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WORLD NEWS

Ceasefire

takes effect

in Beirut
A ceasefire took effect in
Beirut at noon yesterday as
Christian and Moslem leaders
agreed to reopen all seven
crossing points between east
and west Beirut The Arab
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follows siz weeks of often
intense artillery battles.

Page 22

Ryan stands as Euro MP
Roman Catholic priest Patrick
Ryan, who last year success-
fully fought British extradition
moves in Belgium and the Irish
Republic for alleged terrorism,
announced his candidacy in
the European Parliament elec-
tions on June is.

Cannan jailed

Car salesman John Cannan
was jailed for life at Exeter
Crown Court for the murder
of Shirley Banks, snatched
from a Bristol street in 1986.
He received two other life sen-
tences, for rape and another
sexual offence.

Heysef fan* found guBty
Fourteen Liverpool football
fans faced jail sentences after
a Belgian court found them
guilty of manslaughter at the
Heysel football stadium riots

in 1985. Pages

Space shuttle delayed
Launch of the US space shuttle
Atlantis was postponed for

at least 24 hours at Cape Can-
averal, Florida, because of
what space officials described
as technical problems.

BUSINESS SUMMARY

Ex-Next chief

forms link

with Asda
GEORGE Davies, deposed head
of Next retail chain, and his

wife Liz will take responsibility

for Asda’s clothing and foot-

wear ranges. As part of the

deal, the superstore group will

take a 30 per cent share in the
George Davies Partnership,

a new venture formed by the
husband and wife team.
Pages

ACCOUNTANCY profession

and the Government came into
conflict over a system to set

accounting rules. Page 3

FT ORDINARY Index rose
.sharply on Wednesday and
Thursday and jousted with
the year’s highs early yester-

day. However, it slipped back

FT Index

Heinz to wrap baby food in security packs
HEINZ, the food manufacturer
at tbe centre of the alert over
contamination of British baby
foods, is halting production at

its Wigan bottling plant for

two weeks while it introduces

new equipment to wrap prod-

ucts in plastic security sleeves,

writes Lisa Wood.
There have been five con-

firmed cases of its jars being

contaminated by slivers of
glass, razor blades and caustic

soda.
The company, which is ref-

using to pay a £lm blackmail

demand, said the heat-sealed
plastic sleeves would not make
baby products tamper-proof.

but would make tampering
more evident

Heinz, which produces about
80m jars of baby foods a year,

has been developing the
sleeves for several months, but

has accelerated the programme
because of the recent alert.

Production of canned baby
foods is unaffected.

The number of reported

cases has risen to over 220 hut
Scotland Yard said the major-

ity of incidents involved
‘‘copy-cats, people getting on
the bandwagon, cranks and
some cases of self-contamina-
tion." Police believe the man
who made the demands to

Heinz also contaminated pet
food and demanded money last

autumn.
Products wrapped in the new

packaging win be introduced
into supermarkets in a phased
programme. Heinz will
exchange them for existing
stock which will be destroyed.
However, retailers are not
befog advised by Heinz to take
existing stock off the shelf.

The company, which pro-
duces nearly 60 per cent of
Britain’s baby foods, said ware-
housed products were not in
danger.
“We and the police are con-

vinced that the problem is one

of external rantam*tion,"
<gafd Heinz.
Cow and Gate, a tar food

manufacturer whose iducta *

have also been contacntod
along with other bnu$ of
baby foods, said it was rfew-
ing its packaging: Thflim-
pasy said it had receivego
ftlarirpiail threats.

After a meeting yestezqr
between police, goveroattt
officials and the food tau,
police suggested stores eon
sell baby food from behind
counter, which would be.
“sensible alternative" to tota
withdrawal.
Meanwhile Mr Douglas

Hurd, .Home Secretary,
defended police against aliega-

tfons that they, had failed to

inform the public quickly

enough about the baby food

danger. He 'said early disdo-

.

sure would simply encourage
amides and crooks to put more
children to danger.
Speaking cm tbe BBC Radio 4

World at One programme, he
added: These are the sort of

Judgments the police have to
make . . , the essential thing

now is to catch the people or
person responsible for, the
uxijcterlytag exercise."

Packaging to beat the. poi-

soner. Page 3
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Rioters killed at least 25
Mauritanians in tbe Senegalese
capital Dakar In retaliation

for the killing of up to 400 peo-
;

pie in the Mauritanian capital
Nouakchott.

Medvedev readmitted
Historian Roy Medvedev,
elected this month to the
Soviet parliament, has been
readmitted to the Communist
Party. 20 years after his expul-
sion for exposing Josef Stalin's

crimes.

Bush plans Poland visit

President George Bush is plan-

ning to visit Poland during
his trip in July to the G7
economic summit in Paris,

White House sources said.

A visit to Hungary may also

be arranged.

BR Scottish pledge
British Railways Board chair-

man Sir Robert Reid gave
assurances that BR remained
committed to services in the
north of Scotland.

Toxic gas alert

About 1,000 people were evacu-
ated from an industrial estate

near Heathrow Airport, Lon-
don, when solvent containers

released a cloud of toxic

gas.

Do Mamo toft Cl0,000
Broadcaster and writer Jack

de Manio who died in October,

aged 74, left £10,000 in his will.

He once said of his financial

affairs: “It’s entirely my own
fault actually. I cashed in my
pension rights years ago to

pay a thumping great income
tax demand."

Financial Times
The Financial Times will not

be published on Monday, the

May Day Bank Holiday.

to close at L750.4, up 49.9 on
last Friday’s close, as securi-
ties houses balanced their posi-

tions ahead of the long week-
end. Page 15

GUINNESS, UK drinks group,
and Owens-Illinois, US glass
container-maker, will sell the
jointly-owned United (Hass,
one of the largest manufactur-
ers of glass packaging in
Britain. Page 22 and Lex

CENTRAL BANES intervened
in late European trading to
control the dollar’s strength.
The US Federal Reserve, tbe
Bank of England and the cen-
tral banks of Canada, Italy,

France and Switzerland sold
the dollar to prevent it rising
against the D-Mark. Page II

NETBook agreement: Sir Gor-
don Borne, Director General
of Fair Trading, has derided
to extend investigations into

the agreement, which allows
publishers to set minimum
prices for books. Page 22

BANES Hovis KcDougaO, Brit-

ish food group, and Goodman
Fielder Wattie, Its Australasian
counterpart, are thought to
have begun exploratory talks

on a compromise merger fol-

lowing RHM*s £l.33bn bid for

Goodman Fielder. Page 22

BRITISH GAS and Amerada
Hess of the US intervened in
a deal agreed earlier by Enter*
prise Oil, Britain’s largest inde-

pendent oil company, to pay
$L4bn (£824m) for the oil and
gas assets of Texas Eastern.
Page 22 and Lex

OLIVETTI, Italian office auto-
mation company, said consoli-

dated net profits had fallen

by 11.4 percent fall in 1988 to

L3562bn (£L59ro). Page 10

HOWARD Smfth, one of
Australia's oldest companies,
is to restructure through the
A$l86.6m (£87.4m) sale of its

loss-making coal business to
Coal& Allied Industries, its

48 per cent-owned associate.
Page ll
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Royal Life pension inquiry WWW
a 'Aftit's

By Eric Short, Pensions Correspondent

X Wr

ROYAL LIFE Insurance has
started an internal inquiry into

the which resulted in a
subsidiary paying £5m to
restore the funds of the
troubled. Avellng Harford
pension schemes.
Tbe payment, announced on

Thursday, arose from the
link by Royal Heritage Life
Assurance with Mildminster,
the failed investment firm.
Mildminster was one of the
investment managers handling
the assets of the two schemes.
Avellng Barford, a former

engineering company based in
Grantham, Lines, went Into
liquidation last year. This
February newly-appointed
trustees revealed deficits in the
schemes of £4m to £5m.
Mildminster was responsible

for about £5^m of the schemes’
assets, of which only £lAn
could be accounted for. This
loss made tbe schemes’ finan-

cial position weak.
MudmlBBter provided invest-

ment management through
direct shareholdings and
through a broker bond
operation Investing in funds
managed by Royal Heritage, a

unit-linked unit trust firm.
Under a broker bond opera-

tion an outside investment
manager operates a portfolio of
linked managed by one
or more life companies, with
complete discretion - to stifttch

between funds.
In these circumstances,

when the funds of just one life

company are used, it is often
unclear whether the Invest-
ment manager is acting as a
principal for his client or an
agent of the life company.
Tbe £Sm payment by Royal

Heritage indicates that it has
accepted responsibility that
Mildminster was acting as an
agent, with or without its

knowledge.
Authorisation for Mildmins-

ter to transact investment
business has bean withdrawn
by tbe Financial Intermedi-
aries, Managers and Brokers
Regulatory Association.
Meanwhile, the Securities

and Investments Board, the
main financial services regula-

tory body, is about to petition

for the winding-up of
MiMmiwatAr- Mildminster’

s

assets are smalL

The schemes' trustees, Mr
Roger PowdriU, a partner in
the accountancy firm Spicer
& Oupenheim, and Mr John
Kendall, a -Grantham solicitor,

are takingamps to reclaim the
other outstanding asset,not
readily available. This was a
£lm subordinate loan made to
the BqnwfatPii Avefing Barford
company.
The trustees stiH &cea dis-

pute with the Inland Revenue
on tax issues, although the
Revenue has relaxed its stance
towards the payment of
transfer values. These enable
members to take money out of
tbe scheme and invest it in
another pension arrangement
On Thursday Mr Fowdrill

told members of the schemes
that tbe trustees were now in a
position to cover the basic
entitlements of members and
pensioners. He hoped also to be
in a position to these
benefits.

The scheme rules give
trustees discretion over
distribution of surplus. It does
not appear that the liquidator
of tiae parent company has any
claim cm any surplus.
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TRYING TO
BREAK FREE
On foe day of the rugby
league Cup final at

Wembley, Nick Garnett

looks at the gritty reality of

the modern, professional
game
Page I

Minding Your
Own Business
Roy Hodson and Lisa

Wood find out what it takes

to run your own pub

Page VII

Travel

Las Vegas is best in

exquisitely small doses,
says Michael

Thompson-Noel

PageIX-X

Diversions
Christian Tyler on the state

of religion in foe City of

London. Plus How to

Spend it on furniture end
buying a British

dishwasher

Pages XV1U-X1X

Arts
Why von Karajan quit the

Berlin Philharmonic
Orchestra. Plus Pavarotti

at the Met

Pages XX-XXI

Sport
Teresa McLean on the
geode art of making
cricket bats. And Ben

Wright on golf

Page XXII

Unilever cancels Faberge deal
By Christopher Parkas, Consumer Industries Editor

Audit of
REVOLUTION
Next week sees the
tenth anniversary of

the Thatcher
Government In a
special report, to be
published on
Thursday, FT writers

ask whether there has
been a British miracle.

UNILEVER, the Anglo-Dutch
consumer products group, yes-

terday pulled out of negotia-
tions to buy the Fabergtf and
Elizabeth Arden toiletries and
cosmetics businesses fromElk-
lis Family Corporation of the
US.
The $1.55bn <£917m) deal,

agreed in principle in early
February, collapsed after the
seller proposed changes in its

structure and terms, which
Unilever said would have
involved substantial extra

- Riklis is understood to have
attempted to raise the selling

price by more than 9200m dol-

lars.

Yesterday Mr Mike Angus,
Unilever’s chairman, said:

“Essentially they wanted more
money. It is irritating more
than disappointing: You can

waste a lot of time on this sort

of thing.”
In an Official statement he

said: “At the agreed price the
acquisition would have been
an important step forward in
our strategy for personal prodr
nets. There are alternative
ways of achieving our strategic

objectives, and we will con-
tinue to pursue these vigor-
ously.”
Tbe initial agreement was

haded as a major coop for Uni-
lever. Had it gone through, the
company would have equalled
L’Orfal of France in first place
in the world’s cosmetics and
personal care markets.

It would, also have greatly
strengthened its product port-
folio, complementing its exist-

ing ranges of mass-market
products with high-class per-

fume brands.

“I have other acquisition
thoughts,” Mr Angus said,. It is

widely believed that Britain’s
Beecham Group may sell its

personal products and food
businesses.
Personal products, ranging

from toothpaste to perfume
and eye make-up, are becoming

ness. L’Oreal is eartending its

reach beyond France, where it

makes about 75 per cent, of its
ntirmal sales.

Japanese companies such as
Shiseido and Kanebo, which
figure prominently among the
global league leaders, have also
been marketing aggressively in

the US and more recently in
Europe in an effort to compen-
sate for stagnating sales in
their own country.
Revlon to buy West German
cosmetics group. Page 10
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OVERSEAS NEWS

US-Soviet grain

negotiations

stall on subsidies
By Nancy Dunne in Washington

US-SOVIET consultations over
their long-term grain agree-
ment broke up late on Thurs-
day, with the US raising the
purchasing limit from 20m to
34m tonnes but still indecisive
over the Soviet request for sub-
sidised wheat

President Bush anrf his cabi-
net were to discuss the ques-
tion of subsidies yesterday, at
a time when US wheat stocks
are unusually low.

Soviet purchases of US grain
have been closing in on the
20m tonne limit, established
under the Long Term Agree-
ment. Rumours swept the mar-
kets on Thursday that Soviet
dealers were actively buying
maize . At the end of the day,
the US Department of Agricul-
ture announced the purchase
of 150,000 tonnes, but that is
thought to be just the begin-
ning of a grain shopping spree.
The Soviets were also pre-

pared to buy 30,000 tonnes of
US government-owned butter.
The Export Enhancement

Programme, under which the
US provides subsidies for its

farm exports, has been at the
centre of a Washington storm
amid conflicting reports that
the Administration has
suspended the programme at
the urging of the Office of Man-
agement and the Budget.
Members of the House agri-

culture subcommittee were
angry on Thursday over a
report attributed to Mr John
McGregor, the British Agricul-
ture Minister, who was in
Washington this week and was
quoted as saying that US subsi-
dies would not be used to bring
pressure on trade competitors

jing of wiirfing stamp duties
oich, they claimed, handi-
ipped Switzerland in compet-

... - * _ _ Jog with other financial cen-
at the international trade tells, bes, such as London.

Swiss'anks

fear freign

reacfon to

stau> duty
By WIIHc DulHbree

in Gena

SWISS ANKERS warned
yesterd ^ba* a new stamp

duty r fiduciary business

could P forsign investors to

withdA substantial funds

from jos banks.

Thpew levy is intended to

coonisate the federal trea-

survOr a loss in revenue
resx±ng from an easing of

star duty on other financial

tractions, including trading
insanities and money-mar-
wnstruments.
he Swiss banks have been

copoigning for years for the

Congressman Robert Smith, while partially acceding to
an Oregon Repubhom. ragfti: ^ banks^demands in the tax“ms looks to me like the Brit- reform bai he tabled yesterday,
ish Minister of Agriculture Mr otto Stich, the fix^rcen^-
sees us in total retreat at
time when...we ought to be or

the attack...These are delicaf
negotiations and the future *

agriculture in the world is<i

stake.”

Toyota announces $200«i
expansion ofUS capacity
By Kevin Done, Motor Industry Correspondent, in Toiyo

TOYOTA. Japan's leading
automotive group, is to invest
around $200m (£118m) to
expand its vehicle assembly
capacity in the US.

It also announced yesterday
its first significant break-
through in China, with a tech-
nical co-operation deal that
will lead to the local produc-
tion of Toyota van bodies.

In the US. Toyota is plan-
ning to establish capacity for
producing 100,000 pickup
trucks a year at the Toyota/
General Motors joint venture
plant in Fremont, California.
The New United Motor Man-

ufacturing (NUMMI) joint ven-
ture was set up in the early
1980s by Toyota and GM to pro-
duce Toyota-designed cars for
the US market under both the
Toyota and GM badges.
Toyota's latest expansion

plan will bring total invest-
ment at the Fremont facility
dose to Slbn.
In the US, the company cur-

rently sells more than 200,000
light-duty trucks imported
from Japan. It said the project
would create 700 direct Jobs at
the plant, increasing the work-
force to more than 3,400. Pro-
duction is scheduled to begin

in the spring of 1991-

NUMMI is already schtfuled
this year to produce 210,000

units of Toyota’s Corollasmall
family car, also sold in -he US
by General Motors as tie Geo
Prizm, and by Toyota as the
Corolla Sedan.
Toyota also has y wholly-

owned £1.1bn, 200,(NO units-a-

year car plant in Georgetown,
Kentucky, which began pro-
duction last year .

f

In China, Toyota is to enter
a technical co-operation agree-

ment with a subsidiary of the
Gold Cup Automobile Corpora-
tion in Shenyang City, Liao-

ning Province, for the local
production of bodies for its

Hiace van and pickup range.
Toyota is to supply technical

materials, know-how and train-

ing, as well as selling the Shen-
yang group press dies, body
welding and inspection equip-
ment in a deal worth $30m plus
production royalties.

Production in China of com-
mercial vehicles using the
Hiace body is due to begin in
1991 with output rising to
20.000 units a year by 1995.
Toyota said no deal had been
made to supply engines and
transmissions.

Argentina
shuts down
all markets
By Gary Mead in

Buenos Aires

THE Argentine government
unexpectedly closed all finan-
cial transactions yesterday - a
bank holiday - before announ-
cing a further round of emer-
gency economic measures.

Since taking over as Econ-
omy Minister a month ago Mr
Juan Carlos Pugliese has
implemented a variety of mea-
sures aimed at halting a run-
away demand for foreign cur-
rency which has eroded the
austral and fed already high
inflation.

Inflation in April is likely to

be at least -to per cent; prices of
some items have registered
much sharper rises, such as
coffee, which has risen TOO per
cent.

it is expected that Mr Pug-
liese will this weekend re-ad-

just exchange rate policy (for

the fourth time this year), in
order to persuade reluctant
exporters to carry out business
via the central bank, the
reserves or which are now esti-

mated at less than
S500m.
At the moment, exporters

receive only 36 australs for
every US dollar of foreign earn-
ings, while the free market
race for the dollar closed on
Thursday at SO australs.
Mr Pugliese is under consid-

erable pressure to unify
exchange rates completely, and
re-introduce export taxes, at a
level more favourable to
exporters.
At the same time, he is

expected to introduce substan-

tial price rises in the public
sector, as a means of easing a
serious treasury deficit.

According to some indepen-
dent estimates, the govern-
ment has only 40 per cent of

the necessary funds to cover
its costs for ApriL

Peru MP murdered

PERU’S nine-year “dirty" war
has cost the life of an MP.
Veronica Barufattl reports
from Lima. Mr Eriberto Arroyo
Mio, 45. a United Left Deputy
from Piura in northern Peru,
was shot near Lima after leav-
ing his children at school.
The killing, one bullet with a

silenced gun, was characteris-
tic of the Comando Rodigo
franco, a death squad linked
to the ruling party.

W German
space agency
is launched
By David Goodhart in Bonn

WEST GERMANY has
established a new agency for

space research, the German
Agency for Space Affairs
(Dara), which will oversee the
DM20bn (£6.3bn)-plus of gov-
ernment money earmarked for
space research over the next
10 years.
Dara, already nicknamed

the “German Nasa", is

designed to both co-ordinate
and manage the space pro-
gramme, a large part of which
is committed to the major
European Space Agency pro-
grammes such as Columbus,
Ariane, and Hermes.
The Government has empha-

sised its commitment to space
research by establishing a spe-

cial cabinet committee,
chaired by Mr Helmut Kohl,
the Chancellor, and a second
committee of senior officials

from the relevant ministries.

ister, has insisted on clawing
back lost income by imposing
new duties on fiduciary
operations and fife insurance
premiums.
The tax burden on fiduciary

deposits would be light com-
pared with the capital gains
that could be made, and the
danger of the business leaving
Swiss banks was small, Mr
Stich said.

However, the Swiss Bankers'
Association said that set along-
side the steps towards deregu-
lation from which other Euro-
pean financial markets were
benefiting, the Swiss govern-
ment’s proposals were “incom-
prehensible and contradic-
tory".

Stamp duty on fiduciary
deposits would penalise the
large fhnds managed by Swiss
banks for foreign clients. It

would in particular “induce
institutional investors to with-
draw their capital", the associ-

ation said.

A lesson should be taken
from West Germany’s recent
attempt to impose a “modest”
10 per cent withholding tax,

which had led to a flight of
capital from the country, the
association added.

Israel police

blamed over
Nahalin raid
By Hugh Camegy
In Jerusalem

AN OFFICIAL investigation
has found that brad’s paramil-
itary Border Police used exces-
sive force, breaking army rules
on opening fire and shooting
150 live rounds, during a raid
on the West Bank village of
Nahalin this month in which
five Palestinians died, accord-
ing to Israeli Radio.

It said the investigating com-
mittee, whose findings are due
to published next week, called
the raid badly prepared and
recommended reprimanding
senior officers involved.
But it ritmipri the ineiiiflTi^ in

which local youths stoned
troops, was a deliberate massa-
cre.

The report will fuel concern
that the security forces are
adopting an increasingly tough
stance against the 16-month
intifada (rorfeljMs'!-

Mr Yitzhak Rabin, defence
minister, this week threatened
harsher measures if Palestin-

ians did not accept Israeli elec-

tion proposals.
An opinion poll published

yesterday showed 53 per cent
of Israelis favoured tougher
action.

Israel Radio said the border
police platoon at Nahalin
opened fire with five rounds
after countering stone-throw-
ers with plastic bullets.

Both sides entrench their positions on short-range nuclear forces

Hopes for Nato compromise shaken
By David White, Defence Correspondent

NATO diplomats' confidence
that a compromise on the Issue

of short-range nuclear forces

can be reached in time for the

Affiance summit in a month
has begun to waver as a result

of the increasingly entrenched
positions taken in the past few
days by West Germany on the

one hand, and the UK and the

US on the other.
However, most of the 16

members appear to be hedging
their bets, ready to subscribe

to whatever compromise Bonn
might be willing to accept.
“Nobody is going to be farther

out than the Germans,” one
diplomat said.

Over the past 10 days, the
focus of the row has switched
from Nato’s plans for updating
its weapons to the issue of a

commitment on negotiating
mutual cuts with the Soviet
Union.
Last week, Nato defence

ministers took the modennsa-
tion row off the boil with a
deliberately vague expression

of support for nuclear weap-
ons, and acceptance of this by
Washington as showing suffi-

ciently good forth to justify us
development funds for a new
missile. But they found no
common ground at all an East-

West negotiations.

The allies closest to the Ger-
man call for early talks sere

Belgium, most explicitly, and
Norway, Denmark and Greece,
which all distance themselves
from Nato’s unclear facet.

Spain, which.also bans nuclear
arms on its own soil, is slightly

more cautious about a time-

table.

At the other end of the spec-
"

from, Canada, Turkey and Pot-

tugal come closer to the posi-

tion of the US and UK. France

has taken a low profile so for,

but is unwilling to jump into

negotiations that might affect

Us own nuclear forces.

Since Nato decisions are

taken by consensus, not by
vote, smaller members' posi-

tions are not as crucial as in,

for instance, a European Com-
munity council. Following
tomorrow's meeting between
West Germany's Chancellor
Helmut Kohl and Britain's

Prime Minister, Mrs Margaret
Thatcher, bilateral andmultila-

teral discussions are setto con-

ttnue up to the Nato summit

on May29 and 36.

EC foreign ministers will

dbubttessf tackle the Issue in

the margins of their meeting in

Brussels a week beforehand.-

Some ministers are expected to

attend when Mir James Baker,

US Secretary of State, briefs:

the Nato council oh May 12 on

his return from. Moscow, but

UK officials said Sir. Geoffrey

Howe, Foreign Secretary, had
no plan to do so.

The relevant section oz

Nato’s “Comprehensive Con-

cept”, commissioned almost
two years ago and designed to

reconcile force requirements
with arms control, is under-
stood to be still a blank. The
document, being prepared by a
high-level .task force, is dne to.

be approved at the summit

Call for talks on tactical nuclear arms
By Robert Mauthner, Diplomatic Correspondent

NEGOTIATIONS on tactical
nuclear weapons in Europe
should run concurrently with
the Vienna conventional force

negotiations, a group of promi-

nent US and British academics
and arms control experts pro-

posed yesterday.
The proposal, which lends

weight to the West German
position in the row in Nato
over short-range nuclear weap-
ons, was announced simulta-
neously in London, Washing-
ton, Bonn and Brussels by the
independent British American
Security Information CounciL
The separate negotiations on

tactical nuclear weapons.

strongly opposed by the US
and the UK, should be part of
Nato's “comprehensive con-
cept”, which the Alliance has
been discussing for two years
and which is scheduled to be
adopted at a Nato summit at
the end of May.

In support of its siqsgestion

that negotiations should be
held with the Soviet Union on
the tactical nuclear weapons
based in Europe, the coundl
said these weapons were not
suitable for the role of deter-

rence. They were war-fighting
and pre-emptive weapons.
“For deterrence, nuclear

weapons should not be for-

ward-based, where they are
vulnerable, and where they
might be over-rtm."
The group said there was a

strong case for Nato to make a
unilateral move In this field by
beginning the withdrawal of aft

nuclear artillery shells and
inviting the Soviet Union to do
the same. The negotiations
should tium deal with ground-

based imclaar mfaafles with a
range of less than 500km, with
the of either removing
them entirely or reducing them
to very low numbers on either

side.

Professor Frank Blackaby, a
former director of the Stock-

holm International Peace
Research Institute (SIFRU. said

in London that East-West dis-

armament negotiations should

be conducted in the light of a
number of new ideas

.

about
security.

The most Important of these

was the concept of “common
security”, which could only be

obtained in agreement with a
state considered to be a poten-

tial adversary. That implied a
much greater degree of trans-

parency in military matters

and excluded any unilateral
Introduction of new weapon

Fall in US indicators points to

slowdown in growth this year
By Peter Riddell, US Editor, in Washington

US LEADING economic
indicators fell in March for the
second mouth running, for the
first time since the 1987-68 win-
ter, providing further evidence
of a likely slowdown in growth
during the rest erf the year.

The composite Index, looking
aii pari to economic changes in
three to six months, fell by a
larger than expected 0.7 per
cent last mouth, fallowing an
0.3 per cent decline In Febru-
ary.

Nine of the 11 indicators con-
tributed to the fall, notably
building permits and manufac-
turers’ new order^ for con-
sumer goods and. tnnhiriaik.

. The Index of coincident Indi-
cators, which is intended to
approximate to the level of eco-

nomic activity, rose by just 0.1

per cent in March, the smallest

rise since last autumn. This
confirms the impression from
other indicators that economic
activity had begun to slow dur-

ing tiie first quarter. Consumer
spending in particular has
been flattening out.

The financial markets have
also been encouraged by more
optimistic remarks about the
inflation outlook from Federal
Reserve governors and
regional presidents. The latest,

is Mr Robert Heifer, the gover-
nor covering international
affairs; wbo-has said he -does
not believe “the preconditions
for a sustained , acceleration In
inflation are now in place”.

He adds: “The restraint we

have already put in place, cou-

pled wi& the emerging deceler-

ation in economic expansion,
should eventually nave a
favourable effect an inflation.

What is needed now is a bit of
patience to allow that policy

that is in place to work.
The outline budget deficit

reduction agreement between
the Bush administration and
congressional leaders of two
weeks ago has now passed
through roe budget committees
of both foe Senate and House
and wQl be considered on the
floor of both chambers next
week; - Small- -differences
between the proposals <rf the
Senate and the House are
likely,to be ironed out by mid-
May.

Australians dubious of Quayle
claim on US grain subsidies
By Chris Sherwell in Sydney

US VICE-PRESIDENT Dan
Quayle has left Australian cab-

inet ministers, agriculture offi-

cials and farmers asking their

heads at his Haims that US
grain export subsidies are not
hurting Australia.

Mr Quayle is visiting Austra-
lia at the start of a swing
through several Asian coun-
tries. In Canberra, he rejected
the Australian view that Wash-
ington's Export Enhancement
Programme (SEP) had hurt
Australian grain exports.

Prime Minister Bob Hawke
had presented figures to him
showing that, since 1985, when
thp EEP fate effect, Aus-
tralia’s share of the world
wheat market had been almost
halved.
In response, Mr Quayle

offered different figures cover-
ing a longer period, suggesting
that Australia’s share was cur-

rently above the 10-year aver-

age, and that the US's share
had actually dropped.
He told foe National Press

Club the Australian position

had been put to him “In no
uncertain terms", but insisted:

“It is still my belief that US
trade policy Is not hurting Aus-
tralia.”

Since then, Mr Michael
Duffy, Trade Negotiations Min-
ister. the small opposition
Democrat Party, the Austra-
lian Wheat Board and the
National Farmers’ Federation
have all expressed disdain for

this view.
According to the Wheat

Board, Australia has seen its

sales decline sharply in several

markets targeted by the EEP.
In foe Australian view, US

subsidies have allowed its

wheat to capture new markets
at a time when world prices

have weakened. Whereas Aus-
tralian farmers have reacted

by not growing wheat and
turning to. wool and beef,

which are more attractively

priced, US ' farmers have car-,

rted on as before.

Canberra blames this failure

of the market mechanism on
the EEP, under which US
wherat has received subsidies of

around $25430 a tonne.

While Mr Qnayfe’s visit has
reaffirmed the strength a£ the
Australian-American alliance,

ft has stressed Australian con-

cern that the EEP will under-
mine the compromise reached
in Geneva month in the
Uruguay Round of trade talks.

This included a commitment
"by the US and EC not to
increase their farm supports
and to negotiate long-term
reductions. But Washington
Vmwi ggffl rrp will continue.

Swiss bank
policy to be
maintained
By William Dutlforce

'

THE CURRENT weakness of
the Swiss franc was transitary,

Mr Markus Losses, president

of the Swiss National Bank
(SNB), said yesterday.'

There was no reason funda-
mentally to modify central
bank policy, which aims to
maintain price stability by
inflnencing the medium-term
growth in the money supply.
The franc declined by over

30 per cent agates* foe dollar

and more than 8.9 per cent
against the D-Mark between
the start of the year and April

14, when the-SNB raised Urn

discount and Lombard rates:

and,- temporarily- at least,

halted foe slides
For 1989, foe SNB has -set a

low target of 2 per cent growth
in seasonally-adjusted central

bank money but some bankas
have want farther tightening
to maiwfBbt the <rf the
franc «nri hold down inflation.

Mr Loner said it was better

to keep cool and study the rea-

sons for. foe weakness of the
franc. These were:
• The fall in the current
account surplus . from
SFrULSbu in 1988 to SFrt.lbn
last year, which was “nothing
exceptional” during a period
when the economy was boam-
tog and tiie labour market was
tight;

• The decline in domestic
interest rates during the first

quarter which might have led
people. Incorrectly, to perceive
a slackening in the SNB’s
determination to pursue a
price-stabilising policy;

• The current sentiment (on
exchange markets) that the
risks of rate changes within,
the European Monetary Sys-
tem could be Ignored In the
short term.
All these factors were tem-

porary, Mr Looser said, and It

would be wrong to fight infla-
tion by artificially provoking a
rise in the franc's exchange
rates.

Mexican ‘moral guide’ is cast into outer darkness
The teachers’ union revolt has profound implications for the government, Richard Johns writes

M R CARLOS Jonguitud
Barrios, self-ap-

pointed "leader for

life and moral guide” of the
l^m-strong Mexican teachers’

union since 1974, had his
self-perpetuating tenure termi-

nated this week at the behest

of President Carlos Salinas de
Gortari.
The end to the authoritarian

rule of the man who seized

control of the National Union
of Education Workers (SNTE)
In 1972 was euphemistically
described as a resignation.

He was in effect dismissed

by Mr Salinas, who eventually

had no choice but to cast the

labour leader, known for his

use of strong-arm tactics, into

outer darkness. The president

could be forgiven for paying

scant regard to the arcane pro-

cesses of the SNTE.
Having rejected a pay and

benefits award of 20 per cent,

probably more than a quarter

of the nation's teachers are on
strike demanding a 100 per

cent salary increase and
democratisation of the union.

For the ruling Institutional

Revolutionary Party (PRI). the

affair has profound Implica-

tions.

First, the claim of the dissi-

dent faction of the SNTE,
known as the National Co-or-

dinator of Education Workers
(CNTE), is a big challenge to
the Mexican government’s Pact
for Economic Growth and Sta-

bility (PECE) - limiting the
increase in the minimum dally

wage to 8 per cent until foe
end of July - at a time when
talks on renegotiation of
Mexico's UOObn (£58Sbn) debt
have just started.

Second, and related to the
prospect for economic recov-
ery. the strike has brought into
high relief growing tensions
between the PRI regime and
the labour movement
Third, the SNTE has

entrenched itself so deeply into
the political system that it can
dictate appointments of head-
masters and school inspectors

as well as charging substantial
down-payments for entry into
the underpaid profession. Hav-
ing encroached so far on the
functions of the Ministry of
Education, it is in a position to
obstruct the reforms the Sali-

nas administration wants to
implement
Given Mr Jouguitud's unpo-

pularity in the onion, reflected
since 1979 by the existence erf

the CNTE rebel faction of some

•tongxdtud: the “leader for life” in better tfamy

300,000, it might seem surpris-
ing Mr Salinas did not move
against him before.

It seems likey that the Presi-
dent and Mr Manuel Bartlett
Diaz, the Minister of Educa-
tion, were giving him a chance
to bring the dissidents into
hue. But his days were almost
certainly numbered.

Since the late 1930s, Mexican
workers' syndicates have been
a part of the corporate state,
an arrangement which has
made possible the keeping of
wages well below the rate of
inflation since ism, with mini.
mal labour trouble.

Pre-eminent in this system
has been the Confederation of

Mexican Workers (CTM) fed by
Mr Fidel Velasques, who, hav-
ing ensured labour loyalty dur-
ing nine presidential terms,
celebrated his 90th birthday on
Monday.
Within foe CTM. foe SNTE

and the Union of Oil Workers
of the Mexican Republic
(STPRM) have always enjoyed
a significant measure of auton-
omy. Aa leader of the C1M,
“Don Fidel” has presided over
the Labour Congress, which in
effect has brought three-quar-

ters of the movement number-
ing 9J5m workers under the
aegis of the PEL
For keeping the rank and file

in order, labour leaders
acquired political importance,
with seats In Congress and
state legislatures, a licence to
enrich themselves at the
expense of union members,
and untrammelled power.

Described as a “rich union of
poor teachers", the SNTE is
not as wealthy as the STPRM,
whose leader, Mr Joaquin Her-
nandez Galicia — “La Quine”
- was arrested in January, but
it boasts considerable assets.

Bosses of the teachers'
unions formingMr Jonguitud’s
so-called Revolutionary Van-
guard — .made up of about

80,000 headmasters. Inspectors
and federal directors of pri-

mary education - have used
foe same strong-arm methods
as the STPRM in the past. The
CNTE claims 150 dissident
teachers have been murdered
since 1980.

Relatione between foe gov-
ernment and the labour move-'
ment have become strained as
real incomes have plummeted
by SO per cent .and nnemjrfoy-
ment/underemployment has
risen to 30 per cent
The revolt by the teachers*

union raises a question over
the ability erf traditional union

leadership to ensure indefinite
mmplinnnp with state pnHriffl

- as it did with last year's
Economlc Sohdarity Fact and
so for this year with the PECE.
Like La Qntna, Mr Jonguttud

assumed the right to choose
the secretary-general of his
union. Within 24 hours of his
downfall, his puppet nominee
was replaced by Ms Elba
Esther Gordfilo. She is a formi-
dable figure, but foe task she
feces in concffiating foe dissi-

dents and modifying. a pay
claim the government cannot
afford is a 'daunting one. At
least it will be helped by foe
departure of Mr Jonguitnd. .. -

Optimism
for revival

of Namibia
peace plan
WITH no more than 400 Swapo
guerrillas still In Namibia,
negotiators from Cuba,. Angola

and South. Africa are close to

agreement on the revival of

their plan for Namibian inde-

pendence, delegates said yes-

terday, Reuter reports from
Gape Town.
Members of a

Tan and South African. <

sion monitoring the implemen-

tation - of Namibian
Independence said intelligence

reports indicated about L300
rebels had left Namibia for

bases in Angola. .

*T *htefc we .can this

afternoon,” Mr. Venando da
Siva Moors, foe Angolan Dep-
uty Foreign Minister, said dur-

ing a break In meetings sched-

uled to end last night
He said foe three sides had

worked out arrangements to

cope with any South West
Africa People’s Organisation
(Swapo) rebels feft.in Namibia
after a W-hourtroce scheduled
to end at torn this morning but
he declined to give, details.

Mauritanians killed

.

At feast IS Mauritanians were
stoned to death in. foe Senega-
tese capital Dakar yesterday in
retaliation for the killing; of up
to 400 people in foe Manritan-
ian capital Nouakchott, Renter
reports from Dakar.
The killings started just

hours after Senegalese refu-

gees reached Dakar with
reports of two days irf anti-Se-

negalese violence in Nouak-
chott

No-confidence Vote
Kenyan Vice-President Jose-

phs Karanja, 58, was fighting

for Us pobfclcal survival yester-

day after Parliament unani-
mously backed a.voteof no
confidence in him. Reuter
reports from Nairobi. Among
his alleged misdeedawas tak-

ing money from -Uganda to
overthrow the government

Mobil divestment
tiie American ail. com-

pany, yesterday confirmed Its

plans to divest from South
Africa by the end of ‘June, Jim
Jones reports from Johannes-
burg. The company says it will:

sell its local Interests to Gen-
cor, the country's second larg-

est mining group, for an undis-

ckwed amount..
t- -V . ;

French trade boost
ThrFrench:foreign trade, bat
ance, long a worrying feature

of-foe economy, has strength-

ened for the third month run-
ning, with a seasonally
adjusted outcome in March
dose to equilibrium, Ian
Davidson reports from Paris.
Mr Pierre Brfrrfgovoy,

Finance Minister, greeted the
encouraging figure as “good
news for the franc”.

Indian poverty plan
Mr Rajiv Gandhi, the Tndiaw

Prime Minister, yesterday
announced a new anti-poverty
programme which he claimed
would provide a job for at least

one member of each rural fam-
ily, David Housego writes from
New Delhi.
The new measures, foreshad-

owed in the February budget,
reflect a new effort by foe gov-
ernment to provide jobs and
welfare through locally-admin-
istered, village-level schemes.

Dutch budget talks
The Dutch Cabinet was locked
in negotiations last night over
a package combining- a 20-year
National Environment Plan
and the 1990 budget, Laura
Rami reports from The Hague.
Mr Onno Ending, the

Finance Minister, hag threat-
ened to resign unless budget
savings are made. In several
areas - probably -defence,
housing and education - to
pay for the environment pfem.

Berlusconi purchase
Mr Silvio Berinsconi, the Ital-

ian television mag-
nate, has acquired a 4 per cent
shareholding in TF-1, the
French commercial television
network controlled by Mr
Francois Bouygues, Alan
Friedman writesfrom Milan.
Mr -Berlusconi, who is

believed to have paid the
equivalent of around £23.5m
tor the stake, already owns 25
per cent of La Cinq, another
commercial station.
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Tokyo resigned

to Super 301
investigation
By Ian Rodger in Tokyo

TRADE officials in Tokyo were
resigned yesterday to the pros-
pect of Japan being singled out
by the US for investigation for
unfair trading practices under
the new so-called Super SOI
clause of the 1988 trade act.

The US Trade Representa-
tive’s office in Washington was
due yesterday to unveil its

annual list of unfair barriers
facing US exporters. It is on
the basis of this list that deci-
sions will be taken at the end
of next month about which
countries in particular to tar-
get
Japan's vulnerability stems

from rising anger In US gov-
ernment circles over its huge
trade surpluses. This may have
been reinforced by the publica-
tion yesterday of trade figures
for the year to March 31. They
showed the country's trade
surplus rose from $94bn to
$95.3bn. The MoF had origi-
nally forecast a ‘ decline to
S81bn.
Meanwhile, bilateral trade

negotiations on a number of
fronts remained in trouble.
• Talks broke down on Thurs-
day between the US and Japan
over the liberalisation of the
Japanese mobile telephone
market. The US has com-
plained that Japan has failed

to respect a 1985 agreement by

Discount
rate fears

ruled out
By Ian Rodger

A 1.4 per cent rise in Tokyo
consumer prices in April has
calmed growing speculation
about an imminent discount
rate rise by the Bank of Japan.
The Japanese authorities

were not pleased with the rise,

which was 2U> per cent on a
year-on-year basts, bat they
were relieved it was not
higher.

It was file first indicator of
price trends since a 3- per cent
value added tax was
introduced on April 1 on a
wide variety of goods and
services.

A Bank of Japan official

said the rise could not be
considered low or a sign of
price stability and added that
the bank would' not set Its

monetary policy im a single
’

report. J

Mr Tatsuo Murayama,
finance minister, -said the rise

was “almost acceptable'*, but
he feared the economy might
overheat and urged businesses
not to expand their fixed
investment too rapidly.

Speculation about an
Increase in Japan’s discount
rate, which has stood at 2J5

per cent since February 23
1987, bas intensified because
of the unexpected rise of West
German interest rates last
week. Already, there were
concerns about the. high level

of activity in the economy.
March job statistics

yesterday confirmed the tight
state of the labour market.
The seasonally adjusted

unemployment rate was 2.3

per cent for the fourth
consecutive month, while the
year-on-year rise in the
number of people in work was
1.9 per cent or l.lm people.
The Tokyo consumer price

Index rose to 104.9 on a 1985
base of 100. Mr Tasno
Katsumara, director* general
of the Government's Economic
Planning Agency price bureau,
said, however, that If the
effect of the Introduction of
VAT was excluded, prices were
stable.

Analysts believe the Bank of
Japan still wants to raise its

discount rate, but . will
probably have to wait until
next month.

not allowing Motorola, the
leading mobile telephone
maker, to offer its services in
the Tokyo area. The Japanese
say there is a shortage of radio
frequencies.
• The Ministry of Interna-
tional Trade and Industry is

threatening to invoke the dis-

putes procedure of the General
Agreement on Tariffs and
Trade if the US invokes new
sanctions against Japan for
alleged violations of their 1986
semiconductor agreement
• Japan is also threatening
Galt action if the US imposes
sanctions under Super 301 for
the alleged closed nature of its

overall telecommunications
market Japanese officials
argue that it would be against
Gatt rules to single . out one
country for sanctions.
• The Japanese Defence
Agency was preparing fresh
concessions in an attempt to
resolve the month-old dispute
over the joint development of
Japan’s new fighter aircraft,
the FSX_
According to reports in

Tokyo yesterday, the agency
would drop its insistence that
more than half the production
work oh engines he given to
Japan and that flight control
computer software be trans-
ferred to Japan.

Sharp fall

in payments
surplus
By Ian Rodger

JAPAN'S current account
surplus in March fell a sharp
24 per cent to S&Sbn on a year-
on-year basis. The trade sur-

plus dropped 13 per cent to
S8.1bn, and the Ministry of
Finance (MoF) expects the
decline to continue.
Last summer, the trade sur-

pluses began climbing again,
causing anger among Japan's
trading partners, especially the
US. Yesterday's announcement
showed that the trade surplus
for the fiscal year to March 31
1989 rose from $94bn to
S9S-3bn. The ministry had ear-
lier forecast a decline to $81bn.
Exports in March rose 15.8

per cent to $25.9bn while
import* ]blnped'36'per ‘cetft to'

$i7-8&n.
' '

'

1
’

1The 'longterm1
•• capital

•account for March showed a
net inflow of &5bn, in a sharp
turnaround from recent trends.

This was due in part to a large
number of securities issues
overseas by Japanese compa-
nies and to a sharp drop in
Japanese purchases of foreign
securities.

The overall balance was thus
in surplus by S16bn against
gubn in March 1988.

On a seasonally adjusted
basis, the March current
account surplus tumbled 40 per
cent from the previous mouth
to *5J4bn. The trade surplus
was down 30 per cent to $7.1bn.

Output up 4.2%
Japan’s industrial production
index for March posted a 4J2

per cent increase from Febru-
ary to 122.0 against the 1985
base of 100. according to the
Ministry of International Trade
and Industry (Miti), writes
Michiyo Nakamoto.
This was the highest month-

on-month rise since May 1957
and follows a 1.7 per cent drop
in February. The increase in
production is attributed by
Miti to a need to catch up after

a slowdown in February
caused in part by the funeral of
Emperor Hirohito. • Strong
exports- and last-minute
demand for durable goods prior

to the start of a new consump-
tion tax in April also supported
the firm rise in production.

LDP in wrangle over

choosing new leader
By Ian Rodgwr

JAPAN'S scandal-rocked
Liberal Democratic Party
(LDP) yesterday resumed
wrangling ever selecting a new
leader and prime minister after

causing uproar in the Diet
(parliament) by using its

majority to veto through the
1989-90 budget
Mr Noboru Takeshita has

said he will resign as prime
minister once the budget had
been adopted, because of his

involvement in the Recruit
financial scandaL. Mr Masa-
yoshi Ito, a -75-year-old elder
statesman and one of the few
party leadera untainted by the
scandal, has been asked to take
over temporarfly. Mir ito has
been publicly, resisting these
calls, alleging ill-health. He
suffers from a severe form of
diabetes. He has, however, con-
tinued to fiOkwith party lead-

ers, and political analysts in
Tokyo believe be is negotiating
tougj terms;

It is thought Mr Ito would
like to pass over leaders
affected by the scandal and
bring younger D&xnen.lnto Ms

cabinet. The present LDP lead-

ers want to put in older retain-

ers in the hope the scandal will

blow over and they can return
to their leadership positions.

They know that if a new gener-

ation comes into power, it

conld prove difficult to get

them out
Analysts suspect that negoti-

ations will continue slowly
through next week, a holiday

in Japan, then resume in ear-

nest after Mr Takeshita
returns from visits to five

south-east Asian countries on
May 8.

Yesterday’s unprecedented
unilateral voting of the budget
through the lower house clears

the way for it to become law
within a month, even without
a vote in the upper bouse.

It also effectively aids three

months of pressure by the
opposition parties, who were
boycotting proceedings until

the Government agreed to

have Mr Yasuhiro Nakasone,

the former prime minister, tes-

tify about Ms role in the
Recruit scandal.
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Packaging to beat the poisoner
Christopher Parkes looks at possible measures to protect consumers

W HEN seven people
died in Chicago in
1982 after taking poi-

soned Tylenol painkillers,
Johnson & Johnson - the
manufacturer - sealed the
capsule bottles inside cans.

it refined its approach latex,

and presented would-be poison-
ers with three obstacles; the
Tylenol capsules were packed
in a glass bottle with a heat-
sealed membrane under the
cap; a plastic sleeve was
shrunk over the cap and bottle
neck; and the whole was
enclosed in a sealed box.

No physical defence is cer-

tain, however, against the
determined blackmailer. As
packaging makers and consul-
tants made plain yesterday, the
tamper-proof pack does not
exist. As has been shown in
Britain's current crisis over
contaminated baby foods, even
bottles carefully sealed with
pop-up safety buttons in the
lids can be opened and re-

sealed wen enough to satisfy

the non-expert.
Heinz, one of the companies

involved, yesterday took far-

ther steps to protect itself and
its consumers. It brought in a
corporate public relations man
from its Pittsburgh base and
took on 90 extra staff to work
plant that will cover food jars

WT*h shrink-seal film.

That will present yet another
barrier to the prospective tam-
perer - and further cost to

producer and consumer. How-
ever. arguments about how
much shoppers will be pre-
pared to pay for security are
insignificant in the light of

present circumstances - there

is enough evidence that the

Ss&y.
5r?fc y

At risk: the tamper-proof package does not exist

Tony Adams

extra costs can be readily
absorbed.
One concern is to ensure

that
, in making a park tamp,

er-resistant’ or in a way that
easily shows any interference,
the buyer can still open it with
relative ease.

Bubble packs were among
secure packaging options iden-
tified by the US Federal Drug
Administration in the wake of
the Tylenol affair, but they are
difficult to open, as Mr Ray
White of Pira, the printing and
packaging industries' research
association, pointed out
The FDA’s list included

many ideas that are now used

widely in the food and drugs
industries in the US and else-

where - shrink seals, sealed
tubes that must be punctured
by the user, cartons that can-
not be opened without damage,
seals inside bottle tops and
metal or plastic bottle caps
that break on opening.
New-style containers of all

kinds were introduced to pre-
vent a less malicious - but
still costly - issue that arose
with the introduction of the
self-service food store. This
was the practice of some shop-
pers to sample or “graze" dis-

play goods.
Ms Sheila Clark, managing

director of the Packaging Inno-
vation consultancy, said tam-
pering usually concerned such
shoppers. While they were
deterred quite easily, however,
the sinister tamperer was not
Expert consensus has

suggested that the most effi

dent way of protecting prod-
ucts is to follow the Tylenol
example and enclose them in

additional layers of packaging.
A complex design, similar to

those on bank notes, would
help to show interference.
Nucleus, a packaging design
company, has even suggested
holograms - now familiar to

most cheque guarantee card
holders. These might help
because damage to them, or
their absence, might attract
the consumer's attention.
That may. however, not be

the case. Dr Hugh Lockhart of
tbe state university in Michi-
gan, told an international con-
ference recently that up to 50
per cent of people tested in a
survey were unable to detect
tempering in packs they were
shown.
He added that consumers

were largely unaware of tbe
tamper-resistance statements
- now mandatory on US drug
packs - and were unwilling to
take the time to read safety
instructions.

More dramatic means were
needed to attract people’s
attention, he suggested. For
example, inner packs could be
treated to change colour when
outer seals were broken to
admit air. Supermarket Secu-
rity might also be improved, be
said, by using sound-emitting
packs that let off an alarm on
interference.

Anger in aisles as baby food stays on shelf
By Richard Tomkins, Midlands Correspondent

ANGER rather than fear stalked the aisles

of at least one Birmingham store yester-

day. in response to the scare about baby
food.

“If 1 could get hold of the bloke that's

doing this, I’d . . . well, I can't tell you
what I'd do to him," said Mrs Marie Mas-
sey. a customer at the New Street branch
of Boots. “It's disgusting

,
pinking on defen-

celess babies like that.”

Oddly, Mrs Massey’s shopping basket
was well filled with tins and jars of baby
food as she spoke, all of them intended for

her 14-month-old son, DanieL "Normally
we’d make his food ourselves, but we’re
going on holiday to Minorca next week
and l*d sooner risk giving him these than
letting him eat foreign food.” she said.

This was not quite the case of Birming-
ham chauvinism it appeared. According to
Mrs Massey, the last time she went abroad
- to Corfu in 198&**- she-contracted ' sal-

monella poisoning and was in hospital for

six months.- -- 1 ' -v- • '•

Just fls'significant in her decision, how-
ever. was the label on the tins and jars.

Spuming the Heinz and Cow & Gate prod-

ucts at the centre of the baby food scare.

she chose only Boots' own-brand products.
She was not alone. Boots was doing

brisk business in its own-brand baby foods
yesterday, because none of them has so far

been spiked. As Mr Don Fowler, manager
of the New Street branch, observed:
“Everybody's buying them.”

It was a different picture elsewhere. In
supermarket after supermarket, the rows
of branded Fruit and Cereal Breakfast,
Bone and Beef Broth, Vegetable and Rice
Casserole, and Egg Custard with Tapioca
remained forlornly on their shelves, a visi-

ble testament to the commercial impact of
the scare.

At Asda's superstore in Birmingham's

Pallasades shopping centre. Ms Sadie Hak-
een. IS, said she was feeding her three-

month-old son Lewis on Milupa powdered
products, because they were easier to
search for anything untoward.

• -“I used to buy-six jars of Cow &-Gate a-
week, but I won’t be buying any more, till I

know-they're safe," she said, "ft’s just not
worth the risk."

At Tesco’s Fire Ways superstore in Edg-
baston. an assistant was going though the
entire stock of Heinz and Cow & Gate baby

food every hour to make sure none of the
jars had been opened. Nevertheless Ms
Sharon Pierce. 23, was also sticking to
Milupa for her four-month-old son Davy.

“It’s all very well saying you can sieve

what’s in the tins and jars, but you can't
sieve out caustic soda," she said. “1 think
they should clear the shelves."

At the Safeway store in Harborne, a
10-minute vigil elicited only one approach
to the baby food display, from a couple
buying a packet of Farley’s rusks. On
questioning, they turned out to have
bought them for their dog.

Indeed, the only person observed yester
day buying a jar of branded baby food was
Ms Bea Legav, a 30-year-old vegan, who
said she never read newspapers, listened

to the radio or watched television.

“Quite honestly, the real scandal is that
people feed their children on this muck in
the first place." she said,-picking up a tm-»J

of Heinz Fruity Juice Dessert for her sev-
en-month-old daughter PearL ....

“Bet Tm involved in a lot of -travelling
at the moment because we’re setting up a
co-operative to grow organic vegetables,

and sometimes it comes in handy."

Mackay
hits back on
law reforms
By Robert Rice

IN A THINLY disguised attack
on the Bar and senior mem-
bers of the judiciary. Lord
Mackay, the Lord Chancellor,

last night accused some critics

of the Government's plans for

reform of tbe legal profession
of deliberately failing to see
them in context
Speaking at a conference in

Birmingham to mark the end
of the three-month consulta-
tion period on the green
papers, Lord Mackay said:

“They are so keen to find some
concealed horrors that they
axe throwing down their own
stones In order to look under-
neath them.”
One of the creatures they

expected to find there was “a
sort of creeping state controL"
The other was a creature that
Intended to kill the legal aid
system.
In reality, neither existed,

he said.
Creeping state control was

said to lurk in the Advisory
Committee on Education and
Conduct to be set up to advise
tiie Lord Chancellor on law-
yers' training and on the
principles to be incorporated

in professional codes of con-
duct.
Past experience, Lord

Mackay said, had shown that
there was a need for such a
body sod that those matters
could not be left entirely to
the legal profession.

The failure of the Bar and
the Law Society to agree on
rights of audience for solici-

tors- In the higher courts was
an example.
The committee was neces-

sary because the working of
the legal profession was not
the exclusive concern of the
lawyers and tbe judiciary.

Lord Mackay said.

The law, its practitioners

and .the courts were there to
serve the public and were all

part of a single entity that
must not be neglected.

The role of the committee
would be to preserve and
improve standards of compe-
tence and conduct, he said.

Within that framework, the
individual professions would

their own decisions.

Lord Mackay promised to
consider the 2,200 responses
very carefully before finalising

any proposals.

Liverpool fans jailed for

manslaughter at Heysel
By William Dawkins in Brussels

A BELGIAN judge yesterday
found 14 Liverpool football
fans guilty of manslaughter at
the Heysel football stadium
riots at which 39 spectators
died in 1985.

Judge Pierre Verlyude
acquitted another 10 and has
yet to pass judgment on two
more, against whom charges
are still pending.
He sentenced the guilty to

3’A years in prison, of which
lVx years are to be suspended
during a five-year period. They
were also forced to forfeit their
bail money, pay BFr 60.000
(£900) each to a national fund
for disaster victims, plus a
nominal BFr 1,000 fine.

“The acts the fans commit-
ted cannot be tolerated in

Belgium," the judge said.

The 550-page judgment,
which took Judge Verlynde all

day to read, also contained sen-
tences for Mr Albert Roosens,
former general secretary of
Belgium's football union, and
Mr Johan Mahieu, the police
captain in charge of security at
the stadium.
Judge Verlynde accused the

police of “serious negligence”
and commented that the foot-

ball union had known that the
British fans were likely to be
dangerous.
Mr Roosens received a

suspended six-month prison
term and a BFr 300,000 fine. Mr
Mahieu was also fined BFr
300,000 and given a nine-month
suspended sentence.

Zeebrugge stress awards
By Robert Rice

DAMAGES totalling £645,000
have been awarded to 10 survi-

vors of the Zeebrugge ferry
disaster after the settlement of
a test case to determine what
levels of compensation should
be paid for “psychiatric dam-
age” suffered by victims.
The 10 cases were referred to

arbitration under an agree-
ment reached between P&O,
owner of the vessel that cap-
sized. and Pannone Napier, the

disaster law solicitors co-ordin-

ating the claims of victims of

the disaster.

Both sides yesterday said

they were pleased with the out-

come. The amount of damages
that should be awarded for
post-traumatic stress disorder
and pathological or abnormal
grief and how those damages
should be assessed has been
the main obstacle to the final
settlement of most claims for
compensation arising from the
disaster.

Mr Roger Mann, of P&O, said
the range of awards, from
£1,750 to £30,000, was what
they expected to pay.
Mr Michael Napier of Pan-

none Napier said the decision
was an important step forward
in a grey area of the law.

CrickhoweU attacks Walker
By Michael Cassell, Political Correspondent

MR PETER WALKER, the
Welsh Secretary, yesterday
came under renewed attack
from within his own party over
recent claims that he had
introduced a new brand of the

Tory interventionist policies

that had helped the economic
regeneration of Wales.
Mr Walker's remarks have

featured prominently in the
Vale of Glamorgan by-election,

where the Tories face defeat in

next week’s poll, and have
caused some embarrassment in
the party locally and nation-

ally. Yesterday, Lord Crick-
howell, his predecessor,
claimed the Welsh Secretary

had introduced no initiatives

in tbe past two years.
Lord CrickhoweU, the former

Mr Nicholas Edwards, said he
had no intention of “engaging
in fisticuffs with an old
friend.” Yet he was surprised
to be told that achievements in

Wales resulted from new poli-

cies.

He told the South Wales
Association of the Institution

of Civil Engineers that Mr
Walker had “used his supreme
political skills as a trumpeter"
to boost Wales but the ability

alone to proclaim success
“does not constitute an eco-
nomic policy."

Lloyds ends
US treasury

bond deals
By David Lascelles,
Banking Editor

LLOYDS BANK has pulled out
of the US treasury bond mar-
ket because of poor returns.
About 46 people will be made
redundant at its New York-
based subsidiary. Lloyds Gov-
ernment Securities Corp.

Lloyds was one of more than
40 dealers in the market recog-
nised by the Federal Reserve
Bank of New York.
Yesterday Mr Alan Moore,

Lloyds director of corporate
banking and treasury, said the
business was unlikely to
achieve the return on capital

that the bank needed.
Lloyds joined the market at

the end of 1987. However, tbe
combination of intense compe-
tition and tighter capital rules
have made life difficult for all

participants.
The move completes Lloyds's

retreat from securities dealing.

In 1987 it closed down its

London-based Eurobond busi-
ness and its gilt-edged dealing
subsidiary for similar reasons.
Because of that, the closure of
the US treasury operation had
been widely expected.

Ronson denies

Guinness case

allegations
By Raymond Hughes, Law
Courts Correspondent

MR GERALD RONSON,
chairman of Heron Corpora-
tion, appeared briefly at South-

wark Crown Court yesterday
to plead not guilty to the li

charges brought against him in

the Guinness prosecution.

Six charges are under the
Theft Act. Three others accuse
Mr Ronson of aiding and abet-

ting Mr Ernest Saunders, for-

mer chairman and chief execu-

tive of Guinness, in
contraventions of the Compa-
nies Act. He is also charged
with Mr Saunders of conspir-

acy to defraud and conspiracy

to contravene the Prevention
of Fraud (Investments) Act.

Mr Saunders and the other

five accused all denied the
charges on the 65-count indict-

ment on Thursday.
A further preparatory hear-

ing has been fixed for July 7.

Ex-Next chief

forms link

with Asda group
By Christopher Parkes, Consumer industries Editor

MR GEORGE Davies, the
deposed head of the Next retail

chain, is to rejoin the rag trade

through a novel arrangement
with the Asda superstore
group.
The man credited with revol-

utionising fkshion retailing in

classy high street shops is to

test bis magic touch selling

clothes and shoes alongside
racks of baked beans in giant
out-of-town stores.

Asda is to take a 20 per cent
share in the George Davies
Partnership, a new venture
formed by Mr Davies and his

wife Liz, which will take over
responsibility for the design,
buying and merchandising of

Asda's clothing and footwear
ranges.

In return, the partnership
will be paid 25 per cent of any
profits it generates from these
businesses over and above the
returns currently projected in
Asda’s business plans.

Mr John Hardman, Asda
chairman, said sales of clothes
and shoes contributed about
£160m in sales to the group’s
annual turnover of £2.3bn.
These lines occupy about ll
per cent of the group's 4.6m sq
ft Of selling space.

The first fniits of the ven-
ture will appear in February
when the partnership's new
concept for out-of-town super-
market clothing sales will be
launched in 35 of Asda's 120
stores.

Mr Davies said Asda had a
strong niche in out-of-town

clothes retailing which could

be developed much more
quickly by entrusting It to spe-

cialist control.

People were turning away
from the high street, he said,

and the traditional department
stores were no longer doing
their job in the fashion trade.

Mr Davies showed himself to

be a shrewd tactician in the
marketing of high fashion
clothes and accessories to the
elitist “life-style" socio-
demographic before he was
ousted from Next in December.
He was undaunted yesterday

by the prospect of tackling the
wide range of tastes, incomes
and attitudes in a business
which sprawls from Aberdeen
to St Austell in Cornwall.
The first 35 stores to receive

the Davies treatment would
cover much of the country,
including Liverpool, parts of
tbe south and Yorkshire with
comparable demographic pat-

terns, he said.

Mr Hardman, a Liverpudlian
like Mr Davies, said his partner
had preferred the partnership
arrangement to becoming an
employee of Asda. “He values
his independence,” he said.

The initial agreement, which
involved Asda in only a nomi-
nal payment for its sharehold-
ing. will run for five years.

The George Davies Partner-
ship may also be available to

lend its expertise elsewhere.
“The arrangement is not abso-
lutely exclusive,” Mr Hardman
said.

Conflict over plan

for accounting rules
By Richard Waters

THE ACCOUNTANCY pro-
fession and the Government
yesterday came into conflict
over creation of a system to set

accounting rules. Proposals by
the Dearing Committee,
chaired by Sir Ronald Dearing.
appear to be in danger.
The crisis was provoked by a

letter to the Consultative
Committee of Accountancy
Bodies, which represents the
six leading accountancy bod-
ies. from Mr Francis Maude.
Minister of Corporate Affairs,

detailing the system's opera-
tion.

The Dearing plan sees the
Government taking far less
responsibility than the accoun-
tants had urged, leaving it

largely up to the profession to
promote and fund the new sys-
tem.
The committee replied: “The

decision we might be forced to
make is that the system we
have at the moment is better."
Without accountants' sup-

port, the Dearing plan will
almost certainly lapse, leaving
the existing, discredited stan-
dards system in place.

The dispute has arisen

because the Government is not
prepared to pay for the new
system, as “the taxpayer
should not be expected to con-
tribute in respect of the private
sector.” Users, preparers and
auditors of accounts should
foot the bilL

The Government is prepared
to put up less than Elm,
through a £1 levy on all compa-
nies. The rest of the £3m to

£4m cost would have to found
from other sources.
The government plans a

review panel to ensure compli-
ance with standards. The panel-
would be empowered to take
companies to court on account-
ing practices.

The accountants say only
the Trade Department should
be able to do that.

The CCAB also wants the
Government to take more
responsibility for appointing
members of the Financial
Reporting Council which will

oversee the system's operation.
Full details of the Govern-

ment’s plans will be revealed
when amendments are tabled
to tbe Companies Bill this
month.

Move suggested to extend
jurisdiction over fraud
By Robert Rice

A DRAFT bill to reform the
rules governing the jurisdic-
tion of the UK courts over
offences of international fraud
and dishonesty bas been put
forward to the Government by
the Law Commission.
The Government’s law

reform body says changes to
the jurisdictional rules which
date back to the last century
are urgently needed in the age
of computers and modern
methods of communication and
transfer of money across
national boundaries. Under the
present law, UK courts can try
a completed offence of fraud or
dishonesty only if the last
event necessary for its comple-
tion took place in Britain.
The draft bill identifies 15

offences where the commission
believes that the present juris-
dictional rules should no lon-

ger apply. The bill would give
tbe UK courts the power to try
all such offences if any of the
acts that make up the com-
pleted offence took place in
Britain.

The original list of offences
proposed by tbe commission
was limited to the principal

offences of theft and obtainini
by deception, false accountinj
and blackmail and offences o
forgery, it later added thre<
specific offences to the list
false accounting by companj
directors; dishonestly procur
ing by deception the executior
of a valuable security; and ban
dling stolen goods.

It has rejected suggestions tc

include offences of insider deal
ing, misleading statements ir

connection with investmenl
business, fraudulent induce'
meats to make a deposit, fraud-
ulent trading and cheating the
public revenue, on the grounds
either that the offences are
unlikely to raise jurisdictional
issues or because they are cov-
ered by the broader concepts ol
offences of dishonesty.
The bill is also designed to

catch those who plan frauds in
one country and carry them
out in another. At present
those who hatch their plots in
the UK to defraud elsewhere
cannot be tried in UK courts.

Jurisdiction Over Offences oj
Fraud and Dishonesty with a
Foreign Element. Law Com No
ISO. HMSO. £6.60.

Stricken gas plant reopens
By Steven Butler

THE St Fergus gas plant near
Peterhead. Scotland, is to
resume limited operation at
the weekend and is expected tc

be back to normal operating
capacity within two weeks.
Shell Exploration and Produc-
tion. the operator, said yester-

day.
The plant was closed on

Wednesday after tbe discovery
of cracks in key gas processing
equipment, causing a drop of 7
per cent in UK gas supplies.

As a result of the closure,

however. British Petroleum
yesterday was forced to cut oil

production at the Magnus field

by 79,000 barrels a day to com-

ply with Energy Departmen
limits on flaring gas. UnJiki
other fields affected by the clo
sure. Magnus has no facilities

to reinject into the reservoii

gas which is produced aionf
with the oil.

The Government yesterdaj
set a daily limit of 30m cu ft foi
gas flaring. Putting that intc
operation would restrict pro-
duction at the field to 60,Q0(
barrels a day.

Shell yesterday had no fur-

ther word on when the Cormo-
rant Alpha platform, which
suffered a gas explosion last
week, would be hack in opera-
tion.
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Ashdown’s island stronghold under threat
Ivor Owen on the prospects for a ‘jewel in the SLD crown’ in the council elections

F OR Mr Paddy Ashdown,
leader of the Social and
Liberal Democrats, the

Isle of Wight has a political

significance approaching that
which Generalissimo Chiang
Kai-Shek used to attach to
Taiwan when he Fantasised
about using it as a springboard
for mainland incursions.
According to his critics, Mr

Ashdown is afflicted by similar
delusions, with his claims that
the SLD (or the Democrats, as
he prefers the party to be
known) is on course to replace
Labour as the only realistic

alternative to the Conservative
Party.
Mr Ashdown believes that

votes cast in local government
elections are more reliable
than public opinion polls when
it comes to checking the
nation's political pulse.

The Isle of Wight, close to
the coast of Conservative
Hampshire, is the only county
authority in England and
Wales controlled by his follow-

ers, and the importance of its

role as a pace setter is in
inverse proportion to the size

of its 99,000 electorate.

In the past the island, a mag-
net for holiday makers, has
provided a favourite home for
Queen Victoria, a prison for

King Charles I. ar.d, in political

terms, now constitutes a jewel
in Mr Ashdown's crown.
However, the bauble might

well lose some of its shine on
Thursday should the existing
overall majority of 11 be
chipped or more seriously
blemished by the determined
challenge being mounted by

the Conservatives in the
island's 43 wards.
Mr Ashdown already knows

that, along with many of his

Parliamentary colleagues, his

followers on the island have
yet to be convinced that they
can fight successfully under
the SLD or Democrat label.

They do not regard it as an
acceptable price to pay for
retaining the link with the for-

mer members of the Social
Democratic Party who turned

their backs on Dr David Owen
and agreed to merge with the
Liberals when the Lib-SDP alli-

ance sundered.
Mr Morris Barton,the leader

of the Isle of Wight county
council, persists in calling it a
“Liberal" authority, and with
his colleagues Is entering
Thursday's contest under a
"LIBERAL Democrat" banner.
To judge by outward appear-

ances. the imminence and sig-

nificance of the election has
made little impression on the
majority of islanders, whose
relaxed attitude to politics

seems to be shared to a sur-

prising degree by Mr Barton.

With polling day just over a
week away he was still holi-

daying overseas.
Time will tell whether it was

a display of coolness under fire

or foolhardiness by the council

leader, who has switched from
a ward in Newport, the island's

administrative centre, which
he represented for many years,

to one in Cowes, where he now
lives.

In the eyes of his political

rivals - apart from Conserva-
tives, there are Labour, two

Paddy Ashdown: a belief

in local indicators

Green Party candidates and
independents (but none of Dr
Owen’s Social Democrats) —

he is a politician on the run.

During the eight years they

have been in control, the Liber-

als have repeatedly urged the
Government to recognise that

the island has a number of spe-

cial ills - notably, an unem-
ployment rate well in excess of
the national average - not
common to much of the pros-

perous south-east region of
which it is part.

There is cross-party agree-

ment that unemployment
might soar if Plessey’s radar
establishment at Cowes comes
under threat as a result of the
takeover bid launched by the

General Electric Company of
the UK and Siemens of West

Germany.
Plessey provides some 10.000

jobs, both directly and indi-

rectly, and the closure of the

radar establishment would also

have serious implications for

the island's other lading pri-

vate sector employer, West-
land's aerospace division.

The Conservatives are led by
Mrs Angela Clarke, who recalls

with pride that her response to
complaints by Liberal council-

lors that the Government bad
ignored the island's claim for

special treatment was a
Thatcherite injunction to “stop
whining.”
She mflintainH that the coun-

cil’s finances have been mis-
managed by the "left-wing"
liberals, while another promi-
nent Conservative councillor
has called for an end to the
“confrontation policies of the
last eight years.”

Irrespective of such charges,
there seems little doubt that
the Liberal tide, which began
its surge when Mr Stephen
(now Lord) Ross captured the
Isle of Wight Parliamentary
constituency from the Conser-
vatives in 1974, has been on the
ebb.

Two years ago the Conserva-
tives regained control of the
Medina district council from
the Liberals, and when Lord
Ross did not seek re-election,

recaptured the parliamentary
seat as welL
Anecdotal evidence suggests

that at one stage, some in the
Liberal hierarchy became so
nervous that unofficial and
informal approaches were
made with the aim of securing

by Labour and
Greens in a rainbow coali-

tion to prevent the Conserva-

tives recapturing the county
council as well.

National issues which so

often sway local government
elections, and which have
caused the slump in the Gov-

ernment's popularity, have
helped to improve morale since

then.
The Conservative camp is

clearly aware that the deep dis-

quiet over the Government’s

proposals for privatising the
water industry has been inten-

sified on the island by the
introduction of water meters
for domestic consumers - part

of a pilot project which could

lead to their national use.
Alarmist reports are circulat-

ing about the higher charges
likely to result Grom metering,
even though no bills are yet

available to provide firm evi-

dence
Labour, not represented on

the Council for the best part of

a decade, and the Greens might
prove to be the jokers in the
pack. Between them they could
open the way for the Conserva-
tives to win the nine extra
seats (they currently hold 13,

the Liberals 27 and indepen-
dents three) required for an
overall majority.

A hung or balanced council

looks mare likely, but what-
ever the outcome, Mr Ashdown
could well find that the next
attempt to persuade his party’s
annual Assembly to give more
prominence to its LIBERAL
connection is promoted from
the Isle of Wight.

Shell plans

car service

centre chain
By John Griffiths

SHELL OILS, a UK subsidiary
of the petroleum multinational,

has begun enrolling what it

hopes will be hundreds of
small, independent garages
into a national chain of service

centres.

The aim - apart from help-
ing Shell to increase its esti-

mated 12-14 per cent share of

the retail oils market - is to
give some of the UK's 22,000
independent garages market-
ing and other support to
increase their chances of sur-
vival
A number of research

reports have indicated that
more than half of existing,
non-franchised garages are
likely to disappear over the
next 10 years as cars become
more complex, the need for fre-

quent servicing declines and a
bigger share of the servicing

market is either retained by
franchised garages or captured
by large service chains.

Shell's aim is to help as
many independents as possible
to stave off the decline, not
least by helping them to pres-
ent the appearance of being a
national chain under the Gem-
ini Service Centre name and
logo, backed by marketing sup-
port.

To that extent, according to
Mr Tim Green. Shell Oils'
retail markets manager, the
scheme bears some similarities

to the national network of
independent grocery stores
united under the Spar name.
The compan> has been pres-

enting the scheme to many of

the independents via a "road-
show" which has been in the
south of England in the past
week. “We've met about 1,000
so far and the initial response
has been very positive," Mr
Green said. He added that
Sheli intended to spend "sev-

eral million" on the scheme.
The basic package. olTcred in

return for five-year agreements
for the Independents to buy
most but not all of their oils

from Shell, covers marketing
support, livery for the premises
and advice.

The underlying aim is to
project a uniform "quality"
image not cusity achieved by
non-franchised garages, accord-
ing to Shell. Guaranteed ser-

vice standards form part of the
agreement, with formal mecha-
nisms for processing com-
plaints and rectification.

Kinnock attempts to undermine
Thatcher’s 10th anniversary
By Michael Cassell and Charles Leadbeater

MR NEIL KINNOCK, the
Labour leader, yesterday
renewed his attack on the Gov-
ernment's record to try to
undermine the impending
tenth anniversary of Mrs
Thatcher’s premiership.

Addressing the annual con-
ference of the Welsh TUC, Mr
Kinnock accused Mrs Thatcher
of building a “second-rank”
Britain, ill prepared for the
challenges ahpad
The Labour leader also

attended a by-election rally in
the Vale of Glamorgan last

night.

He told the union delegates
that a decade after Mrs
Thatcher won power, the
unemployment level was twice
that of 1979. the country’s
share of world trade had fallen

20 per cent, 170,000 companies
had gone into liquidation and
the burden of personal taxa-

tion was the heaviest ever
imposed.
He claimed the Government

had no excuse for an inflation

rate touching 8 per cent and a
balance-of-payments deficit

likely to reach £18bn this year.

The entire nation was being
punished “for believing the
myth of the Thatcher miracle
and re-electing the myth-mak-
ers."

Mr Kinnock accused the
Government of permitting cru-

cial investment In the coun-
try’s infrastructure and educa-
tion system to drop when the
nation had received £65bn In
oil revenues.
He also launched a wide-

ranging attack on the Govern-
ment's approach to the single
European market, attacking
Mrs Thatcher for “whipping
through” the Single European
Act and then stepping back
from its consequences.
He added: “Mrs Thatcher's

reluctance to operate that
which she legislated is looking
less like concern for sover-
eignty and more like perfidy -
dodginess - treachery - as
the dictionary defines it"

He accused Mrs Thatcher of
confusing sovereignty with
vanity.
In outlining the principles

Labour would adopt for
Britain's rale within the Euro-
pean integration programmer

he said individual governments
had to accept constraints on
their sovereignty and draw up
common rules to regulate mul-
tinational companies, interna-
tional financial markets and
social provisions in EC mem-
ber states.

Mr Jack Cunningham,
shadow Environment Secre-
tary, also accused Mrs
Thatcher last night of presid-
ing over an increasingly
divided, _ debt-ridden . and
crime-ridden community.
• Tonight, Mr Bryan Gould,
shadow Trade and Industry
Secretary, is expected to
accuse ministers of leaving
Britain under-invested and
badly trained, having wasted
North Sea ail revenues on an
import-led credit boom.

Backbench
bills stand

good chance
By Tom Lynch

BACKBENCH BILLS to curb
illegal waste disposal and to
tighten regulation of private-

sector hearing-aid companies
completed their Commons
stages yesterday and stand a
good chance of becoming law.
The Control of Pollution

(Amendment) Bill, sponsored
by Mrs Joan Ruddock, Labour
MP for Deptford, sets up a reg-

istration scheme for commer-
cial carriers of controlled
waste, including builders’ rab-
ble. It has powers to impound
vehicles found fly-tipping if

owners cannot be traced.
The Hearing Aid Council

(Amendment) Bill sponsored
by Mr Jeuan Wyn Jones, ,Plaid

Cymru MP for 'Ynys Mon,
increases consumer representa-
tion on the councfi, set up in
1968 to regulate the industry,
»nH strengthens its disciplin-

ary powers.
The bills, which have strong

cross-party support, now go to
the House of Lords.

Speeding up action on pollution
John Hunt reports on the international maritime conference accord

A fter two weeks or
hard bargaining at an
International Maritime

Organisation conference in
London, representatives of 66
countries reached agreement
yesterday on improved proce-

dures for dealing with environ-
mental disasters at sea.

In the past, efforts to save a
vessel such as a giant oil

tanker have sometimes been
delayed while the shipowner
and the salvage company
argued about the price to be
paid for the operation.
The IMO meeting has gone a

long way to solving that by
rewriting the Brussels Conven-
tion on Salvage, it has drawn
up a formula to guarantee the
salvage company payment for
preventing environmental pol-

lution at sea, even when a ves-

sel and its cargo are not saved.
The main concern Is the

growing danger of oil slicks

from tanker accidents,
although the agreement will

also apply to other hazardous
cargoes such as toxic waste.
Fresh in the minds of dele-

gates was the recent Exxon

Valdez catastrophe, which
resulted in the biggest oil slick

ever known in American
waters and the pollution of a
large stretch of the Alaskan
coastline.

Even more pertinent was the
disaster in 1978 when the
tanker Amoco Cadiz ran
aground off Brittany, releasing
220,000 tons of crude oil on
France's northern beaches. The
public inquiry disclosed that
vital hours were wasted while
the master of the tanker and
the tug captain argued over
the terms of a salvage contract
The Brussels Convention

dates back to 1910, when the
oil industry was in Its infancy
and small vessels transported
oil in barrels. Its main princi-

ple is "no cure, no pay."
That means that a salvage

company will receive payment
only If it is successful in saving
the ship or cargo. It does not
take account of circumstances
where a tug tows a tanker
away from the coast to prevent
pollution and the tanker is

later lost or has to be sunk.
The “no cure, no pay" princi-

ple was embodied in the stan-

dard salvage contract known
as the Lloyd's open form. This
was modified in 1980 to make
some provision for environ-
mental salvage, but it was on a
voluntary basis outside the
framework of the convention.
The IMO has now decided on

a system of special compensa-
tion to the salvage company
where it has carried out work
on a cargo threatening to dam-
age the environment
The salvor will receive the

expenses of the operation plus
an additional payment of 30
per cent of those costa. How-
ever, in special circumstances
an arbitrator could lift the
extra payment to 100 per cent.
Any increment above 30 per

cent would be decided on such
factors as the skill of the sal-

vors in preventing damage to
the environment, the time and
expense involved, and the
degree of danger.
In fact, that formula is a

compromise to take into
account differing views of rep-
resentatives about the scale of
payment. Some wanted the

additional sum set at 30 per
cent and others argued for the
100 per cent ceiling.

In addition, the revised con-
vention gives the master of a
stricken vessel the clear
authority to agree on a salvage
price with the tug captain
without referring the matter
back to the owner of his ship,
which should cut out some
haggling and delay.

Considerable sums are still

involved in salvage in spite of
the decline in world shipping.
In 1986, 130 cases Were dealt

with under the Lloyd’s open
form by the 33 members of the
International Salvage Union.
Property worth £552Jim was
saved and salvage companies
received rewards of £48.lm.
Mr Riaas j. Reinigert, man-

aging director of Smit Tak
International the big Nether-
lands salvage group, recently
called for fair play between shi-

powners and salvors.
“After all it is not a legal

dispute - simply a method of
assessing what is the proper
price to pay for a job which
has to be done,” he said.

WHENITCOMES TO
WATER QUALITY, WE’RE

INOURELEMENT
Drinking water quality is an issue

of growing international importance.

Our multi-disciplined research

approach and wide experience

supports those who set the required

standards and those who have to

meet them.

W?e
WE’REINOUR ELEMENT

WRc Mead Office.

P.O. Bos 16. Maritnr, Btnaringhanahire SL7 2HD.
Telephone: 0491 571531.

CBI seeks to encourage
personal shareholders
By Hazel Duffy

WAYS OF encouraging more
personal and employee share-
holders are to be investigated
by a Confederation of British
Industry task force.

The move, which needs the
agreement of the next CBI
council meeting on May 17,
reflects the efforts by the
employers' organisation to
improve relations between the
City and business.

It is believed that individual
shareholders are more likely to
take a longer-term view of
their companies than share-
holders taking their cue from
the City, which is inclined
towards short-term going
Mr Brian Corby, chief execu-

tive of Prudential Corporation,
will be involved with the task
force, to be set up over the
next year. He was recently
elected deputy president of the

CBI and is expected to become
president next year, the first

from the financial world.
• The CBI council will also be
asked to endorse the proposal
from Mr John Banham, direc-

tor general that all takeover
bids by companies that are
themselves considered bid-
proof should be referred auto-
matically to the Monopolies
and Mergers Commission.
• In an attempt to promote
better understanding between
the City and business, the CBI
yesterday published a guide
explaining what quoted compa-
nies needed to do to communi-
cate effectively with sharehold-
ers and key City audiences.
Improving InvestorHalations.

CBI publications. Centre Point,
108 New Oxford Street, London
WClA 1DV £5 to CBI members,
£10 to non-members.
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Leaders of bus workers in

London reject 7% offer
By John Gapper, Labour Correspondent

THE prospect of widespread
disruption in public transport,,

in London increased yesterday,

when leaders of bus workers
rejected a 7 per cent pay offer.

They are now. likely to ballot

13,300 workers on selective

strike action.

The ballot result would prob-
ably be known on May 8. the.

day that a proposed Indefinite
strike of London Underground
workers over changes to work-
ing practices Is due to start
Talks on that dispute are due
on Tuesday.
London Regional Transport

said yesterday that it was will-

ing to talk further to the
TGWU transport union, which
represents bus platform staff in
London. It implied that it

would consider improving the
revised offer.

The prospect of fresh indus-
trial action over pay comes

amid a series of disputes in

various industries this month.
The rise In earnings and Infla-

• tion has prompted workers to
• seek higher settlements.

There has been sporadic
industrial action on London
buses aver attacks on bus
workers, but the last big indus-

„ trial dispute was over the ten-

dering of routes, .and changes
to pay and conditions, in
1987.

Representatives of London
bus garages are to meet on
Tuesday to consider balloting
on industrial action. TGWU
officials said it was almost cer-

tain that they would opt for a
ballot on a series of 24-hour
strikes.

On Thursday next week,
leaders of engineering workers
are to meet to discuss indus-
trial action in support of a
claim for reduced working

bouts and pay increases
matching the rate of inflation.

London Regional Transport

would discuss details of its pay
offer to bds staff bat said it

would increase overall earn-

ings by about 7 per cent Bus
conductors earn about £186 a
week, and driver/operators

£220.

Although the two disputes at

LRT are not linked, there have

been local disputes on buses

and trains over the past year.

There have been two unofficial

24-hour strikes by tube drivers

and guards in the past few

The bus pay offer covers
platform staff except for those

on four tendered route net-
works where staff pay and con-
ditions have been varied by
LRT. . .

That change was the subject
of the 1987 dispute.

Baker raises targets

for teacher numbers
By David Thomas, Education Correspondent

There are also sharp
increases in the target intake
for trainee secondary teachers
of languages (up 34 pec cent),

science (up 15 per cent) ami
music (up 60 per cent).

These increases include 450
places earmarked for mature
entrants on new training
schemes for secondary teach-

ers of modern languages,
chemistry and music.

'

Mature entrants with rele-

vant experience, including
some higher education experi-

ence, will be able to take a
B-Ed degree, normally a foUr-
yeax course, in two years.
Alternatively, they will be able
to take a part-time post-gradu-

ate certificate of education
while working in their oldjobs.
Mr Baker said: “This expan-

sion takes foil account of the
likely demand for new teachers

in the 1990s.”

The Government has already
announced plans to allow
mature entrants to the teach-

ing profession to train on-the-

job in classrooms.

THE Government has bowed to

fears of severe teacher short-

ages by announcing an
increase of almost a tenth in

teacher training provision in
1990.

It is also earmarking 450
places for novel training
schemes for mature entrants to

teaching who would prefer to

train part-time or to take a
shortened degree.
The expected demographic

decline in the number of 18-

year-olds and the demands of

the new national curriculum
have recently led to wide-
spread predictions of severe
teacher shortages in the early

1990s.

Mr Kenneth Baker, Educa-
tion Secretary, yesterday
announced a target of 23,172

new places for trainee teachers

in England and Wales in
1990-91, 9.5 per cent above the
1969 target
The target 1990 intake of

trainee primary teachers has
been set at 12^50, a 10J2 per
cent increase.

Unions ‘must look ahead9

By Charles Leadbeater, Labour Editor

MR JOHN MONKS, deputy
general secretary tithe TUC,
yesterday called on unions to

swim with the tide of employee
relations development in the
1990s, rather than sigh for a
past which “looks better with
hindsight than it did at the
time.”

Mr Monks said the union
movement’s future depended
on developing more strategic

approaches to collective bar-

gaining and more sophisticated

membership services, rather
than on repeal of the Govern-
ment's union legislation or on
moves to strengthen workers’
rights in the EC.
Mr Monks told the Wales

TUC annual conference in
Swansea: “We look forward to

working with a Labour govern-
ment headed by Neil Kinnock.
But the events of the past 10
years cannot be rolled hack
overnight. Necessary though
legal changes are to help Indi-

viduals, no laws wifi right all

the wrongs.”
'Hie unions’ own efforts to

. improve their performance
rather than new labour' laws
would be the foundation for

the movements future
strength.

"We have to sell the unions.

People are sophisticated con-
sumers. They expect a crack-

ing good service. And that Is

what we must give to make the
breakthrough in recruitment,”

Mr Monks said.

Union negotiators would
have to press for improved
training a™ better ehim care
provisions for women workers
ih the light of looming short-

ages of young workers.
Mr Monks said this would

happen only with a lessening
of inter-union competition over
single union deals, and with
new services, such as cut-price
credit cards.
He also signalled the TOCs

determination to encourage
unions to introduce simpler
collective bargaining proce-
dures, something employers in
manufacturing are increas-
ingly seeking.

Employers
expect legal

challenge to

docks ballot
By Fiona Thompson,
Labour-Staff .

PORT employers are set to
mount a legal i^anonpi to (he
dockers’ ballot • calling for
strike action In the wake of
tiie proposed abolition of the

Dock Labour ScZmme.
The TGWU transport union,

which represents the dockets,
said yesterday -that ballot
papers on industrial action
would be in district offices on
Tuesday morning. The 9,400
registered dockers will vote in
a workplace ballot the follow-

ing Monday, and the result
should be known on Friday.
Hay 19.

Mr Nicholas Ftaney, director

of the-National Association of
Port Employers, wrote to his

executive yesterday saying he
expected a number of employ-
ers to challenge the legal
validity of the muon calling a
strike ballot

.

It Is thought that Associated
British Ports, the biggest
employer, would be one of the
first to contest the issue.

“It is doubtful whether a
trade dispute exists With all

employers,” Mr Finney said.

“IndividahI employers are
makingH dear that.local dis-

cusstotts will be neCessary and
welcome.”
However, Mr Bill Morris,

TGWU deputy general secre-
tary* said that fie had written
to more than 40 of the regis-

tered port employers setting a
deadline of noon yesterday for
employers to agree to talks on
a national' agreement to
replace the statutory scheme.
He said he had more than 80

responses, all of which either
ignored or rejected his
request “Hence our decision
to send the ballot papers out”
Mr Morris said that, after

legal consultations, the union
was “absolutely satisfied that
it la a trade dispute," and the
union would strongly resist
any challenge to that status in
the courts.
The employers’ letter was “a

last desperate cry from an
organisation that has lost all
the arguments,” he said. Mr
Morris was confident Of an
overwhelming vide to hold a
strike.

Training cash bid in Birmingham
By Fiona Thompson

EMPLOYERS in Birmingham
yesterday submitted their
application for funding to
establish a Training and Enter-
prise Council in the city.

The Government wants to
establish 100 of the employer-
led training bodies throughout
the country in the next four
years and Rfr-mingham hopes
to be among the first. With a
turnover of £50m. it would cer-
tainly be one of the largest

In its application document,
the Birmingham employers say
the overriding priority was to
persuade individual employers
in the area to Invest more
money in training employees.
That was a necessity, rather
than an altruistic gesture.

They explain that Birming-

ham’s economic growth over
tiie next decade is more likely
to depend more on the avail-
ability of trained workers than
on any other single factor.
The interim chairman of the

Birmingham TEC is Mr Ray
Way, chairman of Birmingham
& Handsworth Dairies. Here
are four other company direc-
tors on the board and a repre-
sentative from the city conned
A consultative group which

will meet the board every six
months will include represen-
tatives from unions, commu-
nity groups, local authorities,
training providers and employ-
ers* organisations.
# The Government yesterday
launched a £450,000 pilot
scheme to deliver training

courses via the European
Space Agency’s dew communi-
cations satellite Olympus, due
to be launched into orbit in
June. -

The scheme, which is tended
by the Training Agency, will
deliver 60 hours of broadcast
training programmes in infor-
mation technology for engi-
neers and in business skms.
They will be supplemented by
open learning material.
The courses will be live and

will allow up to 1000 partici-
pants to respond to the pre-
senter at the Polytechnic South
West, ih Plymouth. Mr John
Cope, Minister of State for
Employment, said it was
important to use technology to
extend training.

Construction fnnds change is criticised
By Our Labour Staff

PROPOSED changes in
funding for the Government's
Youth Training Scheme in the
construction industry have
been criticised by unions and
employers for putting at risk
the number of apprenticeships.
The criticism comes amid

uncertainty about the future of
the Construction Industry
Training Board, which has pro-
posed the changes to save
£3Gm now raised from a
national levy of employers.
The board is among the

national training bodies which
face uncertainty because of the
Government's attempt to
devolve responsibility to local
Training and Enterprise Coun-
cils led by employers.

Leaders of construction
unions and employers have
written to the CfTB to question
its proposal that the wages of
YTS construction trainees
should be paid from the start
of their courses directly by
employers.
Construction employers do

not now have to pay anything
in the first year for YTS train-
ees, or employ them directly.
That rule has been used by
employers to establish a pool
from which the best trainees
can be picked.
The (3TB has suggested that

it should pay about £20 a week
in grants for each YTS trainee,
which the Budding and Allied
Trade Joint Industrial Council

has estimated -will lei

employers to pay £30 j
other costs.

Mr Bill Hilton, employ)
side secretary, said
increase in costa would b
serious disincentive. Ai
speaking to several employ
he thought there would b
Mg effect tei YTS intakes.
• Leaders of construct
unions have rejected a

]

offer of 5.1 per cent to 600
workers from the employe
side of the Buflding and C
Engineering joint board.
Albert Williams, Ucatt gem
secretary, Said the offer i

“totally unacceptable" wl
earnings in other indnsti
were tiatogat about 9 per



Extractsfrom ICIChairman DenysHenderson s address

to theAnnualGeneralMeetingofImperial ChemicalIndustriesPLC

on28thApril 1989.

T here are three themes which I want to pursue this

morning. First, the continuing success of ICI as

exemplified bythe 1988 results; second.Id as acompany

that will not restcm that success but willcontinue actively building

for consistent, profitable growth as it pursues its aim to be the

world’s leading chemical company. And third.Idand its responsi-

bilityto thecommunity.

Hallmarks ofsuccess

First, last year's results. In 1988 every important finanrial

indicator showed that we did better in comparison with 1987.

Sales volume was up 7%, profits increased by 12% and earnings

per share improved by 14%. Interest cover was very strong and

gearing was at a prudent leveL These are the hallmarks of a

successful business on an extremely sound financial base, which

has doubled its profits, earnings and dividends over the last five

years and is poised to enter the 90’s confidently and in robust

shape.

1988 was indeed a very good year and when taken with 1987

shows that we have lifted welldearof the one billion pound profit

plateau which we reached in 1984. In broad terms all three

segments of the business continued to grow strongly; although

very, good local performances in some of the Consumer and

Specialty Products were obscured by the relative strength of

sterling. Industrial Products had an outstandinglygoodyear with

a28% increase in profits and in Agriculture therewas alsoamuch

better result, brought about by the excellent performance of

Agrochemicals. So far this year the demand for our products has

been strong and, as you will have seen from the First Quarter

results announced yesterday, we have made an excellent start to

the year. I do feel, however, that measures taken internationally to

kerb inflation will inevitably slow down economic growth

somewhat in the future.

Against our achievements of the last five years and our belief

that the re-shaped ICI should be much more resilient to economic

cycles the Board feels fully justified in recommending a substantial

22% increase in the dividend.

Building forthefuture

Let me turn now to ICI as a company that is not only successful

today but onethat is actively building for continued success in the

1990’s and beyond. We are not simply in the business of earning

short term profits, important though that is. We are in the

business ofbuilding forthe future toensure thatwe have a lasting,

growing, world class enterprise. This is why we invest heavily in

research and development and why we pursue consistent, long

term global strategies for our businesses. We are spending over

£1.5 million per day on our research and technology which is of

critical importance to Id’s future prosperity. Innovation is our

lifeblood. Without itno international chemical company can hope

to survive, let alone aspiretogrow in theyears ahead.

Positioned forgrowth

WehavepositionedIQ> businesses in the majorgrowth markets,

with welldiverged and predominantly high technology products

in our portfolio. We have strengthened our position in North

Americaand are acceleratingourexpansion in the FarEast, where

the business environment is different and not without risk, but

wheregrowth potential is very considerable. For example, in 1988

in Japan we purchased an industrial site of 18 hectares at

Tamatsukuri, approved a ‘Melinex’ polyesterfilm plant to be built

oa that site and obtained a listing on the Tokyo Stock Exchange.

In addition, we are broadening our operations in Taiwan and

SouthKorea.

It is this kind of long term strategic thinking thatnow finds us

so well positioned for 1992 in Europe. The work began as long

ago as 1960 when we had no Continental manufacturing

facilities, and just 750 European employees. Todaywe sellmore in

Continental Europe than we do in the UK. There are 16,000

people employed in Continental Europe and 50 manufacturing

sites serving 25,000 Continental customers. With the integration

of the European market in 1992, we will be developing and

expanding our organisation to meet the needs and challenges of

that market. We are well placed to do so because for us this will

represent onefurther step in acontinuous strategic process.

Strengthening the business

Ifwe look backover the last fiveyears , we see thateveryone ofour

three business segments has been strengthened considerably. Our

Industrial Products businesses have been strengthened by the

restructuring which formed ICI Chemicals and Polymers, where

costs savings plus a process of plant rationalisation across Europe

has trebled their profits. In Consumer and Specialty Products,

Pharmaceuticals profits are up by 50% over the five year period

and Paints profits have quadrupled. Colours and Fine Chemicals,

Polyurethanes, Specialty Chemicals and Films have all markedly

improved their results. On top of that, we are spending significant

sums on research and development to ensure that in the years

aheadwe will have strong, new businesses.

The problems of the fertilizer industry have been more than

offset byour progress in Agrochemicals where, with the acquisition

of Stauffer Agrochemicals in 1987, we are now number two in

the world league and profits have more than doubled over the last

five years.

Some of these good results have, of course, been helped by

favourableeconomic conditions but in the main they are the result

of determined management action matched by a superb response

from our own employees to the challenges which change always

brings with it. It is one thing to have the necessary vision that

change is required. It is quite another to achieve it. Our results

since 1983 show that ICTs track record is one of both perceiving

the need for change and, even more importantly, making it

happen.

ICIand thecommunity

That bringsme tomy third theme -IQ and the community.

There are two aspects which I wish to emphasise. Firstly, our

firm belief that the chemical industry is a major force for

improvement in the quality of life across the world. This

contribution goes largely unobserved, but without the chemical

industry there would be more sickness, less attractive clothing,

less satisfactory housing, heavier; less fuel-efficient transportation

andmuch more expensive, less freely available food.

Secondly there is pur commitment to operate safely and in

harmony with the global environment to which we are devoting

significant resources. Of course, we know we are not always

perfect; there are areas in which we need to improve our

performance and we are working on them. The public expects us

to have high standards, and always to strive to do better We accept

that situation unhesitatingly. The way in which we run our

operations is every bit as important as our obligation to create

wealth and well-being for our shareholders, our employees, our

customers and thecommunities which we serve.

Thus I very much regret the explosion at Peterborough which

resulted in loss of life and severe damage to property. The cause is

being thoroughly investigated. We are much saddened by the

incident and our sympathygoes to all those who suffered; and our

gratitude to the emergency services. I also pay tribute to our

employees directly involved who behaved admirably in difficult

circumstances.

I also believe that we must go for complete elimination of

CFCs, not just their reduction. That is why I recently accepted an

invitation to address the Prime Minister’s Conference on “Saving

theOzone Layer”, and why I was determined to give a positive and

unambiguous lead on behalf of ICL At the same time it has to be

recognised that CFCs are not yet replaceable in some very

important applications but we are urgently seeking to produce

alternative products. To that end we are spending £100 million in

a programme of research and development and hope to build

plants to produce alternative products, although there is still a

considerable way to go before we can be sure of success in this

difficult area of technology.

IQ takes its responsibilities to the community very seriously.

We will do everything within our power to ensure that we operate

as safely as possible and will continue to invest significant sums

to protect ourenvironment

Ourworldwide team

Ever since IQ was created we have sought to attract, train and

motivate the very best of people. Our international strength is

foundedon the dedicationofouremployees. It is a privilege forme

to lead such a team and it is equally a privilege to present the

results whichwe have achieved worldwide in 1988.
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The changing

agenda
THE SINGLE most important
political achievement of the
Conservative Party under the
leadership of Mrs Margaret
Thatcher nmy be that it set a
new agenda. The question now
is whether circumstances are
dictating a change. Next
Thursday Mrs Thatcher will

celebrate the loth anniversary
of her arrival in office as Prime
Minister. The Tories have won
most of the arguments during
that eventful decade - and
possibly for longer, if you
include the last, crumbling
years of the Labour Govern-
ment of 1974-79. What is now
open to question is whether
the nostrums that arose during
the chaotic 1970s. and have
served so well during the 1980s,
are relevant to the 1990s.

The present state of public
opinion on this matter will be
measured to some degree by
the forthcoming local elections
in England ana Wales and the
parliamentary by-election in
the Vale of Glamorgan. These
contests take place next Thurs-
day. It is likely that on the
following morning their results
will be closely analysed to see
whether the voters are turning
away from the menu of tight
public expenditure control,
more competition and more
privatisation.

Opinion polls published this
week suggest that the Labour
Party may do well - for two
principal reasons. First, the
high rates of interest and infla-

tion are a continuing source of
worry to most voters. Second,
the Government's recent white
paper on the National Health
Service has led to widespread
disquiet, particularly in the
Vale of Glamorgan, where the
doctors' campaign against the
proposals appears to be having
some effect. The Government’s
argument with the medical
profession may well be settled

before the year is out: this fac-

tor can, therefore, be excluded
from long-run calculations
about the British political cli-

mate. What is difficult to
include, because it is still half-

formed, is the effect of the
Labour Party's reconstruction
of its organisation and policy

stance.

Some equilibrium
Another complicating factor

is the medium-term economic
outlook, which remains
clouded. This week's trade fig-

ures have offered some encour-
agement to the markets, while
several other indicators, nota-

bly the trend in house prices,
may be taken as evidence of a
gradual return to some sort of
equilibrium following the over-
heating exacerbated by the
19SS Budget. It is, however, too
soon to say whether this all

adds up to the hoped-for “soft-

landing."

All these considerations are

of an immediate, short-term
nature. What Is harder to dis-

cern is the long-term trend in
British political thinking.
Three agenda items are in a
process of rapid change. They
are: public expenditure control,

the environment, and Europe.
The Government's tight grip

on public spending constitutes
a major success of the
Thatcher years. It has, how-
ever, resulted in the build-up of
a large fiscal surplus. What is

now being asked is whether
that grip should be very
slightly relaxed, in order to
meet the demand for greater
expenditure on education,
training, public transport and
roads, environmental enhance-
ments, and assistance to the
poor.

Wasteful spending
The Treasury view is that

more is being spent on virtu-

ally ail these desirable ends,
mainly out of funds released
by the foil in unemployment
and the sale of assets. To go
further would be to risk a del-

uge of wasteful spending. It

would be inflationary to return
the surplus in further tax cuts,
so the best place for the money
is in the redemption of the
national debt. This view is

under increasing challenge.
The Prime Minister herself

has taken the lead in fostering
a national debate on the envi-
ronment She is right to do so.

The difficulty for her Govern-
ment, however, lies in the con-
tradictions between environ-
mentalism and the free
market. The free market would
allow as much land as possible
to be used for building; Conser-
vative voters in the south east
want the fond around their vil-

lages to be kept as green as
possible. The market is not
conscious of the noxious emis-
sions of industry; only regula-
tion, tax incentives, subsidies,
or control could ensure that
these are reduced while the
playing field is kept leveL

It is also Mrs Thatcher’s
ambition to set the agenda for
European politics, but Britain’s

fellow-members of the EC may
now be turning the tables on
her and finding a fault line in
British politics. It has always
been there: Britain remains
divided, as ever it was,
between reluctant and enthusi-
astic Europeans. There is no
great Love on the Tory back-
benches for the quasi-federal
dreams of Mr Deters, yet most
Conservatives know in their
hearts that sooner or later
Britain will be pulled into a
form of continental unity. The
Cabinet debate on membership
of the European Monetary Sys-
tem is once again becoming
heated; when that is behind us,
the further steps outlined by
Mr Delors will have to be
faced.

Peter Riddell assesses US President George Bush’s first 100 days in

T hese are unheroie
days in Washington -
a time for small steps
rather than big leaps,

for bipartisan co-operation
rather than partisan confronta-

tion, for consensus rather than
ideology, for deal-makers
rather than dreamers.

President George Bush this

morning celebrates the tradi-

tional first milestone of 100
days in office faced by a bar-

rage of assessments welcoming
Iris style in office but sceptical

about the substance of his
record. A caretaker president,

passive, putting off problems
and lacking a coherent agenda
have been common criticisms.
The Bush presidency is, how-

ever. different from those of
his activist predecessors, such
as Roosevelt, Kennedy and
even the 1981 Reagan, who set
such a store by the 100 days
landmark as a sign of their
dynamic start in office.

Neither by temperament,
conciliatory and reactive, nor
by circumstance - the need to
share power with a Democrat-
controlled Congress - is Mr
Bush such a dominant leader.
By temperament, Mr Bush is

not someone who sets the
agenda, or seizes the initiative.

He likes being friendly with
politicians and press alike - to
“schmooze”, as it has become
known in Washington. He
wants to be liked, to work by
consent and compromise. Sena-
tor Bob Dole, the Republican
Minority leader in the Senate
and Bush's old political rival,

has noted that, while politi-

cians feared President Reagan
(“you knew that this guy had a
hard core and. if you didn’t try
to support him, you were going
to be in trouble”), they are not
afraid of his successor.
By circumstance, Mr Bush is

also limited by having served
for the past eight years as vice
president However much Mr
Bosh, and his aides, at times
distance themselves from the
past there are ties not only of
loyalty - as in a oratually-con-
gratulatory meeting with Mr
Reagan in California on
Wednesday - but also of
belief. Mr Bush thinkw the US
is well placed - with seven
years of growth and low unem-
ployment - and. there is no
need for a radical shift. He
does not see the country in the
severe short-term crisis which
Presidents Carter and Reagan
believed they faced in 1977 and
1981.

Comparing himself with
Martin Van Buren, the last sit-

ting vice president to be
elected president, in 1838, Mr
Bush said, “we didn’t come in
here throwing the rascals out,
to correct an the ills of the
world in 100 days." (He con-
fessed not knowing that Van
Buren’s first 100 days were
marked by food riots and bank
closures.) During a hectic tour
this week Mr Bush self-con-

sciously protested that he did
not “feel compelled or pressed
to reach out for something dra-
matic" just because of the
occasional press column.
As politically important have

been the constraints resulting
from the tone and the result of
last year’s election. Not only
did Mr Bush himself offer few
new ideas, hut the Democrats
- returned with increased
majorities in both the Senate
and the House of Representa-
tives - have felt able to chal-

lenge the President’s proposals

Reaffirming ties of loyalty and belief: President George Bush and former President Ronald Reagan this week

The age of consent
and compromise

and to offer their own.
Mr Bush has followed his

natural inclination to co-oper-
ate and compromise by seeking
deals with Congress from the
start So, instead of the Impe-
rial Presidency of the 1960s and
early 1970s, for a time revived
by Ronald Reagan, there has
been coalition government,
where the executive works
closely with the legislature.

The most striking example
has been the agreement which
Mr James Baker, the Secretary
of State, reached in March with
Congress over Central Ameri-
can policy. This has reversed
the Reagan approach by aid-
ing military support for the
Contras in Nicaragua and pro-
viding non-military support
until next February, subject to
review and veto by Congress in
November. The deal is meant
not only to open up the scope
for negotiations in the region
but also to resolve one of the
most divisive foreign policy
issues of the past decade.

The Central American
accord will provide the pattern
which Mr Baker, a natural
political compromiser, mil fol-

low in seeking a bipartisan
approach to other issues such
as the search for peace in the
Middle East, and East/West
relations. Last Tuesday’s
defence budget was also dis-

cussed In advance with Demo-
cratic committee chairmen.
This consensus approach has

the virtue over the frequent
inertia In domestic policy of

the later Reagan years that at
least something happens. For
instance, Mr Nicholas Brady,
the Treasury Secretary, has
produced long-overdue propos-
als for dealing with the col-

lapse of many savings and
loans institutions and with the
previous impasse over Third
World debt. In both cases
doubts have been expressed
over details and the long-term
impact, but the pinna may help
to check a rapidly deteriorat-

ing position. In the process, Mr
Brady’s initial bumbling and
accident-prone repntation has
undergone a striking revision
in the Washington press,
where he is now being pres-

ented as the unsung success
story of tiie administration.

Coalition governments suf-

fer, however, from many disad-

vantages - notablya tendency
towards the lowest common
denominator. This has been
compounded by a sluggish and
divided Congress. After the
excitements of the late winter
in the debates over, and ulti-

mate rejection of, Mr John
Tower as Defence Secretary (in

itself a big early setback for Mr
Bush), the Senate has recently
been largely inactive or in
recess. And the House has
been consumed by fierce
infighting over ethical stan-
dards, particularly by the still

uncertain future of Mr Jim
Wright, the Democratic
Speaker. The legislative record
so far is negligible.

The only achievements have

been where there has been lim-

ited disagreement on objec-.

Uvea, as over Central America
policy and rescuing the savings
and loans institutions Neither
from the President nor from
the Congress has there been
any wiTUngruess to take risks.

Hie liking for compromise has
resulted in fudge. Faced with a
choice between two mobile
strategic missiles, and a clear
preference from the Pentagon,
Mr Bush choose both so as to
win support from Congressio-

nal Democrats. So deployment
of the rail-bom multi-warhead
MX is to go ahead while money
is also spent on the develop-

ment of the single-warhead
truck-borne Midgetman.

Similarly, in domestic policy,

Mr Bush has sought to have it

both ways in proposing a lim-

ited increase is the minimum
wage. This did not satisfy the
Democrats ««d labour unions.
It also displeased many Repub-
licans _ancL economists who
believer such & minimum is the
wrong way to help the poor
and prefer an expansion of the
earned income tax credit
The most conspicuous fail-

ure has been over the Budget
Both the President and the
Congressional leaders have
constantly reaffirmed the
urgent need to reduce the Bud-
get deficit to restore balance to
the US economy. But con-'
strained by his “read my lips,

no new taxes" pledge of last

year’s campaign, Mr Bush’s
own deficit reduction proposals

on February 9 relied on over-
optimistic economic assump-
tions and creative accounting
on the expenditure side. Under
strong constituency pressures
to preserve spending pro-
grammes, Democratic leaders

' were unwilling to be blamed
for proposing tax increases. -

So. after two months of
talks, the Rose Garden agree-
ment of two weeks ago was a
flimsy document signed by the
Administration and Congress
largely because they believed

there had to be an agreement
rather than because they
believed In its contents. Even
Mr Bush concedes that it was
only a first step towards reduc-
ing the deficit Thanks to "blue
smoke and mirrors" it may be
possible to get by this year
with figures which people
unconvincingly protend .are
consistent with the statutory
deficit target of glOObn (E60bn)
for fiscal 1990 - though «i30bn
to $l40bn looks more realistic.

But the hard decisions

.
both on spending priorities

and. more particularly, on tax
- have been put off until next
year. In theory, talks on a mul-
ti-year deficit reduction pack-
age are supposed to start
within the next few weeks but
no One believes there will be
serious negotiations until the
President is willing to discuss
tax increases. AniTthere is no
sign of that yet
Mr Bush's general liking for

compromise has none the less

.

aroused suspicions among

Republican conservatives who

are watching -for a betrayal of

the Reagan revolution. They

are already worried about tl»

Central American deal with

Congress (which they rightly

see as dumping the Contras as

well as 'limiting presidential

prerogatives); about Mr Bush’s

limited 'proposals for banning

imports of semi-autpmauc
weapons (any restriction on
gun control is heresy to them);

about cuts in the Star Wars/

Strategic Defence Initiative

programme (a totem for right-

wing neo-isolationists); about

- the developing contacts with

the Palestine Liberation Organ-

isation; -and about fears about

tax Increases next year.

More -fundamentally. Gov-

ernment by negotiation leaves

many longer-term difficulties

unresolved. Mr Bush talks of

the need to tackle the US's
underlying problems of lack of
competitiveness. But so far

there have mainly been ges-

tures. The much-trumpeted
plan from the "education presi-

dent” to improve standards
amounted to little more than
$400m in an already squeezed
budget, and the same applies

to care. On the environ-

ment, Mr Bush has won praise

for his proposals to phase out
chloroflaorocarbons (CFCs) to

Heal with global warming, but
has been widely criticised for

his slowness in responding to

the Alaskan oil spiff.

Indeed, the critical question

-about Mr Bush is how he will

react to a crisis. He responded
effectively during last year’s
campaign, but so for as Presi-

dent he has faced few pressing
problems, either domestically

or abroad.' When be does, he
will will require more than the
skills of a conciliator.

To outside-eyes, there is the
paradox that it has been Mr
Mikhail Gorbachev, the leader

of a system of state socialism

which has manifestly foiled,

who has captured the imaglna-
tion internationally, helping to

. divide the Western affiance. By
contrast, Mr Bush appears as

the laggard rather than as the
triumphant leader of the suc-
cessful free market and demo-
cratic system.

'

However, Mr Bash's advisers
recognise the' need to offer an
alternative strategy for the
1990s. The long-awaited foreign
policy reviews, which have cre-

ated speh impatience in
: Europe, look like producing a
shift In the US approach
towards the Soviet Union. This
will move away from concen-
tration almost exclusively on
arms controls, towards a strat-

egy of seeking to encourage
political and economic reforms
in Eastern Europe (already
begun with Poland) and of try-

ing to defuse regional conflicts.

Yet if Mr Gorbachev is a suit-

able leader for the epic dramas
occurring In the Soviet bloc,

Mr -Bush's unheroie style fits

with the popular mood in the
US. where his opinion poll rat-

ings remain high. Bat the
going has been easy so for.

Ccmectlon:
A mechanical error in the set-
ting of the Fcditica Today col-
umn on the opposite page yes-
terday led to the chemical
symbol for carbon monoxide,
CO, appearing. B should have
been the symbol for carbon
dioxide, C02.

i

i

St

\

*

Man in the News
Hans Dietrich Genscher

Exposing
Germany’s
Faustian
dilemma
over Nato
By David Marsh

I
f Mrs Margaret Thatcher
and President George Bush
have passed disturbed

nights this week, flitting
through their dreams Is likely

to have been the restless,
slightly dishevelled figure or
Mr Hans Dietrich Genscher,
the West German Foreign Min-
ister.

Mr Genscher, 62. a leading
member of the liberal Free
Democrats, junior partner in
the Bonn coalition, celebrates

15 years in office next month.
He is the West's longest-serv-

ing foreign minister, the most
wntten-about - and probably
the least well-understood.
He has long been a powerful

actor on the West German
political stage. But the speed
with which he has exploited a
vacuum In Chancellor Helmut
Kohl's battered coalition to
advance his ideas on arms con-
trol has caught both friends
and opponents by surprise.

On Monday. Mr Genscher
flow with Mr Gerhard Stolten-
berg. the new Defence Minis-
ter. on a lightning visit to
Washington, to put directly to
the Bush Administration
Bonn's initiative calling for
East-West talks on cutting
short-range nuclear missiles in
Europe.
Mr Genscher is risking seri-

ous disruption in the Nato alli-

ance. Neither tho US nor
Britain wants such talks since
they fear a gradual move to

remove nuclear weapons from
the Continent.
This week's row over Ger-

many's view on arms control

might look simply like a re-run

of tho disputes over defence
policies which have reverber-

ated between Bonn and Wash-
ington for 10 years.

This time, however, the rift

is wider - and the potential
for damage greater. Mr
Genscher stands in the mid-
stream of currents flowing
through domestic German poli-

tics which, in the next few
years, could make the Federal
Republic much less dependent
on the US for its security -
and more likely to turn to
some form of strategic relation-
slhPVfith the Soviet Union.
The Federal Republic is

standing up more forcefully

than any time since its estab-

lishment in 1949 for what Mr
Kohl termed Germany's own
interests. In a speech to the
Bundestag on Thursday, Mr
Genscher spelled out, more
clearly and more emotionally

than ever before, where these
interests lie.

The foreign minister was
born in a village close to the
medieval trading city of Halle,

in what is now East Germany.
He pays annual pre-Chrtstmas
visits to the region to see

friends and relatives there and
organises reunions of Halle
townspeople in the Federal
Republic.
Mr Genscher’s heart beats

neither in the East nor In the

West - but in the area of Cen-

tral Europe which the Ger-
mans call Mitteleuropa -

roughly corresponding to the

old territory of the Holy
Roman Empire.

In his speech. Mr Genscher
said the Germans had to be

"the main pillar in the bridge
of trust” between East and
West Referring to the govern-
ment’s policy of delaying any
decision on modernising
short-range nuclear missiles
until 1992, Mr Genscher
exposed the fundamental
dilemma caused by West Ger-
many’s membership of Nato
for all the world to see.

The Nato deliberations on
new weapons systems, he said,

applied to missiles which
would strike the Polish and
Czech peoples who bad suf-
fered "such endless sorrow’’
during the Second World War.

Then he referred to East Ger-
many: "it is also a question of
nuclear weapons which can
reach the other part of onr
fatherland . . . The members
of the government swear an
oath to dedicate their forces to
the good of the German people.
The obligation from this oath
does not end at the border

through the middle of Ger-
many. This national responsi-
bility does not exclude my
homeland, the town in which 1

was born and the people who
live In the German Democratic
Republic; no, this responsibil-

ity Includes these people.” The
missiles discussion was a test
to show "how serious we are
over the German nation.”
Mr Genscher has shown

extraordinary vigour and tacti-

cal skill in pushing through his
policies on East-West detente
within the government. The
death last year of Mr Franz-Jo-
sef Strauss, the Bavarian prime
minister and arch-rival of Mr
Genscher. as well as the
removal ofMr Rupert Scholz as
defence minister, has made
this easier. But his policy com-
mands something close to a
national consensus. President
Richard von Weizsicker and
also Mr Hans-Jochen Vogel,
the Social Democratic leader,
have both hacked the Genscher

policy on short-range weapons
this week.
Mr Genscher also makes the

point that West Germany is

not alone on the Continent In
opposing talk of new nuclear
weapons. However, France, as
well as the US and Britain,
does not favour early talks on
reducing the present
short-range nuclear arsenals.
Mrs Thatcher will exchange
views on this point with Mr
Kohl in south-west Germany
tomorrow. Mr Genscher flies to
Paris on Tuesday for informal
talks on disarmament with Mr
Roland Dumas, the French For-
eign Minister.
Mr Genscher’s tendency to

look both East and West in
Europe exposes him to suspi-

cions of unreliability in Nato
capitals. But he has been, in
his own fashion, extremely
consistent He fled to West Ger-
many in 1952 and remains
marked by his experience of
seeing at the end of the war US
troops move out from his
native region in East Germany
to be replaced by the Red
Army. His policies epitomise
German efforts to steer
through a cluster of opposing
forces at the centre of Europe.
Mr Genscher has been at the

forefront of efforts in the last

few years to build up Western
European political and eco-
nomic collaboration. Neverthe-
less, he does stand accused of
not always properly thinking
through the consequences of
his actions.

This is where criticism from
the US and Britain has most
weight. In an interview with
the Financial Times in Novem-
ber 1987, Mr Genscher said:
"We are a people of brooders.
There Is something Faustian in
us - the permanent question-
ing, the knowledge that we can
know nothing - that is some-
thing which is in every Ger-
man. We make every question
more difficult," Mrs Thatcher
and Mr Bush would agree with
that
A senior German politician

who knows Mr Genscher well
rays that Washington and Lon-
don appear to mistrust him
because they do not know
what he wants. He pauses, and
then adds: ”1 don’t either."

CORPORATION PLC

NOTICE TO HOLDERS OF
THE GATEWAY CORPORATION PLC

£66,000,000 5 PER CENT. CONVERTIBLE
BONDS DUE 2002 (THE "BONDS")

In accordance with the requirements of the Trust Deed constituting the
Bonds, The Gateway Corporation PLC (“Gateway") (formerlyThe Dee
Corporation PLC) hereby gives notice to holders of the Bonds that an

offer has been made by S. G. Warburg & Co! Ltd. on behalf of DMWSL
032 PLC for the whole of the share capital of Gateway. The formal offer
document states that the offer extends to Gateway shares allotted, while
the offer remains open for acceptance, on conversion of the Bonds; and
that, to the extent that such conversion rights are not exercised, pursuant

to the City Code on Take-overs and Mergers and subject to the offer
becoming unconditional in ail respects, appropriate proposals will be

made to holders of the Bonds.

Copies of all documents issued to Gateway shareholders by the Board
of Gateway may be obtained from Lazard Brothers & Co.. Limited.
21 Moorfields. London, EC2P 2HT, Morgan Grenfell & Co. Limited.

72 London Wall. London. EC2M 5NL. the Company's Registered Office.
Silbury Court. 41 8 Silbury Boulevard. Milton Keynes. MK9 2NB and the

Paying Agents.

29th April. 1 989 ... .

Uw Directors of Gateway accept responsibility for the information contained m this notice
i o the best of their knowledge and belief (having taken gB reasonable care to ensure that'
such is foe case) the information contained m ihis notice is in accordance with the facts

and does not omit anything likely to affect the import of such information.
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T he first umbrellas of
the season have
sprouted on the beach
at Alexandria. The

Mediterranean shimmers
under an unseasonably hot
April sun. It is Ramadan, the
Moslem fasting month. People
seem distracted. West of Alex-
andria is the new beach resort
of Agaml, the summer play-
ground for Egypt’s well-to-do.

Here there is old and new
money - lots of it - in the
large villas and apartment
blocks that face the sea.

Locals have given preten-
tious titles to the more exclu-
sive locations. It is in the
Champs Elysees area that the
Fayed family, perhaps better
known in Britain these days,
than in its native Egypt, owns
a row of three relatively mod-
est villas shielded from neigh-
bours by a high brick wall.
And it is from here for the

past weeks that Mr Sabh A1
Fayed, the second of the three
Fayed brothers, has been moni-
toring the growing storm over
the control of the House of
Fraser stores group, owners- of
Harrods.
Mr A1 Fayed, a hyperactive

50 year-old with a deep suntan,
is not pleased. He is not
pleased with the British press,
he is certainly not pleased with
Mr “Tiny” Rowland and he Is

enraged by the role -played in
the affair by Mr Ashraf Mar.

.

wan, the millionaire Egyptian
businessmen, whom he accuses
of assisting Mr Rowland to
besmirch the Fayed name.
There are elements here of a
peculiarly Egyptian melo-
drama.

In several interviews with
the Financial Times -
described as his “first and last"
with the press - Mr A1 Fayed
disputed suggestions that the
Fayeds exaggerated their sta-

Tony Walker meets one of the brothers from an extraordinary Egyptian family

At home with the Fayeds
tus as a local family of sub- -

stance at the time of the £6l5m
House of Fraser takeover in
1985. He regards as deeply
offensive recent television
reports that depicted the fam-
ily as virtual slum dwellers.
“We have a terrific back-
ground,” he declared. “We go
back 7,000 years not 800 years."
Mention of Mr Rowland or

Mr Marwan chills the conver-
sation. The head of Lonhro,
Who has fought a long.- cam-
paign to discredit the Fayed
takeover of the House of
FTaser, was “mad at us,” Mr Ai
Fayed says, "because we've got
the best investment in the
UK . . . and it is getting bet-
ter.” He claims that the com-
pany is worth "three or four
times what we paid for it.”

Detailed discussion about
the family's background - the
father was a headmaster -
proved difficult, "Why do you
ask these questions, what is

the relevance?” I was asked
more than once. Salah Al
Fayed was happier to talk
about the more recent origins
of the family wealth.
A picture emerges of

Mobamed Al Fayed, the elder
brother, as an extraordinarily
precocious and lucky young
businessman. His first venture
was an Import-export business
in partnership with Mr Aidsan
Khashoggi, the Saudi million-

aire, who has his own prob-
lems these days. That partner-
ship was formed in 1953,
according to Mr Salah Al
Fayed, who was somewhat

vague on occasions about
dates.

In 1954, Mohamed Al Fayed
married Samira Khashoggi,

- Adnan’s sister. They were
divorced after two years during
which a son, Bmad or “Dodi"
- as he is affectionately
known in the family - was
bom.

In 1956, the year of the
divorce, the Fayeds rented a
large colonial bouse on five

acres of land in the exclusive
Victoria suburb of Alexandria,

not for from the former Monta-
zeh palace of King Farouk.
Mohamed, according to Salah
Al Fayed, subsequently pur-
chased the property at 15
Khaled Pasha Street and it

remains in the family.
The grand house with its 16

rooms, many of them wood-
panelled. Has seen better days.
It was last occupied regularly
by a member of the family -
Salah Al Fayed and his Egyp-
tian-Itelian wife - in 1969 or
1970. Staff look after the prop-
erly, but there has been little

recent maintenance, reside and
out the bouse gives a curious
appearance of having been fro-

zen in time exactly at the
moment when the last of the
Fayeds departed as permanent
residents. Furniture and bric-

a-brac of smother era remain In

plnoe

Mr Al Fayed burrows into
drawers, producing family pho-
tographs and documents from
the past. Here is a portrait of a
young, well-groomed
Mohamed. Here are photo-

graphs of the family on a ski-

ing holiday in Switzerland.
Here is a picture cf "Dodi” as a
child. Here are photographs of
the brothers together, here a
rather garish painting of the
Pyramids signed by Samira
Khashoggi, and here are
Mohamed Al Fayed’s yellowing
business cards from the 1950s.
In one, he is described as
Chairman and Managing Direc-
tor of the Middle East Naviga-
tion Company.
The company was "heavily

nationalised" in the Nasser
nationalisations and sequestra-
tions of the early 1960s.
Mohamed Al Fayed, who trans-
ferred his freight forwarding
business to Genoa at the time,
has not been back to Egypt
since. Downstairs in the
library, the leather-bound vol-
umes on the shelves are mostly
in French. Among the few
exceptions is a collection of
Lloyd's Registers of Shipping
seeming out of place alongside
the antiquarian French titles.

Travelling back to Agami in
his restored cream 1967 Mer-
cedes, Mr Al Fayed observes
that in some ways life had
been easierin the early days in
Alexandria. "1 am sure we are
better off now,” he says in
something of an understate-
ment. "But we have more prob-
lems."
Salah AI Fayed, who lives in

Geneva, headquarters of the
family's holding company, Al
Fayed Investment and Trust
Company (AIT), spends several
months a year in Egypt where

the Fayeds retain relatively
small business interests. Favia,
a freight forwarding company
established in the 1950s, sur-
vives.

Other Egyptian-based com-
panies include De Castro Ship-

ping and Tours. There are
offices in Cairo, Port Said,
Alexandria and Suez. He is
vague about numbers of
employees and the extent of
the family's activities. ‘'Some*
times 1 can't remembers the
names of the companies we
have.” he says.
The Fayeds, or at least Salah

Al Fayed who, among the three

brothers, remains most
attached to his native country,
have been seeking new invest-
ments in Egypt, but on a mod-
est scale. The family bid 330m
(£l7.8m) last year for the his-
toric San Stefana hotel on
Alexandria’s waterfront, but
withdrew the offer when they
discovered that the property
did not include the beach. A
small irony here. Mohamed Al
Fayed was, according to his
brother, the youngest director
of the Anglo-American Nile
company which owned the San
Stefano and the Intercontinen-
tal in Cairo before the com-
pany was nationalised in *Ha

Nasser era.

The Fayeds also tried to buy
the Sheraton at Hurghada on
the Red Sea for $15min 1987
but lost out to a group of Gulf-
based investors. They were
now "trying to find something
else.” Mr Al Fayed’s decision to
break a family rule by talking

to the press was motivated, he
said, by a desire to speak up
for his elder brother whom he
described as a “genius” and
“100 times cleverer than Tiny
Rowland."

“I really feel sorry for my
brother” he says. "He gave a
lot to England . . . they
should make a statue to him
somewhere, not call him the
phony Pharaoh.''

Salah Al Fayed is responsi-

ble for the group’s shipping
and banking interests which
include the Dubai-based Inter-

national Marine Services. He
said the brothers co-operate

closely - he is in contact with
Mohamed Al Fayed almost
every day - and share prop-
erty in common, including a
house at Gstaad. in the Swiss
Alps, which they have owned
Cor some 25 years.

“They ignore that we’ve
been in business for 35 years,
and then they come and say
where did the money come
from," he says rueftilly. “We
are not worrying about any-
thing,” he aridpri. “if yon have
a good past, and you're from a
good background, you can’t go
wrong.”
Mr Al Fayed seems to be

amused by the recent attempts
of Scotland Yard to delve into
the family's background. He
had been to the Marriott hotel
in Cairo discreetly to observe
two British detectives sunning
themselves near the swimming
pool, while they waited for the
Egyptian police to give the
promised co-operation for their

B&aai

Salah Al Fayed at the family's colonial mansion In Alexandria

inquiry. “I don't see why a tax-

payer in the UK should pay for

the policemen to come and
enjoy the sun in the Marriott,
one of the first-class hotels,” he
says.
Mr Al Fayed says he was

opposed from the start to co-

operating with the Department
of Trade inspectors in their
investigations. “It was the
worst (legal) advice in our
whole life,” he says. “We
should have taken the govern-

ment to the international
court ... it was a big mis-
take. I don’t accept anyone to

put his hand in my pocket.”

He added that the Tamily was
determined to fight to preserve
its reputation and to ensure
that it retained control of the
House of Fraser. “My brother
said no one could take Harrods
from him except God,”
observed Salah Al Fayed, “and
he’s right.”

After the grief and goodwill, the rebuilding
On the day of the memorial service for those who died in the
Hillsborough soccer tragedy two weeks ago, Ian Hamilton Fazey,

who lives on Merseyside, contributes these personal reflections

T he great and the good
will congregate with
the ordinary people of

Merseyside in Liverpool Cathe-
dral today in the final, official

memorial service to the H3Hs-
borongh -dead. Afterwards,
this grieving conurbation of
l.5m people will try to get
back to normal life. But no
one believes that life can ever
be “normal" again.
When tragedy hits a single

community few are untouched.
Locally, near my own home In
Crosby, a neighbour died. I

knew him by sight but did not
know him. I know hhn now.
A roofing contractor work-

ing for my closest friend gave
his ticket away to a colleague.

He was killed. A lad who
worked part-time in a local
cafe died. So did a promising
17-year-old cricketer, who also
played rugby for the Gotta XV
of Waterloo, where Iserve as a

voluntary official and where
Mr Kenny Dalglish, managw
of Liverpool football dub,
brings his son to learn the
game on Sundays.
One person I know had 10

colleagues who went to the
match together. Nine had
seats. The tenth, a young
accountant who was to be
married this summer, perished
on the Lepplngs Lane terrace.

Everyone seems to know or be
connected in some way with
someone who died - aid not
one of them a soccer yob.
The last fortnight has

brought a surge of Interna-
tional sympathy. But it has
also exposed the irritation
some feel about Merseyside.
They have tried to prove we

are partly to blame for the
deaths ourselves. Mr Auberon
Waugh, the columnist, says we
are “Not us again!” moaners;
Mr Edward Pearce, his oppo-
site number on a rival paper,
says we live in “the capital of
self-pity.”

People have been wounded
by such words. Liverpool was
founded by a mixture of Lan-
castrian, Welsh and Irish
opportunists. For all their
tough image, their descen-
dants are unashamedly senti-

mental and quick to be hurt.

What the Welsh call hiraeth
- that emotional mixture of

longing, grief and homesick-
ness - is an ingredient of

scouse culture, but Celtic

gloom Is not The people have
a resilience bom of bouncing
back, perhaps too often, from
hard Humour is part of

it, but isn’t fanny. Humour is

serious. Liverpool produces
comedians, not comics. Their
stock-in-trade is tragedy. You

have to be a comedian to live

on Merseyside, we joke.

The scale of the Hillsbor-
ough tragedy is so great that
there have been nojokes about
it, nor will there ever be.
There has been an enormous
sense of loss and hurt, bat
what is going on is not
self-pity, just human decency.
We all grieve together. Per-

haps the anonymous nature of
much London life and the
argy-bargy of commuting rules
out a sense of community, so

that those in the capital can-
not appreciate the networks of
kinship and friendship which
unite people of widely dispa-
rate backgrounds and views at
a time like this.

People are not moaning but
weeping. There is reason to
moan, bat not because of foot-

balL I was not bom on Mersey-
side, but I have lived there for

20 years and have watched
those reasons emerge.
Like other old northern con-

urbations, such as Tyneside
and Teesside, the problem is of
economic structure. The towns
have been based on too few,

usually dying, industries.
Workforces have been depen-
dent on branch factories and
big employers. The climate has
been nnsupportive of entrepre-

neurship, unlike the better-

balanced economies of Greater
Manchester or West Yorkshire.

Such problems take a gener-

ation or more to solve, so it is

not surprising that those least

able to fend for themselves
should moan — not out of
self-pity, but out of anger and
frustration. The latest figures

show that male unemployment
In the Liverpool travel-to-work

area is still 21.5 per cent

In the hands of some on the
left such feelings have in the
past been shaped into a dan-
gerous political force. Mr
Michael Heseltine, the Conser-
vative politician put in charge
of finding a way forward after
the Toxteth riots of 1981,
understood this. He managed
to stop what he called “the
dialogue of the mountain tops”
by shaming people towards
common goals. Since then, less
sensitive ministers confronted
by Labour’s sectarian far left

have found the going harder,
but the present political and
huslness leaders are strug-
gling to undo the damage.

Strangely, they may actually
be helped by the Hillsborough
tragedy. Merseyside has never
been so united or, possibly, on
the receiving end of so modi
goodwill. Building on that
could be the best possible
memorial for the dead.

LETTERS

Hong Kong anxieties PR ProPosed for Eur°PeA From MrAndrew Duff

.

integration w
From Mr Vinod Narain.

Sir, I have followed with
interest the Dill coverage given
by your newspaper to the
recent visit to Hong Kong by
the House of Commons Foreign
Affairs Select Committee.
You point out (leader, April

25) the difficulties in granting
full British passports to the
people of Hong Kong. As an
alternative, you suggest that a
strong, unambiguous state-

ment from the British Govern-
ment that "It would not turn
its back on the Hong Kong peo-

ple In an emergency before or
after 1997” will help to restore

confidence in the territory.

Such a statement would be
insufficient to allay the fears

and anxieties of the people of

Hong Kong. You may recall

that a similar assurance was
given in May 1966 by Lord
Glenarthur. Speaking in the

House of Lords, on behalf of
the British Government, he
said: “We would consider it an
obligation for any future Gov-

ernment to treat with very con-
siderable sympathy the case
for admission to the UK of any
individual British national
under pressure to leave Hong
Kong.” Yet despite this strong

undertaking, more than 100,000

people have left the territory in

the past three years, an out-

flow which shows no sign of

abating.
You describe how efficiently

the 50.000 Ugandan Asians
expelled by fcS Amin in 1972

were airlifted out. I would
respectfully point out that no
one in Hong Kong would wish
to leave in such dire circum-
stances. In order to continue

living here with full confidence

up to and beyond 1997. the peo-

ple of Hong Kong will require

something for more tangible

from HMG than mere oral

assurances.
Vinod Narain,
1425 Prince’s Building,

10 ChaterRoad,
Central,

Hong Kong.

Historic share bargain
rom Mr John Deeley.

Sir, Observer (April 27) says

tat the sale value of the high
iality Mappa Mundi pie share
frtificates may turn out to be
•eater than the offer price cf

1 ,000.

I would go further than this,

suggest that shares at this

-icc are an absolute "snip” -
e are talking about a com-
my with a priceless asset

ilue, a 700 year old tradition

id worldwide coverage.

Informed City acquaintances
-e now speculating that with

fly 7,450 of these extremely
ire shares available, the offer

likely to be heavily oversub-

iribcd - and there is growing
>lk of a strong aftermarket.

with culture vultures willing

to posh the sale value to a pre-

mium of anywhere between 100

per cent and 200 per cent With
predictions of up to half the

buyers rushing to join a stags’

stampede, and clamouring to

donate their instant kilfings to

the Hereford Cathedral restora-

tion fund, there should be
more a botie or two of

celebratory sherry flowing in

the deanery.
prospects for a later British

Cathedrals pic launch have
nevr looked better. As for as I

am concerned, the Government
can keep its water.

John Deeley,

16 Dooms Boat,
Dunstable, Bedfordshire

‘There will always be LTPs’
From Mr C.D. Hickey.

Sir, For the UK to prosper
wc must balance our trade and
control inflation. These targets

ore missed because of the flood

of imports socked into the UK
by the easy availability of
unlimited credit.

There will always be those
who are leas than prudent
(LTP) in managing their
affairs. Most LTPs become will-

ing victims to. .the lure of easy
credit facilities, soductively
offered. Furthermore, many
LTPs (and others) do not real-

ise or care how much this

credit costs - until they must
seek higher income to sendee

their debts. The result is

inflated wage demands to pay
inflated rates of interest

If hire purchase, leasing, and
other secondary forms of usury

were forced into line with real-

ity, say within. 2 per cent erf

frgnk rate (whether above or

below), finance organisations

would find it less rewarding to

serenade the LTPs with the

siren song of easy credit.

CJ3. Hickey,
Jarrtits Farm.
Holcombe. Sussex.

From MrAndrew Duff.
Sir, I wonder if Mrs Thatcher

agrees with Edward Mortimer’s
statement, in his otherwise
admirable and trenchant
article (April 25), that national
governments can “govern the
European Community in a
more arbitrary and authoritar-
ian way than they can get
away with in governing their
respective countries.” 1 doubt if

this is true in the British case.

Of course federalism is vital

in the supranational context if

the EC is to be run in the lib-

eral interest But we need it at
home, too. It is important to
link political reform of the
Community with political
reform of the UK.
Mrs Thatcher does. For

example, she opposes propor-
tional representation (PR) for

the European Parliament not
only because people like me
would get elected, and because
it would be the thin end of the
electoral reform wedge, bnt
also because a single electoral

system would boost the Euro-
pean Parliament’s respectabil-

ity. It would then be more diffi-

cult to dissuade her fellow
heads of government from fol-

lowing the logic of the Euro-
pean single market, and com-
plementing economic

integration with a measured
dose of political integration.

Likewise, the efficient man-
agement of the single market
requires the decentralisation of

considerable executive author-
ity - not to Whitehall, but to

the sub-national level, whether
it be water, health, energy,
safety and training bodies or
local government
A democratic liberal regime,

in such circumstances, would
spawn robust political bodies
at the local and regional level.

Mrs Thatcher, however, has
been quite as anxious to debili-

tate local government in
Britain as she has been to

resist the emergence ofEC gov-
ernment in Brussels.

Moreover, a liberal and fed-

eral Europe requires of the
individual an advanced sense
of European citizenship. Doubt-
less Mrs Thatcher regards as
quite hideous the Democrat
proposals for a Charter of the
European Citizen. But then,
her record on civil liberties is

variable - to put it not more
than mildly — at home.
Andrew Duff,

SLD Candidate. Cambridge and
Bedfordshire North European
Parliamentary Constituency.
IS Mount Pleasant.
Cambridge

Consumer choice reduced
From MrZJE. Headand others.

Sir, The Monopolies and
Mergers Commission has
recently published recommen-
dations (enthusiastically
endorsed, apparently, by Lord
Young and by the press)
regarding breweries and tied
public houses. The Commis-
sion argues, first, that con-
sumer prices have been materi-

ally increased because a small
cartel of producers owns most
of the retail outlets; second,
that consumer choice of prod-
ucts has been materially
reduced.
Most important lending insti-

tutions now own estate agen-
cies. Most now own - at are
tied to - life companies. In
other words - following the
brewery analogy - these insti-

tutions are now already regula-

ting the sale of their own
financial products, thereby
materially reducing the con-

sumer’s choice of products,
and, probably, materially
increasing the true cost to the
consumer of those products, Of
greater commissions on life

pedicles are payable to interme-
diaries owned by the institu-

tions, less “consumer” money

is available for investment by
the life companies - certainly

there are reports that estate
agencies owned by these insti-

tutions are increasing their

rates of commission.)
The Consumers’ Association

and most of the newspapers
seem to have welcomed the

Lord Chancellor’s proposals
that these institutions now be
permitted to provide “convey-
ancing services,” without any
effective protection for the con-
sumer against the inevitable

conflict between the interests

of these institutions and those
of the consumer.
These institutions are

already in the position of the
large breweries. How much
more powerful will they be if

the Lord Chancellor's propos-
als are enacted?
You might wish to give more

consideration to the real effect

of these proposals.

HE. Head.
Geoffrey Harding,
SLR. Foot,

GJL Crews.
Bennett Welch & Co,

Bank Chambers.
Wesloto Bill.

Upper Norwood, SS1S

ADVERTISEMENT

Mortal
engines
From Mr Terry Staton.

Sir. Mrs Avril Cocking’s
interesting letter (April 2)
about the 1882 Channel Tunnel
workings and the Beaumont
tunnelling machine prompts
me to tell you that Colonel
Beaumont's machine was to be
seen for many years - maybe
still - sticking out of the
chalk cliff near the railway
tunnels at the Warren, Folk-
stone.
There have been suggestions

that the machine, or what is

left of it, should be salvaged
and preserved. But who the
owner is probably creates a
problem for those concerned
with the machine's conserva-
tion.

Terry Sutton,
17 Bewsbury Cross Lane,
Whitfield,

Dover, Kent

Roll up
that map
From MrA Agius-Cesareo.

Sir. Your survey on Italy
(April 24) was up to your usual
commendably high standards,
and the accompanying map on
page 44 helped to place Italy's

regions in proper perspective,

unfortunately the map may
also - doubtless unintention-
ally - hinder our plans. It

placed Malta where the Italian

island of Pantelleria should be.

This will create much confu-
sion if tourists or prospective
buyers of Maltese goods
descend on Pantelleria, believ-

ing that they are in Malta.
A. Agius-Cesareo,

Oleander.

A Schembri Street,

Kappara. Malta

BUILDING SOCIETY INVESTMENT TERMS
Applied Net Interest Minimum

Product rate net CAR paid balance Access and other details

Abbey National 101-486 5555) _ Sterling Asset 10.00 10.00 Yearly Tiered lust, or £10K 9.60/935 * bona
Five Star 9.25 9.25 Yearly Tiered instant 8.95/8.75/8.40
High lot Chq Ac 915 915 Yearly Tiered CM bit Chq Card 8.65/8.15/7.00
Current a/e 500 5.12 Monthly El Chq bk/Chq Card

Stare account 6.15 6.24 >2 -yearly El Instant access

Alliance and Leicester* . Capital Choice 10 35 1035 Yearly a.ooc b m l9.75'
,
i - 3m) 19.15"!, - lm)

Gold Pins 925 9.25 Yearly Tiered 8.95/8.75/8.40/8.15 Inst. acc.

BankSave Plus 840 8.40 Yearly £10.000 7.90 £2 la K-*-.6.90 £1+ eur.a/c

Mln.InlL Investment £500
ReadyMoney Pins 615 627 1* -yearly a Instant access

_ Cash Plus 8.15 8.15 Yearly £2,500 7.15 £500*. 6.65 £1-1-. ATM access

Barnsley 10226 7339991 .. Summit 1020 1020 Yearly £25.000 90 days'rw-/p«i -£10K rath let ae.

Birmingham Midshifts .. Quantum Sixty 10.00 1025 M/ij-yrty £25.000 Tiered rates from £1.000
W902 710710).. — .. Magnum 9.50 930 Yearly £25.000 Tiered rates from £100
Bradford and 8lngley(0274 5615451- .. Maxi raiser Bonus 8.50 850 Yearly 0,000 Inst, xcj Bonus for no wthdnuls

Maxi miser lac. 950 950 Yearly £5.000 3 mths./90 day penally

Maxim ber Grwtb 9.80 9.80 Yearly £5.000 5 m.nt_/9Q day penalty

Maxlmkser Tp Rate 10.25 10.25 Yearly £25.000 3 ms not (9.85 mthly/qrtiy/iiyly Inc)

Bristol and West (0272294Z71) - Matrlward 605 624 1; -yearly £1 Inst. Acc £500 7.50
NoJ Capital 10.25 1025 Yearly £25.000 3 months’ notice, £50D 930
Ho.l Income 9.80 10.25 Monthly £25.000 3 months’ notice. £500 9.10
Triple Bonus 9J25 9.25 Yearly £25,000 Tiered to 830 £500* IreHLaec.

Share Account 6.15 624 i* -yearly £1 Instant access no penalty

O'seaj 3Mnths Cap Yearly £25,000 1330 gr. non-UK res-£lK 12.40
Britannia (0538 399394) - - Trident Twelve 10-25 1025 Yearly £25.000 lost acc. £5K 9.75 60d not/loss lnt_

Catbol Ic (01-222 5736/7) - . Jubilee Bond II 10.10 10.10 Monthly £2.000 90-d pen/not m. lot. tfr. 10.42
CenurytEdlnturgliXOai 556 1711) ....- Fxd Rate 2/3 Yrs 9.70 9.94 Choke EL Guaranteed rau 2/3 rears

Ea Pat Fxd Rate 12.40 12.78 Choice £1 GUARANTEED NET + TAX 2/3 years

Chelsea (01-602 0006) . Lion Shs.fi.lssJ 1050 10.50 Yearly £25.000 £500* 9.60 £1QK+ 10.00 3m/lmm Pen
ChelUtihani and Gloucester . Chi- 1 tenham Cold 950 9.50 Yearly £25.000 Uooriily lot available

1024236161)..— . Qdunham Gold 9.25 925 Yearly £5.000 Monthly lm available

Cheshust 10992 26261) . Spec 90 Shares 1058 1053 Yearly £20.000 90 days' noi/cf/nenaJiy

. Spec 90 (e*-pat) 13.16 13.16 M./Y early £20.000 90 days' not/pen Non UK resident

Cheshuntcash 9.25 9.2S U /Yearly £20.000 Instant access. Ttoed a/e

Coventry (0203 252277)— . Moneymaker 935 935 Yearly 125.000 Inst-acc. no pen.

Moneymaker 935 9.15 Yearly £10.000 Mthly Inc £25.000 - 8.97%
3-year Bond 1035 1035 Yearly a, 000 Wlths. 90 days roc/penalty.

90-Oay Option 1035 1035 Yearly £25.000 last aa/no pen It bal £5,000*
90-Day Option 10.00 10.00 Yearly £10.000 Monthly Income option

Frame Setwood (0373 64367) . Gold Minor flee. 9.75 9.99 lj-yeariy El On demand;0-18 year-olds

Greenwich (01-858 8212)-. 60-Qay Account 10.00 10.25 Monthly £40.000 No pen. if £5K remains In acc.

Guardian (01-242 0811) . Premier Shares 9.75 10-U Quarterly £3.000 Ha not/ pen. u> bal. £3.000+
Halifax* - . 90-0ay Xtra 9.05 925 M./t-yny £500 90 days, but

90-Day Xtra 9.50 9.73 M /Vjriy £10.000 instant where

90-Day Xtra 10.00 10.25 M./ij-yrty £25 000 £5.000 remains
Hendon (01-202 6384)

. 3 months shares 9.86 1020 h Yearly £1.000 3 months notice HO 24% £25.000+1
Lambeth 101 928 1331) - . Magnum Account 10.25 1051 »a -yearly £10.000 6 weeks notice + penalty

Uneastnao (061 643 1021)
. Mmerptn 9.25 9.2S Yearly £25.000 Instant access no penalty

Leamington Spa (0926 4500451 —. Htab Flyer 5.85 585 Yearly £10 Withdrawals on demand
9.00 9.00 Yearly £1.000 without penalty

9.75 9.75 Yearly £10,000
Super 90 1050 10.00 Yearly £10.000 Wilts. 90 days not/penafty

1030 1030 Yearly £25.000 Inst acc/no pen If bal £8000+.
Leeds and KoJbeck (QS32 459511) Capital Interest 985 9.85 Monthly £25.000 90 days’ notice or penalty

Capital Access 1035 1025 Yearly £25.000 Same. M/A on bal. £10,000+
Leeds Permanent 0532 438181 Solid Gold 9.25 925 M /Yearly £500 9.50 £5 K 9.75 £10K 1035 £25K

. Liquid Cold 840 8.40 Yearly £500 8.75 £5K 8.95 £10K 9-25 £2SK
Young Lceder 7.00 7.12 h -yearly £2 Maximum Age 18

Mandw (0282692821)— Rainbow 90 1035 1025 Yearly £25.000 90 days notice

Rainbow 90 990 9.90 Yearly £10.000 90 days notice

Uomlngton (01-485 55753 Momlaglon 90 10.00 10 25 ij-yearly a.ooa G0K+ imm. -EL0K 90d ci/pn.

National & Provincial*— . 90 Day Notice As. 1020 10.20 Yearly Tiered Inst £10K+ 10.20/9. 75/4.40/9. 00
Monthly Income Ac 9.80 9.80 Monthly Tiered As 90 day. 9.80/935/9.05/8.65
Inst. Access 9.25 9.25 Yearly Tiered Inst. 9.25/3 .95/8.75/8.40/7 .90/635
SlowAmy Bond 9.60 9.60 Yearly £500 2yr ierm/0.5% boms on matnr/iy

National Counties (Q372742211) .
Comet 2nd ha 10.60 10.60 Yearly £10,000 40 days notice & penalty

Nationwide Anglia (01-242 8822) Capital Bond 950 9.50 Yearly £1.009 90 Days' notice or penalty

Bonus Bollder 923 9.25 Yearly £25.000 4.25 £25K+, 9.00 E10K+-. 8.75 £SK+,
8.40 £214+. a.OC E5CO+. 6.00 Q+

Capita) Bonus 10.25 10.25 Yearly £25.000 10 25 £25K+. 9.75 E10K+, 9.50 £5K+.

925 £500+
Income Bond 9.50 9.50 Monthly £2.000 90 days' notice or penalty

Kewtnny (0635) 43676. Instant Premium 950 950 Yearly £25.000 Instant access. Tiered a/c

Treasure Plus 10-25 10.25 Yearly £25.000 E10 K-+ inst act 3 mtn not/on Tiered a/c

Newcastle (091 2326676) Non Pin 10.00 10 00 Monthly £50.000 Instant new- Tiered A/C

North of England 1091 5656272) . Premier 90 1025 10 25 Yearly £25.000 £5K+ 9.8 90S nm/pen.
Premier 90 10.00 10.00 Monthly £25.000 £5K+ 935 90d noUpen.

Northern fcek (OTl 285 7191) Mnjupmiwr'W 9-2S 950 M/Yrly £5,000 90 day notice

930 9 76 M/Yrly £10.000 90 day notice

9.75 10 02 M/Yriy £25.000 90 day notice

10.00 10 28 M/Yrly £50 000 90 day notice

Norwich A PetefVgh (0800 581584L. Top 10 1000 10 00 Yearly £30.000 10 days' notice

Nottingham (0602 481*44) Record Plus 1035 10 25 Yearly £30,000 90 day’s notice or 90 day's penalty

Portman (0202292444) .._ Premium-Plus 9.75 9.75

Portsmouth (0705 291000) 60 Day Capital Ac 10.25 _ Yearly £25.000 No restrictions over £10,000
Principal it»«)22244188) 3 Month Option 10-25 10 25 Yearly £20.000 Tiered 3 mwrhs roUc*/ penalty.

Regency (0273 724555) Plus 9.00 900 Yearly £20.000 lm acc. £10K 8.B5 £5K 8-25 £500 7.80
SneHldfl 10742 756300) Stainless 10.25 1025 Yearly £10,000 Holier after 1 year, 7 days

Sklpun (0756 45811 Sovereign 9.50 950 Yearly ua.ooa Instant access no penally

Sovereign 9.00 900 Yearly £5.000 Monthly inc av on inv £2,500+
Sklpton Ninety 1050 1050 Yearly £50,000 10% mly inc available

Sldpton Ninety 10.25 10.25 Yearly £25.000 9.70 Mly Inc opt available

Sklpton Ninety 9.70 9.70 Yearly £500 935 Mly Inc opt av on In £2.500+
Stroud and Swindon* Century <2 Year) 10.25 10.25 Yearly £20.000 (10% on £2000+ 90 day hot)pen)

Town and Country (0Z -353 1476) ___ Superstore 950 9.50 Yearly £25.000 Instant. Tiered from £1
Moneywhe 9.15 935 Yearly £25.000 cno pool /cm; Card

Super 60 10.15 10.15 Yearly £25.000 Withdrawals available

Wessex (0202 767X7D - Ordinary Shares 9.52 975
Woolwich* Prime Account 925 925 M /Yearly Tiered Instant access. 2.40 £500+.

8 75 £5K+. 0.90 £10K+ 925 £20Kr
Premium Iny a/c. 10-25 10.25 M /Yearly Tiered 90d nt/pen E10K+ lira. 935 £500+

930 ESK+, 9.75 £10K+.

10-00 £20iC+ 10.25 40K+
Yorkshire(0274 734SZZ) : Platinum Key 950 9.50 Yearly £500 60 days' notice /penalty

Platinum Key 9.75 9.75 Yearly £10,000 Instant over £10,000
Platinum Key 10-25 1025 Yearly £25,000 Instant over £10,000

!

‘Fortelephone see local directory. CAR - Annual yield after Interest comsounded 29/4
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Chamberlain Phipps offers raised
By Philip Ceggan

RIVAL BIDDERS Bowater
Industries and Evode Group
both increased their offers yes-
terday for Chamberlain Phipps,
shoe components and adhe-
sives group, as the takeover
battle reached its last fort-
night.

The Chamberlain board,
which had recommended
Eyode’s earlier offer only to
withdraw the recommendation
after Bowater made its bid,
was meeting yesterday to
decide on whether it could
back either of the two
increased bids.
The increased £B7tn Bowater

offer, from 220p to 230p per
share In cash, was followed
just seven minutes later by an
increased all-share offer from
Evode, the chemicals and plas-
tics group. Evode then picked
up, through an associated com-
pany Sarclear. an 11 per cent
stake in Chamberlain.
The purchases take Evode’s

stake in Chamberlain to 14.9

per cent stake, just short of the

15 per cent limit allowed a bid-

der which is not offering a
cash alternative. In addition,

Evode has received accep-
tances in respect of '12 per cent

of the ordinary and L.49 per
cent of the preference.

In a statement, Evode said

that a detailed review by the

board had determined that the
integration benefits of a
merger with Chamberlain
Phipps would run at an ann-
ualised rate of £3.5m before
tag-

The company added that in
the light of this It was increas-

ing its offer to six ordinary
shares and 11 convertible pre-

femece shares for every 10 In
Chamberlain. Acceptance of
the offer and full conversion of

the preference shares would
result in Chamberlain Phipps
shareholders holding 46 per
cent of the enlarged group's

Chamberlain's share price rose

7p to 228p.

That means that Bowater
can buy shares in the market -

it already owns 9.8 per cent
and has acceptances in respect
of a further 3.8 per cent.
Because Bowater’s offer is in

cash, it could buy up to 29.9

percent before the bid closes.

Bowater’s offer Is final,

unless a third bidder emerges.

According to Mr Norman
Ireland, Bowater's chairman,
“it all comes down to cash or
paper". The Evode camp >

Norman Ireland: it all comes
down to cash or paper

equity.
The value of Evode’s offer,

based on last night's share
price of 190p, was 236p, accord-
ing to Evode’s calculations.

arguing that acceptors of the
Bowater offer would face capi-

tal gains tax problems. The
Bowater camp is arguing that
issue of such a large number of
Evode shares would depress
the subsequent share price.

Bowater is advised by S G
Warburg, Evode by Morgan
Grenfell and Chamberlain by
Barings.

SCIT backing
£58m offer
By John Thornhill

The Smaller Companies
International Trust, an invest-

ment trust managed by Edin-
burgh Fund Managers, is rec-

ommending a £58m offer by
the British Steel Pension Fund
to its shareholders.
SCIT’s directors said they

would have preferred to have
continued as an independent
trust but are recommending
acceptance in view of BSPFs
29.96 per cent holding in the
company and the offer’s “fair

and reasonable" terms.
SCIT results for the year to

March 31 showed pre-tax prof-

its up to £1.36m (£817,000) and
investment income ahead to
£1.79m (l.44m). Earnings per
share were 2.54p (1.48p). A sec-

ond interim dividend of 1.25p
will make a 2p (1.5p) total for

the year. Net asset valne was
151-8p (L23.4p).

Low offer totally underwritten
By Nikki Tail

SG WARBURG, the merchant
bank, yesterday announced
that it had extricated itself

from the awkward position of

possibly becoming a significant

shareholder in Scottish food

retailer William Low. That pos-

sibility followed some unsuc-
cessful sub-underwriting in
respect of Low’s recommended
£136m bid for Budgens a week
ago.
Warburg had underwritten

the cash alternative offer, but
attempts by Low’s brokers -
County NatWest Woodmac and
Glasgow-based Parsons Penney
& Co - to sub-underwrite this

only found takers for half the
shares on offer. The result
meant that, if all shareholders

took the cash alternative, War-
burg would have been left with
around 25 per cent of the
merged group, at a cost of
some £67m.

Yesterday, however, the mer-
chant bank said that it had
now found institutional inves-
tors prepared to take on the
bank’s remaining commitment
with regard to the underwrit-
ing of the cash alternative.

The second wave of sub-un-
derwriting was conducted by
the bank's own securities arm,
Warburg Securities. It said yes-
terday that all the remaining
shares had been taken, by nor-
mal institutional investors. It

is thought that about 15-20
institutions were involved this

time round, with at least one
Scottish name included.
The latest sub-underwriting

was done at the same price -
250p a share - as the former
attempt, but the sub-under-
writing fee is understood to
have been made more attrac-
tive by Warburg giving up a
part of its own underwriting

fee.

Low shares were lp stronger
at 254p yesterday.
During the first wave of sub-

underwriting, an undisclosed
number of shares were taken
by County NatWest Woodmac,
not by the investment arm of
Comity NatWest, as stated in
last Saturday's paper.

Addison stake

Motivaction, the French
market research company, has
increased its stake in Addison
Consultancy, the design and
market research group from 21
per cent to 22.7 per cent. Last
week Motivactlon's manage-
ment had h»iirc with Addison,
which is also in takeover dis-

cussions with MAI, financial
services and advertising group.

Leisure Idys up to £1.22m but earnings slip
By Clare Pearson

PRE-TAX PROFITS of Leisure
Investments, which last
November paid £L70m for Mr
Peter de Savary’s LandLeisure,
jumped to £1.22m, up from
£643,000, in the six months to
December 31. But diluted earn-
ings per share fell from lJ27p to
1.15p.

The company, which has cut
gearing, excluding goodwill,
from 166 to 81 per cent through
£45m worth of asset disposals
since the end of the period,
said it expected to realise a fur-

ther £25m by this means over
the next few months.
Mr Stephen Forsyth, chair-

man, said there were still a
number of non-casino interests
that came with LandLeisure.
such as caravan parks, a
housebuilding company, and a

Manhattan hotel rite, remain-
ing to be sold. He also envis-

aged selling some of Leisure
Investments' restaurants.

LandLeisure also brought a
418-acre rite at Weston-super-
Mare. in the books at £27-5m,
for which the company has
recently applied for planning
permission.

The Gaining Board is cur-
rently investigating Leisure
Investments* suitability to run
casinos, following its purchase,
through LandLeisure, of Aspin-
all's, and of two others casinos
acquired at the same time.

Leisure Investments has
maintained that this is a rou-
tine measure.

In future, the company is

expected to have four core

areas: casinos, restaurants,
health - it intends to focus on
stress and beautician services
- and amusements, excluding

,

in the longer term, amusement
arcades.

The contribution of acquisi-

tions to these results was as
follows: two weeks’ trading of
LandLeisure and the two other
casinos; four months’ of Theme
TTnidingw the London restau-
rant chain; and three months*
of Lingfield Park, the race-
course, golfcourse and hotel
rite in Surrey.

• COMMENT
Since the figure depends so
crucially on the performance of
the casinos as well as property
disposals, it is fiendishly diffi-

cult to predict what profits Lei-

sure Investments may have
by Christmas. But follow-

ers are preferring to err on the
cautious side at the moment
and suggest a pre-tax figure of
around £28m, putting the
shares on a prospective p/e of

would look

Turnover was £13 .61m
(E4.09m). Interest payable rose
to £L5m (£101,000). A dividend
of 0-55p (0.46p) is being paid.
The year-end has been changed
to December 31.

less than 10. This
cheap - but for continuing
nervousness about the import
of the Gaming Board investig&r

tion as well as misgivings
about the quality of earnings
jand degree of indebtedness.
After a labyrinthine past, the
company's way forward is now
fairly clear

Gold Fields

serves share

disclosure

notice on
Minorco
By Kenneth Gooding,
Mining Correspondent

CONSOLIDATED GOLD Fields,

the DE diversifed mining
group, has served a Companies
Act 212 notice on Minorco, the
South African-controlled
investment group, to establish

which Gold Fields’ sharehold-
ers this week accepted
Minarco’s £3.5tm bid.

Minorco, which claims it

owns or has acceptances for
about 55 per cent of the Gold
Fields shares, said it reluc-
tantly had to comply with the
212 notice and accused Gold
Fields of “using tactics which
are directly contrary to estab-

lished City practice regarding
the confidentiality of the bal-
lot box."
An organisation which

receives a 212 notice must
reveal whether it has bought
shares in the company which
issued the notice and where
the shares mwo from.

Sir Michael Edwardes,
Hinorco’s chief executive,
commented: *We believe they
can only want this informa-
tion in order to bring some
pressure on those shareholders
who have already accepted our
offer. This is the predictable

action of a bad loser.”
However, Mr Gerry Grim-

stone, of J Henry Schroder
Wagg, Gold Fields’ adviser,
said: “This Is a perfectly
proper use of a 212 procedure.
We want to know where we sit

with our shareholders."
Minorco also claimed yester-

day that its offer had been
supported by a majority of the
institutional shareholders -
17 of the top 80 bad accepted
for either all or part of their
hnliHnp.

It urged Gold Fields, which
refuses to admit defeat
because a US court injunction
prevents Minorco taking up its

acceptances, “to oefaave
responsibly to act in the
interests of its shareholders."
“Neither the law nor the

rules governing City practice
suppurt in any way the behav-
iour of Gold Fields’ board and
management in rtiwtrhnhurHwg

between shareholders that it

likes and those it does not,"
Mlnmna said.
Gold Fields replied that its

directors bad been advised
yesterday that “their responsi-
bilities are to the company as
a whole and not to any partic-
ular- group of s&arehokur£I£
la as important to ensure .that

tiie minority are not oppressed
as it- is to take account of the
views of the majority." .

KCA falls to £2.8m

KCA Drilling made pre-tax
profits of £2L8toi (£3.45m) in
1988. Earnings fell to 3p (3.7p).

Isosceles moots restructuring

for ‘misconceived’ Gateway
By Nikki Tali

ISOSCELES, the newly-farmed
institutionally-backed com-
pany which is mounting a
£1.73bn for Gateway, Britain's

third largest food retailer, yes-

terday claimed that radical

restructuring of its target was
required.

In its formal offer document,
it maintained that there was
“broad agreement on the part
of analysts and financial com-
mentators that Gateway is

structurally misconceived and
action is needed". It said there
“must be an end" to the appli-

cation of a single retailing for-

mat to Gateway's “diverse"
range of stores.

In the High Court, mean-
while, injunctions were lifted

yesterday against the four
suspended Gateway Foodmar-
kets directors who have said

that they supported the Isosce-

les scheme. They have given
the court sworn affidavits with
regard to past behaviour, and
offered undertakings concern-
ing their conduct during the
bid. These include that they
have neither passed nor will

pass confidential information

to Isosceles. The undertakings

were accepted by the court

Isosceles intends to seQ off

the bulk of the superstores,

with Asda lined up to take 62

of these; dispose of Herman’s

and Medicare; “improve leader-

ship and incentivise employ-
- ees” at the ongoing Gateway
- Foodmaricets chain; and take

the company private so that
'

“restructuring can take place

free of the short-term pressures

of the stock market". Isosceles

would be refloated in three to
- five years’ time.

Yesterday, Mr David Smith,
- the accountant who heads Isos-

celes, said that there had been

. half a dozen inquiries about
Herman's, the US sporting
goods retailor which Gateway
.acquired in 1986, but which has
since seen a sharp profits falL

Isosceles also suggested that
one option might be to split

Herman’s »"d sell different

stores to more.than one buyer.

The offer document contains
a strong attack on Gateway’s
recent performance. Gateway

Foodxnaxkets, said Isosceles,

had the lowest sates and oper-

ating profit, per sq ft of the

major food retailers In their

respective 1987/8 financial

Gateway hit back, however.

by claiming that the 195p-a-

share offer was “miserly’

it failed to recognise the

group's market position and
trading improvement; and that

it undervalued Gateway rela-

tive to other takeovers in the

UK (bod retailing sector.

The financing of the Gate-

way bid. also detailed in the

offs- document, is as heralded.

It comprises a mixture of
equity, mezzanine funding and
senior debt - the latter made
up of five separate facilities,

some of which are designed to

replace each other. The partial

loan note alternative allows
shareholders to take 35 per
cent of their cash consider-
ation -in this form. Mr Smith
receives a foe of £100,000 if the
offer goes unconditional and
will then enter a two-year ser-

vice contract with isosceles.

TKM in £26.8m Australian buy
By John Ridding

TOZER KEMSLEY & Mfflbourn
(Holdings), the motor distribu-

tor and retailer which is

of Sir Ron Brlerley’s
group, yesterday announced
themacquisition of Subaru (Aus-
tralia) for A$57m (£26.77m)
cash.
The acquired company has

the exclusive import conces-
sion for Subaru in Australia. In
the nine months to the end of
March 1989, it reported pretax

profits of A$8J7m ontumavec
of A$88m.
TKM already holds the

exclusive Ferrari concession in
Australia and has a range of

motor retailing and distribu-

tion interests In Europe. Mr
Reg Heath, chief executive,
said that the acquisition,
together with the Ferrari con-
cession, forms the basis for an
expansion into the Austral-
asian vehicle market He added

that the groups would, seek
other acquisition opportunities
in the area.

Since the easing of vehicle
taTBtinn levels and tariff duties
In Australia, car sales and
imports have shown steady

‘ growth. In 1988, Subaru
increased its market share
from 0.84 to 142 per cent
The purchase will Increase

TBM’a gearing from 31 to

around 45 per cent

Ademco write-off behind
Tunstail fall to £1.68m
By Andrew Hill

GROWING PAINS at Ademco,
Tunstail Group's chain of dis-

tribution centres, hit the secu-
rity equipment company’s prof-
its in the six months to MSrch
31. Tunstail made £1.68m
before tax In the half-year,
down from £3J2m.
Tunstail had to write off

£544,000 above the line as a
provision against slow-moving
stocks ana. bad debts at
Ademco.
That offset a record six

mrmthw from *PrmgfraU TVTprar^
the personal alarm-systems
subsidiary-whldrwlg continue

.

to pro^dde ' rthe
Yorkshire group’s profits.

Group turnover rose to
£24.27m (£l8.28m). Earnings
per share fell from 12.7p to &8p
but the interim dividend is

being increased to L75p (L5p).

• COMMENT
Tunstafl’s diversification from

the strong core business of per-

sonal alarm systems for the
elderly has ted it into difficul-

ties. The group could hardly be
hianwii for the Sound Diffusion

investment, a situation which
may yet end fa the courts, hut
"stock shrinkage" at the
Ademco distribution centres,

suggests a worrying lack of
controL More positively, the
enlarged Gardiner Group,
which bought Bridgend
Group's security division at
the beginning of the month,'
could push up mmgfna lnsedu-
jdty-piroductB. a,move
-befollowed.- by-xompetitors
such as TunStalL Seme doubt
whether Tunstail will match
last year's pre-tax profits of
£5m in the fall year, but even
if it does, the shares, on a pro-

spective p/e of 18, are at best a
speculative investment. Bid
hopes are ruled out by Mr
Dawson’s 45 per cent stake.

‘Growing pains’

hit profits at

Kitty Little
By John Thornhill

Kitty • Little Group, the
manufacturer of fragrance
products which came to the
USM last April, announced a
sharp fall in pre-tax profits
from £846.000 to £402,000 far

the year to January 31 1989.

The company issued a warn-
ing about profits in December
and the shares remained
unchanged at ffBjp yesterday.

Mr Graham Webster, chair-

man, said the disappointing
resnlts were mainly doe to
lower-than-expected sales com-
blned^-wittogreater-overhead
costs.-.,-.-...

..

He described the perfor-
mance as "the growing pains
of a young public company."
Turnover rose marginally

Cram £4.13m to £4Jim. Earn-
ings per share dropped to &8p
(7.2p). A proposed final divi-
dend of lp will make IJSp far
the year:
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TRADITIONAL OPTIONS
• First Dealings
• Last Coalings
• Last Declarations
• For settlement Aug 7
For rate indications soa onef of
London Sftaro Service

Apr 24
May 12

Jul 27

Calls in Frogmore, Hoetnocell,
Opfim, Atlantic Res, Rex Wins,

Spong, AT Trat, Randswortti,
LOFs, Tusker, Buie, Blocks Lets,

Amstrad. ASDA. Put: Spong

Davies & Newman edges ahead to £9.9m
By John Ridding

DAVIES & NEWMAN
Holdings, which operates the
Dan-Air airline, yesterday
announced a slight increase in

profits for 1988, from £9£m to

£9.92m.
The company also

announced that Sir Ian Pedder,
Dan-Air’s current deputy chair-
man. is to take over the chair-
manship from Mr Fred New-
man. who Conned the company
36 years ago. Mr Newman
remains a non-executive direc-

tor of the airline and chairman
of Dan-Air's parent company,
Davies and Newman Holdings
Pic.

Turnover in 1988 increased
by 2.8 per cent to £338.9m.
However, earnings per share
slipped from 98p to 94.18p
reflecting an exceptional tax
credit of £769,000 in 1987. A
final dividend of 12Jp (Up) has
been proposed giving a total

for the year of 17p (15p).

The results included receipts

of £L3m from the sale of a Boe-
ing 727-100 and a Hawker-Sid-

deley 748. However, these were
more than offset by the excep-
tional costs involved in setting
up of Its four new scheduled
services which it took over
from British Caledonian In
October last year.

Dan-Air, which represents
virtually all of turnover and
over 70 per cent of profits saw
a flat year in terms of earnings
despite increasing passengers
carried from 5.5m to 5.8m. This
reflected tighter margins and
costs associated with the dis-
ruption caused by air traffic

control disputes last summer
and lies behind the flat operat-
ing profits for the year of
£9.4m.
Improvements were, how-

ever. experienced in the
group's other activities. Mr
Wilfred Jones, finance director,
said that there had been steady
progress at Dan-Smedvig, the

group’s associated company
involved in ofl drilling and well
servicing. Gatwick Handling,
the airport passenger service
and management organisation,
also increased profits over
1987.

Mr Jones added that the
prospects for Davies and New-
man, the group’s shipbroking
business, were currently
brighter than last year and
that Dan-Smedvig had experi-
enced a busy first quarter. Fur-
ther improvements were expec-
ted as a result of the recent
strength of the oil market

next eight months. Whereas
the culprit in 1968 was partly
the costs involved with its

schedule expansion, this year
the problem seems to be more
the result Of tighter margins in
the charter sector. With fuel,
handling

, and landing costs
going up and package holiday
sates going down, earnings will
be hard pushed to improve.

will start

• COMMENT
Sir Ian’s skills in handling
Spitfires, Mosquitos and Can-
berras may prove useful in
steering Dan-Air through a tur-
bulent patch which con-
strained profits last year and
which can be expected to pro-
vide a bumpy journey for
Davies and Newman over the

This said, the group
to enjoy the benefits of its four
new routes and there is still

scope for efficiency gains. In
addition there will be assis-
tance from its non-air activi-
ties, and Gatwick Handling, in
particular. Caution, however,
seems the order of the day and
profit forecasts in the region of
£10.5m are reasonable. This
places shares on a prospective
multiple of around 8; underpin-
ned by the potential advan-
tages of European airline dere-
gulation, but probably at the
top end of its range.

News Digest

SECURITIES TRUST

Net asset value

advance to 136p
Securities Trust of Scotland
had a net asset value of 136Ap
at March 31 1989 compared
with U8-5p a year earlier.

Gross revenue for the year
advanced from £11.45m to
£l3.73m and net revenue from
£6-06m to £7.33m for earnings
of A52p (3.72p) per share.

They are recommending a
final dividend of 3p (2.4p) for
an improved total of 4Ap (3.6p).
A one-for-one scrip issue is

also proposed.

of £514,000 (£359,000) included
a higher contribution from
interest received of £28,000
(£19,000).

After tax of £175,000

(£130,000) earnings per share
came out at 33£p (223p). The
directors are proposing a final

dividend ofo^p (3.8p) for a total
for the year of 7.5p (5p).

TALBEX GROUP

Losses soar
to near £lm

£237,000 and earnings per share
advanced to 516p (47.9p). The
directors have proposed to
maintain the final dividend
at 4J5p for an increased total
of 7^p(7p>.

CLAYTON SON & CO

Almost static as

turnorer falls

HC SLINGSBY

Rise of 43%
to £0.5lm
Taxable profits rose 43 per cent
at HC SLingsby, Bradford-based
maker of trucks, ladders and
ancillary equipment, is 1988.

Turnover increased from
£7_59m to £9.3lm, a rise of 23

per cent The pre-tax figure

Clayton, Son & Co (Holdings).
Leeds-based engineer, reported
a fractional decrease in pre-tax
profits from £L05m to £L03m
in 1988. Interest received was
£10,000 compared with charges
of £55,000. Turnover fen from
£17.01m to £15.68m.
Tax fell from £348,000 to

£137,000 and earnings before
extraordinaries worked
through at 35.45p (28J8p) per
share. The extraordinary credit
was £79,000 (£211,000). A final
dividend of8£p (7p) has been
recommended for a total of
10.5p (9p) for the year.

Talbex Group, which fills and
supplies aerosols, reported a
sharp increase in losses from
£159,000 to £978,000 for the six
months to March 31 1989.
Turnover grew from £8J57m
to£17.llm.
There was again no tax and

fully-diluted losses per share
came out at 0.66p (0J4p). Net
interest charged was £490,000
(£119,000 received).

LAMBERT HOWARTH

Black bid

unwelcomed

National Home Loans
rises 62% at midway
By Davkf Barchan!

NATIONAL HOME Loans
yesterday reported pre-tax
profits of .£13.41m for the six
months to March 31. up 62 per
cent on the same period test
year.

However there was no

.

increase in the interim divi-
dend which remained at last
year’s level of 3J26p. Earnings
per share were also unchanged
at 5Ap.
Mortgage lending during the

period rose to £1.61bn
(£1.23bn). Mr John Darby,
chairman, said that NHL was
performing strongly in a more
difficult trading environment.
The company’s share of the UK
mortgage market Vias - how
risen to 29 per cent

'

Despite the downturn in the
mortgage market, Mr Darby
said that NHL was receiving .

more applications for mort-

gages than a year ago.

In March, NHL had enjoyed
its best -ever month with new
mortgages running at £375xn.
Of these mortgages, 55 per cent
were remortgages rather than
house sales.

Mr Richard Lacy, chief exec-
utive, said that NHL had made
substantial investments to
diversify into new lines of busi-
ness^ and five new subsidiaries,
faefa ftlpg a leasing operation,
were “now ready to go."

Diversification of the sources
of the company*s fanding was
also continuing. There had
been a £260m mort-
gage—backed -US commercial
paper transaction in' February
and further transactions for
completion in .the second half
of the year are under negotia-
tion.

Gleeson ahead
MJ Gleeson, the construction
and property investment
group, raised pre-tax profits
from £3Am to £4^6m in the six
months to December 3L, on

turnover up. from £47J2m to
£62.69m.
Earnings were 2805p (2L99p)

share. The interim dM-
is lifted to 2.4fip CU4p).

DIVIDENDS ANNOUNCED
_ „ Correa -

Current Date of ponding
psymant payment dividend

BefrioxHbfffs

Total
for

year

Total

last

year

-fin

JO WALKER

Advance to

£674,000
JO Walker & Co, the
Leicester-based timber
importer, increased pre-tax
profits from £600,000 to £674^00
ih the year to December 31
1988. Turnover rose 19 per cent
to £17Aim in the period. -

Tax took £20,000 more at

Lambert Howarth, the
footwear and luggage group,
has repeated its opinion that
the takeover bid from Peter
Black, the Yorkshire-based
firmsumer gnnria mflnnfartqrfr
and distributor, is unwelcome
and inadequate.
Commenting on. Peter

Black’s formal offer document
which was posted on Tuesday,
Mr Martin Jourdan, Lambert
Howarth’6 chairman, said:
“The board believes that this
bid isno more than an
opportunistic attempt-to seize
the benefits ofhmafite nf Tjunhort
Howarth's recovery on the

Button Assets int

Brit (stead Ah§. fin

Clayton Son ft Co fin

Davies « Newman JRn
FtMdaxAgrfc fin

Fleming Untvsl fin

Gleason (MJ)— im
Govett Oriental Jin
HopUnacms fin
Investors Cap Int
Kitty LlttleS fin

LaiSUrt fans Int
Lendu HokBngs fin

Natl Homs Loans Mint

Scot Mod 4 Trat fin
Scot Naflenal TT int

See Tst Scotland
Mngsby(HC) ..fin
Tharsls fin

Tttnstsg ...hit

WaBosr (JO)
WDUamsonTea

-tin

-int

Alt
08*
0.2

A3
1Z5
1

2

A

2.46

0.9

1.165«t.
1

0.55

oat
3JW
1A

1 .6+
3
5.5
4

1.75

4.5
10

July 1

May 25
July 29
July 3

June 30

Aug 14
June 15

July 1

July 3

July 14

7i r.imm
WnTTB

Tlta

rlghfo andfor acquisition Issues. §USM stock. HUMMhriSSTSnibSmarket. Second interim making 3o
making1A75p (1-3p) ,o date. tgfigX*
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MARKET STATISTICS
economic diary

TODAY: us figures for March
construction spending. Campaign
for Press and Broadcasting Free-
dom Media in tho 90s conference
*t London University Student
Union. Mrs Glenys Klnnock
speaks at Unicat conference on
children's rights, institute of Edu-
cation, London.
TOMORROW: Mrs Margaret
Thatcher, the Prime Minister vis-
its West German Chancellor Kohl
at hi« home in Oggersheim for
talks On Nato short range mis-
siles.

MONDAY: May Day celebrations
in mosgow. indirect tax on
tobacco implemented in Ger-
many. Swiss money supply fta-
lires for March.
TUESDAY: The Bank of England
publishes the following statistics
for March: London sterling certifi-
cates of deposit: bill turnover sta-
tistics; UK banks' assets and lia-
bilities and the money stock;
sterling commercial paper. Build-
ing Societies Association annual
conference, Guernsey, (until May
4). General council of the Bar
responds to Green Paper on
reform of legal services. Mr Yas-
ser Arafat, PLO leader, first meet-
ing with President Mitterrand.
Parts. Meeting at parties to Mon-
treal protocol on substances that
deplete ozone layer, Helsinki,
(untit May S). Italian consumer
prices figures for April.

WEDNESDAY: Department o!
Energy publishes advance energy
statistics for March. Department
of Employment issues figures for
overseas travel and tourism (Jan-
uary-February); and a detailed
analysis of employment, unem-
ployment, earnings, prices, and
other Indicators. Bank of England
publishes details of capital issues
and redemptions In April Trea-
sury issues figures for UK official

reserves tor April. Advisory Coun-
cil on Science and Technology
statement on defence research
and development German statis-
tics on March industrial produc-
tlQn; March manufacturing new
orders; and April unemployment
THURSDAY: An inaugral public
lecture: What are the problems In
the West German "Modal"? by
Gordon Smith 8t the London
School of Economics. Vale Of Gla-
morgan by-election - result
expected around noon Friday.
The Queen opens British Food
and Farming Exhibition, Hyde
Park. Viscount Whitetaw speaks
at Foyles lunch, Grosvenor
House. London. Polish Commu-
nist Party two-day national confer-
ence opens, Warsaw. Bundes-
bank meets.
FRIDAY: Department of the Envi-
ronment publishes figures for
housing starts and completions in
March. US employment figures
for ApriL

EUROPEAN OPTIONS EXCHANGE

BANK RETURN
BAMUNG DEPARTMENT Wednesday

April 26. 1988
tncr

decrease lor week

LIABILITIES C
14053.000

106.703.081
1-2H3.il 7,048
2.074,185025

£

Public rbtposKn

Reserve and other Accounts - 9ei 137031

3,478.559.054 - 208045037

ASSETS
930038.719
830.404,470

1,911029080
Advance and other Accounts
Premises Equipment & otter Secs -

54068.740
1S3,167025

3.478059.054 - 208045037

ISSUE DEPARTMENT
LIABILITIES

14,463027013
6.372,067

141087,674
1007074Notes in Bonking Department

14,470000.000 + 140000000

ASSETS
Government Debt
Oft)or Government Securities

11010100
12037017.727
1.821,767,173

777.443080
917,443060

14.470.000000 + 140000000

MONTHLY AVERAGES OF STOCK INDICES
Apr. Mar. - Feb. Jen.

Financial Timm
Government Securities

Fixed Imerest ... —
Ordinary ...

Gold Mines

SEAQ Bargains (S p-m )

F.T.-Aetuartes . .

Industrial Group ....

600 Share -
financial Group
AU-Share —
FT-SE 100 ...

6641
97.10

1700.6

168.0

1100.50

1174.75

731.26

1066.86

2066.6

88.28

0609
1710.7

186.8

31.908

1109.77

118206
749.64

1076.80

2074.0

88.72

07.87

18760
1640

32006

1088.18

1158.47

751.74

105008

20450

87.65

9842
15434
1654

32.174

99442
1084.79

704.48

076.16

1891.7

April Hlflfi

Ordinary —

„

1750L4(28tfl) 1089.4(1001)

A 11-Share 10B0.04(28>h) 1048.43(10(11)

FT-SE 100 .•N.iMMiuiiuuMi 21 !60(20ttt) 20250(100!)

Nationwide

_V^r|Aagu»sy

£300,000,000

Floating Rate Notes
Due 1996

(Second Series)

(Issued by Nationwide
Btulding Society)

Interest Rate:

12J93% perannum

Interest frriod:

28 April 1^89 to

31 May, 1989

Interest Amount per

£5,000 Nnte due
31 May. 1989: £58

•
Interest Amount per
£50,000 Note due

31 May, 1989: £579.99

Apent Bank
faring Brothers& Co, Limited

NOTICE TO
ADVERTISERS

NEW FT FAX
NUMBER

From Monday 20th
March

The Advertisement
Trade Fax Number is

(01) 873 3062

European
Assets Trust

N.V.

The net asset value at

3 1st March, 1989
DFI 7.26

GRANVILLE
SPONSORED SECURITIES

Cm YWd
Big* Lew OW9M7 Prire Bare* die W % WE

327 295 to. Brit. Ind OnlUwy 327X4 +2 10J aa 88
38 30 Ann8*ge*Dd Rhodes -

—

31 -1 - “ •

33 25 BBS DrilQfl Group fllSUI — 30 0 21 6.8 4.8

173 149 B#njgn Croup (SO -vr 173 0 2.7 Lb

UO 105 BwdonCfWwCf. Pref.CEl iiore e 6.7 • 6JL “

123 108 Bray Ttdmelagks — 108XO -i 5.9 S 5

110 107 BremMtl Com. Prrt 108 0 11.0

303 285 CCl Croup Qrttwey -—

—

303 0 1X3 44 40
17* 1*8 CCLGraao U9b COM.Prei 176*4 0 14.7 84

183 140 CwtoPteSE) 183x8 0 74 40 108

110 109 Cirinm Fre( (SE) no 0 100

367 395 Octree Btair - 387 0 220 31 80
122 119 81 122 0

141 115 JxefaM barest) - 136 0 33 2.4 13.0

322 2*1 MbMMMcHVUmBSa 312 0 • “

107 98 s1I111i1i 103 0 74 70 19
403 465*4 0 18.7 40 12.4

2*0 270 Tsnte&CirlM'..- 280 0 90 . 33 98

UO 100 TortW* fieriKWCwirPrtf.- UO .+1 10.7 W
122 92 IrvvfafllloMWflsIOSM) 112 +1

113 106 UoMM EuropeCon Pref 113 0 8.0 70

395 3» Vit*ftowD«|Co.Me 395 0 220 5.*

9» 332 J| 332 0 162 4.9 277

SccmIUci dcridMcd (SO ud (USJU jft Mlt in (abject ts tfte rate and mslall» of The

Suck Ettknw/OiLr scteKIs IWed rtw*W datt is subject te ttc ratal of ISA

Pint Seams n dealt la rtridfr on nuteW bargriA tett. Etfi>*r finartHe A Co

UmHrfw StMMlIa DavitsVMM« auifot Mmt » ttat wsrttte

CfuuSr ACa. Ud.

IU>HUt,MnEC»IV
TritphaM’DI-dSi 1212

MnnhwofTSA

CmdkDnkiliaM
Lons 1mm. lufci ECKDP

Telephone 01-621 1212

Member nfihc Stock Evtfonre A TSA

I.G INDEX LTD, 9-X1 GROSVENOR GARDENS, LONDON SW1W0BD
Tel: 01-028 7233/5699 An AFBD member Reuters Code: IGIN, 1GI0

FT 30
Apr. 1761/1770 -*4

dun. 1775/1784 +7

FT5E 100
Apr. 2131/2141 4-1

Jun. 2148/2153+4

WALL STREET
May. 2414/2426 N/C
Jim. 2426/2438 N/C

Prices tBkto at 5om and change fr from previous close at 9pm

Series

May 89 Aug - 89 Nov. 89

StockVoi Last vol Last vol Last

Gallic . S 380 Ifo * 28 16 3 28a S 378.20
GaldC 5390 125 200 a 109 12 S 378.20
GohJC J 400 309 000 2 600 10 1700 5 37800
toWC 5440 — — 80 1 40 400 S 37800
Gold P S 370 410 L90 5 5.90 S ?78.20
SaMP 5380 114 5.50 23 890 2 9.50 8 S 37800

Mar 89 Jun. 89 Jul 89
EOE Indue C Fl. 255 100 45 _
COEtednC . Fl, 265 153 35 — _ n. 30232
EOEtodaC n. 270 229 29 - _ 29 33 Fl. 30202
EOEWaxC FL 275 285 25 — _

Fl. 30232
EOElndn C Fl. 280 464 20 SO a _ _ _
EDE Index C FI.Z85 286 15 14 1650 b 20 1920 Fl. 30232
E0E Index C n.200 604 11 1
EOElndn C FI.295 1701 7 47 10.20 FL 30202
EOEtedsC Fl. 300 1183 460 637 7.30 17 L0J0 Fl. 30232
EOEMexC Fl. 305 2607 2.60 713 5 9 8 Fl. 30232
E0E Index C Fl. 310 2304 100 13 300 8 Fl. 30232
EOE Index P FT 280 53 0.70 6 1.70 19 ?9) R 30202

Fl. 285 . 44b 1 106 3a 12 320 Fl. 30232
EOE Index P Fl. 290 373 1.70 46 3JS) b8 FI. 30232
EOE Index P FI.295 841 3 28 500 a 65 750 Fl. 30232
EOE Inter P Fl. 300 135 5 93 700 Fl. 38232
EOEtadexP Fl 305 244 840 6 11 36 L20O Fl 30232
EOE Index P

.
Fl 310 82 12 1 14 18 15 Fl. 30232

S/FI C Fl. 210 3 2.60 64 3.40 FI. 21215

Jul. 89 Oa. 89 Jan. 90

ABNP
Atm C
AbcridC
AinoC
AkzoP
AmnC
AraraC
Antra P
BUHMMNN-TC
R.V.DSMC
N.V. D5M P
Elsevier

C

Giit-Brat.C
HrifletoiC
HoogovensC
HoooovesP
KlilC
klm p
KNPC
KMPP
NEOLLOYOC
NEDLLOYDP
RaLBed.C
KaLIM.P
PtilllpsC

ptiripsp
Royal DuukC
Royal DetckP
IMIeverC
UnllwrrP
Vm Omraren C
Von DDimereo P

FI. 45
FI. 40

FL 100
FI. 110
FI. 150
FI. 150
Fl SO
FI. 60
Fl 75
Fl. 75

FI.130
H 120
Fl. 70
Fl. 40

FT. 120
Fl. 100
Fl. 110
F1.45
Fl. 45
Fl. 60
R. 55
R.420
n. 37o
Fl. 66
F1.45
FI.40
Ft 40

FI.130
Fl, 130
Ft 130
PI. 130
R.45
Fl. 50

253
31

378
122

1682
330
143
464
210
202
808
247
30
79

261
1202
377
677
80

423
124
142
108
206
95

3475
493
392
320
1428
293
1202
320

0.90 535 1.40 115 LOT FI. <4
0.40 82 1.10 FT 44
4.10 94 5.70 5 730 FL 102
430 115 500 _ Fl. 11030
7.80 302 12 6 10 FL 153
280 30 430 13 5 Fl. 153
LOT a 2.70 Fl. 49 BO
270 153 3.70 10 5 Fl. 79J0
000 20 100 Fl. 79.10

2 11 3.80 12 480 Fl. 73 70
3.10 62 5 5 700 FL 12610
130 b 18 230 Fl. 12610

4 83 520 2 6.50 FI. 71.70
0.70 4 1.70 12 200 Fl. 3b.60
600 103 8 — Fl. 11800
800 221 12 32 14.80 FL 1O50O
10.50 5 U0O Fl. 105.60
300 ISO 3.90 25 5.10 Fl. 47

1 86 200 5 3.30 FT. 47
4 172 580 114 700 Fl. 60.40

0.70 4 100 —
Fl. 60.40

2400 12 39 — Fl. 412.50
9 3 19 _ Fl. 41200

1.60 210 2.70 42 3.70 Fl. 64.10
330 12 4 30 Fl. 64.10
110 434 2.40 a 123 3.20 Fl. 3700

3 148 300 64 4 Fl. 3700
730 184 800 FT. 13b SO
230 40 400 13 500 Fl. 136.80
6.10 39 9.30 a 22 12a Fl. 13500
220 373 4 18 5 Fl. I350O
6.10 211 7.70 IS 9 Fl. 50.40
330 27 4.50 6 530 Fl. 50.40

TOTAL VOLUME IN

A-Adi B- Bid

CONTRACTS : 68.743

C— Call P-Put

BASE LENDING RATES

ABN Bat
Man&CMpae
MB-MUA*Bk_
Allied trtt Bat

• fanMatter
Banking Giwp.__

Associates Cap Coip

Adhoritf Bank

• B&C Herd®* Bart_
BskofBaota

Cfyteitte8ak_

Gown.BLM£aa_
Co-operatheBaik.

CosUs£Q>.

%
13

13

*13

13

OrpriB Popalar Bk 13

Unfair Bart PLC 13

Duunlnrie 13

EoRtffialBankpIc 13

Ester Trust Ltd 13h
rnurial& Gen. Bart.. 13

FlnatetwU Bait Pic. 14BnoBiltaVacm...
BartHapoafus 13 • Robert nemfng & Co. 13

Bart Crefit& Cora_
Bart of Cura
Bade ofMad
Bart ofMb
BaiksfSotted

Raw BeigeUd
Barclays Bart

Beadnaft 8a£nc_
Berliner BartAG

Brit Bkof Mid East

• BnwnSWpiey

Business MtgtTa—..

CL Bad! Nederland

Central Capital

• OHrtertouseBart__

CtfiortNA

CHf Merchants Bart

—

Robert Fraser &Ptns._ UL
13 Gkotart 13

13 •Gimessliatao 13

HFCBartpfc 1313

13 • HaterasBart 13

13 KsfiaMe&GenlmBrt 13

13 • HlUSasad $13

tHoareiO). 13

Hoogtoog&Sanrt — 13

13

13 ...
13 • Leopold Josept&Soai.. 13

13 UopfcBart 13

13iz MertnjBartUd 13

13 McDonnell Douglas Bit D
13 MWandBart 13

13 Mortgage Expns Lid._ $13.75

13 MortBrtgCorp. 13

13 NaBk. of Kuwait 13

%
HaiWestrahsar 13

Norton Bart ltd 13

NorwidiGaiTrast 13

PSfVATbankes Limited . 13

Prodock] Bart PLC 14

tM^iSoas 13

EntagfaeG'racta 13^
Royal Bt id Scotland 13

RojalTnEtBart 13

• Swit&WBbosaSea.. 13

Stondad Chartered 13

TSB 13

United Bkof Kuwait 13

United Mizrald Bart- 13

Unify Trust Bart Pic 13

Western Trust 13

Wesqat Bart Cop. 13

Whiteaway Left* 13^
YortshireBart 13

• Barters of British Merchant

Banking & Securities Houses

teociate.
3

Deposit do* 5.9%
Sawrne83%. Top rw-QD.D00f

instant acts 12.1% f Mortgage

tee rale. $ Denacd deposit 8%.
Uortgagel3i25%- 14.00%

FT-ACTUARIES SHARE INDICES

These Indices are the joint compBatiofi of the Financial Times, the Institute of Actuaries and the Faculty of Actuaries

EQUITY GROUPS

& SUB-SECTIONS
Figures In parentheses show
number of sucks per sectlorf

49

61
62
65
66
67
68
691

_70

71
81
91

99

CAPITAL GOODS (207)- 955.01

Building Materials (291 . 119547
Contracting, Construction (38).. 1719.92

Electricals (10) 2915M
Electronics (30) 2177.97

Mechanical Engineering £54) 513.94

Mrulsind Uetal Forming (7). 54949
Motors (17) 315J55

Other Indstrial Materials (22) . 159247
CaNSUMEJffi8flUPQ35)». 1264,95

Brewew and Distillers (221 .. 132748
Food Manufacturing (20).. 1034.02

Food Retailing (15) 21M.93
Health and Household (14) 228309

Leisure (33) 1607.09

Packaging & Paper (15) . 577.76

Publishing & Printing (18) ... 3588.99

Stores (33) 784.46
Textiles (15) 54L48
OTHER GROUPS (95) 1080.7$

Agencies (±8) 1260.92

Chemicals (22) 1236.89

Conglomerates (12) 158007
Transport (13) 2416.81

Telephone Networks (2).. 1108.97
Miscellaneous (28) 42469.73

IMQUSTMALGttHiP (407)J.

Oil A Gas (13) 12032.92

500 SHAREINDEX (500).41203.18

FINANCIALGROUP 023), 739.73

Banks (8) 734.52

Insurance (Life) (8) 105340
Insurance (Composite) C7) .. 58648
Insurance (Brokers) (7)... 950.94

Merchant Banks (11) 33137
Property (52) j 1313.20

Other Financial (30) 371.49

Investment Trusts (72) ...

Mining Finance (2)

Traders (8)

ALL-SHARE INDEX (705)11090.64

FT-SE 108 SHAREWDEX*

Friday April 28 1989

Index

NO.

112630

112137
649.87
140237

latte

No.

211B4

Day's

Change!

%
ESSSt
(Max.)

403
-04

+14
405
+03
-0.J

-HU
+04
+QJ

-03
+0J,

-03
+0.4

+1.1

+14
-03
+03
+03
+03
-03
+03
+04
+04
+0.4

+00
-92

+00
+0.4

+04
+14
+03
-04
+00
-0.1

+00

+0.7

-10
-00

+00

Days
Change

+23

Grass

Dlv.

|Yie1d%|

(Act at

(25%)

1035
11.91

12.87

842
8.72

1006
1409
11.68

907
8.91

9.73
948
837
605
744
1003
9.09

1103
1130
10.02

703
1130
941
80S
1039
1041

9.69

9.78

9.70

2402

8.85

5.90

9.99

8.92

9.48

Day's

High fa)!

2134.9

445
4.28

4.08

431
3.07

3.97

533
441
4.24

3.63

345
3.99

330
236
338
401
430
432
504
4.12

232
4.77

4.42

337
404
442

349

5.47

4.99

500
630
546
542
6.63
433
2.75

5.65

2.81

3.92
4.95

402

Days
Lowlh)

21160

EsL
P/E
Ratio

(Net)

11.64

1006
10.16

14.49

14.86

12.08

7.9*

10.00

13.01
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NEW from THE FINANCIAL TIMES

ROW TO MAKE MONEY
IN A BEAR «
MARKET
Thenew FTGUIDE

TO ALTERNATIVE
INVESTMENTS by
Jackie Wuilschlagei;

is 250 pages of hard
information and
highly practical

advice on how to -

play the alternative

investment market, successfully. Not only does
it discuss the merits of fine art, furniture and
silver; it also introduces you to the world of
books, bears, Bugattis and Bordeaux.

Copiously illustrated with photos, graphs

and charts, theFTGUIDETOAIXERNAXXVE
INVESTMENTS explains the economics and
mechanics of the art market and even tells you
how to join the ranks of the angels.

To benefit from a behind-the-scenes

knowledge of sales room technique, dealers’

methods and how to spot a good investment,

simply complete and return the attached order

form together with your payment. You’ll find

that you can mix business with pleasure:

PublishedApril 1989.

OrderForm
Please return to: (Mail order address only)

-The Marketing DcpL, FT Business Information

7th Floor: 50-64 Broadway, LondonSW1H OD&
ftl: OI-79920Q1

Plate note payment mua accsunjim, order. Prices bxtatepouaavand todcia*.

Please send me*

Office
ooly

rule Qty UK
Price

Overvess
Price

4322
0*28

FTGfeMew
AhniXtht InKMaKVU
ISBN 1 853340138

£1430 £17.00
USS2S P0

l enclose my cheque value £/USS made payable 10

FT 8uewss Information.

1 wish to pay by credit card

(mark choice):
[

|visa
{ }Access I jAmex

| ]
Diners

Card No. i 1 1 L 1 t J (I Li L1. JJJ.X)

Card Expiry Date.

r*|*I wish to order 5 or more copies. Pfonc send ate detaib of bulk

^wiHwamimnAplwiw
(BLOCKCAPITALS PLCaSE)

hfc/Mn/Mfn

Title

Organisation.

Address

Postcode.

Signature.

.Country.

.ate.

Please allow 28 days for Mvny. Refunds are given on becks returned in

perfect condfoon md whfua ? days of recopL

Returned office NumberOne Sowfawark Bridge LondonSE1 9HL.
Rcgisicred in Engfaad No 980896.

It sums up our year
for mortgage lending.

another outstanding year for Britannia” has, by now,

become a well worn phrase to the keen observer ofour annual

chairman^ statement advertisement.

Nevertheless, the phrase once again describes exactly the

12 months we have just enjoyed.

Particularly with regard to mortgage lending.

In a very competitive market we completed some 40,127

mortgages during the course ofthe yean

A figure that amounted to record lending of no less than

£1359bn.

And one which contributed significandy to our group

profits, up by28% to a record £64m.

Significantly however, the number of mortgage accounts

of 12 months or more in arrears has been reduced considerably,

dearly reflecting our policy of prudent and responsible

lending

Looking ahead, the introduction of Asset Express Home

Loans makes a unique departure from traditional building

society marketing and looks set CO carve an important niche

in the centralised lending market.

On a broader front, the year has also been one ofprogress

in the financial services market generally.

Our semi-open plan branch refurbishment programme

has continued apace throughout the >ear with a further 36

branches completed.

Similarly, the number of Britannia Shield Property

Services outlets, our estate agency network, has been boosted

to 50 throughout the country'.

In October we launched Britannia Motor Insurance

Services Ltd. in association with B&C Insurance Brokers Ltd.

In February we launched our stocks & shares dealing

service making it easier for members to buy and sell on the

stock market.

And in March we announced plans to become the Best

building society to own a life assurance company.

A successful ourcome to acquisition talks with FS

Assurance of Glasgow is expected, allowing us to offer a full

range of life assurance, unit trusts and pension products.

Chairman, Mr Norman Cowbum concluded his statement

thus: "The Society is in a strong position to meet the challenges

in the financial services market generally and to continue

prudent expansion with enhanced profitability,"

An assertion that not only bodes well for the coming

financial year but one which also underlines our Intention to

make it yet another necordbreakec

Britannia
Building Society

FOR EVERY MOVE YOU MAKE.
NEWTON HOUSE, LEEK, STAFFS. 5TC3 5RG.

•t
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Olivetti falls 11% after

slide on financial side
By Alan Friedman in Milan

OLIVETTI, the Italian office

automation company, said yes-

terday a reduction in income
from financial operations
caused an 11.4 per cent fall in

1988 consolidated net profit to

L356-2bn (S259m).
This was the second succes-

sive decline for Olivetti, and
the latest outcome was 37 per
cent down on the record
L565.5bn achieved in 1986.

A squeeze on margins and
the rising costs of components
in computers contributed to a
19.5 per cent decline in pre-tax
profit to L432.6bn. But cuts in

administrative overheads and
a 14 per cent rise in group reve-
nues, to L8.-107.4bn. helped
boost operating profit 20.4 per
cent to L406bn.

Olivetti is undergoing a
wide-ranging reorganisation
and analysts had predicted a
slackening of profits. The com-
pany said yesterday it would
maintain its dividend for 1988
at L340 per ordinary share and

French
confectioner

agrees to

overseas bid

Campean to reshape
By Roderick Oram In New York

ALITALIA, the Italian state

airline, is to join Olivetti to

launch Eurofly, a charter air-

line. It wiD operate five new
McDonnell Douglas fltD-83 air-

craft and the initial Invest-

ment in the venture will be
L15bn (fll.Zm), writes Alan
Friedman.
Each will own 45 per cent

Olivetti said that since 1979 it

had run an executive charter
service with eight aircraft and
Llftbu of 1988 revenues. San
Paolo Finance, an investment
banking subsidiary of the San
Paolo banking group, will
have XO per emit of the ven-
ture.

Alitalia said the charter
market in Italy had lm poten-
tial passengers a year.

By George Graham
in Paris

L360 per savings share.

Mr Carlo De Benedetti, chair-

man, said the 1988 result
showed growth above other
European information technol-
ogy companies, but he
acknowledged a shake-out in
the sector had led to a “gener-
alised pressure on margins."
Olivetti said financial

operations such as foreign cur-

rency transactions and an pay-
ments by Volkswagen had sup-
plied L140bn of earnings in

1987, when Olivetti had an
interest-earning cash balance
of L531bn. In 1988 the company
had L156bn in debts.

Olivetti produced 517,000 per-
sonal computers Last year, of
which American Telephone &
Telegraph bought 110,000.
AT&T has said it will be con-
sidering alternative suppliers
to Olivetti, while the Italian
company this week announced
a supplier deal for Europe with
Digital Equipment.

Philips reports modest rise
By Laura Raun in Amsterdam

PHILIPS, the Dutch electrical

and electronics group, lifted its

earnings modestly in the first

quarter of 1989.

The company said: “We’re on
the right path and we have no
reason to change our forecast

for 1989." Earlier. Mr Cor van
der Klugt, president, had fore-

cast that for the year as a
whole, Philips would achieve a
"substantial improvement In"substantial improvement In

net income from normal busi-

ness operations.”

Net income edged up 3 per
cent to FI 223m ($106. lm) in
the quarter from FI 2l7ro a

year earlier, boosted by cur-

rency factors. Per share earn-

ings were tittle changed at

FI 0.86. against FI 0.85.

Non-consolldated companies
contributed FI 72m to net
income, up from FI 16m. Much
of the increase was due to Phil-

ips’ new joint venture in major
domestic appliances with
Whirlpool of the US, in which
Philips has a 47 per cent stake.

Total sales improved by 2
per cent to FI 12.64bn in the
first quarter. Operating income
fell 11 per cent to FI 611m.
Electronic components saw a

small loss due to high develop-
ment and restructuring costs
in integrated circuits. Compo-
nents were expected to remain
in the red for the Test of the
year.

In professional products,
operating income slipped
under price pressure on per-
sonal computers. Higher oper-
ating income was posted by
lighting, which booked buoy-
ant sales of energy-saving
lamps, and consumer electron-

ics, where margins widened on
compact discs and small
domestic appliances.

Revlon to buy
West German
cosmetic group

Increase in exports helps

lift Anglo American Coal
By Andrew Fisher
in Frankfurt

By Jim Jones in Johannesburg

REVLON, the big US cosmetics
group, plans to extend its

activities in Europe by pur-
chasing Betrix Cosmetic of
West Germany, a family-owned
company whose medium-priced
products are sold under the
Betrix, Laura Biagotti, and
Boss names.
As a result of the deal -

negotiations should be con-
cluded by the middle of this
year - the Frankfurt-based
Betrix will end its three-year
co-operation agreement with
Wella, the quoted hair and
body products company based
in neariiy Darmstadt.

Betrix said its inclusion in
the Revlon group would
strengthen its international
business through access to new
markets.

INCREASED export and
domestic sales and higher dol-

lar export prices combined to

lift the sales of Anglo Ameri-
can Coal Corporation by 30 per
cent in the year to March.
Coal and coke sales rose to

45.5m tonnes from 42.5m
tonnes, bringing turnover to
R1.45bn ($567.7m) from
Rl.l4bn. Pre-tax profit was
R364J2m against R229Jm.
Amcoal is South Africa’s

largest coal company and the
country’s largest individual
exporter. Mr Graham Boustred,
the chairman, says exports
rose 10.7 per cent to 7.2m
tonnes. This compares with an
increase of only 1 per cent for

South Africa's total exports,
which rose to 43m tonnes in
1989 as sales were curbed by
sanctions and oversupplied
world markets.

Mr Boustred expects rand
export earnings to rise further
this year with increased vol-

umes and favourable price and
exchange rate movements.
He says the company plans

to add to its export capacity in
j

the longer term but neverthe-
less warns that South Africa's

export competitiveness is

threatened by inflationary cost
increases.
At home, Amcoal raised its

sales to Eskom, the state-
owned electricity utility, to
32.7m tonnes from 30.1m
tonnes. Mr Boustred says that
though Eskom increased its

electricity generation by 5.7

per cent in calendar 1988 its

coal consumption of 64JSm
tonnes was 2 per cent lower
than in 1987 as the utility com-
missioned several new and effi-

cient coal-fired power stations.

A GROUP of foreign investors
has launched a FFxlSlm
($24.2m) agreed bid for Cheval
Blanc, one of the last remain-
ing chocolate producers in.
French hands.
Two chocolate bar manufac-

turers, Sooth Hope, based In
Trinidad, and TJS Investments
of Malta, are offering FFr300 a
share for Cheval Blanc, whose
shares have been suspended
since December, waiting for
French government approval.
Both companies are leaders

in the chocolate confectionery
markets of their home coun-
tries, and Mr Gaston Maulin,
whose family controls Cheval
Blanc, has chosen to ally with
them in the increasingly inter-
national chocolate market.
The bid may not rank along-

side the £2.55bn ($4.28bn)
takeover of Rowntree In the
UK by Nestle of Switzerland,
but it has gone through close
scrutiny from the French Gov-
ernment, which has become
concerned about the inexora-
ble slide of many of the coun-
try's best-known edible brand
names Into foreign hands.

Nestie’s purchase of Rown-
tree, which owns the tradi-

tional French chocolate brands
of Menier and Lanvin, gave
the combined group over a
quarter of France’s FFrSJjbn
chocolate market last year. In
some market segments, the
Mmhmwl share was over 35
per cent, prompting the Gov-
ernment to refer the bid to the
competition coundL
Jacobs Suchard, the Swiss

group, has a market share of
over 15 per cent, with Mars
estimated at around II per
cent and Lindt at 7 par cent
Foulain, one of the best-known
French brands, was bought 18
months ago by Cadbury of the
UK, leaving Cantalnu, which
supplies mainly own brand
chocolate bars far supermar-
ket, as the only large producer
in French hands.

Unlike most other European
markets, France Has remained
loyal to dark, bitter chocolate,
and many consumers still pre-

fer the chocolates matte on the
premises by their local patis-

sier. Milk chocolate, led by
Jacobs Suchard’s Mllira brand,
has made nigwhlg inroads in
the bar market, however,
while in the fancy chocolate
segment, sweeter Belgian-style
chocolates WBgaiiylng’* gnmndf
often through franchise shops.

Outside the chocolate mar-
ket, Mr Henri NaUet, France's
Agriculture Minister, has
declared his opposition to fur-

ther foreign acquisitions In
the food and drinks industries,

although Ids only success has
beat in blocking the purchase

i

by Japan’s Takashimaya group
of the distributor of the Bur-
gundy wine, Romance Conti.

MR ROBERT CAMPEAU, file

Canadian property and retail-
ing investor, said yesterday he
had turned his main corporate

. vehicle into a holding comply
and devolved operating respon-
sibilities to its subsidiaries in
Canada and the US.

.
He said the change “reflects

the evolution” of Campeau
Corporation through its push
in recent years into US retail-

ing with the purchases of the
Allied and Federated depart-
ment store eiiaiws — including
Bloomingdale’s of New York -
for a total of US$10.2bn.
The changes will be scrutin-

ised carefully by US and Cana-

dian markets because concern
lingers about the financial
health and prospects for

group. Some analysts remain,

cautions even though Mr Cam-

'

pean has already sold enough
assets to pay off a large part of
the S9hn he borrowed to
finance the US acquisitions.

Analysts will also be trying
to assess the influence that
Olympia & York, the Canadian
property and resources group,
might be playing in Campeau's

affairs. O&Y, owned by the
Reichmann family of Toronto,
has a 26 per cent stake in Cam-
pean and is believed to be try-

ing to increase its role in the

company.

Campeau confirmed yester-

day that Mr James Roddy, its

president and dxtef operating

officer, had resigned because of

tim restructuring. He has been
replaced tor Mr Ronald Tysoe,

previously in charge of Cam-
peau’s corporate development

and president of its US arm.

The resignations are the lat-

est tended to Mr Campeau,
who is known for Ms fieryJum-

per and strong opinions. Last

May, Mr Robert Morosky. a
respected executive in the

retailing industry, quit aspres-

ident of Allied Stores.

In addition. Mr Roger Ash-
ton has resigned as Campeau’s
rfitef financial officer. Mr Rus-

sell Davis, who holds that posi-

tion at Federated and Allied,

will expand his job to take on
Mr Ashton’s duties. . . .

Under the new structure, the

operating subsidiaries are a
department stores group com-

bining Allied and Federated;

Ralphs Grocery, a California
supermarket chain; Campeau
Development Corp, the US
property arm; and Campeau
Canada, the Canadian property

operations.

Leumi makes record provision
By Hugh Cantegy in Tel Aviv

BANK LEUMI Ie-Israel, the
country’s second biggest bank,
yesterday joined Bank
Hapoalim, its larger rival, in
announcing record bad debt
provisions to cover its expo-
sure to the country's debt-rid-
den kibbutzim movement.
Bank Leumi said it was set-

ting aside Shi 633m ($347.7m)

against bad debts, and as a
result reported an inflation-ad-

justed net loss for 1988 of
Shi 202,000, compared with a
profit of Shi 20im in 1967.

Taken with the Shi 885m
provirions announced by Bank
Hapoalim and Shi 143m set
aside by Israel Discount T^awir,

the country's three largest
financial institutions have
together made bad debt provi-

sions of Shi LGfflm, a total far

in excess of .anything seen
before in Israel.

The mam reason was the vir-

tual collapse last year of the
kibbutzim movement of agri-
cultural and Industrial co-oper-
atives, and the simultaneous
debt crisis in Hoar Industries,

the big labour-owned conglom-
erate. The Government is in
the process of concluding res-

cue packages for both bat is

insisting the banks carry a
sizeable chunk of the burden.
Bank Leumi’s exposure to

the kibbutzim, which
approaches Shi 2bn, is less
tha^ ftalf that Of Wapftalirn. but
it still set aside Shi 272m
against kibbutzim debts, with
an additional Shi 60m set aside
against Koor.

Japanese

buy stake in

Groupe AG
By WURam Dawkins
in Brussels

Mr David Friedman, chief
executive, said a generally
stagnant economy meant
income from financing
operations was up only slightly

at Shi L53m. Total assets rose
2J5 per cent to Shi 48bn while
loans to and deposits by the'

public were up 4.7 per cent and
5.8 per cent respectively at
Shi 2Qbn and Shi 33.8bn.

TDB Amex advances by 12%
By William DulHoree in Geneva
TDB AMERICAN Express,
Switzerland’s biggest foreign-
owned bank, yesterday posted
1988 net earnings of SFr79-8m
($48.4m). an Increase of 1L8 per.

cent over the previous year.
It will pay its parent, Ameri-

can Express Bank, an un-
changed dividend of SFr35m.
With SFr37.5m brought for-
ward from 1987, the board has
SFrU7.3m at its disposal for
appropriations. It proposes to
allocate SFrSOm to reserves.

Total assets climbed by
SFr2.9bn during the year to

SFi9.3bn. This strong advance
was due In part to the merging
of the private banking inter-

ests of AEB in Switzerland and
London with TDB American
Express in March 1988.

The rise from SFrSbn to
SFr7.2bn. in total client depos-

its also stemmed in part from
the incorporation of the AEB
interests, but the board also
reports a “most satisfactory
growth” in private hanking
activities at all locations.

profits, the bank's reserves win
total SFr630m and capital
funds SFr851m- -

Before the merger, TDB and
American Express Bank (Swit-
zerland) posted , combined net
earnings of SFr88m and a com-
bined cashflow of SFtifflm In
1987.

After distribution of 1988

These results compare with
the 1988 net profit of SFr79JBm
and the cashflow of SFrl43m,
but the bank describes 1988 as
largely a year ofreorganisation'
and consolidation.

Hitachi fails to agree Comparex sale
By Louise Kehoe In San Francisco

ASAHI MUTUAL Life, Japan’s
fifth largest insurance com-
pany, 1ms taken a 5 per cent
stake worth an estimated
BFxSbn ($76.4m) in Groupe AG;
Belgium's largest insurer.

. .. The pair have agreed to co-

operate in Europe on: their,

“development, real ‘ estate
investments and fund manage-
ment,'* according to AG, which
holds 25 per cent of the Belgian

life assurance market and 10
per cent of the market for nan-
life risks.

“The purpose of these vari-

ous actions is to strengthen
Asahi's experience of invest-

ments Jn Europe with a view to
expanding its activities in the
light of tim single market in
1992,” the Belgian company
said.

Asahi already has offices in
London' and Luxembourg: Its

stake in AG entitles Asahi to a
board seat, the holder of which
will be nominated at the com-
pany’s next general meeting.
Asahi bought its shares from

SotidfS Generate de Belgique,

the holding company, and An-
Hyp, tiie Belgian savings bank,
both of which continue to hold
stakes in AG.

Just more Qian half of AG's
equity is owned ' by loyal
long-term investors, which also
Include RT Welding and the

HITACHI of Japan and
Comparex of West Germany
failed to reach an agreement
due yesterday on. the. sate to
Comparex of the European
operations of National
Advanced Systems, a unit
being shed by National Semi-
conductor of the US.
NAS is a leading supplier of

IBM plug-compatible main-
frame computers manufac-
tured by Hitachi. Comparex, a
European supplier of computer
peripherals in the plug-compat-
ible market, is partly owned by

BASF of West Germany.
In February, Hitachi and

Electronic Data Systems, a
unit at General Motors, agreed
to acquire NAS from National *

Semiconductor for.8898m . At
the time Hitachi said Out it

planned to aril the European
operations of NAS to Com-
parex for about 50 per cent of
the total purchase price.

According to Comparex,
however, talks with Hitachi
ran into difficulties when the
Japanese company introduced
new terms that would not

make the purchase viable.

Comparex said terms just set

out by Hitachi would have
meant -air. additional tax. -bur-

den for Comparex that would
have added roughly $K)Qm to

the purchase price.

Hitachi said talks were con-
tinuing and there was still a
chance the deal will go ahead
although it would not now be
possible to meet Hitachi’s goal
of completing an agreement
simultaneously with the clo-

sure of the purchase of NAS
from National Semiconductor.

'family at Mr Maurice Idppens,
who is the chairman of thewho is the Chairman of the
company.
" Asahi has an annual pre~'

mium income equivalent to
BFr440bn, mare than 10 times
the BEcUMbn for AGtoitsJast
full-year report in 3B8T.

'

; At the fast count at the end
of March last year, Asahi held
16 per cent of its assets -
which is BFr300bn out of a
total of BFrLSOObn - outside

Japan.
“AsahTs short-term objective

.is to increase the level of its

foreign investments," the com-
pany said.

WORLD COMMODITIES PRICES

WEEKLY PRICE
CHANGES

Latest
prices

Change Year
on week ago

High
1989

Low
1989

Gold per troy os. $378.25 -6.25 5449 $412.25 $378.25
Silver Per troy os 334 OSp -2.45 344.25p 35S.&5P 327 . 45p
Aluminium 99.7?» (cash) 52292.5 + B7.5 52460 $2610 $1907.5
Capper Grade A (cash) £1809 + 18 £1141 £1982.5 £1634.0
H-aa(cash) £369.5 + 3.0 £343.5 £392 E337
Nickel (cash) SI 51 50 -700 318100 SI 9350 514825
Zmc (cash) S1657 5 + 50 £585.75 $2107.5 SI 600.0
Tin (cash) S 10725.0 + 237.5 £3645 S 10760 $7460
Cocoa Futures (Jul) £744 -18 C933 £900 £742
Coiteo Futures (Jul) £1109 -4 £1042 £1270 £1069
Sugar (LOP Raw) S299.0 -10.4 3230 6 $315.0 5235.8
Bailey Futures (Sep) £102.9 + 0.3 £98.7 £113.50 £100 95
Wheat Futures (Junl C11B.4 -1.0 £107.1 £121.85 £114.40
Cotton Outlook A Index 74 65c + 0.10 65.65c 75.05C 61.35
Wect (6J5 Super) mop 660p 71 Op 620p
Rubber (Spot) 58 00p -0.2S 65.25P 64p 560
Oil (8 rent Blond) S 19.252 -1.25 516.675 S21.35 316 125

r». L-xino uni««a oitH-rwlao alalod. tUnquoUN p-p*fK0Ag. c-canra (b :-May.

(Prteaa supplied

H/fih/Low AM Official

Aluminium. HJ% portly (S per tonne)

by Amalgamated Mauri Trading)

Kart close Open Interest

Rtnfl turnover 9,425 tonne

US MARKETS COPPBI 25800 lbs; cents/lbs

Cosh 2290-5
3 month* 210O-S

awawM jaoa-g
2200/21 70 2184-5

Copper. tirade A (E per tonne)

175-7 33.095 tola

Rbig turnover 2X400 tonne

Cart 1808-10
3 months 1770-7

1815
178871770

Saver tU8 centa/Hne ounce)

Cash 580-2 57X5
30 June 588-8 581-3

1770-1 7X657 lots

Rtng turnover 0 oza

Lead (E per tonne) Ring turnover 8,550 tonne

Cart 380-70
3 months 388-8

WlBfcel (5 per tonne)

Cart 15100-200

368-8-5 9.722 Iota

Ring turnover 1,044 tonne

1665M00
3 manats 14908-60 15200-80

33nc, Special High Credo (S per tonne)

Cart 1675-80 1895-705

15150/15100
15000/14800

15100-50
14800-50 14850-800 7,440 lota

Ring turnover 8.950 tonne

3 months 1835-40
1707/1700
1855/1840

SPOT MARKETS COCOA C/lonno
Zinc (5 per tonne)

183Q-4Q 10834 lots

Ring turnover 8,250 tonne

Crudti oH (pci t*airN FOB) + or - Close Previous Htgh/Low

Cj6m
BiOTl Olnnd
\V T 1 (1 pm owl

Sl5H+S0Cq - 339
SI0 20-9 -OSS
S20 U4 SSq 41.44

May
Jul

724
744

722
743

727 718
747 730
784 753

OR product*
IWt prpmp! do+vory par tonne CIF) + or •

Dec
Mar

790
791

aoo
790

80S 795
798 7S9

Prrmiuni GasaUno
Cat. Cil

S2M-MS -1

S152-1S4 -3 Jul 608 B!2 816 807

Cart 1855-80

3 months 1592-5
1885
161071580

ROTATORS Ertonne

Hunw Fgol Oil

tort-in
Pciroloum «*rCU , £slimalmt

TurnovorJ731 (10653) Ion Dl 10 tonnes

ICCO indicator pi'ce* (SOHs per tonne) Dally
prkoo lor Apr 27: 981.C4 1059 09). 10 day average
lor Apr 23. 901.05 1933.06)

Close Previous Hlgh/Low

May 1336 134.0 1416 1336
Nov 916 91.5
Frt 1000 1006
Apr 137.5 1376 138.0 1376

LONDON BULUOM MARKET
OeM (Una oz) 5 pries

Turnover 268 (125) lots of 40 tonnes.

Ci>:0 rpnr IrOy njl^V
D.'vor ,'pcr Irov OCVf*
r-io:.nym tppi hoy C-'l

Pn'lnd.cni (per Iroy oj)

Close 378-37812
Opening 381 >2-382
Morning fix 381.3
Afternoon flu 377.55
Day’s high 381 V-382U
Day’s low 377*4-37754

E equivalent

ZSItx-SMtlT*
225*4-225^1
225.222
2244)82

IN THE METALS, prices Ml in all

markets led by heavy selling In the
gold and-sh/ier. reports Drexel

Burnham Lambert Gold lost over &50
as stop loss sailing weakened the
market Silver tell due to carryover
selling from Thursdays decline.
Palladium tumbled from a news article

saying that tftanhun could be a
substitute metal. Platinum tell on
spillover selling from palladium and
the lower energy complex. Copper
trading was again;slow with prices
slipping a Ml In the softs, the
expiration of the May contract and new
short selling by oommlsaion houses
and funds sank the sugar. Coflee
declined on news of the dock strike
settlement. Trade buying In cocoa
firmed prices. Pork belly and hog
futures lost ground as lower cash
prices and increased hog runs kept
prices down. An unexpected Japanese
beet tender supported the cattle

market In the grains, soybeans closed
lower as the port strike settlement and
rainfall kept a lid on prices. Wheat rose
12*2 cents basts May as rumours of
the EFP announcement rallied the
market Corn gained slightly on
expected Soviet tender business.
Crude tell sharply In the near-by
months

May

Ctoao

13870

Prevloua

13890

Htgh/Low

13960 13850
Jun 138^40 13860 0 0
Jul 133.80 13810 134.40

‘

13260
Sap 12810 129.90 12890 127.70

Dec 12260 124.40 .12860 122.70

cnaoa oa. (uonq 42.000 us gam tAtm
Latest Pravtoua Htgh/Low

Jun 2043 20.92 20.70 2038
JxA 1823 13-34 I960

’

1961
Aug 1883 1854 1884 1829
Srt 1822 1803 1823 17JS
Oet T762 1769 1762 1761
Nov

.
tun 17.45 17.72 1760

Dac T7JS3 17JEB - 1760 1762
Jan 1760 17.07 1760 17.06
(Fab 17.IB 1893 17.19 17.19

Chicago
SOYABEANS 5,000 bu snbn oents/80tb bushel

Close Pravtoua Hlgh/Low

May 722/4 729/4 724/0 720/4
Jul 729/4 738/0 730/4 725/0
Aug 727/4 732/4 729/0 723/0
Sep 714/0 717/8 Tiara 710/4
Nov 705/8 Ttwe 706/0 702/0
Jan 714/8 717/6 718/0 713/4
Mar 734/0 72BHJ 726/0 722/4
May 730/4 734/0 731/0 730/4

SOYABEAN OIL 6Q8Q0 Rmk eenta/tb

HEAT1NCI OjL 42X00 US flafla, omtfa/US QaUs

Latest Pravtoua High/Low

May 8186 5186 6220 5138
Jun 4906 -4964 S030 4809
Jul 4906 4814 4928 4830
Aug 4630 4840 4950 4880
*ap 4075 4890 5005 4823
Oet 6040 SMS 8000 4878
Now SUO 5100 SIw 8060
Dac 6140 CIS 6178 5115

CAN MEA11QP tons; frtan

Ora® Previous High/Low

COCOA 10 tanrwrtManms

Aluminium Ilroc maihtn)
Copper iU5 Protocol)

Loud (US Procurer]
N'Ool I'roc marvel)
Tin iFuoposn Iron martial)
T-i* (Kuaia Lumpur martoO
T.n |Now York)
z<rrs (US Prime Western)

52305
14JV148C
37 SC
645c
SI 0725
28 48r

490 5c
87^c

Close Previous Hlgn/).ow

May 1i« 1178 1169 1142

Jly 1109 1127 111B 1092

Sop 1065 1079 1069 1045

Nov 1050 1068 1030 >032

Jon 1044 ion 1045 T028

Mar 1042 1048 1033 1030

May 1042 1050 1042 1032

SOVASSAM NIAL E/tOima

Close Prcvkw WgtVLow

Jim 155.00 157.50

Aug 148.50 15200 151.00 W7.70
Oca 149,00 151,00 150.00

Tumevar 32 (32D)loa <4 20 worm.

Can id wO'C^Uf
S"cep (Ooad wpigni)t
P-g« iiivo wciigftrT

Turnover7752 <6945) lota of S tonnes

ICO Indicator prices (US cents per pound) tor

Apr 27: Comp, drty 119 05 (120.08). is day
average 11822 (118.01)

I SlQ/hxtsx point

i.C'SJCn daily sugar I'awr) S299 Ou
London daily sugar (wtHtr) 5341 0u
Tax and L>!o oipon price C288.0

SUOAM (S par tonne)

Bariev sEngiirt lecd) C104 25*»

Ma .-e iUS to 3 valid*) 1 134
V.>vaf tU5 Dark tortnem) C1287S*

BiJjbpr i«pol<W 58 000
Rubber iJunlT 60 00p
Rubber (Jill) 66JSO
Rubber IKV RSS No 1 M«)SK 5m
Cocorut cal (Philippines SSlUu
Palm Cl iMataysian)S S405 -5
Copra (Philippines)? $332.5
5r,aboana il/Si C2KN
Coswi "A' mdet ?4 6Se
wpollers l&to Suww) 820p

£ a lonno uni oss ociarwlso slated, pganga/kg

C -cnni5.il). 1-ringgiL’kQ. v-Apr/Jun u-MaylJun.
c-Jun v-Apr.’May. *~Aug. *-Mpy tMaal Com-
mission average lastoch prices cnango from
a nrpch ago WLendon physical market 9CIF

RonciOam + Bullion market eK»4. m-MAtoy.
sum cer.ts-Vg

ttmrn Close Previous High /lm*

May 270.00 204.60 270.00 267.GO

Aug 256 60 268.00 270.00 256»
O* 254.80 269 20 269 W2S4 E0

Dee 257 00 269 CO 285 00

Mar 249 80 261.80 28200 232.DO

WMto Gtora Previous High/Low

Aug 332.00 334.00 33580 390.50

Oa 31200 326.00 323.00 312.00

Doc 310 00 319.00

Mar 301.00 31000 312.00 30800
May 299.00 30800 309.00

Close Previous High/Low

Apr 1623 162S 1822 MW
May 1041 1033 1648 1640
Jul 1440 1427 1441 1430
Oct ISM 1320 1538 1830
Jan 15HJ 1548 1560
Apr 1580 1573 1552 1580
BFI 1829 1634

Cotea S pnea

MopMeal 380-394

Britannia 389484
US Eagle 389-384
Angel 309494
Krugerrand 377-380

New Scv. '89-60

OKI Sov. 88-80
Nobte Plat 547-2-530.4

E equivalent

230-233

230-233

New York

C30M Pravtoua High/Low

043 1223 1246
1211 1200 1217
1213 1206 1222
1222 1213 1227
1221 1214 1223
1293 1224 1233
1211 1200 1217
vzn 1282 1270

maize 5^100 bu mini conte/aeib bushel

CToee Previous tfigh/Low

100 troy oat; gftroy oz.

Claee Previous High/Low
230-233
223-225

52*2-83 «4

5212-63(4

323-1-328-56

W*”* "C 37jQflfba; oama/lbs

Ctoae Previous Wgh/Low

May 268/2 288/6 270/0
Jul 270/4 Z70* 271/4
Sap 282/0 293/4 2B3/4
Dae 28B/6 282/4 261/4
Mar 288/2 288/0 208ft)
May 267/8 270/0 289/4
Jul 270*0 271/4 271/4

Turnover 412 (687)

Sftrar fix p/flne oc

Spot 344 05
3 months 34480
B months 358.05
12 months 377.75

US cte equlv

583R0
577JO
502.70
BXf SO

9772 3832 378.0 377JS 13470 1S03E
380.5 388.1 38U STM Jot 127^48 131.04
382.7 0 0 0 Sap 12226 12010
384.8 SOILS 387/S 38M Dae 1*8.80 121JEO
389.8 3S3l3 381-5 389X1 Mv item 1212S
394* 400.4 '

397-5 3903 May 117/00 13Q.QQ
399-8 40St8 4008 3000 Jut 117.00 12M0
404JJ 4108 404.3 403JS Sap 117JB IIOOO
4092 4109 414J) 4108

. WQM WORLD 11’ 1«
PLATINUM SO troy <a- 8/iroy oz.

MEAT BiflOO bu mfarr cente/OOttHairtcl

Port Prevtocm Wgft/Low

“V 417M 405AJ 421/0
Jui 405/0 398/8 405/0
Sep 413/6 407/2 41310
Dec 424/E 419/2 438/0
Mar 431/4 423/S 481/4
Mey 422/4 417/0 422/4

GRAINS Crtorme

Wheat Close Previous Htgh/Low

May 110.80

Jun 118j40

Sep 10620
Nov 10740

11880 11880 11810
118.40 118.40 11800
105.10 105.16 10810
107J5 107.40

Atemtnlum |B9.7K) Calls puts

Strike price S tonne May Jul May Jul

Ctorn Pnvtous Ngh/Low

Jul 3342 5622 5400 5303
Oet 6206 5802 6400 tona
Jan 3208 5602 0400 3315
Apr 5005 652-2 3400 5315

163 105 1
65 128 12
14 05 81

1 8000 any eg canteRroy ot

Close Previous ttgh/Low

Turnover; Raw 3534 (4800) late <H 50 tomtes.

Whuo <395 <812) .

Pans- Whiio (FFr per tonne): Aug 3095, Oet 20C5,

Doc 1950. Mar 1925. May 1915. Aug 1905.

Bartey Ctoia Prevloua Wflh/Low

May 107.60 10815 107.80 107JO

Clipper (Grade A)

OAK OtL S/lonne

owiaa on. snxirrei

Ctoao Previous Nigh/Low

•iun 18 K 1900 1B« 18.!
Jun IQ K 1900
Jul 17 74 1J.04
Aug 17 15 17.JJ2
‘PE tr-tfex iqcj 10 51

Turnover* 6833 i&OOfll
"

1855 18.53

17M 17.64

17 15 17.05

Close Prflvtous Hlgh/ura

May 151 25 153 25 153 50 1ST.00

Jun 14750 14900 149.25 147J»
Jul 146 50 147.50 147JO 14500
Aua 146.75 148.00 14725 14525

Sop 14825 149-50 14800 146.75

Oci 149S0 ISO 75

NOv 150.75 183.00 150 75 150 25

Doe 153 75 154 50 153 00 152.00

SOP l«L£G 103.10
Nov 10885 108.10 10800

Turnover wheal 04 (ISO). Barley 30 (29).
Turnover lots of 100 tonnes.

18* 178 2 B9
24 87 EB ISO

36 234 339

lONDCM POX TRADED OCTIOaH

500.1 564-6 SMwQ
566.1 5*9.5 0
570J 5750 57A£
600.7 5885 5880
5BS.1 6083 600J)
509.7 GOSlI 0
6083 61SJJ eiao
6182 82M *280
6282 «55l& 632.0
6386 *482 641.fi

Ctort Prevloua Hlgh/Lw

May 11JB mi mi ii«W 1164 1269 12.12 11,51OS 11 JJ0 1200 .1204 11SO
«l« 1U3 1160 0 0
Mar 1164 116* 11.71 1162
May IV1 11.70 11.70 1161
JM 1160 11-87 1120 1lao

COTTON 5Q600; cents/lbs
'

Ctoe Previous HlgMLow

UVC CATTLE 40600 tag centeflhe

Ok** Prevloua raph/uwr

Jvo TIM 1on 7160
""

Aug 8868 87.7T 8827
Sep 6840 *875 *840
Oct 69.20 8897 GBM
Oaa 7068 6667 7830
Fl9ta 70.70 7060 7060

UV1 HOG8 30.000 Hx oantanbe

Cto— Pwwteua High/Low
8COO 84-05 UM SUO Jun 48.62
MRO 84JO 66.03 . 34,51 Jut 47JK
88J5 nen 63,70 «L35 Aug , *6.17
6SJOO 6SJJ6

.
63JS 84-95 oet 43.02

mrao «J0 SMS 69u8S . Dee 4445
66.10 6&00 muss 6SJS Feb 4flJ)5lI Apr

Jun
44.60

47137

PW» (Cert SeBlameni) p/kg

Close Previouj High/Low

Jun 108 5 108 0
Aug 108 5 106.0 1062 105.7
Oci 110.0 110.0
Nov 111.0 111J1
Feo 1D&5 106i 1C82

TumOver 70S3 (
7137JIOU Of ICO MniWn Turnover 72 (191 lots Of 3650 kg

Jul

45

sep

40

Jul

38

Sep

78
25 25 68 ill
13 IS 104 181

Jul Sep Jul Sep

54 76 10 18
24 45 30 36
3 24 64 65

REbnart (Seae; SepterBber 18 1831 a 10Q)

Apr 27 Apr 26 mate ago yr age

20284 20236 20082 17S1J~

DOWJONES (Ba»8: Dec. 31 1974 100)

Spot T37JS3 137.73 13870 12810
Futures 13814 13860 13817 13260

' Cum Pravtoua WtfVLow

Mey 178.45 174.70 379X0 174.05
Jul 181.80 177JO 18Z80 177J2S
Sap 1774*5 174jB 779.00 T74J0
Now vsrm 16380 1B&80 164,25

• Jan 164-25 16055 16450 TEQ90
Star 163.75 KO06 0 0
May fBXfiD 15680 16050 16050
Jul 163-90 mao 0 0
Sap 16800 18000 IOOjOO

•run 4B.cz 4767 4669
Jut

.
4762 4767 4768
*817 4847 4840O* 4802 43.12 4822

D#C 4468 4465 4460
Feb 4805 46.17 4820
Apr 4460 4466 j)T
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INTL. COMPANIES

Howard Smith to
sell loss-making coal
unit to associate
By Chrf* Sherwell in Sydney

HOWARD SMITH, one ol
Australia's oldest companies,
is to undergo a long-mooted
restructuring through the
A$186.6m (USS148.6m) sale of
its loss-making coal business to
Coal & Allied Industries, its 48
per oent-owned associate.

The move announced yester-
day continues a process of
rationalisation for both compa-
nies. It will boost Howard
Smith's earnings and
strengthen its balance sheet
while adding substantially to
Coal & Allied’s production and
reserves.

The terms also mean the
stake of Mr John Spalvins’
Adelaide Steamship group in
Howard Smith will rise from
19.9 per cent to at least 35.5 per
ccut, leaving the investment
conglomerate aa Its largest sin-

gle shareholder.
Apart from coal, Howard

Smith has interests in indus-
trial products distribution,
engineering, towage and ship-

ping, including North British
Mantime of the UK,

Under the restructuring.
Coal St, Allied is to sen its 22
per ' cent cross-holding in
Howard Smith and make a
rights issue in order to fund its
purchase of Howard Smith’s
wholly-owned coal subsidiary*
R W Miller. Coal & Allied
already manages the R W
Miller interests.

Coal & Allied will sell its 22
per cent stake by offering
Howard Smith shareholders
one of its Howard Smith shares
for every 3£5 shares held at
A$3£5 per share. This com-
pares with the Howard Smith
share price of A$4~20.

Its rights issue to Coal &
Allied shareholders will be on
a one-for-two basis at A£L50
per share, to raise AgfiOm. This
compares with a Coal & Allied
share price of AS4.75.
Howard Smith, which has

sold a string of assets over the
past year, confirmed it would
maintain its 48 per cent hold-
ing in Coal & Allied and take
up its entitlement undo* the
rights issue.

High metal prices boost
Australian mine groups
By Chris Sherwell

TWO OF Australia's largest
resource groups, MIM Holdings
and North Broken Hill Peko,
yesterday reported increased
profits for the first three quar-
ters of the financial year,
reflecting the- continuing
strength of base metal prices.

MIM said its after-tax profits

from operations rose to

A$144.1m (US$114.8m) from
AS56.5m in the same period
last year. With foreign
exchange gains, the figure was
10 times higher at A$l87.lm.
Sales revenues were

A$l.26bn. up by AS127m. and
the group reported a strong
cashflow of AfcBOm, up 39 per
cent A further A$120m came
in from the sale of MBCs 4)
per cent stake in the Agnew
nickel project, and the group
reduced its net debt from
A$1.54bn last June to A$958m.

The overall profit improve-
ment was due mainly to strong
copper zinc prices, and.
would have been still greater

but for the impact of a strong
Australian dollar, which
reached a four-year high dur-
ing tiie period.

The black spot remained
coal, both because or the cur-

rency and because of industrial

disruption which contributed
to a 13 per cent fall in sales

volume to 6m tonnes. Zinc
sates were also weaker because
of a pricing dispute with a Jap-
anese smelter.

North Broken Hill Peko
showed a consolidated equity
accounted profit, after tax and
minorities, of A$8&9m, up from
A$70.6m in the year-ago period.

The group is the result of

North Broken Hill’s acquisition

of Peko-WaHsend last year.
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CURRENCIES, MONEY AND CAPITAL MARKETS
FOREIGN EXCHANGES

Central banks sell dollars
INTERVENTION BY several

leading central banks was only
partly successful in controlling

the dollar's firmer trend in cur-

rency markets yesterday. The
US Federal Reserve and the
Bank of England were joined

by central banks in Canada.
France, Italy and Switzerland
selling the D-Mark at around
the DM1.88 level The Fed was
also selling Japanese yen at
Y13JLS5-
However, the US unit still

finished on a firmer note
despite a 0.7 per cent fall in

March- leadmg economic indi-

cators.

The firmer tone was difficult

to interpret, but the absence of

any rise in the Japanese dis-

count rate provided underlying
support The improvement was
-also enhanced by comments
from a leading Swiss official,

claiming that the Swiss franc
was overvalued. This led to
suggestions that Swiss Interest

rates may not be increased.
Unless rates outside the US

show a firmer trend, demand

C IN NEW YORK

for the dollar is likely to con-
tinue. Intervention by central

banks yesterday owed much of
its partial success to the rela-

tively low trading volume
ahead of the long weekend in
most financial centres.

The dollar closed at

DM1.8800 from DM1.8765 and
YJ32.S5 compared with Y132.15.

Elsewhere, it finished at
SFrl.6730 from SFrl.6585 and
FFr6.3550 from FFr6.3475. On
Bank of England figures, the
dollar's exchange rate index
rose to 6&5 from 68.4 on Thurs-
day.

Sterling finished towards the
day's lows. Its exchange rate
index slipped to 95.0 at one
point, before closing at 95. L,
still down from 95 J! at the
opening although unchanged
from the close on Thursday.

Investors were content, in
the main, to adopt a wait-and-
see attitude ahead of the long
weekend. Like the dollar, the
pound is likely to gain support
from recent suggestions that

most major European interest

rates are unlikely to move
firmer for the time being.

The pound closed at $1.6890

from $1.6910 against the dollar,

but improved in D-Mark terms
to DM3.1750 from DM3.1725.
Elsewhere, it finished at

SFr2.8250 from SFr2.805Q and
FFrlO.7325, unchanged from
Thursday. Against the yen, it

rose to Y224.25 from Y223.5Q.

The D-Mark lost ground
against the French franc, clos-

ing in London at FFr3.3605
from FFr3.3825. The franc’s
firmer tone was underpinned
by news that the French trade

deficit in March narrowed to
FFr263m, better than the
FFr400m shortfall in February,
and a substantial contrast to

market predictions of a FFr3bn
deficit.

The Swiss franc continued to

lose ground and was quoted at
an eight-year low against the
D-Mark. The franc fell to
DM1.1240 from DM1.1315 on
Thursday,
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MONEY MARKETS

UK rates

steadier
STERUNG INTER-BANK rates
were confined to a narrow
range In London yesterday.
While a narrower UK trade def-

icit in March and a further
contractioD in money supply -

as defined by M0 - helped the
market to take a more relaxed

view, there appears to be little

prospect of an early reduction
in baids: base rates.
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180 0 2 UM 1187 "075 4 24 67 80 8775 3 35 75 »
185 0 0 1638 1685 9100 2 16 90 97 1 25 96 70

EsUuated etslooe IM*. GUIs D Puts 0
Previous toy's open lit Calls 160 Pats 1600

LONDON (UFFE)

26-YEAS 9% NOTIONAL GILT
C5d.no 32afi of 10B%

EsHaaled rabanr fatal. Drib 751 Pie 701
PrettaB tor's am Ik. CUB 3735 PUU 4713

Enimaud vokme total. Calls U52 Pots 1276

PrerisBs toy's om inu Uls 244U Pats 26753

PHILADELPHIA SE £/S OPTIOfB
£31256 (mb per £U

Jin
Sep

dose High U» Ptn.

96-Ci 9W3 »« 95-2S
96-28 9787 9781 9624

Estimated VoHane 14927 (72471
Pmkw day's open hd. 22361 Cl90®

7-46 YEAR 9% KOTBHML GILT
S598« 32adi at 1H>>

Strike Calk

Price

1.660 »f
Jm
3.96

Jrt

4.19 4J7§ 0%
1.675 UR 232 2.66 3.55 0.61
1.700 045 LZ3 170 2.48 1.97
1.725 OjOT 0JH» 097 1.71 3.94

L750 0.02 0J9 046 1.12 632
1.775 0.02 0J8 Ota 879
1800 - 0.07 039 1127

Pas
Jen
085

Jul
157 fr

L55 260 391
314 382 534
495 55b 699
706 755 883
9.43 9.74 10 83
11.75 12.04 12%

Owe
92-23

High
Jm
Sep

Estimated Volume 0 (01

Pmlaas day s open InL 165 (1651

92-23
Pmbus day’s am tat Calls 438.646 Puts 405.048 lAJI camaria)
PmltxJB oafs voUehc Calb 51,053 Pats 9.868 LMI uu ipiOoI

IIS TREASURY BONDS 896
5160800 32nds af 1M%

CHw Ulo
91MS5 90-C
90413

Jim

Dec

Estimated Vetome 3319 (2517)

Pmtocs Uni's open taL 68b5 (72291

Low Pmr.
90-00 90-05

90-03

6-K. NOTIDNAL GESMAH GOVT. BOMB
DM 250,06a lOOtks af 108%

Do* Hnh
94.19

Lm Pits.

Jen 94.03 9482 93.97
Sep 93.67 93.78 93.70 93.62

Dec 93.37 9332

£n
central

rata

Cureocy

a£irt 6ca

AffJB

% change

hem
central

tale

% duaae
arifwtal tor

dMergence

Okayra
Ham %

435403 +255 +088 ±15344
755212 +320 +143 ±15404

IV'-IT'riVlMlM 209S53 208041 +L06 -0.61 ±10981
6.93403 7.03122 +L84 +0.17 ±L3b74

DuKkfixUder 251943 234625 t116 -051 ±15012
0.768411 0.778725 +L34 -033 ±16664

JuUanUra. 148353 152283 +265 +168 ±44752

Apr 28 mDD Yes K^2I H FI. Lm El B Fr.

E DPI 1689 3175 2243 10 73 2325 3580 2324 2005 66 40
S 1 1860 1328 6JS3 1673 2120 1376 L187 3931

DM 0315 0532 1 7065 3380 0890 1128 7320 0A31 20 91
YEN 4.458 7.530 14.16 1000 4754 1259 15 96 10361 8939 2965

FFr. 0932 1574 2959 2098 10. 2633 3336 2166 1869 6188
SFr. 0354 0593 1134 79.43 3.798 1 1267 8227 0.710 2350

H FI. 0279 0 472 2997 1 isn 0560 1R 44
Lira 0.430 0X27 KhI 4617 jgjl 1540 wj* 0863 2857

CS 0.499 0542 1584 1119 5JS2- 1409 1786 1159 1 3312
1506 2544 4762 3375 1616 4255 3.392 3500 3.020 100.

Estimated Volume 10575 (13588)
Prerioas day’s open tat. 36650 060931

6% NOTIONAL LONG TERM JAPANESE GOVT.
BOND VUOH lOOtks if 100%

Jm
Sep

Dose High Low Pie*.

10437 104.47 10433 104.43

103.48 10336 103.49 10384

Estimated Vohwe 596 1492)

Pmrioas day’s open kft. 762 ISM

THREE MONTH 5TESUNG
£506800 iMtatiaf 169%

One Hlgfa low Pm.
Jaa 87 03 87.16 87 00 87.10

Sep 8755 87.66 8752 87.S9
Dec 88.00 88 09 87.% 8854
Mar 8827 8834 8824 8832

EsL VoL (Wc.ftgs.iwt stem) 23694 (24316)
PrtibBs day’s cptn im. 75202 (7«W>

1

THREE MONTH EURO^Iil
"

Sim pohits af 108%

CHICAGO

ILS. TREASURY BOMBS CST1 8%
SU0860 32a* if 160%

JH

£
Mar
Jim

5?Dec.

Mar
Jut

&

Latta High Lew
9W8 90-17 90-01

•5S4H 90-13 89-30
9003 9010 9000
9001 9007 89-24
B9-2B 9002 B9-2B

8024 8028 8024

Pm.
9000
8029
8026
8023
6020
8016
80 11
8006
8001
8027
88-21

JAPANESE VEH OUMI
YU5m S per Y1W

GteS Riga tow KS"
0.7573 0.7587 0 7567 0.7627Jua

Mar

0 7660 0.7677 0 7656 0 7716

0.7755 - 07755 0 7605
- 0 7894

DEUTSCHE UAKK (T ’ Ul

DM125,000 S per DM
'

' Latest HJas Law Pm
03334 03346 05332 05357Jtm

Sep
Dec

05372 05387 0.5372 05397
05420 - 05420 05440

ILS. TfiEASURY BILLS OHIO

f aftf

91.72
HU

9187
Law

9170
Pm.
9172

THDEE4MNTH EUDtJOOLLAR HUM)
QnpiMsaf 100%

Sep 91.78 9LB3 9174 9L73 HU Low Pm
Dee 91.72 9179 9L69 91.68 9022 9035 9019 9019
liar 9L83 9LB6 9181 9181 9046 9028 9026
Jaa • - • 9183 9028 90.42 9024 9023
Sep 9172 Bar

Jon
Sm
Dec

Urn

90.46
90.47
90.45
9037
90.46

9058
«®60
9058
9050
9056

90«
9043
90.42

9035
90.45

90.42
90.46
90.46
9038
90 47

SWISS FRANC dUW
SFr 125880 S per SFr

STANDARD & POORS 500 INDEX
SSOO Bnw odea

Sw
Dec

Latest High Law Pm.
PK'Iyl 0.6057 Jua
I-Y'-nrr-fJI’T-M'l 0.6107 Sep
0.6100 - 0.6100 06161 Dec

Latest High Low

311.65 312-00 31130
316.05 31650 315 90
32050 32180 32050

Pm.
31155
316.05
320.60

90JSJob 9022 4059 9022 M0U-S fFQKXM EXOUKQ

Ott
Mar

90.14

9034
9037
9052

90.14
90.44

90 25
90.42

Spot
16390 16848

3-mtlL

16767
6-fffitL

1.6660

I2m0L
16487

SUMTERURC Si pee £

EsL Vo I [lac. figs, oot shown) 14974 053721
Pm toes day’s open M. 59993 (60632)

THREE MONTH EUtOMARK
Dll lm potato af 106%

Jut

Dec

im Htah Lmr Pm.
16768 1.68L4 L6762 L6844
1.6650 16682 L6650 L6726
L6580 15600 16530 L6634

Ctose Htah

9331
Lm Pm.

Jot 9319 93.16 9324
Sep 93.09 93 20 93.09 9324
Dec 9301 9314 9106 9358
Mar 9301 9325 9106 9359

EaJnuted Volumr 2954 (30981
Pmtaas day's open la. 5983 <50651

Ff-St IM INDEX
£25 per hdl tadex petal

Jua
Ses

Cte High Low
21585 216.70 214.90
21925

Estimated Vdiuue 2832 (3I6«
Pm lorn day’s open Irl 18393 (18513)

FT GUIDE TO
WORLD

CURRENCIES
Every Tuesday

in the FT

LONDON TRADED OPTIONS
EXPIRY DAY In the FT-SE 100
index option passed quietly away,
though there was some bullish

tendency reported by dealers.
Overall market turnover reached
the modest total of 31.636 con-
tracts. made up of 24,010 calls

and 7,626 puts, as the FT-SE 100
index gained 2.3 points on bal-
ance to 2,118 .0.

Relief that the UK overseas
trade figures for March, released
on Wednesday, had not met the
worst fears continued to buoy up
the equities market. The alloca-

tion of Treasury bills — which
had been passed over the previ-

ous week - at a yield below that

of a fortnight ago also encour-
aged equity holders.

Dealings In the Index came to

CALLS PUTS
Ophaa Jd Oct Ja M Ott J*o

10,631 contracts, again reaching
some one-third of overall busi-
ness, with call contracts amount-
ing to 7.695 and put to 2,936.
Trading in the index option was
helped modestly, as was the
index itsell, by a premium over
fair value being seen in the con-
tract on it for June on LJffe.

There was some net closing in
Index options, even bo, on the
call side, and some opening on
the put The most actively traded
index series included the April
2.1 SO calls, which saw 1,776 con-
tracts, and a slight closing of
position, the May 2100 calls,

and slight closing of interest and
the May 2150 calls, which found
1,766 contracts and the substan-
tial closing of position of 1,206

CALLS Pins

contracts to 4,779.

On the put side ot the index,
the most actively traded series
were the May 2050s, dealings of
861 in which saw some closing of
position, and the May 2100s, in
whioh activity of 666 contracts
brought some opening of interest.

Cadbury cantered away from
the field in the individual stock
options stakes, as the underlying
price of the slock gained 8 ^2 p to

354p. on a basis apparently
largely governed by options deal-
ings.

Turnover in the option on the
stock amounted to 2.193 on the
call side and 780 on the put. The
May 360 calls alone reached
1.310 contracts and brought an
opening of interest In the series
of 856 contracts to 2,772.

CALLS PUTS

Alld Leant 420446269 7 11 13

P457 I 46Q 20 3fa 45 24 25 30
500 8 18 - 52 54 -

BriLJUmaff laO 38 42 - 1 24 -
1*195) 180 20 25 32 4 7 11

200 7 15 IS 16 17 19

Bm Com 200 16 24 2b 8 9 13
r?£l9) 220 b 14 17 18 20 22

. 240 3 7 - 38 3S -

600 52 73 90
fa50 26 47 62

Beedam
(too

.

Bone. 290 20 30 37
(*290 ) 300 9 20 26

6.P.

1*290)

eniHti Steel

l*B5 >

Bass
(*949 I

230 20 27 35
300 9ij 161] 24

70 16V 17 21
80 7V 10 14

90 2 5>i 8b

900 77 112 125
9S0 48 80 95

1000 23 55 -

20 26 30
42 45 55

U 14 15
21 24 26

7b lib M
18 21 24

lb 3 4b
4V 6b 8
1212b M
16 23 32
40 42 52
62 67 -

C & Wire 420 94 109 118
ran I 460 59 76 90

500 31 51 63

Con. Gold 1250 120 155 180
(13001 1300 90 U0 155

1350 70 95 130

Couruokk
(“3321

Com. Union

1*385)

300 37 45 50

530 14 26 33
360 4b M -

360 40 48 62
390 18 30 38

420 3 16 -

2 6 8
9 13 19
23 29 33

45 70 90
TO 95 115
95 125 145

6 10 12
18 21 24
39 40 -

6 11 13
16 24 2b
36 42 -

G.K.N.

1*385)

Grand Met
1*572)

330 66 73 83

360 41 «9 61

390 21 30 42

3 4 7

5 10 15

16 22 »
500 89 100 113 2 6 9
550 48 62 75 10 17 20
600 29 34 48 33 40 43

I.CJ. U50 119 140 175 14 28 3S
£*1221) 1200 80 1D5 142 30 47 52

1250 47 77 112 55 70 82

Inner 233 34 43 54 4 11 13

(T302 ) 300 19 31 42 11 22 25

330 6b 17 26 31 38 44

KMftter 269 40 <4 S3 4 5 9
1*297) 280 23 30 38 9 12 13

3C0 12 19 27 17 21 25

LuErcta 500 67 84 92 6 U 15
(*5571 550 31 51 hi 21 2b 32

600 11 26 - S3 57 -

Lae 5eau
raa i

u&s
[*171

)

STE

ras>

Swc-ury
(
c243

1

Shell Tran.
r«3)

550 36 57 70 W 17 21

too 12 30 42 42 43 47

160 14 20 25 4 6 7b
180 4 8b 11 15 16 17

223 59 67 77 2b
303 41 53 63 5

330 21 32 43 16 19 23

220 26 35 42 2

240 11 20 27 8
4 6

10 12

360 - 68 76 - 5 6

3W 32 «2 52 7 11 )b
«20 16 23 33 20 23 25

Optlea hd Oct Jm M Oct Jaa

Sutetonse 140 38 40 43 2 3b 5
<*1741 160 20 2b 29 6 9 12

180 9b 14 19 18 20 22

Trafalgar 330 62 77 78 2b 4 b
C390) 360 34 48 56 6 11 16

390 18 28 34 21 & 28

UBLBbcalU 300 31 « 50 6 8 U
P327 ) 330 13 23 32 19 22 25

360 5 12 - 45 46 -

IMkscr 500 66 a 100 3 6 9
red91 650 28 49 63 IS 20 44

Ultramar 280 42 54 68 7 11 14
non 300 28 42 52 12 20 26

330 14 26 34 32 34 38

Optfoa ar Aag dv Am Hoi

Brit tern 500 88 106 118 b 5 ID
nab ) 550 40 65 K3 4 15 a

600 9 34 S3 23 35 45

BAA 3M 51 59 73 b 6 8
(*377) 360 74 35 51 2b 11 14

390 b 18 33 16 2b 28

BATIrdt 500 57 75 89 lb 6b 13
(*552

1

550 15 40 58 11 23 30
600 3 19 33 50 52 57

BTR ISO 43 54 6? 1 2b 5
(*3711 360 15 .12 41 4 9 1.1

J90 3 15.
.
24 » 23 26

BriLTekccm 260 13 20 29 2 4 9
4*268

1

280 .3 9 16 14 18 19
300 1 4 9 33 36 37

Cadbury Sea 310 24 19 49 1 7 B
(353) 360 6 18 30 14 17 70

390 lb 8 lb 38 40 43

bAinesi 420 <6 64 74 lb 5 10
P463) 460 14 37 SO 9 19 22

500 4 18 30 38 40 44

GEC 770 _ 28 35 5 7
(*239

)

240 - 16 23 — 12 L5
260 “ 6 11 a 27

Huboo 160 34 60 b 1 _
(*1931 in i14b 19 27b 1 3b 5b

200 2b 7b 14 8b 12 14

LASM0 441 30 55 70 8 16 Z)
M67) 479 9 32 47 2b 35 42

527 2 “ “ 68 “ "

P. 0.0. 650 30 67 77 S 17 23
P6731 700 6 35 48 35 42 45

750 2 17 28 80 80 80

PllktajS* Ml 14 3 31 2 12 13
P250> 260 4b U a lb 23 24

280 l 6 13 « 39 38

Plessqr 240 2b 33 38 lb «b 5b
(*263) 268 U 17 2b 6 9b 10

280 3 Bb 12b 19 21 22

Prudential 160 19 25 30 1 3 5

1*177) 180 3b 9b 15 7 9 13
200 2 4 6b 2S 26 27

Ratal 390 so 63 80 1 7 11
(*438

)

470 23 39 59 5 IS 21
460 4 a 36 27 31 39

B.T.2. 460 72 88 1 4 _

«27» 500 33 57 72 4 12 16
550 6 3 39 26 32 38

Option Bey Asj Hm RUy Aog Hw

Scat. A Hew

raw)
Taco
1*173)

Opttaa

> 280
300

140

160
180

24

11

34

14

2

May

34
22

40

21
10

Sep

42 3
30 10

42 1
26 1
13 a

Dec May

9
20

1

3
10

5a

12
24

3
5
13

Ok

Vaal Reefs 70 12 15 IB it 2b 4
(179) « 4 6b 9 2b 5 Bb
(MU Jaa Sea Dec Joi Sep Ok

Anstraf 120 8 13 ia 9 12 13
[*U6> 130 4 9 13 16 IB 19

140 2 6 9 25 26 26

Barclays 390 72 84 - 1 2
1*452

)

420 44 57 66 2 » 9
460 15 28 38 16 23 24

Btae Drde 500 « 66 78 b 14 18
(*536 > 550 18 36 JH 23 38 40

600 5 16 2U /a 70 72

Brilia Gas 160 24 27 29 1 3 3b
C1£U 1 ISO 76 10b U <b 9Ub

200 1 Jb / 20 24 25

Dliora uo 21 26 _ 3 6 _
F145) 14Q W 19 25 6b 10 13

160 6 U 16 18 22 24

Glaxo 1300 120 172 190 14 30 38
(*1379) 1350 S3 13/ 15/ 2B 40 57

1400 52 10; 127 50 60 75

Hawker Sled. bOO UO 12S 135 4 12 15
(*704) 650 65 Hf 100 12 23 30

700 27 60 72 32 45 52

Hillsdovn 240 32 40 - 1 3 _
(*2ta> 260 15 26 33 6 9 10

280 5 15 21 18 20 21

Loariai 257 30 40 52 5b 11 15
(*279

)

283 14 2b A 16 23 26

309 5b 14 23 16 42 45

Mldl.ind Bk 129 18 25 35 S 14 16
(*332) 357 6 12 - Z7 30

Hftayce IM 35 42 43 1 2 4
(*192) 180 17 2/ 29 2b 6 8b

2S0 5b 13 18 12b 13b 17

Stan 170 7 1214b 4b 6b 8
(*1241 130 3 710b 11 12b 13b

140 lb - - 20 - -

THF 280 23 33 41 4b 8b 10
rwi 300 10b 20b 29 13 U> IB

Tknru EMI 600 102 103 _ 1 S _
1*688) 650 55 63 78 7 15 20

700 20 30 47 27 39 44

T5B 100 12 14 17 Z 3 4
(*1081 no 5 / 11 4b 6b 7b

Wellcome 420 68 85 97 2 7 U
M781 460 37 bb 68 U IB 21

500 13 33 46 33

FT-SE DfOEXt* 21161

37 40

Air te .Jaa Jal Apt "47 Jts Jd

ISO 270 «K3 305 _ b 2 3b
1900 220 214 257 270 b 5 8
1950 170 IBB 210 225 b 5 8 14
2000 120 140 167 182 b 9 16 22
2050 70 % m 142 b 15 74 32
2100 20 W t» 107 b 31 40 4R
2150 b 3b bb 11 31 57 63 73
2200 b 17 V HI 93 95 UO
Aeni 28 Total Cataracts 31,636

Ceil! 24 010 Puts 7.626

FT-SE lodti CMs 7695 PnU 2936
’‘Underiitog start) orice.

sf -i
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Aar
AMU
AMR Cum
ASA
flvxconi

Abbott Lab
AcnwCImtad
AMbeRs
advanced Micro ........

Aetna Life

Atfil PubJ

Aimuman (H FJ ...

Air Prod & Cbrm
Aidfrto-Caleer

|

Amman's
Alcan Aluntlaipn
AJcoSuxJjn)
Aieusan&AI
We»
Allegheny Ini)

Aiieghe^ Prow
Ali« Signal

Aluminum Co of Am ..

Anux
AmtUMCcrp ... ....

Amerada Hess

Am Bonus ...

Am Cyanaintd . .......

Am Eiett Pouter

Am Express

Am Family
Am Cm Coo ..

Am Greetings
Am Homo Prod .....

Am livl Group ....
Am Medical mil _....
Am National mux. ...

Am PiWuu
am Sum ........ ...

4n> T * T _
Amonreti
Ames Of* Stores . .

Amctck Ik
Amoco Coo
AMP
Analog Dmto ..

.

Aitteuser-Bosdi

Aon Com .....
AooiioCoinp
Aooie Compilers
AretorDunieH
ArruecnOwm ........

Avila

Armtt
Armstrong World . ...

Asanx
Ashland Oil

Atlantic mdi
Auto Data Pro ..

.

Avjntf*
Avery Intrnutionji ....

A.ort
Awn PrOO

BalmcoCam-..-. -
Baker Huqbei
Ball Com .

Bally

ba't Gas S Elec. ....

Banc One. . .
ESaodaq .

BaitkAmma
bonk o! Bolton .

Bjf* « n Ena ....

Bank of NwVdric .
Bofllrry Tit N V. ...

BarcJars ADR
Bameti Bksinc
Barry Wnght
Basle
BjhiUi & Lon* Inc

Baxter inti

Becum DKklmon ._
Bell Atlantic

Bell In6ctr«
BeHsotitn

Beneficial Corp ..

Beta let* oi Sled ....

BtuLiDi
Black & Decker ..

Block H&R
Blount B
Boeing
BoiseCascade ......

Bona ini Goto

Borneo
Bwaterloc - -
Briggs Stratton ...

Bristol Myers
British Airways ....

BP
Belt. SUH ADR ....

BnL Telecom
Broad me
Broon Forman B
Brcnm Group ...

Brown & Sham
Brown Feeris

Brunswick ___
Burlington Nrtto ....

uss

w«
26%

=*
... 141»

=8

CBI Industries

CBS
CMS Energy

CNA Financial ... ...

CPC International —
CSX
Canot

Cadnetu
Cameron Iron

Campbell Souo
Can Pxiftc
CaoDuesABC
Capital Hldos.

Carlisle COS. Inc.

Carolina FWr
CaromterTedi
Carter Ha*1n
Castle & Cooke ....

Caterpillar

Crnlel . . .

Certertor Energy .. ..

Ce«ei
Central IS W
Dump Home Build .,

Champ Inti ..........

Charter Co .

Dose Manhattan ...

OemicaiBiig.com.

.

Chevron
Chrysw
Chubb
Cigna

Cincinnati Mil
Pt'coro
Citliens&Sum. ...
Clarl Emi>pmmt

.

Cine Clllls Inc

Coroi
CiusLri Coro ......

fflf.i CdU
Coca ColaEnt!
Colgate Palm
Columbia Gas . .

Crmtust n£ng ...

CcnnvM ih Ee
Comm Satellite

Comp-ig Computer

.

tWP Sucre* . .

C-euraa

Cemltfun
Cc+tFicrtit
C'nkitGas

. .

Com P.iptv

Co*-. Rj'i

Co"' : tank Com .

Cam ; (ag
C.-n Tri ciro
CrtiT.,, d.iij

Zj.'.f vu.
COCVS AONri
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K Mart

.

|
DSC Conans

Daisy Systems
Damon
Sana ....

Dayton Hudson

Deem
i
DdmarvaPwr&L ..

Delta Air

Brener _
Di*e Pnnr -

Dm & Bradstreet

Da Pom
Dnguesne UgRt

EG&G
E-System
EasternGas&F
Eastman Kodak .....

Eaton
EdUWlnc.

;

Emerson Elea
Emturt
Engenurd Corp

Enron Com ~
EnsertJI

EUiyl

!

Exxon-—.

FMC
FPL
Fedders

Federal Express

Federal Mogul
Fed Nat Mart
Fed Paper Brd
Fie Merest (Torn
Hitmans FdCp
First BA Systems

,
First Chkaqn

1 Flrtl Eiecntlre

First Fid Bancorp _.

Flnt Interstate

Firm UisstetaH ...
FlniPm
First Linton

First Wachovia

FUbadl
Fleetwood Em —....

Florida Progress

Floor

Food Lion Ik A
Ford Motor ...

!

Foster wterier
Freeport McMoran—

.

1 GATX
GEICOCnrp
GTE Coro
Gallagher (AJJ
Garnett

Gap Inc. Dei

Gcroorp
Gen Am Invest

Gen Cinema
Gen Dynamics
Gen drone
Gen Instruments ...
Gen Mills

G«Motors.
Gen Nutrition

Gen Pub Utilities _
GaiMmnraHEr...
Gen Signal

Gmrmetn
Gcnrad.

1

Golden West
.

Goodrich (B.FJ __
GoodyevTlre
GracelW. &RJ „

! GratogerfW.WJ

|

GtAUPacTea
Gt Ntbn Nekoosa ._.

Gt West Financial.
Grryinml
Grow Group .m,.
Gmornun—__
Gulf & Western
Gulf States Utl™
Hall IF®
Halllbatun

: HamatMAJCO
Harconrt Brace ......

Hambdifegre— _.

HarrisCap
Ham

I Hartman

.

Hasbro
Hecla Mining
HdretUUl
HdmeridcAP
Heraifes.

Nersiwy Foods
Hewlett PW.
HHtM Hauls
Hitachi

r Com

HwsneUGwl
Household Im
Houston teds

Humana ...

IP TimberLud
ITT

Ideal Bask brt

Illinois Power
Ml inois Tool
ID ADR
hnpCemAacr —

,

INCO
mjjenoii Rand .....

Inland Steel

unrl

Interm
muivaphCom ...

hnrrfjke

IBM
bill Flavours

Iml Income Pro....

(ml Min & Orm .

Inti Mull IfOQdS.. .
Mil Pwer
InurnuOlic

IntcrTAN

DOW JONES

-it

-h

3

uss

LSI Logie
LTV Coro

Leggett 4 Platt

LrucadlaNatl

UliylEllI

Limited toe.

Un Broadcasting

Unco In Nat Corp..-
UtUnMs
UaOabteme ...

—

Lockheed

Loewi Com
LoneSor
Lon Star Tech

Long Island U0d—
Longs Drag Sirs

Loral Coip

Lows Dev. Com
Lou Islam Land
LnuMara Pad lie

Lime's
UArixm .

Mack Tracts

ManorCn
Uarfc. Hanover—
Maiwilte

Mapra
Marion lahs

.

Marriott _...

Manh Mariana ..

Martin Marietta

MmeoCorp. —
Mass HnKJ Corp—
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WORLD STOCK MARKETS

Giants and dwarves people the obscure realm of emerging markets
W HICH of the world's

stock markets has
the largest number of

listed companies after- the US?
Japan, perhaps? Or the United
Kingdom?
The answer is India, which

boasts a staggering 6,000
domestic companies on its 14
stock exchanges - not far
short of the 6,680 quoted in the
US, and way ahead of the UK’s
2,054 and Japan’s L571.

This Is jnst one of the many
illuminating details to be
gleaned from the Emerging
Stock Markets Factbook, pub-
listed this week by the Inter-
national Finance Corporation
- a veritable guide to every-
thing you wanted to know
about obscure stock exchanges
but were afraid to ask.

It paints a picture of
extremes, since developing
markets are apt to grow rap-
idly from a very small base.
Share prices In the Philippines,
for example, have climbed by.
1,488 per cent in the past four
years, while the market capi-
talisation of Portugal has shot
up by 9,725 per cent.
The 30 countries on which

the 1FC has collected data
include both giants and
dwarves. Taiwan's market cap-
italisation of $l20bn at the end
of last year put it in a league

with Italy, the Netherlands,
Sweden and South Africa. At
the other end of the scale,
Kenya's capitalisation stands
at just *34ra.

Taiwan also occupies the top
of the tree in valuation terms,
with a ptice/eamings ratio of
40-2 — 15 times that of Turkey
which notes a multiple of only
2.6.

FSst-growing Indonesia, with
a gross domestic product in
1987 of $69bn. has only 24 listed
companies - fewer than tiny
Trinidad and Tobago, with a
GDP of $4bn and 33 quoted
companies. India’s 6,000 stocks
sound Impressive, yet fewer
than l per cent of them are
valued at more than $5Qm -
the IFC’s classification of a
large company.
Price performances were out-

standing last year In some of
the Latin American and Asian
markets, but the tone was
rather weak in southern
Europe and Africa.
The exception was Zim-

babwe, which reached new
highs; the market bad plum-
meted in 1981, a year after
independence, hitting a low in
1984, but shares have since
risen by 632 per cent
Last year’s laurels go to Bra-

zil, which soared 131 per cent
in dollar terms, and to

Developing
exchanges show
a wealth of
unexpected
extremes, as

highlighted
by a new study.

Alison Maitland
delves into it

runners-up South Korea, up
116 per cent and Mexico, 108
per cent higher. Just behind
came Taiwan, which would
have improved on its 99 per
cent rise if an unfortunate blip

in the- autumn had not wiped
nearly 40 per cent off the
index. Thailand, arrived in fifth

place with a 43 per cent rise.

If performances so far this
year are anything to go by,
1989 will prove even more phe-
nomenal, at least as far as Bra-
zil and Taiwan are concerned.
The IFC index for Brazil has
jumped 105 per cent already
this year while Taiwan is up
by more than 60 per cent

Performance in 1989*

Brazil

Chile

Mexico

Argentina

Taiwan

Malaysia

Thailand

Korea

* to April 21 cateubtoc! in US$

- -''-am*

Sowob : IFC Emwflkig Mmfcol* Data Bass

Can such a hot pace be main-
tained? The experts are cau-
tious about Brazil and Taiwan,
partly because they have risen
so fast and they tend to be
mare bullish about Mexico, up
17 per cent this year, Thailand,
up 15 per cent and Korea, just
1-5 per cent higher.

Brazil has been enjoying a
honeymoon with domestic
investors, especially pension
funds, who have been attracted
back into the equity market by
a reduction in interest rates.

Initial scepticism about the
Government’s anti-inflation
Summer Plan, announced in
January, appears to have given

way to growing optimism
about the country’s economic
prospects. Inflation is down to
6 to 7 per cent a month from
nearly 30 per cent before the
plan, although it has crept up
from February’s 3.6 per cent
There is also a view that presi-

dential elections at the end of
the year may bring greater sta-

bility, although the ruling
party has yet to name its can-
didate.

Local enthusiasm does not
appear to he shared by foreign
investors, which is partly why
the Brazil Fund was trading at

a 39 per cent discount to net
asset value at the end of 1988.

Mr Tony Ewell of Corporate
Broking Services, specialists in
emerging markets in Europe
and Latin America, recom-
mends at least some profit-tak-

ing. “Nothing goes straight up
and, if it does, it's going to

come straight down. This sort

of market action is frighten-

ing ... a correction is over-

due."
It might seem ironic that last

year's poorest performers like

Jordan, Venezuela and Portu-

gal offer relatively free entry to

foreign investors, while access

to winners like Brazil and
Taiwan is permitted only
through special funds. More-
over, three companies in Brazil

- Petrobras, Paranapanema
and Vale Do Rio Doce —
account for some 40 per cent of

the local Index and each for-

eign fund is restricted to 10 per
cent of their shares.

Mexico is more open, but for-

eigners are limited to one class

of shares and to 40 per cent
ownership of most stocks.
Wider access is expected soon,

and "once that happens the
market is going to go like a
rocket,” says Mr EwelL
Shares have been driven up

this year by local enthusiasm
for the new administration and
its stand on debt reduction.

Flight capital, estimated at

$50bn, has been making its

way back to Mexico - at the
start of the year it was return-

ing at a rate of S500m a week
- as the peso regains status.

In Asia, Taiwan's helter-skel-

ter pace has made it the fifth

most active market in the
world after West Germany and
the second most highly valued
after Japan. The market con-
tinues to surge thanks to pow-
erful economic growth, a sea of
liquidity from the huge trade
surplus with the OS, and a
shortage of alternative invest-
ments.

S
uch spectacular achieve-
ments. however, induce
caution among foreigners.

Liquidity could shrink as the
US economy slows, and there
is concern about market regu-
lation, although the authorities
are taking steps to halt mal-
practices.
Few foreigners hold more

than 5 per cent of an Asian
fund in Taiwan, according to

Mr Richard Katz of Baring
Securities.

Greater interest focuses on
Korea and Thailand. The Bang-
kok market has just taken off

again as domestic confidence
in the economic and corporate
outlook grows. Foreigners,
held back from buying more

blue chips by ownership limits,

are now starting to look at
second-liners. Mr Katz sees the
market index rising a further

20 per cent this year.

The South Korean market
has been dampened by labour
unrest, high wage demands
and the Government's issuance
of monetary stabilisation

bonds to banks to mop up
liquidity.

But overseas enthusiasm for
the country's solid long-term
growth prospects has fuelled

huge premiums to net asset
value in the prices of Korean
country funds. The market is a
favourite with Mr Robert Simp-
son of James Capel who sees
the index climbing from about
935 to 1,200 by the year end.
Stock supply is a problem,

though it should be helped by
the partial dotation of Korea
Electric Power Corporation in

the next couple of months -
and by a curious development
reported by James CapeL The
snakebreeding industry in
South Korea Is booming, with
5m snakes a year produced to

be used in soups, as pets and
for warding off evil spirits. Sev-
eral snake companies plan
stock market listings.

Who knows? Perhaps they
will help push Korea to the top
of the ladder.

AMERICA

Firm bonds help Dow stay steady
Wan Street

THE US equity market spent a
quiet day yesterday, struggling
to defend marin during

Thursday’s sharp advance,
writes Janes Buchan m New
York.
With the help of a stronger

bond market, stocks were little

affected by a mild bout of prof-
it-taking that carried over from
Thursday afternoon. By 2 pm
the Dow Jones Industrial Aver-
age of blue chip stocks was
down 4.77 at 2.414J22 on modest
volume of about 99m shares.
The day started on an up-

beat with a strong rise in the
bond market in response to a
further set of weak economic
indicators. The Commerce
Department's leading economic
indicators fell by 0.7 per cent

in March. The fell. which was

EUROPE

steeper than Wall Street's fore-

cast of 0.5 per cent, kindled
new hopes that inflation is on
the way down and caused
interest rates to drop. The
benchmark Treasury 30-year
bond rose as much as V4 per-
centage point, though it fell

back later amid scepticism
about the value of the report
By midsession, the long bond

was up just point to yield 8-9

per cent
Stocks generally tracked the

bond market with profit-tak-

ing driving the Dow down as
much as 8 points in the middle
of the morning before it recov-
ered. Among blue chip stocks,

IBM was down $!$ at 9114%,
Boeing up 9% at 975%, USX
9'A lower at 934% and Ford f%
higher at $47%.
The most active stock was

Armco, the steel group, which
rose to $11% on volume of

L7m shares. United Technolo-
gies, a strong performer in
Thursday's rally, fell back 9%
to $51%. Union Pacific, which
rose sharply on the announce-
ment of a restructuring on
Thursday, fell 9% to $70% yes-

terday morning;
Aetna Life & Casualty,

which announced an increase
in earnings for the first quar-
ter, rose 9% to $52%. Earnings
per share rose to SL52, against
91.15 in the first quarter of
1988. The insurance sector has
been heavily in demand on
Wall Street this year in the
belief that current competitive
conditions may improve.

Cineplex Odeou, the movie
theatre group, gained 9% to
914% amid growing specula-
tion of a battle for control. A
group led by Mr Garth Drabin-
sky, chairman, said it was con-
sidering buying all 'file shares

in Cineplex that it did not yet
own. At present MCA, the
West Coast entertainment
group, owns a big block of vot-
ing stock.

Tambrands rose $1% to
$64%, also in response to take-
over speculation. USA Today
reported that a corporate
raider it did not name had
built a stake in the company
and believed it might, be worth
S85 to $100 a share in a take-
over.

Canada

MODERATE trading left
Toronto modestly higher. Bank
stocks continued strong but
golds were lower as bullion
fen.

The composite index rose 12
to 3,607.9. Advances edged
declines by 259 to 24L Volume
was 19m shares.

Copenhagen climbs past 300 level

ASIA PACIFIC

Nikkei peaks again on prices data
Tokyo

THE ANNOUNCEMENT of a
lower-than-expected rise in
Tokyo's consumer price index
removed concerns of an immi-
nent increase in the official

discount rate and led to
renewed buying, which poshed
shares to yet another record
high, writes Michiyo Nakamoto
in Tokyo.
The Nikkei average rose to a

day’s peak of 33,737.67 and
dipped to a low of 33,552.12
before finishing with a gain of

212.52 at 33,713.35, the third
consecutive High this week.
Advances led declines by 585

to 328 while 172 issues were
unchanged. Turnover at L19bn
shares was a slight improve-
ment over the L12bn traded on
Thursday. The Topix index of
all listed shares finned 17.02 to

2.4S&52 and in London the ISE/
Nikkei index rose 5.49 to
1364.09.
Tokyo’s consumer price

index for April rose 2.6 per

cent, which was well within
expectations and was seen as
unlikely to trigger an immedi-
ate rise in the official discount
rate.

It had widely been feared
that a rise of over 3 per cent in
April - after a new consump-
tion tax was introduced -
would lead to a rise in the dis-

count rate, now at a historic

low. Many analysts, however,
think a rise is possible in May
because of strong economic
growth and the impact of the
spring labour offensive, as well
as the new consumption tax.

The market was said to have
already discounted a moderate
rate rise.

Buying by index-linked
investment trust funds meant
gains were seen in sectors rep-

resented in the Nikkei average.
Interest also focused on issues

that have dropped considerably
from their peak. Many of these
were property and electric
power companies. Mitsubishi
Estate, for example, rose Y70 to

Y2.550 and Mitsui Real Estate

added Y60 to Y2.550.

Precision stocks were also
selected as laggards with good
earnings prospects. Canon,
with a price earnings ratio of

41 - below the first section

average - added Y40 to 71,610.

Nikon rose Y50 to Y1.520.
Large-capital steels, widely

expected to lead the market
after the Golden Week holi-

days, were mixed in heavy
trading. The top six active
issues were steels, with Sumi-
tomo Steel leading on 84.2m
shares followed by Nippon
Steel with 62.4m shares.

Special situation stocks sup-
ported a 120.23 point rise in the

OSE average to 32,579.49. Vol-

ume rose to 105m shares from
79m on Thursday. Kansai Elec-

tric Power added Y160 to

Y4^00.

Roundup
OPTIMISM over gains in lead-
ing world markets sparked
buying in the Asia Pacific
region, where share prices

ended higher.

AUSTRALIA had a busy ses-

sion, as Wall Street's strength
inspired demand, especially for

leading industrial stocks. The
All Ordinaries index rose 20.3

to 1,500.7, with both foreign
and domestic investors
actively buying.

SINGAPORE also took its

cue from the US and Tokyo,
climbing to a post-crash high
in moderate trading, albeit
somewhat subdued by the
advance of the long weekend.
The Straits Times industrial

index climbed 6.24 to L259.41
and turnover fell to 84.4m
shares from 93.4m.
HONG KONG rebounded

after felling sharply on Thurs-
day, as worries over student
unrest in Peking eased. The
Hang Seng index rose 38.77 to

3,116.03, a gain of 1.3 per cent.

MANILA broke through the

1.000 level on the composite
index on active domestic and
foreign buying of commercial
and mining stocks. The index
reached 1,002.35, up 22.67.

DANISH stocks readied new
highs In otherwise fairly quiet
pre-holiday trading 4n.Euxope^
writesOur Markets Staff.-

COPENHAGEN ted a spar-

kling session, with foreign and
domestic Investors stepping up
their buying to send the stock
exchange ladex above 300 to an
all-time high. It closed up 3.42

at 90328 In active turnover.
Good company results, a pos-

sibility of tax reform leading to

substantially lower corporate
taxes, and stable long-term
Interest rates Inspired buying
by Institutions, said Mr Kim
Brangstrup at Brencor Securi-

ties In Copenhagen.
Sophus Bcrcodsen continued

its rally, rising DKrffl), or 4.7

per cent, to DKrl.330, while
Bang & Olufsen, the video/au-

dlo group, climbed DKrl3, or
3.4 per cent, to DKr390.
PARIS perked up on news of

a much better than expected
trade deficit figure for March,
at FFr263m. But volumes
remained low - estimated at
Thursday's FFrl.Bba level -

and share prices slipped off

their opening highs.
Pockets of news lifted indi-

vidual stocks; Club Med
jumped to a day's high of
FFr600. but fell bads to end up
FFrl at FFr576. bn news of Its

llnk-np with Nouvellcs Fron-
tteras, the cut price tour opera-

tor. Electronique Serge Das-
sault Jumped FFr23.40 to
FFr520 oat its JTFrlbn .contract

from the- Belgian airforce.

The opening CAC General
index was up 10.6, or 12 per
cent, at FFr468.4 and by the
dose the CAC 40 index was
6.98 higher at 1,680.85 and the
OMF 50 index up 2.10 at 47A74.
FRANKFURT barely moved

again but trading remained
moderately active. The FAZ
eased 0.51 to 575.99 and the
DAX rose 1.33 to 1,370.90 in vol-

ume worth DM3.93bn.
Positive factors in the form

of Wall Street's buoyancy and
the abolition of the unpopular
withholding tax appeared to be
offset by concern about rising

domestic inflation and the flag-

ging fortunes of the centre-

right coalition.

Pharmaceutical stock Sober-
ing featured, tiring DM13.50 to

DM638 on its strong first quar-

ter results earlier this week
and positive sales forecasts.

Bayeravereinsbank was the
most active stock, felling DM2
to DM401 after saying it was
dissatisfied with first quarter

results and rising costs were a
problem. Other financials were
mixed, with Deutsche Bank up
DM450 at DM554 but insurer

Allianz falling DM21 to
DM1,780.

Steel and engineering stock

Hoesch rose DM2.30 to
DM247.30 after raising its divi-

dend-fmm DMSJa DMa. .....
ZURICH- was buoyed by the

positive corporate results
scene, rising by about 0.6 per
cent, with banks boosted by
government plans to abolish
the stamp tax on foreign bond
transactions. The Credit Suisse
index rose 3.4 to 578.L

In chemicals, Sandaz bearers

rose SFr225 to SFrll.325, in

response to news on Thursday
of its higher first quarter sales.

AMSTERDAM ended firmer,

with internationals dominating
the news and the CBS ten-
dency index adding 0.4 to 1842.

The collapse of Unilever's
negotiations to take over
Faberge and Elizabeth Arden
sent the stock down FI L50 to

FI 135.50, while Philips was
down 80 cents at FI 37.50 on
disappointment over its modest
rise in first quarter profits.

Chemical Akzo rose a fur-

ther FI 1.70 to FI 153 after its

figures on Thursday, and DSM
was helped along, rising FI 280
to FI 126.10.

In constructions, Volker
Stevin was off 50 cents at FI
68.50 after news that HBG had
acquired just over 50 per cent
MADRID was cheered by

Wall Street’s strength on
Thursday, proving resistant to

higher domestic interest rates.

with the general index rising
089 to 29729.
MILAN, edged up. in quiet

pre-holiday trading, with the
Comit index rising 1.47 to
613.00. Olivetti, reporting a 11.4

per cent fell in consolidated
net profit, lost L2Q to L9245.
Textile stocks remained

buoyant, with SIM gaining
L390, or 6 per cent, to L6840
and Marzotto up L79 at L7.930.

STOCKHOLM was largely
unchanged in slow trading and
the Affarsvslrlden index fell 0.1

to 1135.4. Ericsson free Bs rose
SKrl to SKr245 after the com-
pany won a SKr47om order to

supply radar equipment for a
new Before missile system.
OSLO closed mixed, with

Wall Street adding a firmer
tone. The all-share index rose
L29 to 476.63 in moderate trad-

ing.

BRUSSELS ended mainly
firm in fair volume. Petrofina
starred, making up Thursday's
losses and ending BFr225 up at
BFrl3£50. Holding companies
Electrafina and Coxnetra were
suspended before a proposed
merger.

SOUTH AFRICA

QUIET trading before the long
weekend left Johannesburg
slightly tower. Golds fell, with
Driefontein off Rl at R39.50.
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pure* In paranii

ow nvmtwr <jt stocks
n grouping

us
Dollar
tod**

Australis (88)
Austria (19)
BflQjUin t63)..TrtrtlW-nilM.»i

Canada (127)....- — ..

Danmark (3S)
Finland 126) ;

France (130)„
West Germany (100).......

Hong Kona (49).

irwanc (if), — ...

Uriy {K8
Japan
Malaysia 130).

Mexico (13)...,..;...,...pi'nirf

Nethsrland (42)
New Zealand (24). ......... ..

Nwuwy (26)
Singapors —
South Africa
Spain (42) — .

Sweden (39). .

—

Switzerland [57).iMlrtimiff

united Kingdom (316)

—

USA (660) ..

133.50
12037
133,35
135.16
17028
154.06
119.99
86j88
129.78
149.65
ai.74
186.99
177.07
179.7U
121.70
7037
188.42
153JS
144.07
153.69
159.38
76.01

148.32
125.91

Day1*
Change
%

Pound
Starling
Index

Local
Currency
Indm

Day’s change
% local

.

currency

Oran
Olv.

Ytaid

US
Dollar
Indsx

Pound
Starling
Index

Local
Currency

Inttox

tees
Wgh

19SS
Law

Year
aBO

(approx)

+ 0.8 117.05 111.48 +0.5 5*1 132.47 118.32 110.93 157.12 128.28 121.77

+ 0.9 108.17 120.25 + 0.9 2.14 122.24 10723 119.21 124.16 92.84 91.80

-as 118.92 129.73 ’ -0.3 4119 133.75 117.44 130.12 137.10 128.52 126.11

+0.0 118.50 116.81 + 03 3M 135.16 11067 116.46 137.27 124.67 123.53

+ 0.7 156.31 178.89 +05 1.38 177.05 155.46 175.98 180.38 1SS.35 120.32

+ 0.6 135.07 135.34 +02 1*4 153.20 134.51 134.65 159.16 125.81 127.94

+ 17 10620 119.47 +02 3.02 119.15 104.62 118.83 122.79 112 57 90.19

+ 0.2 76.18 84.76 +0.1 2.30 86.73 76.15 84.70 90.40 81.77 77.28
— 1.2 113.78 129.64 -1.1 4*a 131.29 11028 131.11 133.77 111.80 102.38

+ 1.0 131.47 143.27 + 0.8 3*8 148.44 130.34 147.09 151.36 125.00 122.72
-0.5 7167 83.88 -07 2.50 82.11 7Z10 84.44 8a.B8 78.16 75.73

+ 0JS 165.69 157.87 +0.S 0.48 187.97 165.04 157.07 203.11 180.30 174.80

-0.9 155.2S 183.51 -04 2.61 178.06 15035 184.23 178.18 143J35 130.59

+ 0.2 157.56 476.95 +02 1.08 179.39 157.51 474.84 175.70 15322 130.62

+ 1.0 108.70 117.54 +0.8 4.38 12053 105,83 116.57 122.22 110.63 109.69

+05 61.70 6078 +06 6.48 70.00 61.46 60.41 76.02 66At 77.19

-222 165.20 174.10 -22 1*4 19256 199.08 177.99 198-39 139.92 132.23

+02 134.17 137.55
-

+0.5 2.00 152.85 134.04 13089 155-96 124.57 111.21

+ 1.1 12032 129.34 +0.9 3*2 142,51 125.13 12820 144.86 115.35 127.05

+02 134.75 13046 +0.2 058 153.34 134.64 13522 156.17 143.14 151.32

-0.1 139.72 160.16 -02 229 159.49 140.04 150.63 162.00 138.45 122.82

+0.5 06.64 78.15 + 0.6 225 75.81 6039 77.71 79.76 74.05 80.32

+ 1.1 190.04 13004 + 1.0 4.36 146.68 128.79 128.79 153.33 134,53 140.16

+0.8 11U39 125.91 +0.8 3.53 124.91 109.87 124.91 125.91 112.13 106.92

Europe (1008).. - 12066
Nordic (125) 155.13
Pacfflc Banin (879)....; 184.27
Euro -Pacific (1687V...... 1S8A5-
North America 1*87)....,.,. 126.37
Europe Ek. UK (693).....,, 103.44
Pacific Ex. Japan (224).„ 127.84
world Efc US (18871 167.89
World Ex. UK 146.10
Work! EX. 3ft Af. {2367). 145.36
World Ex. Japan (1992)... 134.S3

The World Index (2447)... US.37

Copyright. The Financial Times Limited. Goldman, Saehe & Co., and County Natwest Securities Limited. 1987

Laimi cricea were unavailable tor ttV* edition.
.

... . ....

ConaUtaumt cfaeags: April 28: name change: Schweizerfeche Kredlianstait to CS Hldgs.(Switzerland).

+ 0.7 105.79 112.37 +05 056 119.86 105-24 111.76 121.70 114.Q2 109.73

+0.0 hth 151.99 4-0.1 1.99 155.08 136.17 152.19 15S.61 13705 114.16

+ 0.S 161,56 154.58 +0.5 0.70 183.33 180.98 153.86 154.72 176.37 169.86

+ 0.6 139.23 137.72 +0.5 1.58 157.97 138.70 137.05 16422 15283 145.82

+0.8 110.79 123.35 +08 032 125.42 110.13 124.39 126.37 112.79 107.71

+0.3 90.69 101.44 +0.2 2.91 103.12 90.54 101.24 10029 98.84 90.88

+ 0.0 112.09 113.34 -0.1 «8 127.62 112-23 113.44 137.65 123.46 iio^e
+0.5 138.43 137.08 -+0.5 1.66 157.03 137.88 136.41 162.77 15204 144.65

+ QJ5 127.22 133.58 . +0.5 2.03 144.27 126.67 132.85 146.04 133.06 12901

+ 0.6 127 47 13027 +0.8 223 144.48 126.86 132.49 146.65 133.82 130.19

+07 109.10 120.57 +07 067 12388 108.59 119.79 124.63 114.51 108.75

+ 0.6 127.49 133.23 +0.6 124 144.47 'lS6J» 132.46 146.51 138.83 130.18

Consolidated Gold Fields plc

LINE
For an important new message to all

Consolidated Gold Fields shareholders
TELEPHONE

0800 444
(ATNO CHARGE TO TOU)

Telephone-free of charge-on 0800 444 998

to receive your Board’s further statement

in relation to the takeover bid by Minorco.

Tto Dincloca af CaBaoifeUMd Cold flBldi PLC lamer Iben Ml J- Ogata* Ttrapjma end J. N Office) no mo pcr*0*a mrpon^ble for fbo inl«ri«*ee confused m Urn edaertMjacm.
1b Hh bnScdtx haomhdtf end Maf of nub Dueewtt rf Cold Flddt i»A* beve ultea ,0 wMflmhln cut le ewure uw nebu lb* e*»> it* itloBBtnm etutubwd a Hum

dnttliefuud u la untdun mb iba {ktu .nd doe» «w uyitong likely lo ellwd ibe ImpMTolmeb udonrumxn. Tbr Directors of Concolkluod Gold rie^U PLC (.oitej >»«
GolIrM Tbcopioa end U; Chute) accept UMpcmnloilttT ectjEdingJy



I

Corporation and County

Stocks No. of bargains included 2

London County2',% Cons Stk I320lor
atto/l - £25 (25Ap69)

Great tn London Council 6!^^ Stk 90/92 -
rsz *;

Bcmingium Corps's Stk 1947(pr after] -

120 (2SA089]

3 (1903) i932(or alter) - £20 |2SAp«|
3",% Stk i»46(or after) - £25 (2IAp89)

Brmnqnjm Dtsmct Count* 1 1 '<i% Red
SK 2012 - £107'i (28Ap691

Bristol Carp Deb Stk 13”.%) - £20
(2IAp89)

Leeds Carp3“. Deb Stk 1927(«r after) -

£25 (2TA0B91
Moncnostor Corp 1691 3% Red Stk

19s Hot after) - £28 (21ApS9)
a% Cons Irrd Sw - £31 (25Ac89)

Newc3Sde-Upon-Tyra(Cily of) 1 J Red
Stk 2017 - £1059Stk 2017 - £1059

Norwncn Corp3“o Red Stk - £25 (21Ap69)
Nottingham Corp3% Stk [IrnJJ - £2d

(2lAp69)
Reackng Corp3% Stk 1962(or after) - £25

(2<Ap89)
3 Stk 1978(or after) - £28 (21ApS9)

Sunderland CorplRrver Wear Coirnnj3'«

Funded Debt Anns - £24 (26Ap89)
<: »•« Funded Debt Anns - £40
|28Ap89)

UK Public Boards
No. ol BOrggnc octudod2

Agricultural Mortgage Corp PLC5ft% Deb
Stk 9495 - £81
6'i*» Dob SUt 9294 - E80ft (21Ap89)
6%'* Deb Stk 85J90 - £92 'i t26Ap89)
10‘;% Deb Stk 92/95 - £98 (21Ap89)

Metropolitan Water MetrapoUi an Water 3%
A Stk 63/2003 - £49 (24ApS9J

Port of London Authority3% Port d
London A Stk 29/99 - £53 pJApSS)
8V,*. Rag Stk 87190 - £95

Foreign Stocks, Bonds,

etc-{coupons payable in

London) No. of bargains Inducted 5

Greece .(kingdom of)4'j. Rentes i889(As3d
with Accept cert] - £32 <25Ap89]

Abbey National Butting Society 1 1%% Nta

1995 (Br£1 000.1000061 00000) - £98-
(2SAp89)

Bank or Montreal Realty fnclO%% Nta
1992 - SC68S®

Barclays Bank PLC10L% Senior Suborxl

Bds 1997 - £93'.i l2SAp89)
Bakins B.V. Zebras 22/t/9fl(Bf £10000) -

£49 (21 Apes)
Canter Parcs UK PLC5ft%
GtdCnvSubBdS l988due1998(Bc£5000)
- £101

Commonwrraltn Bonk of Australia 9'',% Na
1992 (BrSC5000) - SC95". (21Ap89)

OenmarklKingdom Of) 1 1 »% Bd» 1994 -
£99:.®

General Motors Acceptance Corp7V,%
Nts 29/ST89(8r ECU 10006 10000) -

ECM'l (21Ap89)
General Motors Accept Corp Canada

1051% Nts 15712.92 (BrSCI 00081 0000)
- SC97S (21Ap89)
10M% Nts 30/8/93 (BrSCI 00065000) -
SC98' i (21Ap69)

Granada Group PLC11K% Bds 2019
(Br£1 00006 100000) - £98® ft®

Halifax Buttling SoootyRlg Rare Ln Nts
1992(Br£SOOO) - £100.02 (24Ap89>
Rtg Rate Ln Nts 1996 (Br£SOOO&SOOOO)
- £100.06 (26Ap69)

Hydro-Quebec
1l%ObsSerHC9®99
- SCI 00.6 C28Ap89)

ItatytRapubOc of)9%% Nta 1999 - $98%
(26AP89I

Land Securities PLC9ft% Bds 2007 -
£85% (24Ap83)

Leads Permanent ButtSng Society Rtg
Rata Nts 1996 (BrCl 000061 00000) -

£100 (2SAp89)
Nen PLCB%% Cn* Bds 2002 - £105*

91. (25Ap89)
Nomura international Finance PLC7%%
GW Suberd Bds 1992 - £92*

Pearson PLC Zero Cpn Bds
t992(8r£l 00065000) - E6S% K
(24Ap88)

Ranks Hons McOeugaS PLC4!i% Cnv
BOS 2003 (Br£5000)- £111 (24Ap89)

Royal Bank of Scotland PLC 10*.

%

Subord Bds 1998 (Br£S000625000) -

£94* (2TAp89)
Royal Trasfco Ld9%% Debs 1992

(BrSCI 000610000) - SC95 -

; (21Ap89)
Samsbury (J) (Capital) Ld5% Cnv Cap Bds

2004 {Br£Sl - £101 '.® 2® '.®
Smith 6 Naphow Assodaiod Cm PLC

5' Cnv Bds 2000 -5145 (26ApB9)

SwedenKingdom oI)8%% Bds 1990 -

S38', (21Ap89)
Trafalgar House PLCiO%% Bds 2006 -

£32% (25AP89I
Wcstpac Tmemauonqi Rnanca BV1 1% Gid

Bos 1990 - S99*« (21Ap89)

Sterling Issues by Overseas

Borrowers
No ol hargara mc<uded47

Aaun Patetopmeni Bank 10 -* Ln Stk
?009|Rcg) - £100'.

Austra/iaiCommcnwnaiUi on9',“. Ln Sik
20i?iRort1 - CM I’. l20ApA9l
9'.". Ln Stl. 2012(00 - £90'. (25Ap89|
li-.-.Ln On. 2015tRiw)l -£107‘,

Bank of Greece 10'-’. Ln Sn> SOlOiRog) -
SM

Cfiissn Conti oto De Coooorallon Econ
»£•.% Gra Ln Sik 20t3iRegl - £1160
•v s r 7

Cksso NaiiiTnaln Don Autoroums i
6*« Gid

Ln Fix 2906 - CIS-'.
CJ-3M T^ndC1 ' Do Franco

10 '.%OdSoiLnSlkJOt 1. 12. 13.1 -UReg)
- r'r’j** ‘

»

fO'. ' v£idVW>r LnSIkCO 1 1 . 12. 13. 1 4(Br) -
t*SS‘. iMtayiffiH

1C*.", Gid UI Sik 2007(Rogl - IIM
Denmark ihmgdcun of) 13*. Ln Stk 2005 -

£1)5'. \
Dacmc ro do Franco 12’.*, Gtd Ln Sik

rCWkKnc-.l . £119 . -
u’.". G;d 5er Ln Stk 2009 truing] -

EliO > l*. i:i»3K-l
Curcman Inmi'tmont B.tnk 9% Ln Stk

2001 iG-EMOTi - tea-. (2iAp90|
9\\ III Stt row - £95
10’.'. Ln Saw 20O4tnegl - £99*. V. ;

»»*. Ln 54h 20G?(Kn<ii -1103%
nnurkSRrril.Nl: .?ft I frl Ln Sik
rWkRrg) - HOT
1 1V- Ln s-.k JOOSiBi£50001 - £109"-
(TSkc^ei

MyCrp-Curbnc 12 79% Ln Sik 2015 -

£i*.6‘.

ItoanartcpuC's; cr)14’,*. Ln SK 2016 -
£121 i75Ap£T.H

tncu Ld 16*.% Unp Ln Slfc 2006 S Rap Opt
-£123®

tmnr-Amciic.m D-irtioprncnl Bank 9'.*,

Ln Stk 20«* - EM*. 4 l25ApS9l
fenwmiKinai Bank tar fl« A Dov9't®. LD

Sik roiaRngi - £94'. (20Ap83l
11 i". Ln Eik 2003 -£107'. *i

treiana 12' Ln ilk OOCOiRnU - £1 13’i
Nr* CnaUrvll:.". Stk 2C0P(Ang) -CIOS

If-"- S* £|X6/Br ES0C01 - rioc:.
PSABiO)
if .% stk :oi4irboi - dot*'. irsApflfl)

Neva SeoM/Prek .nan of) 1 1 Ln stk
2019 - £108 '. '« 12540891

FV»h.-ga;.Rce oD9% Ln Stk 2016(Reg) -
ES4*. *i

Proiio20 da Ooooac 12*% Ln Sik 2020 -
£113'. l25AEi8>>l

S&wiihmsoon c« 1 1 Ln Sik
rOlttRcg) - CUT? (26Ac«)

Swodenihmgdom of)9*.% Ln SK
20144ROCI . £i)3'. (24*009)
9‘."o Ln SK 20l4jBr) - £93 V, gSAp89)
ti% Ln Sik MiCiBo - £104\®11% Ln Sik 20i£iB» - £104 4.®
13.5% Ln SK MlfflRoij) - Cl£4*i
OTApfiR

Ln/Wd Maxlcan Staiea 16*5% Ln Stk
2008fRog) - Cl 14 iKApflei

Banks and Discount

Companies
No of bargain! mdudodi|)4l

AneSachotlHrnrylHIdgs PlC9% Cnv
Subeia Ln Sik 1996 - £85

Aurtmlo £ Now Zealand Bontur^ GpNaw
SA1lS0% FdiKug 50% OiV TIB SIWW
- 125 6 126AP89)

Bank ai WUn PLC l3'-.% Subord Una Ui
Stk 9597 - £109

EarcUis PLCADfl |4 1) - SSO 248992®
Barciora Bank PlC7'V% Unj Cap Ln SK
8691 - £89(26Ap89)
8%% Uns Cop Ln Sik 8693 - £87 6
I2°b Una Cap Ln Stk 20 Ti) - £108*..
16% Uns Cap Ln Stk 200207 - £1M'.;
S (26Ap89)

Borings PLC6% Cim 2nd Prf £1 - 9t

Commercial Bank of Near East PLC
SSfRsg) - £3.8 4 (2lAp69)

Hambros PLCNon Vtg £1 -56®
7.5% Cum Cnv Rad Prf £1 - 99 100

Lombard Nor® Central PLC5% Cum 2nd
Prt ci -50®

Mtdand Bank PLC7V,% Subord Una Ln
Stk 83/93 - £85 (2SAp89)
tO\% Subord Una Ln Stk 93/98 - £98

9100
14% Subord Una Ln SK 2002107 -
£118%

ADR (3:1) -E1B.D5OS30J7®
7% Cum Prf El - 87 8V,

9% Subord Uns Ln Stk 1993 - £91%
12%% Subord Una Ln SK 2004 - £110

Royal Bank of Scotland Group PLC 11%
Cum Pit £1 - 109 |24Ap89l

Schroaera PLC6k% Uns Ln SK 97r2002
- £8J".

Standard Chartered PLC12%% Subord
Uns Ln SK 2002/07 - £106*

TSB Group PLC10N% Subord Ln SK
2008 - £967,

TSB HU Samuel Bank Hofdlng Co PLC8%
Una Ln SK 89 <94 - £85® 7®

Warburg (S.G.) Group PLC7%% Cum Prf

£1 -85 67, (26ApS9)

Wimnisi PLC10VK, Cum Prf £1 - 115

(21Ao83)

Breweries and Distilleries
No. of bargains included 807

AKed-Lvons PLC5V* Cum Prf £1 -54*
(24Ap89)
7J,% Cum Prt £t - 70 (21Ap89)
6’.% Red Deb Stk 84189 - £96
tiv.% Red Deb SK 87/92 - £86 V,

7*.% Red Deb SK aani3 - £87
(2SA089)
11*% Deb SK 2009 - EliO* 14

(25Ap89)
7*% Una Ln SK S3/98 - £82

Bass PLC4% Cum Prt El - 30 8 (25Ap89)
7% Cum Prt £1 - 80 8 (2SAp89)
3'.% Deb SK 87/92 - £84 |21Ap89)
8'.% Deb Stk 87/92 - E92S C25Ap891

10*% Dab SK 2016 (Fp/AL-26/5/HS) -
£100". 126Ap8B)
7*% Uns Ln SK 92W - £83'6®

Baas invoafmenta PLC6% Uns Ln Stk

65/90 - £91-'. |26Ap89)
7%% Uns Ln SK 92/97 - £82* 3
(28Ap89)

Boddribton Group PLC9/,% Cnv Urn Ln
Stk 2000/05 - £172

BuknarfH.P.)Hldgs PLC 854% 2nd Cum Prf

£1 - ICQ®
FuBer.Smtih 6 Tumor PLC8% 2nd Cum

Prf £1 - 103 4* (21Ap89)
GraeiuM Whitley PLC"A" Ord 5p - 3)5®
8% Cum Prt £1 - 99 100 <24Ap89)

7M% Deb SK 87/92 - £89 (25Ap89)
10% Deb SK 2014 - £95%. (26Ap89)

Guinness PLCADfl (5:1) - S39.8J®
Hardys 6 Hansons PLC Ord 25p - 965 85
Mansfield Brewery PLC Ord £l - 480

iZSApBS)
Scottish 6 Newcastle Breweries PLC7%

Cnv Cum Prt £1 - 136K 7 8 8 9 40
7.1% 1st Mtg Deb SK 85/90 - £93
(25Ap89)

Seagram DtsWera PLC 12K% Dab SK
2012 -£113%®

Vaux Group PLC4%% A Cura Prt £1 - 43
(2>ApB9)
754% Dab SK 87/92 - £89
9.876% Deb SK 2015 - £92 (2SAp89)

Watney.Mann 6 Truman HJdga PLC6%
Red Deb SK 8944 - £81 (2BAp89)

7Si% Red Dab SK 87/92 -£85
10V,% Rad Deb SK 90/95 - £98®

Whttbread 6 Co PLCB Ord 26p - £1 1-3

(24Ap89)
6% 3rd Cun Prf SK £1 - 58 (25Ap89)
7% 3rd Cum Prf SK £1 - 69 (24Ap89)
4*'j% Red Deb SK 994004 - £82
(21 Ap89)
6»% Red Deb SK 88/91 - £897,
7i(% Red Deb SK 89/94 - £894
9L% Red Den SK 91/96 - E93H
(21Ap89)
7ik% Uns Ln SK 88/91 -£90BSAp88)
7'*% UhS Ui SK 95/99 - £80®
10'*% Una Ln SK 200045 - £97%

Young & Co s Brewery PLC4.2% Cun Prf

SK - 80 (25Ap69)

Registered Housing

Associations
Na ol bargains mduled2

North Housing Association Ld8K% GW Ln
SK 2037 - £80.08
Zero Cpn Ln SK 2019 - «2S

Commercial, Industrial, etc
No. ol bargains included 16468

A.C.Houmgs PLCll%Cnv UnsLnSK
94/98 - £1 10 (28Ap89)

ADT LdADR 110:1) - $27J® .925® 854®
*7.® 225®

AMEC PLC 15% Uns Ui SK 1992 - £104
Albion PLC Oid 20p - 85 90
Abright 6 Wilson LdB% Dob SK 87/92 -

£90(21Ap89)
Alcan Aluminium LdCom Shs of Npv -

£18", (25Ap89)
Alevon Group PLC82SP (Net) Cnv Cun
Red Prt lOp - 99 101

Abed Ttwine Companies PLC 10% Cnv
Subord Uns Ln Sik 1993 - £315

Ord Sp - 135 (26Ap89)
AMOdahM BrWoh Foods PLC7W% uns

Ln SK 87/2002 50p - 38 <26Apfi9)

Aasoaatod Fioharkw PLC8u% Uns Ln SK
91/96 - £87 (21Ap89)

AKins BnM(Hosiory)PLC5W% Cum Prf £1
- 50f2lAp89)

Aitwoods PLCADfl (5.1) - $32.3 (21Ap89)
Altwoeds (Fmanca) NVB' .p Gtd Red Cnv

Prt Sp - 126 7 8
Ausun Road Group PLC Ord 25p - 380
Autcmsiled SocuhlvrHWosI PLC5% Cnv
Cum Red Prt £1 - 108 (24Ap89)
6'*o Cnv Cum Red Prt £1 - 121 V,

A.rtal PLC lO i". uns Ln SK 96/98 - £90
(2IAP81)

Avosco FLCCum Pig Cnv Rod Prf 1997 Ip
- ii3(Z6Ap09)

Ayrsiuro Moral Products PLC Ord 2Sp -
273

B .VT Industries PLC ADR (1 1) -
S3.20 750 249602®

B A.T Inveifmcraa PLC 10% Uns Ln SK
90.95 - OB' i

T0'.*» Uns Ln SK 90.95 - CS6% 7 B'A
(26Ap89l

BET PLC5". Perp Deb SK - £45
B/CC PLC5*,“, 2nd Cum Prf SK El - 54

<2tAF09l
7*. DcS S'k 85/90 - £92
r=. J. Dub 31k 90 95 - £06

SM Ooup PLC 4 Bp (Nell Cnv Cum Rod
Prf Z0p - 116 (25Ap89l

BOG Group PLC 12';% Uns Ln SK
2012/17 - £t 10*. % (26Ap69)

B S G Intar national PLC 12:,'. Uns Ln SK
3J/M - £98 100 |21ApeS)

BSR Internahdnal PLC S"i% Uns Ln SK
85 90 - £86 I21AP89)

BTP PLC7.5plNelJ Cnv Cum Red Prt 10p
- 107 9

Pardon Group PLC So (Hot) Cnv Cum Red
Prt lOp - 1 09 (21 Ap89l

Bnrdsoy PLC Warrants to *ub for Ord - 23
(26AOJ3)

Beauford PLC To (Net) Cum Cnv Red Prf

10p - 712 (25Ap&9)
8o.i:er PLCB 67% Cum Rod Prf £i - 98

B",% Cnv Uns Ln SK 2000 - £145 %
Bollway PLC 9 5% Cum Red Prt 2014 £1

(Fp/LA-4'5/89) -98(2lAp89)
Btrmio Ouaicjit PLC7W% Uns Ln SK

87:92 - £35
Blackwood Hodge PLC4.7% Cum Prf £1 -

60 IZ6AP09)
Una Ln SK PWO - C90

Bhw Arrow PLCADR (10:1) - 9)5.624479
7 6.124463

Quo Cirac Industries PLC5';% 2nd Deb
Sik 1984/2009 - EGO (ZSApOS)
6L% Una Ln SK(1B75 Of Oft) - £55
(24Apfl9J

Bhindeil-PemtoglaM HWgs PLC7%% Uns
Ln SK 90-95 - £80 (3«p89)

Boob Co PLC7h% uns Ln SK 89-33 -
£07'..®

Bowaier induMm PLC 4.35% Cum Prf £1
- GO (£SAp89)

Branhwane PLCCnv Prt 50p - 75 flv.

Burnt CtwmicaiB intomjticral PLC9%
Cum Red Prt El - 1CB » (2SAofi9)

Budon PLC6% Cum Prf SOp -28
I25AP89)
8-v Deb SK 88/33 - £88®
10'.% Deb SK 81/M - £96 (21Ap89)

Brtttah Airways PlCaDR (10:11 - $33 !i H
Bnbsh Alcan Aluminium PLC1W*% Deb
SK 201 1 - £94 P.

Bribcn-Amaron Tobacco Co Ld5% Cum
Prf Stk £1 - SO!,®
6% 2nd Cum Prt SK £1 - SB

Bnnan Homo Stores PLCSWa Mlg Dob
5K 89-94 - £79 l24Ap8S)
6' ,"» Wig Dob Sik 89«4 - £81

British Shoe Corp HUgs PlCB’.’,% Cum
Prt £i -62
6",% Cum Ord Prf £1 - 50 (SflApB3)
7% Uns Ln Sik 85/90 - £90

Brtish Steal PLCADR (10:1) (Ptfy Pd) -

"J; -

; 1*^ i’.-'-f4

FINANCIAL TIMES SATURDAY APRIL 29 1989

LONDON STOCK EXCHANGES Dealings

Details of business done shown below have been taken with
consent from last Thursday's Slock Exchange Official Ust and should
not be reproduced without permission.

Details relate to those securities not included in the FT Share
Information Services.

Unless otherwise indicated prices are In pence. The prices are
those at which the business was done In the 24 hours up to 5 pm on
Thursday and settled through the Stock Exchange Talisman system,
they are not in order ol execution but in ascending order which denotes
the day’s highest and lowest dealings.

For those securities in which no business was recorded in Thurs-
day's Otlicia! List the latest recorded business In the tour previous
days Is given with the relevant date.

Rule 535(2) and Third Market stocks are not regulated by the
International Stock Exchange of the United Kingdom and the Republic
of Ireland Ltd.

r Bargains at special prices. 0 Bargains done the previous day.

S14265 S3 2B51 .3J .31587 JS2 .33

BrfMI) Sunpr PLC10V* Red Dab SK
2013 -£101* * %2013 -£101* * *

Brawn a Jackson PLC10.75% Cnv Cum
Prf El -112®
NSW 10.75% Cnv Cum Prt £1 - 100

ButaryAj/j a Co PLCOra sk 5p - ns
Bunzl PLC7% Cnv Uno Ln SK 8S/97 -

£93
Bumdene Imraatmanta PLC15% Uns Ln
SK 2007/12 - £110 (24ApS9)

BUrton Group PLC8% Uns Ln SK 98/2003
- £79 60 (21ApB9)
9W% una Ln SK 98/2003 - £85
6% Cnv Uria Ln SK 1996/2001 -£967
78ft 9

C.HJndusrtttt PLC9%% Cum Rod Prt £1

7% Cm/ Cum Prt El -230(2SApB8)
CMS Packaging SJLFFlfi -63
Now FF1S (3/4 1989 Dlv Rag) - 57 57
57* 57* 58 68* 59 80

Cadbury Schweppes PLC8L% 1st Mtg

Dab SK 94/2004 - £92 <21Ap89)

9% 1st Mtg Dab SK 88/93 - £92®

Cakebread.Robey A Co PLC Oral lOp -
163 (£1 Ap88)
8K% Una Ln SK 93/98 - E7B(21ApS9)

Canadian Ows Pack bidustr LdCom Npv
- 385 (34Ap89)

CamngfW.) PIC7K% Uns Ln Stk 38/83 -

£80 (26Ap86)
Carcto Engineering Group PLC10*% Cum

Red Prf £1 - 105 (26Ap89)

Cemrewav Trust PLC11% Cum Prt £t -
100 (21 Ap89)

Channel Tunnel investments PLCSp - 162
Chamngtora Induatrtaf Hidga Ld10*%

Una Ln SK B3/98 - £94 (24Ap69)
Oyda Blowers PLCOrd Sp - 370

(?4Ap89)
Corns Pawns PLC4*% Una Ln SK

2002437 - £48 50 » (2SAp89)
6%% Uns Ln SK 2002/07 - £88%
(25Ap89)
7*% Uns Lit SK 90/95 - £84 (2SAp69)

Coats Vlyafla PLC45% Cum Prf £1 - 82
ConenfAJ & Co PLC Non.V -A" OnJ 20p -
950

Cookson Group PLC7% ptd Ord SOp - 32
(24Ap89)

Cooper (Frederick) PLC6Sp (Net) Cnv Rad
Cum Ptg Prt 10p - 99 100 (26Ap89)

CourtaukJS PLCADR (1:1) - *5-41

6% Cum Rad 2nd Prt £1 - 60®
7*% Dab SK 88/94 - £87* (2SAp89)
5ft% Uns Ln SK 94/96 - £73
6S% Uns Ln SK 94/96 - £76 8
7 *% Uns Ln SK 94/98 - £81
lVk Uns Ln Stk 2000/05 - £79*
(26Ap89)

Cowan.de Groot PLC10K% Cum Prf £1 -
110 (25Ap88)

Crystslan HUgs PLC8!4% Cnv Uns Ln
SK 2008 - £90 (24Ap89)

Cullen's Hidgs PLCWarrenta to sub for

Ord - 8 {24Ap89)

0RG PLC7U% Uns Ln SK 88/91 - £80
(26Ap89)

Dnkjety PLC4.8fi% Cum Prf £1 - 60 5 72
(24Ap6B)

Davies 8 Motcatfa PLC'ATNorLVJOrd IQp
- 177®

Debanhams PLC6ft% Uns Ln SK 86«1 -
£88* *
7*% Uns Ln SK 2002/07 - E73
<28ApB8)
7V% Uns Ln SK 20Q2/07 -E768
(24Ap89)

ana PLC7*% Deb SK 88/90 - £82
(25ApB9)
10%% Dab SK 95/99 - £97*

Dencora PLC62S% Cum Cnv Rad Prf £1
- 158 (2BAp89)

Dewturst PLC Ord lOp - 60 (28Ap89)
Dickie (James) PLCOrd 2Sp - ISO 1

Doctus PLC Warrants to sub for Ord - 8ft
(28Ap89|

Domnon Infamailonnl Group PLC
Warrants n sub lor Ord - OX (24Ap69)

Dowty Group PLC7% Cnv Cum Redm
£1 - 124* 5867

Dwyer PLC 7.25% Cnv Cum Rad Prf £1(NI
Pd-16/5/89] -2

Eastern Prodiice(Hkiga) PLC10*% Una
Ln SK 92/97 - £89 (2SAp8^

EOotqB.) PLC7% Cmr Cun Rod Prf £1 -
107 (24Ap89)

BIS & Everard PLC7%% Dab Sue 67/92 -
£57 (2SAp89)

Bewick PLC8%CnvCum Red Prf 92S4
El -295 (2SAp69)

EngBsb Electric Co L47% Deb SK 88/9t -
£S7(24Ap88)

Eurotunnel PLC/EurottmM SALfnfta

(Slcovem Inscribed) - E&425 6445
8.455 (24Ap89)
Warrants (Sfcovam fcaqfbod) - QL685
OMOMoV)

Evered Holdings PLC355% Cum Prf £1 -
52 (24Ap89)

FU Group PLC7.7%Cnv Cum Rod Prt
95/99 £1 -105®

FWay(James)PLCtt2% Cum 1st Prf SK £1
-58(24Ap89)

Rsbet(Albert)Group PLCADR (10:1) -
*16.17 (25Ap89)

Ftoons PLCADR (4a) - *KL4 *
5*% Uns Ln SK 2004/09 - £68

Fobel Imamatfcmal PLC8% UnaLnSK
88/93 - £78 (24Ap89)

Fphos Group PLCCW Sp -57

B

Fortnum & Mason PLCOrd SK El - £41
(2SAp6S)

Foseeo PLCOrd 2Sp(Rfd-l/l/89) - £2.78
4*% dm Prf £1 - 83ft®
10% Cnv Uns Ln SK 90/95 - £135
(Z5Ap89)

Friendly Hoctta PLC4X% CAvCum Rod
Prt £1 - 103
6% Cnv Cum Rad Prf £1 - 177
7% Cnv Cun Rad Prf £1 - 113ft

GO International PLC 10% Uns Ln SK
87/92 - E91 (26Ap69)

GKN (United Kingdom) PLC 10ft% Gtd
D0D SK 90/95 - £98 ft (2SAp89)

General Bectric Co PLCADR (1:1) - 54.05
-07 .07 .075 .09 .1

7K% Uns Ln SK 87/92 -£85 (28Ap89)

Gestetner Hidgs PLC10% Cnv Uns Ln SK
90/95 - £140 (3«Ap89)

Glaxo Group Ld6ft% Uns Ln SK 85<95

50p - 38 (24Ap89)
7%% Una Ln SK 85^5 sop -41ft 2ft

Glynaved International PLC 7ft% Dab SK
89/94 - £B4(2SAp89)
10'i’i Uns Ln SK 94/99 - £S8ft

Goodwin PLCOrd 10p - 57
Grand Metropolitan PLC6ft% Cum Prt £1

-60(2SAp89)
5 75% CULS 1989 400p pOOp PBy
PdHReg) - 359 60 3 5 6 8 9

Great Universal Stores PLC5%% Rad Una
Ln SK - £47 (24Ap89)
6ft% Red Una Ln SK - £58 (24Ap89)
B'..% Uns Ln SK KV98 - £80 (25ApS9)

Harma PLC 11% Cum Prt £1 -117
Hansons S CrosfieW PLC6ft% Cum Prt

£1 -63p4Ap89)
Hawker SICCotay Group PLC7X% Deb SK

87-92 - £85
Kggs 5 H« PLC7% Cum Prf £1 - 85

(25Ap89)
hfish Cosiorth Park PLCOrd £1 - £42

I29AP89)
Hdl & Email Wdgs PLC14% 1st Mtg Deb
SK 2000/03 . £108 (2SAp89)

Hodgscn Hckkngs PLC625% (Net) Cnv
Prf Sp -80

Howard & Wyndham PLC 18% Uns Ui SA
7691 - £101 (2lAp89)

Huntorprint Group PLC67i% Onv Cum
Rod Prt £1 - 107 (21Ap89)

Hurting Associated industries PLC 9 ft%
Cnv Uns Ln SK 03/08 - £305 (25Ap89|

LVU PLC 5'*% Uns Ln SK 2001/06 - £57
(21Ap£9)
7'i% Uns Ln Sik 8691 - £90 (2SAp89)
7'.% Uns Ln SK B&93 - £85
e% Uns Ln SK S&IS0 - £93« <2SAp8S)

leaijnd Frozen Poods Hidgs PLC Cnv Cum
Roc Prt 2Cp - 104 5 6 6 7

Impenoz Chemical industries PLC5ft%
Uns Ln Sk 94/2004 - £85
7’;% Uns Ln SK 8691 - ESS 4
8t,% Uns Ln SK 88/93 - £33 4
11%% Uns Ln SK 91/96 - £102

JacksontWritiam) 6 Son PLC 7ft% Cum Prf
£1 - 73 EONS

Johnson A Firm Brown PLC 11.05% Cron
Prt Cl - 117 (26Ap&9)
11% Uns Ln SK 93-96 - £S5ft

Johnson Group Cleaners PLCTJSp (Net)
Cnv Cum Rad Prt 1 0p - 148 8

Johnson.Vorttwy PLC8% Cnv Cum Prf £1
-570
6',% Mtg Deb SK 85/90 - £91®

Jones)A.) & Sana PLC 67,% Cum Prt £1 -
50 l24Ap89)

Jakarta's HOgs PLC7ft% Cnv Una Ln SK
200002 -£S34(26Ap89)

KLP Group PLCCum Cnv Red Prt lOp -
67®

Kingsley & Forester Group PLC3.85%
Cum Prt fi - 50*

LadSrcke Group PLC8% Gtd Uns Ln S*
90/92 - £90

Lairs(Jahn) PLCOrd 'A* Nen VM 2Sp -
349® SO®

Lament Hidga PLC6% Cum Prt 50p - 24
(24Ap6S)

Lapcrra incusmes(HWg5) PLCSK% Deb
Sk sa/93 - ess*
8% Deb SK 93/98 -C83X.
104% Deb SK 94/99 - £94 (25Ap88)

Laauro Inveaanenia PLC7% Cum Cnv
Red Prf (93/98) £l -934

Lewis(Jahn!Partnershlp PLC5% Cum Prf

Stk £1 -47'.;

7ft% Cum Prf SK £1 -70(21Ap89)
user 3 Co PLC5% Prt(Cum)n -503ft

(21 A(58?)
Uoyd(F-H.lHlc-5s PLC7*% Uns Ln SK
8191 -CSSrt

Lomfto puc7v:% in Mtg Deb SK BS.-91 -

£88 l2SAp89)
10 -% 1*1 Mtg Deb SK 97/2002 - £98
(25Ap89)
9% 2nd Mtg Deb SK 87/92 - £88

LoveflfVJ-XHugs) plcbw% Deb Sk
67.-82 - £95 |2)Ap89)

Lerw(Wm) 8 Co PtC6.75% Cum Cnv Rad
Prf £1 - 132 3 4 4

LoweiRoMrf H.) & Cf PLC675% (Net)

Cnv Cum Red Prt 1 0p -97
Lucas industries PLCGft% i« Prt £1 -

47®

10«% Uns Ln SK 92/97 - £96ft
MB Group PLCOrd 25p - 207 7 .2828 ft 8
99

MacantefLondon) Ld7K% Una Ln Sik
8K91 - £85 (25ApB9)

McCarthy & Stone PLCO.73% Cum Red
Prf 2003 El -97ft®
7% Cnv UnsLnSK 9904 -£146

Merits & Spencer PLCADR flfci) -Jifift

(21Ap89)
MerehaBs PLC10%Cum Prt et - 100
Mecca Leisure Group PLC7.2Sp (Net) Cnv
Cum Red Prt 20p - 94KKSS»e

MKheUn Tyre PLC9H% Deb SK 92/97 -
£30ii CSAp83)

Mitel CorporBOanCom Shs of NPV -1SS

8% Una Ln SK 88/93 -£80(24Ap89)
Scott & Robertson PLC7»% Cum Cnv
Red Prf £1 — 140 (2BAp89)

Scott's Restaurant PLCOrd IZftp - £10*
Sears PLC7% -A" C»*n Prf £1 -70

(21 Ap8S)
12ft% Cura Prf £1 -TQ9(Z4Ap88)
7.4% Uns Ln SK 82/97 - £81

Sms Engineering Hidgs PLC8% Cun Prf

Servomex PLCNew Ord 5p
(Fp/LA-2B/5/89) - 138 K77H8Bft9
9

Skflaw Group PLC7ft% Uns Lit SK
2003/06 - £63

Skim Engineering PLC9K% Deb SK
B2&7 - £91 ft (21Ap89)

Skidal (Wliam) PLC 5-625% Cnv Cum Red
Prt £1 - 119 20 (2SAp89)

BOO Group PLC315% Cum Prt £1 -44
(2lAp69)

Smith & Nephew PLC5ft% Cum Prt £1 -
53ft (SMAp/39)

Smith (W.H.) Group PLCB- Ord lOp -
57ft 9 (2SAp89)
B% Red Deb SK 87/92 - £81 *
«21Ap89)
7K% Red Uns Ui SK BS«3 - £88
(21Ap89)

Smurffl(Jefferson)Group PLC 1 0ft% Una
Ln SK 75/95 - E96 (26Ap88)
9«% Cnv Una Ln Nta - £161 ft®

Spong Hidgs PLCCnv Cum Red Prt 20p -
67 (26Ap89)
7% Cnv Cum Red Prt £1 -B0

Squ&b CorpCom SK 51 - *75* <2SAp89)
Siaveley Kdustries PLC7ft% Una Ln

Stktaa/91) - £89 (24Ap09)
7ft% Una Ln SK 88/93 - £86 (26Ap8S)

Stead & Simpson PLCOrd 25p - £14 ft

17.1

Stoddard Sekers international PLC4%
Cum Prt El -46(21Ap89)

Smneriffl wags PLC 10ft% Cum Prtn -
95 l2SAp8§)

Storehouse PLC9% Cm Una Ln SK 1992
-£112 4

Summer mtamadoriaf PLC 7.5% (Net) Cnv
Cum Red Prt £1 - 105 (2BApS9)

Sutcflffa.Spaafcman PLC Warrants to sub
lor Ora -MC2SAP88)
9K% Red Cum Prf £1 - 100 2

SwanUohn) & Sons PLCOrd 2Sp - 587
SwirefJohnj 6 Sons 106.3% Cum Prf El -
734

Symonds Engineering PLCOrd 5p -40
TAN PLC8% Mtg Deb SK 87/92 - £90

(25APB9)
10.1% Mtg Deb SK 9CV95 - £91

(26AP89)
Tarmac PLC7ft% Deb SK 92/97 - £82
Tate & Lyle PLC7ft% Uns Ln SK 85/90 -

£88 (2SAp89)
Taylor Woodrow PLC9K% IstMtgDebSK

201 4(£30Pd-1 5/6/89) - £26% (21Ap80)
TeifM HKigs PLC warrants to sub lor ora

-121
9% Cum Prt £1 -101ft®

TOSCO PLCADR (1:1) - $262 (24ApS9)
4% Urts Deep Doe Ln SK 2006 - £4754

THORN EMI PLC Warrants to «ub (or OnJ
-190

TOngrThomas) PLC8r,% Una Ln SK
89/94 - £85 (2SAp89)

TRaohur Juts Factory PLCOrd SK El -

TootaJ Group PLC9% Cum Pit £1 -46 8
(24Ap89)
4li% Pap Deb SK - £43 (2GAp89)
7'..% Deb SK BS/90 - £91
7*% Uns Ln SK 89/94 -£82

Tovries PLC -ft- NtXLV.Qrd 10p -74
(26Ap8$)
5%-A’CuniPrt50p -M

Trafalgar House plc7% UneDebSKCi
-61 (2SAp89)
0% Uns Ui SK 94/99 - £82 (24Ap88)
9ft% UnsLnSK 2000/05 -£80*2
(25A«8»
10W% UnsLnSK 2001/06 -2Kft 7ft

Transport Devetopmant Crouo PLCgx%
Um Ln SK 950000 - £87«,

Tiunhousa Forte PLCWarrants to Sub for
Ord -88
025% in Mtg Deb SK 85/90 - £89
725% 1st Mtg Deb SK 86/91 - £90*
(2SAp89)
105% Mlg Deb SK 91/96 - £99
9.1% Uns In SK 95/2000 - £88 92M
(2SAp89>

Try Group PLCNew Ord lOp
(Fp/IA- 12/5/89) - 128ft 31 2 S3

Unigato PLC4.7% Cum Prt £1 - 68®
6ft% Uns Ln SK 91 (96 - £75 Q6Ap89)

Unilever PLCADR (4:1) - £64^45
S*% Uns Ln SK 91/2006 - E56
(34Ap89)
8% Uns Ui SK 91/2006 - £79 St 2 V,

Union bitwrarikmel Co PLC6% Qan Prt

SK 71 -70ft (26A069)

7%Cum Prf SKO -70
Union Stool Cocpfot South Afr1ca)LdOttf

R0^0 -72(21Ap89)

Monsanto CoCom SK 82 - $96%

N^CoraCom SK SS - £33.7 (B4Ap6B)

nsm plcs^p (Net) cnv cum Rea Pff top
-116

Nest PLClO%-8“Cum PrT50p -53
(25Ap89)
7% IstMtgDebSK 88/81 -ESOft

NciS^m^nitV PLC8%% Cnv un« Ln SK
99/04 - £112

Norsk Data AS Ctaaa -BTNan vig) NK2D

-

NK45
North MkSand Conabuotron PLCOrd lOp
- 158 65 (28Ap89)

Northern Englneertng Induatriaa PLC9%
Lina Ln SK 80/95 - £88 (2BAp69)

Northern Fooda PLC 7ft% M> SK 86W
- £91 (26Ap89)

Oceonks Group PLC9K% Cum Red Prf

1893 £1 - 90®
Warrants to aub lor Ord - 14

OOvertGaorgeMFootwear) PLCOrd 2Sp -
53O06Ap89)

ParkfMd Group PLCCum Red Prf 201 On3
£1 - 88ft 9 ft ft 90ft (25Ap89)
7% Cum Cnv Red Prf £1 - 385

Psrtoraor Zochontt PLC 10% Cum Prf Cl -
108 7

PavBon Leisure Mdga PLCOrd lOp - 177
786 00520025

Pearson PLC 5.675% Uns Ln SK 88/93 -
£65
fL97S% Uns Ln SK 88493 - £70
13.625% Uns Ln SK 2007 - £118*

Puinamon AGS PLC75pCm Sitoard Ln
Stk 2002 2ftD - 80

ROar BoctricaJ PLC7K% Uns Ln SK
86/91 -£90<26ApB9)

Pltmrd Gamar PLC0H% Cum Prf £7 -
105 (24Ap89)

Plessey Co PLC7ft% Dab SK 92/87 -
£81 2 (28Ap69)

Portals HUg3 PLC9ft% Cm Uns Ln SK
94/2000 - £201

Porter Cbadbum PLCB% Cnv Cum Red
Prf 1993 £1 -145<2lAp89)

POramouthaBundariand NewspapersPLC
105% 2nd Cum Prf £1 - 115 (2<lAp09)

PowoB Duffryn PLC4 iX% Cum Prf SOp -
22®

Presstt; HoMkigs PLC 105% Cum Prf £1
- 100

Queens Moot Houses PLC10X% 1st Mtg
Dab SK 2020 - £94% (26Ap88)

Quicks Group PLC 10% Cum Pit £1 - 110
ipSApUfl)

FL&A.H!dgs plc

W

arrants to sub tor Ord
- 40 (25Ap89)
9% Cum Prt £1 -90(28ApB9)
12% Cm Uns Ln SK 2000 - £85
(28Ap89)

RPH Ld4K% Una Ln SK 200V09 - £30
9% Uns Ln SK 99/2004 - £80

Recat-Chubb Ld8% Uns Ln &K92fl6 -
£86 (26Ap89)
8»% Uns Ln SK 87/92 - £88 (2S4P80)

Racal Beutionlca PLCADR (1:1) - $7-03

Racai Tatecom PLCADR(10:1) -881:845
.79 2 .02 ft ft H V

Ranks Hods McOooga* PLCB% Cum 'AT
Prf £1 - 50 (2&Ap&9)

8% Cum B' Prf £1 -58(24Ap88)
8H% Uns Ln SK 908)4 - £87 (21ApB9)
8*% Una Ln SK 91/95 -£90S

Ratnora Grot*) PLCB2EpCm Cun
Non-Vtg Rad Prt 20p - 88 9

RawScut Mamatkmel PLG8K% Uns Ln
SK 88/93 - E90 (25Ap89)

Reed International PLC4ft% Cum Rad Prf
£1 -40®

Renokl PLC7%% 2nd Deb SK 92/97

-

£79 (28Ap89)
Rexmore PLC i3%(Net)Cnv Cum Rad

Prf(91/92)£1 - 190(25Ap68)
Richards PLC4% Cum PM £1 -38

(28Ap69)
Rlvoa Ctnemas PLCSOp - £37®9®
Rockwara Group PLC7JS%Cm Cum
Red 2nd Prf £1 -94

Rohr industries Inc Star of Com SK $1 -
$325424®

Rotork PLC9ft% Cum Prt £1 -103
Rugby Group PLC8%Una Ln SK 93/98

-

£74 ft (26Ap09)

S3 U Stores PLCWsrrants to sub for Ord
-40(24Ap89)

SD-Sdcon PLC8J% CmCum Red Prf £f
- 131

' " warrants to sob ft* - 17
Sukri 8 SaatcM Co PLCADR (3rf) -

814*
8% Cm Uns Ln SK 2015 - £72 3
(2BAp89)

Snmstxiry(j) PLC7ft% 1st Mtg Dab SK
87/92 - £86

Salmon (Christian) PL£5£% Cum Prt £1
- 77 (26Ap89)

Savoy Hotel PLC8ft« Mtg Osb SK 91/90
- E81 (21Ap89)

8% Dob SK S3/B8 - £84 ft 5
United SdsntfKs HWg# PLCK5%Chv Cum

NOh-Vtg Red Prf £1 -778
Upttn{EJ& Sons PLCOrd 2Sp - 92 2
Vickers RX:s% CumfTBc FreeTo SOpJPrt
SK £1 -65®

VictoriB Carpet HktasPLCOid 25a -178 .

C8Ap88)
WB Industries PLC 11 .3% Cum Prt £1 -

150 (25A089)

WCRS Group PLCSS%Cm Cum Red Prf
1999 lOp - lO0(2lAp6$)

wadangtontWiri) PLC42% Cum Rf £1 -
57 (24Ap89)
5.6% Cum Prf £1 — 73 (24Ap89)

Wagon Industrial Kdgs PLC7JSp(Net)
Cnv Ptg Prf lOp- 117 8

WoKor & Staff Hidga PLCOrd 5p - 204 6
WBjkerCIhomaa) PLC Oral Op - «

(25Ap60)
Warner HoWays U6«% Cun Prf £1 -83

(26Ap89)
Warner-Lambert CoCom 8K *1 - E5DV

(Z8Ap89)
Waterford GtessWtrtd WWgwoad PLC

Units (1 WPG Ord lr£OQ5 & 1 WFW Jnc
-79 ft 80

WatmaughsPOdos) PLC8ft% Cum Red Rf
2006& -94% ft ft 5

FJl C. Paoeo investment TrustPLC
Warrants to stir tor Old -98 (28Ap69)

FWh Throgmorton Co HX7.25%Cm Uns
Ln SK 2003 - £99

flte Scottish American .That PLC119%
Dab SK 2018 - E105K .6K 0MAp09)
New 113% Deb SW 2010 - £103

Msrivale Moore Pl£10H%T« MtQ Dd>

SK 2020 - £B4» (24ApW
Marin IrtMffWlani Prop^MUlAmi
Rad Cnv Rfn - 81 (26AP89)

P & O Property HokSngs Ld8% Uns Ln

Stk 97/89 - £79 . .. ..

Rrat SpanUt bw That PLCWsmslM to
aub f v Ord -29

Rsmtng Far Eastern Imr Trust PLC4H%
CunPrfCI -52(26Ap09)
5% Cum Prf £1 -S7ftff6Ap89)

Ftaming H^> toeomt Irw Trust PLCOld

S^S^CorpPLC9«l5tMto
DebStk 2015 - £87ft (23Ap0O)

«l Mdas PLJC10% ewa PlfMp -33

‘ 0*d 26p (Whh Warrants)

IFpfl-A-19W89) - 107 8 *9
naming MsrcmtHs lew TWtat PLC2J%

. Cum Prt SK £1 - 46ft (34Ap89)
35% Cum Prf SK £1 -54

Fleming Ovwsess tov That PLCSft Cwn
prf B -58ft (24Ap00)

Resign & Col Invest Trust PLC7ft% Deb

Goman Strata- Co* Inv Thm RUC
warrants to stbfar Ord -66

Oicsgow (ncorno Trust PLCWsrrsnB to

sub for Ord -78 C28Ap89)
Gtobe awssansnt.Tmst PLCIIKK Cm

.

Uns Ln SK 90195 - £350 CZIApBB)
Govett AtfanUc Inv That PLCSft% Cum

Prf SK -£8O(21Ap09l
Govetf Oriental tov That PUC5%Cum Prf

5^25% (Net) Cnv Cun Mki-VIb Prf £1 -

105(24Ap89)
9K% lot Mtg Deb Stk 2011 -£91
(2SAp8to

property Security Inv Thai PLC8% Cue
Prf£1.-90 . . •.

Rush ft TompUna Group PLC7J% Cm
Cum Rad Prt £1-

Scottish MetrapoBon Property PLCi0X%
IstMtgDebSK 2018 -£94%

The Third Market Appendix
No. of berg*** 11****”* 14* -

DeuHnornm GradPLCWtt iwita to sub

SfcRsdCimiPrfn -90p8ApM
E^S^wSiratsnPLCOniap-W

.

MMyaOroup PLCOrd -*9

M^reee PLCWtoranta tosub for ad -

50-72^4* 6 _
. Rule 535(2)

‘

No.ofbargatoalncfcidcd47 —

.

Adneme 4 Co PU5-0- Otd El - £19

A/SS®! PLCQld ip-»« 032M
^ug^Sican AfftaHturo PLCOtdasp-

Aston )J£ Fortbrf CM> PLCOd £5(1

j&lSSISS**-*««•

Sneatbank Property TrustPLC9% Cun
Cnv Prf £1 -11B06AP89) _Cm Prf £1 - HBpfiApWf)

Thersto Company PLC2Sp T
Unttad Kingdom Property Co
Urn Li Sk 2000/06 -E7B

Plantations
No. of bargains Included4

Woveriey Cameron PLC7JifHNst) Cm
Cum Rod Prf Sp -99

WosOHrid Group PLCWarrants to sub lor

Ord -66
7ft% Cnv Cum Prf £1 - 170

WTWecrott PLC4-1% Cum Prf £1 - 57

Qovett StraMto im Thist PLC9% Cum
Prt El -Kf2»na^
9%% Dab SK 2017 - £82%

Investors Capital That PLC3K% Cum Prf

SK - £55 (21Ap89|
KMnwort Chert*, Inv Trust PLC4% Cue

Prf SK - £04% (24Ap09)
Klotnwon Onerises Im Trust PLG4% Cum

Prf SK - £86% (24Ap8S)
Lszard Select fmesnaant Thist LdPto Rad

Prf (Lip UK. Actha Fund -tlOJBZ

Wkmay PLC7% Cun Prf £1 -82 (24Ap89)
8.79% Cm Cum Red 2nd Prf 2000 £1 -

Wffiams Hdgs PLC 1 0ft% Cum Prf £1 -
100 (2SAp69)

Wood (Graham) PLCOd 25p - 214 5
(26Ap89)

Xerox CorpCom SW $1 - £37% (25Ap89)
Yorkshire Chemicals PLC5%Cum Prf £1

- 44 (26Ap89)

Angto^astem PftmWKxK PLCWarran
wsubkxOd -sacSApom
12H% Uns Ln SW 95/99 - £84®

Baradn Hd» PLCSp -45 (26Ap8S)
ClttSngtDn Ourpur atton HJWSIHW 1

*ub for Ord -3® (2SAp69)
9K% Cun Red Rf £T -95p8Ap09)
8% Cm Um Lit SK 1999 - £1 12
|2BAp89|

bKh KarmoHi Kafang RUbfaerPLGlOp -

jft^Rubbar PMsMons PLCSW lOp - 60
(2SAp8to

NsTOorougn PtanHona PLCOd itto -98
«20hpa»

Rf 0-1p Japan barisx FUnd -
Wa of bsroaKa btduded2

Financial Trusts, Land, etc
No. of bsrpsms kuftidad484

Aitken Hume tntefimtlontf PLG7%(Nef)
Cm Cum Red Prf £1 - S9C24ApS3)

Armour Trust PLC 1 0ft% Una Ln SK 91/96
- £93

Australan Agricultural Co LdSA (L60 -
3S5(2lApB9)

Authority tovestments PLC9% Cnv Uns Ln
SK 2006/11 -£117

British & Commonwealth Hdgs PLCIOft*
Urts Ln SW 2012 - £84* 4U 5%

CM! Managed PortMo inv CoShs of WV
(Safeguard PortftAt Sha) - 1008
Shs of NPV (Growth Porttoio She) -
BBS
Shs a* NPV (Bitsrprim PortfoBo SIM)

-

Capital Strategy FUtd LdPto Red Prt

S0.01[EmaiglngMktsFisia) - 111%
(2lAp8S)

Cokxmade Davatopmem Capital PLCOtd
£1 -140

Defy Mail & General Trust PLCOrd SOp -

EFT Group PLCWsrrants to sob tor Ord -
15 (25Ap89)

Exploration Co PLCOral SK 6p - 165
(26AP89)

F & C Enterprise Trust PLCWarrants to
sub forCM - 15 (28Ap8B)

First Debenture Ftoance PLCII.128%
SeweraBy Gid Dab SK 2018 - £103%

dnEnlhol Reserve Asset Fimd Ld
PtaRedPrl SODS a COJS5 Bonds) -
E7J1622
PtgftodPrf $005 a GLtopsnam Yen
Bonds) -E5JM911
PtgRedPrf *006 CL N(JapanaM
FTpitthw) - £055357
PtgRedPrf $0J)5 CL OfGiObal EquMsq
- £7.88791

Grawos Fund LdSha $0.01 QDRatO Br) -
*725 (21Ap89)

London a 9t Lawronoe Investment PLC
Oxllio -IUSBaoM

HnnbOtaWM^AMl tncSO.10 -
81X40 ff1Ap«9)

Monks (nvestment Thist PLC11% Dab SK
1

2012 - £102%
Murray tmemolkinal Trust PLC39% Cuos

Prf £1 -63(28Ap8S)
New Throgmorton Thist(1B83j PLCZero
Cpn Deb SK 1998 - £85% (28Ap80}

Northern American Trust PLC3ft% Cum
Prf 8K - £50% (24Ap09)

fttver & MerosntBe That PLCfiK CUR Rf
SW - £50 <24Ap89)

Scottish CMss tov Trust PLCOM SK 25p
-078
5%> Oum Rf SK - £61 (24Ap89)

Bcotttsti Eastern tov Trust PLC4ft% Cure
Prf SK - E47K (24Ap89)
9%% Dab SK 2020 -ESI ft (2SAP09)

Scottish Mortgage $ That PLC6-12%
Stopped tot Oeb Stk 2020 - £105%®

Scottish National Thttt PLC0K Cun Prf
ei -eapHApes)
10% Deb SK 2011 - £S3H (24Ap80)

Second AHara Trmt PLC4ft% Cum Rf
SK - £51% (24Ap89)

Securlltm Thist of Scotland PLC7% Deb
SK 88/93 - £88 (?k

ShirasbivestmantFUtftaraMstosubtar
Ord -64

TTt City of London Than PLC10X% Dab
SK 2020 - £96(21Ap0D)

Throgmorton TVusr PLC12 SH6% Dab SK
2010- £108®

Updown InvBSUnsnt Co PLCOrd 2Sp -

a Lawronoe 8 Ottawa ndraw Co4% S8g
• lit Mtp Bda(Gpn 225) - Cm (21Ap89)

Shipping No. Of Orgetna mctudwiaoo

Bwrgvsan «t-y A8"B* NooVIg 8bs NK5 -

-NK240
NFC PLCVmVIg Old 9p -3401 258% 2

2 3 243 % ft >48844 244 2569 % 5
507

Pantnaulwr * Oriental Steam Nav Oo5%
Cum PM 8K - £50(21Ap8S)
Warrants to purchase Old SW - 160 .

t«**9)

UtmtteS Na of tmgalna Indudad*

ftonon Transport PLCDM IBOp - 510
(2SAp89)

CESC Ld/ft% Cum Prf RulO - 10
(28Ap89)

MeroeyDocks 8 Harbour Co3ft% Rad
Dab SK 79/89 -£93(26ApflW_
B%% Red Dab SK 94197 - £77

ISM. (tab SK 98/90 - £76®
US WESTJncShs Of Com SK of NPV -

£36 (25Ap80)

ExSerSW-COrd 00p -

RriroouOi Hotol PLCOrd £1 t.**.

5 Qenerai «dgs PLCOrd Sp

mmSSnBAkM '“5^p89>

Fredericks Ptaoa fftdga PLCOd 20p -

(LRlSS PLCOrd lOp - fiOJM

Ol^r
(

e$M4tons PLCOrd WQ.02 1/2

-£0A6
Grampian Tftovtdon PLCOtd lOp. - £0.74

Grearctai^Kotats PLCOrd IQp - EK62
(LB3(2SAp8St

Hartley Baird PLCOrd Sp - BUS 055
»5ApB9)

LGJndax LdOrd £1 - 600® •

Ireland YWd s ivautmanw PLCOrd lOp -

J^M^stobu^Onl 25p - £325 3^8
(21Ap89)

Jersey Gas Co Ld3% Cum PrfEI - OL24
Jersey New Wtuwvorks Co Ld3ft% Cisn

2nd Prt 2S -E1.40
2% Cum 4th Prf £5 - £084
10% Mto Dab Bda 89/90 - £97

La Riche's Stores LdOrd £1 - £30
(25Ap8B)

4% 1st Mtg EtaWKReg) - £20 (24Ap68)

London Fiduciary TrustPLCOrd lOp - 19

MlS^Brttarmto treamadoraliLdJspan
Income 6 Growth - 235ft®

Merratt Hidga PLCOrd lOp - £183 125
OSAp69)

North West ExptoraBoo PLCOrd 20p -

£026 0J38(2SAp69)
Other Resources PLCOrd KQ.06 - £044

0.445 045 0455 IC023
Paramount PLCOrd ZSp - B0.KRS 0.175

iiiik’

u>l

ProSfic lift Maittgement(Gkiatnaoy)UK
Com & Bond Fund - £10.11

UK Equfty income Fd -£1024
RMigare Footbal Club PLCOrd £1 -£29
R^yBaotronics Group PLCOtd 5p -

Seymours Ld4% Cura Ptg Prf £1 - E0l48
Southern Newspapers PLCOrd £1 -
EM&®

Sun OR BrfMbi LdOi Royalty SK Units Ip
- £022 (24Ap09) .

Tadpoie Teehnotogy PLCOrd lOp - £1

VtmtafM6acu%0e PLCW
for Old - 110 (24Ap88)

PLCwarrants tost®

Wttan bwestmsnt Co PLC8%.Deb Mt
96/99 -£84ft(24Ap8B)
8%% Osb SK 2010 - E82X 2%

Unit Trusts
No. of bargains tocftrdsdaa

Guinness Right Global Strategy FdPto
Red Prf SI91(Managed Currency Fund)
- £108648 (25ApB8)

Ptg Rad Prf SGOI (Global Equity Raid) -
£33.7456 (2SAp89)
Ptg Rod Prt $081 (European Ftxid) -
$7822® 8227®

HST Samuai(Jeraey)Raad inter Fund Pig
Red Prt ip - 1172

Hoibom Currency Fund LdPig Rad Rf
*0.01 MansgeOStarttw SM) -1304

IBl Global Fwids LdPtg Red Prf

Canadian A Fornign Ml Unit TnnHnooim
Units -220.1

M2 G. American SmaPar Oofe Puod
Accum Unto - 831 ptApttOl

M2 GjGoU 8 Garml Fundtoe Unto -
422(28Ap89)
Accum Units - 40.1 (24ApMQ

M2 Q. Intamatlonal Income RaidInc Unto
-852

Mines - Miscellaneous
No. of bmgatna bKiudedSM

Waterworks
No. 0« hargttns inttodedd

BristotWatanrortraCo-
42%(Ftnty7%Max)Cona Old 8W- £828
82%(FRriy 5%4Con« Prf SK - £050
(2SAp09)
1120% Rod Dab SK 2005/09 - £98
(21Ap09)

Chester waterworks Co&IBKtPmfr
4»%)Prf SK - £100J24Ap89)

East AngMan Water Coi6%(Fn*f
S%)Cons Ord SK - £375 (2SAp80)

9% Had Oab SW 92/94 - £94
East Worcestershire Wotanworks Co

7%(F<ntylO%)MaxOrd £10 - £40$
(KAp89)

•Eaetttoume Watacworke Co10ft% Red ' •

Dfib SK 9527 -£80(2SA
MU Kent HoidtoBS PLCOrd £1 -500 /
,p4Ap89) .

Warrants u aub tor Oral - 100 0SAp89)
North Surrey Watar Co9M% RodOab 9K

94/96 -£95(21Ap09)
South staltordaNra watarvitotto Co .

42%(Fhdy 7%)Ord SK Ctosa B -£87S
(26Ap89)
32%(FWy 5%)0rtl 8W - £878#
'4% Perm Dob SK - £30® \

West KentWMarCot2ft%RedDab8K
Mra6-£1O5(20ApB9)

Co PLCOrd 25p - E2K

TYnmeflantto Hidgs PLCOrd SOp- £32
(2BAp0S)
Pfd Ord SOp - £34 (21Ap69)

WMmhamptan Raceootrse Co PLCOrd
25p — £520125 (2SAp09)

Wynnstav Properties PLC26p — £123 1.4S

Yates Brae Wine Lodges PLCOrd 2Sp -
E2K* .

RULE 535 (4) (a)

Bargains marfcod In sacurltiaa
whara prisdpts marbet is outside
0*o UK and NapuMte of Ireland.
Quotation has not bean granted In

London, and dealing* are not
recorded bi the Official Ust.

Amataantmad Hnandal tov* PLCWtaianta
to aub torSM -5ft (26Ap89)

Artoo Untod PLCCnvRad Prf IQp - 87®

Aetna 78* C29M)
Allam ExptoraUan 5 06/4)
Ama DcpartaMfit Stares S1528754 (21/4)
Angto-Alphs Ord R23.75 (26/«
Aastmarlt ML 5* (24/4)
And. Foundation Inv 60
And. Minina 3*
Bonl Ord 158 - •

BwwfU JntRKH.44029 06/4)
CSpe>taHcOII-44(2b/4)
Churchill Tteswrcc 5* (26/4)-
Ciu Daveiopments SS4.40, 4.40022.
4.44662 ^ . .

Coaex Aim 1# (21/4)
Commit Exp CUst V 550
Cnlzm Heiourcp 21 (26/4) !

Darty.ER50LL<B '
. .

Eastcoort Ord 2-04/4)-' "
Great Victoria CoM 4 Qb/4) .

Haw Par Bros Im Slngapoic tog)S$328535
Hood Cora 529.7525* (26/4)
HfehreM Sa*i & VaHufimn 54.77, 20. 21,
R20

Kalgoarfle Rmourcc 2 (26/®

^^^,%p
y
,0p - 87# USM Appendix

Ptg Red Prt S0.01(Managad SM) - Stowans ^TLdPcd - 33 No. of bargains kwfcxk
£10-33 ru> RanCnweim - 1 iiniH - - IU.

tnchcepe PLC8% Uns Ln Sttt 87/BO -
£95ft (2SAp80)
127,% Uns Ln SK 93/98 -£104
(20Ap89)

bnsmsKtnM City Htdgs PLC8ft% Cnv
Cum Rod Prt £1 - 72 (28Ap88)Cum Red Prt £1 - 72 (28ApeS)

. warrants to sub tor Ond - 170 (eMpU)
Ml Stock Exchange ofUtCMep of IrLd

7ft% Mtg Dab Sik 90/95 -£83 - ...

f2AAp83i
10H% Mtg Dab SK 2018 - £94ft

. (24AP89) _ _ .

Ivory 3 Shne Adas FUndSM of
NPVJUnftod States PorttoBc^ -$2,169
(24Ap89)
SM of NPV(Unftsd Kingdom PertMo) -

102.6
Koraa-Europe Fhnd LdSM SaiO - $48%
SM(IDR to Bl) SaiO (Cpn 2) - SO

MIM Britannia Jersey Gtt Fund LdPtg Rad
Prt ip - 131 9.09 (25Ap89)

Mercury Oftahora Starting TrusrSM of
NPV(Global FinQ - 10S2(25Ap8fl)
Staof NPVOlAmartcan Raid) - 1092
SM of NPV(PWdac Find] - 112ft

Mezzanine CapttaKInc Tat 2001 PLCtoe
SM £1 - 170 1 3 (26Ap88)

Murray ventures PLC 11.1% Dab SK

Da Beers ConaoWatsd Mines LdOM
R0J)5(Br) (Cpn 82) -91626 1826

B Oro MMngAExptorattonCo PLCOtd
IQp - 366 (2Sta89)

Bmps Minerals Group RjCOrd 2p - 114
58 _

lasa^ura-Ciappac Muse LdOrdJSWS21 -

RTZ Corporation PUC3J2S% *A* Cun Prf
. £1 -45 CZSApaa . ..... .

0%% UiwLnSK 88/90 -£90%
WOoughby's Consoddamd PtCPfd Ip -
75

Zamble Cormottlatad Copper lines Ld*B*
Old K10 -11520

BLPGrocp PLCSp (Net)Cnv Cunt Red Prf

lOp - 110 (2tAp89)
Capta ftaup PLCOnf2p - 120 1

3

CftWwon PLC8^%p&tq OnvCwn Had Rf
£1-1587£1 -1587

ConKtsaM MlcrowwvapKWPLCgBto
' Onv CuntJ*ed Rf 2006-£1 -85-

. :CMApB9).. .

Derby Group PLCOrd 6p - 153 5
Dmvey Warren HMgs PLCVar RateCnv
- Itos Ln SW 1995 - £90 •

GUM Mew PLCOrd 25p - 290 (2SAp99)
Great SouBtani Grot*) PLC375p CumOnr

.

Rad Rf 5p - 92 4 4 (25Ap09)

Green (John)* Son PLCOrd lOp -1201
2

Guldahouee &oop PIC
82p(Naf)CnvCuaRadRf2006- 0%
(25ApQ0)'

£>ax Hoktage PLCOrd lOp -178
(MApOO)
New Ord lOp (Fp/LA-8/5/89) — 175®

Kunicfc PLC7p (Nat) Cnv Cum Rad Prf 5p
- 120®

CMS Group PLCOrd 20p - 103
Pont! Group PLCOrd 6p - 102 5
Quarto Group hic&75p(Net)
CnvCumRadShe of Pftt SW CaiO - 180
6{2SAp8»

OuMgotti PLCOrd Sp -67
RandBwarfh Trust PLC7% Cun Cmr Red

Mines - South African
Na of bargakts indudad43

91/96- £96 <25Ap89)
nmc Group PLCWarrenta to sub lor SM

- 95 (25Ap88)
Old Court tinomadonai Reserves LdPto

RedPrfSOONStBfflflgSM) -S24.6SI®
Quadrant IntorconUrwmal Fund LdSM

SO.iO(European Shs) - £1.54
Sha *0.10(Far Eastern SM) -$389®-

RBC Mamadonal Bond Fund LdPig Had
Prt $021 -$1123®

Royal Treat Government Seca Reid LdPtg
Red Rf Ip - 6225

Save A Prosper Gold Retd Ld$021 -
S13.68(25Ap89)

Second Market tnvasanent Co PLCZ%«
Cnv Uns Ln SK 1994 - £58 (21Ap89)

Smith Naw Court PLC12% Subord Uns Ln
SK 2001 - £90% 1ft ft ft <2TAp88)

Stmts Investments PLCWarrants to aub
tor Onf -40®

TR WOridwkla Strategy Fund SJcavShs
NPV (North America FtxxJ) - 11621®
Shs NPV (MWW-Currsncy Bond Fund) -
1082(24Ap89)

Thai Investmant Fund LdPtg Red Pfd
SO21 - $9H

Thailand Mamatfonal Fund LdPtg Shs
$0.01 (Em's to Br) - £112 12 1228
1225 12%

Thompson Ctve tnveetmeras PLCOrd 50p
- f40(24Ap89)

31 PLC7ft% -A* Deb SK 89/92 - S87»
P6AP8S)
7ft% -A- Deb SW 91/94 - EB8
9% "A- Oeb SK 91/94 - £89H
11 %% Uns Ln SK 1990 - £99 pi Ap89)

Value 3 Income Trust PLC Warrants 88/94
to sub for Ord - 18 (26Ap99)

Vanbrugh Currency Fund LdPtpg *A* Rad
Prt ip - 1742

Whitbread Investment Co PLC8%% Dab
SK 87/92 - £83 <21 Ap89)

Bsneto Exploration LdOrd R021 -48
East Rand Goto A Uranken CO Ld*8T Old
ROJO - £1% (2SAp89)

General MMng IMon Oorporatiian82%
v»r Comp Cm Cum Prf HO40 -
£10%®
122% Uns Subaid Comp Cnv
DsOsQnrf) R27 - £12

Lsbows Pkianum Mines LdOrd R021 -
812

Lbicun Reefs Gold MMng Co LdOrd
RQ21 -30

MMdle VWtwawrarendWfeatsni Ara«s)8%
Red Cum Prt R1 -S(21Ap09)

Navr Central v/bmsaranad Areas Ld
ROJO -ESft (21Ap89)

Oryx Go« HokSngs LdOrd Shs of NPV -
100 (26Ap89)

Western Deep Levels LdOption to Sub tor

Ord - £7% {24Ap89)

Krystone hnemaUmnl $18,525* (21/4)
Kulfiti Malaysia Old -33* (2S/4J

Malaysia OTC (Malay Ord)Kulim Malaysia Ort (Maty bid) 29
Malaysia* Airline System MS720617 (26/4)
Malaysian Plantations 40 (24/4)
McCardty Croup £1.95* _
Noranita C$22.06968,. 19437JH22.25(26/4)
North FlIndHS Mines JE1J23 t2S/4)
Oceaneering bn £22S4S42 (25/41
Ohio Resources 22
Oil Search AS.716.4323.4 5 (24/4)
Overseas Chinese Banking Core £2* (25/4)
Paiatiora Mining £73* £26/4)
PtctUney Uglov KUMmann FR196

:7% Cun Cnv Red

Ptnevale investments 18 (26/4)
Ttegal Hotels ttktod HK57J0. 7JS
Shoritt Gorton Mines 600
Singapore Land SSll (25/4)
Soudiwen Gold mines 2J (26/4)
Strategic Minerals Corp ASMS I

Prf £l - 110 (2&AOSB)
Savage Group PLC5J%(rW) Cum Rad'
Cnv Prt £1 -108 -

SeiadTV PLCOrd ip - 18ft
TOM Systttm* PLCOrd 5p - 48 (25Ap89)
Vtstec Group PLCOrd ip — 28 ft 0
York Trust Group PLC Rad Cum Cnv Prt
20p -89 (28Ap89)

Strategic Minerals
Target Resources 27

,

Teat Corp'A' £9JS (24/4)
United Overseas Land SS2AX
Westfield Minerals C$1,635

OB Na of bajQxlnx tacTuded 1874

British Ptooieun Co PLCOrd 2Sp(tnter1m
Cans) -283 * 6 7 ft 88 ft 90

Br fferndrafoB of toe Stock toefcaage Council

9% Cum 2nd Prtn -88(21Ap89)
Wmah Ol PLC7ft% Cum Rad Rf 91Bumrah Oe PLC7ft% Cum Rad Prf SWE1
- 87ft 70 3$ (2flAp88)

8% Cub Prf SK £1 -7B(2BAp89)
Enterprise Rnanca 1989 PLC Unto Var
Cal Gtd CULS 1988(PflyPa) -288 935

Landoc & Scottish Marine OT PLC 1 0ft%
Deb Stk 2009 - £94% % "Via 5

MobB CorpShs of Com SK $2 - £29J8
Shea TransportATrodtngCo PLCOrd SM

(Br) SSKCpn 181) - 408
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Texaco htemattanal Flnanclel Coro8%
S8g/S Cnv GU Ln SK 81/99 - £11 OftSSq/S Cnv Gtil Ln SK 81/99 -

(2lAp89)

INTERNATIONAL & BRITISH EDITORIAL,
ADVERTISEMENT & CIRCULATION OFFICES

Property Naofbargalnaincludedaso

ABed London Properitaa plciok% tst

: FdtertxLAdrorttrinfl and CrTOuta-
ratal 472. NL-1017 CA Amsterdam.

Mtg Deb SW 2028 - £98% (25Ap89)
New 10%% 1st Mtg Deo SK 2023 -
£97% (2SAp89)

1 Property Trust LdflftK Uni Ln
SW 84/89 - £95 QSAp69)

B8ton<Percy) PLCAccum SMSSp -488

Insurance
Na of bargains IndkidedSSS

Boaoombe Propom Co LdBft Cum lit FW
£1 —104 (26Ap80)

BradhVd Property 7Yu« PLCIOftft, Cum
Prt £1 -114®

Brixtan Esutta PLCO% tat Mtg Dab SW

Alexander A Alexander Snricee InoSM of
ctaaa C Com SK $1 -£14% (2SAp89)

General Ace flra&Ute ask Corp PLC
S»% Cum Prt £1 - 55 (24Ap89)
7ft% Uno Ln SK 87/82 - £87
7*4% Uns Ln SK 92/97 - £84

Guardian RoyalExchange AaataaneaPLC
7% Cum Red Prf £1 -7S(24Ap8S)
7% Uns Ln 8K 80/91 -£87K®

Caottal * Countloe PLC9%% 1st Mtg Deb

Investment Trusts
No. ol borgalna lnckidad71S

ABanoa Trent PLC4% Prt SK (Cura) -
£45% (24Ap68)
5% Prt SK - £50 (21Ap69)

American Treat PLC5% Cum Prf SW -
£57%p4Ap8g)

Auatraiia tovenmam Trust PLCA Warrants
to sub for Ord - 7 (24ApB9)

BaWe Gilford Japan Trust PLCWsiraniB
to aub for Old - 410 (24Apfm

BaWe Gifford SMi Nippon PLCWnantt
to aub for Ord -81 (24Ap88)

Bankara tnvaatmant That PLC3J% Cum
Prt SK -£52(24Ap8S)
10ft% Dab SK 2016 -£96K (21Ap8S|

Brtttta Assets Truat PLC'A' S% PM
Stk(Cum) - £47 (29ApW)

British Emprro See & Genaraf TiuitlOIM
Dob SK 2011 - £94 (2SAp89)

Cantrovfneial Estates PLC0ft% Uns Ln
SW 88*93 - £81 (21Ap69)

Cbarbraod Afltanca HUgs U7ft% Uns Ln
8K50p-31®

Cttotorm HoWhiga PLC 11% latNOgDab
SK 2016 - £»% (21Ap68)

area Estates plc7.73% cnv Cum Rad
PrfSI -103 4
10K% 1 st Mtg Dab SK 2012 -E82

EngOah Property Corp PLCWft 1« Mtg
Dob SK 57/2002 - £90 (25AP88)
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LONDON STOCK EXCHANGE

Early gains trimmed in active session
THE UK stock market jousted
with the year's high points in
another busy trading session
yesterday but soon lost most of
its early gain as the tamWnp
securities houses balanced
their trading positions ahead of
the extended weekend break In
the UK. With both the Japa-
nese and West German mar-
kets also briefly closed next
week, the big trading firms
were unwilling to leave posi-
tions open in London.
Turnover remained high, but

a Seaq volume total of 539,5m
shares, against Thursday’s
529m, included a high propor-
tion of market maker business
as traders sought to pass on
commitments.
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The session opened with a
rush as London responded to
the renewed advances in
Tokyo and New York. Also kin-
dling excitement was a buying
programme from a US securi-
ties house, believed at first to
be worth around £5Gm across
the London equity market Sal-
omon International arimiwttted

to a programme “much smaller

than that {£50m)
n - and some

sources believed that a buying
programme bad been swiftly

reduced when it met a market
resolutely unwilling to selL

The FT-SE raced up to
2,134.9, a new 1989 trading
peak, within minutes of the
Seaq opening, but as quickly

lost momentum when sellers
refused to sell and buyers
bflcVwi off.

By 'the close, the FT-SE
Index was only £3 points up at
2,118, just short of the previous

dosing peak of 2425.4 reached
on March 14, UK Budget Day.
The Footsie index has gained

57 points over the week as
fears of higher domestic inter-

est rates have receded, helped
by the announcement of an
improved UK trade deficit; the
improvement in sentiment ha*
Spurred a return of institu-
tional buying of UK equities.
Daily share trading volumes
have moved above £lbn, reach-

ing £1.4bn on Wednesday.
With the market in a consoli-

dation phase yesterday, there
were relatively few special sit-

uations. Unilever, heavily
traded this week both in Lon-
don and, in NV form, in
Amsterdam, fell in heavy turn-

over after annonr>Hng the ter-

mination of plans to buy
Ffeberge/Elizabeth Arden. The
London market had seen the
deal as potentially very benefi-

cial for the Anglo-Dutch food-

stuffs and detergent group, and
traders took a cautious view of
its abandonment
There was little activity in

the market’s two most signifi-

cant bid situations. Beecham
shares continued to trade
around recent levels, reflecting

the market’s satisfaction with
the present valuation imposed
by theplanned merger with
SmithKline Beckman of the
US.
Shares in Consolidated Gold

Fields gave ground, but once
again, turnover was very thin
as the institutional holders of
the shares waited for develop-

ments on either side of the
Atlantic.

FINANCIAL TIMES STOCK INDICES
Apr Apr Apr Apr Apr Year 1939 Since Compilation

28 27 as 25 24 Ago High Low High Law

Government Secs 88*5 88.68 88.64 8624 88.16 MAS 8929
13/25

85.84
113/4)

127.4 48.18

(9/1/35) (3/1/75)

Fixed Interest 8725 87.04 87.00 9627 8626 97.57 90.50
(15/3)

85.93

(4/1

J

105.4 5053
(28/11/47) (3/1/75)

Ordinary 1750.4 174S9 1731A 17082 17012 1443.9 1781.1

(14/3)

1447.8

(3/15

1926.2 49.4

(18/7/87) (26/6/40)

Gold Minas 185.0 1882 185.1 196.5 1B6.fi 206.4 196.1

(28/3)

154,7

(17/2)

734.7 43.5
(15/2/83) (26/10/71)

Ord. DL Yield
Earning YM %(fu!t)

P/E RaBo(Not)(£r)

445
10.64
11.15

4.46

10.78
1121

4.51

10.92
11.0S

4.56
11.05
10.96

4.58

11.09
1021

4.51

11.70
10.45

© S.E. ACTIVITY
Indices Apr 27 Apr 26

SEAQ Bargains!5pm}
Equity Tumovsr(Em)t
Equity Bargainer
Shares Traded (mt)t

30.007 28.132
1465.09
32AS1
2H.1

26298
1416.84

20.864
gwa

24.423
1375.06
27,911
5289

22231
854.30
26,292
351.3

27.276
1074.38
30,818
4822

Gilt Edged Bargains 952 103.1

Equity Bargains 207.8 192

2

Equity Value 6276-6 28832

Ordtaaty Share Codex. Hearty changes

9 Opwing #10 am #11 am. #12 nm #1 pm #2 pm
ITBQlB 17557 17508 17505 175Z5 17S32

•3 pm BA pm
17539 1748.9

Gilt Edged Bargains
Equity Bargains

Equity Value

94.0
185.5

2537 3

97.3

184.1

2490.2

DAY'S HIGH 17BOB DAY'S LOW 1748.0

Basks 100 Govt Secs 15/1028. Fixed mt 1928, Ordinary 1/7/35,

Gold Mines 12/9/55. SE Activity 1974. *N1I 11.06 tExcluding Intra-market
business. * Corrected figure.

• London Report and latest

Share index: Tsi. 0898 123001

Unilever
loses the

scent
Unilever were swept lower by
the announcement that the
deal to buy Fabergd/EIizabeth
Arden had foundered. The
shares had touched 566p but
closed at 549p. a net fall of 10.

Turnover was a brisk 4.7m
shares.

Analysts were Ranging au*
Michael Landymore, at Hen-
derson Crosthwaite, said there
were no short term ftamingg
implications. “And it can’t
have escaped the market's
attention that Beecham’s cos-
metics business will be up for
sale shortly." Beecham is due
to merge with SmithKline
Beckman of the US and a
sell-off of non-pharmaceutical
interests is likely.

Mr John Campbell of Pru-
Bacbe echoed those thoughts.
He pointed out that any effect

on projected 1990 earnings
should imply a fell of only 5 in
the share price. "The rest of
the weakness is bad senti-
ment” He said that Unilever’s
refusal to pay too high a price

was evidence of the company’s
shrewdness, and pointed out
other opportunities in the US.
"There are plmty of US food
companies that would make a
good product fit with Uni-
lever." He singled out Camp-
bell Soups, parts of Beatrice,
Nabisco or Sara Lee. By the
end of trading, talk of such
purchases had spread around
the market and the closing
price was 2 off its low point.

Enterprise baulked
Enterprise Oil shares see-

sawed after confirmation of
recent market stories that two
other interested parties have
exercised their pre-emption
rights over Enterprise's pro-

posed purchase of the UK
North Sea assets of Texas East-
ern. Enterprise' shares closed a
lower at 538p, after 532p.

Enterprise CHI announced its

plan to acquire the assets,
along with Texas Eastern's
other exploration and produc-
tion assets for &.4bn on March
1. The UK assets account for
almost glbn of the purchase.
But British Gas and Amerada
Hess said yesterday they would
exercise their rights which
relate to a clause dating back
to 1965.

Analysts said the deal was
now back in the malting pot
with negotiations between all

the interested parties expected
to take place as soon as possi-

ble. But Enterprise announced
yesterday that it expected to

call on shareholders for the
ildp on the stock units issued

via a rights to pay for the pur-

chase. "They must be confident

of eventually getting the assets

or they wouldn’t have
for the UOp; but the whole
thing is legal mess and
extremely complicated," said
one analyst

MB packaged
The last loose ends of the

Carnaud/MB Group/Elders
saga were tied up whena block
of 16’Am shares was trans-
ferred by Warburg Securities
to Mercury Asset Management
from the French holding com-
pany CGIP. This tranche bad
been sold by Elders to the
French company in a green-
mail operation earlier this
month. CGIP, like MB Group,
has a 25 per cent stake in the
new CMB operation which
encompasses both company's
packaging operations.
Yesterday’s stock transfer

was sold around the 207p level
which Warburg was offering
the shares during the day. The
price eventually settled at that
price, a penny below the open-
ing. Seaq registered a turnover
of 35m shares.

FT-A All-Share Index

Equity Shares Traded
Turnover by volume (mUSon)

400

200

Gold Fields wait
With Newmont Mining deter-

mined to continue its legal
resistance to Minorco's bid,
and no sign of an extension in
the UK Takeover panel dead-
line, Consolidated Gold Fields
had another thin day's trading:
The shares lost 20 to I300p, the
level regarded by the market
as a reasonable trading price
on fundamental grounds, even
if the Minorco bid fells to clear

the May 17 deadline, which
would pot it out of play for a
year.

A mere 463,000 Gold Fields
shares traded yesterday, a fur-

ther indication that the major
institutional holders, effec-

tively locked in until fee bid
situation

.
resolves itself, are

not unhappy with the current
share price. Some believe that

if Minorco fells a third party
will move against Gold Fields
which has bean firmly pinned
into the takeover frame by the
high rate of acceptances for
Minorco’s £3.5bn offer.

Racal Electronics again flew
high in electronics, advancing
another 13 and extending the
gam over the week to 47 at a
year’s high of 440p. Turnover
yesterday came out at 10m,
bringing the number of shares
traded over the fiveday period
to 34.3m.
US securities bouses contin-

ued to chase the stock which
remained in short supply in
the market. The background to
the recent surge in the shares

has been talk that the group is

moving towards a sponsored
.ADR facility.

Racal Telecom, whose out-

standing share price perfor-
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RISES AND FALLS
On Friday On 8» week

Rises Falls Same Rises Falls Same
96 2 10 453 27 80

Corps. Dam. A Foreign Bonds __ 18 2 2« 77 IB 12S
hwhitWwfa S33 252 788 2.527 1.288 4.076

287 74 297 1.117 413 1.760

Olte 33 20 44 147 100 238
2 O 10 7 3 SO

41 52 85 236 173 483
OBwrm — 117 37 100 448 249 584

Touts — . 1,127 439 1,389 5,012 2JS1 7.389

mance since tbs flotation last

year has been partly responsi-

ble for the re-rating of Racal
Bientirwite

, attracted profit-tak-

ing and slipped S to 355p.
Two textile majors closed the

week on a high note. Cour-
taulds nudged forward a few
more points, taking the gain
over the five days to 18 at 332p,

still buoyed by speculation of
stakebuilding exercises leading
to a possible bid.

Tootal meanwhile equalled
the highest point >»» year of
136p, up 2. Mr Donald Ander-
son of Hoare Govett believes

the current price represents an
even balance of risk and
reward, although he expects
Australian Mr Abraham Gold-
berg to progress from a 24 per
cent holding to a full bid. “In

the present state of the market
it would seem likely that an
offer of around L50p, an exit

multiple of 13.6, would suc-
ceed," said the researcher.

Beazer, the international
building group, were pushed
ahead to 204p before easing
back to close little changed on
the session at202p; Swiss Bank
Stockbroking came out with a
strong buy recommendation
yesterday after a seminar and
lunch with Mr Brian Beazer,

the chairman and chief execu-
tive of the group. Mr Richard
Hopewell, building analyst at
Swiss Bank, rates Beazer
shares a short tens and funda-
mental boy, citing the low p/e,

healthy asset backing and good
prospective parninp growth.

Creston, which has a 44 per
cent stake in Ex-Lands jumped
6 more to 80p.
Empire Stores fell foul of a

hpnrish circular, this one from
Smith New Court, which has
lowered its profits forecast for
the current year from £7-5m to
ffim and next year from £l0m
to £8m. The knock-on effects of
last year’s postal dispute, plus
current poor trading conditions
were to blame for the down-
grading. Empire ended 10
weaker at 180p-

Burton also dropped with
the sector, closing a touch ligh-

ter at 212p, this in spite of a
buy recommendation from
Nikko Securities. Mr David
Robinson of Nikko, who
lunched with Sir Ralph Hal-
pern yesterday, is highlighting
Burton’s “aggressive approach
to increasing market share and
their succesful contestible
strategy across the most profit-

able consumer clothing mar-
kets."

Next eased 2 to 143p after Mr
George Davies, the former
chairman, unveiled his new
operation; he is setting up a
new company with supermar-
ket group Asda to exploit the
retailing potential of "out-of-
town clothes shopping". Dix-
ons, still damaged by a BZW
downgrading, fell a further 3 to

145p; volume of 9.3m shares
was boosted by the placing of a
line of SJ5m with a variety of

institutions by Citicorp Scrim-
geour Vickers.
The biggest turnover in elec-

tronics, outside of Racal,

COMMODITIES

WEEK IN THE MARKETS

Base metals suffer ups and downs
IT HAS been a week of ups and
downs for the maim: base met-
als on tbe London Metal
Exchange - good for traders

but not so appreciated by con-

sumers and producers.
Nickel soared on Monday

after Outokumpu, .the Finnish
mining and metals group,
declared force maJeurc on
deliveries because of a week-
end explosion at it Harjavalta

smelter. News that stocks in

LME warehouses had fallen

more than expected (down 645
tonnes to 2,413 tonnes) added

to the upward thrust. Cash
nickel added 5730 to close at

Si6.600 a tonne.

Outokumpu said that an
explosion and fire at the
smelter's oxygen plant had
interrupted production of both
copper anodes and nickel cath-

odes. Production will not be
back at fun capacity for at

least three months. The
smelter produces about 50

tonnes of nickel a day. half of
which goes to the group's own
stainless steel operations.
Monday's ' high prices

attracted some keen sellers of

surplus metal, according to
traders, who believe many con-
sumers are weR covered for
their immediate requirments.
Another influence beating
down on the price this week
has been persistent sugges-

tions from traders of a verita-

ble flood of nickel into Rotter-

dam from the Soviet Union.
On Tuesday the market fell

right hack again, and during
trading on Wednesday three-

month prices were for a time
below roe 3X5,000 a tonne level.

At the close yesterday cash
metal was $15,150 a tonne,

down $700 on the week. Adding
further bearish pressure yes-

terday was news that office

and technical staff at Falcon-

bridge's Sudbury, Ontario,
plant will be voting on Monday
on a new labour contract
which was been accepted by
the union.
Copper prices have also been

erratic, and London prices

have once again been strongly

affected by moves bn New
York’s Comex. One trader
summed the situation up on
Tuesday when he said the mar-

ket appeared to be performing

like a “headless chicken” in

the absence of fresh major
market-moving factors. Trad-

ers have been watching the on}

off strikes in -mines across

Peru, but even the national

three-day strike got off to a
slow start on Thursday and
most operators are still looking

for definite signs of disruption

to supplies before taking fresh

market positions.

Cash copper closed yesterday

at £1,809 a tonne, up £18.

Aluminium prices strength-

ened towards tbe end of the
week amid concern about the
docks strike in Brazil and the

threat of a general strike in
Venezuela - both countries
are major aluminium export-

ers. But three-month prices
were unable to break the $2^00
level as “there is very little

fresh physical business at
these levels,” one trader said.

Three-month metal closed yes-

terday at $2,1B2JQ, a rise of 960
on the week.
The Brazilian strike has also

affected tbe week's movements
in the coffee price. Robusta
futures jumped in London on
Wednesday on news of the
strike, but on Thursday prices

retreated as some dealers, fear-

ing that the mazket could drop
sharply if the strike was
resolved, liquidated their long
position. Yesterday tbe Brazil-

ian courts ruled that the strike

was Illegal, but several ports

were reported to be still on
strike, London's July rotmsta
contract closed yesterday at

£UQ9, a fall of £4 on the week.
The massive ovorsupply of

cocoa in the world pushed
prices further down tills week,
although, as one trader
remarked, there is nothing new
in it London's July contract

ended the week down £18 a

tonne at £744 a tonne.
The sugar market has been

choppy for some time, and all

eyes yesterday were on the
expiration of the May raws
futures contract. Sucres et

Denrees, the French trade
house, was widely expected to

take delivery of up to lm
tonnes from both London and
New York for sale on to the

Soviet Union. The London con-

tract expired at l£30pm yester-

day, and it turned out that Suc-

den had taken delivery of 2£45
lots, or 127,250 tonnes. The
New York May contract was
due to expire later yesterday,

and Sncden was expected to

take delivery of a much larger

tonnage.

Tbe large take-up of delivery

is seen as generally supportive

of prices, and will clarify how
much sugar Is available for

nearby shipment. However, the

London Daily Face for raws
fell $10.40 to 5299 a tonne dur-

ing the week.

On the London bullion mar-
ket yesterday the gold price

broke out of its recent narrow
trading range to fall S8 to

$37825 an ounce. The initial

downturn reflected weakness
in the silver market, but a
lower opening in New York
hastened the decline.

David Blackwell

occurred in British Telecom
where nearly 7m were traded.
But chare* could wniw lit-

tle headway, closing only 2
harder at 268p.

Stories that a joint venture
deal with West Germany's Sie-

mens regarding computer sub-
sidiary ICL, could be on the
cards continued to buoy STC
shares which edged up to 328p;
“With everything that is going
on in the European electronics

industry that sort of deal
would obvivously be the way
forward; they are rumoured to
be talking and it would be sur-

prising if they weren’t," said
one analyst.

Tunstall were a major casu-
alty, plummeting 40 to 260p
after the sharp contraction in
preliminary profits, but HO
rose 5 to 234p in busy trading.
Smith New Court said it had
dealt with 75 per cent of the 2m
chnT-pg traded.

Once again there was good
turnover in Hillsdown, with
8.7m shares changing hands as
the price edged 3 higher to
270p. The bulk of the recent
business appears to have its

origin in the 60.5m shares sold
into the market at 255p by Mr
David Thompson, the former
chairman of Hillsdown, on
April 6. Dealers said that a
good deal of that stake ended
in Iprs than solid hands, and it

appears that investors who
bought the stock decided this

week to take the 15p premium
and sell their holdings.

Cadbury Sbweppes were also

a firm market, the shares clim-
bing 8% to 354p in thin trade
amid reports of heavy buying
of the May 360 call options.
Producer and wholesaler J
England soared 18 to I13p on
the news that Barlow Clowes
bad sold its 29.9 per cent stake
in the group to Unwin Hold-
ings for 102p.

Among retailers interest in

TRADING VOLUME IN MAJOR STOCKS
The following M based oo trading volume for most Alpha sciatties dealt through the SEAQ system rcstertar until 5 pm.
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Asda and Gateway tailed off
slightly; the former ended
nwphanigo^ at 165p on turnover
of nearly fen shares and the
latter closed a shade higher at
I9ip on turnover of 7.1m
shares.

Fisons gave up 7 to 306p on
fears that it would be pre-
vented from selling pentame-
dine in the US. The FDA ruling
is on Monday. News that Laid-
law Transportation had
increased its stake is ADT to
24.1 per cent boosted the latter

4 to 175p. Turnover was 5.2m
shares.
The stories would not go

away of Armstrong Equipment
being eyed by a predator and
the shares closed showing a
rise on the week of 22 at 155p.
Caparo Industries, the 13.8 per
cent shareholder which late
last year helped Armstrong
fend off a bid from Wardle

Storeys, was considered the
most likely bidder.

FR Group responded to brok-
ing house "buy for long-term
growth" recommendations, ris-

ing 7 to 244p, while expansion
hopes generated further inter-

est in Western Motor, finally

27 dearer at 662p.

Reed International staged
another of Its periodic runs
accompanied by revived specu-
lation of an impending man-
agement buyout. The buoy-
ancy In tbe shares began late

the previous session and the
pace warmed yesterday to
leave the price 12 up at 405p.

“When they (the shares) rise,

it’s a prospective mbo and
when they fell it’s an immi-
nent large acquisition,” said a
leading trader.

DRG also surged higher with
marketmakers pointing to an
aggressive buyer taking the

view that the shares were
undervalued. They closed 16 up
at 449p.
Alva were notable among

investment trusts, rising 29 to

270p, following a little publi-

cise! announcement that ERI
intended to substantially
increase its current sharehold-
ing of 13.78 per cent The trust

also said that net asset value
was now equivalent to 300p per
share compared with the end-
February figure of 260p.

Hie beleaguered London
United, hammered on Wednes-
nday and Thursday after news
of problems with its US subsi-

diary. slumped 5 more to 70p,
leaving the stock a massive 54
down on the week.

Other market statistics,

including the FT-Actuaries
Share Index. Page 9

LEADERS AND LAGGARDS

Percentage changes since December 30 1968 based on
Thursday April 27 1989

Oil & Gas + 18-09
Consumer Group + 17.52

Transport ...— + 29.07
Health & Household Products + 27.68
Building Materials —.— + 2S.74
Conglomerates + 24.72
Mechanical Engineering + 24-51
Agencies + 23.12
Capital Goods + 21.B1
Electronics + 21.72
Food Retailing + 21.12
Seetrteais + SOX,
Motors 20.70
Chemicals + 20-37
Other Industrial Materials— + 20.25
Investment Trusts + 20.20
Other Groups + 1958
Brewers and Distillers 19.28
Industrial Group 4- 1027
500 Share Index + 19.08
Metals a Metal Forming + 18.75
Leisure 4- 18.52

All Share Index . + 17.43

Contracting,Construction .+ 16.00

Gold Mines index . + 13.05
Food Manufacturing + 10.90

Banks . — + 10.25
Insurance;Composttn) + 10.17
Overseas Traders .+ 9.97
Telephone Networks .+ 9.70
Financial Group ... —

,
+ 941

Property + 900
Packaging 6 Paper .+ 858
Publishing 6 Printing .+ 8.45
insurance(Brokers) -.+ 3.85
Merchant Banka . + 3.67

BENCHMARK GOVERNMENT BONDS

Coupon
Red
Dale Price Change Yield

Week
ago

Month
ago

UK GILTS 13.500
9.750
9.000

9/92
1/96
10/08

107-00
97-06
97-20

-1-2/32

-2/32
+0/32

10.96
10-24
9.26

11.33
10.42
9.41

10.80
10.12
9.15

US TREASURY *
8.875
8.875

2/99
2/19

96-30
99-19

+ 1/32
-2/32

9.04
8.91

9.16
8.99

9.38
9.18

JAPAN No 111
NO 2

4.600
5.700

6/98
3/07

95.5420
106.1102

-0056
-0.001

5.32
5.05

5.38

5.05
5.17

5.03

GERMANY 6375 11/98 96.5800 + 0.130 6.86 680 6.95

FRANCE BTAN
OAT

8.000
6.125

1/94
5/09

96.7676
95.0500

+ 0.367
+ 0.740

8.65
6.74

8.96
6.60

9.18

9.0Z

CANADA * 10J50 12/B3 101.0000 + 0.500 10.08 10^9 10.62

NETHERLANDS 6.7500 10/98 97.4250 +0.050 7.12 7.06 7.16

AUSTRALIA 12.000 7/99 92-5563 +0.341 13.34 13.41 1358

London closing, ‘denotes New York morning session
Yields: Local market standard Prices: us. UK In 32nds.. others in decimal

Technical Data:ATLAS Pries Sources

APPOINTMENTS

Fisons
senior

post
FISONS has appointed Mr

DA. Trigg’S as chairman of the
horticulture division. He was
president of Fisons Western
Corporation, the division's
North American business. He
succeeds Mr JF. Valentine
who is resigning on May 19
to become group managing
director of Southern Water
Authority.

ROBERT CUBITT
HOLDINGS, Ipswich, has
appointed Air Peter Copping,
formerly an executive director,

as a director. Mr Peter Tailing
becomes a director of G.C.
Hammond. He was an
executive director.

Mr Bill Wright has been
appointed managing director
of CONSOLIDATED
MICROVISION.Hewas
managing director of Harris/

3M.

PLM REDFEARN GLASS
has appointed Mr Duncan
Penn as production director,

Mr Stan Wray as technical
director, Mr Des Hewitt as
engineering director, and Mr
Fred Davie as commercial
director.

COMBINED ACTUARIAL
PERFORMANCE SERVICES.
Leeds, which monitors 2.000

pension funds, has appointed
Mr Laurence Flasher as
financial controller and
production manager.

M Mr Alan Taylor has joined
SWISS BANK CORPORATION.
London, as director of global

Mr John Hooper (above) has
been appointed non-executive
chairman of the ABBEYGATE
GROUP, Leicester. He was dep-

uty chairman of Banro Indus-
tries.

custody. He will be responsible

for launching a new business

initiative in this area.

Following the acquisition
Of SECCOMBE MARSHALL
& CAMPION by Compagnie
Parisienne de Reescompte, Mr
Henri Cukiennan, Mr Olivier

Mirat and Mr Philippe

Debenne have been appointed
directors to replace Mr
William Grant and Mr John
Robertson of Citicorp

Investment Bank, who have
resigned. The Earl of

Clarendon remains chairman
and pianaging director,

together with Mr John Pooley
and Mr Christopher Chapman
as joint managing directors.

RISO KAGAKU
CORPORATION, of Japan,
which makes printing and
duplicating equipment, has
formed its European
headquarters - Riso Europe
- in London and appointed Hr
John Smetana as managing
director. He was commercial

Joining
Bremner
board
Mr Michael J. Bracegirdle

and Mr David Flint have been
appointed to the board of
BREMNER.
Mr Braceginile, 35, is a

multimillionaire industrialist
with substantial commercial
and property interests in
Scotland which include
construction, civil engineering,
property development and
investment, food processing
and food support services.
Last year he saved the

Scottish company Lafferty
Construction with a
multi-million pound rescue
package, saving 600 jobs
through bis company, WJ.
Hart (City). Mr. Bracegirdle
is one of the biggest individual
shareholders in Bremner.
Mr Flint. 33. is a partner in

the Scottish law firm
MacRoberts, specialising in
corporate law.

director of Gcstetner
Manufacturing.

WICKES has appointed Mr
Trefor Llewellyn as group
finanee director. He was
finance and administration
director of Dixons Stores

Group, and succeeds Mr
Andrew Mills-Baker who is

leaving the company.

JOHN HEMMING & CO has
appointed Mr John Routh as
finance director, who joins

from Peat Marwick McLintock,

and Mr Lee Gribling as sales

director, whojoins from.

Hoskins Group.

PA CONSULTING GROUP
has appointed Dr Keith Ridler

as chief executive of its

technology division. He was
director of engineering, and
succeeds Dr Ken Macrae, head
of PA's Cambridge laboratory,

who is retiring in June.

Mr Ron Kelly has joined
the board of AUTOBAR
INDUSTRIES. UK holding
company for the Autohar
group, as technical director.

He was with Mono Containers,
part of the group.

Mr David M. Davis, MP for

Boothferry and a director of
Tate & Lyle, has been
appointed a non-executive
director of GLOBE
INVESTMENT TRUST. Mr
David J. Gregson, an executive
responsible for investments
in unlisted companies and in
special situations, also joins
the board.

Mr Colin Purvis, assistant

director, becomes director of
the BRITISH TEXTILE
CONFEDERATION on June
30 when Mr Ian MacArthnr
retires.

Mr J. Raymond Johnstone
(above) has been elected chair-
man of SCOTTISH FINANCIAL
ENTERPRISE, Glasgow, suc-
ceeding Sir Thomas N. Risk

,

who remains on the board.
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- PO Bex 124 Norwich NR1 US 0603683986
— NUAsi Fuads
_ Managed Fund 6L2 6*4 +02
- Sue Ctekflbrt Fine. . 59* 620 +0 2
- Ebu.ii Fund - 64 1 6? S +0 2
- lormautvul Fund.— 55 8 58 7 +0J
— Eiimux Fund. . ..57 1 63 Z +00 -
* Nprji American Fund 526 55 4 +05
_ Paclic Fund bb5 70.0 +0 2
_ Property Fund T50 79.8
* Firm Interest Fund— 53 3 5b! +01
- Indte linked Sec Fan*.. 550 58 2 +0 2
- DrppNt Fund . . . . S6.7 54.7
- NUAH RcUirencut Plans
- Mi art Fund. 66 7 702 -05
- UK Ordinary share Fd.. 7b 0 80 0 +0 3
_ lptenullonjl Fund — 585 61.6 +03 -
- Proper r Fund 75 8 79 P +25
- Fixed laiera: Fond.... 540 62.Z +oj
- lasar beard Sec Fund .. 570 fa£> 1 +00
_ Desrelt Fund 620 65 5
- KUANUin

- tese> Liu ec Set Fuse—156 0 54.01 +0.21

I Norwich Union Ufa fasuraace Sac.
_ POBo. 149. wore tli NR13KG 0503622200
_ UMuted Prtnxons
_ V/IUi Praf 1is Fd 1 1408 120.61 *0 D4
_ Manag'd Fe 13*71 la: BO +i DO -
- UK Equity rd 1*0 67 1*3 08 +007 -
_ Internal ifanjl r* 106 92 1*4 23 +0 68 -
_ Euroswxu Fd . ._. 129 07 IX 8b +000
- Ncatn AmniGin Ft _ 134 *9 14157 +0 3*
_ Pacific Fd . 129 T7 13- 60 +0 67
_ Property Fd 137 42 145 17 +9 51
- FU« IntFd. 104 73 110 25 +0 57
- to! Bead (a. 11124 117 in m 80
_ Bldg See Dee Fd. 10804 11* JO <0 03
_ Palo arrester*5 Ualt-Unked PIre*
- rurdlPiertKF.nij 2032 3086 +31
_ iBpai-Ltmrt Set Fund IbO 7 IV).Z -00
_ Ordinary Share Furd - 545 2 573 4 413*

tcdcynjcionjl Fired 146 6 1540 +L0 —
Property Fund...— 2265 238 * +00 -
Deasu: Fund. 1940 2040 +0 4
Kurt Fund.. - 3613 3835 +60

no bxreeclKttFttWrlS- 41Mb
_ "Pnco as at April 18

bl2 644 +02
59* b20
S« l

558 587 +00
632

526
665 70.0 +02
758 74.8

550 582 +02

667 70 2
76 0 800 +0 3

61.

b

75 8
59.1 b2.Z
570
620 65 5

8640 41D0
176741
<77 7 502.9

414 0
232 4 244 7

146.7 ISAS
+0.2

(Unit Funds) Ltd
iHhq WC1V7EB 01-405
- 1845 *440
-. 307 2 323 4 +0.1
- 755 8 7455 +10 6
... 537.6 565 4 *6.7
... 138 7 lab 1
.- 172.8 181 4 -0B
.. 1620 170 4 +16

146 2 153 4 *10
... 104 1 104 6 +05
- ;£>50 1010

106.0 1100 +05 -

- Pearl Assurance

Z 25? Higa tacinoni L01
Prop Du. iGraste“ Pros Acc. ‘Gross)
ECu.tr iGrrrzJ.
Karaqwd Xml
Prop xcc. ifJeu„ En-rtyitaeu

133 Uanaged'NrJ-.” Imyroat-naiinet) —” C'H S.Frtlr.ixrei“ Harm Fund
— Pearl rtexareuxa tUntt
“ ReltylarlSenre L

—

” Rn f.ljn i0e*iE2i
“ Rat Mao tS**'ea 3) _

Ret Caen -“ Rm Casa iSeries 31—
- Phoenix Assurance Ca Ltd
- Pn stall Hoict Riwiiff Hill. Brotol
- Life Anorancc Fnods
- Wealth Au* 1*30 0 4S2B
“ Ed'rPn.Ea — 1387.7 4100)1
' Ptnslsn Plan Funk
” pnqndi“ UKEefaHr«ec —.199 5 209 9
“ International **e Ib52 1738“ Proper,! As: . — 16* D 1726
” Flirtinma Asc.— 163 C 17L9- Morevta 1030 1611
- EM; Ssc Link Aa; ... 1310 159*
“ Special Urged. Ac* Q • 17*7 iaj.6~ POharuijFramliuatDti
- hittii Growth tee — IDO 0 105.2- Am Smllr. Cot. Act- 2D2.1 2Go 4
- Capital Tsi Aee. 193.7 203 8" JdMna&rtiAcc. . 239 4 2520“ American Turn AiC... . 10* 7 120 7
- Reuvery TsL Ate 2120 223 2“ Special Mngd Aa il7b.A 185 6

PitfaCPlilGT- Iprym+i *o+ai Ace 142 7 160 7
~ US& Genera) Act—.-. 98.80 1D4 0“ AuerSreeSruAee..... 79 20 3300- JJteiriGrtenKAeB... 2350 047 6“ FvEtei&Gen Aee_ 1720 181

0

“ UK Capiul AS 213.4 224 6
EurooeanAa 242 8 202.4
SfaKiAlMnga.As 1550 163.9

I Pignw Mutual Insurancg Co Ud
- 16 Cross* Oh. H Waurtea Lirepos) 051JJ28bfc5S
- Manjgrt F-jnd 243 4 309.4
- Han Ptm me e. Cn Fas 3858 406 2 ... -

Mom* Fund. —.118 7 1250 .....- Pern Lings Fd UnU -. 49 6 10*4 .- Pen-. Hngd Fd (Asi_.. U9.4 1260
- Pens FT30 F8 (Kill.. . 1*20 1*9 6- PernFT30FdtAccl.— 170.9 174 4 _ .

-
- Ph* 0 seas LlgF«>!aiU_ 72 0 75 3- PttetiseasUqFtfAd.... 866 912

Pees Fad btt Fd linn.-. . 103 7 1040 „...- Peru FxdW Fd (ActJ 104.7 J lllllt- Por, Drocnlt Fa ilnl-j 20* « 104 9 _ _ -- Petrs Deposit Fd lAct) . 125 b 1320
I Corttinued on next page
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Premium Life Assurance Co Ltd
37- W. Ppiyi'iiMit awd.Hjrwnn Huui

(l4.0 120.0
Building Sec. Fd .1700 mo
Bjlar.MiL ZBO 0 205.0
Eurooejr _ laZ 0 171

0

GTIVtoajWfl .„ ... (WO 177 0
brlnmrtMagi:

. .
115 0 1220

Genoa 112.0 U9.0
SIIL -. 177 0 1B7 0
Gtotal. 48.0 51

0

Hhgnlnr
. ... 1160 1230

internal iciul Equtty . 184 0 194 0
Japan 239 0 2MD
M+n+grd. MO 48 0
Prtwrty Z76 0 291

0

R.W lirtofr.il Gold.
. 130.0 147 0

UP Emit* 178 0 308 0PmlnlMi
Arm rein ... 1440 1320
BaHdOqSx. Ft .. .

1600 1790
Balanced

. .
2140 226 0

Exroraao_ 1400 169 0
Cmui 1020 108 0
cm. 1480 1540
lntrrajtkll.lt EOHIQF.. 138 0 144 0
JjWn . . . 1350 1430
Maimed tA 0 68.0
fngmv - .. 2130 2230
UK Equity 338.0 356.0

Prolific Life & Pensions LU
Stramangaie KtMJil. Cun>BrtalA94SE 05>9 33733

Mjiucrd Fund Mr BaLircrd Growth Mi

0444
-2.0
*1 0
S3
*10

.58721

*:.o

420

-10

to

*30

*10
+10

,

+10

-id

+10

3.0

Prudential Pensions Limited
Honors Ban London EC 1NZNH
Dhcmiwarr Ap> 26... U*> U 19427
EquityJor 24 ... . OMA 1» 150

lnteraall 0MlApe!6 . E24 43 25.13
ftrO Bond Bor 2b . . . £11 <4 1L61
Friedlnl Aw26 . £71 26 72J1
hare UnJrrd Asr 26 ... 15*7 74 6051
Properly Am 24 00738 11386
Cjsii Am 12 |jp v.is 2055151
Pnr-Untcd IhfJrMMMf
Mjiugm Apr 26 . . .

CathAraS*
Prodrrtlkl Pga* . .PfmUMUf27 153.8 1419
Pm UK Eg Aw 27. .. . 301.5 317 4
Pm Inti Apr 27 ... 1750 1852
Peis Filed Am 27 . . 1W3 1730
Pens Index LI Aw 27.. 151.4 154 4
Pm Con tar 27 126.2 uz.4

Regency Life Assurance Co Lid
Regency H*. Lanark So, Laodog Q4 4X5.

Sottish EtettahteLift Asscc.SbC- Stadia Ufc Attarante CoUG-
01-4039222 £*^Sq,Edlqtar*

Mind.
UK train
Internal tonal..

+08
+1.7
+1.0
-05
-1J

Janaa .....

Pacific .....
TKMI04I
Filed tut

„ Indexed Ltakfd

_ Fortfre BondlCarrorey—.

ta Mlxkd 4383
PamUKEooKy
Pots Irttraatronal

Pwa American
PenEurotwu
Me Japan

Aogrcuire PiflloFd _
Balanced PlfltoFd ...

Caulwt PtUra FO
One Find
European Find
Far tail Find
Filed Inrat Fain
Mttmntoiui Fund

Balanced G«ru Mngd
Adiemenan Mngd......

S«at* lined
Casnfd.
Property Fund
Equity Fund
Pad Ins. Fond
Internal tonal. ......
Htofi Income ..

Far Eurt.
Karin Americas.
Eurcul S.U
TKfmalan
Extra rite fd
Convertible A Gilt Fd
Amx+run locum*
Gill Fu+d 20 .......
Eirrw+n Find
Pt«t 5 Fixed lot—
aand ca Pn» Jet. .

.

Uwdm HadPm -cc_,
Setter Unsd Prm An..
BaitdingSoc Ace
Proowtj Pcac Ace
FI* In Pent Act
Lflullt Prm Act .....
i sinnai uhii Pern act.

-

Hijs me Prm Act. ...
Iren Prm Act .

n American Prm Act.
Fjr Eaitem Pent Act..
Scrcul Stu Prm Acc
LiiM Income Prm Fd .

CaaimiAie & G<U Pro...
AiDendi lm Pro.....
Edrmd Prm
UjiwdnCai Pm ....
” IP. Fired Pm..

581 7
122 4
107 2
230 4
2325
M5 7

245 4
2414
472.7
432 1
2548
60+2
£345
2S£4
15+5
120 9
2982
44 2
44 ’

555 J
1180
105 1

£34 7
2882
346 4
-30 7
270 4
484 0
157 4
1729
422.2
48L 1

323 4
147J
134 1

102.4
1045
100 5

613 0
124 2
1U 0
2434
3006
687.0
311

J

310.0
9024
«55«
270
M2 0
253 8
300 i
164 4
128 7
JI7 3
104 4
104 6
584 6
1245
110 7
2524
3034
417 8
7643
284 7
504t
IMS
182 1

4445
5045
340.7
174 2
141.2
108 4
115-3
1053

'•w*
+00
+12
+04
+03
+82
+0 3
+6.3
+4 759
+ 1 8
-58
+42
+04,
+25
+OB
+2.1
+0.2
+1.61 5
+0 9
+1 3
+02
+0 ?1 O
+23
+4 4
+1 7
+3 0
+14
+3 4
444
+1 1
+2.8
1.0

+02
-0.1
+18

Monet Fund 174.9
N American Fd.

- Property Find
- UK Eouiry Fd ...
- A.I.U Braun DIphnftL.
- Swim Select Ion. .....
- Chan Salm FlrM Bd .

- Eire MasurFd _ . .

- hrrtnuk Growth Fd...
- Beeller Hjto Lfl Pen...
- MIBMurro Spec Poet....
- s«nm Global Fd
- HantwKt Ts Fd .

- All lords ham c

1180
310 4
1211
10732
80 4
m.7
242.1
257.1

1137
41SJ3
3822
928
110.8
1083
42.0
104 0
97.1
1102
109.1
72.0

1242
3244
127.4
1128
5.1

117.5
2548
2706
184.1
1194
437.1
+023
97 7
1166
1140
44 B

114 7
1(12
114 0
114 8
75 B

01-538B800
+0.9|
+2.4
+05
+LD
+0.2
+03
+07
+U5

+09
-L9
+3.9
+0.B
+0 3
+02
+0.4
+02

+0.4

Pin* Pacific.. .. 209.1
Pbs Find bricte+L

Pan Index Linked.
Pus Cam..
Pens PiuucHy—......
PmElitol —
EOlahBTBtoe...—

.

BailltoGIffartf Japu.

1*4.0
154-1
174.9
1346
143.7
2402
HO

J

1542
123 0
1040
l«J
120647 126947

172.7
162.5
184.1
Ml.

7

1724
2528
2319
167 4
130.4
1126
152!

4414
488 4
5344
U3J
174 7
2B8J
230 2
214 4
1345

174 410 103539
188.6 1985

4434
507 7
L266
165 9
Z73.8

Ub J
2064
137J

1225
H75
1972

031-5569101 lpwme»MC«PaUl.--
+06
+01
+L0
+0.1
+1 1

+1 B
+2

+0.4
+05
+01
+0.1

+0203

3.2
+42
-0.8
+L4
L9
+34
+0.7
+0

to 047

+06
+3.7

+u

_ World Tedawuat
1

_ American Giwrta

• find SetVi 2 arlcM
about. Olliers «MllaMe from Reoency Uft

I Re) Iancr Mutual
- Peilaaoc Hone. TuaBrVbe Wells, tot
- Dmoili Act Fd. .. .. 122 7 124 i
- Eouny Acc Fd 3086 3244 +38
- Managed Acc Fd 2742 2‘HJ4| +8 6
- PnoFd list bad...- 56L2I +55
- Prw Acc FUi2red to) . 172.1 151 2 1 +12
- Unit Tm« Mn Fd 111.4 117 2f +2J
- BL Pmloii Fu*b

, . ,- DrooUtAct. L58.4 14471 +0 3
- Equity Acc .... liJOJ Z+251 -7 zl
- FUnrlntAcc 1157 7 lt*.0 +2J
- Gil lade Lai Acc 133 4 1404 +0.7
- Managed Act .....1271.1 285 J I +7.41

I Royal Heritage Life Assurance LU

I Scottish Lift Investments
- 19StAidic*S4WlEdMwiti

:

—
• Ja*

188.6
142S
137.4
1306
1822
942
192.0
257 6
165.9
2551
2905
212.2
1699HU
1545
207 6

tottreat tail 1
.

Fired brterett

Mei Urtrd
Desoirt.

WithPntiU Pod" .V..

Pens. Prcwrty ......

Pent. UK Egully. ...
Pen. Aineth+n
Prm Pacific. —
Pens. Earooean
PmMmUml
Pm Fired lot .

Pem-MeeUeM.. .

0891510033 Pens. DcpasiL.
- Pm. Managed.-— •

1838

vai
Si
I486
1305
145J
137.6
1915
572

2025
271 2
174.7
268.7
304.0
Z23.5
1790
152.2
1450
2186

031-2257211
4.2
+0.9
-0.1
+L9
+20
+0 8
*02
+06
+0 1

+08
+0 00
+18
+15
-02
+2.4
+47
+1_2
+05
+oa
+0.1
*1

1

214J
1232
1465

:
Gold 615
htti Leisure Mirk 1635
GUbal Incamg-.

_ Procerty SJjtei 1580
_ uirtteiai Enargr -w-7

102
1025

U5 Smanjto— [B43
Mralian Gnmtl J60.7
Emm Pert.. 1

Eorr^sui Sn CDs. [

FrcodiMil
Heag Kong Pcrf. —
latcntaUoBAl StwiP.

.

lawn Performance—

.

Jaun Small Co
SRMQI4 ASCAH SdlL-
IIKGlWHlI
Managed.
Stanaii

.

American GrowU

—

EumsanGiDHtlL... —
Far East GitPMlL

lictnie .

.

bill Emerging Ces.
IntIGnmU
UKGrunUi
Wort deride Reonery—.
Maaased....

Re n +-*

- Te^ers^AgawHict Ciuwp Aio LM
Ptatii BH1 taW 020221

1395 146.4
1016 107.0
1075 . 112.7 3

YMd

Rnborangh FbniicW
123- 123 Carta la toMd Uwtoo

n msssteT^
HaU-tnni Fd SOU—
FMfepfPnFd..—

.

£ ft* JK
pui sfen* +v VMi

— r™
Me* rite - inm Ka^t Bank of CamtU Fumb

iM . RBC Offjte* Fgad teMgi Lgnrfed
mar

TtabrldH* Writs EgattaWo
Attey Coart, TmAtUb* Went

m»
.9+5

UL7 1175

+05
+0 .6

1

+0J
+04
+03

^Vi«PlJdE«pL—

5780° 3
6080

Brehho Bond EaanpL.
DaStatoanL.

.
S38

DamMon Growth 6650

Niiruvrta....•«.
S»toBtWUfe... 371-50 luo
MHIteWtlAl
Do. OnUrary

806 <0.2
909 1045
1001 105+0
1502 1202Do. Ordinary — .

08925X5993 btlUKlMm BnHdsfl &. Bn Grp LU
_ The
- 71. Lender EM.

- IM Seal MM
_ Pen. Scot. Mob. .
_ Maa SRwdcr. A
_ PeaMB+Sdrafcr

—

_ Maa. TttrgeL.

El :

_ Pen. Mao. Target
_ Man Scot Erai-

safety—.

—

. §?££
Do

- UK Uf* Assurance Co Ltd

Stes&la Bwal Twat
,

Caoltal Gimth- -
Radik Basin
Fla. & Pmo Sb aid-
liderBJUMai..-~
Fhfd&CoanxlAk-..

_ Equrtytocamt
HtotricM —
Piefereraaim

“ Smaller Cotnoanlm—

i

nwfdtofdrAAPM— .1

1635
1562
174 2
1262
U7J

“ 109 Si Vincent Sc. Glasgow

20 Cllftca St. EC2A4HX
MelllGoU
MiKIGwUl'A*
Op Proa • —
Op Equity

Acotn Mauged Fond. 1168 2 173 11 +18[
PontaiioTUCU

. . . Il57 7 166 1 +15
Intel l+ui UaiuM..JlM 7 11051 .. .. I

PHfJMj«Gwm4l»t . [Ill 1 1 J 7 0| +E0
DuLOwiBbUcanie Hioa 11471+041

FueCiPlJl Umi and Oi brr Prices ring 0534-33733

Property Equity & Lite Ass. Co
Bader Ayr. ScuUmd SS2 64H

,
0702333433

In Man Priruon Fd
. . 1332 140 2

bn Man Cm Bd Fd.... 134 4
(M H+u Cruet Bd Fi»d_ 1234
FlenMe Pmp M. Fd 173 6
Fleulle Motor Bd. Fd 3t2B
Social Man Inc Fd .. 1255

Property Growth Assur Ca Ltd
Sea Alliance House. Houlum
Pnjceny Tiaid . —

.

Pmpeni Fund (A)
AgnoillDralfuld...—
Agile. Fund lAI —
AWxj tml Fund .....

ASbry Njl Fd IM
li+i .IrnnD Fund. ...

fn+mraem Fund (A)—.
Egnli Fond ........
Eguily Fund 1A' _..

Money Fund
Uem Fund IA)
ActiUrtal Fund
GiH-Edard Fond
GUI-EdqH Fd-CAt.
Retire Arm ITT

Dp Man
On Peg . ..

Os Bad
On Me OiM

8
0 Ifn Man -
a US!

Op Eijrcmln Co's
Ponton Faadr-SeriesB

474 3
4204
784.6
348 8
543 1
272.1
2246
2327

ai^aa 020270733 262524

504 3
4+2 6
825 4.

367.2
424 4
2865
341.7
ZU.4

12888 304 1

ACAcc.
680 6 714 3
1892.5 1992 2
633 3 666 7
999J 1041 4
510 7 537 6

+8.4
-01
+3.7

rt»*2+U
+1.4
-0.1
+15

1222

+145

+6.7

437 2
416 4
614 l
•/•az
314 1

344.4
234 1

226 6
858 6
832.3
314.7
3045
342J
247 4
247 4

838 0
343 0
++0.7
157 6

Intmuitoul I _
BUM Sot Ule Fd....

Property Gm-tti Pmsia
All A-mrrAt Uts.
In.. Fd Uls. .

Prm to* Fd. UU. ...

Cora Pen Fd
Cm. Pm CIO IK.—

^

Man. Pens. Fd ._
Min Pens Cap Ul.
Pino Pros Fd —

-

Prop Prm Cac Uu
,

Bldg Sot Pm. UL.

—

Bldg Sol Cm Ut__

_

Gills Pens Fd
Gifts Pern Fd Cao.

,

Egally Prm. Fd
Egnit.Pcm.Fd.Clp.-
1ml. Pots. Fi. .

Inti. Pm. Fd. Can I

Providence Capitol Life Ask. Co Ltd

0403MMU

53 Emily
.— Fired Intern! ...

—

Managed
Dwkkil
OanmwvCIahal
GarurareHA. -
Gaitimv- Pacific.Hmmm Act
Perpetual Mm —

—

Framllnqion Mug. . .

.

Ga remote Pc* Mngd...
Gjttmpr* Pen Eipp ...

Bee imm Pennon Fand..
5ulfoll Cao. Pen. Fd.K&i:
Praaeny .

Eraiiy
Fired ImwtsL
Managed

Canun bTcbil.
Garlmare HA.

fcrS.
p
jS

,

.
h
izr i^2

Pentelual Msq. - 1273

L
r^S&M

M
D
Spi::: S5.5

Gartmore Pen Eure ... 91.0
FnrdnsartdneCMSFri _ 104 6
Art Eure P*n .71107.4

For Pemhm Capital (tolls Steue rim e*t417
Baring Eadi
Auuialla—

Grown & Income
Japan Special

Jmaa&airist—
Fust Japan -

First Norm Arnn+ea

—

first Smaller

- Scottish Mutual Amrama Society 158 General
- 109 StVUmm St. Glasgow

,
041-2486321 T5B Pmwr tacnoK.-

- Flea EndApr 18. 11144 6 1180 0
J

- T5B Income
- Pea Mngd Mar3L— J768J 794.0 1 1 - TSE N* Rmoortes.

—

- ScntUsh Mutual Investments tsb iniereauout.

—

rat __ .041-2486321 155
1495 157.7-

165 0 173 7
145+ 174 2
1245 JL3L1
180J 184 8
216 4 zzai
2DbO 214 4
148.1 1554
124 4 134

J

133.4 1+0 3
179.0 1B&3
1235 130.1
12L4 128.4
126 4 133

J

114.4 124 3
1443 173 0
147.4 174

J

170 5 179 5
127 0 133 7

1742 1555
206 3 2172
178.7 1885
1526 1*0 7

131 1 138 0
1543 162 7
176 6 1859
131.7 138.7
122.7 124 2
135 B 1+3 0
131 1 138.1
136 2 143.4

unmu rwm ...

ODPcrumlty Fund .. -
WorfdnldcnalaiFtd-.
UK Edi>n Final
UKSsulIrrCm Food.....

Europrau Food—
Far Eastern Fed
JapireeFM. . . .

Norm Amcf *ao Fuod_
latematlnial Fund . ..

Gilts & Fid 1.1 Fund....
Indu-Lmvrd Fuad.
Properly Fand
C+Pi Fnn4_7 on uuitDin

' _ Pm Safety Fnp.

nSx Pem GmrlbFod-
PrmOMSnunityFnd-
PDBWnieeWMwcFat

—

_ Pros UK Easily Fed-..
Pa UK SratCo3 Fod_.

Pm European Fnd
,

PmFarE+uFnd 1

+rt 7fi3 7*. P*m Jajanrsr Fnd. ...

S iP2-® Pent KlAAnwiicaa Fad..

.

Pentlumainaul Fnd .

.

PeiBGIfttfFntMFM
Pm InSu-liniud Fad.
Pros Property Fnd
Pm Cast Fand
Pm Hallfaa Fad

- TSB Smaller Cos
- TSB Managed.
- R—dU Pwitons Itea
- Peretore Managed.-...
- Barings Managed
- FidelityManaged-.--.
- Frsmf login* Marafed

—

- GarnnoreManaged—
- Hrodano* Managed -.
- FJHnonB too Ma)d

—

- HIM anlawn Manage.
- Perttotnal Managed
- Barit Tnn+HIan al«P
- ISIS Managed
- GturnuedFd 1493..J- Amur Indc. Monitor.. ..

- EuroindeiMMriur
- toil lode* Monttnr.
- Japan Index UcrnKl-
- If I?toon Monitor .

- All foods tan equ
- atoUafifa from Sknfli Ufe

- Standard Lift Assurance
- 3Cewgg. EJatoga fm TXt

Z Scottish Provident Institution

diS5
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104A Treas 12igpc 19938. _...

84C Funding *pe 19938
109& Treas Uii PC 19938
90S Frets. 8*1 pc 1994
_ - .J Treas 14*jpc 19441*.
109ilEtt!il3>2Kl9<M

*v.

I

10.06
11.07
513
10J0
12.92

11.08
1245
3 21
857
8.27
10^4
27(

11.72
bZt
3.4C

10.22

11.09
864

12.27
1026
8.65

10 63
359

11.86
12.62
B.95
1021
11.82
7.02

12.42
9.25

12.64
12-2ll

12-32

1128
11.10
11.07

11.93
11.89
12 00
9.91
1191
10.98
11.73

965
11 54
10.67
958

11.12
U-38UM
11.02
11.08
1105
10 98
9.14

11.02

1195
10.80
10.65
10.75
10.17
10.70
10 71
10-SI
10.70

Five to Fifteen Years
%« Frtas.lOpcU. 19948...

>|106£ Each. 12>Tpc 1994
! 92S Frias Spc 19948.
,104,1 Trias tfpe 1995...-

] 745 Uen3«Gti90-95......
I
975 Eh*- 10 U pc 1995

IA Treas 12 ^ pc 19958.
H Frets. 14pc'96......

C rreas.9K 1992-968
1 Treas 15 1

* pc 19968
_JSe«*13Lpc 19968
9611 Contmlon 10pcl996^...

113 Frets 13UPC 19978.
99A Exdi 10 l

i pc 1997
90l Treas8 It pc 19978.
122^ Each 15pe 1997

96pc 1998...

ziTraasM pc 1995-988—

,

j [Treas 15*2pc 'W8——

-

JlExch. 12oc 1998
L Treas 9]a pc 1999rU-

Each. 12LPC 1999

j Treas. 10 «* pe 1999
1 Comamlon lO^iPC 1999..

i Treas. 8 Lj pc Ln 20008...

1 Conversion 9pc 20008—
\ Treas. 13pe2900._
C Freas lOpe 2001
i Treas. 14pe ‘98-01
SeaversJon9fcpc2D01...

j Ext*. 12pe '99-02..
,

t Confenlon lOpc 2002.....

I Treas 91, pc 2001
! 9211 Exch. 9oc 2002
120% Treas. 131tpc2D0O-O3-
100 J, Treat 10*2003.

J 107 1+fTlMS. 11 ij pc 2001-04_]
1011
1091

+>•

a

Over Fifteen Years
IVeas.lOoc2004
Funding J‘>« '99-04....

Conversion 9 lj pc 2004...
^mvenlon 9ij pc 2005...
Etch.10 iy pc 2005
Trail. 12Vpc 2003-05..
Treas. 8pc 2002-068.-..

1017, Conversion

9

\jk 200b...

lU.ltl[Treas. 11 Ape 2003-07.'
911, Treas 8 ij pc 2007 8.
1270 Treas. 13Wpc ‘04-08....

%*« Treas. 9pc 2008

8

87*, Treas 8pc2009.
97>a Dokv9kLi201I8. .._

65A Frets. 5 >3 pc 2006-128.
85*, Treas. 7 J,pe 2012-158.
126ib(ch.l2pcl3-‘17

"K +X
9.72
6.07

99[J +A 9 91
49 +,i 991
10B£ +A 9 7(!

+,5 10 M
0712 9!f

102 Ah HKlfl 99C
11412 +A 10.22

93 J, 9 11
129A +

*r
10 41

97V 9.2C
+«g 896Wi 9 !?

66), 8?9
86% +A 8 41
127K *& 9jS

10.22 1055
11.6* 1066
9.5f 1047

11.3b 1064
4.00 058
1058 1052
1155 10.51
1209 10.64
951 10.09

1241 1055
11.69 1050
10.19 1055
LL57 10.45
10.43 10.3*
9.49 10.14
1206 1057
10.02 10.22
824 982

11.91 1059
10.9C 1051
9.78 9.95
10.95 1050
1050 10.18
10.20 10.17
956 9.90
958 9.92

11.04 10.29
10.00 9 99
11.63 10.46
989 9.94

10.90 1052
9 89 9 84
9.81 9.82
953 974

11.23 1052
950 9.73
105U 10-11

B52

949
9.7B
943
4 43
9.76
928
968
9 24
916
954
8.%
9.06
9.13

BRITISH RINDS-Cftitd
1989

High Lon Stock I T M- ] vlVLl

Undated
45 Sl
40V
70
41
30 ,

291,

42% %nspls4pc.

38W Wai Loan 3>gpc8
Com. 3>2PC '61 Ah.

31 1* Treas. 3ot 66AH
26L jw5oLs2'ipc
261tifr*E. 2lipc

Index-Linked

43 ] J]
+1* 913 _

38%n +»f 9.03 —
i(i« 5.27 -

36 A 8.21 -

21% 4-lg 8.47 -

27& +*e 9.07! -

(fa)

re»2pclL "90184.6}..

DO. ZK' 928(97 5]...

|0o. 2 941102 91

00 2pe '9*167.91

Do2(,pc’01C78.3)....

Do. 2lj pc '03(78 B>...

Do. 2pc ‘06(69.5)

Do. 2i] pc '09(785)...

Do. 21] nc'U(74.fi).„
Do. 2‘jtpc '13(89 2). .-

Do.2(gec 1618161. .

Do. 21-pc -20<83 0) ..

(Do. 2>gpC'24K(97.71..

128% _

106]| A ?hf
98!>n - 1* 3 DC
144), *),

+A
3 22

1231, 3 42
1207, at

J*
3.4b
T4F

115 ,'S a +)g 3-K
120V •’ll 3.4<-

zoo,; +
*l 3.4t

108ft 3.4*

106,*. *h 3.4C
09 U *h 3 J71

(1) (2)1

272

365
3.62
3.58
353
3 49

Prospective real redemption rate on projected Inflation of (1)

10% and (2) 5%. (fal Figures in parrmnnes show ftPI base
mooUi for Indexing, He 8 momiis prior to issue) and have been
adjusted (a reflea reUastng of RP1 to 100 In January 1987
Conversion factor 3.945. RPI for August 1988 107.9 and for
March 1989: 1125.

INT. BANK AND Q’SEAS
. DrKll'tUZOiO .

DnBfcLO'tpcUZOO*-
—_lial3igpcZ010...
Da.llVpcLii2QL5 ....

Inv Bk llpc La 2002_,
Do. 10J,oc2004

DnBkl2bpc2003...
20150n.9(ancLn

lysia 10\pdji2009...
' Meric* Sates Mocaos

CORPORATE
102j 100{BVinMani 13i,pc 1939..

Ulb lOSbLDo.li'ypcZda
91 87igeLC6^pcl9W-92

124b 14 breeds 13 b pc 2006
33 3ojbverpool3bpclrred

94b 92jLCC6^pc‘88-90
30 2H^Do 3pC '20 AM-

107 b 104bRLmchBtreUbK2007._

100
124 ijm
lOSbs*w
U3

94b«i
Zlfil

10.67 10.60
10 16 10 14
10.81 1054
10 SO 10.43
1054 10.43
1058 103aU DO 10 58
1024 10 58
11.3a 11.45UM 13.80

N LOANS
100 bo ... .

106 b <2 *-1

87b )
120b a

3i«i

92b*
28 nl . ..

105bm

13 43 11.20
10 80 10.70
7.71 11.70

1120 10.94
1129
750 13.40
10.71
10.9U 10.80

COMMONWEALTH &
AFRICAN LOANS

AMERICANS

89b 86b KZ 7 « pc 1988-92 88b -U
206 2(M SRhodkbK Mou-Assul. 2di
84bl 84bTDo. 4bl>c87-92Asstd.. 84bd !

834 11.60

LOANS

Building Societies
I 9BJ3 lu'oiae Anglia 9 Kpc 8589_.
' “*“Po.B[|DC30.5 89

(PC 26 6.89

Jpc 17.7 89
L0C7 889
Jpc 298.89
, pc 18.9.89

g,pc 2.10.89
ipe 6.11.89
fpc4-U89.
!pe 2.1.90
Epc29.1.90...._.

j Da. 12 it pc 26.2.90
(lDo.3%pclLUi2021

WJJtfj+i

giw
99,',

ggV

M
is

*9;
99Jfl

igobM*b

It

5531 953

951 1353
8 97 13.02
9 87 1324

10.75 13.24
11.13 13.18
1163 13 22
12.43 1322
1237 13.21
11.90 13.20
1257 1320
12.86 13.22
1263 1319
12.75 13.19
4581 4.45

Public Board and Ind.
95|Agr)c. Mt_5pe'S9-39....| 98| ! 5.10j

45lMeL Wir. 3pc B‘„ I 46d .... I 6 53

FOREIGN BONDS & RAILS

10 41

Stack
iiW* 7 pc Ass

Do.6pc28Stb.Ass
Do4pc Mixed Ass
ung. "24 Ass
iydra Quebec 15oc2011.

'

ind 14bPt Ln 2016..
reland9bpc '91-96

On 9b Red.

Gran Yield

350 m.75
3 T7-50
2 >500

275 1357
15 00 10.90
1450 1157
9.751 10.65
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I

High Low I Stock !

33, ',1 2*>|lfit>Mxt LaBor»sriei|.l

5j7oI 361ptVA|leghm;&Wlc...i

15,*J 12iiUnu> 51 1

11*1 956piAmdahl 5c. (

32f 25bi4mer. CyaiwnriSS...!

19bi lA&lAmcr. EipreubOe.... I

12*1 854 plainer. Medical lit 5L I

20*! 15blAn*ritanT.&T.Sl..l

33bl 26 Abnieriuch SI
f

15 (il 9b)BdnlcA/nerluSlA..
'

25%l 19lfllBtnkersH.V.Sl I

48S|I 38‘jfBeli AilaniicSl I

26\l WblBcllSouth Corp I

15^1 12% IVBethlefwm Steel S3.

ll**l 92%feBio-Rad Labs A....

271|l 15blBowaterliK

id 9'4ferunsvilcl: 75c ...

33.1 1 2SJ,ICPCInuil. 25c

19bl 173,ICSXS1 1

798pl 333plctlifarnltEngy i

25bl 17
1+
fcampbril Soup 15C....1

22.11 15’bwUiabaUa S12'|. t

21b I lTlOinn. Banking Cgrpn... I

lbVl 13]2lChryslerS6>, I

17El 14ilCUJ«»1) SI . . .. 1

230 cl 162pfcltyFed Fin. Corp I

29&I 25(ilColgtte-PalniDlhKSl J

21b 167, tons Tr*iqhwyi*2br. |

14b 10 (i leant' I Bank Corp 54.. I

387 1. jJ 300oi*Ccroaair DtU Sutt..... I

386pl 278plCulHnetSftirelc ....I

24 b I 21,’jDantCorp SI I

10i;l 854plDau General I

32b I 28bl0un & Bradstreet SI. I

34>:l 30bl£aianCorpn.50c I

10 bl B^lEchllnlnc I

18 ,’J 16^lFPL Grhip lc
(

32 bl 27blF0rd MPUK SI I

35b! MftfcATX62be *

203.1 24blCen Elect *3c !

567 cJ 484plvGeneiJl Host CrepSL

221 1 IB bis I Ifette 51
769 pi blfaplfatAm F Iru. S«gs Bk SI

19fjl Ib.ifcreyfteundSlb

llbl S47p]HaibrQ Inc 50c . ...

flljl chfomeGroup SI I

43bl 326honeywriiSl'; 1

27bl 15blHoiston lnds.0 I

74bl 63,',ilBM Corpn 51 U .. . I

52pl 45pk*M9( SunotffLSfs 1c yl

23,(1 1 B(> knqmad -Rand SZ... .1

29 J,
I 22 blloclftted Crpn. SI I

IBAl 15,'jLonf Sur Inds SI I

20 -'il 17l
; lLoul5Uiu Land 15c. .1

15! UblLowesSOc I

21,(1 15/jMjmif. Hanover SI... I

17<l1 13 ,',IMbvIII Lynch SI ... . I

2253pIl910plMalek Inc I

23bl lBblMnrgantJP) S2b— -I

43b| 3*bhYKEXSl I

21 b» lBblPHHCani | I

244pl ZZOphfPtclIIc Agr | ....I

21raf lglPacificorr S3b I

221.1 ib^FacificTeiesislOc. I

18b> ISbiPall Corp. 25c I

50 il 39,*.fPriinzftil831/3c... .
I

21b I 17,‘JPreinartlntl I

33.1 1 2BbiQuiter0auS5 1

26 lil 23blfte0 NV Corpn S5. ... I

13 ‘J 11 [{biKkwell hnJ. S! 1

281.1 Zlb^outhwESIern Bell 51.1

23^1 l/.lbim Co. Inc. 51 1

267.1 22]]lrRWfnc.62bc I

19l 14 blTW Services S5 I

31,’. I 26blrennecoS5 1

32 bl 28fTexam S6 25 i

25 /,l 21blTexaslnur.Sl I

70 bj 58bmmelne 51 I

17 b* 15 AlTRI NOVA Corp. !

ZO.'.I IblUSXSl
Ib4pl 126plvUnllab

31b! 22 blutd. Technologies.. .

I58pl 123pWutllliechim:

38bl 31 bjUS Wtst|
28,’,

I 22bKvtsteMtia*anenSL
17(,l LJblWhJrlpcoi SI I

ml 16jilWhftmtnCorp I

31%1 28bivWoolworth S5b ...I

Price l+prl Du I hrbd

£ I - I Grass Icwlsr's

32(,id+^ I 51.201 -I 22
518pj +1 I 30d

<0tl

hlOd

51.201

84gl

7&j
. 5120
Ih52 92i

eod

I4bl+b
Hbd+b
34

i9.;d +*,

lTbl+b
204.1 **]

33ljl+b
15bl*b.

257,d+>l I S208I

48 S I +S. I 54 08l

261,1 +'* I 52.521

13bri+b I
-J

Ubl .. i A
16bJ + 1* I S1.12I

u/.xd *•,«. I 44d
33,’.I +b i Sl.bOl

195*1 +-b I SI. 241

633pl +1 i -I

24^1 +b t 92d
21 Led *,1 1 52.3*1

2*>;l +b » 52.721

u;id-b i 51.201

i7i;d +r, 1 si 4si

178cl +5 I 4<l

29,id*-,; liS1.43l

IBI3I .... I 9ftc!

14l —b I 8c!

334 pi . ..I -l

32Sd +8 I -1

24 1. 1 +b I SI bd
Ubl I -I

sibl+b I SI 7dl

34 all
.
IhSZOOl

10 bid *b I 70d
17)* ed -i I 52 20l

2Bbrf-b \ S3 Od
35,',1 + b I 52 Od

28b d+,’. ! SI 64)

503pl -8 I 28d

22^1 .
I 9bd

754 pi -31 1 bOd
18! -b I Si 32l

111 I l*cl

7Spxdf +b I 20c!

41b! -I, ] S2.10)

S2.96!

S4 84)

-I

17bl
*7bl*b
45pl

23 bm +b > SI 04i

27bd . . ..I Sl.bOl

17b*J -A I SI 90l

20bid +b I SI 00J

Ul +b I 48cl

2ll +A I S3 aS
17l *-b I si od

2009pl *4 I 3 2d
22bd+b I 51.66)

43b 1 *b I 54.041

21J -b I si.id
244pl ... .) 4

Zlbatt+b I SZ Mi
22 bl +b < SI 76!

lBlgl +b I 48cl

50,’.I -A I S3 ool

21 a! -A I 60d

33id+b 1 SI 20l

255,1 +|J
) 51.281

12bd I 72d

28b> +1« I S2 48)

23bl+b I 5180)

26bl -b I 51 72)

19l +b I 10d
31 *J +b I 53.04!

31,'ld -A l«S3 00)

23]id+bl 72d
70ijl+lAl Sl.OOl

16,’ariL I 64d
20/,l *-b I S140I

160pj
'

3Ibj+2b
138pl

38 bra *h
2Sbnl +b
17bl+b
J9b^+b

-1 34
-I 1.6

4 0.5

-1 22
-I 26
A 33
A 34
-I 31
-l 2-3

-1 47
-I 4.9

-I 5Jh

4 -

A -

A 39
4 22
4 2 8

4 3.7

4 -

4 2.2

4 bJ
4 7.4

4 50
~4 48
4 13
4 2.9

4 31
4 03
-J -

4 -

4 39
A -

4 32
4 34
4 4.0

4 72
4 6.2

4 33
4 33
4 33
4 25
-4 4.6

4 -1.3

4 09
4 15
4 2 9

410 0
4 4 2

4 -

4 2 6
4 3.4

4 b 3

4 28
19
9.1

34

4
4
4
4
4 44
4 54
4 3.1

4 -

4 7.0

4 46
4 15
4 35
4 17
4 21
4 29
4 33
4 51
4 4.4

4 38
4 oj
4 5.7

4 55
4 IB
4 0.8

4 23
4 40
4 -

4 3.0
4 -
4 5.8

4 1.0

4 37
. 4 2 B

31bl+lbl 51641 4 30
Continued on next page
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Global hm.Fd i $1023
VhgvcU TradingCara
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[

SIKH. 40
Frinfuml Gaunia.. .. I 11097.40

Kara Growth Trust
Hanagw:GWnretotal TnnriMpntC>
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KmdMngB: Kara,InertTnMtCiUd
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PFC Interoatf Portfolio Fd Moot LM
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BitancM Griwrth FA—
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Pacific Growth Find
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Parinter Bond Fond SA
HAV
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LJre«il<»Mow DM..JmU052 JUSSI
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Deal log areklyan llwniay

Unyds Bank Geneva Switzerland
Unyttliri'l Dollar 1104 70 109 10*
lAMsin'iEaraoe-.- SFiUtoo u**o
Ucymlst'l Growth. SWIL 10 22*0Qd
LlayOS lld.1 Income - Sf>2J£50 71100
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Ltayaslnt'l PkiIIC ... SFfZXUO NC<
UremknSnobfrCai... 11*21 1*86
London Portfolio Strviai pie

,
Las Port Did Cal Lid—I S9*AA I

MFM LM
MirtcreBHIAanH.|S141Sl 14151
Mprumen knl Boirt Fa.

.]
10336 10.744

MtrimnMMICrtftfd.
.
|2L724 22.795

MarismreUKFd IU-819 L819I

M & G (CaymreiJ Ltd

ArtaPreCinFO
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EtaserCthFdMV _.

DP Eon RcSfilB F0 MV
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$2 06 Z17

a
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04 1 10

147641 1
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I
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12*4.81
S3QS74
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OUMOV
137 44
SS7.11
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-.... *34
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The Portugal Fund Limited
Llmd* Bank Trust CanpiW.fChiaiKl llltadd Ltd
HAV Mar 31 T 1*3* I ....I

SM*HIPDW 10 20.

Protected Performance Fund
, ,

Ptrtormoocr Fund- . I ID 72 I _ I
‘ WrefcijrdN ling on Tnclire

Prudent laf Inti Financial Services LM
Hoi kora CurrwLy Food
Managed 5lrri log—

.

taoaged Dollar
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DU Damt
SWFr Dranll -
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—

CoMEaAsrilZ* —

.

(Accam UaiuJ.—

McDonnell & Co fBennodaJ LM
rko MogwAranrage—
McD Fin ArNunge

,

McO Futures |

McD DrtmilM
McD Bringmutar Fa...

McD N AmerCwllL—
UcDSasraGzdUriFd

—

McO Forex Fd.

115.6* 1*6*
soar 6 43
139-33 37 14
1*2-17 65.4S

000
_... 0 00—.. 178
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113.12 13 1M
099.9 100 2x1
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-0 04
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6 40

,
5*3

to 37
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121 60 22.68
SZ759 28.97
112.74 1338
117.21 18.07
1802 8.42
$1056 115a
S4 22 9*8
10 04 1054

McKtel^r AllsopPjRfek MjXnqi FwhJ

Mipom Fund Miigmt (Bermodz) Ltd
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Swllrecm 1 C4«

{
1

USDcUorCbS -I 1953 I —

I

Malacca Fund (Cayman) Limited
HAV Ad>2*-. ...___r 110.78 I 1

Mm (nteraationvl Fufares
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MUfTUUITED-fnC- $13 99
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imncToiJMremS- W»
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KESTREL UMITtD - £32M
Mediterranean Fond tSTCAVJ
HAV Aar 25-
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latmutienal FnM ... .1 1LD.56
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|
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*0.01
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- NM Rothschild Asset Management Limited
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Royal Trust North American Bond Fd
- HAV US$4 41
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Sabre Fund Mngt.LM

Taipei Fund
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NAV NT £2. 208.60 1 DR USS8247 «0r 271

Taiwan (ROC) Fund
HAVAbf28 NTS2.463 00 IDR Vain USS9ZJ16 34

Templeton Galbraith & Hansbener Ltd
GMflMI Inc Apr27. ... .1110 22 10.881 ...I

The Thai-Euro Fund Ltd

1 „ ..j _

Bflurjrw-i --1 -
The TballBnd Fund
HAVAW 28Biln 558.105 84 IDPoali* US521.90* 44

The Thailand Growth Fund Q 00 DIF
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£1 U«p-C4 449 _
15 000-C9 499.0 000-C49 944.
£50 OCO*

-.13 04

74 74 +0A7
IM *0 01 6 65
815 +004
10 93 *0 04
1036 -0.02

Orkitu Bahamas Ltd
Drew, CrtartJi F nae. !c8092 839011
OrtmnlHi KreFd. ..I07-W53 02H8I

PAM Fntnm Trading (Carman) LU
HAVAreZ*- • I SLQ40 84 I .

Value as at Jan 1987 100.00 10500
Sun Ufe Global Management Ltd.

Sobol Bred
jllB

. . J4009 95B4M -003
Cletal l.jll(n ?9T9

J0184
,01!

GhUUi Rtcnert . .9813 10538 *0 27
Hare* 44 62 100 hM -0 02
America* umrtC 107« 114.91 *0 7
Cremw.MrtG-w (0*70 114JJ *056
FreEtacGU . . 106.28 114 55 +0*4
JoAlaGl*. U2«2 120 71 *0 61
UKGrtMJi . U0J8 UBJ7e *0.55

: Bank Accounts
Cron Nei

I A/UHUlied Arab Bank Ud
97-101 Connrel Sf. LfloMo, EC4N SAD

Gr^h

OMNA 112 001*1 .

HICA l£2,tel**

™ 01-6296802
JlJIO 10 25] 14jarumli
112.50 4 70 1 13 64 1 kith

HOTES-Credf KM*w Ulnar reeropi from cunpotlig rale gf
101 hrt aoiul rate oner oeeuclun of CRT Gr £cut> CAR
C4U rttuiwltait Id bmi rrlr Uutu^n+vnpanfrt
annual rate lm Ci Imrnn irtrrtu onued

UNIT TRUST NOTES
Pr«« or* ID pr°c* orlrj otrer-li* indicated and Uwa;
demg'unrllalUu-aprrfurrieribUS eaUan. VtaiR *•
aildp, fbr ill Bnr'dil eraentK. Prit« jf certain alder
inuran:r iiRhea runt luDien u casual game Ul on
vaio hDirtr4»la>nfrwcf UKum, p Periodic Sramlanr
irairapM piam l Single snmium iwuame. i Gflned
Eric* i*iloe« ail ciktom ogem't unemivjon i
Prreian say l crite H Gueroj** gra» a SizmerdM. •Vme oeiore Join (at ' Ei-4uui ilium Kunlyaiiiluie
U c ni-noi.lt taiA 4 Yitln colimn vom onrauliuc
role, a! NiV mertau. tUa dividend C— I Fuedl ra! SIB
reigsnlMS.

I



20

CANADIANS
1*89

HU. Low
157b
23 Up
I3U
3b p Z\
2«b4l2V

W,
2,

12
655d

17
570p
12V
IT4i

997?

&
340

307b

15V
7BZri
186

14V

TO
IZ*4

41b,
511b

373*
401; d 18 ’4

653d
953s
572p
234b
330b
541, p

IT
71 _

12b
UlH
13V
28 >j

1|V

193d
12M
12b
20 U
42 V.

112pl

§23

183gl

129b
4'.

lowAn

229 (afl

524b
751
370p
192b
243
27bi

»7i13;

651
10b
34Bd{VI

"*
141,

599MH
lOZcW
lb3p|

85bOW

i°
7<

72V
3;
7,

16V
bUdV

73d*T,

Slock

jbABM Gold Carp
4V BWAMwi Eabw Coni.

.

tJ02ptoAmer Baindl (w.,.1
HUArrer. Lightwave |..

rtfArmeno
pWAslamerles Hldgtf..

VAuoimltg Enin
Bk. Montreal I

Bk rwwScotl
:

jyfiow Valleyl-

.WBrjscaoS

pjfBrtJVwiter Ret.

(Can.Imp B»fc|
'an. Pacific I

_ Do 4oc Oft £100 .

4c Central Capital 'A* |.

p fCoronJ C«n>

piComTVXMin
p vDarttf Mem. Sys.|

V PDerlai> Inds I

p rEcho Bar Mina
PECO Coro I

j Kj lactic Resources..

B Sandall Tech* Inc

DfGecdoroeRet
B Iranqes Eiplnl

ortl Pacific Res
pVGuli Canada!
FHawkerSId un|
Henljn Group
Hudson s Bay |
imperial Oil |

Srect
Inland NaL Gas 51..

Uidririoe Mine ...

WMincodwEioln ....

Nevada Goldfields..

a :
i PRio Alaon

»b RofjIBk Cm 1

p YSowa Lid Carpi'"

3d*5p Iral En^J..._
im Pure few. Carpi

[Toronto-- Dam Bt|..
Trans Con Pipe.

ISdptVamy Corel.

Price

E
131|

23V
12b
2 as
27bp +b
3055 +Z
21 Ut

wiS
136
174c -1

14 +b
nib -4
41 Ij

460b *9
386p +3
361p +15
21fi -1

65Jp +17
846c
410p +2
226(i +1

292p +15
37i,« +b
U7p -6

15p -Me

774C ......

12b
6091 +4
12* -**

27 +b
18U +b
684c +5
219c -1
177p +2
124p +1
12*,

20 bn *h
42* +b
89bP +3*
64p +2
90f +1
HU +b
au« +8
164pi +3

Oh
Gw

32x2]

wd
Slid
7&g
«v

LL75c
S0.07I

52i
51.08

60c
SI.80
sSO-8£

80C

S2ZDI
USSLIol

cv

BANKS, HP & LEASING
1989

High. Low
"27BJ

£12V

•a

£171;
3501

1051mu
*6floamI

3?

03]
42ffl

iS•D7! .

£16 $ £12,>1 Oat khk KBk Y50...
+£179- £156 > Deutsche Bk DM50
260 225 Pint NaL Fin lOn . 0
134 110 FHFCbJot MtalPlri »

tlbjV £15 Full Bank Y50
295 252 lemanJi Naotwal. p
139 113 Goode Durrani 5d. 8
131 118 faJimea Mahon lOp £

255 225 HarobrosZOo f
51 40 Hit AShing HKSZ50-

485 J70 Joseph 1 Leoltl. .y
140 131 KuqA Button 20p.y
344 277 Kfnoaort bmoonGrp

J

368 321 Liunis £1 t

48 40 Lo« Sent. Bank lOp.y
343 241 Midland U a

£15U £12U MiubMPii flank Y50
316 267 Mordon GnofNI £L f

335 274NoiAuSl.Bk.ASL.
629 510 Not West, a a

£210 £170 Ottoman Bonk
83 62 Rea Bros Group, y

•205 155 Rouncnild U> Hldjs.f

416 348 Borai Bk. Scotland . c

£135 £10* Samara Bank Y50....

175 124 StrrdtMrtju Bk UlIlL P
975 87D Schroders £1 y
775 655 Oo.a N/V «.y

£24 [J £19* Sec. Pacific 510.....

Slock
219AN25A1

.
241 Allied Irish ..

[£11* Algetnenr FI 10
Anglo Irish

75 AitfladwrlH.ilp.

(£58 A, B’calre Cie FrlOO..
K35U Banco Bilbao via. ..

£28 Sonco dr Santander

.
230 Bank Ireland IrU. (

(£17* Bank Leuini

350 Bank Lmml tU.K.1

88 Bank Scotland A
LU»i- Do.9UnelrrtPt..vJ

52 Bank of Wale..
*04 Banian £1 ...

28 Benchmark ZOp yf

334 Brawn Shinier £1. M
57 Bicinet Mart Tit

325 Cato- Allen El 9
201 Chancery -

JEW : Commenuk DM10.
£2: u Chon Hbk KrlOO...

234
523
352
123

•284
4651

“5671 500 Standard Otand. £Lo
£19':kl5U Sumitomo B*kY50
133 L-l 106 T58 1

lb4 TS8 Ch'oel Is’l

470 Union Discount £L.J
277 Warburg tS.G.i 9
98 OoftpcACnv Prf.y

232 Wenpac SAl—
443wlmnm 20p.

Hire Purchase,
485) 224lAnqlo Leasing lOp.y
42S 355 aF Yeoman 509.. y
95 51 KaonaiLeumhJJln
77 55 ^tUe-s(Mgs)10p..P
38 31 Equity & Gen 5pi-y

365 312 Pro*. Financial.. . p
168 100 *Ref lex Tntt. Ir5p..y

206 146 ieonTrunCre. Ip y
17U 127tWoodcteUrlK20p..yl

Leasing,
42ld

423!
92 +a
77 +1

33 -1
331 +10
166 +15
20*
1641

V etc.
F5.0| 6.6] 1.6] 18.4

4.6 2.4|l3 B
3-3 1.2| 26.2
4 5-4

1-7 711
• 7 -3

3.3 0.8
4 4.6

1.2

B1SA-.HUMm
is a

L0288%f
W7.09
QU*%!

4
100

36.9

9

BEERS, WINES
45

u
& SPIRITS

507 220 AlltaW-joitt .. . «
£22~« £17,* Anheuser-Busch SI.

97>* 7*73 Ban «
203 lbO Baddmgum B| 165
190 135 BulmrriH P )5o.. B 161
230 192 Burtomood Breweryl 23f
445 402 Clark (Matthew)... v 441
"34J 279De,eni«iU A)5o.J 299
253 210 Do4*pcb2MPt..y 223
242 205 KWioge.Pooe'A'SOo! 205=
455 385 +Fuiier STJt .. y 431
577 425 Grand Vnreo 50b. d 574
335 258 Grn?n ill wnitlev p 308
)6? 129 Oo 5 95ocCrPl£i. v 146
622 447 oreene king . .

. p 515
473 329 iuinneu . ..a 465c
137 102 Do BUpcCmPrf..., 136

£1+7 £119 Dn8>,pcCvin ¥ £162
23F 135 highland oitu 20b 3 234tt

'27rO.*,lW MjijiiaiHllMlirft y 2700
1 7« l335-.Mja»aid tlM» A' 1

J9l 45KF.ljnriii'ldBre*9r, V
2£'S I WiUjr.iun Thumpi«i 0

n'tJLitnrt.nii Wine. |
73(1 M 'IfAfirland . ..(
44d 2!>4l5--oll £ New 20p a"

P2-.'jV.vj, ijroup 10d
•V 29°IA hltbn-ao 4 .

494 41VA0I. A, D#d(m
6321 500fi cun? °aiw A WJ® d
474)1 4» Do Non V. 50p

4S9|
£22

1675
I4H
2M
383
726
300
290
371

H

ts

*13 Oj

23^
4.3

i6.5l

T3.1M
uiTq
93 5M

63 y
m3 a
15 Oj

7.23
5 95

,
,745]

«
12 B2(

,20
9
r2

,

m5 33
9 05)
19 l3
6 53j

rlO 55]

Si

2.7 3.G
- 1.7

3.2 3J
0 35

2.5 5 2

2.6 1.8

3 6 3?
3.9 16
252 Z.7
3.4 2.3

5.0 1.1

2.7 35
3.3 3.1

- 5-2
,3.4 1.9

A32 3 2

25 0 5 6
feflO 5 1

2 7 1.6
« 03

23 16
25 24
3.1 19
45 19
58 l 7

24 4 1

23 30
29 3 8
40 2 1

1.6 2 3
1 il 2.71

11.7

1Z9
•

10 5
28.3
1L2
21.9

16.4
239
13.0
121

200
12.1

31.0
9

36.6
21 2
219
161
124
13 2
16 9
116
15 5
32.7
27 6

BUILDING, TIMBER, ROADS

+* Wj+tV-BW H
lt*if.:rr.it:p

Z6CI JtrjHciiww
9K Tiertiw.ncn

46.-4 7:uiAM£C5Pp
n\- h9jLn e i; j Cm Cr P* .y
2i?j| lb^LAEor, . y
4hj| .-4>u4ii;iiaSre |0p 0

J>, u-.l . «
?4F] Ir7f*r«,iiie IOP y
30- 24** A>lriJ tmiq IDo v
40a 3F5;4r;»pr^ 5u . . P
121 lltlfTBMSSlOO . 1
377 21elliPS Inc. 50p . 0
2'.4 W+fe <<Hcr<dgr drlck..y
14; ’•I'lJr.JilPT 'Brnl lOp. y
J?0( ISOiB.liduin lOp y

eAu+VLamr Htm+t lOu 1

: Pry lOp . 8
1 0
;h lOp .. y

261] IRTjlii+kricv Grouo. 6
lOgP+it Or at 20o . y
305 Block lev* 2«Jo .. v
JigO'ur Circle £1 c
I!KCt-' 7',pe C> ko Pt

. y
JP+lDitHOn y
325|ar.iLA
122 k'.riti'Ji Dredging, p

1 5&j IC^Frr.in: Great, 0
120) lO^fiOuttuii 4uAlnlp.y
JJbl 125IC4LA 5p .. V
i*?:; tiOicSH p

iW*'»
5c 8

1 PiMem, lOcv

116, 7fr i+'or, iCh4rlrs) 5s c
101 14T Cairo? Ipp . y
765) J 7;, Canicr Group y
244i ISuCcpsoniF ,59. ...y
3£4 rsgc.'-iainCrauO . p
311 CjgCdu'nrr; ide Prn» 0
221 ::9Crnt NicMlOp. p
47 y.: p.'5*.r: Cr Cm ftl W y
91 JllCmion IPp y

143 9tij£rss5* tjjmek) 10b y
319* rbtJpnucutiB;®. Mi .[

36v 1 *£'>.'K Punion Group50 y
11

£5 2] 147x.SC50g y
45M yi^emena Niogj tap ..p

197] 101K-EMln Group 10p .y
107 83£'ilh .. .»
2i<\ 2l3fkn)Grcup . . . y
!4C 951.- S.fr+d 0
210f 155|Flirfin4r IQp y

277] rtMjFefl MouvngSp-B
°a rtf-inian Grou? Itta B

24S- ZUfr-FrwmjiGryBjltoy
Id tUfc.iilHOrp 5p D
2&q 262Fjit!K £ Dana lOp \
7bj 63[Po 'A" 10c .

. y
S2F1 S^OCiecvjn iMJ, 10O. y
1 ,J4| 160 Harriypi Indk lOp yiw lMkiHJtfieid Ests y
1521 lWHkwflre-Slujrt 10a |

EWSiJMIte lD3E -0>M..y
133] llOk-HrT^rbon 10o .,y

1 10]Do <9C Cm Cr Pf. y
6U:+iry 6 Croft 25s v

-baHrywaadWIIlijim fl

IDgDO Co* Prf y
iiyHier.4 Hin 8
1 3|How Gineo )0p y

.rn 45jH3»ars HMc Up y

IJd n-VriP5** JMnSM 8
} ,51 Wmn, Ame.? Con

llSpathonCrorelOo y

\Yi H3pjntU)5p
y

1 L3 BdyJrnningt AS 50

462 +5
110 +2
195 +2
390
45

231 -2
290 +3
395 -2
130
244 -1
197
133 +1
165 -8
78

202 tl
245 +2
73 ....

233

..

..

131
393

536b: .*

143 *1

135c .

375
I57C +3

117 +1
111 ..
145 *2
190. .

130 !
360 -i
112 ..

116.. .

165 .

715 +7
23b.

3250 -4
267 '1

216 +1
91
86+12

139 +1
319 +5
31

231 +3
45*.-C *1;

143 -2

11b ....

as -5
131 *3
201 +4
289 . ..

ID ..

.

235 *2
94

275*
63* .. ..

023 -5
193 +3
189 +2

146* . ..

£47C .

.

133 .. ..

129
91

295 +1

120 .

372o
. ...

103 +1
43

156*
127 +1
137 +2
145 -1

9fl+l

2a-.|4 9|3
4
1

6
2 V
5*43

39
OSOrJ

3 8

33| 4.

9iJJ

64
1 oj

m2 01

r7

*33
18

« Si 5.01 t 71

r22 ST\ 2~
12.0 lj|
20

111 16 2 I
,100 3. si

3 75 3 9
*3 5 10 ffl

3 fls 1 6|

7?-^1
3 75
,3.0 86]
6.0 zq
,4 3 3 a
L3 3 21]

,2 75 4 71

027 ?, 3
:*.e i.a
r»0 3 fJ

4.0 2.1
40 33

14 C 4.9|

11C
3.G

11 75a2d
3.15 LLU
7.151 3 9|

5i-«.

G1.6 l.li

« 0 7 1

,4 25 5 5]
,0 7b 3 3
40
1.7 3.8]

53
34 22}
KO 2.9|

4.50
tb3.4 6 4]

•4 5 13

ffl
2.76 4
2 76

ffl.14 7.9
6 85 2.7
3.C 6.5
2 75

010%
,3.0 24
7.C

3J8 3.7
UJ 3.1,

6 75
12.0
3 38
ti: 4 b
55 31

,15.4
2)10 6
57.7

75
114
21 0
00
19 6
20 4
12 0

86
70
53
65

21.4
•

94

14.1

12 8
72
128
101
13.7
‘7

12.0
12 3
86
66

29.0
97
7 7
78

44.7
98
4

11.6
4

7.0
4

10.0

122

9.3
4

116
9.9
133

*
*

128
98
92

16.8

*
75
83

13.7
25.3
9.3

BUILDING, TIMBER, ROADS -j

Contd

699|
111
182

•546
£106
135
193

•405
40

136
124
195
15E
245
308
157

•43.
324

81
283
155
352
*70

12C
206
315
164
368

•279
267
271
19(
309i

Price
,

£M2( +1

IlSi
ii3 +1

1989
Low Stock

£144 a29 jfarjeCcp FLOQ
370 275 Lalng (Jofcal 6
405 285jUumU)U v
157 121 Lawrence (W.) 0 -

160 127 DoaJocCnHPtEl 155

U

67 48U alley IF.J.C.) 12>jp{ 65V
103 tfiian.&CMeilde y
275 214 Lordl (Y. 4.) 8 267
366 297 McAlpIne (Alfred'. 0 365
407 334 McCarthy& Star* 20p f 351
•315 305 McLaughlin 4 H...y 30Bb
313 178 Magnet. 0 29L
103 68 Dais, bc« 2011 , y 89)

240 194 Minder, IHIflgV...

192 141 Mar ley «
274 228 Mania I Is t

113b WloftbB&CmfcdPfy
124 101 Maundcrl U.XZOp. £
473 344 Merer me .. ..0

257 151 Miller iSun)10p..v
458 344 Mowlem IJ) t

IOC 69 ASM lOp -B
96 76 Weedier Group |..v

2063 18S6 Hewarthlll £1
211 160 Newman-TonB....
•197 139 Pettlrnmon 10p....

91 TOPhoolUTIntter. ..H

145C 1025 Pochins

157 113 kplyploelOp.
jj171 140 Prmnisg 20p. n

50; RMC ... 3
82 Ralne Inds 10p....d

140 +Ramus W
4IS Redtoml —
£89 asartC* 7>*c.& IS. . -l£103 (’

+b

lOflEflwkef iop ... y( 13^ -.

134 Rogby Group I IBS +1

323 Rush A Tompkins., y 377 -3
31 +SWP Grouo 5p. V >9

118 kSandeHGtoup Up y I>6
SbiSnofleM-ReewlOlY UW
150Snaree&Fisw....y 16jJ +9
143+Snenff Hidgs.Spy
144 tGhnrco Grp 9
2U Slndall lWm> 5p— v
128 Smart CJ ) lOp y
327 Steel 'ey l 414n..
226 Tarmac 50p n 31* -1
92 Tay Homes y

566 Taylor Woodrow... o
342 Tilbury Gran V
70 fTorex Hire 1O0 .y
232 Tran, PerUm lOp - y
il7}Tiidof20g
281 Turriff Corp I
51 TywmlOp a
98 HftwrftmGm spy

149 vihraplani5o v
160 Word Group Su y
103 Ward Hldgi Up 0
320 Waits Blake t

205 Wstbory lOp B

B
igginsCrouo ... S
'lianBtwoenlOc.ffl

ihontComi'y, -H
Impey IGro) 0

133 ....

622b -5
460b +5

81 -1
237 +5

155a
331.. ..

70 +1
116 +1
199 +1
311 -11
136 +5
331 -1
263 +3
261 +1
254 +1
182
2841-5

218
166
265
111 -

214
437 -1

253 ...

421b +3
96 ...

.

96s +1
2045 . .

210 *2
162 ....

72 -1
1425]

153

6Mb9"*6
109)
isa ..

.

5341 -2

Ok,

Net

"1
7 5|

Si

9y
.64

5.7
6 65
lb.L
5H
59-

».
5c
6 3..

£>— 5]

3is]

9
4.

19
F3.

09|
si5.q
as)
5.0

Si
l£L

*iih

t7 0|

u M®
lO’VV

S3
,12 53
RO 3
L4 4
2.75
o4.0

15.25.
4.5
50

d5.S

11.5
10 0

thS67
is.:
16.5.

u2.2|
aBq
6.3

111!

L3.51
,2 3.

5.

<)
2.y
7.4]

*i6.73
3 a

9.^1

hna
Grt PfE
1.6 U
,46 b

4.1J3J 9.

hi
'll 9J
3 3 10
5.9 10 8
3 0 B
3.9 JO
3.2 15
8.1

3 4 lb
5! 9^
3 6 102
7.8
37

19
5f
3.3
8.4

3.6
3.5

ss
,

Z.7

iflZJ

3.3

1.3

1.5J
59
3.9|
b.8

M33
4i}

13J
6.
7_I

6.9

19 3
3.7l 10.3
28128
3 7
51

7.

a

3.a
3.n
4

4j

4 3^13
3. LI

12.6

9^
9.9

in
11.
255

3.3
4.4
2.7]

2 2
5.1
3.7,

4.4]

2-B33
4.0
3.314.7
4.eJ

5^
4.6)

127

145
10.6
a
6.

14

3?
nil_
22 14.

I
6.5
118
138

0
8.7

CHEMICALS, PLASTICS
£43A(£40,i|Aluo FI 20
360 275 A Mda Moldings
143 119 Allied Collate lOp ..
63 56 Mm* Plastic Tec* lc.ri

552 491 Amersnam imj
1671} 110 Astra Hlta- -fl
£96,’. £341, BASF AG DM50....
155 124 BTP lOp

£97U £87V Boyer AG DU 50
198 159 BUgden lads

tl

159 122 Brent ChenrslOn.0
‘4681 305 Cairo Group lOp .5
-- 25 Kudrtdgr house lc.ri

275( 197 Canning (WJ 0(
223 Chemny Inti. J Op y(

319 Coalhe Group a
289 Coats Bros....

“

169 Croda im. lOp
69 Doe,In lOp.. .

2l3

Pi94
|£12%

|

453]

204?
201

J

614

£25 b)
183]

17a

itg

163)EHl5 & E*erard..^H
£9,1 tngemard U5 SLdv.

,

23 European Cofonr 5p..yf
169 Evode Group
233 Foseco ...„
123 tGaynor&oop Up. y

,

244 taliteadfJ.} IOP.. y
t24 k Hercules lnc|

ri9S Hickson Inti

£8911 HoecBsiAG DM50.
- 'EM Do.Rn 10pctln.La_.

1247)1012 Imp. Own £1 oj

173 fcJeyes Group 5p

,
Inds. 50c..a

225 Leigh fnteresis 5p H
173 5o 6pcCy.lfcd.Prf
136 llTM5p
612 MoutcUsao ADR

£21 U Now, Inds. '8* Kr.20.
£22'j PmiarpAB 'B'SklO
140 Plyju _,...y|
lib HWr2p.
44 tuBom(WmJ100..Yt

314 tehem EnySemTpw
227 Remakll lOp pf

11774 ScherlngAG DM50
12b stclIHeSpNkitwn 1]
4b nwrgar Bardet Up. yj
68 JTransrap lOp y|
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Beirut ceasefire begins with uncertainty
By Lara Marlowe in East Beirut and Andrew Gowers in London

AN ARAB League-sponsored
ceasefire took effect in Beirut,

the Lebanese capital, at noon
yesterday as Christian and
Moslem leaders agreed to re-

open all seven crossing points
between East and West Beirut
However, as the Museum

Crossing, one of the main tran-
sit points for commuters, was
opened by army troops, the
prospects for further progress
towards a lasting truce and for

the lifting of transport block-

ades by both sides remained
uncertain. It was also unclear
when or where the observer
force agreed to this week by
the Arab League would deploy,
or which countries would par-

ticipate.

At an emergency meeting in

Tunis on Thursday, Arab
League Foreign Ministers
called for a ceasefire and for

the lifting of blockades. This
followed six weeks of often
intense artillery battles
between Christian forces on
the one hand and Syria and its

Moslem militia allies on the
other, which have left nearly
300 dead In and around the
Lebanese capital.

Yesterday. Genera! Michel
Aoun, the Christian army com-
mander who is one of Leba-
non's two rival prime minis-
ters, said he had authorised
the reopening of Beirut airport,

which has been closed since
mid-March, and of the ports of

Guinness plans joint

sale of United Glass
By Andrew Hill

GUINNESS, the UK drinks
group, and Owens-Illinois, the
US glass container-maker, are
to sell United Glass, one of the
largest manufacturers of glass
packaging in Britain.

The sale could realise more
than £160m in total for the two
companies, each of which owns
half of United, although some
observers believe the business
could be worth up to £190m.

Yesterday's announcement
that a buyer is being sought is

the latest development in a
wider shake-up of the Euro-
pean glass packaging industry,
which experienced a downturn
in the early 1980s with the
increasing popularity of plastic

containers. Concern about the
environment means the more
easily recycled bottles and jars

are enjoying a renaissance,
however.
United, which supplies the

food, drink and dairy indus-
tries, operates some plants ded-
icated to supplying Guinness,
probably the biggest buyer of
bottles in the UK.
The group, which produces

6m glass containers a day. said
it would retain the lucrative
Guinness contracts, which
accounted for about 30 per cent
of its business.

Guinness said the sale of its

United stake tied in with its

recent strategy of focusing on
the core branded beer and
spirits business, while Owens-
Illinois now prefers to sign
technical agreements with
European partners.
The US group has been sell-

ing its equity stakes in Euro-
pean glass companies since it

went private in 1987.
The most recent evidence of

the remoulding of the industry
came last autumn, when PLM,
a Swedish packaging company,
bid successfully for United's

rival. Redfeam, the third larg-

est UK glass packaging group.
United's other main UK com-

petitor is Rockware Group,
which also has about a third of

the glass container market.
Mr Shaun Dowling, United's

chairman and a Guinness
director, said yesterday he had
compiled a list of about 25 pos-

sible buyers, the majority
based outside Europe.
Monopolies considerations

would rule out a sale to Rock-
ware. and the European Com-
mission might oppose a merger
with Saint Gohain on the
grounds that the French glass

group already has 25 per cent
of the European market. A
more plausible European
suitor would be BNS, a French
food and drinks group which
earns about a sixth of its turn-
over from the manufacture of
glass containers, although Mr
Dowling said industrial groups
would also be interested.

Guinness acquired its stake
in United when it bought Dis-

tillers in 1986. The drinks
group then sold its own glass-

making subsidiary Canning
Town Glass to United for £10m,
consolidating the bottle-mak-
er's position in the shrinking
UK glass container market.

In the 1970s and early 1980s,

United was badly affected by
problems of over-capacity and
competition from plastic pack-
aging, losing £l4.4m before tax
in 1983, following cuts and
redundancy costs.

Since then United has dis-

posed of several peripheral
businesses and should be in a
position to announce pre-tax
profits of about £19m for 1988,

on sales of £150m.
United's owners have

retained Morgan Stanley, the
US investment bank, to con-
duct the sale for them.
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Joimieh, Beirut Tripoli, Sidon
and Tyre.

He refused to say whether he
would allow ports just south of

Beirut which he has accused

Moslem militias of using for

the smuggling of drugs, weap-
ons and contraband, to reopen.
But he implied that he would
not stand in the way of the
Arab League force if It were to

take responsibility for opening
the ports. It was a blockade of

these harbours by Gen. Aoun
starting on March 6 that
sparked off the latest round of

shelling.
If the two sides agree to end

maritime blockades, Beirut
will have returned to the
uneasy raim which existed

before the latest flare-up, but
Lebanon will be no closer
towards resolving its

deep-rooted sectarian prob-
lems.

Both Gen. Aoun, who has
beat waging a strident cam-
paign to eject Syria's 30,000-

plus troops from Lebanon, and
the Syrian regime and its

proxies have made minor con-
cessions to enable a consolida-

tion of the ceasefire. Gen.
Aoun said: “It is not a solution

but it is a step towards a solu-

tion.

"

The precise deployment of
the observer force remains in
dispute, with the Arab League
apparently aiming to place it

on tvip green Un* dividing th**

RUM and
Goodman
discuss

merger

Enterprise Oil deal

on assets challenged
By Steven Butler

By Chris Sherwell
in Sydney

EXPLORATORY talks on a
compromise merger are under
way between advisers to Rank
Hovis McDougall, the British
food group, and Goodman
Fielder Wattle, its Australasian
counterpart.
The discussions follow

RHM*s £1.33bn bid for Good-
man Fielder this week and
reflect both the commercial
logic behind the two groups’
ambitions to own each other
and the recognition that
neither is likely to succeed
without the other's agree-
ment.
Yesterday Elders IXL, the

brewing and agricultural-
business conglomerate which
controls 10 per cent of Good-
man Fielder, confirmed that it

did not want RHM to take over
Goodman Fielder and would
prefer a negotiated settlement.
Mr Pat Goodman, chairman of
the target group, will also
resist selling his significant
stake.

On the other side, Goodman
Fielder retains a 30 per cent
holding in RHM from an abor-
tive bid last year, and Elders
could also build a stake in
RHM to help defend Goodman
Fielder.

RHM yesterday submitted
details of its takeover proposal
for approval by the Australian
Government's Foreign Invest-
ment Review Board (FERB),
which has one month to make
a decision.

Goodman Fielder will also
make submissions in defence
- pointing to the prospective
loss of Australasian control of
key elements of the food indus-
try. If RHM's bid succeeds,
much of Australia's bread and
margarine industries will fall

under British control.
Goodman Fielder has been

careful, however, not to rale
out the merger option - hot
least because that is what it

was seeking last year. Signifi-

cantly. it would prefer to
achieve this without the inter-
vention of Australia's regula-
tory authorities, the FIRB and
the Trade Practices Commis-
sion. the country's anti-trust
agency.
An RHM stock market raid

on Goodman Fielder on Mon-
day took it to the maximum
allowable 1-L9 per cent, and the
group now needs permission
from the FIRB to go higher. If

it reaches 20 per cent, it pro-
poses to make an offer of four
RHM shares for every 11 Good-
man shares or, alternatively,
£1.236 cash for each Goodman
share.
On Wednesday, Goodman

Fielder rejected this offer as
totally inadequate on both
price and conditions.

A BATTLE broke out over
Slbn of UK oil and gas assets
yesterday when British Gas
and Amerada Hess of the US
intervened In a deal reached
earlier by Enterprise Oil,

Britain's largest independent
oil company.
The two companies served

formal notice that they would
exercise pre-emption rights
that could potentially thwart
part of Enterprise's $1.4bn
(£828m) agreement to purchase
the oil and gas assets of Texas
Eastern, the US pipelines com-
pany recently taken over by its

competitor. Panhandle East
era.

Enterprise Ofi, however, dis-

putes whether the rights have
any validity, raising the possi-

bility of a battle in court if

negotiations foil to produce a
compromise agreement.
The disputed rights derive

from a 1965 agreement between
Amerada Hess, British Gas,
Amoco, and Texas Eastern,
which formed a group to
search for UK oil and gas.

Parties to the agreement
were given rights to purchase
shares of the UK subsidiaries

of these companies, should the
subsidiaries be sold for the
same price at which the sale

agreement had been readied.
Texas Eastern sold its world-

wide oil and gas assets to
Enterprise on March 1 for
gl.4bn and invited its partners

to consider exercising their
pre-emption rights on the safe,

which covered only the UK
subsidiary valued at $961m.
However, the case is further

complicated because while
Enterprise Oil disputes the
validity of the rights, it consid-

ers itself party to these rights

should they turn out to be
valid. This is because Enter-

prise Oil was initially formed
from the oil assets of British
Gas, which were hived off

before the utility was priva-
tised in 1986.

Enterprise also exercised its

pre-empted rights yesterday,
saying that It did so “without

accepting that pre-emption
rights exist, bat to protect its

own position."

Mr Sam LaidOaw, managing
director for Amerada Hess in
the UK. said however that it

was questionable whether the
British Gas rights had in fact

been transferred to Enterprise
along with the assets and that
this was a question for British

Gas and Enterprise to work
out.

He said Amerada Hess and
British Gas would he flexible
and hoped to reach an amica-
ble compromise with Enter-
prise to include agreement on
shares of Texas Eastern North
Sea, the UK subsidiary, to be
held by each of the companies,
interim management arrange-

ments for the company and
eventually a method for divid-

ing the assets between the
three companies.

Enterprise was not prepared
yesterday to spell out its

grounds for disputing the
rights. The shares in assets
held by the companies today
are far different from those
when the agreement was origi-

nally reached, although Mr
Laldfew said that the claim
over Texas Eastern North Sea
shares would be determined by
a complicated weighting of
shares in various assets cur-
rently held. This had been
agreed with British Gas.
Texas Eastern is understood

to have been advised that the
rights had no current validity.

Enterprise indicated its

Intention to proceed with the
deal yesterday when it said
that a second tranche of its

rights issue would be called at
IXOp per share at least The
rights issue was structured in
two tranches to take account
of the preemption possibility.

Enterprise held out the pos-

sibility for compromise, saying
that it recognised Amerada
Hess and British Gas were
interested in acquiring assets

and would be prepared to con-
sider spiling assets in its own
portfolio.

Dons’ pay Continued from Page 1

provision in the last pay settle-

ment for differential payments
to professors of outstanding
merit or in disciplines with
recruitment problems.
Oxford agreed last year to

introduce merit payments of
up to £7,500 on top of the pro-
fessorial rate of £26,905.

However, Oxford dons are
due to debate in the Congrega-
tion, the university's govern-
ing council, a call to reverse
that decision on Tuesday.
The attempt to return to a

single professorial rate at
Oxford has angered Ministers,
who see it as inconsistent with
complaints about the brain

drain.

Ministers believe universi-
ties could increase salaries for
a small number of professors
to as much as £45,000 If they
used the flexibility elements of

,

the latest offer and of the pre-

vious settlement to the fdlL
Moreover, they are deter-

mined to use next year's uni-
versity pay settlement to
advance still further a market-
based system of pay in the uni-
versities. They already foresee
a repeat of this year's pattern,
in which they provide the
employers with extra funds
that will be partly earmarked
for flexibility payments.

Borrie orders broader inquiry
into the net book agreement
By Raymond Snoddy

SIR GORDON Barrie, Director
General of Fair Trading, has
ordered a more wide-ranging
investigation into the net book
agreement, which allows pub-
lishers to set minimum prices
for the sale of most books.
He said yesterday that his

office had decided to extend its

inquiries because of what it
regarded as conflicting evi-

dence. A decision on the
arrangement has been prom-
ised by the end of July.
The net book agreement, one

of the last remnants of resale-

price maintenance, was exam-
ined by the Restrictive Prac-
tices Court in 1962 and again in
1968. On both occasions it was
found to be in the public inter-
est.

The court argued that if it

were eliminated there would
be fewer bookshops, a reduc-
tion in the number of books
published and a rise in book
prices.

Sir Gordon said yesterday,
however, that there had been

great changes in both book
publishing and selling since
1962.

“The most important ques-
tion under the law - and the
burden of proof Is on me - is

whether these changes would
lead the court to take a differ-

ent view now of the effects of
ending the agreement. I have
received conflicting evidence
on a number of points,” he
said.

Under the terms of the agree-
ment, members of the Publish-
ers’ Association and other pub-
lishers are allowed to set a
cover price for most books and
to ensure that booksellers in
genera] do not sell below these
levels.

Mr Terry Maher, chairman
of the Pentos retail company —
which owns Dillons and is a
leading campaigner for aboli-
tion of the agreement - said
he believed Sir Gordon's deci-
sion marked “a big step for-
ward."
Mr Maher had already maHp

clear his intention to breach
the agreement unilaterally
some time this year. Yesterday
he said he did not rule out
doing so before Sir Gordon
made a decision.

Timing of any action by Pen-
tos will dearly depend upon
the level of support it receives
from large publishing compa-
nies, several of which favour
the current arrangement
The company’s caution

stems in part from the public
declaration of support given to
the agreement by WJL Smith,
the UK's largest book retailer.

Smith has it dear, how-
ever, that if the agreement is

breached it will compete vigor-
ously on pricing.

Whatever Sir Gordon
deddes, Mr Francis Maude, the
Department of Trade and
Industry minister responsible
for competition policy, has said
the agreement wifi be one
trade practice that will be
looked at under planned legis-

lation on restrictive practices.

LONDON BRUSSELS NEWYORK
01-2513339 02-2191607 (212) SB 1570

two halves of the capital, and
Gen. Aoun insisting that the
observers should be close to

the heavy artillery positions
from which Syrian forces have
been pounding East Beirut in

recent weeks.
Gen. Aoun declined to offer

any plan for a longer-term
political solution beyond reiter-

ating his call for the removal
of foreign forces from Lebanese
soiL Sheikh Sabah al-Ahmad
al-Sabah, the Kuwaiti Foreign
Minister who was Instrumental
in securing yesterday's truce,

is due to discuss possible ways
of building upon it with Mr
Javier Perez de Cuellar, the UN
Secretary-General, in Geneva
today.

The cost of losing

Mr Monk
On the face of it, the offer
document for Gateway pres-

ents the institutions with a
simple proposition. Warburg
does a brisk and effective
demolition job on- the com-
pany's record and prospects;
and though nothing Is said
about what will happen after

the initial asset-stripping exer-
cise, the Isosceles consortium
would argue that since it is

paying cash, what it proposes
to do thereafter as - a private
company is Its own concern.
The problem is the old one of

institutional responsibility. By
proposing to put its faith in the
existing line management.
Isosceles is implicitly saying
that Gateway’s failings must
be wholly the fault of Mr
Monk. But even if one swal-
lows that, the answer for the
owners is surely not to send
the company to the breaker's
yard, but to sack the man in
charge.
Given that no single institu-

tion seems to own over 1 per
cent - leaving aside AB Foods’
15 per cent stake - the coor-
dinating mechanism may not
exist. But the Isosceles plan
consists of selling Herman's
while it is in disarray, and get-

ting rid of the superstores -

FT Index rose 4JS to 1,7504
North Sea to be worth fighting

about so many years later. Not
only is it doubtful whether
such rights still exist at all, it

is also uncertain whether they

belong to British Gas, or were
passed to Enterprise when it

was floated. Enterprise dis-

putes the very existence of the

pre-emption rights, while Brit-

ish Gas argues that the agree-

ment holds, but that Enter-

prise has no rights under it

whatsoever.

those in the bidding for .Bee-

chum's cosmetics business, for

example, must look to their
sums.

the growth part of the business
— while retaining the odds— while retaining the odds
ends. The institutions might'
also reflect that if the price
they are being offered for Gate-
way is partly financed by Asda
paying too much for the super-
stores. so much the worse for
their holdings in Asda.

Indeed, the break-up pro-
posal goes further again. The
Gateway store portfolio is a
curious mixture of the enor-
mous and the very small, and.
Isosceles aims to concentrate
in the middle. This would
involve selling off two thirds of
the 600 stores initially
retained, and trading up to
forger premises. The question
is not whether Gateway is
awkwardly constructed as it

stands: it is whether haodfog it

over to a debt-laden consor-
tium for quick resale repre-
sents the best long-term return
to its owners.

But in horse-trading terms,
Unilever would appear to have
come out better than Mr Sfldls.

Until the recent past, big take-
overs were not a part of the

.

Unilever culture, and even
now, the group . has shown
Itself distinctly reluctant to
pay over the odds. So, for
instance, it lost Rich&rdson-
Vicks to Proctor & Gamble,
secured Chesebrough Pond’s,

and baulked at KKR’s terms
for the Hunt-Wesson division

of Beatrice. It has thereby
secured a useful reputation for

strategic parsimony; while Mr
Riklis, whose variation of
terms at the last minute
proved too expensive, will have
weakened his reputation as a
seller. It also looks. rather a
misjudgment to put Fabergd
back on the market at a time
when the Beecham business -
not that much smaller, and
very similar in character — is

on the auction block as wdL

However, as neither ride has
any desire to go through a long
and costly legal case, a negoti-

ated solution seems likely,

while the bluster from both
sides suggests the starting

points are a good distance
apart, agreement may be possi-

ble on dividing the shares,
with a view to sharing out the

assets at some point Enter-

prise is in a hurry to get it all

sorted out, as it must decide on
the exact size of its rights call

by the end of May. Its state-

ment yesterday that the second
call on the issue will be at least

llOp suggests it has no inten-

tion of letting go altogether.

British Gas'

Unilever
The last-minute collapse of

Unilever’s agreement to buy
Fabergd may hot be'disastrous,

but it is distinctly vexing for
the company. Only weeks ago,
Unilever was saying that its

ambitions in personal products
were broadly fulfilled for the
time being, and that its atten-
tion was therefore switching to
the food industry and the Far
East. The assumption must
now be that it is back in the
market for a replacement, and

Having put up with others
spoiling its deals, British Gas
is now spoiling someone rise's.

The result, however, may he.
strangely similar: the upshot of
yesterday's last minute inter-,

ventibn in Enterprise's bid for'

Texas Eastern’s North Sea
assets may well be another'-
Bow Valley-style shareholding
stalemate. * •-*

:

British Gas wants to own
these assets itself, but foiled to
outbid Enterprise in the action
earlier this year. It is now seek-

ing to get them by activating
an aged pre-emptionagreement
on the shares in Texas Eastern
North Sea, drawn up when
nobody believed that there
would be enough off. In the

Guinness
Guinness’s derision to sell

off United Glass looks like a
last forewell to diversity, at
least as the company now
defines it Since announcing a
couple of years ago that it was

. reverting purely to the. drinks
industry, the group has dis-

posed of £5Q0m worth ofassets,
. ranging from, newsagent and
chemist drains to .the old Dls-

tfllers carbon dioxide business.

More precisely, it is now con-

cerned with expensive brand
names: besides its recent
excursion into Louis .Vuitton
luggage. It still has the Gle-

ueagies hotel, Champneys
.'. health forms, and - somewhat
further down market - the
Guinness Boofeof Records.

United Glass looks an ungta-

morous remnant by compari-
- son. Nearly half its business
consists of spirits and beer bot-
tles for Guinness itself, and
much of the rest is in the
declining market for milk bot-
tles. No attempt has been made
to diversify into plastic; and
white profits, at £!9m before
-interest," are stone £3m higher
than a couple of years ago, the
glass business showed itself in
the early 1980s to be horren-
dously cyclical Still, this is

one. of the. clutch of European
glass container makers which
rank equal third after Saint
Gobain and BSN .of France.
With luck, Guinness might col-
lect a handy half share of
£Z50m on the deaL
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Trying to

break free
On Cupfinal day, Nick Garnett describes
the gritty reality ofprofessional rugby

HREE MILES from turn-off 32
on the MB2 cross-Pennine
motorway lies a small commu-
nity stillT wty still suffering a nastyA hangover from the social con-

vulsions of 1960s Britain. Past new,
slab-sided and windowless warehouses,
through neat fields of mustard crop, along
by the edge of the Ackton open-cast coal
mine where gargantuan dump trucks pick
their way across elevated roadways, the
A639 slides down into the township of
Featherstone.
A long strip ofred-brick terraced homes

with a single crossroads, Featherstone is a
mining town with no mine, the pit shov-
elled into history after the 1984 strike.
Consumer-boom Thatcherism has sidestep-
ped Featherstone. Jobless men push prams
with their wives on a mid-morning week-
day. A huge video simp caters for the
enforced idle. Small shops sell cheap brio:

'

a-brac on flimsy pavement-side tables. A
two-bedroom unmodernised terraced
house is for sale in the BaWfint Building
Society window for £7,000. The poster at
Big Time Bingo says: “Win a holiday hi
Caister (half board), tickets 45p.”

In Featherstone, the facet erf life that has
not taken an dhow in the face is rugby
league: northern cultural oddity, vibrant,
nationally televised sport, and a focus for
the parochialism, class-riven bitchiness
and regional divisions that still ding like a
limpet to sport and society in Britain.
Housed in a neat little ground at the

bottom of Post Office Road, Featherstone’s
gates have doubled in the past year to
more than a third of the town’s population
of 12,000. “Featherstone hasn't got much
else left other than the Rovers,” says club
secretary Terry Jones. “It's the centre of
everything.” Last weekend, the little club
knocked tdg-spending Leeds out of one of
the game’s major dips.

Mineralised to fHl half of Featherstone’^

.

first squad, bodies musded from working
at the coal face, clothed in the dub's
antique-style blue-and-white hooped strip.

“All you had -to do was shout down the
mine shaft and -they would send up a cou-
ple of forwards in the shaft cage," Jones
recalls. Those days-are buried. Only two
face workers from the' big drift mines fur-
ther north tax £ne>ctab,

s. books.
'

The town remabB&bBvatthdess, a bastion
of small-scale northern HXt portrait in
This Sporting Life, David Storey's abrasive

novel about mghyleague.
Across the Famines, Wigan; the game's .

richest team - they play St Helen’s in
today's Wembley final - has the jaunti-

ness that comes with big gates and big
money. Players are arriving for training at
Central Park. A white Audi coupe with
special body kit swoops into the dub car
park. A large man, not tall but with a
massive upper torso draped in leather
bomber Jacket, steps out and walks, nim-
ble-footed, to the dub entrance. Behind
Miami Vice sunshades he nods to some
autograph hunters and disappears Into the
clubhouse. Adrian Shelford, a distant
cousin of W&yno Shelford, the New Zea-

l-eft: Martin Offiah, the “fastest
thing In football boots." Above:
Wigan v Wldnes. League Is no
longer a brutal type of forma-
tion mugging played by beer
barrels

land All Black rugby union captain, is one
of a large number of highly-paid Antipo-
dean mercenaries in British rugby league.
Like so many of them. Shelford’s dusky
skin testifies to the cauldron of inter-race

breeding in the South Pacific, a mass of
Tongan grandfathers. Aboriginal great-
grandmothers, Maori fifth cousins.

Clad in blue, skin-tight speed suit, Shel-

ford cruises through his training schedule.

Halfway through. Wigan’s black captain,

Ellery Hanley, arrives late, a brilliant nat-
ural footballer, with the classic thick-
tfrtghed, narrow-ankled legs of the trader
in strength, and speed. Hanley rehearses
manoeuvres for the following day’s game,
disdaining even to shed his designer track

suit, and leaves the field with a swagger.
The Leeds-bom player is on a £60,000-a-

year contract with Wigan, plus sponsor-

ship. He will earn £3,000 a match playing

in Australia during the short close season.

The News of the World has just done a
number on the Wigan star concerning a
certain disputed paternity suit "I’m sorry

but Ellery is not talking to the press,” says
Maurice Lindsay, Wigan’s short, ebullient,

millionaire chairman

Wigan spent £lm on big-name players

between 1984 and 1986. A car park and
training ground is bring sold to developers

for 22.5m, the money to be ploughed back

into a new stand, private boxes and corpo-

rate entertainment suites. But money does
not always save reputations.

Vaselined up, legs rubbed down with oil,

lightweight body armour strapped to
chests, Wigan trot out onto the field at
Widnes the next day and suffer a right

pasting. The Cheshire chemical town
retains the championship in front of a
capacity 18.000 crowd. Martin Offiah, a
black speed freak with a small head
perched on a bull neck atop a long sinewy
frame, buries Wigan .with his eighth haj-

.oved

league and the physical appearance of the
.semi-professional players who ply their

trade in it Once a brutal type of formation
mugging played by beer-gutted barrels

with a few light-legged greyhounds thrown
in, it is now a game of constant move-
ment Forwards are shorter, lighter and
faster, the slow-moving tubs killed off as a
species. The backs have got bigger, devel-

oping upper bodies like forwards. Two of
Wigan '5 sprinters weigh more than 16
stone.

trick of tries of the season. Rather unlove
by the mrirm hierarchy as an amateur
player at Rosslyn Park, London, Offiah

has taken two seasons in rugby league to
become the world’s most devastating fin-

isher, his tries always topped off by a
crowing, arm-raised appeal to devoted sup-

porters.

“Offiah has some weaknesses, but he is

the fastest thing I have ever seen in foot-

ball boots," says Darryl van de Velde, an
Australian who is on a three-year coach-

ing contract at the Yorkshire dub, Castle-

ford. “There is noone in Australia can live

with that pace.” The young British stu-

dent is earning an extra £50.000 in Sydney
during the close season to try to prove it

The Wigan-Widnes game reflected the
way rule changes have reshaped rugby

I
n the past few years change has
been injected from outside with the
arrival of Australian and New Zea-
land coaches introducing advanced
methods of training and pburning,

some lifted from American gridiron foot-

ball: the colonies schooling a jaded mother
country.
Van de Velde lives just outside Castle-

ford: “I didn’t come here for the scenery".
He watches a vast number of matches on
video every week, providing detailed writ-

ten breakdowns on tackle counts and per-

formance failures to players at Castleford’s

large tin bowl of a ground. Graham Lowe,
Wigan's New Zealand manager, uses a

computer to produce the same type of

information. British coaches, like the
inspirational Alex “The Mouth" Murphy at

St Helens, continue to represent the lais-

sez-faire style of coaching, but the game is

altering fast “It has changed out of all

recognition in Britain and the top clubs
are as good as those in Australia, but the
projection of the sport is so poor here that
people don't realise it,” says Lowe.
The most exhausted-looking man on the

Widnes side was Jonathan Davies, the
Wales rugby union captain signed this

year into the ranks of the 13-man league
code on a four-year, £130,000 contract.

Looking a rather frail figure among the
shaven-haired beefcake on the Naugbton
Park pitch, Davies says it was the hardest

game in which he has played.

Welshmen (to see Davies) and Scotsmen
(to see Alan Tait, a former Scottish rugby
union international, now the Widnes full-

back) peppered the crowd. Yet professional

rugby league in Britain remains entombed
within a narrow strip from the Mersey to

the Humber. A thousand teams play ama-
teur league. 200 of them in the south and
Midlands. But Fulham, in west Loudon, is

the only professional club outside the
game’s northern stronghold. It is a sport

with working class roots that is ignored in

the south by a working class press devoted
almost solely to Britain’s national sport of

soccer.

For people like Davies, the divisiveness

of history carries penalties difficult for
those to grasp whose country has a sim-
pler and more homogenous sporting cul-

ture. and where the historical divisions

between classes and regions are less

warped.
Since league broke away from union at

a ceremony in the George Hotel. Hudders-
field, in 1895 over the issue of “broken
time payments" (working class lads want-
ing pay to cover for wages lost while

playing rugby rather than working In the
mill or down the pit), rugby in Britain has
been bedevilled. Like a clutch of other

recent union "defectors" (Adrian Hadley
and Peter Williams at Salford, policeman
John Bentley at Leeds, Mark Preston at
Wigan. Paul Moriarty and Tait at Widnes),
Davies risks becoming an historical non-
person in the game (rugby union) that

bred him. For the heinous crime of turn-

ing to another, if related, sport and mak-
ing money doing so, the union hierarchy
still takes a sour and bloody-minded view.
The spreading practice of payments in

union leaves its hierarchy untouched, but
the sin of crossing cultures is another
thing.

It affects the media, too. “For some BBC
commentators, players who switch codes
seem to be written out of history like a
Russian textbook.” says one manager. “If

that TV commentator Bill McLaren ever
mentioned a player who bad turned to
rugby league, it would probably get stuck
somewhere around his adam’s apple."

On the cruel northern pastures of pro-
fessional rugby league, imports from
union range from the spectacularly suc-
cessful to the unmitigated disaster. In
parochial Britain, many Welsh players
struggle to uproot themselves from the
valleys. They still refer to it by the quaint
phrase “going north.” like a polar expedi-
tion without thermals rather than a three-

hour drive up the M6. Some return home
after a short stint, like Terry Holmes, the
brilliant Welsh scrum-half who had a dour
time playing in Bradford Northern’s vast
and soulless Odsal amphitheatre. Others
put down some roots. Robert Ackerman,
another former Welsh international, is

now a sport development officer at White-
haven. the little Cumbrian town whose
faded Georgian elegance reflects the
money it made as a coal and timber port.

League players carry a collective chip
on their shoulder they get little national

recognition as craftsmen in one of the
world’s toughest body contact games. Uni-
maginative TV coverage, with lifeless pre-

sentation and amateurish commentary
and which often ignores the big matches,
fails to reflect the game's energy, its blend
of muscle and motion.
The game has been cleaned up. It has

rarely suffered from the persistent cheat-
ing mid thuggery of union where the line-

outs. rucks and mauls are free-for-alls. The
sound of splintering bone and twanging
ligaments is still part of league, but the
stiff arm driven with malice into an oppo-
nent’s face is disappearing: Gary Pearce,

the ex-Wales union stand-off playing at
Hull, has survived three seasons in one
piece. “The lads back home said I wouldn't
last for the four-year contract without hav-
ing my nose go but I've kept it intact,” he
says.
League, though, is worried about an out-

break of illegal tackling aimed between
the neck and the hairline. Tony Burke, the
St Helens forward, has just had 43 stitches

in an ear wound. Brian Smith, the Aussie
coach at Hull, says the problem is caused
by laziness and inadequacies in technique.
“I signed David Boyle from South Sydney,
who is one of the toughest blokes I’ve

trained. He's got a body Uke granite but he
couldn't believe the number of whacks he
took around the head. The problem is that
not enough English players are prepared
to bend their back in the tackle and hit the
player low. In Australia, the emphasis is

on constantly hurting and Intimidating
your opponent, sapping his speed and
power but doing it fairly." Damage to
shoulder and knee Ligaments, though,
rather than loosened teeth and rearranged
facial bones, is the main cause of a trip to
the local infirmary.
The failure to disinfect the whiff of pie

and peas that infects the game's image is

Continued on Page n
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The Long View

They know a trick or two in Skipton
A PAGE of statistics can be
tricky to interpret, but often
less so than the press release
that comes with it. -

Mortgage lending is “sub-
dued" and building society
commitments to lend are rising
by “less than would normally
be expected on seasonal
grounds", according to the
Building Societies Association
tills week.
But wait a minute. Although

net advances during March
declined by 13 per cent com-
pared with the same month of
1988. much of that could be
explained by Easter falling in

March this year. Compared
with any other period but the.

spring and summer of 1968,

when the housing market was
freakishly strong, the perfor-

mance of the building societies

looks amazingly robust
A coincidental press release

from, the Skipton Building
Society posed ftgtber questions
about the soothing official BSA
line. Building societies, gushed
the Skipton. must become tike

"aggressive new players" itt

order to ensure that the Indus-

try's 10 per cent decline in

completions in the first quarter
of the year should not become
a precedent (actually, net
advances of principal,, as
opposed for gross completions
were only I per cent down on
the first quarter of 1388). The
Skipton is doing its hit by
sharply raising Its own lend-

ing, and designing new prod-

ucts tailored for current mar*
ket conditions.

Officially, high interest rates

are beginning to work. Con-
sumer demand is at least slack-

ening in its growth (though the
figures- are erratic) and house
prices have fallen a little, in
some southern parts of the
country (though they have con-

tinued to rise in the north).

, But it can scarcely be said
that monetary conditions are
tight. The bank lending figures
just over a week ago came as
something of a shock. Sterling
lending, which was supposed
to have started to slow down.
Jumped to £10.1bn in the March
banking month on the.M4 defi-

nition (which includes building
societies). Growth in M4.was 18
per cent in the year to March.

.

You might say. so what? The
Government only looks seri-

ously at the MO version of
money, which has slowed
down nicely. Although growth
in M0 jumped above the Gov-

ernment's target range last

year it has decelerated sharply,
to a seasonally adjusted annual
rate of probably not much
more than. 2 per cent over the

past six months.
Moreover, part of the

broader growth in money
might be Just a temporary
effect of aa economic slow-

down. While personal borrow-

ing appears to have eased as

intendeds company borrowing
has risen, perhaps because in

conditions. of sagging demand
stocks have accumulated more
rapidly than managements had
intended.

At the same time, Nigel Law-
son was rescued this week by

the improvement in the trade

I ; \RR Y f\ J) I . Y

The Government
should stop thinking

in terms of monetary
fine-tuning and
recognise that the

housing market Is an
inflationary engine

that may run away

balance for March. It may well

have bon nothing more than a
favourable fluctuation in an
underlying monthly current
account deficit of £Lfibn, and
in April the swing could be in
the other direction again. But
the equity market took a jump
for joy on Wednesday. The
dangers, however, are not

going to fade away.
as I have been saying for at

least the past 12 months, the

recent problems of inflation

and overheating in the UK
economy originated in the
credit explosion which built up
over several years and peaked
last summer. At least, it was
supposed to have peaked: that
was the purpose of 12per cent
and- then 13 per cent interest

rates..
But the Government does

not appear to have understood
the implications of the finan-

cial deregulation which it initi-

ated. Conditions are now quite
different from those of the 60s
and 70s. Then, competition was
inhibited by overall lending
constraints, which, for
instance, kept the banks out of
the house mortgage market.
The big building societies,

meanwhile, operated a cartel;

when interest rates were high
they judged it right to protect
their existing borrowing mem-
bers from the worst effects of

high rates, and the result was
a shortage of funds and a
queue for new mortgages.

Not any more. The mortgage
marketing organisations built

up during the years of boom
axe now being turned up to
mtwrimrfyp pntput. All kinds of
gimmicky new mortgage prod-

ucts are being devised to get

around the cash flow obstacles

posed by high interest rates.

What would be the point of the
Chancellor putting up rates
stiQ higher - which he would
have had to do if the current

account deficit had been an

erratically high £2bn this week
- if the response were to be an
even bigger flood erf low start

mortgages?
The Government should stop

thinking in terms of monetary
fine-tuning and must recognise
that the British housing mar-
ket is a vast inflationary
engine which at any time could
race out of controL The answer
is not a 1970s'-type system of
controls, but the creation of a
proper balance between supply
and demand for housing.
.There must be an injection

of fear to counter the greed.
For all the fate of falling1 house
prices, the feet is that the Hali-
fax national price Index is still

up 30 per cent cm a year ago.
And with personal incomes ris-

ing at nearly 10 per cent the
ability of borrowers to pay
high interest rates is recover-

ing all the time.
For the time being, the

assumption of both borrowers
and lenders is that the Govern-
ment will not force a genuine
shakeout, but only a. tempo-
rary squeeze. And given that

the Government is not minded
to accept the tax and planning
permission changes which may
really change perceptions in
the housing market, they are
right. But the inflationary
wave is now moving through
the rest of the economy. The
Treasury might Ukrto pretend,

by focusing on a monetary
aggregate - M0 - which
excludes the bousing market
The (act is. however, that they

know a lot more about these
things in Skipton.

; • ...
•
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INVEST UP TO £1 5,600 THIS YEAR
TAX-FREE

Most PEPManagers have launched their 1989/90 PEP, Brown Shipley
P£PManage« Limited have delayed the change to theirnewplan —

TO YOUR ADVANTAGE
PERSONAL CHOICE
£7,800 OR £15,600 TAX-FREE?
You still have the opportunity to Invest a

total of £7,800 TAX-FREE per person

before April 6th 1990. £3,000 has to be
invested by June 3rd 1989 and the

remaining £4,800 by April 6th 1990.

This allowance increases to £15,600
for married couples.

UNLIMITED SELECTION
You may select one or two qualifying

U.K. equities —
One U.K. equity of £4,800 or

# Two U.K. equities of £2,400 or

One U.K. equity of £2,400 plus'one

unit or investment trust up to a limit

of £2.400.

TRUSTCHOICE LUMP SUM
OR REGULAR SAVINGS
OurTrustchoice plan gives you the

opportunity to invest in one of five

Brown Shipley Unit Trusts via our PEP
either as a lump sum of £2,400 or on
a monthly basis from £100 to £400
per month.

EQUITYTOP-UP
You have the opportunity to cop-up your
Trustchoice unit trust investment with

one or two equity investments to a

maximum of £2,400 per annum.

COMPLETE FLEXIBILITY

Our PEP oilers you complete flexibility.

It incorporates all the benefits

introduced in the 1989 Budget whilst

keeping costs to a minimum.

For further information contact: Brown Shipley PEP Managers Limited,

30/31 Friar Street,

Reading, RGl 1AH.

fra*. Tel: 0734 595511.

Please send me a Brown Shipley PEP Brochure:

P~j 1989 (E3.000 allowance) Q 1989/1990 (£4,800 allowance)

Name: —
Both

Address:

.

postcode: Telephone:

B/own Sfttplcj PEP

Managers Limited

A Member oflMRO

DON’T MISS OUT ON THIS TAX-FREE OPPORTUNITY
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FINANCE & THE FAMILY: THIS WEEK

Two ways for investors
to beat inflation
Immediate fears about another rise in interest rates might
have receded, but the need to protect your money
remains. John Edwards examines the attractions of
National Savings and gifts. Page Iff

Time to produce the goods
In a market In which short-termism Is decried as a noxious
epidemic. Save & Prosper is one of a handful of unit trust
groups that can produce really long-term performance
figures. But do the figures tell the real story? Christine
Stopp puts the group under the microscope. Page V

A lower marital tax bill

The independent taxation for married couples will offer

special opportunities to increase marital net income if

either spouse was tram before April 6 1926. Anthony
Casswell reports. Page V

Building societies lure expatriates
Bradford A Bingley has just joined a growing list of UK
building societies operating branches offshore. Peter
Gartiand looks at a growing market and finds the best deal
for expatriates. Page VI

So you want to run a pub . . .

For many would-be small -
businessmen and women, tt-r &So jWSm rt n
the thought of running their j yown public house is often the ;x/ \pL ^ M
ultimate fantasy. Pulling -:£5. I f I

pints, chatting to the :j WA\ I I I
regulars . . . but is it all yk JUj
fun? Roy Hodson and Lisa
Wood look at real life behind I

the bar. Page VII - |

Briefcase: Bid to reclaim tax: Pagw VI
Diary erf a private investor: Page VI

LONDON UKewentaccountbatanoa (£MRon)

Building Societies
Net new commitments (£ bn)
6.0

Unit Trust

Unitholder accounts (mflBon)

Mar 1987 1988 Mar*89

Mortgage commitments slow
Building societies recorded a smaller than expected
increase in net new mortgage commitments during March
— normally a month when there is a big Increase in home
loans. The value of new mortgages agreed in March was
well up on February at £4J25bn, but well down on the
March 1988 figure of £5.88bn. According to the Building

' Societies Association mortgage demand Is subdued in

response to the current high level of Interest rales. During
the first quarter of 1989, building societies' commitments
amounted to £9,994m, just 7 per cent above the previous
three months. However this was almost one quarter — or
£3,168m — below the figure recorded in the same period -

of1988. In file retail savings market, building societies’ net
receipts fell to £8l3m in March from £1,064m in

February. HeatherFarmbrough

Unit trust decline continues
Private investors are still pulling out of unit trusts. Latest
figures issued by the Unit Trust Association tills week
showed that the number of unitholder accounts tali again
in March to 4.80m, continuing the decline that started in

February 1988. Funds under management by unit trust

companies Increased by £2-3bn or by 5 per cent over the
course of the month to reach a total value of £49.2bn.
However, sales for March were slightly lower than the
figures recorded over the past two months. This suggests
that some unitholders may be selling holdings as prices
recover to nearer their pre-October 1987 stock market
crash levels. John Edwards

Safeway debut for Switch card
National Westminster Bank is piloting its new Switch debit

card scheme at the Tunbridge Wells Safeway store. Switch
is a debit card scheme which was launched in April 1988
by three UK banks — NatWest, Midland and the Royal
Bank of Scotland. The NatWest card is the three-in-one

servicecard incorporating cash dispenser, cheque
guarantee and debit card/point of sale facilities. The
servicecard will be issued to customers as a replacement
for existing cards. These are usable at point of sale and
for withdrawing cash from the Bank’s servicetills. Hf

New VISA card is launched
Town & Country Building Society will launch its own VISA
card on May Z The APR will be 19.5 per cent or 1.5 per
cent per month, which T & C claims is the lowest rate of

interest offered by any leading high street building society.

T & C is the fourth building society to launch Its own VISA
card. Ian Bell, managing director, says that the group is

deliberately undercutting Its competitors as it believes

many people will, switch from other cards. T & C is offering

a direct debit facility which will clear the total amount each
month, even though this amount will probably vary. HJF

Index-link income plan
by British Assets

Afterthoughts cloud

optimism over trade

Storing8 morthMate* wto (%>

14

An unusual way of providing

extra Income to investors has
been devised by British

Assets investment trust,

managed by Ivory & Sfme.
It has raised £150m by
placing with institutions loan
stock for repayment in the
year 2005 that guarantees an
investment return matching
the performance of the
FT-Actuaries All-Share Index
during that period.

The idea is that the £150m
capital raised will be
Invested in companies
paying dividends that are
expected to grow faster than
the Index average, and
therefore the Trust will have
some extra cash available to

benefit investors after

meeting its obligations to the
loan stock holders.

The plan is to increase the
dividends paid to ordinary
shareholders at least 10 per
cent more than would be
possible before raising the
£l50m.
As a start the Board has
forecast the total of the four
quarterly dividends likely to

be paid for the year to

September 30 on ordinary
shares at not less than

3.50p per share, which
represents an increase of

20.4 per cent over the
dividends paid in the
previous year.
However, this is not Intended
to be a one-off enhancement
The extra cash will be
invested in shares that will

provide an above average
yield and faster dividend
growth rata, as well as
increasing capital value.

The key behind this unusual
method of gearing Is the

Trust's ability to outperform
the All-Share index. The
institutions which bought the
loan stock are apparently
content with a guaranteed
return matching the All-Share

index both in terms of

income and capital.

By investing in high (or

above average) yielding

shares the Trust should have
no difficult in meeting the

income requirement The risk

lies in whether these shares

can also provide the capital

growth. If they do not then

the Trust and its

shareholders, will have to

sacrifice capital to meet the

commitment to the loan stock

holders. dohn Edwards

WAS FT . . . could it really

be . . . heavens, it seemed
that it could! For once, a set of

monthly trade figures actually

rolled out looking better -

rather than drastically worse
- than City predictions. Per-

haps that says something for

the level of wariness with
which some commentators
now approach these delicate

economic matters. Even so,

unbridled glee at this rare
event was still difficult to

detect
True, the market - as mea-

sured by the FT-SE 100 share
index - gained about 45 points

over the two subsequent trad-

ing sessions, pushing it beyond
the 2,100 barrier. It even
reached a brief post-crash high
in opening trading on Friday.
But as the morning wore on,

the steam disappeared from
the rally. There is certainly a
significant school of thought
which believes that the eco-
nomic picture remains rawd.
at best, and questions those

trends which finally seem to be
heading in the tight direction.

Anticipation of the March
trade figures, which were pub-

lished on Wednesday, served
largely to restrain sentiment
during the first part of the
week. On Monday, trading vol-

ume in London dipped to a
miserable 3408m shares, with

Ranks Hovis McDougall's
table-turning bid for Sydney-
based Goodman fielder Wattle
nianwing a good deal of atten-

tion but doing little to help the
market’s mood.
At first glance Tuesday

looked much better, with vol-

ume stepped up to more than
575m shares, but a couple of

significant programme trades

took root of the credit That
said, there was at least a happy
forerunner to the trade figures

themselves, in the form of a
relatively downbeat Confedera-
tion of British Industry survey.
This is the second successive

quarterly survey from the CBI
to adopt a rather pessimistic

tone, talking of declining
industrial confidence plus a
prospective slowdown in out-

put growth mid Tnannfanturlng
employment It also pointed to

signs of rising costs, but there

were suggestions that margins
might bear a part of this,

rather than prices.

At any rate, the days when
such warnings from industry
were a bearish tug on equities

are long past Tbday, the mar-
ket prefers to read them as an
indication that the high inter-

est rate policy Is biting and
that more manufacturers will

be inclined to push exports. AH
m all. Footsie managed to tnm
in a nine-point gain
Wednesday began gently

but, by mid-morning, dealers
were already beginning to
scent a pleasant surprise.
When the trade figures were
unveiled, they showed a cur-
rent account deficit of £L19ta,
compared with February’s
£L7bn, while the visible trade
deficit fell from £2.2bn to

HIGHLIGHTS OF THE WEEK
Change

FT OkL Index

AMEC
Armstrong Equip.

CourfauMs

Deneora

PnrtrtB HMfla.
— - - - rnnstaunrvsv roocs

London Utd.

Micro Focus

Oxford instruments
Pavilion Letsurs

Interest rats Mar raesdas.

Preliminary profits up 71%.

Takeover speculation restarts.

Share ataka/ bid speculation.

Doubled annual profits to BJw.
Ontainast Md apacutaMan.

Pratts wanting-

Worrfes over US subsidiary.

Recant good figs/broksr’s circulai

Consideration of CEO appointment

RHM 369 -20 404 345 £tAba bid for Goodman FMdac.

Racal Elect. 440 +47 441 275 Sponsored ADR sought/atk shortage.

Rank Org.

Sotheby's HMge.

967

2240

+ 63

+ 250

988

2270

721

1087

Talk at Hansen bid for Xerox of US.

US baying Interest

WALL STREET will just not
let go. Eighteen months after
the Crash, the US stock mar-
ket tamed in a rally on Thurs-
day which was as sweet and
innocent as anything before
October 1987.
The Dow Jones industrial

Average, which is the measure
that most people watch, rose
29.88 points on Thursday and
the stock market goes Into
May in Its most bullish mood
since the middle of 1987.
"Ftankly,'* says Michael Metz
of Oppenheimer, “I think that
we’re about to see an explo-
sion in the stock market”
Whether this really is a bull

market or just a bear-market
rally as some people still

think, US stocks have staying
power. Since the last Thanks-
giving holiday in late Novem-
ber, when the market took off,

the Dow has risen 16 per cent
The Dow Jones Transporta-

tion Average is now trading at
an all-time high. Since the
beginning of the year, a stock
such as AT & T has risen 22J2

per cent - which, on an ann-
ualised basis, suggests that the
phone company is doubling in
value every year.
The rise has not been

smooth, but choppy, which is

as the bulls would have it The
market has gone through
three mood-swings this year.
In January, there was a sort of
startled surprise that company
profits were still going up-
This gave way in February and
March to fears that inflation
and interest rates are going up
faster, raising the cost of buy-
ing these profits. In the past
two weeks, the market has
become convinced that profits
are steady or will rise and that
interest rates are steady or
falling. It is a pretty picture.
However, it is not entirely

plausible- Thursday’s rally
was set off by an article in the .

New York Times which said
that the Federal Reserve had
stopped pushing np interest
rates because of signs that the
economy is slowing down.
The credit markets soared,

interest rates fell, stocks rose
and programme traders, who
have been lying rather low
lately, plunged into the equity
market That Wall Street gets
its information from reading
the newspapers may be of*
comfort to small investors
(and reporters). But this ama-
teurish rally raises several

WALL STREET

Full steam ahead
in choppy waters
Dow Jones Industrial Averages
2800 -":"!£T'y-r .f. •.-s' *. sgygy-r. HyjijRTiVSE

- F wrr?:::
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XIJ9bo- This compared with
estimates on the. current
account front ranging between
£1 4hn and g|_flhn.

One thought sprang immedi-
ately to the fore: the extent of
the improvement surely
removed any immediate
upward prasgme cm foe inter-

est rate front Up went Footed
to show a aOpctait gain ahead
of lunch. £ dosed 22 paints
higher at 20B8A.
On Thursday, after a slightly

hesitant start, it was much foe
same, with Mtaoroo’s success
late cm Wednesday in achiev-
ing 54 percent acceptances in
the bid battle with Consoli-
dated Gold Fields pushing
ConsGold’a shareprice nseftflty

ttigho; despite uncertainty on
the US iegu front.
By Friday, though, more

sober thoughts were drawing
through. For a start; questions
have been raised over ho

w

good the March trade figures
actually were, and the extent
to which they suggest a sus-
tained improvement ahead.
Exports were indeed up by 9
per cent, but this was one
parity to a significant positive
contribimon from
and an increase in oil exports
— a trend that w™ mmdftg
suggest might be reversed
when the latest North Sea ofl
Hfddwtf hits the Anri? figure*.
Non-oil exports, rxrtnrttng
enattc Items, rose by L35 pcs'

'

rm 'Hie month
Moreover, although the

authorities pointed out that
the mxteriylng wohzme of non-
all exports rose more swiftly

time since 1985.
The oil companies did

poorly, apart from Texaco.
Profits at the steel and bask:
chemicals indnstries that have
enjoyed big Inflationary
growth are tHug- off. Son
mast are ikecompare* wttcfc

.

most do betterif the trade
accounts are to be squared,
this ms not mi ancoaxagfog
performance. However, there
was little by way of baa raws.

W Mum «f
'

than flwtof frOMfl imports -
which mast be good news -
there is still the worry that the
threatened dock strike could
lead to import end
spread copfnskraaB round.
There are other economic

caveats, too; which lead some
forecasters to suspect that con-
acdidatiOB rather, than merry
nop See ahead. Oh the one

. hand, there are the various
pressures on the wage-front; on
the other, concern persists

m»r the Mfltantt ofconsumer
spending is relation to the
high interest 'rata policy.
Finally, just for good measure.
Britain’s interest rate policy
could yet be subject to pres-

- sure front interest ' rate.

ft should also be saM that,

.when It comes to the corporate
reporting front, the market’s
attitude is leas than comdstent.
While it tends to welcome
signs that industrial bullish-
ness is bdng checked, on: the
macro-level - witness the CBI
survey - it is equally pleased
to see the absence of any
recessionary twinges at the
miaxHeveL
KX is a classic case in point.

The dufflitealg eampany, long
seen as a bellwether for British
industry, rolled in first-quarter

figures well in excess of ana-
lysis’ forecasts. Pretax profits

were 98 per cent higher at
£442m, compared with fore-
casts pitched at little more
than £40Gm. and the advance
was well spread between the
various divisions. That did
something for ICI itself - its

shares rose 34p to I232pr

although they remain on a sig-

nificant sub-market rating -

but rather more for the mar*
kerfs confidence overall.

It fa just possible to argue

that these confuting accounts
of corporate buoyancy point to

. the sort of “soft landing”
sought so fervently. But until

there is concrete evidence that
the loss of domestic confidence
is fuelling a greater export
effort, some may also wonder if

the market is having its cake
and eating it at the same time.

On the hid front, attention
concentrated on the still-unre-

solved Gold Fields situation

and on RHM’s decision to bite

beck at its 299 per cent share-

holder, Goodman Fielder Wat-
tle, with a hostile £l.33t» bid.

This comes about raven
after Goodman’s own

Md for KHM was referred to
the Monopolies and Mergers
CUmmiastan - an inquiry it

never pursued.
One especially interesting

feature was tin: sub-underwrit-
ing of RHM’s cash alternative
- the first exercise on this

scale in a Md situation since
the 1987 grab. True, it was
done by Cazenove at a discount
of over 14 per cent to RHM’s
prosannoancement price, and
- if anecdote! evidence is any
guide - was not particularly

easy. Nevertheless, real evi-

dence that the UK institutions
are prepared to swallow even
modern risk mustbea stride in
the right direction.

Nikki Tait

[JUNIOR MARKETS J

Carbuncles
all round

questions.
Wall Street has mostly given

up hoping far the sort of non-
inflathraary growth that justi-

fied the bull market in stocks
between 1982 and 1987.
Instead, everybody is talking
about a “soft* landing.
While this sounds a fuzzy

idea, it is actually quite pre-
cise. It requires that the econ-
omy slows enough to cart infla-

tion but not enough to destroy
companies’ nrofitabUity. Metz
deftnes it so: “sUghtity lower
corporate profits and l per
cent to L5 per cent economic
growth generated from the
non-consumer sector of the
economy.” By any accounts,
this is quite a small runway
on a rather large and potboled
airfield.

It was only a month, ago that
the market was deeply worried
about iWng Inflation, and the
series of weak economic statis-

tics since then, «ilwiMtiwg in
yesterday’s 0.7 per cent fall In
the March leading indicators,
may not be confirmed in the
second quarter. At the very
least, rising oil and petroleum
products prices (in part
because of the Alaska oil spill)
bIhbiM push Up the tnflpHiyn

measures for April
As Griggs A Santow, the

bond market commontutors,
said on Thursday night, the
leading Indicators are “famous
for giving false signals, and a
rebound in Aprilis a very dis-
tinct possibility." Reports of
highor inflation could knock
beta stock and bond markets
about, as occurred in March.
There Is also the ‘threat of

recession. The Federal Reserve
has raised interest rates by
three percentage potato in the
past year and nobody yet
knows what this has done to
depress business activity. Last
week’s quarterly reports from
companies did not give much
evidence either way.
Du Font, Sears and the

paper companies were good.
Manufacturing companies
with frig order books and big-
ger production problems
mostly did better than expec-
ted - Boeing. Caterpillar and
Cummins Engine - though
McDonnell Douglas did very
ranch worse.
In the technology sector,

where Wall Street finds it hard
to predict profits, IBM made a
gesture of confidence by rais-
ing its dividend for the first

IT there y&^+mhkai. ft
came from rad, one or (he
great MMmfariwriiff compa-
nies of the 1880s, which said
that It may not be able to
match last year’s profits fids
year.

XB the first quarter, weak
demand from US consumers
forced the company to launch
an incentive war which cut US
profit* by 6 per cart. As Hugh
Johnson at First Albany
pointed out on Thursday: "U
the onto sabs don’t start to
recover soon, weakness win
start to spread through into
other parts of the economy in
a domino effect* We're that
dose to a slowdown. We're not
quite there. But the market
seems to be Ignoring the pros-
pect of a recession, even when
it’s dose in front.”

Of comae, there are reces-
sions and recessions. The pros-
pect of a couple of quartos in
which Gross National Product
stays flat or declines should
not be a disaster for the stock
market. However, as Metz
points put, US industry has
taken on so ranch debt in the -

mid-1980s that indite are not
well cushioned hlfbg

*1116 assumption is that a
recession will be brief and
shallow,” he says. ‘Hut indus-
try is terribly leveraged, with
interest costs con*H ?ing a
quarter of internal cash flow,
which leaves companies very
vulnerable.”

Monday
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James Buchan

Trying to break free
Continued from Page I

largely the fault of the sport’s

dour, insular, hard-bitten
northern bosses. Australian
players get exasperated in the
UHL Back home, where league
vies with the home-grown
Rules code, the presentation is

of a gladiatorial contest, closer

to American football than
rugby. Tina Turner does the
TV commercials. In Britain,
many of the grounds are intim-
idating bride and steel sheds,
relics of an industrial past.
Like soccer grounds, they

reveal a contempt for the fan
although, unlike soccer, the
spectator can watch without
the bonliffUTfl OT the rifaatHg

John Moses, a St Helens' for-

ward in the 1950s and newly-in-

stalled secretary at Bradford
Northern, says no-one can
remember now where the
money produced in the post-

war boom times actually went
“It certainly didn’t go on play-

ers's wages.”
As in soccer, there are too

many professional teams. At
the bottom of the second divi-

sion, stories of penury and
skra-of-the-teeth survival come
thick and fast. Huddersfield

saw its club virtually disinte-

grate this year. Runcorn had a
player walk-out over money
and has straggled to keep itself

together. The old Blackpool
club has spent the past few
years migrating up and down
the M6 searching for a perma-
nent home.

hi a brutal world, the losers
suffer. Second division Wor-
kington, a Lancashire-like
afterthought on the edge of the
Lake District, has enjoyed
gates this year of just 600 com-
pared with more than 15,000
during the roaring '40s and
‘50s. The Eagles at Sheffield, a

dub formed in the 2980s, have
just won promotion to the first

division but the dub says that
its players have earned just
£2,000 each fids season.
The forma: sales director at

Puma has just been appointed

as the league’s first commer-
cial director. Next week, a new
companyjs being floated by
the league to buy mid manage
homes for visiting Australian

players. In anovel move, War-
rington and Wigan axe playing

each other in Milwaukee in
June. It seems that a cutturaBy
entrapped sport bursting with
energy is attempting to escape
its bounds.

ANARUHTnSCT’SJot is not a
.happy obe. Criticised for per*

. defied fiefc tf Wftivity and
dadfaira mr^afieged design
faults, the public image of
architects leaves a lot to be
dashed. And far most ct the
tooted architects, their gnan-

- dal performance and share
price can afford little
consofatttm.
Architects and design

companies have repeatedly
' featured among the worst-per-

forating stocks on ite Unlisted
Securities Market. This year,
the wooden spoon goes to SPS
Consultancy, the shares of

.
wMcfc have fallen by 44 per
cent in 1989.

As such, it is following the
tradition established fry D Y
Davies, Whinney Mackay-
Lewls and Tribble Harris Li,

which all put in dismal
performances last year.
Blanchards, a loss-making

interior designer has heaped
farther misery on tiramini-sec-

- tor. Somuch so, that last week
the company announced the
sale of most of its loss-making
architectural businesses and a
reverse takeover of a-property
company.
However, the gloom can be

overdone. AfterAfront of reme-
dialaction, D Y Davies appears
to have recovered. It recently
announced a rise in interim
pre-tax profits from £88400 to
£504,000, reflecting cuts' in

'

overheads last year. SPS, also
believes that its problems are
behind It. Meanwhile, an
ummllted performance has
been recorded by the Company
of Designers, which came to
the market soon after the
Crash of October 1967.

Shares in the Company of
Designers have risen by 58 per
cent in value since the start of
the year. That reflects its
strong 59 per cent rise in pro- ,

tax profits to £L86m in the
year to last September. Acqut-

;

gtttons are continuing apace,
while its architectural work is

still buoyant and well spread -

between office and industrial
. ]

work.
However, even if some com- i

pantos’ fortunes are in the j

ascendant, the sector is still
j

prone to some persistent Bis. j

Perhaps ihe araa common at
these is delays. When an archi- j

tect takes cm additional staff to
j

caps with a large contract, any ]

hesitation on the part off the \

client will result in heavy ]

overheads. - i

"In the design industry, l

(Ways are a fact of Ufa. Every (

business suffers from them," t

says Roger Henderson, chair-
j

man of the SPS Consultancy
Group. -

- j
Such an occurence marred t

the company's first half year l
on the USM three years ago, t

when profits halved. Similarly, t
D Y Davies halved its profits in p
1987/8 when it increased its t
staff levels to cope with two
large projects which did. not

folly matart^e. .

.

* Partly as^antit oCthic^-

1 SEiT&3WS&&
f nesses. Almost all hare need
» . their quote to finance aflurry

of xcqulsttieas, which take
-

' them into related businesses
> such as interior design, survay-
i lng, estate agency and land-

scaping; The goal is to provide
i a multi-discipline service, so

they can bid for the entire con-
tract for a development.
This trend is mirrored by

interior designers, which bare
snapped up architects and
other specialists. SPS. for
Instance, started life on the
USM as Space Planning Ser-
vices, an office planning con-
sultant It has since bought an
architectural practice and a
firm of consulting engineers.
Now it wants to expand into
property services and char-
tered surveying. "The bound-
aries between one kind of busi-
oess and another are Warring;”
says Henderson.
However, the experience of

SPS has not been particularly
happy so far. The engineering
consultancy bought in Febru-
ary 1988 made a loss of £154^000
for the six months to the end
of 1988, when much of the
promised work failed to materi-
alise. As a result file group as a
whole was plunged into a toss

. of £38,000, although it is now
trading profitably.

SPS is not alone. Expansion
has been fraught with diffi-

culty for many practices. Trib-
ble Harris Li, which is based in
the US, found that the Hmi»
and expense involved in mak-
ing acquisitions was more than
it bargained for. Disappointing
1987 results and interim tosses
made Tribble Harris Li the sec-
ond-worst performer on the
USM last year, with a 75 per
cent fail in its shares price. It

has recently posted a pre-tax
loss of 82.63m for the year to
last November, compared with
a profit of XL5m last year.
•' Given the harsh treatment
meted out to axchftecte by the
stock market - which is gen-
erally intolerant of short-term
hiccups - it may not be clear

just how far architects benefit

.

from quotations.

But, apart from funding;
acquisitions, architects can
point to several advantages.
For one thing, the higher pro-
file they gain from a flotation

helps attract new diems. For
another, ft helps the architects
Invest in computer-aided
design, which helps them meet
the demands of Increased com-
ptexfty and tighter timetables.
Furthermore, a quotation

allows them to offer shares to
their staff, which helps them
keep and attract skilled archi-
tects. Therefore, in spite of ail
the hurdles, it will be no sur-
prise if more architects brave
the market

Vanessa Houlder
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BES
issues

falter
A NUMBER of Business
Expansion Scheme issues have
failed to raise as much capital

as they had hoped. Where com-
panies raised less than the
minimum subscription, share-
holders will have their money
refunded - but they will have
failed to qualify 'for tax relief

on those shares for the tax
year ortding in April 1989.

According to Tim ViHiers at
BES Investment Research,
£349J9m was raised under the
BES scheme la the past tax
year, but this was some £l50m
less than the industry had
hoped-for. Nevertheless, it was
well above the ElSOm raised in
the previous year, due largely

.

to the Inclusion for the. first,

time of assured tenancy com-
panies.
Not surprisingly, assured

tenancy close _ companies
proved particularly popular, as
investors were able to claim
tax relief on any interest pay-
ments on loans taken out to

pay for the investment Close
companies accounted for one-
third (£123.39m) of the total

raised for assured tenancies.
The companies which suf-

'

fend in comparison with the
1967/88 ' tax- year were trading
companies^ which are allowed-
to,' raise only up to £500,000
each following the lowering of
the limit in the 1988 budget.
These raisdd £9j8lm last yemv
compared with the 138Q total'.of
£lS8m.

^ "

Star quality
ONE OF THE unit trust
world’s fastest-rising stars has
found its astrological match.
The tiny but well-respected
Merlin Fund Management
group (£20m under manage-
ment since Us launch in 1967)

is merging with Jupiter Tar-
butt, another independent fund
management group.
Jupiter is, in fact, taking

over Merlin, which was owned
formerly by North Sea & Gen-
eral. A South African finance
house, Angiovaal, bought 25
per cent of North Sea and this
went against the grain of one
of the principles enshrined in
Merlin's Ecology fund - no

substantial South African con-
nections..

The sew company will have
£370m under management split

between investment trusts,

unit trusts, pension hinds and
private clients. Its main trust,

the River Plate and General
Investment, is capitalised at
around £90m. Merlin will

merge its unit trusts with
those of Jupiter Tarbutt Mer-
lin’s International Growth
trust with assets of £17fim, is

ranked in the top three per-

forming funds over periods
from six months to 10 years.

H. F.

There is a small trickle of

issues coming onto the market
while some issues launched
before- the end of the 1988/89
tax year are still open.
One BES company, Unicom

Anglia Housing, has launched
a save-as-you-rent scheme for
assured tenants with the Hali-

fax Building Society . The idea
is to encourage tenants to put
a Tegular monthly sum into a
building society deposit
account at the same time as
paying the rent The principle
is that it is more cost-effective

to rent while mortgages are so
high, and to save a big enough
deposit to buy a first home.
Tenants will be given the

option of paying a fixed
amount by standing order each
month together with their rent
payments. The extra sum 'will,

go into a Halifax 'Savings
account carrying a higher-rate
of interest than an .ordinary
account.

,

HeafberFarmbrough

Young at heart
THE TRUSTEE Savings Bank
is now prepared to provide
motor insurance cover to
young drivers (ages 17 to 25)
following a review of its motor
insurance operations Its finan-

cial sendees- arm, TSB Trust
Company, now offers three
motor insurance policies
through the group's 1,600
branches, designed to meet the
needs of almost all types of
motorist
The Third Party-Plus policy

provides basic insurance cover
to the young driver. It . offers

third party, fire and theft
cover, with the latter extend-
ing to the vehicle’s full market
value. An important additional
feature is that if the motorist
has ah accident for which he or
she is not to blame, -then the
policy -will cover the legal
expenses involved in pursuing

a claim up to £25,000. The pol-

icy is available only for drivers

aged 17 to 25.

The Popular Comprehensive
policy is a more sophisticated
contract available for drivers
aged 17 to 45. Full accident
cover is provided, with an
automatic £50 excess, with
cover includes the cost of pro-
tecting the car while it is out
of action and the costs of deliv-

ery to and from the repairer.
Lost or damaged property in
the vehicle is covered up to a
value £100.

Finally, the Comprehensive-
Plus policy, available to motor-
ists aged 35 or over, has a wide
range of benefits - including a
replacement car if the vehicle
Involved is less than 12 months
old.

Eric Short

Now GA turns to unit trusts
LEADING COMPOSITE
insurer General .Accident is

possibly known best to the UK
puhlic as a motor insurer
although the group itself,

through its animated TV car-

toon character “General Acci-

dent,
1* Is expanding its name

awareness as a complete insur-

ance and investment entUy.
That name awareness is cru-

cial because the group has
been rather slow in developing
its retail investment services.

Its subsidiary, GA Life, was
one of the tost of the- tradi-

tional life companies to enter
the unit-linked life sector some
four years ago.
Now, it will pt-enterlng. the.

unit trust field at the end of
this month, a move foreshad-
owed five months ago.
Aa well as using the

.

press,

GA Life intends to market
through independent financial
advisers plus the group’s direct

sales force and its tied agency
force - which includes five

building societies and a nation-
wide flhain of estate agencies.
Name awareness will be

important because the firsttwo
trusts, GA Growth Portfolio

and GA Income Portfolio, are
unlikely to catch the immedi-
ate attention of investors.
Indeed, these products reflect

the status of the group itselfi

solid and.,reliable but some-

p, f. v i»
v rar?

what dnIL
However, GA's unit trust

development manager, Des
Waddington, feels that this is

what investors are looking for

in the aftermath of the October
1987 stock market crash, rather
than the highly volatile exotic
funds that proliferated in the

beady, days ahead of the crash.

The funds will be managed
by Edinburgh Fund Managers,
which already handles GA
Life's linked-life funds. EFM
has its own stable of unit
trusts but Waddington is confi-

dent there will be no conflict of
interest
Alex Gowans, of EFM, is

emphatic that the funds will

»•**%'» ii. .
,

t.-i* ;•.* -i

a

li i

not be completely unadventu-
rous. The Growth fund will
have 50 per cent overseas,
including 10 per cent in Far
East Pacific Equities, the
emerging markets which Gow-
ans considers to have consider-
able investment potential But
the Income fond is somewhat
more cautious.

The charges are pitched at
the industry’s norm - 5.75 per
cent initial and L5 per cent
annual management fee. Pric-

ing will be made at 10 am so
that investors can deal at his-

toric prices throughout the day
until 5 pm.

E. S.

S -~-4> tr

investment performance
mpion two new unit trusts.

Before asking you ro Mire their unk mitts seriously, •

company should be able to show you a pedigree of

superb Investment performance.
.

J
Because whether you're looking for a

regular. income from your investment, capital

growth or a sensible combination of both,

brccding-wHl tcIL

We're proud to (tty that, currently, there ^Hp
are very fc*w people with better investment

performance track records than Colonial

Mutual.
Ifyou've seen the prizes our managers

have wpn with unit-linked life funds,

you'll certainly agree. .. .

Champion over-5 years for

Equity and Property Funds.And
second and third place out of-

a

long list of entries for Fixed
| j

Interest and Managed Funds
respectively."

* -

.
Now this expeniaev available - •

to new owners in Owo .carefully
1 '

thought out.soundly based unfnmws
with -a minimum investment of juw

£1,000: the Colonial Mutual' Income

TrustandtheColonialMutualCapitalTnisL
Cfaril 23rd May, the unit price is fixed at

.

50p.t Arid an investments attract a vahiablc

Bonus Allocation to units,worth up to 2 Wfc. So

make sure you don't miss out on this new
.

,

opportunity.
j

Ifyou have any questions, or would like to
j

find out more about Colonial Mutual’s new unit
j

rusk, call our Helpline free an 0800 100 100.

lb. invest now; just complete the Application

zs

Form bdow and send it to us, together with your
cheque (minimum £1,000 per oust), to reach

us by 23rd May at the latest.

Please remember (har the capital

value ofyour units and the income
from them are not guaranteed and may
fluctuwe- most of the charges on your
investmentareincluded in the 'offer*

price of units.

ill

w

LTjBy Whilst unit trusts and unit-linked

life funds are similar in tenns of the

basis on which they operate,they differ in

certain aspects such as their tax treatment.

Unit-linked fund past performance is

not, thereforc.8 guide to future unit

KSHKCc trust returns.

Ifyou can takeareasonably
long-term view on your investment,
wethinkyoii’U find ourtwo new
un*1 trusts will be faithful and
rewarding friends.

Wf * "Source:Money MMaMganezu/Fuatax to

F ' IstMucb 1989.BatiE oderm bid, nci income
naBWWWl

am yvWfiw lqtHtrt Cimritfiftftt

LAUNCH OFFER BONUS
AQ investments qualify for a launch Bonos Allocation

to units,BUT ONLY IFTHEY ARE RECEIVED
BY 23rd May 1989.

InvestmentAmount Bonus Allocation

£1,000-£2.499

JX500-£7A99 lWfc

. jC7^00+ 2<ft%

PHONE COLONIAL MUTUAL FREE ON 0800 100 100 S'
Application for Investment

Ibi Colonial Hstwd, UsllIhlK Accounting* Mn*|«*M«t
XJato^raJBgfWT,lWhhrHMitY»*d,Le«4«nSBllBto

To take advantage oMWi ferial opportunity,and tl« latwrft boausi

dns&f oanpleic thl* App&aiionand imn u, with jpdiir cheqpe.rotlw

ddtt'M shown

ihurAppUdokta nun be treriwdbySSrdAhiylWato bencfuTmm the

taoch tanui and the facd offer price of 50p.

MUSOtalOCTAlLS

Mr/Miy/Mki/Mit/bthcr,. '— —— '

Suraam-— ’

Fomiwnefri^—^

;

Due of birth:

INVESTMENT DETAILS
I/TOs wish to f (minimum of£1j000) ia the

anil trim indicated beloww the fixed offer price ofSOp per unit.

(ride one):
.

THE COLONIALMUTUALINCOMETRUST j |

Income unit* will be issued.

THECOLONIALMUTUALCAPITALTRUST Q
Accumultdou unit* wilt be Issued.

Noib Ifyoa wish to invest in both (run*, yon ritoold obtain a second

applicationby enclosing a written lequen with your application, or by
‘phoning our five HetpUae on 0600 100 1D0.

I/We setose a cheque pajaWe to Colonial Mutual UnitTrust Managers Lid.

df y«W4iihriibsil°b<Wdlw more U N I T |

•ddnitmii eppUoMit should provide the above Jeeatlaon a separate sheet

eTpapCh wtucfcritoukl be and dated.)

i AV li t!.uWtMimrnt-mutra A mcniDrrcrf L/.UTR**»d.IMW>.
«n*

** Hitt,t-wl«t ECtPeflD.

Immediate fears about another rise in interest rates might be over

but the need to protect your money remains. John Edwards reports

National Savings and gilts:

two ways to beat inflation
THIS WEEK’S trade figures

may have delayed, or avoided
altogether, the need for

another rise in interest rates.

But fears about inflation

remain to haunt investors. So
what do you do if you are wor-

ried about inflation and want
to protect yourself?

The obvious answer is to

seek investments where the

capital return moves up in line

with inflation. Shares may pro-

vide long-term protection but

there is no guarantee that
prices will not go down in the

short or medium term, possibly
as a result of the impact of

Inflation on wage awards and
other costs squeezing company
profits.

There are, however, two
main investments which have
a government guarantee they
will match inflation- These are
index-linked gilts and the
National Savings index-linked
certificates.

On the face of it National
Savings certificates have the
advantage because they are
free of tax on the income as
well as the capital gain. You
are guaranteed a tax-free real

return of 4.04 per cent over and
above the rate of inflation as
measured by the Retail Price
Index This means that if infla-

tion is running at 7 per cent in

theory you would receive the
equivalent of 11.04 per cent
interest a year tax-free.

However, the interest is pay-
able only when you sell the
certificates. You do not receive

a regular Income and, as with
most National Savings prod-
ucts. there are complications.
For a start, the maximum

amount you can buy is only
£5,000-worth per person. In
addition, you have to hold the
certificates for five years to
receive the full 4.04 per cent.

And there is a sliding scale.

If you sell your certificates

after leas than 12 months, you
receive no interest at all. At
the end of year one, you are

paid 3 per cent plus the rate of
inflation; year two, 3.25 per
cent: year three, 3.5 per cent:

year four, 4.5 per cent; and
year five, 6 per cent
With index-linked gilts, you

can invest as much as you like

(although stockbrokers are

reluctant to deal in amounts
below £5,000) and dispose of
them whenever you want with-
out necessarily losing money
as a result of selling before the

official repayment date.
The interest paid in the form

of dividends (twice a year) is

inflation rate at issue, the

higher the market price.

although the latter also takes

into account inflation expecta-

tions by the redemption date.

Glenn Davies, of CL-Alexan-
ders Lany & Gruickshank, says

that although index-linked gilt

Qo

liable to income tax at yoiir top

rate but the coupon (interest

rate) is lower than savings cer-

tificates, ranging from 2 to 2.5

per cent. The real protection

against inflation comes from
the increase in the value of the

capital, which is not liable to

capital gains tax.

At present, there are 13 dif-

ferent index-linked govern-
ment securities (gilts) which

.

are listed every day in the
Financial Times under British

Funds on the London Share
Service page. The main differ-

ence between the 13 stocks is

the date of redemption, when
they are due to be repaid. At
the moment, this ranges from
1990 to the year 2004.

The figures in brackets in
the accompanying illustration

refer to the RPI, eight months
before the stock was issued,

and this is reflected in the
present market price which
measures tbe gain attributable

to inflation since tbe stock was
issued. Basically, the lower the

yields have moved up in recent
months, they still provide good
opportunities to guard against
inflation - particularly for the
high-rate taxpayer - since the
income is low and the capital

appreciation is free of tax.

Acording to Davies, private
investors tend to buy the
short-dated stocks. However,
he feels they are a bit pricey
just now and the best bets
could well be in the medium-
dated stocks, due for redemp-
tion between 2003 and 2011.

Davies says there is always a
chance of losing money if you
sell too soon, since the market
price reflects expectations and
the strength of buying demand.
But the underlying trend is

upwards in line with inflation,

and index-linked gilts are
essentially a form of insurance
against inflation. Of course, if

inflation falls to a low level,

then you might well get a bet-

ter return from shares.
The FT gives two prospec-

tive real redemption rates,

using projected inflation rates

of 10 and 5 per cent - but
these are just examples. The
return in practice depends on
the rate of inflation, which
boosts both the capital value

and the coupon (dividend).

As an example, if you buy at

£100 and annual inflation is 10
per cent, the stock would be

worth £110 at the end of the

year and, with a 2 per cent

coupon, you would receive two
dividends: the first of £1 and
the next £1.05.

By the end of year two, at

the same inflation rate, the
stock would be worth £.121 and
a further two dividends would
be paid of £1.10 and £1.16.

Tom Rostron of the Whit-
tingdaie group, a gilt specialist,

says in its latest quarterly
investment letter this week
that the key point about infla-

tion-indexed gilts is that, if

held to redemption, they do
guarantee a set return after

inflation. This is something
that no other liquid investment
offers.

He warns that the longer-

dated index-linked gilts are
more volatile in price but may
perform better than most if tbe

institutions become wary of

the stock market. However,
they would underperform
should the government decide

to cause a recession by raising

inflation rates sharply.

The cheapest way of buying
index-linked gilts is via the

National Savings stock regis-

ter. All 13 are available and
charges are very low. For pur-

chases below £250, the cost is

only £1; over £250, it is £1 plus

50p for every additional £125-

worth bought. Sales over £250
are charged at the same rate

but, below that you pay £1 for
sales between £100 and £250
and only lOp per £10 for sales
under £100.

The disdavantage is that the
deals are by post, so you can’t
make instant transactions and
don't know the exact price.
You also don’t receive any
advice.

Stockbrokers do offer advice
and the commission is vari-
able, mainly according to the
size of the deal; but generally,
charges are lower than for buy-
ing shares.

THEPOWERTO

* Source: Planned Savings Djli Services. Group Weighted Performance, offer lo offer, net income reinvested to l.-i -89.

In the highly competitive world ofunit trusts, it’s tough enough to come first with

one trust.

It’s even tougher to be the top performer across a group’s whole range of trusts.

But Fidelity has done it.

Not once, not mice, but an amazing six times outoftiae nineyears sincewe
launched our first unit trust

This quite uniqueperformance record has been achieved by strong, sustained,

.single-minded dedication to better research, better stock selection and better

management In fact, performance has always come firsr at Fidelity.

Talk to yourIndependent Financial Adviser about Fidelity’s outstanding performance

or call us freenowon 0S00 4l4l6l and find outwhy,when itcomes to unit trust investment,

Fidelityshould be your first choice.

Remember past performance is no guarantee offuture returnsand that the valueofunits
reflects the valueofdie underlying investments and may fluctuate and is not guaranteed.

Fidelity Inresiment Services limited: Member of IMRO and LM'TRO
Member %A ihe LTA

Ret Cute FT82
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The Week Ahead

Old dogs show off their new tricks
LIKE CLARENCE, marinated
in malmsey, companies steeped
in tradition are getting hard to
find. This market seems to like
its old dogs to Learn new tricks,
and most of those which have
survived the takeover surge of
the 1980s are trying to perform.
Next week's list, foreshort-

ened by the Bank Holiday, has
a couple of interesting
announcements on Wednesday.
Interims from Tate & Lyle
demonstrate the trend to
“focused" expansion; and pre-
liminary figures from
Harrisons & Crosfield will
show how the company is

changing from an international
trading and plantations
management business into a
conglomerate.
Under its chairman and chief

executive, Neil Shaw. Tate &
Lyle has hit the takeover trail

with a vengeance over the past
twelve months or so. From
being a possible target itself
early in 1988, it won Staley of
the US (com syrup), gained
control of the CST group
(starch production. Continental
Europe) and bought a leading
US cane refiner, all in six
months of frantic takeover
activity.

Tate has since taken control
of Spain's No. 2 producer of
cereal sweeteners and starches
and is currently buying in the
49.9 per cent minority in Red-
path Industries, its Canadian

subsidiary.
It is coming out of the acqui-

sition splurge, says John
Campbell of Prudential-Bache
Capital Funding (Equities) as a
“global carbohydrate proces-
sor." It also has a gearing ratio

of 200 per cent.

However, Richard Allen of
Kleinwort Benson Research
notes that the minority buy-in
will come to completion ou
Monday week; a major Redpath
divestment is expected to

reduce Tate's gearing to more
acceptable levels immediately
after that

In the meantime, the group
is expected to show first half
profits up from £44m to £67m
or £69m before tax, although
earnings per share will show
only a small increase because
of equity issued in the course
of takeovers.
Harrisons & Crosfield may

be out of plantations and into
speciality chemicals, timber
and builders' merchanting,
malting

,
animal feed and own-

label foods; but it decided in
January, said chief executive
George Paul, to retain its full

name in the City, rather than
use the "Harcros" diminutive
which identifies its subsid-
iaries at operating IeveL
At any rate, H & C, like Tate,

has been having a popular
time of it in the stock market
Richard Allen sits at the lower
end of analysts' forecasts with

Harrisons & Crosfield Tate & Lyle

Share price relative to the

FT-A Alt-Share Index

Stero price relative to he
FT-A Afl-Share Index

140

£120m pre-tax. up from £90m,
including a final contribution
from the 30 per cent share of
Harrison Malaysian Planta-
tions which has been sold for
£145m and was the last link
with the plantations business.
Wednesday's other big mim

is the Royal Bank of Scotland.
Investors may expect big
things out of the Royal Rank
after the Bank of Scotland’s 36
per cent jump in pre-tax profits

this week, but Vernon Madge
of Sheppards counsels caution.

He notes that the latter’s
results were for a full year,
while the Royal’s will be for six
months - during which the
effect on profit merging of high
interest rates and competition
for clients’ money has become

more apparent
Furthermore, he observes,

this is the financial year in
which both the Royal and the
Rank of Scotland, in its turn,

will return to providing for
pensions after a holiday from
corporate contributions. He
expects the Royal’s profits to

rise from £137m to £150m
before tax at the half-way
mark, and from £309m to
£325m for *ha full year.
Stakes built in two of next

week's food groups have been
put into the predator category,
ud share prices lifted accord-
ingly. Kwik Save, third genera-
tion of the “pile-it-high, sell-it-

cheap” food retailing tradition
- after Tesco, and Asda -
achieved a lot of growth and

somewhat less stock market
recognition until : the - Hong
Kong-based Dairy Farm Inter-

national bought its stake qp to

25 per cent in 1987.

Graeme Seabrook, seconded
from Dairy Farm in 1988, is a
managing director looking for

sites and for shopping centre

exposure for Kwik Save’s
retailing formula which, argu-
ably, has a niche to occupy
with major supermarkets mov-
ing into fresh foods, and out of

town.
Shearson Lehman’s Rowan

Morgan, in a pre-results com-
ment expects the group to post
half-year profits up from £24m
to £29m before tax next Thurs-
day on the way to £66m
(£55%m) for the year.
Nurdin & Peacock, the wish

and ^rry wholesaler to inde-
pendent retailers, the licensed
trade and other caterers, now
has the Dutch group SHV as a
6 per cent stakeholder. It may
also be seeing the turn of a tide

in food retailing.

Brokers CL-Alexanders
t

.

fling gs Crtrickshank. say in a
recent circular on the company
that the sales volume of small
food retail businesses showed a
fractional fawwinA in 1987 afi«w

years of daniina, and note that
the grocery majors are reduc-
ing their presence in grnaTi

j in-

town supermarkets. They
expect Nurdin to lift its 1968
profits from si&fim. to £19.7m

before tax, after a disappoint-

ing year in 1987.

Meanwhile, there are two
ways to look at Hunting Asso-
ciated Industries; first, that it

is a small defence contractor

used to feast and famine, and
risks a contraction In defence

profits in the early 1990s; and.

second, that despite its rela-

tively small size it is a desig-

nated defence prime contrac-

tor, and that it iswell placed to
win major weapon system con-

trasts with the current shak-
eup among major contractors
such as GEC, Plessey and BAe.
Clive Forestier-Walker of

Kitcat & Aitken expects Hunt-
ing to show pretax profits up
from £18.1m to £22.2m next
Tuesday, with subsequent
growth taking it over £30m for

1990. He notes that the com-
pany is family controlled,
which may reduce its attrac-

tions as a high-octane stock
market vehicle; however, he
says, as a bid-proof group it is

likely to be offered more
opportunities to bid on future
weapons programmes.
Other names include

Guinness Mahon, reporting its

half-year results on Thursday.
Economic' news closes the
week with housing starts and
completions from the Depart-
ment of tiie Environment on
Friday.

WilHam Cochrane

Capital gains tax Indexation allowance
Rl Month

1982
Rl Year
1983 1984 1985 1988 1987 1988 1989

January - 0.359 0.293 0.231 0.167 0.123 0.087 0.012
February - 0.354 0.288 0.221 0.162 0.119 0.083 0.004
March 0.414 0.351 0.284 0.210 0.161 0.116 0.079
April 0.386 0.332 0.267 0.185 0.150 0.103 0.061
May 0.376 0.327 0.262 0.180 0.148 0.102 0.057
June 0.372 0.324 0.259 0.177 0.148 0.102 0.053
July 0.372 0.317 0.260 0.179 0.152 0.103 0.052 *

August 0.371 0.311 0.249 0.176 0.148 0.100 0.041 •

September 0.372 0.305 0-246 0.177 0.142 0.097 0.036
October 0.365 0.300 0.239 0.175 0.141 0.091 0.026
November 0.358 0.296 0.235 0.171 0.131 0.086 0.021
December 0.361 0.292 0.236 0.169 0.127 0.087 0.018

Your mortgage choice

Revenue ready-reckoner
THIS IS the time of the year
when investors like to work
out their Capital Gains Tax
position daring the past fiscal

year to see whether they have
used up their £5.000 exemption
and if they will face a hefty tax
demand at the end of the year.
To make these calculations

you need to take into account
the indexation allowance,
which strips out the effect of
inflation and thus leaves only
the true gain to be taxed.

The Inland Revenue tax
offices do the calculations ou
your behalf when assessing

yonr liability, but for those
who want to work it out them-
selves the Revenue issues the
figures used in calculating the
indexation allowance, as
shown in the table above.
For purchases made before

March 1982 you take the value
as at March 1982. since follow-

ing the 1988 Budget this is now
the base. Otherwise, for pur-
chases made after March 1982,

you take the value of the origi-

nal purchase. You then multi-
ply the cost of the original pur-
chase by the figure given in
the table for the month of pur-

chase. Add the two figures
together, then deduct them
from the sale price to arrive at
the chargeable gain.

As an example a purchase
for £10,000 made before March
1982 would be multiplied by
0.414 = £4,140. Add these
together, and deduct £14.140
from the sale price, say £40,000,
and the chargeable gain is

£25,860. For a purchase made
in October last year the £10,000
would be multiplied by 0.026 =
£260. So only £10.260 would be
deducted from the sale price to
find the chargeable gain.

EMPLOYEES changing jobs, or
simply leaving their previous
employee’s company pension
scheme, are the target for a
new pension contract which is

being offered by Provident
Life.

The group’s Personal Trans-
fer Account is designed specifi-

cally so that employees can
transfer their accrued benefits

from their company scheme
into a personal pension.
The Budget proposals limit-

ing benefits in company

transfer plan
schemes to the first £60,000 of
earnings are likely to encour-
age highly-paid executives to
take the transfer value of their

accrued company pension ben-
efits, with their employer's
approval, and switch into a
personal pension.
Provident Life does not pay

commission to intermediaries
on its Gold Pension contracts,
and this applies also to the Per-
sonal Transfer Account. As a
result there is no bid-offer
spread, so at least 98 per cent

or the transfer money is

invested. The annual
management charge is 0.5 per
cent.

However, it does mean that
interested executives need to
deal with advisers operating on
a fee basis, such as accoun-
tants. solicitors and consulting
actuaries.

There is the usual choice of
several funds with varying
degrees of risk, from a unitised
with-profits fund to a
rnayimuTn growth fund.

Extra High Rates

With Only One Month’s Notice

10 .25%: 13 .10%
ftSAAB One Month Notice Account

offers:

Extra high interest - calculated daily, credited monthly

No penalties for withdrawals when one month's notice is given

Withdrawals on demand may be permitted subject to a fee

Minimum initial deposit: £2,001

No bank charges

For further information please telephone David Carroll on
01-629 6802, or FREEPOST the coupon below.

AAB - Allied Arab Bank isan established BritishBank, registered in theUnitedKingdom and is

recognised asan Authorised Institutionunder theBanking Act 1987,with itsHead Office in theCity

and a Branch in the West End ofLondon.Theshareholding ofAABindudesa majorUKClearingBank.

'interest ratesmay vary according tomoneymarket trends. High rateofinterestpaid onhalancesof
ELOOt and over. Net Compound Annual Rate is 10.72%. GrossCAR is13.92%.Gross EquivalentCAR is

14.29%, where tax is paid at basic rate. ^Compound Annual Ratecalcubted onmonthly interest

remaining invested).

To: The Manager, High Interest Accounts, AAB FREEPOST 16,

London W1E8HJ
Please send me details of the One Month Notice Account

Name

Address

AN INTEREST-ONLY
mortgage which leaves the
method of repaying the capital
up to the borrower has been
introduced by Choice Personal
Finance, a member of the TSB
group.
By scrapping the need for a

specific repayment vehicle
such as an endowment policy,

Choice is effectively offering a
straight loan, with your home
as collateral, and in this way is

enabling borrowers to reduce
costs. It is only insisting that a
term assurance policy is taken
out to cover the cost of repay-
ing the mortgage in the event
of the borrower dying.
Borrowers can choose to

repay the mortgage by any
method, including simply sell-

ing the property. Alternatively
they can make their own
savings plans separately, possi-

bly at a later date when they
may have more money avail-
able.

Philip Haynes, Choice gen-
eral manager, said that it

should appeal particularly to
first-time buyers anxious to
keep monthly outgoings to a
minimum finring the first few
years, without incurring extra
deferred interest charges.
The interest rate will be the

standard Choice mortgage rate,

currently 133 per cent, and the
lending criteria will also be the
same. Loans are available up
to 95 per cent of the value of
the property (or 90 per cent for

those over £150,000) and three
times the borrower’s annnai
income or 23 times in the case
ofjoint applications. Borrowers
must be between 25 and 50.

Meanwhile Abbey National
is offering mortgages, - with
higher-than-usual • interest
rates, for those wishing to buy
a second property or a holiday
home. It will also consider giv-

ing mortgages on overseas
properties, such as houses in
France, but these wdold be
treated as an extension of an
existing loan with Abbey
National rather than a sepa-
rate mortgage- In other words
you have one larger loan to
cover two properties — your
UK residence and a holiday
home overseas.

The interest rate is 1345 per
cent for foans over £60,000 and
144 per cent for smaller loans.
There are also stricter controls
On amnnnt that is lent.

Where a mortgage is

extended to include a second
property, the amount that can
be borrowed depends on the
value of the property and the
gjgp of the current outstanding
mortgage.
Where the second property

itself is separately used as
security the loan Is limited to

75 per cent of the purchase
price. .

In both cases the total sum
borrowed must not exceed 2.75

times the borrower’s main sal-

ary, or 2.25 times a joint
income. This is a lower level

than with a first mortgage,
since it reflects the extra costs
of maintaining two properties.

United Bank or Kuwait
claimed that it planned to be
the first -UK based- lender to
offer* French frflnc mortgfifiss

to finance the purchase of resi-

dential or commercial property
in any area of France. The
mortgage rate will move in line

with movements In the P1BOR
(Paris Interbank Offered Rate)
and is currently 9.9 per cent
Payments must be made in

French francs, so there is an
obvious currency risk for ster-

ling borrowers as with all for-

eign currency mortgages.

J.E.

A self-picked PEP
A SELF-SELECT Personal
Equity Plan (PEP) that allows
you to choose any qualifying
share but has no Betting up
charge or annual management
fee has been launched by KHlik
St Co., the London stockbrok-
ing firm recently set np by
Paul Killik, previously with
Quitter Goodison.
Dealing charges are the stan-

dard 1.65 per cent on the first

£7,000. declining thereafter, but
there is a high minimum
charge of £40 to discourage
buying too many shares. In
addition the firm will charge a
special collection fee of £750
on all dividends to cover the

cost of reclaiming the tax.
However, the dividend win be
credited tax free immediately.
The intention is to encour-

age purchases of only one or
two stocks. There win also be a
“feeder” fund allowing you to
invest £3,000 under the old-

style PEP and a further £4,800
under the new-style PEPs up
until April next year.
Several other stockbrokers

are offering PEPs allowing cli-

ents to choose their own
shares, but the charges tend to
be fairly high.
Meanwhile Bardaysbare, the

retail stockbroking arm of Bar-
clays Bank, continued that it

was planning to come back
into the PEP market with a
managed plan and one where
clients can make their own
investment decisions. Details
have yet to be finalised.

MIM Britannia says it has
received more than 16,000
requests for information about
its TaxBreak lump-sum PEP
investment scheme. It has
decided to extend from May 5
to May 19 the closing date fin: a
special offer of a 4 per cent
discount to any UK unitholder
wishing to switch existing
investments iwtn TaxBreak.

J. E

INTEREST RATES: WHAT YOU SHOULD GET FOR YOUR MONEY
Quoted
rate %

Compounded return

tor taxpayers to

25% 40%

Frequency
Of

payment

Tsx
(ss*

"Otari

Amount
f _ a
tlllUWU

t
WRMrawsi

«tayri

CLEARING BANK*
Deposit account . 4.50 4.60 3.68 monthly 1 0-7
High Interest cheque 7.80 7.80 6.32 monthly 1 1,000-4,999 0
High interest cheque 6.00 8J0 684 monthly 1 54006,999 0
High interest cheque .... 640 670 6.96 monthly 1 10000-48.999 0 -

High Interest cheque 8-80 9J2Q 7.86 monthly 1 50,000 0

BUILDING SOCJETYt

L
Tick if non-UK resident

Oar branch situated at 131-132 Park lane. London W1Y3AD.
FT 29/4/89

Ordinary share B.OQ 8J». 427 half-yearly 1 1-250.000 0
High (merest access 8.00 600 6.40 yearly 1 500 0
High interest access 625 6.25 680 yearly 1 2.000 0
High Interest access 675 8.75 7.00 yearly 9,000 0
High Interest access 9.00 9.00 720 yearly i 10.000 0
90-<Jay „. 9.05 9.25 7.40 half yearly 1 500-6,999 90KMay „ _ 9.50 9.73 7.78 half yearly 1 10.00624,989 90
90-day - 10.00 1025 820 half yearly 1 25,000 SO

NATIONAL SAVINGS
Investment account
Income bends ...

10.75

1150
12.00

7^0
7.50

S.01

606
9.09

9.00

7.50
7.50

5.01

6.45

7.28

7.20

7.50
7J0
5471

yearly

monthly
yearly

not applies
not applies

not applla

2
2
2
3
3
3

5-100,000

2.000-100,000

100 rain.

25-1.000

20-200/month

1 mth
.

3 mth*
3 mth*

8
14
8

34th issued
Yearly plan

General extension

MONEY MARKET ACCOUNT
Schroder Wagg 680 9^0 7.36 monthly 1 2J00
Provincial Bank 9.78 1023 618 monthly 1 1,000 0

UK GOVERNMENT STOCKS
5pc Treasury 1986-89 10.73 9.45 8£8 half yearly 4

. 8pc Treasury 1892 10JI1 681 7^6 had yearly 4
10.25pc Exchequer 1995 10.47 7^9 634 half yearly 4 ^ ‘

3pc Treasury 1990 9-S3 6.09 8.62 half yearly 4
3pc Treasury 1992 9.17 634 7.83 half yearly 4
index-linked 2pc1992S§ 8.58 608 7.78 half yearly 2/4 - 0

r,%7.rr .. r»7n~ iui uohiiwo U.UUU.V opttciai IHCHliy TOT BXXTZ £10,000
SSouree.Phillips and Drew. §§Assumes 5.0 per cent inflation rate. 1 Paid alter deduction of composite rate tax. a
Paid gross. 3 Tax free. 4 Dividends paid after deduction of basic rate tax.

COMPANY NEWS SUMMARY

CoBweosr
bid for

TAKE-OVER BIDS AND MERGERS.
Value oi Price Vpfe* -

Md per Marie* before elMd
, -jban** pdeer taw*

. ..

Boasa UaasM
Budget*
CCA PuW4 '

CttamberTn PMpps
Chsmbsrfn PMpp
Com Gold FMda
DOT Grp. -

Gateway
Habit Precision
Keep Trust

Prices Id pence unless otherwise tofflo

soers 320 304 103.03

157 148 132 134.5

136* 134 . 115 1490

224. 228 154 8422

i.
: -23ir 229- 189 84.52

1300 1435 646bn

- 123W 1« .
112 601

196" WV.
.

134 1.7am

BOOR:
Low (WraJ

mv
Evade:;

Banter tods.

Apricot Comp.

Magnet

Mfflmcd Brawn..
HO -

Ptunb HMgs.
Viking Pack. ' -

WAHfdgt.

550*5

300"

101

-2DQTt
1355

210
*

173*

50

203
290
97

217 -

133*2

•208-

169

48

70
-

513

150

set..

208

83S
5X8
8.98

54822
7737 .

14,08

Ep*C«»

127*2 315*1
189
123

41

2853
1B.4

19.06

Black (Pslar)

.

DMWSL
Corned Hidgs.

WP •-

Rolls Boyce -

Ratos tods.

Dewater tads.

Hadsn MacLsMn

All c»»it otfer.ffCaah alternative. ^Partial bW- *For capital *‘™“V
conditional.**8ased on ZSOpm price* 88AW8B.TAt suspension. USftarea end cash.

01*

PRELIMINARY RESULTS

Company (EOOO) IP)

OMdends*.
per altera (p)

Albany Urn. TeL
Allied Insurance _
AMEC
Ashley Laura
Bank of Scotland
Bank of Wale*
Barlows
Bfflam 1
British Fittings
Brtxton Estate
Caparo Indust.
CMM Health Res
Cl Group
Cfaricson Horace
Dencora
DukenaInstar
Edinburgh bw.
Epwln Group
Executes Clothes
Famed Elect.
FKzwBton
FR Group
Frost’Group .

Gold Base & Met.

Haden MecteUan
Hawthorn Leslie
Jennyit Inv. Co.
JMO Group
Jonas Group .

London Finance
Molynx Hokfinge
Netit Jamas - -

Plumb HofcBnga
Radamec Group
Rediand
Ropnar
Saga Group
Scnntons
Serif Cowed*
Sherwood Comp.
Shiloh
Smallatiaw ft.

Sovereign OB
8peor JW A Sons
SftU Stores
Tarmac -

Thurgar Bardex
Tootal Group
TR Energy
TV-AM -

Verson M*L
WA Holdings

'

Yota Cano

Feb 424.
Dec 331
Dec 61.600
Jan 20.260
Feb 178300
Feb 2.500

Oec. 611 -

Dec 125
Dec 5.590

16,160
8,540
10
6.130
5.100

Dec
Dec
Dec
Jan
Dec
Dec 8,850
Dee . 3J2O0:
Mar 24440
Dec -2^10
Dec 443
Jan 27,110
DecT 5^60
Doc 22,400
Dec 3,530
Dec 102
Dec 11.100
Dec® 4,780
Dec 310
Dec* 1,610

'

Dec* 5.180
Dec 472
Dec 899
Dec 6,160
Jan 2300
Dec 430
Dec 221.500
Dec 5,250
Jan** 2,730
Dec 2£00
Dec 6.480

1.970 LDec
Mar 1,240
Dec .356
Dec 1,900
Dec 206
Jan 1.890
Dec 393.100

1.700
42£90

Oec
Jan

(34,500).
(23.060)
(131.300)
(2.600)

(43)
'•

.. .

(12 )

"

(2.91 0)
(16210)
(2.110)

(92. L)

(3,010)

(3.460) .

(4.060)

(2.680)

(16,720)

(2,119)

(546)
(25.710)
(541)

(22.100)

(2.320)

cr2):;.

(1.900)

(3.300)

(168)

(639 L)
(4.360)

(756)

(500)

(7.60Q)

bbl
(185,100)

(4,130)

(2 ,210)

(700)-

(4JI00)

(1.890)

-(1,450)

(440)
(4.700)

(380) -

(1.745)

(265.400)
(1.910)

Dec 621 L
Jan 20,130

(40.290)

MOL)

Jan
Jan

1.860
£060

Dec- 17,800

(3.480

(13400)
(927)

(1.600)

(14.016)

3,12 (2.41)

6.1 19.2)
47.8 (34.0)

8-57 (7.30>

: 138 (109)
4.9 (7.0)

.

332 (2.57)

SSL (1.3)

203 (14.5)

14* (11.9)

5*4 (0.65)

015 (-)

5.43 (3.71)

16.0 (10.1)
28.5 (15*)
2.83 (3*4)
6.76 (4.12)

T13 (12.2)

7.8 (11.3)

133 (13.1).

932 (1-10)
208 (104)
18.0 (123)
048

.
(0.46)

15.1 (7-7)
'

1-74 (1.5)

107 (8 82)

044 (-)

33.8 (35.1).

1.38 (229
103 (6-8)

17.1 (22.1)-

12.4 (143)
13 (7.3)

523 (43.2)

11.9 (9.1)-

10.8 (6.74)

37.6 (11J))

17.4 (13.4)

- (273)
143 (16.6)

939 (113)
1.9 (3.80)

238 (5.69)

11.1 (103)
343 (23-5)

337 (5.48)

11JO (113)
-

. H
106 (15.9)

2.03 (1.42).

4.45 (3.02)

11.7- (102)

23 (2.25)

2.5 (4.0)

173 (13.0)

035 (235)
3.8 .(3.15)

23 12.8)

235 (075)

4.04 |4.0)
6.385 (4.5)

"9.75 (7.8)

2.05 (135)
- W
13 (137)
635 (5-25)

53 (3.0)

13 (-)

5.4 (4.15)

53 (43)
13 (33)
43 (33)
- • « ‘

534 (4.62)

025 (7.0).

04 (04)-

6.0 (2.5)

06 (035)
23 (05)
- ’

- (03)
10.0 (05)
13 (1.1)

235 (1.75)

83- (RO)
53 (4.25)

13 (1.5)

193 (153)
735 (7-0)

73 (43)
14.0 (63)
6.0 (33)
- . (43)
2375 (235)
3.0 (3.0)

(-)

23 (6.0)

435 (4.0)

100 (735)

23 (235)
4.85 (4.5)

- (-)-

63 ,(4.5)

0375J0.33)
1.5 (13)
33 - (OO)

nrnRWf^TAtmB«TS
; Atari*

dr-pw ***;»>
-Attm. v . Deer 3,’OOQ. (2J980JX wn-5 .

'(13):

Allied London .Props. • Deo-- • (3,460) *137 -(0.^
Bertram Invest. Tut Mart 58 (31} .0.9 (0.75)

British Empire Sec. Mart 1.134 (176 L) 0425 (030)
COFC Trust .

- - Mari 2,580 (2,900)
*

Church Charles Feb 8,950 (8.770) 1.0 0-0}
CosaR Feb 2.110: (1,300) 4.0 (23)
Daks Simpson Jan 2,410 (2,330)

- 33 - -(3.0)
Ensign Trust Mart 1240 (1350) 0.3 (0-3)

Fenner JH : . Mar 5.450 - (4,520) 62 (3^0)
Five Oaks Invests. Dec 1,520 (809) 0.8 w.
Hatfield Estates Feb .1,004 (253) 135 (-)

.m Mar# 442.000 (358.000) - (')

leampe Fab 1.1W (1.028) 235 (210)
London A Pros. Shop Dec 3,970 (743) - (-)

Lowland Investment March 887 1746) 23 (13)
Mwiory Computer Dec 25 (104) • (-)

Matamec Jentique Dec 26 (6 L) . (')

New Cavendish Estate Oec 71 L (5 L) - (-)

Regina Health Dec 101 (62) _ (-)
'

Rosebaugb Dec 20,098 (9326) - (-)
ocoumn irairo. rrop

,
Feb 5,580 (3300) 235 (2-0)

SbanT Group Jan 14)02 (987) 13 H
St hres Group - Jan 12,500 (10,060) 135 (0.75)
Ulster Telavialon Jan 1,400 (1320) 23 (23)
Wade Potteries Jan 620 (1.070) 1.85 (1-5)
Wellcome Feb •»28,700 (94,800) 1.3 (1.0)

(Figures in parentheses are for the corresponding period.)
tohrldends are shown net pence per share, except where otherwise
iruBotad. L — tosajfr Total income^ Irish punts & pence-t Net revenue.

® This years figures for 11TWs years Ogives for nine months.
. ..

monttiM* This years figures for 15 monOuM* Fhat quarter figures.
This years figures for 18 montfia.

Sv

RIGHTS ISSUES
Atylo to to raise CSOm via a one-fof-ons rights issua of convertible bonds.
Tsltwa Ortn^ Is to rairn C21m via a two-for-tira- rights Issoa at SOOp.

O

OFFERS FOR SAUE, PLACINQS
AND INTRODUCTIONS

8«tniora totsraaUem] is to Join tits USM via a placing of 228m shares at^ m*ln “ placlnfl •"
Tatars Group fat to gain a full Stock Exchange listing via an introduction.

RESULTS DUE
Company
FINAL DfVlDBfDS
Apollo Watch Products

.

BOA Holdings
B**w® Jamas.
Boot Henry & Sons

,

Brewmakar

.

Dolyn Packaging

.

Forward Group -

HarrisonaXCreanaM

,

Highcrcdt Investment Trust

.

14-Tec Sports.

Last year This year
due - M. Final M.

— Wednesday
—— Tuesday 13 1.5.. 13— Tuesday 13 33 1.1— Thursday : 53 93 53— -Tuesday 03— Wednesday 0375 676 - 645

Wednesday 03 2-0 13
-Wednesday 103 -160- > 160— Thursday .. 1.1 : 1.6 ' 13

Hunting Associated Industries^,
Jackson Group - - —
taw.
Mezzanine Cap. 6-inc. Tat.

.

Moss Bros. Group
Nurdin & Peacock—
OlS Group

,

PathbOM Brotinrs

.

Time Products

.

Titaghur Juta Factory

.

UPL Group

.

Usher-walker

.

Westerly

Tuesday
Thursday
Tuesday
Friday
Tuesday
Wednesday
Tuesday -

Thursday -

Thursday
Tuesday;.
Friday
Wednesday
Thursday

33
1.0

43
23

1.S

4.0
13

2.75
23
13

7.7
2.7

53
13
136

13
1.76

33
235

13
2.5

2.7

05

1-409
62
23

1.0

3JO
0.5

Apollo Metals

.

Clrcaprint Holdings

.

Eurotnoney

.

Fundinvest

.

Glasgow Income Trust

.

Guinness Mahon Holdings

,

Johnson Group Cleaners

.

Kalamazoo

.

Kwik Save Group

,

Royal Bank of Scotland
.

Sanderson Beetnonka -
Speyhawk

.

Tate & Lyle

,

Video Tape Recordings

.

Thursday -

Tuesday
Wednesday
Tuaaday
Thursday
Thursday
Thursday _
Tuesday
Thursday
Wednesday
Tuesday
Thursday

'

'

Wednesday
Wednesday

53
3378

2.4

83 -

E.S92

52
0-5
2.4
53
67
3.0
103
as

13
64

13
5.4

9.7
ao
93
193
1.7

S'toS."
8 8h°Wn **** par *h4ra •"» «• "Susted for any tntarvsnlng

|s<.

H'hi

VJ
j

T

. I
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FINANCE & THE FAMILY
Older people should benefit from the changes
planned for next year, says Anthony Cassweli

How to enjoy a lower

marital taxation bill
THE INDEPENDENT taxation
for married couples, to be
introduced with effect from
April next year, will offer spe-
cial opportunities to increase
marital, net Income if either
spouse was born before April 6,

1926./.
Anyone aged over-65 is eligi-

.

ble to receive an age allow-
ance, which gives extra , relief

from tax over and above the
personal allowance. Thebe' Is
further relief when you reach
75, following this, year's Bud-',
get. Yon receive these, addi-
tional allowances in full pro-
vided that yOilr total income is

-

below the age allowance
Income limit.

For every £2 of gross income
above this limit, there is a £i
withdrawal of age allowance
until it runs out completely.
On each £2 in the age allow-
ance withdrawal band, income
tax at 25 per cent will take 50
pence, as usual, while loss of
£1 of age allowance will incur'
25p tax. Thus, the effective tax
of 75p on £2, or 37.5 per cent, is

clearly to be avoided.
This year’sBudget improved

the rate of withdrawal of age •

allowance for 1989-90, although
there Is still only one income'
limit for both

1

married couples
and single people. Howeveiy
from April 1990 the appropriate
basic or age allowance will be.
available individually, and' the'

income limit -will apply sepa-

rately to each spouse.
The married couple's allow-

ance, which will be based on
the spouse who is oldest, will

normally be given to the hus-
band but will be transferable
to the wife to the extent that
the husband has too little

income to use it.

To work out your situation,

you should first estimate your
net income as you expect it to
be for 1988-90, and then what it

would be if independent taxa-

tion were already to be avail-

able. This will give you some
idea of your ^automatic*. tax
relief from nextApril and what
transfers of assets may be nec-
essary to increase your net
income.
You will want to ensure that

National Insurance Pensions

Single Plus lor Married

,
person . wife couple-

1988-88 basic rales £2140 £1287 £3427
1989-90 basic rates £2258 £1365 £3629
1690-91 (RP1 up 6.5%}

“
E2413 £1452 £3865

you can make use of both sin-
gle-allowances and of the mar-
ried couple's allowance, and
that neither income will fall in
the age allowance withdrawal
band. - -

.. The first accompanying table
shows annual rates of National
Insurance pension for last year
and this; the planning projec-
tion for 1990-91 has been based
on the assumption that infla-

tion will have dropped to 6.5

per cent by September. A
wife’s National Insurance pen-
sion will count as her own
income even if it arises solely
as a result of her husband's
contributions.
The second table shows the

basic and age allowances, with
tile income limits and the mar-
ginal levels at which age allow-
ances run out.- Indexation
depends upon the increase in
the Retail Price Index for. the

year to the previous December.
The projected inflation fig-

ure of 5.5 per cent comes from
the official Financial State-
ment and Budget Report
198940 (FSBR). Suggested plan-
ning figures assume inflation

at 7 per cent by the end of 198%
hopefully, the worst situation.

But if you base your plans on
hlgber-tban-expected rates of
inflation and indexation, this

should ensure that enough Is

transferred between you to
make full use of both your
allowances.

Interest on deposits in build-

ing societies and banks is paid
net and the tax deemed to have
been paid is not recoverable by
non-taxpayers, so transfer of
such deposits is ineffective for

using up tax allowances.

More suitable contracts are
offered by National Savings
because, whether taxable or

Independent tax allowances for pensioners

At
1989-90
levels

Projections (or 1980-1891.

If RP1 Dec.88-Dec.80 Is

+5.5%
(Per FSBR)

+7%
(Planning)

Single Allowance £2,766 £2*40 E3JM0

Married Coopla'a Atfcnmneas
Ago 65.74

£1^N £1,680 £1.700

SbigtaAga Mlomnoa £3,400 S3£90 £3,640

Man tad Aga Allowance . £1.985 £2,100 £2.130

Aga Allowance Income Until £11.400 £12.100 £12200

Aga AKowanca ram owl above:
Stagaparaan £12.630 £13.400 £13.440
WMi marrtad aga aflomnoa £13.420 £14.240 £14240

AgaTSAovar
Parana! AKowanca £3£40 £12.100 £12.200
Married Coupte'a ABowanoo Was £21.40 £2.170

Aga Aftowanca Incoma LMI
Aga Allowance nma out abova:

Cl1.400 £12.160 £12400

Stngfa pairon £12.010 £13.700 C133W
WBfc married aga aflownca £13.700 £14.620 £14.740

Courts branches out
COUTTS & CO., the- exclusive
private banking, subsidiary..of
NatWcst, is moving slightty

downmarket with-the launch
of a portfolio

,
service which

Invests in both unit and invest-

trusts.

e bank already has an
Investment management side,

which handles portfolios with
a minimum of £100,000. But it

has now decided to cater for

customers, and non-customers,

with smaller portfolios.

Peregrine Banbury, head of
investment management, said

the new service was designed

primarily for customers of the

bank who would normally be
..expected to htfve^an. annual
income of over £50,000, or- free

asset* of £150,000. However,
with its freedom as an Indepen-
dent .intermediary, Coutts was
able to offer medium-sized
Investors the opportunity to

establish a portfolio that min-
imised risk, while aiming at
long-term capital growth.
There will be fairly stringent

rules, though. For example, the
portfolio will include only
investment trusts with funds
under management of more
than £50m, and unit trusts
with at least £20m - and both

must have' had a good perfdr-

mmSCe record over the past five

years.* The portfolio ‘wm usu-
ally be made up of 30 percent
unit trusts and 70 per cent
Investment trusts.

There is a setting-up charge
of 2 per cent of the amount
invested, plus a half-year man-
agement fee of 0.5 per centdn
addition, there are the dealing
costs in the underlying holds,

although Coutts hopes to nego-
tiate discounts on unit trust

purchases that will be passed
on to customers.

John Edwards

Where do you take £25,000
when nobody wants to know?

Aston major sockbtoking houses become

inDeasmflV^^rtutkxvaPscd* fewer and fewer c<

them warn to Know too private investor - even

wtenhecancoovnandk^

An honourable exception js Phidential-

Bacfte Sacurfces who do normsrely rataome

the private investor but offer him professional

advice, personal financial planning, and market

.

Qxpcrtse. backed by a Qitiup d 20 senior UK

analysts.

Our obmnmssion rates are very competitive.

STOCKBROKING FOR PRIVATE CLIENTS

and our computerised service means that you’ll

receive the most up to dale account information.

Prudential-Baefw Securities, with offices in

330fcnstionsaround thework*« the stodtoroking

arm of the Prudential insurance Company of

America, the targes! non-bank financial services

company sr» the world.

Why npt call Sheila Bromley on 494 8785

during business horns and arrange to come in

and find out mote? After all, we dorf! call It a

personal client senrioe for nothing.

Prudential-Bache
Securities*

pnx«<̂ .B^^wSd<^<^a^3 tnc-5 aurtnxgonGflKlerwWiXlt£
M«i4WO4TSA*n0AFBD '

INDEPENDENT
TAXATION

FOR MARRIED
COUPLES

not, the interest Is paid with-
out deduction of tax. Govern-
ment stocks (gilts) can also be
used. The interest is taxable
but tax can be reclaimed by
non-taxpayers; and if you buy
gilts through the post office,

the interest is paid without
deduction of tax.

When planning to prevent
the income of either spouse
from falling into the age allow-
ance withdrawal band, it might
be prudent to assume that the
income limit for 1990-91 will be
only £12,000 and that age allow-
ance will run out at £15.000 for
the husband and £14,000 for the
wife.

For the purpose of the
income limit, interest from
building societies and banks
must be grossed-up by adding
one-tbird to the net amount
received. Chargeable gains on
insurance contracts must be
included
Provided that you can adjust

the balance of income between
you, the planning figures sug-

gest that, in 199081, no tax will

be payable on the first £7,700
where age allowance does not
apply to either spouse, rising

to a maximum of £9,770 if both
qualify for the over-75 rate.

And if you have a combined
gross income of £24,000, which
you ean split equally between

.

you, it should be possible for
both of you to enjoy full age
allowances and to achieve a
marital tax bill which is £1,348
less than in 1989-90.

Unit trusts: Christine Stopp examines Save & Prospers record

It’s time to produce the goods
IN A MARKET where
short-termism is decried vehe-

mently as a noxious epidemic,
Save & Prosper is one of a
handful of unit trust groups
that really can produce really

long-term performance figures.

For example, a £10.000 Invest-

ment in S&P’s High Return
trust in 1965 would, in 1988,
have paid out £3,280 in divi-

dends (compared with £803
from a similar building society

investment) and would have
had a capital value of E8-L880.

Yet. on cumulative figures
going back seven years, High
Return has not once been
above the sector average.
Indeed, far from being an
investment phenomenon, the
impressive High Return figures
reflect primarily what the UK
equity market has done in the
period (the M&G Dividend
fund, for example, did even
better).

Nevertheless, most investors
would probably not complain
at such a return and might go
along with the view that S&P
has accomplished its objectives
as outlined by Christopher Tra-
cey, the investment director.
He says; “We aim to beat infla-

tion, to improve on the build-
ing society, and to give the
greatest possible reward with
the least risk. We are not a
short-term fashion bouse. To
plan to be top of the tables is

asking for trouble. We make no
apologies if people see us as
being on the dull side.”

To eschew short-termism
might be regarded as a virtue,

but is it merely an excuse for
poor performance? Looking at
cumulative figures over the
past seven years, S&P has few
top performers; and of those it

does, half are in small, special-

ist sectors. Of eight trusts in

the three big UK sectors, only
Scotshares and Smaller Com-
panies Income have anything
like a record of long-term con-
sistency. Other trusts which

Save & Prosper strong and weak performers
Offer-to-bfd, Income reinvested. Years to 1.4.89.

Trust 1 2 3 5 7

Smaller Cos. Inc. 18.6 21.3 74.9 186.1 367.6
(15/125) (17/108) (14/98) (11/67) (18/55)

US Growth 13.9 -5.8 1.5 54.1 1650
(57/117) (16/103) (24/90) (12/59) (10/36)

S.E. Asia Gth. 45.1 30.4 121.2 132.0 174 7

(10/78) (7/65) (3/53) (6/30) (19 /22)

Energy Indus. 25.3 19.7 61.8 37.8 105.3

(1/30) (1/27) (3/24) (1/19) (5/13)

UK Equity 11.7 5.2 28.8 120.4 293.5

(75/109) (63/99) (66/91) (43/75) (30/66)

High Return 11.3 6.8 44.1 152.9 345.4
(86/125) (96/106) (75/98) (43/67) (35/55)

European Gth. 19.6 16.4 12.1 103.7 310.6

(52/101) (57/84) (31/59) (16/18) (8/11)

Japan Growth. 3.5 13.7 74.3 140.3 464.8

(47/60) (47/60) (28/55) (21/32) (11/13)

Source Rnatat

have been frequent visitors to
the top quartile are Energy and
South East Asia Growth.
The group's main defects are

a patchy record in the staple
UK trusts and few successes in
other major markets. US
Growth is an exception. But
the group's other two US funds
- Smaller Companies and
Income & Growth - have not
done well.

Some of S&P’s troubles are
historical. There was no
in-house management team
until 1979: trusts were con-
tracted out to other groups.
Tracey admits frankly that per-

formance in the 1970s was
“dreadful.“ He also reckons it

takes 10 to 20 years to establish
an in-house team. But it is easy
to put blame on outside fund
managers who are no longer
there to defend themselves,
and the first 10 years of estab-

lishing the team are up. By
any standards. S&P should
now be coining up with the
goods.
The market perception of the

group has been of a declining
giant, and market share figures
bear this out In 1986-87, when
fund managers’ salaries (as

well as equity markets) went
mad. the group found itself los-

ing good managers who were
lured away by the more varied
prospects of groups offering
other types of fund as well as
unit trusts.

In April last year S&P
became owned wholly by, and
merged operations with, its

major shareholder, Robert
Fleming. A team of 15 manag-
ers and no analysts before the
merger became one of 60 man-
agers and analysts in the com-
bined fund management group.

This, plus access to the Jardine
Fleming fund management
operation in Japan, should
bring considerable benefits.

Tracey claims: “The way we
make investment decisions
now is less hand-to-mouth than
it used to be.”

In the one-year performance
figures, 14 funds out of 31 are
above average compared with
nine out of 26 over five years.

This suggests the position is

being turned round but doesn't

say much for the way invest-

ment was being run before the
merger. For a £2bn group to

say that decision-making is

now “less hand to mouth"

gives cause for concern.
In comparing funds with the

sector average and with the

competition - the top 40 or so
groups - Tracey sees an
actual cause for worry in a
fund which has become a

chart-topper, since this might
mean it is taking undue risks.

This novel cause for anxiety
stems from the fact that many
S&P unitholders have been
investors for very long periods
- perhaps even 20 or 30 years
- and preservation of their

capital is seen as paramount
As a result of its cautious

philosophy, S&P survived the

1987 crash relatively welL But
the poor performance of the
large funds is due partly to the
continuation of the same
approach in 1988 when a more
aggressive stance would have
been more appropriate.
There has been a change of

managers on the UK Equity
fund. Success in this sector has
been due largely to takeover
stocks over the past few years,

and S&P's refusal to take large

positions in individual compa-
nies has been damaging.
The main aim for the imme-

diate future is to make the
main UK funds more solid. The
Fleming merger did not result

in the larger group “stepping
in and doing things." The
major changes have been the
enlarged team, the big com-
pany atmosphere, and the
availability of UK and overseas
research from the parent group
which has a strong reputation
for managing investment
trusts.

There is plenty of scope for

applying the new injection of

expertise. The group hopes to

be consistently above average
but, as Tracey admits, there
are still “too many stragglers."

High Return's impressive
record since 1965 says more for

long-term investment in the
stock market than for S&P's
specific expertise.

1 - 9 - 8-9
RECORD
RESULTS

ASSETS 1989

1987

1988

PROFITS

E!?* ll P

1987

iJil

411 /o

U|>

52%

. ... .. x < v'*

£162 million £212 million £279 million

PRE TAX 1989

RETURN ON
CAPITAL

1987

£2.6 million £4 million £5.6 million

1988

RESERVES

1988

1987

5.21%

Pre-tax profits as a percentage of the average reserves

at tne oegwung and end oJ eacn year.

a.6 million £11.1 million £14.7 million

Provisional results year ended 31st March 1989.

m
869 Forest Road, Walthamstow, London E17 4BB. Tel: 01-531 3231.
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FINANCE & THE FAMILY
THE DAYS when it was
possible to invest in almost
any UK-quoted company and
make a reasonable profit seem
to have long gone. The private
Investor now needs to look
closely at a company and its

prospects before making a deci-

sion as to whether to invest
There are still some good bar-
gains to be found, but it takes
much more effort to find them.

1 still have investments in a
number of mainly small com-
panies plus possible "takeover
targets" and “special situa-
tions". But I remain rather
cautious about the short-term
prospects for shares. As to the
medium and long term out-
look. who knows?
Does this mean that non-

stock market investments now
have greater appeal? With
inflation apparently still rising,

my and my wife’s investment
in the fourth issue Index-linked
National Savings Certificates
look even more attractive as a
“safe haven" for some of our
money.
Each year, the certificates

pay a range of interest that
matches the rate of Inflation as
measured by the Retail Price
Index.
This is added to a basic rate

of interest which ranges from 3
per cent in the first year to 6
per cent in year five, providing
an overall return of 4.04 per
cent per year on top of the
inflation proofing if the certifi-

cates are held for the full five

years.

When the certificates are
cashed in, the repayments are
free from, all UK tax, which

Diary of a Private Investor

It takes time to root

out share bargains
shnnTd maim them particularly

appealing to higher rate tax-

payers.

They might also be attrac-

tive to non-taxpayers who do

not want to tie up too much
money in a bank deposit
account from which basic rate

tax will automatically be
deducted.

Unfortunately, the maximum
holding per person of the
fourth Issue index-linked certif-

icates is only £5,000. This Is

possibly because the govern-
ment Is not 100 per cent sure it

can "control” inflation and
because government funds are

heavily in surplus and so it

does not really need to borrow
further sums.
So Ear, however, the govern-

ment kept the minimum
holding level of these certifi-

cates to £25, but it has recently

announced that the minimum
purchase of Premium Bonds
will rise from £10 to £100 from
July 1 this year.
Perhaps the government still

wants to encourage "small
favours", but not "small gam-
blers”?
The chance of winning any

premium bond each year is one

in 11,000 but my wife and I

each have the maximum
£10,000 Premium Bonds hold-

ing so, theoretically, we should
stand a one in L7 chance of

winning a prize in every draw.
The odds against us not win-

ning a single prize every year
are 55,000 to one. The size of
the tax-free prizes ranges from
£250,000 to £50 - although file

odds on a band winning the
£250,000 prize are one in 2bn.
How have we fared in prac-

tice? In 1988 1 won 13 £50 prizes
and one £100 prize ™Wfng a
tax free return of £750; while
my wife won six £50 prizes and
two £100 prizes, producing
total winnings of £500.
Kimberley, one of my two

young daughters only had a
holding worth £25 which was
purchased for her in early 1988.
Within six months she won
£50.

My “performance” this year"
has been miserable - only one
£50 prize - while my wife has
so Ear had six £50 prizes and
two £100 prizes , giving her
£500 already.
Kimberley has won nothing,

although she used £25 of her
“winnings” to buy more pre-
mium bonds. She put .the rest
into a deposit account with a
building society which she
hopes will eventually follow
the example of Abbey National
in aiming for a stock market
quotation.

In the Abbey National flota-

tion children will receive an
exfr" 5£ per cent interest on
the amount in thefr accounts
as at December 31, 1988, as a
"compensation payment” for

not having a vote on. whether
or not the society should con-

vert into a public company.
Recently my wife arid I have

opened separate modest build-

ing society accounts with
National and Provincial, which
has been “tipped” as being one
of the most likelybuilding soci-

eties to follow Abbey Nation-

al’s example.
Alliance and Leicester is also

thought to be seriously consid-

ering an eventual flotation

and, as I already have an
account with that society my.
wife has recently opened one
with them in her own name.
Turning back to the stock

market 1 remain concerned
about the high levd of interest

rates and the huge foreign
trade gap. If millions of people

already appear to accept inter-

est rates of 25 per cent, and
sometimes over 30 per cent, on
certain credit cards and bor-

rowings then wfll ah extra half

or 1 per cent on interest
~

cause tfw»m to cut their

:

frig on foreign products ?
Surely higher interest rates

m«rn higher costs for British

manufacturers who wffl then
pass them on to consumers
making foreign peodncts even
rhAupgr and more attractive in
comparison?

Kevin
Goldstein-Jackson

IT IS astonishing that the
Finance Bill 1989 should
Include a strong attack on pri-

vate investment companies. It

is proposed that, in future,
they are to be taxed at the
higher rate of Income tax if

they fail to distribute less than
85 per cent of investment
income to their shareholders.
They are also to be obliged to

distribute their capital gains.

In addition, their manage-
ment expenses - such as
office costs, directors4

fees and
loan interest payable on their
borrowings - are no longer to

be deductible items in comput-
ing their tax liabilities.

Moreover, private compa-
nies which serve as vehicles

for dealing in real estate or
stocks and shares are to be
treated not as carrying on an
active business but as if they
were passive investors.

The reasoning for this
switch in government attitude

has not been explained. All
that is known about the objec-
tives of the change is that,
under existing law, companies

The memory lingers on
get tax deductions for interest
and other payments in circum-
stances whereby an individual
taxpayer (it Is said) could not
get comparable deductions.
Thus, the Chancellor’s osten-

sible purpose is to secure neu-
trality and to destroy the fis-

cal attraction of a private
company vehicle. Given this
alleged objective, U is reason-

able to examine in some detail
how it is being fulfilled.

Two different possibilities

emerge: either the Revenue
has made an honest error and
has foiled to recognise that it

is creating a system under
which companies are to be
positively disadvantaged by
comparison with individual
invertors; or the explanation
put forward is mere humbug.
On the first supposition,

individual taxpayers carrying
on file activity of dealing in
land or other investments are
permitted to set against the

taxable profits of this activity
the commercially reasonable
costs of tirawagfag the oxter-
prise. These include office ser-
vices, professional costs, pay-
ments to managers and travel.
But if the corporate frame-

work is chosen to undertake
these activities, these items
become no longer deductible.
Why should that be so?
The corporate vehicle is not

an abuse. It is a convenient
vehicle permitting the aggre-
gation of such activities into a
composite whole; the raising
of short and long-term finance;
and the adoption of limited lia-

bility.

Suppose the partnership
alternative, and not the corpo-
rate vehicle, is selected. Five
individuals, in partnership,
are liable to pay tax at only 25
per cent on investment or deal-
ing profits totalling over
£100,000 (ignoring personal
allowances, other deductions

or income).
But if they use a corporate

vehicle, and re-invert income
for the long turn **i«*«aH of
drawing it down for present
consumption, then the tax rate
rises to a flat 40 per cent from
the very first pound of profits
earned.
So does it seem as if the sec-

ond explanation of positive
discrimination Is the true one?
There seems to exist in the

Revenue philosophy a continu-
ing bias against the rewards of
passive Investment by compar-
ison with those at active man-
ufacturing. The distinction
between "earned" and
“unearned” income has long
since been abolished, but the
memory lingers on.
Receiving investment

income and toaHwy in prop-
erty and securities are some-
how tainted with tax avoid-
ance. They remain suspect.
Under a Conservative gov-

ernment, papular capitalism is

to be strengthened and deep-
ened. in the ChanceQaxfa own
words. But when capitalism
ceases to be at the modest
level of PEPS or ESOPs and
becomesa structured business,
tiie tax pressure is to inten-

sify.

What has happened to neu-
trality, which was designed to
give equal treatment to all
activities and diminish the
intrusive nature of the fiscal

system?
It appears that these mea-

sures have been formulated by
the Revenue rather than by
ministers concerned with this
neutrality policy.

It is reported that the Gov-
ernment wfll be patting for-
ward amendments dnriny the
committee stage of the
Finance Rfll to “complete the
drafting.” That should be a
good opportunity to withdraw,
or least amend substantially,
this proposed unfair legisla-

tion.

Oliver Stanley

expatriates

UK building societies

lure offshore money
BRADFORD & Btagteyjoined a
growing list of building societ-

ies operating branches offshore
when it opened for business in

the Isle of Man earlier this

month. Britannia, Leeds Per-

manent and National Provin-

cial are also in the Isle of Man.
Bristol and West has set up to
Guernsey white the industry’s

two big guns, Halifax and
Abbey National, have chosen

*^Abbey has just announced a
Joint venture in Italy, similar

to the one in Spain. But -those

are for domestic customers in
those countries. However, it

also has a subsidiary offshore

company which operates from
son office in Gibraltar.

Thus, with increasing off-

shore activity it seems fittinq
that the Building Societies
Association, the industry’s
trade body, has chosen Guern-
sey as the venue for its annual

conference next month.
The reason for all this off-

shore activity can be traced
back to a r.Hangp in the law in

1986 which made it possible for

building societies to credit
interest on a gross of tax basis

to certain depositors. These
include people working or
retired outside the UK, pro-

vided they wm satisfy tax-

man that they are not nor-
mally resident in the UK.

British expatriates form the

obvious market, but Interest
rates in excess of 13 per cent
have naturally attracted for-

eign money.
David Roberts, the manager

of Halifax’s Overseas Business
Unit, is shy of revealing
detailed figures but concedes
he has noticed a growth in
business from foreign nation-

als, mainly Europeans and
Americans.
Roberts maintains the flow

of money from overseas is

important to the Halifax
because it is consistent from
one mouth to the next In con-
trast, the UK money tends to
fluctuate either seasonally or
because of competition from
other forms of saving and
investment.
Graham Dawson, of financial

adviser Chase de Vere, says it

is not uncommon for nonresi-
dent customers tohaveseveral
imilHan pounds on deposit. At
present. Chase is offering a

rate equivalent to anmml inter-

est of 14.1 per cent on sums of

£40,000 and upwards deposited

for a shc-manth period in an
account with one of Britain’s

The company is aide -to do
this by rebating to clients port

.

of its -commission from the
society. ' ff the £40,000 or more
is left on deposit for a further

six month*. the annual rate of

interest works out as equiva-

. . White the table reveals some

very enticing rates, it should

be remembered that there is no

SfoSgas the "be£: build,

lag society buy. This is

because the decision as to what

is best must be made by* the

individual saver, according to

the amount of money-he wants

to place In an account and the

length of time he la prepared to

have that money tied up.

Remember also that constant

A HlSBtlre of toMt* grow
lifts

bnMfcag sodstg

Minimum • tntoreat Withdrawal

Investment (£> Rate Notice

Swansea 26,000 13.68 90 days

From* Sofwood 20,000 13.48 90 days

Momington 1,000 . 13.46 90 days

Cathode 10,000 .13.42 Instant
1lii>afc,iT «h 40.000 iaae 90 days

Town & Country 1.000 .
13.32 BOdaya

Bristol & West 25,000 13.30 90 days

Oarflhflton - 6.000 13.30 Instant

Halifax _ 50,000 13J8 Instant
-

Melton Mowbray 25,000 13L26 60 days
Walthamstow 5.000 13JS 00 days
Guardian 34300 ia.8 todays
Surrey SOD' 13.17 90 days
Buddnshamshfre 1,000 13.16 Instant

City & Metropolitan . 10 13.00 Instant

• Souks: Css ds Vara

tent to a very healthy 13.7 per
cent In the flirt year. . .

It should not be assumed,
that societies which have set

up offshore are the only ones-
interested in attracting depos-
itsfrom British expatriatesand
other UK non-residents. Just
about, every building society,
big and small, offers gross
interest accounts from a UK
base to individuals who can
complete a simple declaration
of nonresidence as prescribed
by the Income Tax (Building
Societies) Regulations £966.

As is often the case with
building society accounts for.

UK resments, the interest rrtw
paid by the smaller societies

are often higher than those
available from the industry's
giants because of what is seen
as a greater element of risk.

The accompanying table
shows a selection of toe most
competitive animal rates iff

interest now lor lump sum
investments of varying sizes.

Where interestiscreatedmom
often than once a year, the rate
shown reflects this.

jockeying for position means
that today’s best building soci-

ety. rate might not be tomor-
row's.

.. With an increesillg nrrmhor

of societies setting up offshore,

does It make any difference
whether & British, expatriate
opens a gross interest arwmmt
offshore or with a mainland
branch of-a society? .

An advantage ofthe onshore
route la the existence ofamore
competitive interest rate struo-
tore. However, many deport- -

tors are wary of bringing their

money Into mainland Britain
and may be prepared to sacxi-

flce a percentage point or two
of interest. . .

The offshore route is also
more - appropriate for
short-term expatriates who
may find they have a tax liaUt
tty oh an onshore account on
their return to the UK.

Peter Gartkmd.

Pettr^Ckxrtlandiseditor ofThe
fitternatumal. tht FT’s maga-
zine for expatriates.

EDUCATIONAL

FRENCH 66 IN PROVENCE
and FRENCH, DUTCH, ENGLISH or SPANSH 66 in Hie ARDENNES

The adrontages of the *C«ao 6G» concspt, wttb taUanSaf couna

:

1 . Intensive study (MMmun 38 losaora per wart)
2. Plus me constant practice of what you have learnt, every day tom 8 sjjl to 10
pm, with teachers constantly present at meaUmes, breaks and m the evenings.

a A toW of 66 hours per week olU knmentai In Iw language.

C«an ta lop ctau IntamaUonal school lor leaden ki buatnw ramgemeirt
and Bowamuwmt, as our references show. »

CERAN GG
Language courses tor motivated people.

v CERAN ARDENNES
I Amiedu Chateau 266. &4880 SPA!

J BajQlUM Tol [+-32J87/8771 64 -

F«*(+3Z»W736»
Tolat <9850 ceran b

CERAN UNGUESPROVOKE
BP. 27/266

F-30 130 PONT-SANT-CSPWT.
FRANCE T«L (+33166393838-

. FOJt (+331663937 20

COMPANY NOTICES

iet ready for 1992 learn French not
at the most renowned school

INSTITUT DE FRANCAIS
• The highest quality teaching
• A high-level international student body
• A cordial, hard-working atmosphere
• Excellent French food
• A breathtaking setting cm the Riviera
• A truly caring staff

Dailv 8.30-17.00 with 2 meals
For adults. 8 level,: Bcniuten 1 to Advanced II

Next o-wcck course Mans. S May. 5 June 1989 and all year.

,
INSTITUT DE FRANCAIS-FTD29

-23 A*. Ocm 4.adore, OS VllMranchaAlar. Tol- 19 at « 44. TUc *708*0 F-

LEMN TO STEAK FRENCH
Mt TOTAL NATURAL IMMERSION

talk Franck pu liefeasts hi 7

tatmhro tap la Its OOROQGME
Chateau LA YALOUZE

M. S3Si4«2BJAUfoiifoaa.M!!eeo
34490 LA IOCHI CMALAJS.Franco

LEGAL NOTICES

No. 001443 of 1989
M THE KICK COURT OF JUSTICE
CHANCERY DIVISION

M THE MATTER Of
CARLTON COMMUNICATION PLC

- and -

IN THE MATTER OF
THE COMPANIES ACT 1985

NOTICE HEREBY OIVEN ttmt BH Otar M tfW
Hign Cowl ol JuaOc*. Choneory DivMJan
a*Md to Aprs Tees aanftmtng mo canut-
Lttton at mo Shan Prwrium Account of me
aaevo named Coraoany was wgmiad by
mo RoBtarv of Companwa on im Apr*
hob

OaM SHOi April tees

Catted ChancB
Royeo House
AUermanbury Square
London EC2V 7U>

Poteionu «we

PERSONAL

AUTHORS.
Your book published.

For details:

FT, Excalibur Press. I Elystan
Place. London SW3 3LA.

CLUBS

EVE
bat outlived the others became of
a policy on Eair play and value Tor

money. Supper from IO-3J0 am.
Disco and lop muicons. gUmor-
om hostesses, exciting Ooonhows.

01-734 0557. 189. Regent
Scjuandoo.

De Beers ConsolidatedMines Limited
Incorporated in the RepublicofSouth Africa

Company RegistrationNo11/00007/06

NOTICETOMEMBERS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that dta one hundred and 8m mmal general

meetingofmembers ofDe Beers Consoiktazed Mines Limited wffl be held acdie
head office of die Company at 34 Stotikdale Street. Kbnberiey. on Monday.
22nd May 1 989, at I4hl5, for diefetowing business:

— to receive and consider die annual finandaJ statements of the Company and
ofdie Groupfor the yearended 3 lx December 1 988;

— to elect directors fn accordance with die pravtaoni of die ankles of
association ofthe Company;

— to consider and. if deemed fit; to pass, with or without modUcatton. the
fallowing resolution as an onfinary resolution:

"That the directors be and they ana hereby authorised to allot and issue, after
providing far the allotment and issue of die S ordbtary shares IntermofThe De
Beers Employee Shareholder Scheme, afl or any portion of the untamed S
ordinary and deferred shares of five cents each in the capital of die Company at
such time or times, po such person or persons,company orcompanies, and upon
such terms and conditions, as they may determine."

A member entitled to attend and vote at die meeting may qipainc a proxy eo
attend, speak and vote in Ns stead. A proxy need not be a member of the
Company. If required, forms of proxy are available foam the regUtared and
London offices of the Company.

The transfer registers and registers ofmembers of the Company vd8 be doaed
Sera 1 3th May to 22nd May 1 989, both days Inclusive.

Holderi of deferred share warrants to bearerwho desire to attend In personor
by proxy or to vane at any general meeting of the Company mux comply with
the regulations of the Company under which share warrants to bearer are
Issued.

Byorder ofthe board
H.J.CRANKSHAW

Secretary

36 Stockdale Street,

P.O. Box 616, Kimberley, 8!

29th April 1989

DeBeers
D« Beam Comntirtwee Hina Lmwd

Note; There ore no service contracts framed by the Company, nr any of ha
subsxfarie*. to any director ofthe Company.

GROWING BUSINESSES
The Financial Times proposes to publish a

Survey on the above on

24th May 1989

For a full editorial synopsis and advertisement
details, please contact:

Sue Mathieson

on 01-873 4129
or write to her at:

Number One, Southwark Bridge
London SE1 9HL.

HNANCiALTIMES
lutei i suvMii kiwinm

Bid to
I shatt. soon be retiring st
age 63 and starting a private
pension- Stmnltenaonriy, I will

receive a capital sum of
approximately £80,<NNJ. In
view of separate income tax
assessments starting in April
1990, I would like toe £80,000
to go in my wife’s name. Also,
ideally, I would flfce the sum
to be invested in (say) a build-
ing society to earn a high rate
of interest to use as additional
income.
However, as I understand it,

the interest would be paid
after deduction of 25 per cent
income tax and this cannot be
reclaimed- My wife has virtu-

ally no other income and so
her personal allowance would
be lost. Can you suggest an
alternative that would offer
the same security and high
interest rate, but one that
would enable my wife to
reclaim tax to absorb her per-
sonal allowance? We would
both prefer tax to be deducted
at source so as to avoid the
unpleasant shock of a tax bQL

I a** woiriny toe assumption
that my own compulsory par.

chase annuity (pension)
bought on the open market
cannot be transferred partially
intomy wife’s name.
Our Briefcase service does

not extend to investment
advice, particularly in view of
the Financial Services Act
1980. You should seek advice
from someone authorised
under that Act
No income tax is deducted

from building society divi-

dends/mterest, but the rate of
djyfatend/faiterest actually paid
reflects the burden of reduced-
rate tax (sometimes called
composite-rate tax - although
tbrt is a different tax, strictly

speaking) borne by the society.

Id the hands of a basic-rate
taxpayer, the only tax payable
is the age surcharge (now 2222
per cent of tiie actual dividend)
for people over 64 of modest
meaiyi- in the lumrin of higher-
rate taxpayers, the only tax
payable is excess liability (now
20 per cent of the actual divi-

dend). In the hands of a non-
taxpayer, there is nothing to be
claimed from the Inland Reve-
nue.

No income tax fa deducted
from the dividends ofUK cmh-
panics. The tax consequences
for basic-rate and higher-rate
tarpapers are similar to those
for building society dividends.
In the hands of non-taxpayers,
on the other hand, UK com-
p&ny dividends carry aright to
payment of tax credit (how
33% per cent of the dividend)
from the Inland Revenue. In
contrast to building society
shares, UK company shares
cany a right to Indexation
relief in capital gains tax calcu-
Tatinna -

farnma tax is deducted at
the basic rate (now 25 per emit)
from interest on gilt-edged
securities (unless held on the
National Savings Stock Regis-
ter) and on UK company loan
stocks eto, generally rocking.
However, before deciding to
buy interestbearing securities,
you should ask your tax
inspector for toe explanatory
leaflet (IH68) on tbe accrued-in-
come schema.

It is generally not a gdod
Idea for non-taxpayers to
invest in foreign .or. Common-

BkIEFCASE
M tagta raapcMaASnycm Ot aootafMf fer

taWnWTtiiMhrtaM—in (Aw
tataM* wtawi* Affta«HM wm ft*

I by past mm aaaa

wealth stocks and shares if the
interest or dividends will be
subject to withholding tax in
the country of might Although
any UK tax deducted wfll be
recoverable from the inland
Revenue, it is rarelypossible to
recover the tax withheld over-

Rnally, we must repeat the
warning which you . have
doubtless seen in our columns
over recent months, it is not
enough just to put investments
in your wife’s name - there
must be a bona Side outright
gift to her of all interest in the
income and eapWwi; that is to
say, she must be free to spend
the income and capital as she
pleases without being answer-
able to you in any way for
where the money has gone.

The right

to be told
FOR THE part seven years, my
wife and I have lived to a large
farmhouse converted into two
bouses (one upstairs and one
down). The house Is shared
with my brother and sis-
ter-in-law. Tbe mortgage is in
all four names, with monthly
payments split two ways.
Thro ughout the duration of

the mortgage, Z have run a
successful business and have
always been fortunate enough
to keep up the mortgage pay-
ments. However, my brother
has not been so fortunate la
term of regular employment
and has cm a number of occa-
sions fallen into arrears Quite
seriously with the mortgage
payments.
Omr building society win not

accept that we are two differ-

ent people end that I have
kept up our side of the pay-
ments. It would now appear
(a) that; after seven years of
repayments, very Uttie of toe
capital owed has been paid off
and (b) that toe teem of the
mortgage outstanding is inde-
terminate, according to the
society. It would also appear
that toe mortgage repayments
are too high for toe amount
borrowed.
My concern is that X am

being penalised for my
brother’s missed repayments. I
have asked my society for a
breakdown of payments made
to show who paid what and

when. But it has been offhand
in its rt +Uudw has «u»iii

these are too difficult to trace
over the years. This is totally
unacceptable.

Is there any legislation
under which toe society is
compelled to give me a full

breakdown of payments upon
request? Also, is It possible to
divide the account for future
repayments.
You can certainly insist that

the society gives you an
account showing all payments
which have been if nec-
essary, you can sue in.court for
an account You cannot, how-
ever, insist on dividing the.
account between you and your
brother; you would have to
repay the loan and take out a
fresh mortgage.

Arrears

of tax
I WAS self-employed In
general practice in toe NHS
until rething in January 1987.
I contributed to the superan-
nuation fund of the NHS. How-
ever, over a third of my total
earnings were from private
practice. Each year, my
accountant agreed with the
tax inspectoran amount that I
could contribute to a retire-
ment annuity in respect of
three non-NHS fees, and tins
qualified for tax relief.
In April 1987, the tax Inspec-

tor decided that his interpreta-
tion and application of the
estrartatntary concession had

been incorrect and that tax
relief would be withdrawn on
the annuity payments from
1981/82 up to ceasing to work
In the NHS. A large amount of
tax (around £1^00) is now
being claimed by too inspec-
tor.

This seems most unfair but
my accountant informs me
that the inspector can alter Mo
decisions for the six-year
period in question. To appeal
to the tax commissioners
would be pointless.

Was your accountant negli-
gent in falling to check toe
working of concession A9? If
you have not read the conces-
sion yourself, ask your accoun-
tant or your tax Inspector for a
copy of the free booklet
1111(1988) which sets out the
alternative bases for NHS prac-
titioners for 1972-73 onwards.

ft your accountant was not
negligent, then ask him
whether:it might : be worth-
while inviting your MP to refer
the matter to the Parliamen-
tary Commissioner (the
ombudsman). The Parliamen-
tary Commissioner might wish
to consider, for example,
whether the fact that your tax
inspector could not understand
what concession Afl meant
between 1981 and April 1987,

the Board of Inland Revenue in
the drafting of tin concession
and of the relevant paragraphsm the official instruction book
issued to tax inspectors (which
is protected by the Official
Secrets Act).

We take it that your accoun-
tant has already. checked that"

do not stand to benefit
l concession A19 — Arrears.

of -Tax Arising Through Offi-

cial Error?

Neighbour’s
refusal
ON. HIS death, my father"
bequeathed to me his semi-de-
tached property and, after a
lapse of some 10 years, I pro-
pose to sefi it. The owner of
the adjoining property - who
is anxious to acquire mine,
and who owns also the land
immediately to the rear of my
house — has let it be known
.that he would not penult any
other purchaser to carter upon
his land far the purposes of
essential maintenance of my
property.

Is any legal Justification for
thferattitude, even though it is
agreed he would be compen-
sated for any dmrinpe to his
ground in the process?
Tour neighbour would be

entitled to take the stand
which he now does if the own-
ers of your projierty have not
acquired a right to enter the
neighbour's land to cany out
maintenance work to your
house. There could be an
express grant of such a Tight in
your title deeds; but if there is
not, it is possible that a right
might have been acquired by
you, and your father, having
actually used the neighbour's
land for that purpose on a
number of occasions over a
PWiod Which erri^^ gQ TOSL
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MINDING YOUR OWN BUSINESS
It s fun to be behind, the. bar, chatting to the regulars, dispensing their usual tipples. Or is it? Roy Hodson and Lisa Wood investigate

So you want to own a pub . . .
THERE IS NQ more popular

‘

small business
1

activity in the
country today than owning
and running a pub. It Is the
dream of countless thousands
of couples. But the figures
show the yawning gap between
dreams and reality. Only, about
3,000 free houses - as opposed
to pubs owned by breweries,.
which putjn tenants or -inenag-.'
ers - change hands eacbijear
out i of the 20,000or-po in -the*
country.- a-..,::- x
It has, in fact, been a

remarkably stable market
year-on-year In recent times.
Right now, though, there are
more buyers about than - snir-
ahle pubs, probably because of
recent sharp rises in property'-
prices which have enabled'
many couples to sell, their,
homes to raise the initial capi- -

tal to become Mine Hosts:'
But few people are fortunate

enough to get enough cash
from their house sale to move
straight into a pub withoutarr-
anging extra.finance. For pub
prices have. risen even faster

The French Emperor Napoleon claimed
.the British were a nation of shopkeepers.
Nearly two centuries later. It seems they
warn to be a nation of pub-fceepers
instead. This Is the first of an occasional

series on the pleasures and pitfalls of
running a public house — plus some
of the legal, technical, financial and
psychological hurdles you are likely
to have to overcome along the way.

than -house prices during the
past 10 years, as the table
(below) shows.
John Howard is managing

director: of- Christie -and Com-
pany, a .business, agent, valuer
and.surveyor which specialises
inrikensedipronises through a
chain of is offices (14 in the UK
and one in Dublin). He reckons
that the average price for a
free house during the past year
has

.
broken through the

'£200,000 level for the first thne
and now stands at £202.000.
What sort of people are pre-

pared to risk all their capital,
‘ and borrow a lot more, in order
to own and run a business in
which, like as not, they, have
had no experience - apart,
perhaps, from standing in front
of the bar?

It would be easy to peculate
about the dreamers, the cou-

ples who want to work for
themselves, the urgent desire
of some to create a new life-

style. Better, perhaps, to serve
up some hard facts.

As part ofa-study of its own
business —. which includes
selling about 1 500 pubs in an
active year, such as 1988 -
Christie and Company commis-
sioned a survey of the trade
from Harris Research.
Among 1.400 owners of pubs,

wine bars and licensed restau-
rants who. were quizzed, the
first Interesting fact to emerge
was -that 60 per cent had not
previously owned a business.
More (16 per cent) had come
from careers in the armed ser-
vices (those gratuities]) than
any other sector apart from the
licensed trade itself, which pro-
vided 17 per cent of the new
owners from the ranks of

employees.
Aspiring pub-owners do not

seem to be too fussy about its

actual location so long as they
are satisfied by various other

factors. Indeed. 25 per cent of
those surveyed bought finally

in an area far different from
the one they had considered
first

“People start looking for a
pub 1

in the Cotswolds and
sometimes end up happily
ensconced in the Yorkshire
Dales,” says Howard.

Interestingly, only 15 per
cent of them said they had cho-
sen their pub strictly on its

merits as a business concern.
The majority picked their pub
because they knew the district,

had contacts in it, or thought it

an attractive place to live.

Clearly, life-style has more
to do with pub-owning than

The great brewery sell-off could
prove more dream than reality

WOULD-BE thine -hosts' -and
entrepreneurs '• are probably

-

going to be disappointed if they'
believe that pubs will be twjy'a
pfehny should the Goventthtixt
approve the recommendations
of the Monopolies and Mergers
Commission on the brewing
industry.
The MMC, in itB lengthy

report published. last month,
recommended that no brewer
should be allowed to own more
than 2,000 pubs. It says: “Tins
ceiling will require the divest-

ment of some 22,000 premises
by United Kingdom national
brewers.
“We do - not believe that

1

United Kingdom property or'
capital markets will have any
difficulty in -absorbing the
change; we are recommending
a maximum of three years for

the divestments to take place.”

However,- the MMC’s rosy
vision of thousands . of pubs
released into the market to be
sqappedjipby thrusting entre-

preneurs - in wHat would be
the biggest-everforced disposal
by the Govenflc&iebt ^' is likeSy

to temaHa a pipe dream-A con-
census of dpinioh amoiig ^peo-
ple- involved dosely- dn: the
business' 'is- -that fewer than
5,OOP of-tho ’22,000 ^premises
mentioned by the MMC might
be expected to come on to the
open market 1

Indeed, the general belief is

that most national brewers will

opt to^quit brewing rather than
sell off their pubs because
retailing is the area where
investment has been concen-
trated over the past -few years
- and where the profits are.

Grand Metropolitan, Allied
Lyons and Whitbread are but
three' of the national brewers
tipped by analysts to sell their

production operations. Some
pub disposals are likely - as
they-concentrate on their most
profitable outlets - but dispos-

als will not make up the sales

bonanza anticipated by the
MMC. And even if considerably
more pubs are sold by the big
brewers than experts predict;

there is unlikely to be a torrent
ofthem pouring on to the mar-
ket to createa bonanza-buyers’

market for aspiring landlords
In all probability, the ana-

lysts say, the pubs would be

PRICE RISES OP
PUBS AND HOUSES

COMPARED
(1075-100) PUBS HOUSES

1975 100 100
1976 111 108

1977 139 116
1978 178 148
1979 ... - 223 194
1980 271 208
1981 268 210
1982 282 226
1983 324 253
1984 353 290
1985 359 320
1986 363 364
1987 . 432 431.

1988 595 524

Sourc*. Christa a Co.

dispersed among a wide vari-

ety of buyers. For instance,
large “parcels" of them would
be sold to other brewers anx-
ious to bring their levels of
ownership towards the 2,000

ceiling. Some big buyers from
other trading sectors would
enter the market with the aim
of diversifying Into the
licensed trade. A number of
foreign brewers might wish to
move into the British market
or expand their positions in it
Finally, a number of premises
offered for sale would be
bought by existing tenants.

Recently, there has been a
sellers’ market in pubs. The
sort of places that a couple
with capital might want to
buy, in order to enjoy a com-
plete change in life-style, are in
short supply.

Jeremy Stein, the managing
director of RCC, a company
which specialises in advising
on' sources of finance for
licensed premises, sums up the
trade’s feeling that the market
is unlikely to lurch violently in
the other direction because of
developments following the
MMC report. “The market
could easily cope with the
number of premises likely to

become available to private
buyers “ he says.

balance sheets and business
plans in the minds of a great

many couples who decide to
buy. But that does not mean
they are amateurs heading for

failure.

Indeed, the opposite is true.

The rate of bankruptcies
among owners of licensed
premises is low by business
standards. And experience has
shown that complete newcom-
ers to the trade are just as
likely to make a success of a
pub as are old hands.
Why this should be so is not

easy to define. One reason is

that pubs are bought usually
as going concerns. The new
owner can increase profits (or

diminish them) by the impact
of bis style and ideas.

But he is less than likely to

run the business into the
ground. Unless, that is. he
takes too great a liking to the
stock-in-trade.

Next Week: Buying a pub -
financing the purchase, getting

a licence, suitable insurance,
plus valuing goodwill and the

stock.

USEFUL CONTACTS
Browers Society, 42 Portman

Square, London W1H OBB (tel.

01-488-4831).

National Licensed Victuallers’
Association, Boardman House. 2
Downing Street. Farnham. Surrey
(tel. 0252-7 14-448).

Hotel, Catering and Institutional

Management Association. 191
Trinity Road. London SWT7 7HN (taL
01-672-4251).

The National Association at
Licensed House Managers. 0
Coombe Lane, London SW20 8NE
(tal 01-847-3080).

Innslght (licensed trade training
courses). Jack Knowles, S Market
Place, Henley-on-Thames,
Oxfordshire RQ9 2AA (teL

0491-573-260).

ChrisHe and Company. GO
Victoria St, London SW1H ONW (teL
01-799-2121).

USEFUL BOOKS
Thinking of Buying a Pub? by

Malcolm McDonald, published by
Christie and Co. and the National
Licensed Victuallers’ Association.
Price £5-95.

Runn'mg Your Own Pub, by Elvan
Money, published by Kogan Page.
Price £935.

_ A Pub With Roses Round The
Door (a mins of information In a
light- hearted style) by Steven R.
Brown, published by Information
Ltd. Available by mail order from
Innslght (see address above). Price
£7-50.

Anna and Richard Abrehait . . . “this life will And any flaws in the partnership"
Tony Andrews

Hard work all the way
ANNA ABREHART lost a
stone in weight in just two
weeks after she and husband
Richard bought the Plough, a
village pub at Coldharbour
near Dorking. Surrey, just
four months ago. “I was burn-
ing up with nervous energy
and hard work and was not
finding time to eat,” she says,
looking back on those early
frantic days.
The Abreharts, both 45, are

running the pub with
part-time staff and a great deal
of enthusiastic support from
their four sons, who range in

age from 23 to 13. Bat they
have not had a fnD day off
since they took charge - and
that has been during the
so-called quiet winter months.
They have been married for

23 years but confess they had
more quarrels during their
first two months in the Plough
than during the whole of their
life together previously. “It
was the tension as we learned
the job," they say.

Neither Anna nor Richard
had any previous experience of
operating licensed premises
although they had worked
together running a building
contracting business. They
managed to squeeze in a week-
end Innsight pub management
course, ran by Jack Knowles
at Henley-on-Thames, and
then they were open for cus-
tomers.

They are active from 7am
each day as Richard sets off

for the local cash-and-carry
for supplies while Anna, who
does all the cooking, starts
preparing shepherd's pie (the

pub favourite), steak and kid-

ney pie and other hot dishes.

They do not expect to get to
bed until long after midnight
Anna says: “You have to be
strong people with a strong
relationship. This life will find

any flaws in the partnership.”

The Abreharts decided last

year that they worked
together well enough to try
their hand at the licensed
trade. As much as anything,
they were looking for “a more
sociable life." They accepted
an offer of around £200,000 for
their Surrey home and began
looking immediately for a pub.

The Plough bad been on the
market only a few days when
they heard about it and
offered £415,000 against the
asking price of £425,000. They
knew the district in the Surrey
hills and they liked the idea of
having the highest pnb in the
south-east of England (800ft

above sea level) in a village

with alpine qualities - it can
be cat off by snow in the win-
ter.

The Allied Irish Banks, a
group which is developing a
speciality of providing finance

for the pub market, came up
with a mortgage of £240,000
through its finance arm -
along with a prudent sugges-
tion that the Abreharts should
pay an up-front £2,400 for a
three -month moratorium on
interest charges and capital
repayments. That useful
arrangement proved a great
help through the dark days
between January and March.
Now, apart from the gruel-

ling work-loads they face
daily, everything is going bet-
ter than they had dared to
hope. They are attracting new
trade and have increased the
average week’s takings from
£2,700 to more than £3,000.
But they must now make
mortgage repayments of
£2.800 a month.
There have been one or two

welcome bonuses, such as the
Easter hank holiday Monday
when they served 173 lunches
(ail cooked by Anna) and took
£1,700. And there was the one
day of the otherwise-mild win-
ter when the village WAS
snow-bound and they acted as
honorary headquarters for a
massive snowball fight. That
also helped the takings.

Both are delighted with
their investment and the new
life it has given them. But
they know only too well that
they will succeed or fail
according to the time and
energy they can devote to it.
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M

HbTOorf business
CENTRES

Successful property company seeks

capital parter for. its business centre

subsidiary: 70,0Q0 sq.ft, of office space,

proven management, exit route/

repayment in 1991. : .

£1 million: equity/convettible loan/

secured loan. Sensible terms.

Write Box F88J9, Financial Times,

One S&tttJiwartt Bridge;LemUm SE19H& ;

CANARY ISLANDS
SOUTH TENERIFE. Development taad plM of j.jSMnr* with pmnteion

to build upto 3.630m1 construction. Ideal lor 10 vffiu tor 40 apartments,

a gum house or nursing home. Frias £150.000 «

Other plots 8gd projects available on the now retort of LAKESIDE
COUNTRY. CLUB.

Writs for farther detail* to

ROBIN BROECKAERT-
CASTILLO SUR PROPERTY ^tfiBrnON CENTRE

Avcnida Sanaa 14, Los Cnstiancos 386SQ. Teacnfc TeL 34 22 79 41 58

WANTED
MaHtefl gate wasted of

EnftIUh apsafclnfl parsons
in Europe, Asia, Africa,

Pacific A Latin Amdftoa,
Plans* respond Imnadl-
ataty by tax If pofftttri*.

- - Mr Shapiro,
Four Way Cotnmuideations*
SM Otetoa Ofwarr Way.

Los Angstes, California,

90049, USA.
Fu-{2t3) 478 <882.

BUSINESS

Tire Regus
Centre :

London

• BxBcudn OfiBcsk
• Coafiwencsa
ComnHM&sdoau

•QabRanaiusaK:

TllMgw Squat* 91-4025359

•iMdM-SDddwvtCnvtnhaOH*

business wanted

FAMOUS
• NAME

Individual bitcslor/praprietor

Ktki to acquire or participate tn a

MM-mamifort'tring gomf concern

with a Camou* and reputable

name. Flexible oopnoe but

preferred range below £230,000.

Wrtw Bax H4728. Wwsrhl Hast.
Ore SeUmarfc Bridge. L nadea

SEl 9HL

franchising
sraar vous OWN wisMw.ovaf ua
uMMnn' (Marine ' tu. epo. at Vis

natonaL Wamcnbc GW&TTON iswn

MAY a FREE Mtnttim- OMwta 2. Leo-

££ ww wTsai ioa suTtoTMn. a.
Tsi 01-327 1SCB.

BUSINESS FOR SALE

Levers of London ltd

TheJoint Administrative Receivers offer for sale as
a going concern the business, assets and goodwill of
the above group of companies.

The principal features comprise; •

9,200 sq ftfactory, warehouse and office

premises in Bethnal Green
Ladies' wear manufacturer principally for

export
Children's wear manufacturer
Ladies’ wear mail order company
Large stock offinished garments for forthcoming
season
Substantial customer base
Group turnover in excess of £3-2m p.a.

The business maybe sold as a whole or separately.

For further details please contacttheJoint
Administrative Receiver; R. HockingFCCA
<fefI3/PJQ.'

ismm9mi Stoy Hayward
A Mwntoar ot HorreHta & Horwrehlnarniaorm

Accowmim eusnessmmsers amm^cemsvtocmsuuws

8 BAKER STREET, LONDONW1M IDA
TEL01 -486 5888 FAX01 -487 3686 TELEX 2677 1 6 HORWAT.

AodMiMbrax* lid Etftaadaad!WjIb Is carry e

EAST ANGLIA
Thriving UPHOLSTERY CURTArN & FABRIC Business.

Freehold shop, work shop, 2 bed apartment. Extensive range of

fabric books, 7 professional staff. Delivery VAN. Freehold

£295,000.

Apply to Robert Wells,

39 Exchange St, Norwich. TeL 660368/9

FOR SALEREPLACEMENT WINDOW AND
CONSERVATORY MANUFACTURER AND RETAILER
Good reputation - East Anglia Tnmow C.75M (ft trade, ft mail) Pre ax
profit £250,000+ Leasehold premises 18.500 sq.ft (possibly freehold)
Managing Director and 50% owner would remain for a year if required.

Further derails to principals only from:
' EAD Moore

Andrew Moore &CoJ2 Kins Street
Sodbury.Suffolk COIQ 6EB

. . _ . . . AkQ7S7 88028}

Andrew Moore A Go are authorised by the Institute ofCha rtered Accountants
w England A Waist to carry on Invouneni Business.

PLANT *
MACHINERY

Heavy Aluminium Floating
Pontoon Bridge

4 x. 322 feet Spans - 100 Ton
Vehicle’ capacity £1.075 million.

Write Bax tn H4746, Financial Times,
.

One Southwark Bridge. London SEl 9HL

FOR SALE:
Casts. Branr. Spsia:

IGtb cranny bouse. aagtiTcem reneu-

nua testing si tBedmel
aiy, lacim’n larps spcatJ old home .

Pnoe 1500.000. For iisuicr mfonaun:

ASxrn C«rtr2«t l1
.'*torn.

17113 p

—

r-r^ tCtrtmai - Spa*,
at ieL- rSpsss, 9?2 SitiC

SCOTTISH BAGPIPE
COMPANY

A unique opportunity to acquire an old
established Scottish bagpipe company
(founded in 1879). The company consists of

an attractive retail shop in the historic
Royal Mile next to Edinburgh Castle which
has a brisk season selling bagpipes,
accessories and quality gift items to the
tourist trade. The Company also has a
small manufacturing unit seven minutes
walk from the shop, which supplies the
shop and many export customers including
foreign military bands in the Middle East
(contracts in hand). Turnover £170,000.
Genuine reason for disposal. All
management training and consultancy
supplied in the asking price of £69,000.

For further details please contact
03552 46516.

ARTIFICIAL SKI SLOPE
The assets and trade of Snow Trail Limited,
a ski slope and related amenities operator,
are offered for sale as a going concern.
Situated close to Merthyr Tydfil, in South
Wales, the site offers a 400 metre run of
exceptional quality.

Principal features comprise:

* Easy access with parking for 400 cars

* 22 acre site (approx.) and including
bar/cafe and changing rooms

* Unique artificial wet snow surface facility

* Drag lift and related equipment
Interested parties should contact the
Joint Administrative Receivers:

Barry Mitchell or David Snowden.

Peat Marwick McLintock
Marlborough House, Ficaian Court, Fuzalan Roa
Cardiff CP31TE. Telephone: (0222) 462463
Telex: 497987 PMMCAJR G- Fax: (0222) 481605

FOR SALE
Well established fabrication engineering company
specialising in stainless steeL, alloy, steel welding &
construction catering mainly for the marine industry

Mod Contractor
Located on South coast in modern marina based

premises.

Write to Box H4765, Financial Times,

One Southwark Bridge, London SEl 9HL

W-
Educational Publishers

The business and assets ofOxford Vision
(Resources) Limited (in Administrative

Receivership) are for sale as a going concern.
The assets include:

“The Children's Video Bible"

Video packs forGCSE study including ‘Animal
Farm", “Educating Rita" and “Jesus of

Nazareth"

Further titles and broadcast agreements under
negotiation.

Parties interested in the whole or part of the

business should contact the Joint Administrative
Receiver

Me VM.BairctowFCA, FIFA, ArthurYoung,

KingsCourt, 185 KingsRoad,Reading,
Berkshire RG14EX. Tel: 0734593171.

Fax: 0734 503105. Telex: 846683 AYRG.JtL
ArthurYoung
A MEMBER OF ARTHURYOUNG INTERNATIONAL

#u»^3raeqtw^>n««“^<<C,<»,l«^ ft«auraHiiam&igUmaaWalk»ioc3fTvouiin<<BaiiiOTbtiMnw3.nWlllllllIBBtellliH IIWIIHBMMai^BWM

MG SPORTS CAR
SPARES SPECIALIST

London area. Counter and mail order service.
Very easily run. Long lease. T/O £183K. G.P. £57K.

Price only £15K+ S & E.A.V.

Phone 0920-462459

Light Engineering & Building
Maintenance Company

Based Essex/London border. Current t/o £700K. Owner
retiring due to ill health. Established Government, Local
Authority and private contracts. Excellent potential for

fit, go-ahead management £S00,000

Write Box H4764, Financial Times,

One Southwark Bridge, London SEl 9HL

BUSINESS SERVICES

SELL IN FRANCE
1992 and beyond demands attention now. France is a key

market We can provide commercial solutions. We are a French
group of associates in Paris who can offer serivees including
offices & company formation plus wider support as required.

Contact London Office 01-499 9192.
Fax 01-499 7175. “SeU In France".

108 New Bond Street, London WIY 9AA.

EXPORT FINANCE

The financial Times proposes to publish [his survey on:

I JUNE 1989
For a Tull editorial synopsis and udtcnnemcni drrjn* pt»m» eonuec

EDWARD MACQUISTEN
on 01-873 3300

or write to him au
Number One

Southwork Bridge
London
SEl 9HL

I
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Lovely little

licence losers
Stuart Marshall burns rubber in

the Lotus Esprit Turbo SE
and the Porsche 944S2

T HE raid-engined Lotus
Esprit Turbo SE is

one of the most stimu-
lating cars 1 have ever

driven. But, given that I had
£42£00 to spend on personal
transport it is the last car in
the world I would want to buy.
Let me explain. The engine

Is a technological masterpiece:
a turbocharged four-cylinder,
16-valve, 2L2 litre, running on
lead-free petrol and delivering
an incredible 264 horsepower.
It is, Lotus says modestly,
probably the most powerful
engine of its size in an off-the-

peg motor car.

One of its secrets is charge
cooling. When you compress
air with a turbocharger (or. for

that matter, a bicycle pump), it

gets hot. Feed this heated air

directly into an engine, and the
power output will be lower
than it would be if the air were
cooler and thus more dense.
However, if you pass it

through a device which makes
it give up quite a lot or Its heat,

you gain a significant amount
of power. That is what a
charge cooler (otherwise called

an intercooler; is all about.
Michael Kimberley, Lotus

chief executive and managing
director, declares that the
Esprit Turbo SE is the most
exhilarating of his firm's prod-
ucts he has ever driven. I am
sure he is right The car is said
to accelerate from a standstill

to 60 raph (96 kmh) in 4.7 sec-

onds, to 100 raph (161 kmh) in

11.5 seconds and to have a top
speed of 163 raph (262 kmh). To
which I am bound to say: so
what?

I will concede that it has
marvellous handling and road-
holding. It can be cornered out-

rageously quickly and makes
legal speed limits seem oppres-
sively low. But we have to live

with them. If £ have ever seen
a licence-loser, the Esprit
Turbo SE is it To ray mind,
there would be no more point
writing a cheque for £42,500 for

an Esprit Turbo SE to drive at

legal speeds than buying a.

£42,500 thoroughbred to ride in

Rotten Row. (Try galloping
there and see what happens).
Apart from more perfor-

mance than one can conceiv-

ably make use of, except on a
lightly trafficked autobahn,
what does one get for £42^00
(pins a bit more for a decent
radio/tape player and metallic

or pearlescent paint)?
The answer is a squashed-

down two-seater, with styling

guaranteed to draw covetous
glances from young men in
Ford XR3s and an interior that
is fairly cramped but air-condi-

tioned and leather trimmed.
On the debit side, there is min-
imal luggage space, no power
steering or ABS brakes, a glass

fibre reinforced plastic body
that creaks and a really dread-
ful instrument paneL

Visibility through the rear
window is almost non-existent
but fortunately the twin exte-

rior mirrors are most effective.

For obvious reasons, one has
to keep an eye on them all the
time.
Anyone who has owned a

Morris Marina would recognise
the Esprit's door handles and
some of the switches. This is a
dilemma for all specialist pro-

ducers such as Lotus. They can
hardly have their own exclu-

sive bits and pieces made up
when they only want a couple
of thousand of them a year.

But if I had paid £42.500 for an
ultra-fast but impractical
super-sports car. 1 would not be
best pleased to find it had com-
ponents from a cheap and bor-

ing family saloon long since
laid to rest

1 had driven up to East Ang-
lia. where I sampled the Esprit

Turbo SE, in a Porsche 94452.

This is the latest manifestation
of quite an old car - the 944
first appeared seven years ago.
It has a three-litre, 211 horse-

power, four-cylinder engine
with twin balancing shafts, for

which Porsche pays a royalty

to Mitsubishi. Whatever it

costs, it is worth it The only
time one realises that under
the downswept bonnet is an
engine that might otherwise be
in a truck is when it is made to

pull very hard in a high gear.

Understandably, there is then
a slight lumpiness, felt mainly
in exhaust system vibration.
At all other times it spins

sweetly and runs an unleaded!

petrol
Porsche claims 0-62 mph

(0-100 kmh) acceleration in 7J.

seconds and a top speed of 149
mph. It has such urgent
pick-up In third and fourth
gears that slight pressure from
the right toe makes a line of
slower moving traffic melt
away.

In town, it does not feel

clumsy and the power-assisted
steering takes the effort out of
parking. On the motorway, it

cruises quietly enough for easy
radio listening at whatever
speed your conscience - or the
number of points on your driv-

ing licence — permits. On a
track, I am sore the Lotus
Esprit SE would out-comer the
Porsche and show It a very

clean pair of heels. But does it

matter? Not to me, it wouldn’t.
Whatever else one thinks

about a 944S2, Its build quality

is superb. Everything fits prop-
erly and works precisely. The
whole car Is as solid as a rock.

Given regular servicing, one
feels it would be running as
well in ten years as it was the
day it left the showroom.
Although the 944 is nomi-

nally a 2+2, the space for rear
passengers is so limited that
the seats are best used for lug-

gage that overflows from the.

wide but shallow boot. The
driving position Is just about
ideal and the 944S2 is a car one
feels Instantly at home in.

In the aftermath of the stock
market crash in October '87

Porsche had a bad time, but
things are looking rosier now.
The 94432 can hardly be called
a bargain at £3L304, but when
you look at what you are get-

ting compared with the Lotus
Esprit SE - at £42,500, remem-
ber - it does not seem too

When roadhogs break the rules,

here’s the book to throw at them
THE Institute of Advanced
Motorists' Motorway Driving
manual is so good it is a pity

that those in most need of its

advice are unlikely to read
it - the tail-gaters and
lane-hoggers, I mean . . .

Though occasional horrific

accidents make headlines,
motorways are Britain's safest

roads even if, as the 1AM
points out. this is despite, not
because of, the behaviour of

too many users.
Published with the help of

Kogan Page, the «wawnal Is

a second edition - the first

sold out rapidly - and costs

£3.95 from booksellers and
motorway service areas. It

is well illustrated and full of
sensible advice. For example,
in advising drivers
approachinga reduced width
section to move Into a free

lane early while traffic is still

fast flowing, the manual says:

“As the traffic queues to
squeeze into the reduced
number of lanes, it benefits

nobody to play
dog-in-the-manger. If you are
in a Tree' lane, then letany
vehicle from the ‘joining’ lane
slot in ahead of yon. If

everybody did that, even for
just one vehicle each, most
queues at bottlenecks would
be greatly reduced.”

Quite. But why should I let

that oik who rushed past me
in his Cavalier L, when he
could see perfectly well that
the motorway was going down
to two lanes, get away with
it? An unworthy thought I
can almost see IAM Chief
Examiner TCd Clemente*

finger wagging ...
Stuart Elation's Observers

Pocket BookOfCars 1988-90

edition (Penguin, £3J99) is a
handy little reference work.
It lists all the things one really

needs to know about most of
the late-model cars on the
British market, except the

price. The facts are spiced
with comments which are
ln%

|
nwl and realistic.

Maps, to many motorists’
surprise, get out of date very
quickly. For example, if you
are still using a three-year-old .

road atlas, it won't even show
the completed M25. And
remember that towns such
as Gkehampton, Devon, and
villages such as Pembnry,
Kent, have become fit for
people to live in again since
the A30 and A21 were
by-passed within file last year.

Motorists can only benefit

from these time-saving road
improvementswhen planning
a journey by updating their

maps.
Ofall the maps I have, the

RAC's 1:100,000 (approx 1.6

miles to the inch) Navigator

Series atlases published by
George Philip and Son are my
favourites. Unfortunately, they
cover only the south east,

south west and Midlands, but
they are models oftheirkind.
The newly-published RAC/

George Philip folding maps
for the whole of England,
Scotland and Wales fill the

gaps. Though of 1:200,000

(three miles to the inch) scale,

they have enough detail to
make navigation possible
thrmigh lanes anil niMlawlfM
roads. They cost £&50 each.
Far finding your way

around the area roughly
.

bounded by the M25
(especially if the print in the
«nian A-Z has become too
difficult to read) I command
Geographia’s splendid Greater
London Street Atlas (£2235).

It is unbeatablefor clarity.

SM
MOTOR CARS

JAGUAR AUTHORISED DEALERS

GUYSALMON
PORSCHE

AUTHORISED
DEALER

CLASSIC CARS
Bridge

JAGUAR SPORT
19B8 (F) XJR 3.6. Turtgsien/doeahin. elec sunroof, heated seels. 5,000
mites- £38,950
1088 (FI XJfl-S United Edition. Tungsten/doeskin. only 2.400
mrics - £37,080
1068 (F)via Twn Biock/poichmont ntoepipod Mach, black carpets, TWH
onrjno offictoncy, suspension, wheels, tyres, stouring wheel, twin head-
lan’DS. quickshltt Qearpo*, 9.000 miles .... £34,990
1988 (E) XJS VI2 TWR Sotent/doeskln. full TWR body Styling, polished
alloy wheats and whool archos STUNNING. 10,000 mUes £31,960

XJS
1988 (El XJSM WcKHTrtnster/Mjgooha 1 1 .080 miles J26£60
1988 |F) XJS V12 Jubilee Bordeaux over Silver/MagnoUa, wooden stowing and
gear knob, boot and root apodcre, twin headlamps, chrome grS, macho wheels.
chrome whod arenas. 1 .000 mik» £34,950
1968(F>XJSV12Blach/d0esMn.8.000miles £29,960
1908(E) XJSViSMoartarKVdoeaMn. ASS. 8.000 miles £27.980

CABRIOLETS
1967 (3 IUSV12 Cabriolet. Bartieaux/bari ay, 2nd yrwty.lOJXXJmfea £2B£G0
1967 (E) XJS 3J> Cabriolet (Ai.SDvwbirch/bucksWn. 9.000 irrios— £2&OSO

&6*a/2.9'8
1968 (F)DolmSar 3.8 TungworVdoosMn. 4 .000 nvloa £30.960
1988 (FJDakntor 3.8 Tung-.IotVMVHIo. 10.000 miles ...... £29,960
1968 (E) Dataller 3.G BUcV \3«*5fcin, 8.500 m*as..— CZ6SS0
1908 (E) Sovereign 3.6 Satin Boigo/dooshln. ESR, alloys, 700 mJes. £27.950

SERIES III SALOONS
1987 (E) Sovereign V12 Racing groan/doeshln, Jaguar telephone, 17.000
iyuIot ... ................

19B7 (E) Sovereign VIZ Alpine/doeskin, 25,000 mUes. FSH £21,960

Westeri i

COUNTIES

Austin Healey 100M 1956. 62,000 mi lea.

Nory/rad Mm, factory oonvanrion to La
nan atandard, uprated brakes, suspen-
sion. tuned and modified. ‘M‘ engine.
OHW. beautiful UK car net US. Import,
£17.050 one. 01-350 2310 Monday onward*.

CHEVROLET BELAU1 1984 Imported Irom
Africa aun. rot tree, vary original, MOT/
TAX. LMO. Price £4905. Tol. 01-673 3227 or
ove/teeakand 01-6/3 4047.

E TYPE JAQUAH SEMES 1. U WC, LHD
1003 Original Mack. CampMaly reatoted

not run In MOTd. All aerial number* cor- ,

rad £18,600 01 372 6631/0932 568504 Jer-

TWO BOOKS by Hugh Kelsey
in the Master Bridge Series,
Test Your Percentages and Test
Your Communications, are
available in paperback (Gol-
lancz JSL95) and I recommend
them strongly. Let us look first

at percentages:

Hhitos hisxontracte--—
So simple, when you think of

it, hut how many declarers can
resist the finesses? Let us turn
to communications:

MERCEDES BENZ
tEftCEPEE 190 B AUTO Oct 87. FSH, S
months Merced»a Mechanical taeurmnee

and HAC, 28.000m, 8lue/fHack metallic

Electric auraeotrail window. ABS. Blau-

punkt aiareo, CAB phone, Rear head
restraints. Remote alarm, ft* Cosworm
Body Ktt, colour keyed aHoya ctmrtahwl

number. Immaculate conditions El&OHL
Private Sale No altera Tat 0709 589 756.

Q J 10 3

* K 10 6 2

B.M.W

N
AQ

V Q 10 9
7 64

>8 7 5 4 3
E

$
K 10 7 4 2
8 74

3 K 8 2
2 J9

s
95

?AKJ(32
A 9 5

AQ

N

f
A 9 7 6 3

10 8 S 4 3

Q7 _

K J8 5
A 8 3
K. Q 9
982

Q 10 4 2
757 5
7 6 2
K 10 6 4

$ K Q J 10 9 6 2
A J
A J 5 3

BMW M 53S wMto 37k. 1 owner FSH. ESR,
Immaculate condition £11,960 Telephone
0389 8322521832870

BRISTOL
Telephone:.'0272; 620526'

LIMOUSINE

PORSCHE
18*8 CADILLAC UMOUSKE Factory btilte*-

trlalon low miles, A/C. IS feel long -

£3X000 0828 823999

I

APPROVED I

l'51.0 caksI JfrHARTWELLS
VW/AUDI

1987 E. Jaguar Sovereign 3.6 Auto. Finished in solcnt
blue doeskin leather interior, 30,000 miles .£24,450

1987 E. Jaguar XJS VI 2. Finished in solent blue/

doeskin leather interior, 27,000 miles £23,950

1987 D. Jaguar Sovereign 3.6 Auto. Finished in solcnt

blue doeskin leather interior, sunroof, alarm, rear
window blinds. 25.000 miles £23.950
1987 D. Jaguar XJS VI2 Coop. Finished in bordeax
red. doeskin leather interior, 8.S00 miles £23,950

19S7 E. Jaguar XJ6 3.6. Auto.Finished in bordeax red/

cotswold cloth interior, air cond, ABS brakes, sunshine
roof. 17.000 miles £21.950
1987 D. Range Rover Vogue Auto. Finished in cassis

red/osprey cloth interior. 25,000 miles £19.950
1986 D. Mitsubishi Shoirgun SWB, Finished in black/

grey interior. 16,000 miles £10.950

1987 E Porsche M4
TURBO Manual

Stone grey/brown leather,

extras include ABS, electric

sunroof. Air conditioning,

I owner, FSH. 12,000 miles

£31.450
Contact ttdih Wharton

Td 0565 244 333

VW SCIROCCO
1600 GL Auto Reg
BPAJY 38,000 miles.

Excellent condition
£3,000

Tel: 0372 63777.

To advertise
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With both sides vulnerable.
South deals and starts the bid-

ding with one heart. North
raises to two and South goes
on to four hearts. West opens
with the queen of diamonds.
South takes with his ace and
plays a heart to dummy’s nine,

and both opponents follow suit.

How ought declarer to con-
tinue?
He has nine top tricks and a

winning finesse in either black
suit will yield the 10th. If

South draws trumps and relies

on finding one of the finesses
on-side, he has a combined 74
per cent chance. Can you see
anything better?

There is a better method -
setting up a long trick in clubs.
There is an 84 per cent chance
that the clubs will break 4-2.

The declarer must cash the ace
of clubs at trick two (rejecting
the finesse) and play the
queen. West takes and East fol-

lows suit West cashes two dia-

monds and leads a spade.
Declarer wins with dummy's
ace and ruffs a club with his

ace of hearts.

Crossing to the 10 of hearts,
he ruffs another dub high and'
crosses again to the heart
queen, drawing the last trump,
The established eight of chzos
is led, on which, the losing
spade is discarded, and South

West is the dealer and
North-South are vulnerable.
West opens with one no-trump
(12-14 points) and, after two
passes, the South player says
four hearts, which ends thefour hearts, which ends the
brief auction. West starts with
the king of diamonda

,
taken by

the ace. How should the play
proceed?
There are six certain, trump

tricks, two minor suit aces ana
the ace of spades, if South can
get at it It is likely, but no
sure thing

, that West hnlrig the
king of crabs. However, South
should not rely-on the indirect
finesse in dubs. There is a far
safer line.

At trick two, he leads the
knave of clubs. Whichever
defender holds the king must
win - as the cards lie, it is

East — tlw defence nan
make the diamond queen and
the heart ace, but no further
trick. The declarer can cross to
the queen of clubs and discard
his dub loser on the ace of
spades. That fulfils the con-
tract.

If you HUnlc that East rsm
upset this line by withholding
his club king, think again
South will then cash his ciuh
ace, ruff a 'dub on the table,

discard one of Us losers on the
ace of spades and now make
Us contract with an overtrick.
Not difficult. How soon did

you spot the solution?

£. P. C. Cotter

128 Gloucester Place,LondonNW1 5AJ

(01)4860831

ASTON MARTIN

please call

Peter Shield
FINANCIAL TIMES

SAAB AUTHORISED
DEALERS

Wan.irMmiiQ on*f picxnpl doiiverya no» saatta and prot-aW, have the laro-

l

®*ll*1":,n cl used Subi In the Mid-
H“«l LeamingtonEH iOSMl 43tei.

"

VANTAGE VOLANTE
»i(h delivery mik-aye only (250
mileil F rcyiMervU Firsi regiMrrcd
on IJth October Dark blue
with dark blue hood and maroon
hide interior. Often invited in

uccu of £125.000 to be received

by fu bj 12 noon Wednesday.

fax No 0438 742719

Books and Management Reports

are at

01-407 5764 01 799 2002
Phone for free catalogue
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The mid-engirted Lotus Esprit S£.
Exceedingly powerful - but what

can one do wfth an that'

expvnstveperformance?

Merrie England

H OVE IS not a place Monte Carlo- fee, but it W»
that immediately obviously 1 popular andsmootn-

springs to mind for? Jy*om.r ...... • ;
•

an exciting holiday Thirteen years ago^Jona-

— even the name, from the than Minns managed te save

Saxon for burial ground, has. a Hove’s- Victorian THijhptog sta-

sober drawl to it there used tor tfon .firom demolition. , With,

be lots of jokes about Hove £300 InWs pocket he began his

being a -place where people - campaign to turn a intoa

expensive. Standard equipment
indudes power, steering. ABS
brakes, central locking, power
operate! windows and tailgate

release and headlamp washers..

Air conditioning and a full

leather interior would boost
the price by more than £5,000

to £36,412. And: that, of course,

would also buy such toothsome
hardware as a Mercedes 300E
4MATIC. BMW 5351Sport, Jag-

uar XJ-S V12 or a brace of the

.

new and quite delightful Nis-
san 20QSX sports coupes.

went to dfe atui forgot to do so.

:'vftat times have changed.
Hove might not have a palace

or a pier or pink rock with its

name through the middle like

its- neighbouring big brother
Brighton, hut it does have
'some surprises.

--Not even some of its tesi-

^howplace for the development

of steam power and the British

Engineenum was bom. Now
he has over 2,000 models,
life-size exhibits and work-
shops that are not1 only for

restoring old engines but for

designing museums. in many
parte of the world. On Sundays

dghts seem to know it has a ..and bank holidays, the magnif-

castno, and at-the Coral Sta-

dium you can watch grey-
hound racing in comfort over
ah evening meal. The Sussex
County Cricket Club, estab-
lished in 1838, is- the oldest in

tiie country and a festival is

planned in July to celebrate its

150th anniversary.
You can swim in the palm-

fringed pools at the King

jteeht 1876 Beam Engine is in
steam— a hypnotic' sight with
the wheels turning and the pis-

tons see-sawing with a rhyth-
mic throb.
Up'on the Downs, Just ten

minutes drive inland, other
Sunday activities were in fell

swing. At Devil’s Dyke I
watched families flying kites
and hang gliders swooping off

Alfred Leisure" Centre and. If . over .the deep valley. On
braVe enough, take a wild

.

water ride; learn to windsurf,
«afl and canoe on the Lagoon;,
have tennis coaching with a
former Sussex county cham-
pion at the Record Tennis Cen-
tre. In fact, according to some
staunch Hovites, most of the
good things people think are in
Brighton are actually in Hove
and' an “Actually, It's ; Hove?-
society has been formed to
nress the point home.
The two-mile-long Esplanade

just asks to be strolled akmg^ I

started , at Embassy Court, a
1980s white block of flats that
marks , the Brighton-Hove bor-

der and is : incongruously,
joined to .

a Regency house on
the Hove ride. Across the road
is the turnof-thecentury peace
Memorial with its 30 ft high
olive-branch-carrying angel;,

nearby.that afternoon, blue-
jacketed - bandsmen were
playing rousing tunes on a tur-

quoise and cream bandstand.
In the, sparkling sunshine,

little girls skimmed by on their

skate boards, little boys on
bikes, fathers pushed push-
chairs and in the covered shel-

ters old men dozed, hands
clasped on walking sticks; On
the pebbly- beach, a fisherman
was repairing tackle; By the
water’s edge; a.solitary empty
deck chair billowed. The
beach-hut community were out.

in
-

force watching the windy

'

world from the warmth oftheir

'

days they say you can see right

across to Windsor Castle.

Hqve’s Museum and Art Gal-
lery in New Church fioad has
an unusual atmosphere, per-
haps because it was built in
the lSTOs as a family home. In

the pleasantly -proportioned
rooms are interesting collec-
tions of pictures, modern furni-

ture, jewellery, coins and toys;
and outside bn the front lawn
ts the intricately carved Jaipur
Gate. This was a gift frnn an

brightly-coloured little Indian trade detection in 1886
“hames^

‘
' * — ^- «»d-frmn'lteHPeoe^»rejwmiai-

TfordWft IlfltottfepftgitegBWcy

architecture issuperb. There*
sweeping Brunswick Terrace,
painted an obligatory cream,
and Adelaide Crescent curving
elegantly - Into Palmeira
Square, an obligatory magno-
lia. And then I discovered

.for the oldest house in Hove,
go to the flint-walled Hangle-
ton Manor with its'oak-pan-
elled rooms, owned in the 16th
century by the Sackville family
hut today a pub and owned by
Frank Saunders, who recently

bustling George Street fell of - bought the lord-of-the-manor-

smaH shops that were built in
the 1850s as hemes for local

craftsmen.
At No 34, Mr Tari was selling

“real Italian” ice cream. I

asked him what wasreal about
it He produced large tins.- to
show me the crushed fruit

from Italy with which he
makes his 25 different'flavours
so real that they' include the
pips.

Greyhound racing in Hove
did sound a bit unlikely, hut
the town has cast a cloak of
respectability over the Coral
Stadium. Ton can have a
three-course meal from around;
£10 in the 400-seater tiered res-:

tanrant that overlooks the
course and is separated from it

by a glass paneL You need to
book in advance, but menu and
wine list are sent by post.

ship at a London auction. In
the garden, a 17th century
dovecot has been restored at a
cost of about £10,000.

Street packing in Hove is
free and the multi-storey car
park costs just40p a day. tt has
clean streets and lawns since
the local council introduced a
poop-scoop bye-law. The Mayor
launched the scheme with his
own scoop, 800 others were
given away free and now three
tons of the stuff is removed
each week from the 50 “Hove
Dogs Keep it Clean” bins round
the town. A dog warden Is on
patrol in her Bedford van with
her own dog sitting beside her
to show that rise is not really
anti-dog. -

Information; Hove Is 57
rahtotes by train from. London
Victoria. By car, take the M25

The racing was all- over bjr and.: then M23 to Brighton.
10-30, hut Hove was still buzz-' Gatwick Airport Is 25 miles
ing. We went to Woodies.Wine
Bar where Billy Anderson was
playing the guitar in the cellar
restaurant, and then on.. to
investigate the casino at the
Sporting Club. You do need to
be a member or be introduced
by one, but our hotel had
arranged this for us. With play-
ers taking time off from the
tables to tuck into .tea- and
tomato sandwiches on -the
safes* it didn't quite — despite
the chandeliers - have^a

north. I stayed at the small
family-owned Whitehaven
Hotel in. Wllbury Road, five
minutes walk from thp sea
With solarium, small walled
garden and superb food. The
focal tourist information cen-
tre (tel: 0873-775400) will sup-
ply a list ofmore than 40 other
restaurants in the town*

Angela
tyigglesworth

SNAPSHOT
LEAVING THE agricultural
lands of Idaho behind, the
road crossed the Snake River .

.

and climbed suddenly through .

the forest It was almost 4pm -.

and we had eaten nothing
since unravelling tire

mysteries ofan American
breakfast Back In Twin Balta

we had indulged in “hash
browns’*and ‘*short stedis,?. ’

among other tilings, and hoir
it was timefor tea.: - r :

‘ :*

One Of the joys ofAmerica
is in trying to anticipate what '

a mundane-sounding dish will
actually consist of when it

arrives on the table. No
amount of guessing could have
prepared us for this, though.
The cafe, a rather scruffy

would have the offered;
dnnamon rolls instead.-
What was placed betee us

five minutes later was enough
to feed an army but was fit
for a king. Each bun, fresh
from the oven, overhung the

knob of butter flowed over
the soft white icing which
covered the sweet fluffy dough
twisted in a spiral like ah
enormous frnit-free Chelseabw It was deUcuras, and
easily kept us going until
dinner much later.

Immediately outside, in the
warm afternoon sun, we
watched first a white pelican.

welcoming. A large sign in
the window of the adjacent
bar forbad entry to those
under age, weeds were rank- -

in. the flower beds, and the
‘

door was hard to find. Once ..

inside it was more welcoming,
and we ordered tea and
cookies.No cookies?Then we

banyan osprey all fishing
inanarrow arm ofa lake. We
stood for age* as the osprey
plunged repeatedly into the
smface waters. In spite of its
efforts, it failed to catch
anything. Replete with our
roils, we felt nothing hut
sympathy.

,

Michael J. Woods

i*

}/ «
' 2

h \ £

§



HhTANCIALTlMES SATURDAY APRIL 29 1989

TRAVEL

T HE DATE was June 20 1047 and
time, as they say, was about to
run out for dapper hoodlum Ben-
jamin “Bugsy” Siegel.

The mobster had returned to the luxury
Beverly Hills mansion ofgirtfrlend Vir-
ginia Hill after dining at an nroawft^t-
restaurant
Bugsy was relaxed.

His latest venture and most expensive
plaything - the Flamingo Hotel, out there
in Vegas — was Anally coming good.
Bugsy was a real-life rarir«t»re of a

Hollywood gangster.
Young and handsome, his ego was insa-

tiable.
•

“ • “

He started in New York.
His peers and associates comprised the

top ecnelbnWAmerica’s criminal element
A1 Capone. Dutch Schultz/Lucky Luci-

ano. Prank NlttL To die buf-a few.
Then Bugsy went to Hollywood. -

Bugsy went to Hollywood on the orders
of the Mob, to operate a wire service for
West Coast bookies.
He dressed in finely tailored clothes.
Escorted voluptuous women. ~

Drank the costliest champaigns.
And wielded terrifying power.
Not content with his nefarious accom-

plishments in the Los Angeles underworld,
Bugsy dreamed of going legitimate by
building a desert hotel-casino - the
world's most luxurious - that would bog-
gle the minds of a C. B. DeMiUe -or a
Darryl Zanuck.
-The Mob bankrolled his project
The Flamingo was a milestone.
IBnt it just ate money.
The reason Bugsy was relaxed that fete-

ful June eve in 1947 was that the Flamingo
was at last making profits.

On returning from the restaurant,
Bugsy sat on the couch with the Los
Angeles Times.
But a burst of angry gunfire split the

fragrant night air.

It was all over in seconds.
'

An unknown assailant pumped several
rounds through a window of Virginia
Hill’s love-nest.

Five,shots scattered.

;Bat four found their mark.
-Bugsy lay. dead in a swelling crimson'

puddle.
Yet the mobster’s dream did not parish

with him.
The Flamingo flourished, ushering in a

new era of splendour and opulence that
would set the standard for all future estab-

lishments on the Las Vegas Strip.

Bugsy’s flamingo became a real class

joint

AND SO IT remains today - located, as it

is, at 3555 Las Vegas Boulevard South. 28
stories tall,' a glinting confection of throb-
bing pink neon at the very intersection,

opposite Caesars Palace, where Bugsy first

scuffed his toe in the desert and called it a
groundbreaking. Except that what Las
Vegas calls a real class joint bears little

resemblance to what anyone else calls a
real class joint Not that that matters. Lbs
Vegas is Taste City: shimmering, glitzy,

raddled, neon-bathed and sun-baked, so
cosmically vulgar, so consummately over
the fop, that it is difficult not to like it —
in exquisitely small doses.

Bugsy’s Flamingo, for example, is now
the^Flamingo Hilton — cheerfully outra-

gepus and gUtfefingly successful; so big. at

2,920 rooms, that it claims to be the
world’s second largest resort hotel, bested

only by the Las,Vegas Hilton itsefc some
blocks away, which has 8J74 zooms and
nails itself, qntajhshingly, a “monument to

modern-day
They really ate enormous, these Vegas

hotels. Early last month, in the week
before the Mike Tyson-Frank Bruno world
title fight, I sashayed up and down the
Strip, in and oiit of these astonishing edi-

fices with their shockingly impersonal ser-

vice and dreadful, identical food, and felt

as tfrongh I vis inhabiting the same time
warp that shelters the Titanic. No-one
appears to be in charge. At times they
seem almostout of control as thousands of
guests arid visitors mitl and flmmtder and
spend, spendFspend.

In many jrays, the career of Bugsy’s
flamingo matches that of Las Vegas itself.

Within a dar of Bngsy’s murder, percent-

ages of the lotel’s stock were being tossed

around lik* slices of apple pie. and a new
partnership emerged. Undo- fixe steward-

ship of mobster Gus Greenbaum, the Fla-

mingo prc&ered. In I960, two Miami hotel-

man boudtt control. Then it passed to

Kirk Keilorian, whose impact on the
Vegas hejel scene in the late 1960s was
actually greater than that ofMs more pub-
licised rial, Howard Hughes.

In mfelSTO, Kerkorian signed an agree-

ment wth ffiltnm which bought both the
Veps international and the Flamingo

— marling, for the first time, the entry of

a mojo?corporate hotel chain into Nevada

and heralding two decades of spurting cor-

porate growth in Taste City, which contin-

ues to this day.
Las Vegas is a century-and-a-half-old. On

Christmas Day 1829, a group headed by
New Mexican trader Antonio Armijo sent
a scouting party to look for water; at some
point in fixe following days a young scout,
Rafael Rivera, stumbled upon an oasis.

Las Vegas Springs. Twenty-five years
later. Mormon settlers from Salt Lake City
began bmlding a fort of adobe bricks, near
fixe current intersection of Las Vegas Bou-

road, practically insulated Vegas from the
Great Depression.

In 1940, hotelman Tommy Hull built the
El Rancho Vegas on the site now occupied
by the Sahara Hotel - the beginning of
the Vegas Strip. Other hotels followed: the
Flamingo, Desert inn, Sahara, Sands, Rivi-

era, Dunes, Hacienda, Tropicana, Stardust,
and on and OH.
Today, Las Vegas bears scant resem-

blance to the dusty watering stop of 1905.

It has survived the Mob. You would never
mistake it for a Bible Belt town, but fear

Las Vegas is fine, but only in exquisitely small
doses, says Michael Tkompson-Noel

levard North and Washington Avenue.
Part of it still stands, preserved as an
historic site.

In 1910, Nevada became the last state In
the West to outlaw gambling, with a law
so strict that even the custom of flipping a
coin for the price of a drink became iHegaL
According to the Nevada State Journal in
Reno: “Stilled forever is the dick of the
roulette wheel, the rattle of dice and the
swish of cards.”

Forever lasted less than three weeks.
Gambling went underground, as it always
does, and was re-legalised in 1931, creating

a small but lucrative industry that
together with fixe building of the Hoover
Dam and the selection of Las Vegas as the
division point for the Union Pacific Rail-

and loathing are on the wane. It craves
respectability. Last year it attracted 17.2m
visitors, many of them on junkets from
Pacific Rim countries like Japan and Hong
Koxxg. Vegas has 61,394 hotel/motel rooms,
with another 11,000 under construction
and more than 20,000 planned.
As Vegas grows bigger, the pace of its

round-the-clock gambling grows ever more
hectic. It is like a monumental slot
machine, towering in the desert Through-
out southern Nevada there are more than
58,000 slots and more than 2,600 gaming
tables, with much of the action concen-
trated in the casinos of Clark County,
which includes Las Vegas. Great fortunes
are at stake, because in 1988 the statewide
total of taxable gross revenue in Nevada’s

casinos rose by 8.7 per cent to $4.27bn.
(The casinos’ gross revenue is the total

amount wagered less the winnings paid
out).

Some gamblers bet big. Arabs and Mexi-
cans were formerly tbe stars, until the oil

price felL Now the Hong Kong Chinese are
said to be file biggest gamblers. Some of
them bet up to $60,000 per baccarat hand,
winning or losing - in a single weekend
- as much as $10m. But most gamblers
bet small, pouring their coins and notes
.into Vegas’s stickily gulping maw.

At the State Gaming Control Board I

was told that about 55 per cent of the
entire Vegas take is sucked up by the
slots, some of which are joined together in

an unholy system called Megabncks, a
statewide progressive slot machine net-
work that links 97 nasinng in 22 centres
throughout Nevada.
In the first. Megabucks jackpot of 1989,

54-year-old Donald Sarbaugh. who identi-

fied himself as a “former street person”
though he now works for a Las Vegas
recycling company, won $2,756^8426 after

40 minutes of play by lining up four Wild
Ts on the bottom pay line of a Megabncks
machine at the Palace Station Hotel and
Casino in Las Vegas. The current world
slot jackpot record belongs to Cammie
Brewer of Reno, Nevada, who won a Mega-
bucks jackpot of $6£m 14 months ago.

If I were you. I would try and ignore the
wicked slots and other casino games, for
they will drain away your money with a
hideous gurgling sound as sure as eggs is

eggs. To' get your money’s worth in Vegas,

see a few shows, seek out the Japanese

restaurants. by the swimming pool

and spare an hour for the Liberace

Museum on Tropicana Avenue, a collec-

tion of some of the cars, pianos, costumes

and memorabilia of the late great show-

man. It is not at all tacky - well, just a

teeny bit. perhaps: a zillion too many
rhinestones, but nothing outlandish.

Old people love Las Vegas and are flock-

ing there to live, attracted by the climate,

the low taxes and the variety of entertain-

ment If they tire of the casinos, they can
always pop across to the Senior Citizens’

Center, where the programme includes a
“Pancake Brunch & Free Blood Pressure

Check,” as well as an audio-visual show
entitled “Fraud and Other Con Games.”
The best sight in Las Vegas is the road

out of town - any road, for Vegas is very

well placed as a stepping stone to some
desolate, splendid spots. Within an hour's
drive are Hoover Dam, Lake Mead, the

Valley of Fire State Park and Red Rock
Canyon. Vegas is also a good storting
point for day trips to ghost towns and
old-west communities such as Rhyolite,

Potosi, Goodsprings. Searchlight, Pioche,
Goldfield and Tonopah. A bit further
afield, you can reach Death Valley (Calif-

oraia), the Grand Canyon (Arizona) and
Bruce Canyon and Zion National Park
(Utah).

Although Las Vegas is in the heart of

the south-west desert, within 35 miles
there is a mountainous region that boasts

a ski resort Tbe area is Mount Charleston
and the resort is Lee Canyon, both of them
part of Spring Mountain Range.
The animals to be found in Spring range

are said to be the deer. elk. antelope,

mountain sheep, wild turkey, coyote, bob-
cat fox and chipmunk. 1 have driven in
this desert many times, and have never
seen a thing - not even a UFO - but I

suppose they must be there.

If you drive from Vegas to Lee Canyon,
the stuff you do see starts with cactus,

yucca and creosotebush. At 5,000 ft you
are in among pinon pine, junipers, sage-

brush, rabbitbrush and the beautiful scar-

let trumpeter. At 6,500 ft, the pinon pines
are replaced by mountain mahogany, oak-
brush and ponderosa pine, the pine stands
becoming thicker and tbe trees larger the
higher you get At 8,000 ft, the aspen-fir

zone begins.
The Lee Canyon ski area is at this eleva-

tion, and marks the farthest you can
travel by road, though the Bristlecone
Pine Trail starts there if you want to go
higher. Four thousand years old, the
famed bristlecone pine is said to be the
oldest tree in the world, older, even, than
the California redwoods. I do not know
whether that is true or not, trees being
funny; but it is what the tourist people
claim.

1 travelled c/o British Airways’
Poundstretcher, which offers numerous
packages to the US. Its current mid-week
return fare, London-Las Vegas via Los
Angeles or Chicago, is £492; weekend:
£545; advance 21-day booking. Two typi-

cal inclusive prices: 14 nights Golden
West air tour (seven nights Los Angeles,
three Las Vegas, four San Francisco) £965
during May. Or a seven-night California
fly-drive holiday, £625, starting June 1.

Reservations and brochure enquiries: tel:

0293-562760.

T HOLIDAYS AND TRAVEL

T"
FLIGHTS

AMERICA
TOfAST COAST USA

KW RCTURN TO WfcST COAST US*
. .cm to m»o wsst usa .

• FyDin*—

P

aCfcAflM to USA TO C223

• nop4dn—Owjf 300 »Kta0««d*n| Hm
Severn! Ratal

• CaMtariu—Ovor 100 IndKWndOrtf HM
Special Ram

fc Apartment*. Hotel* and Tou*
• Luxury. FYrnmOTy Conducted four*

• v * • Catt to Fra* Brochure * » •

Frontiers m
AIM*

iM Oawnam Rood. London VW ZAW
. . 01-994 6958

DISCOUNT FARES
' In Iff Claw. Club
v a Economy Cfasa

Alio Concorde
For Ita beat guaranteed deals

PfcMt contact the expert*

01-4392944
Fax 01-73* 22*2

' Pan Express Travel

SUPER ^RES
a73 fa-dr £485
t*3S •ha/mutmg £470
£370 ifc-cfca £*!5

020 Vrv Yak £105
£330 Path £665
rawsIM £413

y ms
_ £*40TdA>* BIS
LvAttka £291 Tokyo ms

£36 IVmkhgum £195

Cam
DHU
Hoar

Hm/CUOi><W1M
ACMQSSTMAiO.

BRflnSH
AIRWAYS

First, dirf or economy
class. 45*#discount if two
peopfc tnrelling together.

rJoi-23nms
07-2292595

wonurwtOK flRWTB tar fha dtacnrelng
nalriwaam TraVUlai. McMnqnd Travat. *

. 01440 4073 ABTA

a.WOftUHMM. tow CM
FtMtitm a Aooanraodatton. Phona

.VfaU Traml on (0444) 4W01 < ABTASOtfiS.

OffOONKT MR IMO to f»pt» W**
wM* For arMca call CoMan Sand*
Tmvat 0v*8i «3».

•AMZU4 EUCttrta AMD tfOUDAY* WORLD.
MODE TitianaH to M«a YOK PMM StoC-

Ttaval. 0TMMB6f* ‘ ‘

)R AIRLINES
tRLDWIDE
/LIGHTS

WOR^WIDE DISCOUNTS
.

v UP TO 60%
nfnnnal fhre. economy.

ctatyini da» and Concorde

Xd 01-221-6095
Fax 01-229-3595

fcntrtaa.1Spaln.-PortugaL Oraaca.

Turicay fttaty- towyBhon ataya aaML Car
HraaAooad. FaUtor LH. 01-471 00*7.

AIOLpa nCOVWA.

SPECIAL INTERESVACTIVITY

One ofhTc’s most
, memorable journeys

GALAPAGOS
A ECUADOR
GalapagosOwe ’•

& Amazon Safari.

17 Jnl. 21 days from £2165
Darwin"* GalapagosA
Mainland Kcmdor

14 Am*. 21 days from £2206
21.iW W" day* from £1809

/OVENTURE TRAVEL

tomfJOHtmvTMi «**»
MptamkM»9 WMlOday*
Mpriaadladb SaoiMdm

Napanamas todr*
HnaMneoriMs sainys

SMAMa 20dar*
MHtondtaca* want

Darin Cap Irak Kdayf
- sjtmsaUH rtdays

ROrOCfO 15 ttyf

Tutor isam

|

i: church sntsrr. twi

mMZ
Bftoctnnut
n^njisv
1AIA I'iirA ASM

MoiiwrAiNS,/
WHITE-WATER
JUNGLE m* •

Specialist adventure hodays
undcr^the gnitkuice f^vr
revdcnt’Englisn Out*™*
Nepal. For brochVt wl:

0926 4SQ535 V

HlMAl.AYAN^f QUEST}

». HawtSai Tk.1W»9. MammnnTc itaib/wnwg"
Spa, WiF-kWp'y MY

FRANCE

ffUUMCS - Moiertne Taut artdi Intrifaiaj^

CwuH*OUlantdnk Ud 0I-55WM ABTA

MOW.

r m Roan Olfan wmfcrW *

nraaktoff. "dta I**®* awiwanas pool and

udm TV in teavwm carar*! tacanon. La

Budda. WM OMJI 048» onw ua
Batata, FiMn Td Franca R V# WTt.

SHORT SNEAKS to Francti

i minaitta A cBMaaa*. By car San 04-

SSHa^: Fncnn Fr«a* E«*~l**
OWN 1*M.

CRUISING

The Magic of the Western Isles
Hebridean Princess 3/4 night cruise option from
£220. Discover the elegant way to see Britain's

most dramatic scenery. (Extra hotel night free
before of after cruise or take your car on board
at no extra charge!). For a holiday of a lifetime

our 7 night cruises start at £545 up to £1400 for
a stateroom with private balcony.

Write or phone for brochure:
0756-748077 Cara Binns.
Hebridean Island Cruises Ltd.,

Bank Newton. Skfpton.
N.Yorkshire BD23 3NT

PERMISSION TO
COME ABOARD
Sail to the South Pacific

Islands wlto a
square-rigged Tall Ship
from New Zealand to

Tahiti, Marquesas. Tonga,
Samoa & Australia. Join

. the.Sorer* Larson, Anna
Kristina & Anna Rosa as

a trainee craw (or

Adventure, Challenge &
Camaraderie. Details:-

[\\ Si K! US\V< >R
U CHURCH STREET. TWICKENHAM

01-892 7606/8164^
24 HR
BROCHURE:
Ol-SUTBSl
1ATA MATA.ABTA

ITALY

Let your body
take a holiday
taihl «nto|rtna oood oaffhy hatota and—HBntcwtoA raion your
dtoa and pan* won Uto tanous Fango
raid Mttmils» a**« Haaflh. Saatfy

-• and FUftaaa Oaarapy.

Abano taatowrad In baaudM counbyffcto

km 45 nli iartna haw VanlcB.

SehadatoSgMa taooi HMitoow and
toOtanff morta- Price* a«n or w«hout

i
Wabwanta- Pntotocarbanataralncludad.

Soft COLOUR BROCHURE
wars OR TELEPHONE

Lawaras j
(Vtoiwof WtastinlnswrIMM^j

. 2W PRfisTON AONX HARROW

® |«OOLE8EX HA3 0QA

TEL: 01-904 2202^
CASA COLONICA

Offers a large selection of
Castles. Luxury Villas,

Farmhouses and Apartments
with Swimming Fools ir

Tuscans. Umbria and the

South of France.

Td 376 4747 or 376 4971/2

Mtcon TO ITALY, Tuaosny and ton
raflkM*. Fvnuau. v«** A «aa. teM l to M Cuaadai 1089 C3.H FV#a
colour brocfaiira. Parqinioad Ol 738 4982
(Mhdce-V.

AFRICA

TEMPOTRAVEL
WALKON THE
WILDSEDEt

We offeran unrivalled

sdectiooofadveaznres to
Botswana,Egypt, Kenya,
Malawi, Morocco, Ntnabia,
South Africa, Zambiaand
Zimbabwe.

Forholidays that fed tbevery
pulseofAfrica call01 S61 1131

orseeyour local travel agent.

Brunswick Hooae
.

Bramwidt
London Nil IEE

m
VILLAS

Make I9S9 the
year you got

the villa right

FTHEGREEK ISLANDS I
ALGARVE • ITALY

TURKEY (crewed boats)
MAJORCA

Smd for our 19W brochure -
qotcUv Wc arc Uw iptoatatt
in hn&lay \-flLm Tbrytr all

aichiKy chosen tor aunettr
and urtspotlrd murounltn^, on
a beach <v with pool. All

tnrhjdr maid Mitd alien j cook.
Wrfl over holi ourdxntk rmirn
year iftrryw. (And llufl the
bcW advrrtx^cmaot yewU re*d
Ofl lias pAR«T)

CV Travel
iCVIwdffWMfrH

D^arr
43 CadDRin Street

London SW3 2TR
Dl-SSI 0651/534003
t24hrbrodans - 01-569 0132)

7he very best in

villa hobdap

VILLA RENTALS
Selection ofsuperb villas near

(be sea or with pods in the

Canpes/Amibes ana. Prices

from £450 p.w. few season lo

£2800 p.w. high season.

Tel. 01 650 2347

LANZomc travel Lanzatcto apaciaUM.
Good coeiirr aefl-CTBnng nBaa a asa.
moat wnn grata. Son A sand? Waclto Tal
0737 765311 (54 hr*) AttaMiVka*. ABTA
30J7X ATOL 7Z1&

Tha Boat vita art m Lie Palmer a Parter
Mw book. Amtobto m Aignrv*.
South o« Franee, USA and Carrimaan
toon nano ns. ail nawa prmsa pseix xm
nooo <•« cnaas. Broaiutas 0»* 8<S*1 1,

INDIA

INDIA

For the beat in Indian

Holidays

TRANS INDUS
leads the way

Ring for brochure

01-M8 2728 (24 bra)

-MTRANS INDUS LIMITED

Yeoman House.
11 The Pavement, Popes Lane,

EaCno. London WS 4MG

PORTUGAL
AND SPAIN

TRAVELUMS IN SPAIN? If you ara CoMsm-
pfatmg a rtsll 10 Savina, why not driva out
(B0 milas) to our cotntonawe tarmhouM in
Bi* Aracena Mountains (unapotn rural
Spain. 2500 It aoowa saa laval). Brldah
couple wte> young family take a law paying
guests. DeDdous cooking, decent wtne.
pretty bedroom, own bate. Reasonable
rates. Atao convenient II driving to
Algarve. Magnificent scenery, uora. bird-
song, walks For into ahaal can Sam or
Jeannie on 0i0-34-{S5) 12.40.34 or tax
same number attar 10 p.m.

CANARY ISLANOS. Oran Canaria Puerto
Reo. tuniry appartmeto to laL Also 38N
yacht wWi skipper available lor day sail-
ing. Telephone TO5Z-6B7711 or 010
3438-740397.

UK

Any two night stay in the months of May &
June. For only £35 per Person, per Night

including Evening Meal & English Breakfast.

GRANVILLE HOTEL
R°ad

Tel:- 0273 26302

Courtlands Hotel
19-27 The Drive

Hove
H-O-T-E L -S Tel: 0273 731055

Elegant CountryCharm-
LuxuryLondon Hotel
& Magnificent Suites

^t»Tfcv
Telephone: 01*723 7874,39-40 Dorset Square, London NW1 6QN.

Telex: 263964 Dorset C. Fax: 01-724 3328. USA Toll Free: 1-800443-4138.

SWEAT YARMOUTH Luauiy apartment dose
to saa to and all amentUaa. Tal 0403
8*4663 (anrearphone).

BATH. LUXURY CEOROtAN APARTMENTS In

baautlful Roman city. Central locations.
Private parking. Pats walcoma. 02Z&
44G0C0.

Alternatives
VILLA ALTERNATIVES

Luxory serviced villas in selected locations including France. Portugal,

Spain, Mallorca and the Caribbean. All tbe benefits ofa hotel wiib
Iho privacy and ldustyie ofyourown borne.

SPORTING A STAGING POSTALTERNATIVES
A holiday planned to osit youraport, whether it it golf, sailing or while water railing.

Ha route stopover in s chateau in Franco or an anoent palace in Spain.

EXOTIC ALTERNATIVES
Wc wiJT find the time to tailor make your holiday to be the ultimate in Inrory
and style. Whether it is relaxing an a South Pacific beach, or tracking gorillas

ia Zaire. Simply tell ua your domination and we will plan the read

A very personalised service for very individual people

TEL: 01 785 9999 for advice on ALTERNATIVES
AiSTA 16723 Bladon Lines Travel Ltd iata

BRITAIN’S MOST
SOUTHERLY
^^HOTELI

5Jousel <£ay ^otel
DR4A1AI1C COtfWL MEWS

SAfE SANOr BEACH
EN-SLMTE BOOMS WITH TV
nuomOMU. CUBME
c£AJTifUL gardens

SEQU3W. PEACE* QUET

m 0326 290417

Safaris
Botswana,

Zimbabwe&Zambia

with

Grenadier
TRAVEL

Telephone for a brochure

L (0206) 862268

AMERICAS

DISCOVER
CALIFORNIA

IN STYLE
mraNTOURSwo

arrange jiwtr Fly-Drtva

vacation featuring

Amoton Bed S Breakfast

Phone: (0442) 214480
far brochureanytime

Capitalise on the FT’s connections

by advertising in the Weekend Travel Pages

To advertise in the Weekend FT Travel Pages, simply complete the coupon and return it to:

Francis Phillips, Classified Sales Manager, Financial Times, Number One Southwark Bridge, London SE1 9HL

a’
Allow five wank per line 1minimum 3 Ihh-n) C'hm: vis vitrik {tlv.4.1)

20 words f01.70} 25 uurtk (CSjKj SI wurtS (£51.115) 35 worth (LVt.23)

-V) words (£41.4(1) rates, mcluk: VAT.

AdverthcmL-nL\ over dll uords. rait-k are avail.ihk: on applicaiHin phiNe ainic-h

copy separately Lincapc: £4.511 pur line + VAT Dhpln : £2iM4l + VAT.

Ktase inseri the lolio^inti in the VfcuUud FT tm

Saiurdav. rew

/O
I wivlt in pay K cheque value f

m.idu fttvahiu hi Fintinruil Times Ltd.

1 uuilkutse toil k> Jehu irum my Visj/AmeVAccess account (delete as

appliiMhlc) the sum ol £

Su:iuiuru . _

teal Expiry Dale

Mi rani number is 1 H
Name: .

Addrow.:

rm

.R>Mcode:,

Ditylime Tel No.

.

Czf Weekend FT Travel PagesZ§= 01-873 3503-rfi;
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COUNTRY PROPERTY

MILTON KEYNES- BUCKS
WOODLEYS FARM

WOBURN SANDS

EQUESTRIAN CENTRE
and 42.8-* acres Together with 42.82 acres

AGRICULTURAL LAND
and

4 PONY PADDOCKS between 5 and 9 acres

FOR SALE BY AUCTION
1stJUNE 1989

Pamcutars from Agents.

Berrys
87 High Street
Newport Pagneli
Bucks
0908 611388

Auctioneers:

John Drake & Co
Uncle Jack's
Lavendon Road
Olney
Bucks

Grade 3 toted Georgian town house with lovely garden in superb setting in beast of

The accommodation on three floora comprises:- splendid hallway with marble floor.

We&lfadng, drawingroom. 2 principal bedrooms, kitchen and bathroom. 2 further

rooms and bjihroom at garden level with own entrance.

Electric heating Sccuriiv swum. Garaging nearby.

Viewing telephone 0JI-Z25-:«I9 i.Agenui

Further particulars from and offers over £325,000 to Messrs. Oundas & Wilson,

C.S . 23 Charlotte Square. Edinburgh EH2 4QS. Telephone 031-225-2080.

WILTSHIRE-PEWSEYI MILE
(Paddington 1 hour). Marlborough 6 miles. Swindon 16 miles.

A particularly well maintained large imposing petted house in 1
acre on the Kennet&Avon Canal. 10 bedrooms,6 receptions etc

(including annexe). Stable block and outbuildings. Potential also

for use as a nursing/elderly persons home or sub-division into

smaller units. Ref: MCKT
Offers over£500,000 Freehold.
Hamptons,20 High Street, Malborough.Ifel: (0672) 53471

HOWARDS

EAST COAST - GORLESTON, NR- GT. YARMOUTH
(Norwich 22 miles)

AN IMPRESSIVE ARCHITECT DESIGNED GENTLEMAN'S
RESIDENCE with uninterrupted views of L-lifflop. sea and Harbour's mouth.
Hall, cloakroom. 4 receptions, kitchen, utility room, sun lounge. 5 bedrooms,
dm^ing room. 2 bathrooms. Central heating uml double glazing. Detached
garage with O.P.P to convert to duelling house. Seafront building plot with

O P.P. In all acre.

High Street, Gorleston Tel. 0493 665005

^
TSf

Opon 7 Days A Week
2PA1NSWICK QUEEN OF
J THE COTSWOLOS

1

17th Century Character
House, edge of village, 3
bods, 2 Attic bads.
Farmhouse Kitchen.
Dining Room. Family
Room 23" « 17". Garden
Oarage. Gas C.H.
OITRO £315,000
OPEN THROUGHOUT
THE HOLIDAY WEEKEND

..I Call
10452) at29 IS

Hamptons
SURREY - SOUTH CMCAM

London IVkaorto/Lontfon Bride*)
30 mlROMs

A luiurtcuc sinole rtorer residence of
• •coplionoi qualliv. in ona of iho
area a mast prucugleus private roads
C-ocmic cn la mo Cuddlngion Call
Ctfuiao Recepticn hail, ik anting room,
dining loom, pillta'il room, fcllcJl-

oniprookual room, lamiiy room, study,

laundry room. S bedrooms. 4 M th-

reema. leisure complo* with sauna,
locuezl. indoor swimming pool Doutlto
gatOBO a 4 acre grounds.

Hanmfcne Brtdgara,
Epsom OtSca: tnnr) 1*1*1

a MILES
TTrtey - rl.srcudo hcarlon. ported lj

brnboiod 3 {MMicani (antihouso Finn

Bwicnfifl. UtnisraMe consent tor eon-
vorsion to i>J DodrOOm delocnod
f iling* Moormqa a fishing. Lovely
vtoua Appro, ll; oeioa

Lot 1 (230-22,000. Lot CSS-00,000
Hampton* Pacocfc A Laar.

Ton—tm ry Ontcs- (0054) 282330

COT3WOLDS - BROADWAY
4 MILES

Eoautirut -u'oi Mtuauon - select oevet-

oofTien: 4 luiury cnuchod Itcinos 3
rocepncn rooms. Liictionrprcaklast

room, utilit,. 4 bodroarra. planconV
PMSreom & Double garage. 51ream.

View* to CatswaUp.
Prices from U4W00

THE
BELVEDERE
CHELSEA
HARBOUR

A completely furnished custom
designed luxury Apartment at

this prestigious address.
Equipped to the last teaspoon
and ready lit move in. Realistic

price on application.

Telephone:
01-584-0563

TAX HAVEN!
Du „ni unit m li»e on the KuiH.fdl Isle

i-f Man’ Du, hr.il- Jrrv-y *.*, Gnmvwy
hn a iiKiklli weLivnr and vnaieJree
iirpm if. tut A nmr in ele. My
Jerdwl home n tm Ilk inna eds* ijf

U.ingla- A ha* J bed*. 4 tsnhs. 1 scvrjn
CW. plus a lowly in the pounds

tet Hafsttfi (0624) 852858

GUERNSEY
Modem chalet

Bungalow in rural son
after area comprising
ground floor lounge,

sun lounge, dining
room. Kitchen,

Bedroom en Suite, first

floor: 3 Bedrooms 2
Bathrooms also Double
garage approx, Vz acre
of land Price £435.000
For further information
Phone 0481-45940

• :. • S-\i
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PROPERTY

Why the crash of ’89 remains

Nowhere in the
debate on press free-

dom and responsibil-

ity is there any
direct reference to the confu-

sion, financial Joss nnd general
disruption caused by stories

forecasting a bousing market
crash. This might be because it

is a side issue. But if it was
your house that didn’t sell, or
your estate agency job that
was axed, the past few months*
news coverage will not have
been something to dismiss.

During autumn and winter,
readers’ letters and telephone
calls confirmed that house
price crash stories had either
unnerved them, or ' their -pro-

spective buyers, to the extent
that they were locked in an
unmoving buying chain or
were considering causing a
chain jam by opting out of a
move. At the same time, prop-
erty correspondents on papers
where a couple of paragraphs
and a vast headline suffice as a
feature article, and financial
journalist colleagues on papers
that should know better, were
bemoaning the fact that their
news editors were interested in
running only price crash sto-

ries.

Television programmes have
a similar need to pick a single,

visually dramatic angle on a
story, and it is easy enough to

take a 15-second crash com-
ment from the most conserva-

tive of residential market
observers jfyou have, perhaps,

20 minutes of interview to play
with.

Estate agents and house-
builders saying that they see

no signs of a collapse have
been dismissed by the line,

“They would say that,

wouldn't they?” There has
been an almost gleeful concen-
tration on the presumed losses

of residential market specula-

tors. the ill-loved agency pro-
fession, and the contrasting
mileage that can be wrung
from homeless would-be first-

time buyers and overborrowed
mortgage arrears cases.

It is always tempting to
squeeze a little extra drama
from a change in market condi-
tions- But the stories of immi-
nent collapse that have col-

oured so many views of the

housing market since the
autumn have been both posi-

tively misleading and influen-

tial. As the latest state-of-trade

inquiry by the House Builders*

Federation shows, lack of
buyer confidence Is now'
regarded by federation mem-
bers as the second most impor-
tant constraint on future sales.

(The first constraint is that
familiar cry, “inadequate sup- .

ply of land to meet demand”).
In their first quarterly bulle-

tin for the federation, econo-

mists Mike Fleming and Joe
Nellis throw cold water over
the most pessimistic of the

. the additional influence of “the

inheritance economy” as wfl

move to a second and third:

generation of mass home own-',

ership and as morepeople took

to parents and grandparents
for cash support -=. '

•.

Fleming and. Nellis look
beyond the price-to-lncome
ratio to the figures forraort-

gage-advance-to-incomes and
mortgage-advanee-toprices

;

Both these alternative market

Despite all those scare stories,

John Brennan suggests that
there hasn’t actually been any
collapse in the housing market

winter's housing forecasts, crit-

icising the obsession with the
house-prices-to-incomes ratio.

They say: “There are good rea-

sons for arguing that this his-
toric norm may no longer be
applicable in today's econ-
omy.”

Multiple incomes distort the
figures. So also do people’s
increasing willingness to
accept a higher level of debt
secured on property. There Is

measurements are at histori-
cally high levels and the econo-
mists say. “The percentage
advance figures . . , are not
out of line with the pattern for
the past five or six years.”
This, they argue,' suggests that
the affordability of home own-
ership has hot been damaged
unduly - a very different pio-
ture to that resting solely on
price-income ratios.”

In any event, home loans

cpmpetitioai and no shortage'c£

mortgage funds has made it

passible to create, a broad
range of low-cost loan options

_• to shelter first-time buyers
from ; the full effect .of higher .

' interest rates. . Longer term,
. there are sufficiently dear
^demographic, pressures For
J extra accommodation to
-assume-

Souseholds in ^Britain
haw and 2001 , and the

I ulk d thoee eatfra homes will
le ixLtb^ sduaKTuhalf of the .

1

< 3untnr.FIemfiigL andNellis
< include1 fhra residential price

i t ses nationally in 1989 “could .

. lb as high as in per cent” with
*

» geographic imbalance In the
s uth. A . similar picture is -

-p toted by-toe newly-improved:
N itionwide Anglia Building
S< dety price index; which bow
ta tes account of a far broader
ss nple of price evidence culled
frun afi. the societies’ figures.

' revor Hunswick, JNation-
wi Le Anglia's general man -

ag r, says average UK house
prftes were up:4 percent in the -

first quarter of 1909. with virtu-

ally all the growth outside the

south-east He adds: TThe rate

of increase is stowing, hut we

still think that predictions of a

house price slump this year are

far too pessimistic.

rthe most likely outcome for

1989 Is that house price rises

nationally will ease to around

;10 to 12 per cent, With 6 to 8
. pet oent in the southland possi-
L

bly as much as^jper beat m
the north aridT-bi Wales."

^he --"Halifax 'house price

.iffifex lakes'* more conserva-

tive view, of the market in the

medium term, focusing on the

sharp reduction in housing
.maritet activity since 1968. The
Halifax’s first-quarter 1 figures

suggest that mortgage requests

are sharply down and that
“tins lower level of transac-
tipns-wfll be translated into

less buoyant house' prices, par-

ticularly in the north of
England, as the year prog-
resses.” . -.1

Overall, the Halifax expects

that- house price inflation
nationally will be running at

around 5 per cent by the end of
1989, and that we can expect
“broadly stable house prices In
:1001V" -' -S -

south
pU.kii

ifesteSloin
macm. The
£share id a
te?S£arjthe

dfintteason that two mort^e|'<

bomwing capacities are

flats (i

an lilt

with ts

The.

r than -one. there- is a
"

space^ reason in favour,
blng together to buy a
ome. Stem Studios,, a-
st in studio and one-bed
eL 01-244-7301) provides -

stration of the choice z

o £53,000 options. -

?o-it-alone version is a

economies. of scale .are such
tbal; * taniAer oTagencies are
now

.
providing . an Informal

Isartnea- finVhng sendee, brtog-
-';

frtg together solo buyers to
make up a ntopaty pair. What
toe divorce rate prats asunder
^n: terms at household sizes,
market forces continue to
counteract

s moving experience
ACCOR

each ya
because
tnove bd
existing

A ONE-bedder wfth thatched roof and a view In Mlnstoact
In Hampshire’s New Forest, comes up lor auctionon Hey
10 at Lymlngton. GA Town S Country (teL 0590-75025) exjtoctB

dm 300-year-oM cottage — which received planoinfljiemilsalow
lor expimsIon tn ISSS, and stamte ln a tolrd of tei acre of

'

garden facing open Balds' —to son for C10B,00dtb'£f1IM)Mu

1. 'Now, aj

100 twoW
and ask J

movers.'

T

office yotl
tetepbohe
themove.

)ING to British , the number of ; its existing
around 2m people ., phone line if it has one. That

r are left phone-less one call serves to Jhave the
hey wait until toey metier read oh yemr existing
ire calling toadopt an: / liite. and your aceaunt teans-
line or to get. one ^fecred to - toe nfiW.ntonber on
it their new ptape 'itoe day pftoe move. * “ :

( you need do.fedial .
’ ;Ltoe- teko-averTlcharges are

Wts b^are yoh 'moVe^^6 plus VAT- Having a :com-
v Freephone Hqme- r

/ jdetely oew lfr^toStaltefcosts
rfcn, teD-the BT sales ; A nKDdnwhtt oTOfiS pibs YAT
imeseut address raid, rr*' although the longer 1the
t limber, the d4te erf --^notice yosi 'iren'^fe loqvthat,
; tienewaddres^.pnd/ .--.toe better.. '

i newaddres^.pnd/ .-toe better..'

.:

a-' -

. . ...

KING JAMES’ GATE.

.

THE NEW WATERFRONT VILLAGE
IN OLD PORTSMOUTH.

»(HhMtt&tLOYELL, OXON
ItdbidSnuks^OdocitlSailka. Loi>doB,70 nriksa

Surrounded by histone mesnuments, the CalhedtaJ, otd fertiTtcattonsand period

houses. King James' Gate is Portsmouth's new village. Opposite the coastal

fortifications of Ok! Portsmouth it featwes a harbour with yachts and snail craft

enteringand leaning itsshelterfromtheSolent.

4A DCUOHTFULCOUNTRY HOUSE SET INOVER 3 •ACRES OP GARDENS AND]
•PADDOCKS, WITH SPECTACULAR VIEWS.]
STABLING, OUTBUILDINGS, AND
INDEPENDENT STAFF PLAT.
Thebw it pantafly driided onrf «nj nil two
tonifies but cosBy berom ooa apKloas borne. 7
tediums. 6 rodycwB rooms, 4 h-u.wreiT^.
ami testing, ptaa mas] offlem 7 Loass Bases,

3 tes. sncHbxy MOn*. Urtpn for S an
ud Uutdicsped grounds. TouBy private to

Cbtonr teaetane Aon Sola Agents

PRICE: £750^00

HCck

The village has been designed to reflect the surrounding architecture and has a
variety of houses and flats set around landscaped courtyards, providing both privacy

and security Only 6 apartments and 78 houses will be buik byWWianStndaflpk
and the highest standards ofaaftsmamhipwabe used in their constniction.

Kfog James' Gateoffas a new standard ofwaterfront Eving with luxury homes, in a
unique setting overiooldng the 5dent Come and see for youiseff.

_ LANAWtSHMC

SmoB form and coravu nuk sbsfls
(treated bereicta Edinboi^MMt

-

Glasgow (29 atOei) : Comprises udera
detsebed bungalow (bibbed to Uhct
sundsnt: RegiiKrnd etravsn pm wfah
todes/sbowcr block Ueesmd for 2Lms -

Pkroel of good arable teL i
'

"P to 100 tens ts required :*
Far sail as a whole or in loti.

Wntshlre.
10 nulesSalisbury
Attractive Hated viBase hone with
greai charm and character.
Driichtful (card)bdigbtfol garden of about V. acre
with chalk stream. 4 bedrooms, 2
bathrooms, 3 reception rooms and
superb kitchen. Double garage, oil
central beating. Offers around
£250.000.

THCta*bd& Cochrane.
So&chora. 36 Minr Ssraei, '
MotfacnKS. Td 069B 65233. '"

07227 6204

KING JAMES* GATE
OLD PORTSMOUTH

Cornerstone
TEL 0329 23231

2

SAvnxs
TEL 014998644

MID SUFFOLK
timbered BARN FOR

-

, CONVERSION
6 ACRES INC TROUT LAKE
FURTHER 75ACRES (OR.

FART)AVAILABLE •

CT3MWL Vfohjdair ter*, d ou.

CALLOWAY COAST, too aero faint Mitt
rno-MtHM potontHOl. 4 tedroomod (orm-
DOUM. Farm buldmgs, tnrttl shop, shoot-
ing. ilshlng. booting on 3 lochs CWXCCQ.
PnnicuJort from SmltJw Gore. 78 Coma
Stfsat. Dumfrlaa DCi lDG. Tel: 10387)

Ori-:w Pk.arck

StDMOUTH (East Devon Coast)

A superbly appeared Vietoriu RjesK

doner ia one of the loan's most
prmutotn roods.

Han. 3 fine Reception Rootm. KSuSxa)
SirskfoR Room. 7 BedretMM (bdudJof
Master Suite wnh Lgsnj Bathroom
sad DronoR Rocm), 2 further BiiH-

r04M*. Wine Cellar. Fall pt C.H.
Magnificent Terrace. Courtyard sad
Gardens. Double Garage. t>, sere.

Illustrated brochure from Joint Sole

Agnus - Dior Plaice. Euler |0)92)

3U48 sod U A. Property Semes. Sid-

aoath UWSSI 77077.

(0332)58548———
MCethedndCloKEinerEXl 1HA

EDINBURGH
Th# ATHENS of the

NORTH.
Detmcfwd villa at 20 Wlnion
Gardena, 5 miles from city cen-
tre and convenient for By-Pass
and airport. Magnificent out-
look to Pentfond Hills. Lounge/
dining area, lined kitchen, toi-

let, 3 bedrooms, study,
bathroom, garage, gardens,
gas CH. Viewing Thure/Fri 7-a
pm. Sunday 2-4 pm. Otters
Over £71.000 to:

Henley on Thames
MORTGAGES

Stuart and Stuart W.S.,

7 High St. Bonnyrigg.
Tel 021-663 713S or

031-446 toga

ir London 34 miles

V
ith P,annin9 Permission to renovate a

c^hufJl
*'®led fan

7
lhouse to produce a substantial country house.

Secluded situation m unspoilt yet very accessible countryside.;Ideal
tor equestrian use or Private Golf Course (subject to planning).

Approx 153 acres. ;.v- .

Price on'Application;.' y ; .-.V;
5
.:'

ffepfy to Box TB985, Financial Times, One Sotitowar* London SE^ SffL

1
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Gloucestershire
Shipton Moyne, Tbtbury 3 miles. Cirencester IS miles.

M4 motorway 8 miles.

An exceptional house in the heart of the
BeaufortHunt Country

4 reception roams. 6 bedrooms. 4 bathrooms. Nursery wing. Stuff rooms.
2 bedroomea cottage. Swimmingpool. Hard tennis court. Excellent stable yard with
21 looac boxes. All weather manege. Outbuildings. 7 paddocks. Gardens and grounds

About 32 acres
(Further land available)

Apply. Cirencester < 0288) 669771 or London csmgb/na/3»56i

Perthshire
Edinburgh 65 miles. Aberfeldy 5 miles.

A superb residential and sporting estate
Easily-run Victorian mansion house inth stall (lot.

Lowly cardan and mature policiri Let form. 3 vacant and 3 lot collacra.
Excellent sporting potential with Salmon Fishing on the RnerTay.
Established Pheasant Shoot. 8 hill loehn with enjoy ahlo trout fishing.

Moorland with grouse shooting and deer stalking.

About 1.070 acres
As a whole or in 5 lots

Apply. Edinburgh 031-205 7105

^TI'n'Trr
COMPTON MANOR ESTATE

A magnificent timber framed moated house with a
Grade 1 listed 15th century Great Hall

7 recaption rooms, 8 main bedrooms and 4 bathrooms. Onoat wing with 4 Amber bedroom* and 2 bathrooms.
2 bednxwncd aeli~contained annexe. Outbuilding*. Stabling. Homed swimming pool.

Magnlfimtit landacapod gandenm and lakee. 2poddo^-Walh^NfawiytnJ

About 23 acres
Apply: London orTunbridge Wella (0892) 615035

Surrey
Reigate 1 mile. M25 (J. 8)2 miles. Gatwick 12 miles. Heathrow 25 miles.

An imposing house with superb equestrian facilities
Reception hall. 3 reception rooms.*} bedrooms. 4 bathrooms <3 en-suitei. Self contained ulaiT flat. Suite of offices.

Oil fired central heating. Beautiilil ma ture gardens. Heated swimming pool and sauna.

Secondary bouse. 2 cottages. Lodge. Grooms Flat.29 subles, treatment bam and equine swimming pool.

Outbuildings. Ant and rail paddocks.

About 41 acres
As a whole or in 9 lots

Apply: Knight Frank & Rutley, Guildford l0483> 85171 and London 01-629 6171

in association with Christopher Stephenson International Ltd t0635i 526585 iah/2i~05>

I."

~ “Hw»Sfd^ure
^MiwtilBadhatTi. Rlahnp's Stortford frmitoa. Ware 6 miles.M25 15 mBeaHCcatnil London 28 milca.

;
An attractiveGradeH listed house set

.
- in beautiful matfrre gardens and grounds

Rsosprtw hall 3 rowtwn room*. bnUrnd room.Matter bedroomsmts. 7ttath^bedro^aadsfurtte^^omm.
ootbuddmg.

About 14^ acres
‘ Apply: London

j.LOneofEngland’s.Finest Sporting Estates
"The Home of the late SirThomas Sopwith” -

Stockbridge 3 miles. London 75 miles. Winchester 12 miles. Hornsey6 miles.

Georgian mansion house in an outstanding setting
with panoramic views over the Test Valley

d&rmhoema. Lodge sod 25 eouagea. Development potential Renowned double gun high pheasant shoot.
About 6.4 miles of the River Test and Camera Arable and sheep farm. Woodland.

About 2,175 acres
Sole Agents: Woolley & Wallis, Hornsey. 1079-1 1 512129. Fax: f0794i 523248

Knight Frank & Bulky, London- 01-629 817L Fax; 01-493 4114.

( Pi*#:?

WT - f

Warwickshire
Wootton Wawen. Birmingham 18 miles. Stratford-upon-Avon 4W miles.

An impressive Nursing and Residential Home set in
attractive parkland

3 reception rooms. 28 bedrooms, 8 bathrooms. 2 shower rooms, cellars, second door with potential for additional
accommodation. Providing floor area ofapproximately 15.000 sq. It. Garden, park, tennis court. Suitable fora

continuation ofthe existing use and offering potential far alternative uses.

About 23 acres
Apply: Stratford-upon-Avon i0789i 297735 or London uveuthm*

^Warwickshire
Wtelfontaa;A<ftR. Birmingham 28 mflow. StmtfbrtJ-apon-AvooS mites.

A country house and small estate in an
-

- elevated rural position.

About 32% acres
A» a whole or in 3 lota

Apply: Stratford-upoh-Ax’oo 1 0789) 2977SS dvswnwaxi

V *4.' IS!:
'

S'® UK* .

Gloucestershire

AfinefamOy house in* qmetpositionoB
Hwadmofa Cptawolds village -

to»tiag.Camga.gmd«.

uvgw/tMfln

. Worcestershire
. .

, Worcester 17 milca. MB 19 miles. Birmingham SSmilea.

Aniunmaculate Georgian house in a
beautiful rural situation

4 recaption room*. 6 bedroom. 3 bathroom. dressing room. Oil fired

central touting Coach house providing secondary accommodation at present used as
private office*. Ganges. garden outbuildings and greenhouse. MagmiKeat gardens

and woodland.

About &/z acres
Apply: Hereford 10432) 273087 or London tKCM*w23t3.

|f

'
• •***&--

Rutland
Edith Weston. Oakham S miles.A1 S miles.

A very attractive Georgian village house
ardsKwith views tow utland

3roceptkm room. 6 bedrooms, 3 bathroom*- Coach house with planning consent.

Outbuildings Mabintgardem and grounds with Oman lake.

About 3acres
. Joint Agents: William H. Brown. Oakham 10572) 757801.

Knight Frank & Rutley, London 01-629 8171 v
' " Stratford-upon-Avon <07891 297735 iNahhwj.

Perthshire
Dunkeld.

A superbly restored and modernised
house overlooking the River Tay
Formerly run os a small hotel suitable for residential use as well

3 reception rooms. 518 bedrooms all with en-suite bathrooms. £ further staffbedrooms
with 2 bathroom* and offices Newly modernised 2 bedroomed lodge.

Hard tennis court. Mature grounds and 2ls acre field.

About 6 acres
Apply: Edinburgh 031-225 7105 (CSS/KUsei

West Sussex
Petworih 1 mile. PuUwrough 4 miles.

A listed Grade II house designed by
Norman Shaw

4 reception rooms. 5 bedrooms. 4 bathrooms. 3 bed roomed flat Caraging for 3. Stables.
Mature garden*. Paddock*.

About 8V2 acres
Apply: London or Guild ford <0483 < 65171 i \brt:g utjii

Surrey
Weybridge 1 mile. London IS miles. Heathrow and Gatwick 30 minutes.

A superbly situated house with far
reaching southerly views within the

private 900 acre St George’s Hill Estate
Reception hail.4 reception room*. 4 bedroom suites, flmher bedroom and shower

room. Garaging. Heated swimming pool

About 2V& acres
Apply: Guildford 10483) 65171 lACMu&iai

Derbyshire/Leicestershire Border
Ashby da la Zouch 2 miles. Derby 10 miles. Birmingham 28 miles.

Ml tJ22» 11 miles.

An outstanding house set in an
elevated position

fi reception roams. 14 bedroom*, 5 bathrooms Garaging for 8. Outbuildings.
Gardens and grounds. 4 bed roomed cottage £ potential building plot*.

About 3 acres
Apply: London iABK.2t93t

20 Hanover Square, London W1R 0AH Telex: 265384 Telephone: 01-629 8171
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CLUTTONS
Somerset

New Park Farm

Stavordale
Near Wincanton

Productive Arable and Stock Farm
set in an area of outstanding natural beauty.

234 Acres
of Arable, Pasture, and Woodland.

Planning consent for dwelling.

Excellent 500 tonne Grain Store.

For Sale by Private Treaty

Ref: GPH
Marples Wharf Office, Bath, Tel: (0225) 447575

Wiltshire
Bath 7 miles, M4 6 miles.

Magnificent development of 5 superior dwellings

converted from a particularly fine and substantial

Grade II Listed Barn.

All Houses comprise:
2 reception rooms. 4 bedrooms. 3 bathrooms, (2 ensuite),

cloakroom, attic room/games room.
Double garage. Gardens.

Bath office, Tel: (0225) 469511

Edinburgh
New Town

Waveriey Station 1 mile, walking distance of city centre.

A delightful Georgian, Grade A listed townbonse,
centrally located.

Drawing room, dining room, 4 bedrooms,
3 bathrooms. Separate garage.

For Sale by Private Treaty.
Edinburgh office, Tel: (031) 225 8602

127 Mount Street, Mayfair, London W1Y 5HA. Telephone 01 499 4155
Head Office H5 Berkeley Square. London WIX SOB.

Aba Chelsea, CVxkbrub, Kenangron. Arundel. MsiUon. Bub, Carlisle; Edinburgh. Folkestone.
HunifiM, Hotms ids Heath. Leeds. Oxford,Wk Bahrain. Dubai. Oman. StuBfab.

PROPERTY

For sale: a Nazi’s old house in London
- •

“
' $

: ' ;•£ I,';

John Brennan looks at the background ofa mansion built and occupied by one of Hitler s top c

CORNISH MANORS
ST IVES/PENZANCE

Superior Holiday Hones
from only £33350

New 2/3 bedroom Holiday Homes in

grounds of Cornish Manor. Indoor
pool and lots of facilities. Full
management services. Self financing.

CAPITOL CAINS
TAX RELIEF

Brochure: KENEGIE MANOR. GULVAL.
PENZANCE. CORNWALL

(0736) 66671

T HE ARYAN-ROMAN-
TIC designers of
Hitler’s Third Reich
would have a fit if

they were around to see the
redecoration of the house now
called Sans Souci on South
View Road, Pinna: Hill, in Mid-
dlesex. The swastika-shaped
balustrades cast in Munich
have long since been remodel-
led along apolitical lines: and
murals by Peter StofE, whose
work enlivens royal bedrooms
at Buckingham Palace, now vie
with galactic wall paintings in

a skylighted extension into the
steel-beamed roof. Even the
ambassadorial-sized internal

air raid shelter has been
drafted into use as the new
boiler room within a ducted
heating system.
Joachim von Ribbentrop’s

wife had a Munich design team
flown in to remodel and extend
the German Embassy when
Hitler’s former translator was
appointed ambassador to
Britain in October 1936. Rib-

bentrop wanted the embassy to

be suitably ostentatious In

time for the opening of a Lon-
don social season ran riot

ahead of George VTs corona-

tion in the spring of 1937.

Never a man to be parstmon-
ous when it came to spending
state money, he bought a
three-quarter acre site by Pin-

ner Hill golf dub and super-
vised a fair number of German
builders - along with their
specially-imported metric-scale
bricks - in creating a modem
country mansion. Flamed as a
partying annex and weekend
escape from thp official ambas-
sadorial residence in St
James’s, central London, the

house on - Pinner HID, filled
with people as comfortable as
mgmhgrg of the Anglo-Geanan
Fellowship as they were secure
within the pages of Debretts.

Even after Ribbentrop’s
return .'to Germany as Foreign
Minister,.the house remained a
useful diplomatic refuge, even-

Rooms with a river view

tually housing Herman Goer-
lug's sister until her intern-

ment on the Isle of Man after

the outbreak of war. - -

Sited dose enough to RAF
Northolt to raise local newspa-
per tales of its use as. a Nazi
spy centre - and to inspire
crime writer Agatha Christie

to i$ave her dapper 'Belgian
detective, Herctue ,

Poirot,
involved in a car chase track-,

ing-a femme fataleGerman. spy

mission of Sierra Lehhc .hto

been among a succession* of

owners until its la§£ sale ra

1979, for ‘£300,000, tbtbe pres-

ent incumbent.
f

- v':

-V-
. Bfere;Storey. oHdft-'Mles -

Iwfaht Qiilllers, jreposfe the
1

owner’s amusement • at: the

twists of fate which haye

,

, over
ration of war on the' US- .to -the

US charge d'affaires, m Berlin.

«As an American-Jewish busi-

nessman, he’s sure Ribbentrop

would be. turaing in his grave •

now,” says Storey.
'

_ Quillers (teL 01-951*3626) and
the other joint agent, John D.

Wood (01-493-6071). settled on a

E1.3m asking price for the free-

hold- of the painstakingly
restored and updated five-bed-

room house (pictured). As Sto-

rey says: “Although the raar-

. ket in general is very slow,

once vou get to properties here

":Tnfho ,2500,000-plua range you
are dealing with another

:

type

of-buyer who isn’t really con-

cemed about interest rates if

ttie.’property is right"
& ruDy^iipd^nised exam-

to its wdl-guarded gater -~/pte?vQf a cost-no-objfect 1930s’

there was ‘more^-San lust -a .^-mansion on . one of the. best

hintiotf nfflrial iron^ when ’tiw - dttoph PimwE^SansjSoud
*' was* requisititmeda^ needed fts^hr^sh with

(officers* meM-ddring tlWo:- hiwoay to draw .uifetest from

war. Since tiien,-tiie high conr-r
*

- »
- .•

NOW YOU see It, now yon
don’t Norfolk House, the
Seiffert-designed marble and
polished granite-dad
residential block on the
Thames’ riverfront below St
Paul’s Cathedral in the City
of London, has disappeared
temporarily from the sales
market

In more exuberant times,
nine big river-fadug flats and
two penthouses in the City
wouldn’t have made it past
the brochure stage before the
offers were being weighed.
As it is, Juiien Standing of
John D. Wood (teL 01-408-0055]

explains that they have been
withdrawn for a few weeks
until the building works are
advanced further.

When, three years ago, the
LEP group started the
re-development of what was,
at the start of this century.
Lever Brothers’ Sunlight

Wharf, the Museum of
Loudon’s City archaeological
team recorded the site history.

Once it was a Roman wharf,
then a medieval landing stage
for visitors to both the earlier

cathedral and the old trading
capital.

For 300 years it was where
tile earls and dukes of Norfolk
had their London home and,
after the Great Fire of 1666,
a commercial wharf once
more. With this background*
the site could hardly avoid
being of historic Interest.

Last autumn, Norfolk House
was launched into a market
where cautionhad swamped
ininpinflHffl)- In common with
virtually all new developments
in central London today,

people are happy enough to
view near-completed buildings
- but they don’t reach for
their chequebooks until they
see the finished work. Hence

the delay while the work of
the interior design company.
Charles Hammond, emerges
more dearly from among the
builders* debris.
The scheme - on Norfolk

Lane off Upper Thames Street,

EC4 - is ejected to range
from £285,000 for one of three
one-bedroom flats to
£1,555,000 apiece for the
four-bed duplex penthouses
with roof terraces fitted out
as show fiats. -As well as their
riverviews, all the apartments
have that rare commodity; -

a (Sty car-parking space.
Estimates for service ’

.

charges range from £3J)00 to
£8,000a year and Standing
doesn’t doubt that, given its -

position right by St Paul’s
steps to the river,Norfofl5

House has tobea classic -

option for City-based
companies thatwaut.flats-wtfli
a view. -

COUNTRY PROPERTY

The Watergardens
A truly magnificent development of5upert>ty

appointed i and 4 bedroomed apartments, set

amidst the colourful splendour of nine acres of

historical Japanese M-Jlcr gardens within the

(

prestigious Coombc HUl Estate on

Kingston Hill. Tb fully appreciate the ^ HE WATERGARDEPiS
OCTAGON DEVELOPMENTS LIMITED WEIR HOUSE HURST ROAD EAST MOLESEV SURREY 01-941 4U1> <5HiraH2)

beautiful settingOKriooMag the golfcourse, far

reaching views aad an extravagant specification,

vtsit our fully furnishedshow apartment off

Whiten Roadany day between ham and 4pm. or

telephone 01-547 1681 for fartherdetails.

Prices from £445,000 leasehold.

Copaem Way offers an Inwesdng dioice of three newly designed fwa

bedroomed homes add an extotfag character six bedwom cottage.

All four properties are very MgWy specified and dueeb In didr own prime
landscaped grounds.

The development itself is IdeaSypbcwf beingwhMn easyreach ofthe town

centre and station (Waterloo 25 mins.).A beaurifaBy funisbed dnwhouse b
open fervjewing every thf between H.OOanvSJJOpm or telephone

0372 68465 far farther details.

PRICED FROM £A75.OO0-r3t5/JCO FREEHOLD
Copscm Wfaya dfGopsem Lane. Esher. jwt poseChrome** Fancourt School.

OCTAGONDEIELOPMENTS {JUTTED
HEWHOUSE HiKSTROAD EASTMOLESEY SURREYKT8 9.40 • TELEPHONE01 - 941 4131

Southfield Rood, Chiswick, W4

Classic Designs from a Bygone Era

AnMsnaWfl|ldc«elofttsiofNewBraMHoranbarteringOkcxcfrolar

BedfordMlmrodwtfUnatjfreadofOrtuberodCorel leodoa.

RmBedroom*ibwn Hook*aid Bedroom,Mrv*Homo aaisrupUsto

4cbfbriMrdnnilagGcaj*aSqdeCotaqrodderelopmcnc.

* supbout EQuin>ujdichh
* BEAUTIRiLBmiBOOMS
* MWHKMLGMCMMLHMnG .

* TOPQUAUTY design
* cuxKTOBKMiBfTSHorvntcmauTm
* EASTACCESSTOTURNHAM GREEN
OBIUCTUNETUBeSTATION

* HIGHTHERMALQUAUTYHOMES
* PICTURESQUE LANDSCAPING
* CAfUGBANDCAKSmCES

SWnnlagNcw»omr» jm1 »Soped>Iu»iJUPa«.
DcflaMrnappocaaaferam robe mdrod.

tffHOOU PROPERTY ~ ^

******
Show homes open

Suonfay

. Sunday

9941660******
2 bod mews booMS - fan iIMflOO

4 bed town house* - Aon ilKS.oOO

fv Either lahnnaooa ootet Id* agaitK-

QUINTONSCOTT

bornard
marcus
tffiW HOMES
01-743 1444

DISTINCT! V E APART M E NTS

•; 4i • 42 • 43 1

O'
o ^ I

V/
d;\

s ,v

|

An outstanding and imaginative conversion of three elegant stucco

fronted Houses to form eleven Hats and two Maisonettes.

2 Studios from £125,000 A One Bedroom Flat at £165,000

Two Bedroom Flats from £225,000

Three Bedroom Flats& Maisonettes from £340.000

AB the flats enjoy the benefit <rf landscaped communal gardensand a
resident caretaker. Other amenities indude:

Terraces& Balconies • Working Period Fireplaces • Passenger Lift

Tully Fitted Kitchens - 59 Year Leases - Luxury Bathrooms

Show Hat Qpen: HOO - 7.00 Weekdays 12.00-5.00 Weekends

SOL GEN

SHOW FLAT
OPEN TODAY

CLUTTONS
-117-119 Fulham Road, London SW3 6RL

Tel: 01-589 1122
Fax: €1-589 8132

AN INNOVATIVE RESTORATION OF THE HIGHEST QUAUTY

GOING FOR A SONG
BERKELEY SQUARE

2000+ Sq.Ft. (4 beds/3 receps) of pure glamour, view south over entire
sq. Use as home, letting proposition (£2000 p.w. regualarly achieved) or
business ^entertainment suite (separate entrahce/recep) ideal for high
profile “Social” businesses. Contains gym/steam/jacuzzi. (entire
contents also available).

24 yr lease (renegotiable)
£17,000 p.a. rent, (reviewable) offers in excess of £295,000

01-629 6200

10012WE S T
E A T O N PL A € E

. ,

‘ L‘ O .H.J* O. N S ' W I

There are.terraceaor
central heatingand

75 YearLeases
Prices from £525,000 to £595,000
-

:
indudtog carpelsand curtains

W.A.ELUS
EkMWlM IbMH
•HIIW

; little VEisFioi^vd
hbpnficem detached period
roridencaoffering beautifully -

• appoiruedand * ..

-
, ^cguidypn^octioiMdv V
fenufyaccomniodaiHM.

Duuble nxcpriun, diningitiuni,

_ .
snidy, VS bedroom*.

’bathrooms, bedroom 5/family
lDbm, Mtchcti/bieukfesri^Mi,-

delightful gai\lena,

Cfase to American sch*irarid
' local atneniries.

£725,000FREEHOLD
. _ JSAt Aston Chase

OW7244724

i

QZECH^SPEAKg
M A KERS OF FINE B AT H ROO M S

I a c 7.cc h ijr Sp crake Bathroom,
d s ai fiUiu a v. d i r. d t s c: r i i n i n a ( i n ^

e star e a n r. < p arti r u : a r s , i s t h n

only oathroom brand to give
a d d c d value i < > v o ur home



ImnaroUic manorboose and beaatifnl garden in tbe midst of parkLiml and
paddock*.

Hall, drawingroom, slnlng room. dining room, morning room. domestic office.,

delIan. 8 bedrooms and 4 bathrooms. Staff fiat, billiard room, garaging,
superb beared swimming pool, hard tennis court. Beautiful gardens, farm office

(potential cottage), farm buildings. 41 loose boxes and pasture land.

SaviUs. London, Tel: 01-499 8644. Contact: Henry Pitman.
Savilb, Both. Tbl: (0225)444622. Contacts Harry Drones.

An htatorie Grade D Listed house dating from the 14th Century.

4 reception rooms. 5 bedrooms and dressing rcxxn/twdroorn 6, 2 bathrooms,

cloakroom, Mtchenlbreaktasi room. OH bred central heating. Historic chapel.

Garaging lor 2 vehicles. Outbuildings. Garden and {pounds.

L0< 2: Setf-ctxitamed VWonan cottage with 3 bedrooms.

For Sale Freehold with about ZVt acres.

Details; London Office, Td: 01-629 8700 oi/T2»83s/mprh

WBlSWre Woo<a>oroiighPBwsey3m«es(Padiflngloni hour),M4J14
(Hungerlonl) ZO miles, Jt5 (Swindon) ZO miles. M3 JS (Andover) 33 miles

A historic manor boose, fbrmedy the home at the family of& Walter Raleigh.

5 reception roorro IncludingThe Great Parlour. 5 bedrooms, 2 bathroom, shower
room. Oil central hearing. Double garage. Gardens.

Joint Agents: Messrs. Woolley&Wto. Salisbury. Tel:. (0722) 21711..

'

Sovrlb, Salisbury. T»H.- (0722) 20422. Contact: Christopher Lacy.

ISLE OF WIGHT-Godshill

Gocbhill 1 mile, Newport 5 miles.

Highly profitable early cropping arable farm.

Attractive5bedroom farmhouse.

Fmilc land with irrigation.

Excellent modem buildings including potato and grain

Traditional store buildings with pocenriaL

13. 10ha potatoquom.

For sale by private treaty as a whole or to 7 lots.
'

Savilb, Salisbury, Teh (0722) 20422.

Contact; Nigel foster

OXFORDSHIRE — North Aston
Banbury 9 miles. Oxford 12 miles.

A unique opportunity to acquire a substantial country mansion in die
Queen Anne style, constructed to the purchaser's requirements.

Situated in aZ^acte walled garden of a former I7d» century manor offering

total privacy in an unspoilt Cotswold village.

6 receptions, family room, kitchen/breakfasc room. Uriltry, cloakroom.

Master suite: bedroom, bathroom, sitting room, sun terrace. 5 furtherbedrooms,

4 bathrooms. Staff flat- Triple gara©^ Scabies. Outbuildings, tennis court,

landscaped gardens,

fiacre paddock.

Offers around 1750,000.

SaviUs. Banbury. TeL- (0295) 3535.

A fine WBtehlra Manor Houws of the 18th Century with paddock and
‘

exceptional waSed garden.

4 reception rooms. 6 bedrooms, 2/3 bathrooms, cloakrooms, kitchen. Attic

rooms. Possible development potential within park grounds. Oil central

heating. Gaiagtog. Outbuildings. Stabling. Hard tennis court. Garden,

grounds and paddock. In afl about 3.5 acres.

Detafis: Pewaey Office, Tel: (0672)63205 tsreswjjw

Wiltshire/Dorset Border Shaftesbury 3 miles,

A303/M3 3 mites, Tisbury 6 miles (Waterloo undo- 2 hours).

."’i • •
' x

'

xvcs^-rttth 7^rr,< 7 - v
Bybroll0^rtlc*.M4 (Junction s

.
' f-

ItahSpalLonion Rfrldingron 75 frimatei.'
'

.A rob*wftririCt»frnB«cd periodl^ouse,with snmmosviewsoverthedryof
Bath rod the countryside beyond.

tialL drawing room,cwwmmtnry diningroom, library study 8 bedrooms.

Jbdlhiuoros, cellars. Additional J bedroom Coach House.

(Wilding plot with planning (vrmution.

dQwboflditito.swmimmg pod. Large gardens and woodlands.

About 316 acres.

Price pikfcoo application.

RrefilK awh.1H: (0225) 444622.

CumaenCharlcb Barkahirc.

CAMBRIDGESHIRE . About 357 ACRES
Kimbolton
Huntingdon 10 miles, Bedford 14 miles.

Compactnridndal farm.

ImposingS bedroom 17tb century fannhoase.

Extensive range offan buildings wirh grain storage for 1 ,403formes.

For sale by Private Treatyor in 3 lots.

Lot 1 : Womdireh Farmhouse, farm buildings, 26 acres amble Lind.

Lot 2s 172 acres arable land.

Lor 3: 159 acres arable land.

SaviUs, Cambridge. TeL (0223) 944371.

Goober: John Feat

rii ;:'3?iag
!BeSia

SOUTHNORFOLK
NearNorwich
Norwich 12 miles, Attleborough 2 mdes.

Most attractive follymodernisedfisted Grade 11 farmhouse with excellent range
offormer farm buildings.

Diningroom, sitting room, drawing room, conservatory garden room,
utility room, 4 bedrooms each with en-suite bathroom. Ames.

Large range ofoutbuildings. Garaging.

Gardens, potty paddock.

Asa whole lVi acres.

Region of£310(000.

SaviUs. Norwich. Tel: (0603)612211. Contact; Jeremy Carlson.

AmoBt striking housewithcommandng views. Situated in fine country.

3 recaption rooms, 5 bedrooms, 2 bathrooms, cloakroom, kitchan/breakfast

room, staff accommodation. OU central hasting, Annexa with silting roam,

kitchen, 2 bedrooms, bathroom. Garaging, outtxddings, stabfing, paddocks

and grounds. Indoor swimming pod.

For Sate Freehold with about 9 acres.

Detdb: Shaftesbury Office, Tab (0747) 53492 11/S23SUNS

Urcor C%ce: HuTbe-.s: C^anerec Surveyors

A4 OAA C7AA •- 25 G'Csveror Siree?. wCrdcf- sV.X9F£
UrD^yDfUU To ex 27444

RURAL DORSET
Bridport - 3 miles West Coast - 5 miles

A superb 17th Century Manor House In excellent

rural location with lovely views.

In need of restoration but with many character features: Halt. 3 tteoeptlon.

Kitchen, Utility 5/6 Bedrooms; 2 Bathrooms: Outbuildings; individual Double
Garage; Old Bakehouse; 2 Slone Bams

and Modem Farmbuildings

About Itg acres In all

For Sale by Auction May I8ih 1939

Full particulars tram: R B Taylor S Sons
22 Princes Street. YEOVIL, Somerset

Tel: 0935 23474

01-499 8644 20-GrosvenorHill, LondonW1X0HQ
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© BLACK HORSE AGENCIES BIDWELLS ; 0223 84 1 84

2

RESIDENTIAL
ESSEX/SUFFOLK BORDERS

fa tie Stow Vde* few oiks ws cfSudtwy (Marl* To- Liverpool Siren. 50 1

THISB 0UR5! atKmg George Square

* PrivateEstate avertaokteg Bithraond Parle

* Senriti|/ System uritfi uniformed Cate Keeper

* Gtectnaiiiaflv

* SateHteTelevisiaii (5channels)

* Situated at Parti IfiflLaff Queens Road

* 4BedroomToum Houses.....{from £325,000)

* 3 Bedroom IltafeOTWtteS-....(from£240,000}

*1 Bedroom Hats.-— ffrmn 1125.000)

mammtmmsf w»umheiw jumwefliswo-irns

Town 8£Country

Bifa 11 miles

NORTH WILTSHIRE

M4 (J18) 6 tmks Chippenham 9 miles

' FAR FROM THE MADDING CROWD
Occupying am outstanding rural position overlooking a totally

unspoilt river valley, a magnificent Cotswold Stone Barn with

planning permission for conversion to a single dwelling.

FOR SALE BY AUCTION
Apply Chippenham Office. TeL* (0249) 655101

AN OUTSTANDING GRADE LISTED
MOATED 16th CENTURY HOUSE

Reception hail, four reception rooms, cloakroom, fined kitchen and breakfast

room, seven bedrooms and nursery sitting room, two bathrooms (one en-suiie).

Writ stocked garden with gras tennis court and paddock—about 9V: acres.

Offers in the region of £350,000

Snuu-criKs. Triimpiii!>ir)ii 41i^l) S(rvcu Carrtforirlm' CIS2 2SI ;

Irli-Ii'lmnc:-t-ambridsc':(P22.1)-X4I34I

NORFOLK

^ Lane Fox
Hertfordshire - HARPENDEN

Throe brand new luxuriously appointed bungalows in a splendid
semi-rural location. situated ra an executive area on the south east

side of the town.
Each on has; _
3 Bedrooms; 2 Bathrooms: 2 Reception Rooms: Fully Fitted Kitchen
and Utility Room; Large Double Gcrase. Plot size about V* acre.

PRICES FROM QJOJOD

Harpcnden Office; 0Sb2 7643J3

Head Office: 15 Half Moon Sr. LondonWf

A SMALL COUNTRY ESTATE FOR SALE
AS A WHOLE OR IN 5 LOTS

A FINE DETAChUShPE&IODGRADE U
- FARMHOUSE whh 3 RECEPS A. 8 BEDS LARGE

PERIOD BARN/OAST with PLANNING FOR CONVERSION
and FULLY CONVERTEDANNEXE

DETACHED BUNGALOW TO MODERNISE
CARDEN AND PADDOCKS EXTENDING TO

ABOUT
FOR SALE BY AUCTION ON 23rd JUNE 1989

(unless sold previously}

Sole Attttla
FOX AND MANWARINC.

. ! I HIGH.STREET. EDENBRIDGE. KENT .

Td (0732) 862184

Tbameside Village - offers in the region of £550,000
Superb 1 7th Century Country Residence, set in 2 acres and situated

m one of England's most beautiful Thames Valley villages, on the

outskirts of Goring. In immaculate decorative order, accommodation
comprises: 4/5 bedrooms, 3/4 reception rooms, large kitchen, family

bathroom, enstnte shower room, utility, cloakroom, outbuildings.

Contact: Simmons & Lawrence (0491) 578555

Reepbam I'A miles, Norwich 14 miles
London 120 miles

A FINE RESIDENTIAL AGRICULTURALAND
SPORTING ESTATE

Listed late Georgian Residence in Marure Parkland.
IO Cottages. Arable Beef and Dairy Enterprises.

2 Lordships ofthe Manor. First Class Shoot.

ABOUT 981 ACRES.
FREEHOLD FOR SALE (As a whole or in nine lots)

Joint Auctioneers: THOS. WM. GAZE & SON,
10 Market Hill, Diss, Norfolk. TeL 0379 651931

KENT/EAST SUSSEX BORDERS
Hawkburst 5 miles, Etcbingbam Station 7 miles

(Charing Cross/Cannon Street 65 mins).
Rye 12 miles.

AN IMPRESSIVE COUNTRY HOUSE, IN AN
EXCEPTIONAL POSITION WITH UNSPOILT VIEWS

OVER THE ROTHER VALLEY.
Hall and -i Reception Rooms;

Kitchen/Breakfast Room; Domestic Offices;

6/7 Bedrooms-, Dressing Room-, 2 Bathrooms.

3 Bed Cottage. Stable Block with Garaging/Stabiing
and Loft over Garage with Flat over.

Stabling and Farm Buildings. Gardens with
Swimming Pool and Tennis Court.

ABOUT 35 ACRES.
FREEHOLD FOR SALE

30 BERKELEY SQUARE, LONDON WIX 5HA

01-493 0676
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PARKERS
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LONDON W1X SDL

01-629 7282
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BERKSHIRE. Newbury 3 miles, London 65 miles.

A lata Georgian house In a oupaib setting wftti

Ashing on River Lantboumo. 5 reception rooms.
Master suite with dressing room and Jacuzzi , 6
further bedrooms, 3 bathrooms. Staff flat Tennis
court. Gardens and grounds. About U^acroa.
Newbury office: ToL (0635) 521707. R*f. iuuuss

KENT- FaHtoU. Ashford 12 miles.

A fight spacious Victorian fermhoom with views
over Ronmney Marsh. 4 reception rooms,
5 bedrooms, 2 bathrooms. oD CH, outbuildings,

garage, gardens and paddock.
About 1 f acres. Region £276,000.
Canterbury office: TeL (0227) 451123. nor.acosus

-i,'
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NOrrmeHAMSHIRE-Nofth OBoil Newark12 mfs
A Victorian cotaitiy house ccwverted to a modem
mining home. Accommodation for24 parents.
Planning permission for 10 bedrooms. Gardens.
About2 acres. Region £676,000. Joint agents:
H.H. Morris. Tel. (0673) 62655 & StruttA Parker
Grantham office: Tel. (0476) 65886. RBf.4AS404s

NORFOLK. Ayfsham 7 miles, Norwich 15 miles.
A floe trade I gated ESzabethao manor house
recently futy refurbished In fine parkland setting.
3/4 reception rooms, 9 bathrooms, 5 bathrooms
(3 en-sutte). 2 cottages. Domestic outbuildings &
garages. Party waded garden. About 20 acres.
Norwich office: TeL (0603) 617431. RatseKMT*
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KENT- Tunstafl. Canterbury 18 miles.
A Magnificent Jacobean house fully restored.
3 reception rooms. 1 master bedroom with
dressing room, 4 farther bedrooms, 2 bathrooms,
3 secondary bedrooms. Outbuildings end garden.
About facie. Region £376,000.
Canterbury office: Tel. (0227) 451123. RoUCC3i27

WILTSHIRE-West Lwlngtoo. Salisbury 19 miles.
An attractive country house with spacious and
adaptable fatty ecconanudatfcm. 3/4 reception
rooms, 2 bathrooms, 5 bedrooms, Catorgas CH,
double garage wth studio/office above.
Region £260,000.
SaOsbtay office: TeL (0722) 28741. rw.7«7e7

SELLYOURHOUSE
ThroughtheWeekendFTPropertyPages
lb advert Im; your property in the Saturday property pages, simply complete the couponbelowand return
it to: Francis Phillips, Classified Sales Manager, Financial Times, Number One Southwark Bridge,
London SEI OHL.

Allow five words per line (minimum 3 lines) Cost: 5-15 words £20.70) 20 words (£27.60) 25 words
(£34.50) ?0 words (£4 1.40) 35 words (£48.30) 40 words (£55-20) all rates include Vat. Advertisements
over -to words, rates are available on application, please attach copy separately. LincagCt £6.00 per line

Vu. Display: £27.50 per see + Vat.

Please insert the following copy in the Weekend FT:

on Saturday ___ 1989

I wish to pay by cheque, value £

.

. made payable tor Financial Times Limited.

I authorise you to debit frommy Ylsa/AmexMccessaccount
(delete as applicable) the sumof£
Stgnaninr

Cardexpiry dare

Mycard number is

me

Address;'

1 Western Sutherland A Truly Spectacular. yESTORA

Of Possibly wimbleopets f

Listed Building %

2i,i 16 sob Highlana estate ofastonishing beauty;and variety.

Includes sea, river and loch fishing, deer stalking, rough shooting and unspoilt

coastline with outstanding boating opportunities plus thefamous Old Man of Steer.
LOT 1 Torbreck Estate 7,131 Acres
LOT 2 Dnimbeg Estate 5,408 Acres
LOT 3 Stoer Estate ' 8,577 Acres
A paradise for those who love wilderness and abundant wildlife.

Fbr sale privately -

John Clegg & Co.
2 RUTLAND SQUARE. EDINBURGH EH1 2AS

TELEPHONE: 031 229 8737

29 nCAp'-TAjuna. MtoMur i*w'rtwM».V ,iS<*iasS*

hultihlwql Ut ow»B*oiieeM*rt»FW.. kaluhJL

Hwn.qmv is HiRurnnnu thi cirrM . yy
wiw*v*oo«. London’*

THU( -CA*TIVAYINC
.

-
. JjBBj. _-S*5

«P**rHtNr< CNMANCSO gS r*°

soqoccps woe#

WITH MTS STAITC or TNK
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PORCHESTER GATE
KENSINGTON GARDENS * W2

A luxury derdopmat of27 flats,

on the north side ofKcasingBou
Gardens. Ideally srtnated to
provide easy access to all the
amemdes ofthe West End.

m :

'

PRLDBsmAL HAMPTONS
HSOENTUL SeVELOPMENTS

40 ConaaflM Stntt, Hyde Rule.
London W3 2AB. Fur 01-724 4432

01-262 5060

6 Adingtoa Scmt. Sc. Jnac*\.
London SW1A 1RB. Fee Ot-491 3541.

01-493 8222

2 and 3 bedroom apartments are
currently available.

Video entry phones.
Independent gas central heating
and hot water.

Balconies.

Resident portec. •

Fully fitted kitchens and
bathrooms

999 year lease -.

Peppercorn ground rent

Car parking spaces available at

£12,000each.

PRICES FROM £340,000

y o •v ii. i u_ q •
i

ii ! \ | ( i\ <(/(

)

i j

K( WHi.'iU.H

COPARTNERSHIP

Brand new in Bayswater . .

.

WgCiiir

• ^

5/i 7 MO S L.'OW ROAD LON DO N W 2

.

28 Spacious 1, 2 & 3 Bedroom Apartments

FOR SALE
Prices from £165,000 to £395,000

\

- •>A .•

-

l-lffaMt
' y.iA

*yjyW..*/ m .. c* l/J1 v

Available for Immediate Occupation
si

IIS Kensington Cl'-Lin'ri Street

Lor.i in ll'S 43H
'!',!rrho rw. 01-22 / 2000

Sole Agents

ALEX VEIL
10.5.1 BL'P-

I. li'2 41 ’ti:

Yi'/'v/i f.1

? ~'.>2 K'hf-,

1$*'
.

-if- r.: Av- - -
- >-> •' »•'

34/35 STANHOPE GARDENS
.
r %.V’ *• _

•
:

South Kensington

i

Eleven elegant apartments constructed to asuperb ..t ?j
standard behinda Grade II Listed £acade overioofcmg tfa£
mature trees and lawns of this delightfi^ garden square

'

One bedroom
Two bedroom apartn^fs :i&^^^| .£235^0^1
Three bedroom apartments from\ £390 000

’!• 5T

For sale on 94 yr leases
View dally 11am 6pxxi

Site Sales Office
01-370 1496

•A-ELLIS

A Development by •

Bingbam Land Company

'i .\'mri,«uiiVMxu&
, 3 tyBmmpkjnRcwL^

F': 01-581'

a!l4C>

IN

If. IT
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LUXURY APARTMENTS FACING MONACO, ON THE CAP MARTIN #1%
a Sumptuous estate with swimming pools in the heart of a thousand years old olive grove;

2 to 7 room apartments with double aspect, lame balconies or private gardens. WrrWrSwM

'

11 ru,' if < (!:!/

JOHN TAYLOR & SON .io no!j;.i v.iu; 2'i.s mculins
M ;> \ : !

t A (? !
• v! o N c 0 • Tel.: 93 50 30 70 - Fax: 93 25 86 72 . 'IfNJ '5 G-1i

Majorca
THE BEST

STERLING £1.5 MILLION (OFFERS)
SUPERB QUALITY ARCHITECT DESIGNED & SUPERVISED 'NEW

HOUSE’ WITH EVERY DESIRABLE FEATURE

For Colour Brochure & Video

01-243 0964
F.W. QAPP ESTATES, S HH-LOATg STREET, LONDON W8 7SP - OR YOUR LOCAL REPRESENTATIVE

From Calais to the Somme is one
at the finest temperate coastlines
in Europe. A home here can be a
delightful experience tor work.

holidays or retirement.
Satisfaction first Investment

«

close second Have a look tnis

year. We can give you a
complete service - show you the

opportunities from 125,000
upwants, help with formal Idea

and settling fn. We have a local
British adviser.

Write » Agences No.f.
70 BauJ. Dafoz,

62520 La Tuuquet. France,
Fax to 010 33 21 05 43 95

or phone DID 33 21 05 15 15
tor ItsL

La palomA
DC MANILVA

Between Sotogrande and Esteponaon theSpanish
Costa del" Sol, the Andaluciaja village of Tj
Fhtoma sits on a rugged. hiHsirfe- overtpoking

(he Mediterranean.

The villas, with their superb leisure facilities,

include a lifetime share in the Duquesa Golfand
Country Club for two.

La Fnioma. Invest in the fat&re erf
1

traditional

Spain.

COTE D'AZUR
Riviera Golf Club

The first phase ofspvtmems in this prestigious development cm an 18 hole

golfcoarse has just been released. In the h2b dose ro Canoes, the design

of the esdnave apartments, which overlook die golf course, will reflecr

trench cotoual style architecture, each with large terraces or balconies.

Additionally; owners will be «bJc to purchase membership to the Riviera

GolfClub and enjoy its facilities.

An excellent investment oppotmaji

1, 2 and 3 bedroom apartments available.

Frias from £604100.

PRLDBvniALlS/
I nrernari (mil Projx-rry

2 Allington Qose Wimbledon Village London SW19 5AP Tel: 01 947 7333

_ foradourbrachwe, coo tact: PMS Estate Agents,
48(a) King Street, Maidenhead, Berkshire SLfi 1EQ

or call (0628) 776000.

ANDORRA
SKI RESORT - TAX HAVEN

ApartmwilB t Studio*
JdyMc —glng in traditional Andorran djpta.

‘ _ THERMAL CENTRE Wtth dub
ofcartng avory possible facility & all year •— round sporting activiuaa-

•

frrapfcHf*«4fod1n Sptiin,CM (fof Axahnr

. Contact doveiopnraOKofOoa
HABITAT SA

TW: (0W2) 653702 Fax: <0892) 661713

Cote (PAzure
CAP MARTIN

Announcing a new sophisticated development in a quiet, unique location

perched above the sea on an
11 acre wooded site facing Monte Carlo (2K miles distant).

An early oppaituniiy to secure the best apartments now at:

RESIDENCE LE CAP MARTEN.
I to 4 Bedroom Apartments afl with cn-suite Esdlitks, and a Tew larger

penthouses. Large Terraces or Private Gardens,
two aspects. High specifications. 2 Swimming Pools.

Mats Agent: qdhl
AGENCE GENERALE BOVIS Mjgbf
UK Office. 3 Pros Lane *C
Norwich NR3 2JY J&'rSJ
Tct 0603-488318 Fax 0603*667012

North MaHorca, Pnfknca
WcQ kept viDs in nuiuinc iqrir for

sale, aose to golfcourseA yacht
' harbour. 3 Ale bedrooms.2 i°iK

Mb open plan Bviag,dbifaf Jb
- fciiDtaisMS.-IWsqjnctraa. dbfa —
ffMge. 330 h|jn- private garden with .

a lovely view.

For fonhw information cad
01041 21 7M279I or 52

NASSAU (CABLE
BEACH)/
BAHAMAS

JteacbDonr.condo, .spectamlar

views, very private, only 14
units 2bd/2bth. Starting

$290,000. For info call

305-W8-219I (24 hrs). USA.

For homes
you won't see
anywhere else!

Get atopy of

RhdeRtialFnqperfy.Mail

your local office!
p' r

;

' A ..

^PRLDBvniAL^/
h ' Praporty services 1

.
•

•;

AT THE GATE OF MONACO
betatve eomptoxfflh photo
whiffling pooL Gorgsourview

on Monacoand ho mm.

FromS 33.000'
YovappaimenlluAy
tanfthedvfttibdcony.

OtfrigMpurchase with a choisaaf

JmettciertimesJmertschemes.

Dotaflt on tit 8Mmo qpb tan : CaHmfcw Mamrt 79a. Union Shoot
Mnfctocfc CGnoSO TJF -70L 0993 812171.

This ad had been published on March 1 1. 1089. Unfortunately, there was a
mistake regarding the address » that your inquiry could not bare ben
answered. Therefore, kindly apply to cipher 44-65~257. Pubhciias, P.O. Box
CH-K02L Zurich.

Do you adore the son. silence, benny?

FINCA IN MALLORCA
A superb location, a beautiful residence, country style,

on the south east coast of Mallorca. An outstanding

site with a panoramic view. High standard
development with about 280 m= floor space and jusL as
much terrace. Whole area about 2600 m :

, completely

furnished for 6-8 persons.
Price: 48 Mio pesetas

SWITZERLAND
Safe to foreigners airtftortzocf

Lake Geneva & Mountain resorts
\bu can own an ARWITMENT or CHALET In: MONTREUX, CRAN8-
MONTANA, VERBtER. V1LLAR8. OtUMBnZ, CHATEAU-DTEX,
region of GS1AAD, LES CHABLERETS, LEYSIN, JURA, etc.

From Sfr. 150*000.— Mortgages 60% at 6 % interest, 5-20 years

nl_IAA e . 52, rue de Montbrfllant -CH-1202 GENEVA
HCVAV OJL -feL 41^2/341540 -Fax 34 1220-Tx 22030

SOUTHERN SPAIN

Between Sotogrande and Duq-
uesa, overlooking the Mediter-

ranean, are AndaJucian-style

villas and apartments with

sports jacilitiips which include a
championship golf course.

For colour brochure contact:

PMS Estate Agents,

48(a) King Street, Maidenhead,

Berkshire SL6 IEQ or call

(0628) 776000.

Stunning chalet in probably the
most idyllic setting Uetibel has
to offer. Beautifully decorated,

5 double bedrooms, 3
bathrooms (2 en-suire). 3

shower rooms, targe open-plan
drawing room, spacious kitchen

and
dining area, sauna.

Three south facing terraces.

Details on application;

Sonia Ryan,
41-44 Great Qneen Street .

London WC2B 5AR

French ilongcaea ten 05% up u> W0% of

purchase price Charin Hamer Financial
Servo** : pi mo Bill

Oreeee ta» Palepanee - Golden sandy
besom, inagntfleent environment. 1. 2 & 3
bedroom houses £40.000 - C8S.OOO Robert
Cemin (07W) 22frll.

MONTREUX
Lake Geneva. Furnished
apts, with luxury hotel

fadlities. Ex'lent

mang’nt. Studios 3 bed
.£49-39800

DOMUS ABROAD &
FLORIDA CENTRE
0i 409 0571 (24 hrs)
01 431 4692 (off hrs)

ANDORRA
Buy direct from builders

Andorra-the true tax haven.

Full sales, management
andtental service. C.1.SA.
Andorran Propmict Lid 12 Kingi
CoOcge Road. Ruistip Middlesex.
HA4 8BH Tel [0895J 621617

meaCH PHUKHIIU eS areas Inc. Pas do
Calais ore aBUcUon. MorsA Uturrualontl
01-551 4S0T.

RMOtfrUMOOE SW3 (260 yards from Hsr-
rode). Luxury sonrtced ftiua. from £350 ro
£490 p.er. 28. Oidnsun Sq.. London SW3
1LR Tel: 01-554 273SL

GREECE ITALY
TURKEY FRANCE
Freehold property of
every type; villas,

apartments, land,
hotels, projects.

Whileway Properties,

12 High Si. Knaresborough.

N. Yorks

Tel (0423 1 #63392
or (01.1 4S5 8466

PERIGORD/
CHARENTE
Unspoilt rural France
renovated 2 bedroomed
cottage quiet hamlet.

Perfect holidays/
retirement £30,000. All

types property from
£4,000 cottage to

£140,000 17 C chateau

offered through
Angouleme associate.

Hirst 0732 362136

Switzerland. Jura.

Exclusive Three Bed. Purpose
built Chalets. With Lake
and Mountain Views.
From 450,000 SFr.

U.IC Sole Agonts.
PROJECTEL

Real EsMs and DovatapiMnl
1 St Omar Ridge- QulkHoni, Surrey

GUI 200 ENGLAND
TELEPHONE:(0403)571226/88848

FRENCH PROPERTY
SERVICES

Sea and mountain*. 41 new high
quality developments, lone eritb

rental management available. All
types or property in non regions or
France from £10,000 to £5.000.000+

TeL (0702) 469434.

Fax 10702) 469436

TENERIFE
£5000 OFF

GOLF DEL SUR
Bank Manager's luxurious f bed Rat
on edge of course. Super sea views.

Fully furnished

£5000 otT Cur quick safe.

£39.750

01 5383619

n
El Casar

de Paniagua n

in

Sotogrande

FINCA50L

Fincasol otfcn the newest development within

Sotogrande. The 3/4 bedroomed villas, designed

in old Spanish style with their own garages will

be buih in select chums around shared pools.

El Casar de Paniagua, undisturbed and tranquil

yet pul of ibe superb sports and leisure facilities

for whidi tins area of Southern Spain is famous.

PRICES FROM 24^*00,000 pts
(approx £122^00)

For more information. pbo« oar bead office 'm

Salisbury:

(0722) 411644
or our London office:

01 501 5554
Or writ* teFtorasol Ltd. 4 Bridge Street. Sobbury

WBtsMreSPI 2L3L Quotas reference FT489.

SELLYOURHOUSE

ThroughtheWeekend
FTPropertyPages

To advertise your property in the Saturday property pages,

simply complete the coupon below and return it to: Francis

Phillips. Classified Sales Manager, Financial Times, Number
One Southwark Bridge, London 5E1 9HL.

[

HOMEvS OVERSEAS
At theNEW CONNAUGHT ROOMS

ErtitWHm hilh-Orcn Qnegiv Btxecc.T^mdoa WC3
APRIL 28th-30th
Ti i n i »fm nn.i n,i« tt—rn*—r r^^~T~r

Over 40 itsnda oOerlng propetty la BjalM’intopa.
fXiBMjEaQ'iJtaUi.Tiiikey etc- *

HOMES ffcrtwo free iovtcatlana and a latest June of Borne*

UVfBSAS Oxxfcu mmqaahie vend £1 to DepU^i:
Home* OrmmJ87 City RoadLLonden KC1V ISA

MSSESBEm AJDMXSSZOIV kree

UNIQUE INVESTMENT OPPORTUNITY AT THE
GATEWAY TO MONACO

300 m. Irani the Monaco border, and 1J5 km. from the Sporting Club de

Monte-Carlo, Cettierlne Uamui Is building Ota VILLA MEDICIS af

8EAUSOLEIL. Whh uninterrupted vtewe across Monaco and the sea. these

one badrown apartments are lor aale only on a a or 11 year leaaeback

arrangement

8 designs of one Bedroom apartments priced between 443,000 and
050.000FF. These prices can be reduced by aa much as 30% depending

upon the leaseback arrangement cnoaan.

Full details of these and other developments along the Cots d'Azur at

Cannes, Antibes, Venice. Fro]us and Gavmfalre:

CATHERINE MAMET: 29a Union Sheet Woodstock.

Oxon 0X7 1JF. Telephone: 0993 812171

The Florida Real Estate Show
* An lotroduokm to Florida

* Florida - A Property Overview
• Visas - Immigration

* Luxury Bungalow? from £35,00
* Shared Ownership from £17,500
* Tune Share from £5250 per week

Property Link International, “Freepost** Penn, Bocks, HP 10 8BR
TEL 0494 816056 Fax 0494 S16SI

I

I authorise you to debitfrommy Vlna/Arngx/Acceaa account

(rh^t^scappHgahl^thewimnf S. — - -

Sipnamw

Cardexpiry dace

My card

number is

Address:

|
WeekendFT • PropertyPages • 01-873 3000

|
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GARDENING

First you scatter, then you pray ^
Robin Lane Fox explains his simple methodfor producingflowers on the cheap

il I'M AFRAID WE DON'T NORMALLY DO PALM CREASE
' CLOtHRlN&TON: ,r

.

,

TRANSPLANTS
,
MR

S
OME YEARS it works,
some years it flops, but
this last week in April

is my regular moment
for trying flowers on the cheap.

All you have to do Is buy a
seed packet, rake some earth
into a tilth and scatter the
seeds, praying for gentle rain.

Last weekend was perfect for

the job. so we will probably

now have a drought. If not, you
will own a brighter garden in
two months' time.

I had better explain about
tilth. It is earth forked over,

broken down and raked into a
fine finish without lumps so
that it invites you to plunge
your Angers into its surface.

Tilth requires a rake and, after

you have made it. you can use
the back of the rake's head to

press a shallow little V-shaped
“drill'' into the soiL It should
not be much deeper than a
quarter of an inch. You then
scatter the contents of your
seed packet into it.

Some years ago, a veteran
exhibitor at Chelsea advised
me always to sow seeds by
using nature’s distributor. He
was referring to the crease in

the palm of your hand when
you bend it, just above those
lines that are meant to make
you very rich and very amo-
rous. Perhaps my lines work at

cross-purposes, because the
seed never really comes out
evenly when I tap the side of

my hand opposite the point
which is meant to tell you how
many children you will (know-
ingly) father. I have abandoned
nature's distributor and merely
scatter the seed in little

pinches.
If it is very fine, mix some

sand or tilth into the seed
packet and shake the lot before

scattering. Use the rake.
Anally, to All in the V-shaped
drill by pressing the flat back
of its bead onto the earth to

settle it on the seeds.

Ideally, I like to water the
empty seed drills before lunch
through a watering can with a
fine rose, and leave sowing
until the two hours after tea-

time. The perfect moment to

sow is when it has rained
lightly in the night, looks set

fair for a few hours, and is

about to rain gently in the
evening. You see why garden-
ing is a matter of imperfection.

It is an undemanding task,
and there is not even the need
to transplant the seedlings
when they come np. In mid-
May, you will be trying to
move plants with long, thin
roots into bits of earth which
are no longer very filthy. After

a few hours' hot sun, the busy

person will probably lose most
of the transplants. It is much
better to sow thickly and
reckon to thin out a week or so
after the seedlings begin, to
show. That way. you do not
move the ones you keep.

I'm hoping to remember my
favourite types of seed for this

job even when I go senile.

Their initials spell the first half

of my name: LANES, which
ought to remain In the memory
bank. The seed racks in big
garden centres sell most of

them and, together, they
should not cost much more
than £3- They do not even
insist on a dry summer and
they grow almost anywhere.
The L stands for flax, admit-

tedly in Latin: Linum in its red
form (or the white one, too. if

yon find it). As it is impossible
to move this slender little seed-

ling around, it is suited ideally

to life in a seed drill: some-
times, I never even bother to

thin the seeds that germinate.

It grows about a foot high and
needs sun to open the satin-red

petals of its flowers.

Letter A is agrostemma. or
corn cockle, an old favourite

here although it is a menace in
Balkan coro-fleMs. If you water
it in its early life and thin it to

about 9 in. apart, it will grow
as tall as 3 ft. Its veined and
marked flowers of lilac or
rose-lilac are enchantingly

iplain. It likes sun and grows
with the greatest of ease.

Letter N varies between sun
and shade. In shade, it is the
blue-eyed nemophila, which
likes a slightly Hump Hfp and is
better thinned than trans-
planted. In sun, it stands for
the old forms of nasturtiums

which send out long
stems across the ground
do not have the word “jewel"
in their second name. They
look charming in toe gaps of a
dry wall where I saw them in a
peat mass of crimson and yel-

low about six years ago in
Somerset. The big seeds are
pushed easily into pockets of
soil in toe gaps between the
courses of stone. Alternatively,
toe plants can be left to fall

forwards, like creeper, over low
walls.

Letter E stands for my par-
ticular favourite: the indestruc-
tible echium which Is supposed
to be called Vipers Bugloss
although the name is now
obsolete. It will grow for every-
body, sprouting into a thick
line of rough-leaved seedlings.
It does not mind wet summers

and is always pushy, flowering

to toe tips of its stems. Cut
these back as they start to
twist and set seed and the

plants will- flower all over
again. Blue Bedder is self-ex-

planatory and excellent but
there is also a good mixture of

white, blue and lilac-pink. It is

a marvellous filler of gaps in a
border.

Letter S is less familiar: an
easily-grown annual called sil-

ybum. I once suggested it to a
keen gardening housewife, who

said it fiouBded exactly like her
former husband. Infact, itfya
soapy-l&ued •sort of iitMa&fft--

with seeds like " little shaving
brushes; they axe handled very
easily. Its charm is toe white

. spotting all over tty dark green,
neatly-cut leaves.

.

-A few plants look- very hold,

especially at the edge of a
gravel path or wall, so long as^

you prevent them : from -run-
ning to their beastly Gowers.
The markings look like milk

spots and their popular name
:• . them to the abun- ...

,
'dahce of legend's

-
great milk'

-
.,

’spdtler, the Virgin Mary.:::

Mary’s Thistle is an enchant-',
ing

,
plant in any soil which is

not too rich. .

, This weekend I' will be busy
with my top five: be sure to...

stick with the Lanes and not
th8 Foxes, as I can think o£.

.

some truly ghastly candidates :

for the second half of the mem-
ory trick.

National Trust makes the selling easier
Arthur Hellyer applauds moves towards setting up new and improvedplant centres atfamous gardens
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The ALLEN 58" LAWN RANGER TR IPLE MOWEffl |

I A major advance in quality lawnmowina
1 - powerful, quiet, last, this supers

,
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* • ultimate

|
Manoeuvrability
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POWEREQUIPMENTLTD./I goodidea made better.

I
T IS MANY years since a
plant nursery was opened
at Boda ant, toe famous
garden in north Wales

created by the Aberconway
family and given by toe second
Lord Aberconway to the
National Trust in 1949. The
object of the nursery was to

make available to visitors

some of the specialities of the

garden and it succeeded admi-
rably in this; but it had a side
effect which, I think, was not
expected entirely. There was a
marked and welcome reduction
in the petty pilfering that
occurs often when fine collec-

tions of plants are open for

public inspection.

It is not that gardeners are

any less honest than other peo-
ple but, simply, that toe desire

to possess an especially beauti-

ful or rare plant is so great

that it is easy to persuade one-

self a tiny piece or a few seeds

will not be missed. But when
the plant can be purchased
openly and honestly without
any such self-deception, the
opportunity is taken gladly,

and it is probable that the pur-

chaser will come away with a
number of plants instead of a
sprig or a seed pod plucked
from one or two.
Anyway, that was the way it

appeared to work at Bodnant
and toe nursery prospered so
greatly that, over the years, it

has been extended and given
ever-better facilities for propa-
gation. Now, it issues a cata-
logue and offers plants by mail
order as well as on the original
cash, and carry basis.

What has long surprised me
is that so few other National
Trust gardens have copied Bod-
nant on anything like a similar
scale. Many do now have sell-

ing centres but, usually, they
are quite small and organised
poorly. At last it seems that
there is to be a big change and
already, within a few weeks, I
have been present at the open-
ing of two entirely new or
greatly improved plant centres
in famous Trust gardens.
The first happened entirely

by accident when I visited
Knightshayes Court, near Tiv-
erton In Devon, for an entirely
different purpose and discov-
ered that I had chosen toe very
day when a new and far more
professionally organised sell-
ing centre was being opened
there. It forms part of a general
upgrading of the facilities

made by re-decorating and re-

organising the extensive stable
block to include an excellent
restaurant, a well-stocked shop

and this impressive plant cen-
tre. most of toe contents of
which have been propagated
on the premises. Everything
appeared to be going swim-
mingly on that opening day,
and l have heard since that the
Trust is delighted with the way
toe public is responding to it

and also to another much-im-
proved plant centre at Killer-

ton only a few miles away.
What I did not know then

was that toe Trust had started

negotiations for an even more
ambitious project at BlickHng
Hall - a project that involves

the co-operation of one of
Britain's best-known hardy
plant nurseries, Blooms of
Bressingham (probably more

familiar to private gardeners -

as Bressingham Gardens). Its

very large nursery is near Diss
in Norfolk and its founder.
Alan Bloom, has probably done
more than any single person to

keep good hardy plants in cul-

tivation, rescue old ones from
oblivion, and seek out new
varieties of merit.

BlickHng Hall is at Ayisham,
on toe other side of Norwich
and less than 40 miles from
Diss. It is one of the loveliest

Jacobean mansions in Britain,

sited in a medieval park and
reflecting in its garden , every
style since it was built in!62&
There is a dry moat; formal

terraces with their parterres; a
temple; an orangery; a pyrami-
dal mausoleum; a great ha-ha
to keep out cattle without,
impeding the view; a landscape
lake; a wilderness cross-
crossed with alleys and con-
cealing a little secret garden;
superb trees and shrubs; and
greatly-admired 20th century'
planting by Nora Lindsay, who
used hardy perennials to
reduce the cost of the extrava-
gant Victorian bedding-out on
the parterres.

She was not only a very
knowledgeable plantswoman
but also had great skill in- arr-

anging plants and, at BlickHng.

she showed that itWas possible
- to group them in an informal
way to produce formal effects
appropriate .tmtirdy to a period*
garden such as £KisL

: - -

- But the plants, &YeraIl axe
'

neither sb varied 'nor; for ‘fife

most part,
4

,
so rare

.
a3. those at *:

BO(inant or 'K'nlghtshayes; -

Couft, so ft warfnbt possible fir

.make £plant centre- at Blicfd-1 -

ing quite like theirs. ‘That ’WEt’
where Blooms of Bressingham
came in: The old : walled
kitchen garden at Stickling
was ideal for a plant centre

’

which could be made' in a man-
ner that would actually
enhance its attractiveness. The -

Bressingham nurseries could
supply unlimited quantities of A
plants suitable for all die ape; '-j

dal features at Bfickling/ and :

with a special emphasis on"the --

nid and . the excellent.

- Both the National Trtist hnd
the whale. Bloom family. (for it;

remains .a family business)
were. scrkeen about toe, idea
that they gpt it all sorted but
in six months; and I was pres-
ent on April 19 when Alan
Bloom, now 82, and Anna Rob-
erts, the director. of National
Trust Entdprises. cotfhdtai^e^

-

and opened Blickllng Planfsto,
the public.,.; ".

. . . „ .

T was defoghted wittuWh^^ •

saw and came away with that
splendid old pink, sweet-
scented Chinese peony. Sarah
Bernhardt; a -big-pot- plant of

.Aubrietia Dr Mules (still in my
view, the best dark-purple van-

'

ety - although its_flowers have ,

hot’ the raze-ofsome of the new-'
.comers); -and the -uncommon
^white-flowered form of the

-

friarsh marigold,- or kingcup/
That 'waa all for which I had

'

.
room in my already weltloaded
ear. Had I brought a van I
could have, filled Hr with ease.

The Blooms also are discuss-
ing the possibility: of similar
joint endeavours "in other
National Trust gardens, and
the Trust itself seems suddenly
to be aware fnlly^of the profit
(and the public benefit) to be
gained by playing a more-ac-

" five role in making good plants
available .to- the- public. - As a
holder of many collections of
such plants, it is well placed to

play an' .eyer more-active role

‘

in conserving, them. This is

part of the purpose of Garden
Heritage Week, which starts

today and is organised by the
National Council for the Con-
servation of Plants and Gar-
dens. Foil details are available

in a special edition of The Care
dener how on sale at .news-
agents..

LONDON PROPERTY

On the edge of
the City.

At the heart
oftomorrow;

A luxury home al Java Wharf, Shad
xVlhamet, means the end ofyour
commuting nightmares.

Occupying a superb docklands
riverside location, Java Wharf is an
imaginative conversion offour ware-
houses restored to former elegance to

a superb range ofluxury studio, one
and two bedroom apartments and
penthouses, all within an easy few
minutes walk ofTower Bridge and the

City
The river bus and City Airport

mean Java Wharf is at the heart of
everything with connections to
everywhere.

Features incJude: ^ Porterage.
‘S&s Fully fitted kitchens.^ Video
entryphone.^ Secureundercover
parking. [JQi Lift u> all Doors.
To find out more'cal! our

Sales Advisor on 01-407 6785
any day between Ham and 5pm.

TEPV&

BovisF
Homes
Spread your wings

v- • ;

‘ *

~

r CA LL

5jfesa T00A

vN.Radmark

-• ".} I is :

4g Choireof tNee&lbivbectnoominaisoneQiBaiafialrrients.

t^gaidens.. Prices from £550,000 .

"7.7 ' '

One, sln^e bedroom apirtmentiramE^OS.OtiO

^ Stunning spflHsvBlgalteried penthouse 7 \ V'-/-

+ Hand-bumWtohens wflh Naff appfionces . i\y
PoBshedBoechwocxIfloorstokitehens aid driing rootra :

En~suftebathrooms with Victorianbrass fittinga,
, , _ ^,7

+ Private fin, video entry phone, fidsecuitysystemandM
. .

sound Insulation -
"

Sole Agents:

Marsh & Parsons
57 Norland Square, London W117QU :

TeL 01 -603-0275
r

Ham place swa - immw 2 Bed ful
Kltdian. Dtning Rm, Drawing Urn. Cttpats
A Curtain*. GCH, 13 year loaoe. £215.000
(01) 736 3175.

MJUDA VALK W» - A epaciou*. gractaus 2
dXe bed apart (B7 eq. m approx), m setect
residential area. 90 yr tan*. Communal
fidtL Good coiwcUona Won End. Ben
oiler over srniooa Re tat: 01-389 3787.

RENTALS

Keith Cardale
Groves

Carthusian Court
City ofLondon EC4

TO LET
Superb unfurnished apartments with balconies/terraces
in a prestigious new building strategically located in the

heart ofthe City close to the Barbican.
1 and 2 bed. apartments from £250 per week incl. carpets,

curtains and kitchen equipment.

01-407 2790

WIMBLEDON SW19

FORD

A SUPERBLY SITUATED INDIVIDUALLY
DESIGNED DETACHED PROPERTY.

Myrrb tin* #*rr golfmm lad Ut,
»ha» elTrfing TOT IL SECLUSION )•> eta; 7

atalo walk from mdfrgrMnLTlK fcuiutifullji

yppdiiiicd uccontmodillaii offer*: hall.

di*jkriv.<m. ilrinMD|r room ami dining room
kadmg unio 3u' Kileony lemoc. luxury Dued
km hen jnU kiuiulry. mailer bedroom with
divuuip room and hjihioom. -nd bedroom
miik plus .1 further brdruoim and 3rd
haihruom. double garage, easily managed
gulden*.
£UT5.«W FREEHOLD
AYLES+ORD AND COMPANY.
*1 High Sim*. IMMbkdea i

Londaa SW IQ SEC
T*fc Ul-eie 0020/9811

CLAPHAM COMMON

A mull, btu very appealing swdio
flu on the railed ground floor of
an extremely dcguni early Victo-

rian terraced house on the
Southed* of Claphan] Common.
The flat is light, taeil maintained

and decorated, quiet and peaceful,

and looks out onto a charming
uralkd garden.

Only a stones throw to the Com-
mon. lube and shops, the Fist is

beautifully located, extremely
secure, and would he an ideal first

lime buy or “pied a term".

£62.000

Please call 01-627 1992 (W/E &
Exes] or 01-87} 3269 daring

working day

RICHMOND HILL
superb early Victorian S/B

bed house, and
self-contained flat, original

features, good garden, near
the Park. OFFERS AROUND

£435.000.

Ring 01-9404)560

HAMPSTEAD
SUPER FLAT

Satan 1970 Heek. Hovcntodt Hifl
Large bedroom, nsulie bath/we, hage
thing room, balcony bees touth <mhct
communal gardes, ball, shower room,
unu cabin. 1087 fined knefarn.
Jrd floor, hit. GCH. own lode up

haernnu garage. £l«UM0.

Ring 101 >431 5801/ (01)927 4491

Boying/Renting
in London?

Capital
HOMESEARCH
provides a flexible,

cost-effective property
finding service

Telephone or sendfor Brochure

01 223 4273
32 Baucises Bridge Road

Loudon SWI1 JAO

EATON PLACE
Entrance ball, large reception

room, double bedroom,
bathroom, single bedroom

with cn-suite bathroom. High
ceilings. Just refurbished.

£500 p.w.

TeJ 0372 64542

Top rewire high quat-
uy propartlea to rent Can Domlnlc'e
01-581 -Oise.

PROPSmV REQUIRED from July *89 for long
rental by U£. reetdama. Minimum E bode.
3 recaps. 2 tarfts. Attractive, unfurnished
yllitfle house In good working order. wMi
pwMng. Within 30 mins fast drive of Read,
mg. Up to £2600 px-m. Tel. 01-603 0044.

ai^OjuntiesAawi- -
National5

SPECIALIST FURNISHED
LETTINGS

WHY PAY LONDON
RENTAL PRICES?

Top quality properties available m
cotnnunrr bdi of Surrey and SW
London. Wimbledon - Wcybndas

TO: (037X7) 21745

Further properus ahvan required la
ESHEIUCOBHAM otnmaAhr
ear EmtaBy ud naeadw cSfsft.

HIGH OT
KENSINGTON

Beautiful 2 bed, 2 bath flat
£420 p.w. •

TeL 01-451 0S97

TO LET Mty IMM LUXURIOUS
. HOUSE ON ABINGDON MARINA.

(Oxford 4 mils)
PREFERABLY COMPANY LET,

IDEAL AS
ENTERTAINMENTVENUE

4 bedrooms, brge lounge, fully Cried
kitchen, garden with har-b-que. graaaed
down to boat moorings. The home hat
a tofcteni aveuker.

TeLtmSSSUU OR 0494 70662}

Wl. Entamentoubie 6 Hb6r .uranorL Georgian
Mao. Approx 22.000 eq R. Close -Marble
Arch. Snort lease. Price tZSS.OQO.- Tel
222-1071. ... . . .

MORTGAGES

PEP mortgages
avaHaWev no insurance-

'

obligatiqii. 2 7,

ld6% Home &
Businesses. loans at

lowest rates.

Immediate decision in
principle

OPEN THIS
WEEKEND.

PHONE 01-699 1438-
or 291 0234

PROFESSIONAL BENEFITS

: - iOVER
* JriMNT E14
y‘ Bssfloassm .'-k-

dsiwefiat puiu luauiy.ptasawcepinB;-

risrr new, rrom h<Hac and garden ai

£13.000 off 1987 cost pried

.
..7 " D1-S3^9619.brodnro

HAMPSTCAD " " •

FROGNAL '

. Garden tcvd flat with Patios, Hall
tarRc inception room, 3 bedrooms. 2

bathrooms (l cn-siritcL Idtcfacn.

Needy decorated. Stud carpetx.~own
entrance. £l&S.OOa

Tab 81-722-R423 hoew,
01-625-6729 work

MmMr 2 bed, 2 bam. Long taeee did mutt
*«. Beet oiler aecuras OS&saoug.

.

’ **" * Jemee’a Park 1
T«p “> floor

.mansion fiar u, escellem condition a,ouporb swToundlnga, 4 beda, 2 hams. 2

*wct»r - w perWog.

.

WrajlOO Hathaways 01-222^3733

RENTALS
«" "a* q»Ky Beta

Pid boug* to 1st In sod arowto FuBiam.
Sttlhmn Thomas ttl-731-1333.

"•joy? WOW 2 bed. ategont flat ftvquiat
•Jett nw to Undetgniupd. E220 p.w. Teh
VM3B67S7

GENERAL
APARTMENTS

WlHaOaiaSL
2 ireceps. 3 -beds, 2 baths, lux-
ury mod. flaL Porter, lift,

lease 50 years

£245J)00
Must sell - any offer

01-622-7674 --

AUCTIONS

MAJOR TWO DAY
PROPERTY AUCTION

UNLESS PREVIOUSLY SOLD. .;

Ilth & 15th MAY^ 1989
. , :

'- T.-^Tr: TOtMCLUDEe
.z.' %j. .T •

FAIRWAY HOLIDAY FLATS, THE FAIRWAY
:: r LAKE, ISLE OF WIGHT /

A Freehold Site attending, to approximately 0.763 acresand wmpnsing a blot* of HoUday Flatlets Ld detSbimg^ow. with, aaripary outbidding. Detailed planning
penn^aoii for coversion and extttision to provide a 35

aS rrwr
1

? with y flats (13 sheltered &4 stafp. Total proposed area: over'16,000 m.ft. Potentialfor alternative develbpments, such as B1 or RF<1 nr

GUIDE PRICE to”
1 l° PRE-AUCTIONGUIDE PRICE in excess of £575,000.

Catalogues available from the Auctidheera:-

27 Soho Square, foadu WIV6AX
TeL- 01-437 6977



\;^l>

* •

Nixon: egotism,
vanity and

stupendous folly
Bougjas Jay is left with a stark

impression ofaformer USpresident

QUITE apart (tom the' famous
“tapes”, Nixon as Presidentkept a “Sp*
cial/FUe" of secret notes and memo-
randa (toni and' to him in' the White
House. After his resignation Congress
assumed ownership of these for the US
National Archives, hi May 1987 they
were opened to the public and the
press.
Bruce Oudes, a professional journal-

ist. has edited a 600-page selection of
these documents and written a valuable
Introduction. The great majority o£
them are exchanges between Nixon and
three men collectively known at that
time in Washington DC as “the TWifn
Wall": Haldaman, Chief of Staff. Ertich-
man and Kissinger.
Two sharp general impressions

emerge from this torrent of words. First

FROM THE PRESIDENT:
RICHARD NIXON’S SECRET

FILES
edited by Brtide Oudes
Andre Deuisch £15J>5. 661 pages

Nixon had a peculiar method of work-
ing - as Kissinger’s memoirs, also con-
firm

.

- the very opposite of Reagan’s.
He bated meetings, even of the cabinet

He did not like having anyone, from
insijle the White House or' outside,
talking to him. He preferred working

'

long solitary hours, taking lonely but
firm decisions, and recording these in
memoranda to his private associates,
often at the rale of six to 10 a day.

In one of these Haldaman is charac-
teristically told: “I am not interested in

discussing the matter with anybody on
our staff. I have thought it through and
this is my conclusion.” Other members
of the cabinet seem to have mattered
even less, though on this point Oudes’s
selection may he misleading.

Secondly, and especially starkly to an
English reader, Nixon pushes to
extremes the doctrine of the sole
responsibility of the President and of
the loyalty of the civil service to him. A
British prime minister or minister (at
least before the 1380s) would distm- i

guish sharply between Government ;

business which civil servants were
bound to promote, and party business
to be pursued through the party or Par-
liamentary machines. For Nixon no
such distinction existed. Either you
were, or were not, *Vrae of us0 and “us*
meant first Nixon, and secondly the
Republican Party.

fix this spirit more than half of these
Innumerable outpourings are devoted to
-the furious battle, mounting to an
obsession, between Nixon himself and
tile wicked media, led by the Washing-
ton Post and New York Times, and the
contemptible “liberals” an over the
country. Feeling himself to be the vic-

tim. of a “witch hunt", Nixon avidly
launched a witch hunt in return; and
someone commented that it was hard to
tell “which witch was winch”.
Given the prevailing atmosphere,

however, and the existence of what
Nixon himself called “the plumbers’
unit in the White House”, intended of
course for genuine national security
purposes, it is not difficult to under-
stand what happened. For In 1972
another timebomb emerged, most inter-

estingly unearthed by these papers.
Years before, in 1956, Nixon’s brother
Donald had received a $200,000 loan
from the eccentric millionaire Howard
Hughes, who was granted a tax conces-
sion after. Probably Richard Nixon had
nothing to do with it. But, as the 1972
Presidential Election approached,
Nixon became obsessed with the fear
that the hated Democrats would smear
him -With thiq ancient sranrial _ and
was determined to discover what they
were up to.

Yet amid all this, Nixon was success-
fully organising the historic US rap- 1

prochement with both the Soviet Union
and China. It is indeed a wonderful
irony that on May 27, 1972, when the
“plumbers'* achieved their first Water-
gate “break-in”, the President was in
Moscow. In Oudes's view* “it has not

been been fully established” that Nixon
actually approved the second and fetal
break-in on June 19. Reading the record
here of Nixon's five-page conversation
with Haldeman four days later, one is
left in no doubt that Nixon joined in a
cover-up thereafter; but prior approval
by Nixon Is not absolutely proved.

However that may be, one cannot but
at times admire the energy, the deter-
mination. the knowledge and the sheer
grinding resolution which Nixon dis-
played throughout all this turmoiL
Richard Nixon, on the evidence of this
book, was an exceedingly clever man,
with a remarkably wide grasp of
national and international politics, who
was misled by a black streak of egotism
and vanity into the stupendous folly
which destroyed him

Two
DR AJL HERMANN has been
writing about business law
since 1972, mainly in this news-
paper. His articles are always
stimulating, displaying a
unique grasp of business reali-

ties combined with sharp legal

analysis. His pen has berated
the eminent and not so emi-
nent, including a succession of

Lord Chancellors, judges, the
Government and the EEC Com-
mission.

Inevitably bis articles tend
mainly to concentrate on what
has gone wrong in the area of
business law. Alas,' there has
been much in- this .respect to

‘

Write about.!* recant years.:

This book, a sequel to Dr Her-

.

mum's -excellent Judges, Law
and Businessmen, contains
about a third of his contribu-

tion*:published in the FT in

the period 1983 to 1988. It pres-

ents a valuable survey of the
many mistakes, misjudgements
and simple omissions that
have bedevilled business regu-

lation over that relatively
short period of time.
As the author points out in

his preface, there was no pre-

selection of topics for his col-

umn;. only current events
determined what required
comment
“Judgments crying out for

legislation." he writes, “or leg-

islation crying out for better

Judgment. Judgments which
are grossly unfair and lacking

common sense often handed
down ’with regrets’ or which
take much too long and cost

too much to. arrive at. The
reluctance of governments to

reaped the law when they owe
money, their keenness to got to

kinds of law
LAWV BUSINESS:

Business Law Articles from
the FT 1983-1988

by AH. Hermann
ButUrworda £29.50. 304 pages

law when it can be abusedfor
some political purpose."
The period covered in the

book almost exactly coincides
'with a period of judicial ortho-
doxy. The Denning heritage
has been dismantled, the Court
of Appeal and the House of
Lords have, for the moment at
least. largely buried landmark

.
decisions such as juniorBooks
v The VeifccW Company- (1982).

Legal principles have given
way to strict adherence to pre-
cedent and a literal interpreta-

tion Of statute has often been

Nigel Savage on
a thoughtful
critique of

business law

preferred to the reality of what
Parliament intended.

In the chapter entitled “Law
Unfit for Business” a number
of the sacred cows of the
English legal system are sub-
jected to critical appraisal. The
judiciary is rightly taken to
task for allowing legal doc-

trines to become “an ugly and
oppressive master rather than
a good servant"

All legal structures, whether
deriving from the English or
the Roman system, must bal-

ance the need for certainty
against the need to develop the
law in response to changes in
economic, social and political

circumstances. Civil law
judges abroad have always
respected principles articulated
from previous decisions, but
where the application of a pre-
vious decision brings about an
absurd or unfair result or a
result that is clearly contrary
to the spirit of a statute, they
will depart from the previous
decision.

Many of the criticisms made
by Dr Hermann, from the
standpoint of someone' well-
versed in both systems, reveal
the potential tensions between
the English legal system and
the civilian systems in use on
the continent.
Such tensions will inevitably

become more apparent as the
process of harmonisation
between member states of the
EEC continues. This inevitable
source of conflict is an area
that tends to be neglected by
both policy-makers and some
English practitioners when
they set up branch offices
across Europe.
Continental lawyers think

differently from English law-
yers. They are trained differ-

ently (much longer for one
thing), and the differences are
discernible in the way in which
they practice their profession.
Continental codes give the law-
yer, and for that matter the
public, a clear picture of the
principles and rules; increas-

ingly our statutes tend to be an
impenetrable forest of ver-
biage. There are however signs
of change, not the least being

Hans Schaufelein's woodcut of the Unjust Steward. One of many
interesting illustrations in Basil S. Yamey’s original study An &
Accounting (Yale University Press £30.00)

that we currently have a Lord
Chancellor who was trained
and practiced in a legal system
strongly influenced by Roman
law.
There is much of interest in

this book for the business
reader and the lawyer. The
“incoming tide of Community
law" and the need to take a
more global view of trade laws
are familiar themes.
The legal profession has

often been subjected to Dr Her-
mann’s critical pen and has in
the past withstood its

onslaughts; but pressures cur-

rently facing the profession.

from the market-place and the
Government, together with
developments in communica-
tions and technology, are all

likely to result in the erosion

of medieval barriers. These
inexorable forces, green paper
or no green paper, will surely

bring about the welcome
changes that Dr Hermann
advocates.
NIGEL SAVAGE is Professor of
Law and Head of the School of
Law at Trent Polytechnic, Not-

tingham. He is also a consul-

tant on training and profes-

sional development with Frere
Chomley.

OST ENTERTAINING novel
’ the week is Ruling Passions.

hich cruises
.
into pre-Wap-

ng Fleet Street on the crest

a nostalgic wave and settles

» a great, grubby building
smLudgate Circus. Here the

impart, a journal every bit as

uty as U sounds, keeps the

ag of scandal-mongering
portage fluttering high.

Fluttering with it is pretty

[tic Daisy, juat over from
uladclphia for a stint as fea-

ire-writcr and lover, then

ife. of a rising Cabinet minis-

r. Hie intriguing of her boss

tainst her nusband is. the

ainstay of a fairly tenuous
ot.

Since Susan Cropland has

aved Daisy’s roles herself.

\p can be forgiven for expect-

g more than on adulatory

mp round the pillars of the

rilish establishment and
me glamorous treatment of

use who prep them up. The
ilihg passion of Rufina Pos-

ms is a self-love which dares

speak ife name only too bra-

nfv. In Rampart circles it. ta-

llied charisma, which
plains why this foolish,
nhy book Bf so gripping. ~

.

The Enchantment Of Chris-

>a uoti Setstn is really about
a enchantment of its author
tth another set of MtaWtoh-
ent figures, this time the 0*r-
an aristocrats who hover
ound Lake Sternberg in
ivaria.

James ’ Gaunt, a visiting
iigllsh writer, iff' held
thralled by the monumental
id uncultured exhibitionism

the von Return family, but

Ife Tor ife least showy mem-
t, Christina- In England, she
anages to keep tip the plausi-

o facade of a young widow

Fiction

engagements
RULING PASSIONS
by Susan Crosiand

WeidmfHdA Nlcolson £10.95, 376
pages

THE ENCHANTMENT
OF CHRISTINA VON

RETZEN
ky Anthony Beevor

WeldmfcldA Nieobon £11315. 213
pages

.

THE WOMEN’S HOUSE
by Joan Lingard

. Hamisk Hamilton £11.95. 215 pages

LOOKING OUT
by Phillips Blake

Thr BotOry HeadSHS5.2Q8 pagps

THE COLOURS OF HER
DAYS

by Valerie Bluxnenthai

Coliim £12.95. 352 pages

exorcising a tormented pesti

But heredity will out, and
Christina turns out to be a

closet philistine. .

James, meanwhile, becomes

a parody of the New Man he

set out to be and is reduced to

explaining psychoanalysis to

his stepdaughter in bed. His

fascination with a rather bor-

imj family eventually wither*

into bruised mistrust his cre-

ator seems sa besotted as over.

This is a sensitively written

book badly in need of some
authorial detachment
Take two rambling, Gothic

houses, mirror images of each
other, mi opposite sides of the
street fill one with a “family"
of independent women, pio-

neers and inheritors of libera-

tion, and the other with a gag-
gle of Mafia-style Italian
brothers, and you have your
battle-line ready drawn.
In The Women’s House,

Evangeline, a novelist in the

1930s now restored to small
feme by Virago reissues, lives

with Anna, a mime, and Holly,

an adolescent who has fled

from a sadistic mother. When
the house is sold over their

heads to fee ToneDi Brothers,

their solidarity is absolute:

they win sot budge.

This is feminism with a sting

in ife tail. Maximo develops a
sudden Interest in mime, Anna
is seen getting out of the flash

car just one street away from
their own, and unaccountably,

Roberto keeps turning up to

ask questions at the Pizza cafe

where Holly works as a wait-

Unnervingly, menace creeps

into the harmless muddle of

everyday life. It's a sad tale for

our times, this account of a
banal and ruthless get-rich-

quick culture, overturning an
that gets in ife way, but there

is also a'quite -unsentimental
vision of human warmth and
friendship surviving against

fee oflAe, An unusual. under-

Susan Crosiand: frothy tale

stated work from a talented

writer.

Neighbourly tangles get out
of hand too in Philippa Blake's

second novel. Looking Out.

Across a hay in Dover. Henry
Alland and Liam McGniness
look out from their cottages.

Like the general who hangs a
picture of the enemy in his

headquarters to get to know
him better, the London bankeT
and the Irish jurist piece
together every remorseless

detail of the other’s life. Spiri-

tually as well as physically
marooned in his corner of the
bay, each feels threatened by
the other's knowledge; each is

astonished at the shabbiness of
his own behaviour.

Irritatingly, most of this
book -reads like separate stories

randomly interleaved; one of
adultery on holiday from
Hampstead for the summer,
the second of poverty and root-

lessness for an Irish exile. Both
are well enough told; only at

the end, though, do the parallel

lives converge when two out-

breaks of violence bring Henry
and Liam to face the conse-

quences of their actions.

No doubt there is a signifi-

cance in the relations of an
emotional gangster with a ter-

rorist but Philippa Blake's
breezy style just is not up to

such weighty themes. Still,

some of the writing is excel-

lent, especially the descriptions

of landscape and the long
pointers of rock spreading out
to the sea.

Valerie Blumentbal who is

also a wine-dealer, has turned

her attention to art, and, unfor-

tunately, to the Pre-Raphaelite
Brotherhood, celebrated in her
historical novel The Colours of
her Days. All the criticisms of
gushy moralising and morbid
sentimentality ever levelled

against Millais, Holman Hunt
and the rest occur as one reads

this work, which has none of

the redeeming vitality of atten-

tion to detail of the artists it

describes. If. by any chance, it

is meant as pastiche, it should

be half the length. But I sus-

pect that it isn't

Jackie WuUschlager

Collision of cultures

in a city at war
Harold Beeley on an erudite examination of the

melting-pot that was Cairo during the ’40s

SELDOM HAS there been such
a dropping of names. Under-
standably so. however, for the
author found, as she had been
told when the subject was
suggested to her. that “every-
body you have ever heard of
was there at one time or
another during the war." Ear-
lier writers have of course
observed this, and one of them,
Pennetborne Hughes, pre-

empted the perfect title 40
years ago when he published
While Shepheard’s Watched.
Artemis Cooper gets on admi-
rably without it, and has
revived the story with the ben-
efit of a rich literature in the
intervening years.
Lawrence Durrell, Olivia

Manning, Christopher Sykes
and many others have drawn
upon what Charles Johnston
described as “the curious
Anglo-Egyptian society which
has blossomed out during the
war. Guards and cavalry offi-

cers, Turco-Egyptian prin-

cesses. war-profiteering pashas
and a sprinkling of foreign dip-

lomats” - together, he might
have added, with the great
Coptic families and refugee
Raftcan royalty.
At the heart of this world,

and constantly recurring in
Artemis Cooper's pages, were
King Farouk and the British

Ambassador Miles Lampson
(who became Lord Kifleam in
1943). She draws largely on Kil-

leara’s diaries, the partial pub-

lication of which in 1972 so
greatly humanised the image
previously presented by other
observers. And Farouk bad an
engaging side, as when he put
up a stiff resistance to his dis-

charge from a British military
hospital to which he had been
rushed after an accident on the
Ismailia road.
Alongside the social life of

Cairo the book deals seriously

with the events which had
given rise to, and continued to

CAIRO IN THE WAR:
1939-1945

by Artemis Cooper
Hamish Hamilton £16.95. 370 pages

sustain, its existence. The
North African campaigns, dom-
inated first by Rommel and
then by Montgomery, are viv-

idly narrated. Alamein was a
turning-point both in the
course of the war and in the
life of the Egyptian capital “As
the centre of international poli-

tics and administration, the
great days of wartime Cairo
came after Alamein.”

,
It was then, for instance,

that Egypt became the channel
through which British support
flowed to the partisans in
Yugoslavia and Greece; the
staff of the Special Operations
Executive occupied a block of
flats known to every Cairene

taxi-driver as "secret building."

Here Fitzroy Maclean made
preparations for his mission to

Tito, noting in the files the
existence of an organisation

called PX. the frustration of

which appeared to be a major
policy objective, and being told

on asking that PX stood for the

Foreign Office.

The life of the "other ranks”
and their relations with the

Cairo populace are not
neglected. The Egyptian rob-

bery and cheating which gave
rise to so many anecdotes are
matched by the British (and
Australian) hijacking and
destruction of property. But an
underlying mutual tolerance
remained until after the war. A
final chapter sketches the
deteriorating political climate
and describes its culmination
in “Black Saturday,” January
26 1952. when the city was sur-

rendered to mob violence and
such symbols of the British

presence and the Anglo-Egyp-
tian symbiosis as the Turf
Club, Shepheard’s Hotel and
the Auberge des Pyramides
went up in Dames. The conse-

quent dismissal of the Wafdist
Government opened the way to

the revolution of the Free Offi-

cers six months later.

This detached and compre-
hensive study of a singular epi-

sode in World War Two was
well worth attempting and has
been executed with elegance
and sound historical judgment

Pity the poor
“NO MAN but a blockhead
ever wrote except for money.”
declared Dr Johnson. If that is

so then there must be a great
many blockheads around
today, because most of the peo-

ple who write novels (women
as well as men. dear doctor)
must be doing it for some other
reason than the one you cite.

They are often able and imagi-
native people, but they do not
make much money out of their

books. They could make a
great deal more money doing
almost any other job. Many of
them have, in addition to cre-

ative writing, humbler “bread-

line" occupations, and partners
whose jobs are more likely to
provide the household with a
secure income. - • -

There are some notable
exceptions, of course. There is

Jeffrey Archer. Catherine
Cookson. Frederick Forsyth,
Dick Francis, John Le Carre,

and these are the ones you
tend to hear about because the
announcement of record sales

and record advances make
tuneful music in the ears of the
publishers' publicists.

George Greenfield, a leading
literary agent for 34 years
(with John Farquharson), a
publisher for six years before
that, and the author himself of
three previously published
books, has been pondering the
anomalies of rewards in the
writing of fiction for most of
his working life. What he has
to say about the business,
about the enormous disparities

in earnings among novelists, is

well worth listening to. partic-

ularly by anyone who might be

SCRIBBLERS FOR
BREAD: ASPECTS

OF
THE ENGLISH NOVEL

SINCE 1945

by George Greenfield
Hodder A Stoughton £15.00. 400

pages

thinking about trying to make
a living by practising the art.

After reading Greenfield, he or
she might well decide to think
again.

Greenfield’s comments are
backed by copious statistical

information culled from the
book trade press and the
library Association, and from
his many years of experience
as a negotiator with publishers
on behalf of novelist-clients.
We are here in a jungly world
of royalties and rights, licenses
to print, writing down of
stocks, remainder clauses and
minimum terms agreements.
Greenfield cuts through this
undergrowth like an experi-
enced scout-master leading a
pack of cubs.
He includes three searching

interviews with three novelists
of repute but whose public
images are widely different:

Archer, the tearaway best-
seller; Jon Cleary, the solid
regular performer, who has
built a considerable readership
over the years, and Antonia
Byatt, university teacher as
well as creator of fiction, who
gave up academic work
recently for full-time writing.
There are horses for courses in

author
the fiction arena and each of
these novelists represents a dif-

ferent kind of success story.

You pays your money and you
picks your role-model

Greenfield starts his story at

the end of World War Two
when paper was still rationed

and publishing was still, in the

words of the late Frederic War-
burg, Orwell's publisher, “an
occupation for gentleman," and
he carries it through to the
present time in a chapter on
Conglomerates and Aggre-
gates. The recent acquisition of
a controlling interest in the
once mighty house of Collins

by Rupert Murdoch renders
this chapter in need of
up-dating.

“If one had to sum up,"
writes Greenfield, “the publish-

ing trends of this present
decade to date in one sentence,
it would be: the cottage indus-
try is dead, long live big busi-

ness." If I had to sum up the
publishing trends of this pres-

ent decade in one sentence, it

would be: publishing as an
exclusive male club is dead,
long live the new breed of
female publisher. The Virago
revolution, with its profound
repercussions throughout the
entire industry, seems to have
passed Greenfield by; but, that
apart, he has performed a valu-

able service in dispelling the
clouds of unknowing wrapped
around the mystique of pub-
lishing deals and giving the
general reader ready access to

the bard facts, unpalatable
though they may be.

Anthony Curtis

In the family footsteps
WINSTON CHURCHILL has
been a Tory MP for a Manches-
ter constituency since 1970,
itself quite an achievement.
Recently not much has been
heard from him. He has never
made it even to the lower lev-

els of Mrs Thatcher’s Govern-
ment and has scarcely figured
in internal debates on the state

of the party. He was dismissed
from the opposition front
bench in 1978 for refusing to
support Mrs Thatcher’s line on
Rhodesia and, although some
Tories said at fee time "you
can’t sack a Churchill" there
was never any demand to
bring him back.

Churchill, however, has a
redeeming feature: he can
write. Writing indeed has been
the Churchill family business.
Winston, the Prime Minister,

made his name at it long
before he reached the highest
office. Winston's son, Ran-
dolph, excelled at it not only as
a journalist, but as an histo-

rian. And Randolph’s son, Win-
ston, took to it early.

Together with his father,
Winston wrote a very good
book on the Six Day War. Ran-
dolph said that the best of it

came from his son. The young
Winston was also the first

anchorman of the BBC Radio 4

programme now called The
Worid at One - before William
Hardcastie and Sir Robin Day.
That was a long time ago.

Churchill is now 48. After a
period of silence he has pro-

duced his Memories and Adven-
tures which just about stretch

to his election to Parliament,

but effectively stop with his
father’s death in 1968.

He was the only child to be
bom at Chequers so far this

century. His grandfather, while

MEMORIES AND
ADVENTURES

by Winston S. Churchill
Weidenfeld £ Nieobon £14.95. 261

pages

wartime Prime Minister, found
time to buy him a model rail-

way and play with it in the
nursery. When he was at Eton,
he was beaten for being called
“Winston-bloody-Churchill” At
Oxford he took to flying and
would flip to Brighton for din-
ner, with coffee in Birmingham
before returning to Christ
Church to sleep. He did that

not because he was rich - the
Churchills never were - but
because the costs were low.

This is an old-fashioned, lei-

surely memoir, gushing and
stilted at times, but the mate-
rial is assiduously assembled
and there are some remarkable
family letters to draw on. Pre-

sumably it stops around 1970

because there are more vol-

umes to come. Possibly it is a
bid to reassert himself politi-

cally. Still his re-emergence as
a writer is welcome. He could
be a rather effective political

biographer.

Malcolm Rutherford
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DIVERSIONS

Looking for the Lord in
Churches in the City ofLondon are suffering a crisis of confidence:

the temple of Mammon
Worshippers arefew, and money is tight. Christian Tyler reports

T HE MAN in the pul-

pit wore a spotted
red tie and a pull-

over under his grey
suit. When the last

office workers had filed to

thoir seats he gave the com-
mand and 600 bibles snapped
open to the gospel of St John.
Chapter 20. The Rev Dick
Lucas, rector of St Helen's.
Bishopsgate. was about to dem-
onstrate why he is the Square
Mile's biggest congregation-
puller since "Woodbine Willie”

reigned at St Edmund the King
in Lombard Street.

Appreciative murmurs and a
few brazen chuckles greeted
tbe First sally. This Tuesday
lunchtime, said tbe rector, he
would be offering "a cure for
Durham-itis." His reference to

the Bishop of Durham's wide-
ly-reported Easter doubts
about the physical resurrection

of Christ warmed every evan-
gelical heart In the audience.
The Rev Lucas took his hear-

ers through St John's account,
line by line, word by word.
Twenty minutes later, pre-

cisely. he closed his Bible and
sent his pin-striped Christian
soldiers trooping back to their

posts in the service of
Mammon.

Is Dick Lucas the harbinger
of a religious revival in tbe
City of London? Far from it. St
Helen's is a law unto itself. If

you see people spilling from
any other church doorway at

lunchtime, the chances are
they have been to a piano
recital, a celebrity dialogue, an
art exhibition, a relaxation
class or a vegetarian restau-

rant in the crypt.

Most of the Anglican
churches in the City are doing
well to get more than half-a-

dozen people at their services.

A recent impromptu requiem
for victims of the Hillsborough
football disaster drew 50 at St
Mary-le-Bow, and carol ser-

vices are popular at Christmas.
But the only time St Edmund's
has a big congregation is when
the church is on loan to The
Deeper Christian Life Ministry,

a hot-gospelling sect of expatri-

ate Nigerians. For most of the
time the buildings are empty.
There is never enough money
for repairs and clerical morale
is very low.

When the City was still a
place for people to live in, it

boasted 1X1 churches. The
Great Fire of London in 1666
destroyed 35. Of Christopher
Wren's 51 replacements, 21
have been demolished or sold.

Some were bombed in the
Blitz. Of the 39 Anglican
churches left, one is leased to
Lutherans, another to Free
Scottish Presbyterians. Wren's
spires have been engulfed by
banks but are too important to
be torn down. Today the City

has about 350.000 daily com-
muters and 5.000 residents.
There are 23 V* vicars - and far

too many churches.
The perennial problems of

money and overcapacity were
reviewed again this week by
the deanery synod, in an atmo-
sphere heavy with recrimina-
tion. The City clergy are at log-

gerheads with the diocese,
following the harassment
through the consistory court of
their area dean (their shop
steward), the Rev Malcolm
Johnson, for providing a refuge
for homosexuals. They dislike

and fear their new archdeacon
and feel Ignored by his supe-
rior. the Bishop.

Traditionalists argue that
the churches would get many
more customers - even in
midweek - if priests spent less

time cutting sandwiches and
more time talking about God.
Progressives reply that St
Helen's has mopped up all the
committed evangelical wor-
shippers in the City and that
charismatic preaching cuts no
ice with the rest. They say
there is other work to be done
in the City. But what work?
Perhaps because competition

for souls is so great and the
duties so ill-defined, there is

more schism (management
consultants would call it niche
marketing) in the City of Inn-
don than almost anywhere else
in the Church of England.
The conservative wing is

represented at one end by tbe
bom-again Bible-based evange-
lism of St Helen's and at the
other by the incense and vest-
ments of St Magnus the Martyr
near London Bridge. The pro-
gressives range from the mis-
sionary St Batolph's at Aid-
gate. where the Rev Johnson
caters for homosexuals and

down-and-outs, to the gentle
liberalism of St Michael, Corn-
hill, where the Rev David Bur-
ton Evans, chaplain to the
Stock Exchange, puts on the
best liturgical music.
According to the Rev Victor

Stock, liberal rector of the
lively St Mary-le-Bow in Cheap-
side (three resident parishio-
ners). the evangelicals have a
direct line to Mrs Thatcher and
are prospering; the Anglo-Cath-
olics are retreating into

Rev Malcolm Johnson: caters
for physical as well as
spiritual needs

obscurantism, and the' centre
ground is unsupported and out
of favour.

“It's been a bit of an
eye-opener for me," said John
Ridgeway-Wood. the new lay
administrator of St Katherine
Cree. which has a regular con-
gregation of 15 or 16. “The City
deanery has got to get its act
together: it doesn't know
where it's heading. They are
getting people into church but
they are not preaching the gos-
pel. Some of the things dis-
cussed at a recent meeting of
the deanery synod matte my
hair curL”
He was referring to propos-

Country Notes

Where purity is paramount
WHEN it comes to water
pollution, some branches of
farming are regarded with a
degree of terror by water and
health authorities and by
river-users. Heavy applications
of nitrates on arable farms
present a threat to our health,

probably a long-term one, and
pose an immediate problem
to the Fishing, swimming and
boating fraternities.

The nitrogen run-off into
our rivers and streams
stimulates weed growth that
cloys the riverbeds and lowers
the oxygen level dramatically.
Effluent from pig and cattle
units sometimes escapes into
rivers. Most deadly of all is

silage eiTluent - 200 times
more potent than the product
of livestock.

it conics as a pleasant
surprise, therefore, to discover
one water-based commercial
activity that presents
absolutely no threat to the
quality of our natural water
supply.
Watercress growers are the

goodies of tile rural water
scene. The spring or borehole
water they use is passed on
to the rivers in exactly as pure
a condition as when First fed

into tiie watercress beds.

These growers are a
close-knit community. There
are not many ofthem, perhaps
fewer than 30 in England. Most
of them know, or know of, each
other. The beds, mostly
family-run enterprises, are
concentrated chiefly in

Hampshire. Dorset, Wiltshire,

Surrey and Kent.
Some are a part-time activity

with a a bed of one or two
acres, but the larger concerns
may cover 10 to 15 acres.

Establishing the concrete-lined
beds will cost £75.000 to
£100,000 an acre and, even
allowing for recent
mechanisation, the labour
requirement is heavy: two to
three men an acre, to include
harvesting and bunching.
Unfortunately for growers,

it is thought widely in Britain

that there is a serious danger
of contracting liver fluke
disease from eating watercress
But the Water Cress
Association, run by the
National Farmers Union, has
done an enormous amount to

dispel this misconception. It

points out that there has not
been a single case of the
disease for more than 20 years,
attributing this to strict

enforcement of its code of

Hathaway Shirts

Win a ‘Broadway Break11
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practice for hygienic
production and harvesting.
The fear of liver fluke - . ..

disease might account for the
fact that national average
consumption of watercress
works out at a mere one bunch
per head each year and shows
little sign of increasing. In
catering circles, this is put
down partly to the fact that
watercress does not keep welt
two days at the most There
are signs, however, that the
promotional efforts of the
Water Cress Association may
be paying off. Marks and
Spencer. Sainsbury and Tesco
are among the major
purveyors.
The association plans to be

at the Festival of Food and
Fanning in Hyde Park next
month, organised by the Royal
Agricultural Society of
England to celebrate 150 years
of service to agricultural
producers. A model watercress

bed will be on display and
recipes will be available. These
will include watercress and
mushroom pate, cream of
watercress soup, watercress
mayonnaise and watercress
souffle.

A few years ago, I attended
a dinner party where a silver

rose bowl filled with
watercress formed the
centrepiece far the dining room
table. Against a white
tablecloth, it was rather
effective. The guests made no
reference to this unusual
centrepiece, perhaps because
we were all uncertain if the
watercress was intended for

eating.

Our host remained silent.

Michael Stourton

SUCH HAS been the
tournament dominance of
world champion Gary Kaspa-
rov that you have to recall Til-

burg 1981 for his last indiffer-

ent result. But for several

rounds of the latest World Cup
event in Barcelona, it seemed
that Kasparov might at last
prove fallible.

He lost early on to Yusupov.
then bad a string of nonde-
script draws. At half-way. after

eight rounds, he had only 4%
points, well behind the fast

start of Ljubojevic and Nigel
Short’s mid-tournament series
of victories.

Possibly, Kasparov was sick-

ening for the ’flu: in a rare
move, for him, he produced a
medical certificate to postpone
his game with Jon Speelman.
But in the closing rounds the
world champion produced a
classic Kasparov surge, catch-
ing ljubojevic right at the end
when Short and Lubo drew in
10 moves while Kasparov
ground out a win against Boris
Spassky.
Many grandmasters would

have settled for such a recov-

als to find new uses for the 13

“guild" churches created in
1952 to minister to different

occupations: industry and
finance, the police, the unem-
ployed, the Corporation, and so
on. The idea is that they would
be put to semi-secular use: as a
museum, tourist office, confer-

ence hall, training centre,
preaching house or a Christian

computer-information centre.

“It’s the typical loony sort of
thing the Church of England
comes up with when it's on a
loser,” said Ridgeway-Wood.

The Rev Lucas has built up
his congregation over 28 years,

and claims 10 to 15 new follow-
ers a week. “The church has
lost its nerve, by and large.
People find discussions about
whether to be a Christian or
not pall after a bit We do what
the church has been doing for
2,000 years.”

Malcolm Johnson practises

what In Latin America would
be called liberation theology.
His soup-and-soap church
looks after 200 to 300 vagrants
a day, businessmen with prob-
lems, a primary school of 220
children, and homosexuals
afraid to show their faces else-

where. He is paying off a legal

bill of £6,500 resulting from the
action brought last year by tbe
archdeacon, the Ven George
Cassidy, to oust the Lesbian
and Gay Christian Movement
from a room they had occupied
in the church tower for the
previous 12 years.

His struggle with the arch-
deacon has strengthened his
support among his nervous
brethren, who are alarmed by
rumours of diocesan plans to
reduce the City churches’
income from the covenanted
funds of the City Parochial
Foundation. He accepts that
more churches will have to be
“paired," the one becoming
church hall to the other.
“Nobody seems to be able to

come up with a plan,” he said.

“But I don't think it’s any good
tiie hierarchy imposing one.”

Hereward Cooke, rector of St
Edmund the King, describes
himself as in “the middle ofthe
middle-roaders.” He believes

The Rev David Burton Evans, Rector of St Michael's: asking fundamental questions about Wfeafth'

Christianity “has to be worked
out in the crucible of daily
life.” He hopes to make St
Edmund's “the leaven in the
lump of Lombard St.”

T o that end, he
wants permission
to substitute chairs
for pews to make
his church more

“flexible," for exhibitions, a
bookstall, and perhaps the hire
of videotapes on business eth-
ics. “The least popular activity
put on by churches are the ser-

vices,” he says.
But if evangelism is back in

fashion, why not evangelise? “I
would to God He had called me
to do so. Maybe I need to be
transformed and given a new
life. But I am what I am. There
has not been a charismatic
breakthrough in my life."

Although a number of
churches run Sunday services.

religion in the City is really a
weekday lunchtime business.
The last bull market and the
Big Bang blew a hole in atten-

dance figures. Market-makers
ate sandwiches by their com-
puter terminals; they had no
time for lunch, let alone
church. Things have eased
since Black Monday, and job
insecurity and the financial
scandals have driven some
movers and shakers to seek
solace with the clergy.

In the hope of getting closer

to their clients, the clergy are,

perhaps belatedly, discussing
what is known as the theology
of wealth - contained In the

question: is it alright for Chris-
tians to make serious money?
“We are not just sitting on

our backsides eating lunches
or saying grace for livery com-
panies,” said the Rev David
Burton Evans, rector of St
Michael’s, Comhill. “We are

trying to"serve people and ask
them ; fundamental : questions

'

about wealth.” -

Burton Evansget&UO or 40.to-
his Sunday service, but says
his . midweek attendances !gi

“pathetic.” A supporter of the,

Bishop of Durham (and of tbe
ordination of women), he tours
City pubs at lunchtime in his

dog-collar, running the gaunt-
let of ribaldry, or drops in on
the Union Discount Bank or
Guardian' Royal Exchange.

.

He is among those who feel

that the City clergy are getting
a raw deal: the responsibility

of maintaining , historic
.
monu-

ments with the odium of
appearing richer than they
really are. Like others, he is

worried by -the new
archdeacon.
The Ven George Cassidy is

an Ulsterman, a fact which his
critics cite as explanation for

his hard-nosed, traditionalist

"Picture*:Trevor Humpferic,

and litigious style. What does
Jta thinlrof the -City ministry?;

:

“You must have a holistic

"-view,” -he said. “I am not
^against relaxation societies

-arid so on. They -all have a
-validity, but only if the Chris-
tian gospel is being preached
and proclaimed. 1 don’t think
-you preaehthe.gospel through
food or paintings."

He denies that there Is any
blueprint or master plan for

the City churches, but-says
that the diocese is one day
going to have to reduce their

grants In favour of the 450
churches “struggling for sur-
vival” hi tiie rest of tbe, dio-

cese. He described his dergy-
men-critlcs as “paranoid” and
added: “It’s no . use -them kid-

ding themselves that. 35
churches meet ;the. needs of
350,000 commuters every day.
Yuppies don’t .eat lunch."

AFTER THE moderate
1987s, high hopes
have been pinned on
the 1988 clarets. The

summer, although excessively
dry from July onwards, was at
least not wet; but heavy mid-
September sales diluted the

- grapes, and those^ who-jpicked
early may well have made
rather thin wine.
However, the Meriots, ripen-

ing earlier than the Cabernets,
were a great success, although
the Cabemet-Sauvlgnons were
not completely ripe early in
October when further rain
occurred. The Cabernet-Francs,
which occupy a rather subsid-
iary role in the blends (save in
St Emilion and Pomerot), were
exceptionally ripe. The growers
who waited until about the
10th before picking their
Cabemet-Sauvignons - and
later poured off some of the
juice in the vats to secure
greater concentration - made
excellent wine. The weather
remained remarkably good-
throughout the autumn

,
result-

ing in very fine Sautemes.
The 3.65m hi appellation

Control&e vintage was only a
whisker shorter than the previ-
ous year's, but a good deal
smaller than the record ’85 and
’88, with 3£m hi and 4J5m hi
respectively.

The widely recognised suc-
cess of the Meriots and the ear-

lier expressed doubts about the
Cabemet-Sauvignons has led
some people to call 1988 a
"Merlot year", as were, for
example, ’82 and to some
extent ’85, while '86 was a
“Cabernet year”. But 1988 Is

not so simple, for. though good
wines were made in St Emilion
and Poraerol. where Merlot
usually predominates - and
not least by those with a good
proportion of Cabernets - in
general it would seem that the
Medocs may turn out best,
while the red Graves already
have a specially good reputa-

Wine

Keep an eye on Medoc ’

ttan— /.o-.',.-

One result.'p£ ?tfeeS«»nmfBg-,
drought-.-.,waav^uglivskmsii
which mean strong tannins/
and the 1988 clarets, are very
tannic. These days tannins are
almost dogmatically divided
into “good" and “bad", and the
’88 variety is claimed to be
“good". Maybe, but at present
they are very tough and this
makes tasting even more diffi-

cult than usual for wines a
bare six months old.

The most comprehensive
tasting for a small group of
European wine-writers was
organised recently • by the
Union des Grands Crus, headed
by Peter Sichel of Palmer and
Angludet and representing 120
leading growths, but not some
others, such as Mouton, Cos
cfEstoumel and Leoville-Las- -

Cases. In the Medoc, St Emi-
lion and the Graves four tastr

ings of a total of 100 wines
were shown - an of them, of
course, in cask sample that
are often likely to vary. Unfor-
tunately, in a week that fur-
ther north had snow falls,

some of the wines were exceed-
ingly cold in the chais (cellars).

In addition, I sampled at least
another 200 wines and thus
had an extensive view of the
vintage at this stage.

That' the vintage is a good
one is without doubt, but I met
none who suggested that it was
great. The unresolved question
- and this may take some
time to answer - is whether
the wines have enough fat and
fruit to balance the tanning
and the acidity that helps to
keep the wine. Another diffi-

cult question is when at least
the superior wines will be rea-
sonably drinkable. Nearly all

have exceptionaUydeep colour,
more -qpeh.-pf them

JISe^fFuj^ amvaf^his stage

oaky, bouquets. Currently they
are somewhat “ungenerous",
and in my recollection more so
than the also very, tannic ’86s

at the same period; but these
had more character and per-

ceptible fruit.

As to the likely level of
prices, few of the “nobility"
have produced their opening
offers, although Mouton-Roths-
chfld and Haut-Brion have
come out at Ffrl80 a bottle ex-

M .... 4
'

Chess
ery - 6% out of the last eight
- but Kasparov is a perfection-
ist. His reaction was to com-
plain that Short, with the
white pieces, should have
made more effort. Indeed,
Short faded disappointingly at
the end but still achieved his
best result so far in the World
Cup series.

The finish saw Kasparov and
Ljubojevic 11/16, Salov 10,
Korchnoi 9%, Short and Hub-
ner 9, and Speelman 13th on
seven points. At Amsterdam a
few weeks earlier, Short had
finished second to Timman but
in front of Salov. He is possibly
just about holding his status as
world number three, but it
seems to be a struggle and he
is not reducing the 100-point
gap in ratings that separates
him from Kasparov and Kar-
pov.
Alter Amsterdam and Barce-

lona, Timman has to be the
favourite to win his world
semi-final against Speelman,

scheduled to be played
1

in Lon-
don in October. It might not
matter too much, since Speel-
man prefers psychologically to
be regarded as the underdog
and, in his two previous
matches, he exploited shrewdly
the over-confidence of Seira-
wan and Short But the impres-
sion grows that if Speelman
gets as for as Karpov or Kaspa-
rov in the match series, he is

likely to be crushed.
This week's game looks a

bad omen: Speelman weakens
his K-side at moves 8-9, has to
castle Q-side into Kasparov’s
combined piece attack, and
succumbs to a flurry of tactics.
White: G. Kasparov (USSR).
Black: J. S. Speelman

(England).

Modem Defence (Barcelona
1989).

1 P-Q4, P-Q3; 2 P-K4. P-KN3;
3P-QB4, P-K4; 4 N-KB3, PxP-, 5
NxP, B-N2; 6 N-QB3, N-QB3; 7
B-K3, KN-K2; 8 P-KB4, P-KR3?

Better O-O, although Black

cellars. This was their price in
,-1986 and the other first-

growths are expected to follow
at the same figure, except for
Ausone - its tiny production
results in a slightly higher
price. There is every indication
that prices generally will be on
the 1986 leveL
Among a few internationally

known chateaux that had
already offered their wine,
with the 1986 figures in brack-
ets, are the following in French
francs per bottle: Haut-Bailly
60 (62), La Lagune 52 (54).
Lafon-Rochet 43.(40), Chasse-
Spleen 45 (40) Lanessan 36 (30)
and Palmer 105 (105 -

still has to face a heavy attack
by 9 P-R5. ejg. P-B4? 10 RPxP,
RPxP?? li P-B5 threatening
B-B4 ch. Black’s opening sys-
tem was worked out by Jona-
than Mestel in the mid-1970s,
but Kasparov's treatment is
distinctly stronger than P-Q5
or QPxKP chosen by many of
Msstel’s opponents.

9 B-K2, P-B4; 10 PxP, NxP;
11 NxKN, BxN; 12 Q-Q2.
13 O-O, O-O-O; 14 P-QN41 NxP;
15 N-N5.

*

With several vulnerable
squares round the black king
- QR2, QN2, QB3 - White can
invest a full rook in the search
for a mating attack.

15 ... N-B7; 16 B-B3, P-Q4; 17
BxQP, NxR; 18 NxP ch, K-Nl:
19 Q-N4, QxB.

A desperate gesture to take
the game past 20 moves, but
already there is no defence. If
19 ... P-B3; 20 B-B4 ch, KxN; 21
Q-R5 mate, or IS ~ p-NS; 20
BxNP.

20 PXQ, N-B7; 21 Q-H5, NxB;
22 PxN, KE-Kl; . 23 N-N5,

although, this, tea ^slightly
hypsShftiqfbJiriFfens
toiSW. ivonly^twiumer-
chants, whose; price is Ffrl28).

Many of the wines available
have - offered; only the same
quantity, as they did of. the
minimally-bought ’87s.

Cautious opening gambits
have led to market demands
that have caused supplies to

run out after, a few hours:
sometimes .without enabling
the merchants to taste the
wines. There are also

. indica-
tions that the Bordeaux mer-
chants, to compensate for the
poorly-sold *878. may be expect-
ing large margins on.what are
no more than brokerage
operations, as they did with
the 1985s following the unsold
*84s. Another factor is that for
the first time since 1986 consid-
erable interest is being
reported for the 1988s in the
US, helped by the partial recov-
ery in the dollar, which may
enable US buyers to obtain
them at prices not far off those
they paid for the '86s,
neglected there at first but now
esteemed.

Accordingly, when such pop-
ular properties as Cos d’Es-
toumeL Ducru-Beaucaillou,
Bynch-Bages and Pichon Lal-
ande come out shortly, their
offers are likely to be gobbled
up swiftly, followed by second
tranches at higher prices. But
will buyers- accept these for a
vintage with an as yet unre-
solved reputation?

It is impossible here to
describe in any detail those
wines that I and, in discus-
sions, some of my companions
picked out Moreover, 1 did not
taste some of the “names”,
such as La Mission-Haut-Brion

SxQP; 24 QxP ch, K-Rl; 25
Q-RG ch, Resigns.

PROBLEM No. 770

BLACK 7 MEN

«o

r , . .. ii J
WHITE 9 MEN

M. Hebden v.M. Basman.
City of London Open 1979.:
Some of the most interesting
tournament games occur when
both sides think they are win-
ning. Cl this diagram. White
(to play) was optimistic about,
his two extra pawns and rook
on the seventh, while Black
counted on his threats of RxB
BxP and R0.VR1;

.

or Trotannoy, while many .of

the Graves at the Gnand Cru
tasting were impossibly ,

cold
for me to Judge. Here, however,
is a short list of..some of. the
mere important wines that I

liked::-.

'• St SstfcpherXtos d’Esfoixrael
fparticularly ^fehJ.Mbhterose,
Calm^segTAf.'-7 -

Pauillac: Lafite (very fruity),

Latour, Moaton-RothschUd
(though not showing very
well), : Mouton Baronne-Phi-
lippe, Duhart-Milon, Lynch-
Bages, Haut-Batailley. Grand-
Puy-Lacoste, Pichon^- Baron
(greatly improved, and pre-
ferred by some to Pichon-Lal-
ande though that was excellent
too). _

St Julien: Ldoville-Barton,
Langoa, Gruaud-Larose, Duc-
ru-Beaucaillou (very closed),
Beychevefle (full-flavoured).
Margamc Ch. Margaux' (per-

haps the best first-growth),
Brane-Cahtenac, Issan, Palmer,
Rausan-Sdgla, Le Prieure, Mon-
brisan. -

'

Haut-Medbc: Cantemerle.
Malescases, Beaumont, Pou-
Jeaux, Sendjae.

Graves:’ Haut-brlon (plenty
of fruit). Pape-Clement, Haut
Bailly, Domaine de Chevalier,
Fleuzal, Malartique-Lagravibre.
St Emilion: Cheval-Blanc

(outstanding), Figeac, Ausone
(very pow.erftti, Magdelaine,
Canon,, Canon,-La-Gaffe lie re,
Clos Fourtet (lighter), Franc-
Mayne, Balestade-la-Tonnelle.
Larmande.

,

' ’

PomeroL- P&tnis (very d^ep-
cotoured and concentrated),
L&vangile, La Fleur-Petrus. la
Croix de Gay, Gazin, L’Enclos.
Fronsac: Canon-de-Brem, Vil-

lars, Dalem, Mazeris, Mazeps-
Bellevue, La Truffidre. Moulin-W Labrie, Moulln-Haut-Laro-
que, CoustoELe, Gagnard.

.
Edmund

r Penning-Rowsell

Both players are interna-
tional masters; who was right?
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HOW TO SPEND IT

Lucia van der Post looks at workplacefurniture, a British dishwasher and some Lutyens’ designs

That office

feeling in
your home

mm
F x>, .V

T here seem to be
two completely con-'
trary trends In today’s
workplace. On the one

hand some sections of the
working population are
extracting better and better
lahoOr deals and spending less
epuL-.less -time at work so that
30’ a?id 35-hour weeks are a
raality in some industries. But
1$er& are also those tor whom
7b^- and 8&-hour weeks are
becoming '.almost standard.
These are people for whom the
'Site' between work and real life

Utmost nan-existent - work
andthe test of their lives spill

over Into each other almost
firftffcHngirfsfmhTy

,

It b these people that Rosen-
thal; the German ceramic and
fiualture company, had its eye
on when it commissioned Cmi
Boeri, the distinguished Italian
architect and designer, to
design a range of furniture
that would look equally at ease
in the home or the office, it

had to combine all the func-
tions of office furniture with

the individuality and visual
appeal of furniture that the
same people might want in
their home. In other words it

had to be furniture that
enabled them to do serious
work but that offered, as the
French say, "quelque chose
pour I’oeH”, a little something
for the soul and the spirit, too.
To Cini Boeri this was

exactly the kind of challenge
she likes. "So often, companies
ask too little of their designers.
They -

just ask for a product
that fulfils an image - I like to

- to give them much more *haq
that, to combine function and •

image all In one piece."
Cini Boeri’s trademark is a

calm elegance. There is noth-
ing fashionable or overly asser-
tive about her furniture. At
first they might look exceed-
ingly simple. Look a little fur-

ther and the innate sophistica-
tion of the designs becomes
apparent An apparently dead
plain table-top is actually a
very subtle inverted pyramid.
Fine materials, whether wood

mi
. -
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Zmv Aram, of Aram Design, with some of Cbd BoerTs newest designs

or glass or. aluminium, are quality.” A look at her pte***, tion.
finely finished so that the final splendidly laid out in the great of wi
effect is actually quite sumptu-
ous in spite of its apparent sim-
plicity.

Cini Boeri likes to design
pieces that are happy to play a
supporting role. “People should
be the main protagonists in a
room, not the furniture,” is

how she puts it *T like to make
pieces that give rest and tran-

quillity ” A look at her pieces,

splendidly laid out in the great
white spaces of Aram Designs,

3 Kean Street, London WC2
confirms that these are indeed
pieces that many people could
live' with, restfoily and tran-

quilly, for years.

The most magnificent of all

the pieces, to my mind, is the
majestically simple conference
tjihift, from the Prisma collec-

tion. The table pedestals can be
of wood or marble, the pyra-
mid-based top of dark wood.
But there is also the Ypsilon
range, all based on the use of
the Y formation as the basic
structural element. Onto the Y,
or the double Y, are put a vari-

ety of tops
Needless to say, this collec-

tion is not cheap. It is not fash-

ionable furniture designed for

Trust Britain to

keep it clean
TO THOSE of ns accustomed
to thinking of the dishwasher
as an everyday tool, a piece

of essential machinery In the
Hie of late 20th century
Western man, it might come
as something of a surprise to
be told that once upon a time
the dishwasher was a strange,

exotic piece of machinery,
quite unnecessary In any
well-adjusted, hardworking
household. To desire one, way
back in those early days,

seemed a bit decadent - the
sort of toy those spoilt

Americans hankered after but
not at all the thing for
respectable Brits.

The first dishwasher. I

learned this week from one
of Hoover’s team of MI men
who used to have to seB them,
came to theseshores via New
<S4a2aad

;
ta J9&2 and . . -

apparently It thenseemed at-

least #s alien as the kiwi fruit.

That first year they sold 2,000
machines at 89 guineas a time
- mainly to the the grandest
of states and the grandest of

homes,
Since then selling

dUmasberv has been nothing
but Hood, sweat and tears-

It has taken 37 years to get

a dishwasher into 10 per cent
of homes. Sates have been so
disappointing over the years
that one manufacturer after

Mother has either moved into

rage profitable businesses
or amalgamated with other
makers - until finally we
reached the stage when there

wasn’t a single British
dishwasher on the market.
However, there is good news

insight Dishwasher sales are

beginning to pick up - sales

have doubled over the hut six

years and are set to double
again by the mid-nineties. In

France 25 per cent of families

NEXT TIME you eat

in a good restaurant,

spare a thought for

the pastrycooks. A
good pastrycook Is to a suc-

cessful kitchen brigade what a

first-class goalkeeper is to a
championship-winning side.

Indispensable at the best of
times, the pastry section will

get very little of the praise

when any meal is reviewed,
and yet is in a position to let

down the whole restaurant
through undercooked bread,

soggy pastry and poorly pres-

ented desserts.

in addition, the pastry sec-

tion tends to work in isolation

from the main part of the

kitchen and to work even more
unsocial hours than other

chefs. In Britain, a pastry

chefs lot is not a happy one.

Despite the recent improve-

ments in kitchen technology,

the essential requirements for

a good pastry section have
remained the same - plenty of

space to roll out pastry in a

ST. JOSEPH’S
HOSPICE
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have a dishwasher while in
West Germany the figure rises

to SO per cent With all this

in mind Hoover this week
launched the first completely

.

British-made mnrhim* since
the demise of the
dear-departed Colston.
As anybody who follows

these things knows, in recent
years dishwashers have come
from Germany and Italy, from
Spain and France - anywhere
but Britain. The disappearance
of the British dishwasher from
the market was just one part
of a long sad story that lies

behind some depressing
statistics. In 1970 some 18 per
emit ofmanufactured good
solds in this country were
imported, today it is36 per
cent. Sad though these
atatlstlcs are, and welcome
though a dishwashermade
to Merthyr Tydfil undoubtedly
is. Hoover would be the first

to agree that we cannot he
expected to buy the machine
on those grounds alone. So
how does it actually perform?

I haven't bad time or
opportunity to put it through
the only test that really counts
- years ofhonest servicem
a robust household - but it

comes with some splendid
credentials. There are two
models, the Crystaljet and
Super Crystafiet, selling at

£320 and £350 which compare
well in price with their rivals.

They are extremely quiet to
run, come with sophisticated

programmes, including one
of the most essential of all,

to my view, the built-in

adjustable wafer softener, and
are backed by a free, five-year

parts guarantee. They are

going Into good electrical

departments all over the
country over the next few
weeks.

Eating out

The unsung kitchen heroes
Nick Lander discusses the unhappy lot of the pastrycook

relatively cool area, free from
.excessive humidity to allow

the pastry to breathe, and time

In which to allow a range of

delights to come to life.

In any kitchen, therefore, the

pastry section is always tucked

away in a corner furthest from

the stoves, usually without any
natural light. Normally, the

pastry section starts at least an
hour before the other chefs

when,the kitchen is at its cool-

lest, yot is fulfilling the last

dessert orders when the rest of

the kitchen is tidying op or has

rone home. After all, we do

want our bread at the begin-

ning and our desserts at the

end of the meal. -

These conditions of employ-

ment have made pastrycooks a

xacg apart Above aB, a -good

teurs, .finding good pastry-

cooks, and holding on to them,
is a major managerial problem.
The art and profession of the

pastrycook is one of the oldest:

ancient Egyptian patisserie

included maize panrakes. The
real impetus came with the
return of the Crusaders, who
discovered sugar cane and puff
pastry in the Middle Bast and
brought it back to Europe
where orders of master patis-

siers were established by the
15th century in France.

Strict guidelines as to qual-

ity were laid down and no
worker could be taken on
unless he could make 1,000

nieules (small Flemish cakes) a
day. The profession reached its

peak ia the hkh century under
Careme, and today there are

fborcoaoera basencmw
m yourstowtokf and vre ti

yeefra trust

SxkrSaptnat

love of the material he works

with. After that, like a must

cUn, he needs practice and

dedication. But because they

tend to be loners, good pastry-

cooks need to be left atone to

produce their very best Head

Sw* who arc usually not

trained iuuy a&
tewt-unless interested passion-

ately, to leave this section to

it2

Wben it is not working well,W cbefc may well buy to

their pastry and desserts from

outsidT - ^ option they

vwujid not consider with th«r

meat or fish dishes- For heed

chefe and would-be restauran-

pastxycooks to France alone.

Such enthusiasm never
reached Britain, and over the

centuries the gulf has widened:

there are no grand teaching
establishments in Great
Britain to match Lendtre in

France, Funk-keisser in Ger-

which teaches nothing but
“sugar-work."

Religion, too. has played its

part, with the Roman Catholic

Church providing not only a
plethora of holy days and holi-

days as creative excases for

the patissiers’ art but also by
stipulating certain non-meat
days, , thus providing an outlet

for savoury and sweet tarts
arid flans.

to feet, John Huber, the man
who has done more than any-
one to train pastrycooks in

Britain to match those on the
Continent, carried Ms mother’s
pastry and fillings to the local

bakery on his way to school on
such non-meat days during his
Swiss childhood. Huber is now
the doyen of British patisserie

as principal lecturer In patis-

serie' studies at Thames Valley
College, Slough - a position

he created for himself.

He cane to England to 1958

as part of a barter deal with J.

Lyons' Strand Corner House;
he and three other young
Swiss would set up a Swiss
patisserie and be taught
English to mum. Despite ini-

Mnl muiMiu Mia hilw)

While his colleagues returned

home Huber, fortunately,

stayed, first within the Lyons
empire perfecting nolle feuilles

for Marks and Spencer in 1968,

and since then at Slough.

In 1973. he created the first

British advanced one-year

European model, and this has
now become a two-year course

with both parts involving a
six-hour practical exam.
Among Ms successes, Huber
dies Patrick Clark, a Welsh-

man who now has a thriving
hiigiimgg in Switzerland.

While aware of the progress

made so far, Huber is not too

optimistic for the future.
Although the quality of the
food we eat has improved dra-

matically. be does not believe

that as a nation Britain is pre-

pared to pay for top quality
patisserie - which, at its best,

involves expensive ingredients,

top artisans and has a very
short shelf life.

Too often he has seen good
patisserie shops open, start
well, and then see their custom
fall away as others move to
with larger and inferior imita-

tions at lower prices. Soon, he
fears, it may be only the large

hotels that can afford the nec-
essary equipment (a depositor

for making sponge sheets, as in

a Swiss roll, now costs £16,000)

and be able to spread the
wages of a large pastry section
/pin/l AM in nnn Ufae» Cni*

hotel) over the breakfast, lunch
and dinner services. His
favourite patisserie is to be
found in the coffee shop at the
intercontinental HoteL
John Huber has two other

fears. The first is that we still

view catering as a career only

career of the pastrycook is still

seen as the easiest option
within the catering industry.

This is in marked contrast to

Germany, where you cannot
start an apprenticeship in
patisserie without the equiva-

lent of GCSE. The second fear

is even more basic: that the

courses he has worked so hard

Lutyens
revived
CANDIA LUTYENS has spent the
last three years boning op on the
work of her grandfather. Sir Edwin
Lutyens. His grand and beautiful
buildings are rather better known
than the ranges of furniture he
designed to put in them. Candia
has resurrected some of her grand-
father's designs that she was par-

ticularly fond of or that she felt

were appropriate for today's less

commodious houses.
She had to have some of her

favourite designs made from draw-
ings among toe vast number her
father gave to the Royal Institute

of British Architects* drawings col-

lection as sometimes there were no
examples extant. As yet there isn't

a coherent range, more a disparate
collection of her favourites.

There is toe Pall Mall Writing
Chair, originally designed and
made to 1931 for 120 Pall MalL the
showroom and offices of Crane Ben-
nett, a maker of top quality baths
and plumbing. The chair itself has
a curved walnut and cane back
with an upholstered leather seat.

Photographed (left) is Candia sit-

ting to a dining chair, one of a set

of 10, originally designed for the
120 Pall Mall boardroom. Made
from walnut, with a fretted back
and a drop-in cane seat, they are
hand-made which accounts for the
£2,400 price.

Once again the original pieces
had been lost and the table and
chairs have had to be faithfully
reconstructed from drawings. Per-
sonally I find the dining-table and
matching chairs a little bit too
much, certainly for modern domes-
tic tastes, bnt the writing chair and
the single dining chairs have a
strong and distinctive personality.

All the 120 Pall Mall furniture
being made by Lntyens Associates
Is on show at the moment at 120
Pall MalL Enquiries can also be
made to Lntyens Design Associates,

11 Redcliffe Place, London. SW10
9DB. (tet 01-352-4579).

to create could soon be
stripped of all their practical

content on cost grounds. At
this, he throws his hands in

their air. “How, after all can
you make good pastry,” he
says, “without getting your
hanrts dirty?"

This maxim has been proven
only too true by Michael
Nadell and his wife in their
patisserie “factory” in Isling-

ton, north London. After an
arduous training, the Nadelis
set up their own business five

years ago and their top quality
output is now 94)00 individual
desserts and 5,000 croissants
and brioches a day. Most of
this goes to restaurants, hotels
and tea rooms in the south, but
now he has a distributor in the
Midlands as well as a growing
business for dinner parties and
private customers (telephone
orders only. 01-833-2461).

Nadell believes that toe rise

of the supermarkets was
responsible for the demise of
many traditional British bak-
ers and their skills, and is try-

ing personally to turn the tide.

He set up the InterContinen-
tal's pastry section and now
works a 15-hour dav himself.

which obviously inspires his

staff of 50
When anyone is lucky

enough to be taken on chez

Nadell they have to agree to

stay a minimum of three years,

spending four months on each
ofMs nine sections. His flavour-

fliftn

own, is Maison Bouquillon, 41

Moscow Road, London W2 (teL

01-727-4897).

As our outlook on food
becomes more cosmopolitan,
we should not forget the pas-

trycook. It would be a great

pity to eat only apple crumble
and bread and butter pudding,
however good they are.

Food for Thought

More macho
than a

mere melon

Tooy Aadm

temporary needs. They are
great classic pieces, designed
to work and to give pleasure
for years. Anybody with a new
office to furnish should make a
point of looking at the collec-

tion at Aram Designs. The
glass tables start at £994, the
plain white desk from £3316
and toe majestic conference
table, large enough to seat 12
in comfort, starts at £4328.

PERHAPS YOUR experience
of Spanish food has been like

mine till now: an occasional

holiday on the Costa del
something with the sort of

hotel food that hotel
proprietors can be sure
English. German and Swedes
will put up with on a very hot
day. Strong emphasis on
tomatoes, lettuce and melon
with occasionally a slice of

fried hake or, for local colour,

a bowl of gazpacho without
too much garlic. For feast
days, paella.

Now. nobody supposes that
the Spanish live like that all

the tune; after all, they do have
quite severe winters, what
with the mountains and
everything: and you hardly
expect them to be vegetarians.

In my restless desire to

penetrate these mysteries and
leave no dish untasted, I have
just undertaken a brief tour
of Spain. I took in a great loop
through Barcelona, Valencia,
Alicante and Murcia to

Granada, Cordoba, Seville and
Jerez, then up to Salamanca,
Burgos and San Sebastian.
Madrid, in the middle of the
loop, got missed, but I have
bran there before.

I ate not a lot of meat, not
because it was not on offer,

but because a grilled lamb
chop tastes pretty similar the
world over. I did, however, eat

a lot of eggs. High-class "raff”

food is on most menus and
fried eggs go with most things.

At the end of March, asparagus
was in season, not toe green
kind that is grown in Spain
to be eaten here, but toe
purplish-wMte eat-me-all kind
that is in favour everywhere
else; exceptionally good with
fried eggs and with chorizo
too. Even in quite smart
restaurants this sort of
Inter-city slzzler food is

available and presumably
ordered.
Another feature wMch

cropped up widely is the dish
of a vegetable seasoned with
a small amount of meat or fish.

Green beans or artichoke
hearts are tossed in olive oil

(sometimes in lard. I guess)
with little bits of raw bam.
This is exceptionally good,
although it was beaten, in my
view, by a dish of potatoes:
parboiled, I imagine, before
being sauteed in hot fat with
a few small clams and a little

bit of boiled salmon. This kind
of cooking gives you all the
taste of clams and salmon
while eating a plate of
potatoes. “The cuisine of
poverty,” some might say. but
every bit as good to eat as the
cuisine of affluence any day.
These simple combinations
are at the heart of Spanish
cooking as they are of Italian,

and make French food seem
rather fussed by comparison.

It is the season for elvers

to come struggling up the
estuaries. This time last year
I ate some in Brussels and
made a dim resolution to try

this year to get down to

Gloucester market, which is,

I understand, the only place
in England they are to be had.
Well. I didn’t get to Gloucester
so I had to make do with
Cordoba, where I had a dish
of Anguilas Pil-pil, or elvers

in garlic. So popular are these
little thread-like creatures in
Spain that they are fanned
an over the place.

1 saw them on many menus
across a wide area of Spain

but was fortunate enougb to

have them in what has
instantly become one of my
favourite restaurants in the
world, it is one of those places

with a central patio. There is

a canvas awning over the top
to keep the sun off the
customers. This does not

prevent several large trees

from growing, and the airy,
underwater effect is

remarkable. The waiters are
exceptionally nice and - quite
apart from the elvers - there
is a good and varied menu.
Next time you feel like a long
drive to lunch, why not try
Cordoba?

1 knew, as I imagine
everyone does, about tapas.
The Spanish eat their dinner
so late that the tapas habit

is needed to keep you going
through the evening, so every
bar - and there are a lot of

bars - has its row of dishes
along the counter. Away from
the sea toe selection can be
pretty weird. In a bar in a
village in the Extremadura
I ordered something rather

unquestioningly with a vague
wave of the hand. What 1 got

was a slice of cold, fried

sweetbread between two halves
of a dry roll, fastened with a
toothpick. I have eaten much
worse things, and not just in

toe Army or at school.
Spanish olives are really

something. I have visited the
groves of Lucca in Tuscany
and the rather more modest
groves of Provence, but
nothing had prepared me for

the thousands of acres of them
stretching away to the
shimmering horizon in

Andalusia. The volume
produced must be prodigious.

Ask for olives in a bar, no
matter how modest, and they
bring you a large bowl, green
and black all mixed up
together, some with the leaves
still on, and fragrant with
garlic.

For what it’s worth I ended
up thinking that Spanish food
is pretty masculine, by which
I don’t mean that it is food for
men. Food has its own gender
and men and women may like

feminine or masculine food
quite indiscriminately. The
nouvelle cuisine as practised
in England and America is

definitely feminine, with its

little mounds of green puree,
its pretty little knots of salad
greens and its puddles of
coloured sauce, and in taste
its rather elusive quality is

definitely feminimv
Spanish food, though by no

means all parts of the bull,

is something else altogether.
Real men. they say, don’t eat
quiche. And neither do
Spaniards; no, nor pasta either,
although like every other
nation on earth they are not
averse to pizza.

Peter Lewis

JBL
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Berlin after

Karajan

TT HE DAT when Her-
bert von Karajan
would no more con-
duct the Berlin Phil-

harmonic Orchestra has long
been anticipated bnt no-one
expected It to arrive quite so
abruptly, m his terse letter of
resignation - handed to the
Berlin Culture senator. Mrs
Alike Martiny in Salzburg on
Monday - Karajan, 81, said
his decision had been taken
mainly for medical reasons.
Anyone who has seen him
struggling to reach the
podium in recent months must
realise that his appearances
are a triumph of will over crip-

pling physical disabilities, the
legacy of a stroke, falling
vision, circulatory problems
and spinal surgery.
Bnt his letter also blamed

the Berlin authorities for fail-

ing to clarify his contractual
rights and responsibilities. To
most, this was a smoke-screen
enabling Karajan to blame
everyone but himself for the
growing tension in his rela-
tions with the orchestra.

It was Karajan who, in Jan-
uary, decided to limit his
appearances in Berlin to six

per season in an apparent
move to conserve his energies
for projects elsewhere. Kara-
jan further antagonised the
orchestra by going off on tour
to New York in February with
its main rival, the Vienna
Philharmonic. Karajan's con-
certs In Salzburg last month
did nothing bnt add weight to
accusations that he has been
advancing his own and busi-
ness partners' Interests on the
back of the BPO's £6m subsidy
from the West German tax-
payer; in recent months he has
refused to meet the orchestra's
representatives to discnss
their misgivings. It was hardly
surprising, therefore, that
even moderate members of the
orchestra had begun to call for
him to step down.
But none expected him to

resign with immediate effect
His decision to do so has
undoubtedly cleared the air. It
leaves Karajan free to concen-
trate his remaining energies
closer to home In Salzburg,
where he is preparing a new
production of Dn ballo in mas-
dura for this summer’s festi-

val. It pnts him in a position
where he may be able to influ-

ence the choice of his succes-
sor. And he has pat the orches-
tra in a position where its
representatives are now run-
ning to Salzburg to plead with
him to return as an honoured
guest. Like all the shrewdest
political operators, Karajan is

dictating the pace of events.
For the orchestra, his resig-

nation creates as many prob-

lems as it solves. The immedi-
ate task is to find a
replacement for next week's
concerts in Berlin. The choice
of a successor will test the
orchestra’s unity and judg-
ment. for the musicians hold
widely-differing views on the
leading contenders. There will

be no snap decision. Lengthy
consultations in coming weeks
will result in a vote, probably
in June or July, bnt it may be
another two years before the
designated successor is free to

assume his new responsibili-

ties. The orchestra’s brashes
with Karajan in recent years
mean the title of conductor-
for-llfe will now be quietly
buried. Whoever is chosen will

be unlikely to match Karajan’s
technical perfection, authori-
tarian control or financial
clout
Most of the names that have

been bandied about as possible
successors can be quickly dis-
counted. The only German
worth considering is Carlos
Kleiber, but be has no reper-
toire. Daniel Barenboim and
Bernard Haitink might be
capable of sustaining the
orchestra's traditions, bnt nei-

ther sets the orchestra alight
and Barenboim has just com-
mitted himself to Chicago.
Seiji Ozawa, a Karajan favour-
ite, does not command suffi-

cient respect in the German
repertoire. Glulini is too old,

Bychkov and Battle too young.
That limits the field to three

serious contenders: Lorin Maa-
zel has the advantage of being
free of other commitments, but
he is regarded with suspicion
because of his calculating
image. Riccardo Muti, whose
standing in Berlin rose consid-
erably after a triumphant
series of concerts this season,
is the most visually exciting
conductor - but his refusal to
speak German to the orchestra
represents a huge psychologi-
cal barrier. James Levine is

extremely popular with the
musicians and enjoys the
incalculable advantage of
being the leading protege of
Ronald Wilford, head of the
powerful New York-based Col-
umbia Artists agency and a
long-standing Karajan busi-
ness associate. But Levine
does not have the same stature
as his rivals.

Last summer, Karajan
resigned equally abruptly
from the organising committee
of the Salzburg festival, but he
remains, the dominating per-_

.

sonality. There is no doubt
that, despite this week's devel-
opments, Karajan’s influence
will continue to haunt the Ber-
lin Philharmonic.

Andrew Clark
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Buon giorno, mein Freund,
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Opera Now est un

French,
touveau journal d'opera, niet?
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It covers everything
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to do with opera

OPERA,
in witty, incisive and

in plain
engaging English.

For details of advertising

within the Arts Pages
Please contact

Julia Carrick 873 4664
Alison Nunn 873 3168
Jane-Emma Peerles 873 4064

Musical
with a
message
Antony Thorncroft
discusses Mass Carib

Anyone anxious to see the
Arts Council In action should
pop along to Mass Carib, a black
musical, which is touring the

country, currently resting, not too com-
fortably. at the Hackney Empire and pro-
ceeding to Liverpool, Brighton, and then
remorselessly north again.
The Council has put £200.000 of our

money into Moss Carib, Its largest ever
investment in a production, and you can
see why. For once the popular and artistic

aspirations of the Council have found a
common cause. Mass Carib was initially

commissioned from Felix Cross by the
Albany Empire, a community arts centre
in deprived Deptford, thanks to an Arts
Council grant. It was a success.
Building on that, the money was found

for a grand tour, 30 strong with singers,

dancers, soloists and musicians. The good
Intention was to trail it round cities with
large black communities, communities not
traditionally caught in the Arts Council’s
net. So there it is: Mass Carib - artisti-

cally ambitious, impeccably liberal in sen-

timent, and reaching the parts most Coun-
cil activities barely touch. No wonder the
Minister for the Arts, Mr Richard Luce,
was at hand to share a rum punch at the
launch.
Mass Carib is an intense two hours,

encapsulating the history of the African
slaves in tha Caribbean through music.
The device is simple and affecting. A
group of islanders about to emigrate to

England in the early 1950’s pays a bitter

memorial to their captive past in West
Indies in the form of a mass, a mass shot
through by the two religions that have
dominated their culture - the smothered
gods of Africa, submerged but not forgot-

ten in the westward transportation, and
the Christian God, who, through indentifi-

cation with the Jews in Egypt, became
their talisman in their enforced homeland.
The Mass follows the Latin form -

Kyrie. Gloria, Agnus Del - but embraces
African influences, musical, religious, lin-

guistic. And it also incorporates a stray -
an African shaman converts to Christian-

ity while his wife clings to the old religion

and is sacrificed for her laith during a
slaves uprising against the colonial mas-
ters. Christian parallels run alongside the
theme of exodus, from Africa to the West
Indies, and now back to the country of the
original slave traders. The most telling

moment is the encore when the cast walks
to the front of the stage waving disconso-

lately their British passports.

Felix Cross is ambitious in his music:
there is no facile reliance on reggae or
even gospel to make the impact This is

stronger stuff, punched home with quite
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King's College Londito, where
he devoted himself to the per-

fection of the electric tele-

graph. On the way he dabbled
th developing, electromagnetic \

clocks, typewriters, and harp
lutes.

On Friday Sotheby's is offer-

ing almost 40 items - patent'
models, inventions, research
apparatus, prototype?, etc
from Wheatstone's private lab-

oratory. It would be stretching

'

the truth to claim' that this

opens up an Aladdin's cave of
scteotiflc treasures. The collec-

tion has been picked over in
the past by such worthy insti-

tutions as the Science Museum
and the Smithsonian in Wash-
ington. But, being serious seek-

.

tufted' out, boxes bate * stof-
*"*

lar appeal. But these are fun
objects; attractive presents,

conversational toys.-
* 4 =

Where is the demand for a' :

rare gilt brass nocturnal and^
quadrant, made in Florence in

1527 tn one of the-eariiest Euro- c
pean scientific instrument'' 1

workshops, that of the Volpaia
family? This important ejtan£ : -

pie of early time keeping actu-

'

ally carries the name of the
owner, a Greek priest, in an- ;

inscription, and provides a fas-
1 '

dilating link with the past. It

'

might not be too reliable as a- 1

•watch — squinting through the
hole in the centre at the nnxux ‘

is hot guaranteed to give split

second timing - but as a mil#
era ; after - truth, .they over- , stone -towards the modem age* „

looked such classic . break- it " is surely worth more than
thrqughs. as the Wheatstone. - the £18,000 upper estimated

nail fiddle of.theilMQs and tfc£“' The sale has a good group oT

'

Wheatstone experimental type-7 Italian instruments and"
writer keyboard of around; Jon 1 Baddeley can Justifiably. !

1850: Here Is the jumble ,.o£ &
.

wonder why a Ptolemaic armU- <

great scientists workbench, df lari? - sphere made by- a later.-'-'

fascination to any contempt): Volpaia in 1598, which with its-;

rary: ' inventor, * scientist, ur " whirling circles of gilt bras? is 1 '

social historian.
J

And/being set- as
1 much a work- of 1art as any ;

entiffo insfrumeitte, pribfis aft’ ; Florentine bronze of- thlF

likely to be ridiculously loifr period, should sell for less than
most lots selling for well under ' £20,000 while a bronze of a clas-

£1,000.

This Is one sector nf the
“art” market which has yet to

take off Even Sotheby's spe-

cialist Jan Baddeley admits: “it

sical god might top £200,000.

But until toe number of rich-

collectors in, this, field rises
above the current half a dozen
or so, split between theUS and-

Tony Gouvela: the production Is touring under 0m auspices of ths Arts Council
Is very quietl There is a poor the' continent, scientific inetru-

price track record, just stead?,' meats will remain a peaceful
slow, growth. Scientific fnstru-', backwater. Not' 'that all the'-*

elaborate choral and solo scores, underpin-
ned by drum and guitar rhythms. The
African chants, sung in Yoruba, are the
most powerful, perhaps because the old
gods. Shango and Eshu and Shakpana,
remain the heroes - another case of the
devil having the best tunes.
As a production Mass Carib is a bit ofa

mess, good ideas fighting for expression.
No soloist gets the chance to develop a
coherent character and the choreography
seems unnecessarily cowed. Perhaps the
makeshift character of the Empire stage is

too inhibiting. This is challenging stuff, an
expression of repression rather than the
joie de own exuberance endemic to black
musicals.

Radio

There Is a certain majesty to Teddy
Kiendl’s direction; the boats that play
such a crucial part, taking the blacks to
the Caribbean and thipn to England — are
paper machd models carried on the beads
of actors slowly progressing throughout
the auditorium. The predatory whites,
wearing skeletal masks, and representing
military, religious, and political power,
sing their parts seductively and beauti-
fully from boxes dominating the stage.
There is no happy ending .

Mass Carib will not make any money for
the Arts Council but it is a fine example of
seed com being sown to develop into a
worthy theatrical experience — instruc-

tive, innovative, and quite moving.

?*

meats are under:
and I expect they
be." .

wajrs wBi
objects for sale

1

are academic
dinosaurs: Friday’s auction
includes some of the mosfhbf^'

There is no mystery why: rifle items admitted fo the sale^
this is 60. Few potential collec- room.

‘
:

-

tors are Interested in. such
‘

intricate, technical, obscure
items as a mid lStitcentury
universal equinoctial' ring dial

or a late 18th century ebony
octant. The highest auction

A particular spine tingler is

a set of Savigny dental instru-
ments made In England in the
mid 19th-century. The fact that
the handles to the 16 instru-

ments are in decorativemother
price for a scientific ihStru- " of pearl gives'an extra dimen-
ment is just £380,000 (paid for sfon of terror to the torture;

an early astrolabe) and* the tray, in particular the single
*

only sector of the market to claw tooth-keys which twisted-

'

command reasonable prices is the doomed molar-out with one, j

that turned over by . interior
-
qUick* unanaesthetised, jerk.'

decorators, who are well aware The Set carries a top- estimate
that some lSh .century globes of £2J)0Q.

“
•

' 'r
:

or a smart brass telescope .win. Just as worrying' fir a set- ofv
hiceiyriaic Ara'.jfi'Jtow'-YbikSr. a&fputatiorr' -‘instnnrienta^
apafthfen);- tffEafiJSnkflsh'cam? awanfed-as 4 prizeda sfUdent-
try hotfee^^ ' ?S .

-:
m airthe^Iidy^Sfty of Edlnbltrgfe

Here prices' are ' rising rap- in 185W7. The- mahogany case
-
*

idly. lowed ajccording.to one with its velvet interior bolds a
London dealer In this ; field, '

saw, three knives and a tourni- -

David ' Weston, the. price 'df '
quet, and, as with the dental •

globes has doubled in the’ last set. is a timely reminder of the •

five years. On Wednesday benefits of 20th-century living.

Christie's secured a record auc-. d . __ '

tion price of £104,500 for a pair Antony ihornctoft

an early astrolabe) and* the
only sector of the market to
command reasonable prices is.

that turned over by. interior
decoratoft, who are well aware :.

that some l&h .century globes.’

or a smart brass telescope
,
will

,

nicely1,iaic ;'New"xbrk
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P
ETER Tinniswood
tells us in the Radio
Times how much he
enjoyed writing Win-

ston, the story now going out
on Wednesday lunchtimes on
Radio 4. A lunchtime serial,

Simon Brett’s After Henry, has
been one of the happiest things
I heard this year, and I am
sorry I never managed to say
so in this column; so 1 will
write about this one at once.

Winston, whom his creator
describes as "poacher, scholar,
gentleman, romantic.'' is only
likeable as a fictional inven-
tion. His wife, who objects to
his constant infidelity, has
kicked him out and got herself
"a new bloke." Romantic is a
generous word; his sexual hab-
its are as discourteous as they
are broad.

In the first of six parts, Win-
ston invites himself to live
with the Empson family -
Father, who talks as if in the
forces in wartime India; Wil-
liam. who I suspect will turn
out to be a yuppie; and daugh-
ters Nancy and Rosie. They
cheerfully ask him in as
lodger, servant and workman,
not caring about his scruffi-

ness but hating his dog, who
eats the first chapter of Wil-
liam's book. Winston then tries

to seduce Nancy. She seems
not displeased. But at a family

A talent for comic eccentrics
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conference, they decide that it

will be wrong for him to stay
in the house. They show a
reluctant admiration, but Wil-
liam says “He’s not our sort -
common," and Nancy adds "He
doesn’t belong here." Then in
he comes with a marvellous
dinner an a trolley. What can
happen In the next five instal-

ments? Shall we want to know?
Bill Wallis plays Winston,

Maurice Denham is Father,
Shirley Dixon Nancy, Shaun
MacLoughlin directs, and Peter
Tinniswood is busy on another
series on Thursdays called
Uncle Mori's North Country, in
which he again displays his
singular talent for Inventing
comic eccentrics.

Lunchtime on Thursdays
gives us repeats of King Street
Junior, first heard on Tuesday
evenings. This is no radio
Orange Hill; the action is set
among the staff. Education
being in the news, I wanted to
hear if or how the staff would
be concerned. The only serious
item was a cut of 20 per cent in
the County Hall money. No
one mentioned the national
curriculum. The gift of an elec-
tric guitar to the school by a
local music shop prompted a
Jokey episode in which music
teacher Mrs Rudd and supply
teacher Philip Sims went busk-
ing for school funds. Producer

John Fawcett Wilson kept the
mood light-hearted.

There was more concern for
current affairs in a good
Schools programme that after-

noon, 20 minutes on “The
image of science,” presented by
Heather Cooper. Not a favoura-
ble imagw

,
alas. Of nine high-

school pupils at The Edinburgh
Science Festival, not one
wanted a career in science.

Brian Friel's Making History
(Radio 3 last night) was the
penultimate play in the series,

and very good it was. It tells

the tale of Hugh O’Neill, Earl
of Tyrone, whose loyalties
were unevenly divided between
Queen Elizabeth and the age-
old Gaelic civilisation of
Ireland, and it tells it equably.
O'Neill was not a good man;
the first thing we are told is
that he has kidnapped Mabel
Bagenal, a Protestant, sister of
the Queen's Marshal, to be his
third wife.

Friel is less concerned with
O'Neill's marital morals than
with his political duplicity, but
his main theme is not the pro-
priety of either, only the need
for a truthful record. So we
have Archbishop Lombard
busy on a history, and O'Neill
insistent that he must approve
what is written. O'Neill, with
another disloyal Earl, Tyrcon-
nel. hopes for a fleet and an

army from Spain; when they
come, they are routed at Kin-
sale. O’Neill makes a shameful
submission to Queen Elizabeth,
but lives the rest of his life in
Rome.
The play, which was first

done on the stage by Friel’s

Held Day company and seen in
London at the Hampstead
Theatre, la written In zestful

modem English. It raids with
alternate extracts from Lom-
bard’s flattering biography and
O'Neill’s pathetic confession.
Stephen Rea was superb as
O’Neill, Adrian Dunbar rather
noisy as Tyrconnel, Tony
Doyle deceitfully friendly as
the Archbishop. I couldn’t get
on with Mary Bagenal’s subur-
ban accent. The director was
Jeremy Howe.

B.A. Young
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ARTS

Records

Crespin sets the

standard

ASKED WHICH perfor-
mance I most regret
having missed, I
would not hesitate to

name the concert at which
R6gine Crespin sang Ravel’s
SMMrcoade at the Edinburgh
Festival In the early 1970s. A
colleague who did catch it

described it as unforgettable
singing and added that, on the
climactic B flat in the first
song, the French soprano let

loose the loudest sound he had
ever heard issue from a human
throat
The song-cycle with orches-

tra is a discipline that makes
contrary demands on its per-
formers. In a concert most
singers are so worried about
making themselves heard at all
that they, have time to
think about the words. On
record, by contrast, there is no
problem and so It is good to
report on two new recordings
of-the Ravel cycle this month,
as well as a certain old one.
The first comes as part of the

final instalment in Claudio
Abbado's Ravel

, series with the
London Symphony Orchestra
(DG 427 314-2). The rhythmic
acuteness and scintillating col-

ours that Abbado brings to the
opening work, AJborada del
graciofo. bode well for the
whole disc. -This is orchestral
playing on a high level of
imagination, richly coloured
and

:

recorded with a glorious
amplitude that makes a sonic
showcase of the whole pro-
gramme.
As the LSO’s first oboe lin-

gers seductively over his open-
ing solo, it seems that Shdhira-
zade will be stimulating to the
«miB degree. So it is, too, In

the orchestral department,
where Abbado's keen ear
uncovers a myriad of details

usually lost to the listener. But
the contribution of the soprano
Margaret Price offers pleasure
of a more muted kind, as one
longs for the chaste manner to

be softened by some supple-
ness in the way she speaks the
fgKty.

When Price utters the sug-

gestive invitation "Entre" in
the last song, the tone is quite
wrong. There is no danger of
being, tempted here. Nor Is

there when Barbara Hendricks
sings it on her new disc of

French vocal music (EMI CDC
749688-2). Hie whole of the last

song has been fatally dull with
her, smothered under a doak
of good intentions. If only, one
feds’ the singer would bite into

tterwonisand taka a tew risks.

.

The disappointment is the
greater because, of the singers

under discussion here, Hen-
dricksL probably has the voice

closest to what Ravel intended.

Also, the first couple of songs
had.been promising, delivered
in the right narrative style and
wtth-John Eliot Gardiner and
the Orchestra do lt)p4ra de
Lyon providing decent support.

A group of Duparc melodies
and Ravel's Greek songs,

are lifeless and are not

: by a muffled recording.

BJ" chance Crespin’s own
recording has recently been
issued on CD (Decca 417 813-2)

and -
cannot be ignored. The

reappearance of an old favour-

ite ate this is always liable to

be an invitation to bias and
one' turns to It with some
apprehension. The surprising
thing in this case is just how
much better it really is. From

the opening phrases
voice calls utw a gimn

i
grav-

ing one towards an exotic and
sensual world, of which the
others seem to have no experi-
ence.

Admittedly the playing of
the Orchestra de la Suisse
Romande under Ernest Anser-
met is a deterrent, bat the CD
re-issue ' has .'other advantages
up its -sleeve. In addition to the
old coupling of Berlioz's Nuits
cflefewe have a selection <tf pia-
no-accompanied miladies by
Debussy and Poulenc, ail with
Crespin at her most personal
and voluptuous. Do 1 see Ravel
wagging his finger in disap-
proval? J hope not
The new recording of Mah-

ler’s Des Knaben Wtmderhom
with Leonard Bernstein and
the Concertgebouw Orchestra
(DG 427 303-2) contes from a
live performance and imparts
some of the problems encoun-
tered by this mustc in the con-
cert-halL The best aspect of the
disc is the orchestral contribu-
tion, in which Bernstein offers

all the detailed perceptions one
might have predicted. The mili-
tary songs, such as “Revelge”,
have a biting Mahlerian irony.
Yet it is precisely this qual-

ity that is missing in the sing-
ing of the baritone, Andreas
Schmidt. Perhaps the rela-
tively leisurely tempos that
Bernstein sets, slower than
Szell or Solti in the past, do not
help. Lucia Popp, the otherwise
delightful soprano soloist, has
some trouble keeping in tune,
while Schmidt sings his songs
with correctness, but not much
more. There is a iarit of vocal
personality about the perfor-

mance as a whole.
If pressed to recommend a

vocal disc of Mahler under
Bernstein, I might prefer the
reissue of his Das Lied von der
Bide (Decca 417 783-2). There
are drawbacks here, too: James
King tramples the exquisite
Chlnoiserie of the tenor songs
underfoot and Bernstein him-
self tends to exaggeration. But
when he and Dietrich Fischer-
Dieskau embark on the fftiai

“Abschied" the music-making
lifts on to an inspirational level

that makes amends for what
went before. The digital trans-
fer is somewhat brash.

Or, better still, to Britten. A
poetic new recording of the
Serenade for tenor, horn and
strings has just been made by
Anthony Rolfe Johnson and
the Scottish National Orches-
tra under Bryden Thompson
(Chaados CHAN 8657) which,
might well be regarded as the.

most successful alternative to

Peter Pears’ famous account
that has yet appeared. Though
Rolfe Johnson is not without
moments of vocal strain, it is

dear he has thought himself
entirely inside the music,
experiencing its vocal lines and
the sounds of its words anew.
The companion performance

Of Les Illuminations by Felicity

Lott does not quite do that, but
there is compensation: she
gives a beautiful rendering of

the Qxuure Chansons fran-
txxises, youthful Britten terri-

tory where Berg and Ravel
meet to delicious effect. In

vocal terms this new Britten

disc is arguably the most rec-

oramendable of the present
batch of new recordings.

Richard Fairman

Habsburg, Feldman
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T HE SEVENTH annual intis'-,

national Theatre Festival of

Parma has been concentrat-

ing this week on the place of

the actor in both the theatre and
beyond. AH over Europe, but espe-

cially in France, Italy and Great
Britain, the actor is contesting- the
supremacy of the theatre director. In
part, this is a reaction to the techno-

logical and Intellectual impositions
that grew out of the post-War ideolo-

gies and personalities; in part, a sign,

of aggression in (he wake of theatre's

failure to change anything, least of all

its own structures mid priorities.

Last Saturday's opening production
was a one-man reading by the veteran
French film actor. Alain Cluny, in the
breathtaking Teatro Farnese, one of

the last and greatest temples of the
dying Renaissance. Built in 1638,

bombed in 1944, restored - to its pris-

tine wooden magnificence by the .

early 1960s. this paradisical galleried

arena is Europe's fest home of the
large-scale theatrical spectacular.
With a just irony, and a raspingly

elegiac and echoing delivery, Cluny
read; in Tricoloren happen, from the
Venezuelan and Brazilian travel dia-

ries of Alexander von Humboldt Here
was late 18th' century man' re-defining
bis place in the universe, just as the
late 20th century actor must repos-
sess bis place in the theatre.
The urgency Of Humboldt’s apostro-

phes, punctuated by some ecstatic
Handenan settings by Alessandro
Nidi of Levi-Strauss’s cantos from
Triste TropiQtus, was given a brllBant •

physical analogy In the progress of

Cluny through the theatre. He started

among the audience who were seated
on the stage, moved down a gigantic

ramp to a desk with books and a
glob© (Prospero’s cell?), thence to the
semi-circular seating area, coated in
inch-thick dust, sprouting a single
taken of arboreal vegetation, before
achieving final, transfiguring apotheo-
sis at the building's strongest point in
the centre of the main gallery.

The director of Tricoloren happen
was Glgl DaH'AgHo, a stalwart of the
festival’s host company, the CoDetivo
di Parma, whose Quando Jncommda
Lo Spettacolo (When Does The Play
Begin) at home base in the Teatro
Due was a different sort of environ-
mental project, directed by Walter Le
Moll and compiled by Daniele Abbado
(proud Dad, the conductor Claudio,
joined the Saturday night throng).

Spotlight on the actor
Michael Coveney attends the Theatre Festival ofParma

Laurence Cateme, left, and Franpols Chattel in a controversial Miss Julie from Geneva

The audience of about 100 people sat
with the. actors around a table the size

ctf a tennis court.

We became sarrogate performers,
with our gestures, looks, scratches
and sighs. The actors read stiffly from
books, from philosophical and poetic

masterpieces. But the word was out of
joint. In response to an actor's “1

know what 1 like and I don't see it

here" spiel, confidentially delivered to

a member of the public, the curtains
proper opened behind us to reveal a
striptease act and a conjurer.

This sop to popular expectation was
again superseded by two actors in

ridiculous piped-bose rehearsing a
nonsensical exchange from Finne-
gan’s Wake supervised by Marcello'

Vazzoler's hilariously mobile prompt-
ing bomuncule and, beyond him,
Paolo Bocelli’s threatening director.

This crucial sequence, PirandeIlian

and bizarre, left the actors drained
and humiliated. Bat while the show
raised certain issues, it skirted any

fundamental enquiry into the artistic

hierarchies. A finale was required,
and this was provided in a
fall-blooded performance of the last

scene of Euripides' Orestes, a macabre
tango of mayhem with Menelaus and
Helen interrupted not by Apollo but
by the crushing descent to table-level

Of the neiUng .

It seemed curious that a theatrical

discussion about the actor's role
should end in a renewed allegation

that artifice is the dominant reality. I

am prepared to concede a satirical

intention on the grounds that I had a
very good two hours in the theatre.*

The next two hours were more
problematic, though thematically
related. In the Teatro Due foyer and
cafe. Martine Vaudeville and Helene
Lapiower played the actor Ion and the
philosopher Socrates in a brisk canter
through Plato’s dialogue Ion. We
could watch the actors, or watch them
on video screens dotted all around. Or
we could watch other people. Or go to

sleep. 'The material, which is not
uninteresting, became entirely sec-
ondary to the circumstances.

This came from the Acteurs Produc-
teurs Assoctes, a new Paris set-up. A
second APA show. Innocence, com-
prising fragments of Heinrich von
Kleist and the Bible, was presented
out back of the Teatro Due in an open
air swimming pool Drained of water,
this proved a wonderful natural set-

ting of peeled sky-blue murals and
sky-high diving boards. Aloft, Pen-
thesilea bemoaned her lot in deaf and
dumb sign language, while, below, an
actor in a polar bear skin huddled
over a fire with a parachuting pilot.

Another actor wandered around in a
dark suit.

These figures were frozen in their

environment, as was your correspon-
dent lurking by the two metre mark.
It was a naughty night to swim in,

nuncle, even without the water. The
whole thing smacked of Robert Wil-
son of the early 1970s, not so much

Einstein on the Beach as Heist-time in
the swimming-pooL

Interestingly, the APA also incorpo-

rated some of Kleist’s pronounce-
ments on the nature of puppetry.

Craig’s theories of the uber-mario-

nette were just around the corner,

which only goes to show that hege-

monic arguments in the theatre are

always par for the course. With a Rus-

sian play about alcoholism and a Lith-

uanian version of Uncle Vanya still to

come, not to mention a Genet sympo-
sium out at Reggio Emilia, the festi-

val was broadening the context later

in the week.
The star guest attraction last Sun-

day. though, was Strindberg's Miss
Jiilie. directed by Matthias Langhoff

for the Comedie de Geneve. Here was
a typical Eastern European-style con-

ceptual production fascinatingly, bar-

bancally, juxtaposed with powerful,

uncompromised acting. No moody,
poetic atmospherics such as were
lately supplied for this piece by Ing-

mar Bergman.
The midsummer night drums grow

louder. Christine (Martine Schara-
bacher) chops food for soups at the
downstage wooden block. Miss Julie
(Laurence Calame) enters through a
split wall of lurid pink and dances on
the table, buoyed up by a floating
knapsack of coloured balloons. The
servant Jean (.Francois Chattot,
nigged up to resemble Strindberg) is

a lumbering manipulator, part psy-
chopath. part opportunist.
With its 1950s refrigerator, opera-

tional stove, world news from Stock-
holm on the radio, tilted floor, pun-
gent kitchen smells and grotesque
violence, this may sound like a trav-

esty of Strindberg’s “naturalistic trag-

edy.” It is not. Langhoff certainly
incorporates a commentary - most
strikingly at the end. when the sui-

cidal Julie exits to the bam over the
heads of the audience and the play
starts again with a new balloon-laden
reveller installed upstage of the still-

busy Christine; is she Julie, was this a
dream play, or a metaphor of rape? -
but he also strikes to the heart of

Julie's neurotic desperation and of
Jean's psychopathic response.

Time enough for further debate
when this extraordinary production
comes to London in July. But it does
show how the most challenging work
will always arise when actors and
directors acknowledge their reciprocal
functions.

T HE CLOSING stages
of the 1988-89 New
York Met season are
devoted very largely

to Wagner’s Ring. The com-
pany is mounting three eyries
of its recently completed new
staging, events of some impor-
tance which have drawn Wag-
nerians from across America
and well beyond. (I shall be
reporting on this next week.)
But the house is a hard-work-
ing one; the “free” evenings of
the second and third cycles are
given over to performances of

L'ehsrr d’amore.

. In the middle of I7ie Ring,
Donizetti was not at all a

Pavarotti’s New York elixir
mindless or unworthy diver-
tissement The house is huge
for this tender comedy of sen-
timent, and, perhaps as a con-
sequence, the production (evi-

dently not in its first
freshness; no dates given in
the skimpy Met programme) Is

of the comic-strip tendency;
Dulcamara, obviously mod-
elled on the Wizard of Oz,
arrives and leaves by balloon,
and ballet girls and boys twirl
in on point at the least excuse.
But the revival is very well

sung by the famous names
who lead it - Luciano Pava-
rotti and Kathleen Battle.
They conld have made it a
Roman-circus Ellsir, but they
have not: the opera is untar-
nished by superstar high-jinks.

Senior Italian tenors love
playing Nemorino. Pavarotti's

is currently being taken across
the operatic compass (reaching
Coven t Garden next season).
The balky, bearded singer In

his 50s and the young country
swain never quite become the

same person, but Pavarotti’s
evident pleasure in the role
ntakga the disparity unimpor-
tant - he keeps this side of

buffoonery, and the results are
endearing even when the
comic strokes are at their
broadest
He is in wonderful voice at

the moment refreshed, youth-
ful-sounding. clean-cut of the
ideal weight and size; not
exactly melting in “Una fur-

tiva lagrlma,” and never hon-
eyed or delicate in attack. But

he is warm, affectionate, a
“popular” artist at his most
genuine, and the audience is

with him all the way.
Miss Battle's pure tones are

mall, bat never forced; pin-

point prelection and a satiny
caress lavished on every note
carry them across the gilt-en-

crusted spaces. The delicious

young soprano who won all

hearts in Glyndebonrne’s Fed-
elta premiata has become a
highly skilled professional,
complete with glittering dia-

mante smiles and pert, prac-
tised gestures. Some freshness
is missed in her Adlua (It is

present in Dawn Upshaw's
Giannetta. which makes for an
interesting contrast); the
voice, however, is exquisite.

Paul Plishka’s solid Dulca-
mara and Leo Need’s loud Bel-
core are of more common
stock, genial bat not witty,
and the conductor. Marcello
Panni. is capable rather than
loving. And yet by the evening
of the evening one is in no
doubt that the total has been
more than the sum of its parts.

Max Loppert

I
N MOST orchestral con-
certs 19th-century Rus-
sian music still means the
works of Chaikovsky and

a handful of lollipops by
Musorgsky and Borodin - a
tiny and unrepresentative
selection from the distinctive

of all the nationalist ghettos of
late romanticism. The Flight of
the Firebird, the series of four
concerts which Michael Tilson
Thomas is conducting over the
next three weeks with the Lon-
don Symphony Orchestra, aims
at altering this perception and
at demonstrating how a tradi-

tion with its roots firmly
embedded in native folk cul-

ture can be traced right
through Russian music from
Glinka and Balakirev to Stra-

vinsky and Prokofiev.

The lynchpin of that lineage
is recognised as Rtmsky-Korsa-
kov, who as teacher and prose-

lytiser did more than most to
nurture and propagate it. The
series is subtitled "Rimsky and
St Petersburg” and is as much
a celebration of his multifac-

eted talent as a survey of his
colleagues in the so-called
"Mighty Handful" — the fer-

vently patriotic group of which
Balakirev was the early men-
tor - i

. imbuing his disciples
with a devotion to the heritage

of Russian folk music that he
had collected and transcribed.

It is all very much a labour
of love for Tilson Thomas, who

Firebird in flight
Andrew Clements introduces a festival

of Russian music at the Barbican
has long championed Rimsky's
cause. The highlight of the fes-

tival will be the first British

performance on May 7. semi-
staged. of Rimsky's Mlada,
which Tilson Thomas regards
as a crucial work in forming
the style of both Stravinsky
and Prokofiev in the first

decades of the 20th century.

From Mlada, first staged in

St Petersburg in 1892, to Stra-

vinsky’s Firebird, on to The
Bite of Spring and even Proko-
fiev’s The Lone for Three
Oranges, the resonances can be
clearly heard, but Tilson
Thomas recently detected the
same threads when conducting
Stravinsky’s strictly neoclassi-

cal Symphony in Three Move-
ments, written more than. 50
years later.

Mlada itself has a curious
history, for the seed of an
opera on the legend of Mlada
was sown in the early 1870s.
when there was a plan to com-
mission a collective stage work
for the Imperial Theatre in St
Petersburg. It was to be a
grand spectacle, combining
opera, ballet and scenic tab-
leaux; Cui would write the first

act. Rimsky and Musorgsky
take responsibility for the cen-

tral pair, and Borodin supply
the finale. The project found-
ered after about a year, and the
composers were left to salvage
the music they had written as
best they could.

Musorgsky recycled his -
some of it was incorporated in
the unfinished Sorochintsy
Fair - Borodin utilised most
of his in Prince Igor, and Rim-
sky went on to write another
fairy-tale opera May Night
which found a suitable home
for parts of his score. But
almost 20 years later, after Bor-
odin's death, Rimsky resur-
rected the idea, revised the
original libretto, and composed
a complete Mlada of his own,
an opera-ballet in four acts
which called upon all the lav-

ish scenic and musical forces

of the original conception. Like
Christmas Eve. which ENO
staged with such popular suc-

cess last Christmas, Mlada
belongs to a genre that Rimsky
very much made his own,
evoking an enchanted magical
world. Ear removed from the
harsher realities of the society

in which he lived.

Rimsky's success (or failure,

depending on one’s point of
view) in insulating his music,
and his opera plots particu-

larly, from the real world is

perhaps one reason for the
neglect of the bulk of his music
since his death. The natural-

ism of Musorgsky, whose
operas tackle fundamentally
human themes with such com-
passion, is justifiably viewed
more sympathetically nowa-
days. Certainly that whole
expressive mode of Rimsky-
Korsakov, in which puppets
and human characters can
happily coexist and which has
to be clothed in the most gor-

geous orchestral colours seems
thoroughly alien to us now,
So the LSO's series may pro-

vide a timely enttee to a lost

world. Where it has become
the norm to decry Rimsky's
tinkering with Musorgsky and
opt for to hear Ms original
orchestrations unadorned. The
Flight of the Firebird will

include a number of his works
in Rimsky’s versions, as well

as the 'finale to the collective

Mlada which Rimsky orches-
trated after Borodin's death.
There are familiar works in the
concerts too - Prokofiev's
Scythian Suite, Rimsky’s Sheh-
erazade and the complete Fire-

bird ballet - but it is the unfa-
miliar which deserves
attention.

Period Rameau
E VEN WHEN the South

Bank has undertaken
its proposed improve-
ments, it is unlikely

the Queen Elizabeth Hall will

bear any more comparison
with Versailles. Although the
hall is a good size, it is difficult

for it to accommodate stage
productions in any period style

and the painted marble col-

umns imported for this
Rameau evening hardly began
to soften the aggressive moder-
nity of its interior.

The English Bach Festival's

double-bill of authentic
Rameau was offered as part of

the "Revolution revisited"
series. Though the costumes
were reworked from original
designs by Boquet, the sets

perforce had to be left to our
imagination. Some degree of
creative listening was also nec-
essary to get the best out of the
musical side, as the fine, styl-

ish intentions of the EBF
Baroque Orchestra under
David Roblou were often
undermined by tentative
ensemble.
Nevertheless there was

much inspiring music to hold
the attention. Of the two pro-

ductions, the first - a diver-

tissement from Nats. “Opera
pour la paix'' of 1749 - can be
despatched in brief. While the

EBF's desire for historical
accuracy was entirely on the
right lines, there is a limit to
what peaches-and-cream cos-
tumes ana posed gestures by
themselves can communicate
to an audience today. Nor was
the singing entirely confident
After the interval, though,

the “acte de ballet" Pygmalion
fared rather better. This is a
delightfully simple dramatic
tale and the very spareness of
the production, devised by cho-
reographer-director Stephen
Preston, worked skilfully to
Rameau's advantage. As did its

sharp sense of humour, for the
toothless old hag stomping
about in the comic Pantomime
rescued the evening from cloy-
ing prettiness just in time.
Although the tenor Andreas

Jaggi was pushed by the
demands of Pygmalion himself,
the vocal contribution was also
a more solid achievement. Jen-
nifer Smith brought genuine
poise to the role of the Statue
and Sally Harrison sang cutely
in Amour’s aria, an essentially

simple piece that still surprises
the ear with the constant rich-
ness of its harmonies and the
unevenness of its phrases.
What a marvellously fertile
inspiration Rameau had.

Richard Fairman

CHESS No. 770
Neither. Beat is 1 N-K6 ch.

K-B3; 2 RxP ch, KxR; 3 NxP ch,

K-Kl; 4 NxR, RxB when
White’s four pawns can bold a
draw against Black’s extra
bishop, in the game, White
went 1 B-K7? missing N-K4!
forking the rooks and winning
for Blade.
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oil on canvas, 27% x 43% in.
(
69.4 x 109J cm). (Detail). Estimate:£8,060-£13,000
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'HlSSPLENDID paintingbyAlfordde Prades

X depictsTcddington, WinneroftheDerby1851,
and is one ofthemany paintings,warercoloursand

prints ofraring, hunting and coaching scenes to

be sold by Christie's South Kensington at their

second annual sale ofEquestrian Art, Raring

Memorabilia and Fine Wines atTartenaiU.

Newmarket on Thursday, 4 May at 630 pm
fWine) and Friday, 5 May 2f 1030 am
(Memorabilia) and 630 pm (Pictures),AH lots,

including vintage port, fine Claret and Burgundy

as well as a selection of racing memorabilia, will

be on view at Tattcrsalls on Wednesday. 3 May.

For further information on this or any

other sales in che next week, please telephone

(01) 581 761L

8 King Street, London SW1
85 Old Brompcon Road, London SW7

164-266 Bath Screer, Glasgow
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YOU CAN always tell when the
cricket season has started -
the weather goes from bad to
unspeakable. The past fort*

night has upheld this tradition, with
heavy snow at Derby last Saturday
evoking a mass of memories of sunnier

days and higher scores.

John Nyren began his classic, The
Cricketers of My Time, first published
more than 150 years ago. with the decla-

ration: The game of cricket is thor-

oughly British.” Any disappointed fan
will go one step further today and tell

you that the most British thing about
the game in England is the (»ld wet
weather that overhangs the start of the

season like a funeral pall.

In Nyren's day, at least, the Hamble-
don Club he was describing had the
sense not to start playing until “the
first Tuesday in May.” Nowadays, we
start early in April. And only April

showers prevented Graeme Hick mak-
ing the MCC's opening match too pain-

fill to forget. When rain stopped play at

tea-time the Saturday before last, he
was 173 not out and Worcestershire 474

for 3. It is open to imagination how
many he might have scored had the
climate been kinder.
Wet weather and bitter beer are two

of the traditional Australian complaints

about English cricket, and I see no rea-

son for that to change when the Aussies
arrive next week to prepare for their

fight to win back the Ashes fas Hamble-
don, in days gone by, used to spend the

first week in May preparing to fight off

pretenders to their crown as the kings
of English cricket).

In a fit of patriotic inspiration, Nyren
used his second sentence to tell us that

the word cricket probably comes from
the Saxon cryce, “a stick," and there is

a sort of lyrical inevitability about the

fact that cricket sticks, better known as

bats, can be made only from the wood
of one species of willow - the female of

the salix caemiea, a water-loving, river-

bank native that thrives in damp cli-

mates like England's.

There have been many changes in

cricket since the great days of the Ham-
bledon Club. Bats and weather are
among the precious few features of the
game that are pretty much the same
now as they were then: and the quality

they have in common now. as then, is

moisture. The reason willow makes
good bats is that it is strong, durable,
light and moist enough to stay springy
and resilient come what may.

Home-grown or imported, good or

poor quality, every length of willow
embarking on a cricket bat career starts

its new life by being stripped of its bark

and dried out. Half the body weight of

willow is moisture and that is a bit too

much, even for cricket. Each length of

trunk is cut into sections, called clefts,

which are dried until their moisture

content is reduced to a comfortable 11

per cent

I was told this and shown it in action

by Bemie Facer, one of the last bat-

makers who works by hand. He turned
a cleft of willow into a bat while I

watched. It took him two hours. He has
a craftsman's scepticism about drying
bats by natural methods. Putting bats

in well-ventilated barns and sheds

Willow to make
bowlers weep

Batman strikes again; Bemie Facer at his Buckden workshop

means a wait of anything up to 18

months before they are dry enough. A
well-ventilated kiln means a wait of 48

hours and, as far as be can see, does not
harm the wood. He uses both methods.
Facer has been making bats for 30

years, Including an unhappy spell in a
bat factory before setting up on his

own. He supplies a small, devoted mar-
ket and the start of the season is a busy
time for him. Most of his customers are
local - from Huntingdonshire, Cam-
bridgeshire and all over East Anglia -
but he exports a few to Australia and
the West indies.

The day I went to see him, he had
just had an order by telephone from
Orlando, Florida (April and May are the
most profitable months for cricket
homesickness). Facer much prefers his
present work to making bats for Geoff
Boycott. John Edrich and the large

number of Test and county players he
supplied in his factory days.

Ail bat manufacture involves the
same base processes: stripping, drying,
weighing, measuring, balancing, cut-
ting, pressing, shaving and shaping.
Factories do these to a standard, fixed

formula. Facer does them according to

the individual needs of his customers,
to whom he gives outspoken advice.
Everybody is fussy about his bat and

only really likes one that scores runs.

But it would be a brave man who told

Boycott in the Sixties and Seventies, or
lan Botham today, that he didn't know
what bat was good for him.

People who make bats by hand,
cricket coaches and lovers of old-fash-

ioned touch play dislike the new breed
of heavyweight bats, although Facer
makes them if he can’t talk Ids clients

out of them; they are as good as stylish

bats at paying the grocery bin. The Sib

to 31b 4oz heavyweight celebrities of the

Eighties - the Jumbo, the Giant and
Botham’s favourite demolish-the-sofUes

Magnum - mean heavy hits in one-day

cricket. But they have none of the easy

manoeuvrability of the 21b 4oz bats that

were used pretty well universally until

a few years ago and are still by far the

most widely-used today.

Nevertheless, weight is gaining popu-

larity. All the Glamorgan batsmen 1

met at Fenners the Saturday before

last, earing their way into the new sea-

son with a match against Cambridge

University, said that at least one of

their three-or-four-bats weaponry
weighed 2'Alb, often 31b.

_

It is only a matter of time before the

MCC decides that this weight is killing
batting and introduces laws to limit it,

as bat height and breadth were limited

when they looked like killing it in the

past. In 1771. Thomas “Shock" White of

Ryegate arrived at Hambledon for a
game with a bat which, as Nyren com-

mented drily, “being the width of the

stumps, effectually defended the wicket

from the bowler.” The width of bats

was immediately limited to 4.25 inches,

and the Hambledon blacksmith made
an iron frame of this width through
which suspect bats could be passed.

Bat-makers today still use L25in frames

to measure as they make.
After Shock White, bats settled back

into their stately aloofness from change
for a couple of quiet centuries. Then, in

1973 Barry Richards came out with an
orange bat mid Graham Scope with a
bine one for Sunday league games.
They were forbidden quickly.

It is fitting that Dermis Lillee in his

Australian heyday should have been
the most recent champion of resent-

ment at Fngfish cricket's conservatism,
epitomised by its bats. In 1979, Lillee

invented the revolutionary aluminium
bat Forbidden quickly. More than that
in 1982 ratering staff in the West Aus-
tralian Department of Mental Health
declared the bats to be useless in the
fallback vocation Lillee had found for

them as “bacteria-free and virtually

indestructible” soup-stirrers in the hos-

pital kitchens. They were too bard to
rtean — an ignominious ending for the

latest effort to save bats from stability.

At the moment, willow disease looks

the most dangerous candidate in that

cause. It was brought into the country
recently by foreign willows, as Nyren
could have told us in advance. The wil-

lows came from Holland but their ail-

ment has a quintessentially English
name: watermark disease. While scien-

tists work on producing a vaccine, rain,

sleet and snow continue to fall and Lil-

lee has begun to succumb to the damp-
ness of English cricket
Following last year’s dreary summer

playing for Northamptonshire, he is

going to spend this summer coaching
for them and - who knows - consol-
ing his countrymen with a pint of bitter
when they lose the Ashes series. In
Nyren's words: “Ale which would put
the souls of three butchers into one
weaver. Ale that would flare like tur-
pentine.” It would be nice if something
in English cricket flared this season.

Teresa McLean

Why American golf

is so complacent

S
everal of the most
serious symptoms con-

tributing to the current

decline of American
professional golf have mani-
fested themselves in the past

month. At the Blasters, Scott
Hnrii, by his own admission a
journeyman (in American parl-

ance, a blue-collar touring pro-

fessional), got into position to

soar out of that depressing cat-

egory for. the second time in

the space of two years. His
career has been very lucrative

but otherwise largely undistin-

guished.
-

In the 1987 US PGA champi-
onship at Palm Beach Gardens,
Hoch took three putts from 8ft

on the 72nd hole when two
would have given him his first

major title. What happened to

Hoch at Augusta recently is

now history. But, in a sense,

Nick Faldo has been the benefi-

ciary of two American players'

frailties in winning his own
two major championships,
since Paul Azinger dropped
strokes to par at both of the
last two holes at Muirfield in

the Open Championship of
1987, and lost to Faldo by a
single shot
Hoch has now won well over

$2m since joining the US tour
in 1980. But in that period he
has won only three tourna-
ments in his native country.
More significantly, two of
those victories, recorded in the
1980 and 1984 Quad Cities
Open, were gained when many
of the best Americans were in

Britain competing in our Open
Championship. Hoch won the
much-coveted Bardon Trophy
in 1986, one of his six winless
years, with the tour's low
stroke average of 70.08.

Similarly, Azinger won three
times in America in 1987 but
only once in 1988, and this sea-

son has gone winless so far.

But he has still amassed
$268,025 tor 11th place on the
money list.

1 believe Azinger has been
haunted by his failure at Muir-
field two years ago. In fact,

Azinger putted so poorly at the
Masters that in desperation in

the Last two weeks he has
resorted to using the elongated
putter that has become the
rogue’s badge of senior golfers

bedevilled by the “yips.”

It is the Last two tourna-
ments that have so completely
exemplified all that is really
insidiously damaging to Amer-
ica’s chances of regaining the

Ryder Cup in September. On
Hilton Head Island, in the Heri-

tage Classic, winner Payne
Stewart started a final round
three strokes ahead of his near-

est rival, Kenny Ferry. The lat-

ter is a strapping- very long-

hitting 28-year-old from Ken-
tucky who is in Ms third foil

season on tour after three
unsuccessful attempts at the
qualifying school
Ferry has a wife and three

children under five years of
age to support, so when Stew-
ard birdied the second hole of

the final round on glorious
Harbour Town links, the so-Ear

winless Perry unashamedly
reported that he then began to

play for the second-place
cheque of $86,400, which he'

earned with some ease by four

strokes over Fred Couples and
Bernhard Langer, who ties for

third.

Stewart won by five shots to

record his fourth victory in
this, his ninth season on tour.

His cheque for $144,000 allowed
him to take his warnings this

year to $328,710 for a career
total Of no les than $2,734,117,

and that is only the tip of the
iceberg - official money, as it

is known.
Last Sunday, in Greensboro,

North Carolina, controversial
Ken Green carried a two-stroke
lead over winless 27-year-old
John Huston, slenderly built

but another big hitter in his

second year on tour, into the
final round of the rich K-Mart
Stores-sponsored Greater
Greensboro Open.

Huston, married with one
young daughter, was playing

in the final group for the first

timp and was understandably

nervous. He threatened briefly,

only to fall back. Then, like

Perry, he concentrated only on
securing second place with its

massive reward of $108,000.

It is easy to sympathise with

both Perry and Huston, but not

with a system that puts such a

small premium on outright vic-

tory. However, the most dis-

turbing statistic of recent
months concerns the very tal-

ented, but almost negligently

nonchalant. Couples. Couples
has already won $416,747 this

year without a single victory

and, in his ninth year on tour,

has won only three times. But
he has still managed to bank
$2,335,783 in a far from out-

standing career.

Is it any wonder that Ameri-
can professionals are getting a
bad name for their compla-
cency, even if they are victims

of a trade union-type system
that ensures a fine living for so

many? Forty-five players have
already this year amassed a
six-figure sum each during a

season less than four months
old.

But worse is to come, if yon
despise remorseless consis-

tency without victory. Of the

top 20 money winners in the

US, only 12 have won a tourna-

ment so far in 1989. Yet the

other eight lumped together
have pocketed no less than
$2,311,122.

We all know how strong the

American tour is supposed to

be in depth. But is the pressure

becoming so great that too

many are ready to substitute a
fat cheque for the thrill of vic-

tory? Certainly the agony of

defeat is now only really pain-

ful to a proud and shrinking
minority.

Five years ago, Fuzzy Zoeiler

played in an exhibition match
that I staged in Asheville,

North Carolina, in aid of char-

ity, and he took a $5,000 fee,

providing wonderful value for

money. Last week he told me
that in those days he could not

fill his year’s calendar at that

price, but that this year he is

already scheduled to take part

in 66 outings at $25,000 a time.

Because of his ailing back, he
has already rejected many
more such offers. Need I say
more?

Ben Wright

CROSSWORD TELEVISION & RADIO
No. 6,922 Set by CINEFHILE

Prizes of £10 each for the first five correct solutions opened.
Solutions to be received by Wednesday May 10. marked Cross-
word 6,922 on the envelope, to the Financial Times. Number One
Southwark Bridge, London SEl 9HL- Solution on Saturday May
13.

that is consonants and/or vowels are transposed, as HACK BAN-
NED for BACKHAND, or TOTE RIPE for TIGHTROPE.

ACROSS
I The one remaining temple

for speeding on the motor-
way (4.4>

5 Arrangement for increasing
cholesterol level f6)

9

Identifications for other
than wild horses (4-4)

10 Pet plant? Abduct someone
with a German accent? (6)

11 Difficulty at gallery: moke
no progress iS>

12 Summon vessel from the
blue (61

14 Bamboo column is analgesic
(4-6)

18 institution, needy for the
use of: measure for engine
(5-5)

22 Untypical miss by explosive
plaything (6)

23 Nipponese anti-aircraft fire

takes the biscuit <&)

24 Strike god. the big-headed
fixer (6)

25 Reserves writer in town hall
or enclosure in stable <5,3)

26 Spoil nail on road (6)

27 Run away from one’s vic-

tim. having liberty of move-
ment (4,41

DOWN
1 Sound of European end (6)

2 Monkey loose in Slam (6)

3 Prayers started any fires? (6)

4 Eating root makes a busi-
nessman (lfl)

6 Golden article taken to
South American city for
some music (8)

7 People agree in reasoning
(Si

8 Beheads Conservative near
the roof (3,5)

13 Busybody to bury dissident
prole <10)

15 Gossip reveals beset about
to get a lift (S)

16 Poor term used by advertis-

ing man (8)

17 Milk pudding is nothing to

student in unfinished dis-

cussion group (8)

19 Instinct follows childless
plant (6)

20 Mother left beast (6)

21 Tavern in heaven with little

meat (6)

Solution to Puzzle No.6,921

Solution and winners of
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Mr A.W. Busby. Redruth, Corn-
wall; Mrs E. Morrice. Potter-
ton, Aberdeen; Mr t. Paterson,
Barton, Lancs; Mrs M.D. Saun-
ders. Carlisle, Cumbria; Mrs
Karin Somerville, Abu Dhabi.
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GRAMPIAN

HTVWEST
1130 am The Chen Show, lasso pm Batman,
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am Hank Williams Jr and Friends.

BBC2
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The wsek in the Lords. 730Nawavmw.730
Talking la a Stranger. 03* The Likely Lads.
*55The Young Ones. 1030 Snooker. 1230
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LONDON
035 Ghost Train. 1130 The Manktas. 1330
The Cnart Show. 130 pm News. 135
Regional news and weather. 130 SaM 6
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430 Cartoon Time. 4s45 Results Service. *30
News. 5.-05 Regional news. 535 PMce 5. 530
The increowm Hulk. K19 My Secret Desire.

730 Caichpnrase. 7:30 Davro'a Sketch
Pad 030 Murder. She Wrote *00 News. 935
Regional weather. MO Escape (ram Bob! bar.

1205 am Saturday Night at tna Movies. 1230
Hot Shota. 130 SNrdgehamrner.

CHANNEL 4
830 am Ark on the Mom *30 Just 4 Fun.
73* Bright Sparks. 730 Streetwise. 030 Bax
OfOce Weakly. *30 The Oprah Winfrey Show.
035 Jazz Classics. *25 Munai Buchstarwao-
gur. *30 Listening Eya. 1030 Moneyapmnar.
tlthSO Rim: "Tom Brawn's Schooldays*
(1951). John Howard Davies In the title rale of
the much-ebosed lBth century Rugby School
pupil, mao pm Marie Museran. 1230 Dance
with Me. tl30 Charlie Chaplin Festival. 230
World Ot Animation. 240 Racing.

535 Brookslde. 030 Right ID Reply. 530
Challenge to Sport. T30 The World This
Week. t030 Chortle Chaplin: The Cfacua*
(1925). 935 Film: 'The Holy Innecenia*
(1904). Indictment ol peasant lire In Spain
undar Franco. 113S Monbvux Jan TWL 1230
am Rlvran.fi30 Film: -Scarfaca’ (1832).

Goiqpiar mode starring Paul Muni.

S4C WALES
As Chmaiil 4 aeeeph-

*30 am Early Morning. *30 Open Callage.

1030 Hard News. 1130 Moneysptrmer. 1130
Listening Eye. 1330 Right Over Spain. 1230
pmSumo. 030 Century ol Childhood. 730
Carrag Aten. 730 Nawyddtan. 7*0 Y Maes
Chwarao. *30 Rarglen Foot. 930 Snweer.
9*0 CynhatSedd '88 TUC Cymru - Abenawa.
1930 Rim: The Circus’ (1028) starring Char-
lie Chaplin.

BA Begtaoa ss London exospl at the Mow-

ANGLIA

1130 am Mr Merlin. 505 A.L.F. M Who'S
Tha Boss?!230 am Film: "Where Does K
Hurt?’ starring Paler Sollere.

1130 am The Chan Show. 1230 pm A
lamadh Duttalch. SrtO Criomagsn. 123B am
Flint -Carttuafee* (1070). Car cheat across
America starring DavM Carradne.

GRANADA

1130 am The Partridge Family. *10 pm Fttw
-Father Deer Father’ (1072) starring Patrick
Cargill. Beryl Reid and Donald Slnden. 1230
am Film: ’Canjuake’ (1OT0) starring DavM
Carradlna.

1130 am The Partridge Family. SrtS The
Incredible Hulk. 1230 am Fane ’Carquake*
(1970) starring DavM Carradne.

YORKSHIRE

1130 am The Chart Show. 1230 pm Small
Wonder. 230 FBnr -Please Sir* (1071) star-

ring John Atdenon. 5fl5 The tocretfloie Hulk.

1230 Rim.- -Carquake" (1978) starring DavM
Carradne.

RADIO

(3) flaraa on FM

BBC RADIO 2
*00 am Graham KnfaM. *0S David Jacobs.
*00 Sounds ol Bio fiOs with The Crickets.

1030 Anne Robinson. OOO Gerald Harper.
130 pmThe News HuddDnea. 139 Sport. *09
Cinema 2. 030 The Seven Ages. 738Pop
fleotv-

730 Vieimese Delights. 930 String Sound.
1035 Marlin Katner. 1239 am Night Owls
wiBi Dave GeSy. 130 Colki Berry presents
Nlghtridf. 200-430A Little Mght Music.

RADIO 3
730 ma Morning Concert. *15 The Week on
3l 830 New*. aasBeethovan. 930 Saturday
Review. Building a library-. Schumann's Sym-
phony No 3. ‘RhentaJi’. Reviews of new
releases mainly of British rauelo. Record
Release: 10*0 Tippett (Lime Music lor
Strings); 1032 Stravinsky (Renerd); 1139
Maxwell Davies (An Orkney Wadding with
Sunriee);1132 Mozart (Plano Trio hi G. KE84);
11:41 Beethoven (Sonata Op Bis. 'Les
Adtaux') end Bishop tranacr Qodowsky
(Home Sweet Home) on mono records by
Leopold Godowaky; 1233 pm Britton (Can-
tata: St Nicholas).

130 pm News. 135 Third Ear. 130 Mark
Luhotaky MoMn) and Borta Berman (piano):

Beethoven (Sonata In G Op 06L Schnrtke
(Sonata No 1). Schumann (Sonata Op 115)

and Schumann arr Krohrfer (Fantasia Op
131). 330 Adrien Boult conducting Vaughan
Williams' Tallis Fantasia (mono) and Elgar's
The Kingdom'; records.

530 Jazz Record Requests. 5*8 Critics'

Forum. *35 Prokofiev nano Sonatas. T10
Unintentionally Tragic by Chekov. 739
Eugene Onegin (Rve relay) ENO production
of Tchaikovsky's opera, wkh Jonathan Sum-
mer* hi the Ml* role. 10** Mozart Adagio
and Fugue In C minor (K54B) and Diverti-

mento In D (hi 138). 1135 Outside Hi. Human
Chain in cancan. 1130 News. 1137-330 era
Russian Orthodox Easter Vigil (lira relay]
from All Saints' Russian Orthodox Church.
Enmamore Gardena. London.

RADIO 4
730 mm Today. 930 News. »«S Sport on 4.

030 Breakaway. 1030 News; Loose Ends.
1130 News; The Week hi Westminster. 1130
From Our Own Correspondent. 1230 Money
Box. 1235 pm The News Quiz. 130 News,
ino Any Questions? 13* Shipping Forecast.

230 News; Any Answers? 230 The Accring-
ton Pals. 430 News; The Living World. 430
Science on 4.

530 Conversation Piece. 535 Week End-
ing. *00 News. 035 Citizens. 7S» Stop The
Week. 7*56aturdayNlght Theatre: "The Glo-
conde Smite’ (j). 0rt* Music In Mind (S). *50
Ten To Ten.

I

IfcOO News.
1*18 The Saturday Feature; 'Mortimer of

the Bailey*. 10** The Poetry of Popular
Song. 1130 Sweet and Low-down (a). 11*6L
an Actor (a). 1230 News.1233 am Shipping
Forecast

SUNDAY
ItorBcs tisa programme In Mack end while

BBC1
•*5 am Open University. 835 Plavbus. 0T13
Making Sense 930 This is me Day. 1030
Handmade. 1030 Bustoses Matters: ‘1992 Is

Too Late'. 10*8 Fondly History. 1130 Help
Your CTN Id with Maths 1135 Having a Baby.
1238 pm See Heel! 1230 Country FHe. 130
News. On the Record. 230 EealEnder*. 230
FKm: 'Hltfi Society- (1958) with Bing Crosby.
Grace Kelly one Frank Sinatra hi ma musical
version of 'Tha PtiiiodaiphJa Story'. 4*5
Eurovtvlon Song Count
535 The Clothes Snow. *50 The Animals

Roadshow. w«h Desmond Morris and Sarah
Kennedy. *25 News. 8*0 Songs at Praise.

7:11 May to December. 7*8 All Creatures
Great and Small. 8*0 Mastermind. *10
News. 935 There Ufa 1*10 Everyman. 1030
Whan in Holy. lirlS Network Eat*

BBC2
IrOS pm international Brides Club. 138
Grandstand. 5:00 Rugby Seeclal. 830
Snoonar 0*0 The Money Programme: Trade
Gap - The Spectre at the Feast' MB Lost
WoriC*. Vanished Lives. 735 Play. -Tha
Winslow Boy” by Terence Flanigan, wfih Ion
Hchardaon. Rosemary Loach. Gordon Jack-
son and Emma Thompson. itZ2S Snooker.

LONDON

935 am Ghost Train an Sunday, ions The
Campbells. 1*45 Unit. 1130 MeonaSon. 1*00
VWona. 1230 pm Tha Weekend Lhrn 1X45
Police 5. 1230 Local news and weather.
1235 Tha Weekend Live 130 (TN New*,
tallowed Dv ITV National Weather, ino Eyew-
itness. 230 Coronation Street. 330 Rim.
“Doctor el Large’ (t957) with Dirk Bogarde.
*90 Butleoya. 535 Hart to Hart. *30 tTf|
News. toHowad By FTV National Weather
•SS Local news and weather. 5*0 High-

way. MS Family Fortunes. 7*5 Capaack'a
Law. 0*3 (TO News, followed by (TV National
Weather. 930 Tanomera. lOOS Running Wild.
1033 The Thatcher Year*: Miracle or
Mirage? 1235 am Fbotbaic The Sbnod Cup,
Evenon v Nottingham ForesL MM The Chert
Show.

CHANNEL 4
030 am David the Gnome. 030 CMkfron of
Flra Mountain. 930 Oennt*. *25 Movie
MeheJ. 10.00 Tha tomtit TIM weak. 1130
Fob's Programme. 1935 The Handarson
Kida. 1230 The Wattona 130 pm Lost in
Space. 1M0 Fitra: “Curly Top” (1935) With
Sniriey Temple. *25 Club X 435 New* 3am-
m«y grid weefter, *00 The Business Pro-
gramme 390 7-Sport. 8*5 Tha Cosby She*.
MB Fragile Earth. *15 The Alde&u>gh Uaa-

tarduaae*. BrfS The Media Shaw, 10ri9 FIbir.

"Accident" (1087): Study of a mid-Ilf# crisis

lor an Orient dun. vntn Dirk Bogarde and
Stanley Baker. 1295 m A<Z d CAW wim
Hank WongtonL

S4C WALES
Aa Channel 4a»capt>
930 am Fob's 31 arte®. Ml Hefoe. 1130
Pub's Programme 1*0 pm Big World Cafe.
2:00 Fldeo 0. 12*0 Film: 'Belle of the
Mnettos' (1634) wttft Maa WOOL 430 Trea-
sure Hunt 5*5 A DWerant World. MS Pobol
Treagldie. MS Newyddiafl. MO Margaret
Williams. 530 Hal Strseon. *30 Datiirau
Conu Dechrau ConmoL *00 Snweer. *30 MU
Oea Nab Wedl Qedd Ouw Ertoad. 998 PUm
'Comrades” (1950).
BA Helena aa London except at tb« krihrw-
top timas:

ANGLIA
925 am Ghost Tram on Sunday. 1290 pm
Farming Diary 1235 Anglia Newa 230 High-
way to Heaven. 530 Afl Clued Up. 590 Coro-
nation Street 130 am The Other Side ol
MkWghL

BORDER

935 am Ghoet Tram on Sunday. 1*25 pm
Landmark. 230 FBm: ’Roods of Pear" (1050).
490 Tha Duchess of York: Alpino Asaioi-
mom. 830 Ecotsport. 830 Bullaaye. 1130
Prisoner: Celt Block H. followed by fTN News
Head*nee. 130 am Tha Other aide of Md-
nlght 190 French Connection.

CENTRAL

*25 am Ghost Tram on Sunday. 1*90 eat
Central Newsweek. 1235 Central News. 230
First Division Football. *H Coronation Street
(omnibus edition). 1*00 am Prisoner. Cell
Block H. 138 Tha sunod Cup: Guenon v
Nntmgnem ForesL

CHANNEL
*25 am Ghost Train on Sunday. IMG pm
Raflecdan*. 1295 Lea Francois Chez-Voua.
1*50 Cyril Retailer's Gardart. 33Q Tha Graek-
ast Show on Earth. 530 Huttseyo. 1238 am
Simod Cup: Evenon v Nottingham Forest.
230 Tho Other Stdm of NtidnlghL

GRAMPIAN

*2i am Ghoet Tram on Sunday. 1*4*
Rotaastory. IMS Human Face ol Indonesia.
11*5 Lime 1*20 pm Landmark- *30 Pro-Am

Christopher Haley and Emma Thompson In Terence Rattfgan's
play "TIm Winslow Boy,” on BBC-2 at 7.55 pm

Pool Challenge. *90 Film: -The Bride to
Much Too BeautH*" (1050) with Brigitte Bar-
doL 530 Scotnort 530 Bulimy*. 1235 mm '

Prlaoner Cell Stock H. 130 The Otiter Bide*
,

MktmghL 190 Donohue.

GRANADA

1230 pm THa to Your Right 12*0 Aap Koa
Han. -1*55 Grenada Reports. 232 First OM-
atai FeetbeJL 230 FUnc 'Africa, Tamos Blyfe*
(1057) with Hugh O'Brian and John Mills. 590
Coronation Street 1235 am Prisoner COM
Stock H. 130 The Other (Me ol Midnight
ISO Donahue.

HTV
Uf am Ghoet Tram on Sunday. 1*90 pm
Farming Wales. 12501 HTV News. 230 Char-
Ne'e Angela. 530 Coronation Strom. Uxnni-
bua). 1235 era Prisoner: Cefl Slock H. 130
Simod Cup: Nottingham Forest v Evenon-

HTV WALES
A* MTV Wnl, wmoptttflB-ttJO gm-WUos

SCOTTISH
995 aa*' Ghost Train oa Sunday. 10*8 Glee
MIcheoTa Cavalcade on GWTV. 1195 Link.
1130 Sunday Service. 1290 pm Landmark.
1*0 Scotland Today. 230 Chain Letters.
330 The BSL 435 Scotland Today. 430 Bot-
toeye- 530 Scoaport. *oo ALK 1235 am
Boostoh Books. 1230 Cnim Tara. i*o The
Other Side ol Midnight. toHowad by ITN News
Headlines. 130 Donohue.

935 am Ghost Train on Sunday. 1230
Flavour ol Bio Month. 230 Who's The B
290 All Quod Up. 530 Landmark. *35 C
nation Street (omnibus). 143* am li

Space. 1230 Uvtng and Growing tor Ad
132 Tho Other Side of uktolgm. 130 D
hue.

036 am GtMei Train on Sunday. 1230
Provtaw. 1*0 Water Nawatbn* a Farn
Weather. 230 A Nation of Animal Lev
230 School* Quiz. *30 Coronation sit
*32 Ulster Sport* Result* 130 ma The O
SWo ol Mktalght 130 OoaatHje.

*» am Ghost Train on Sunday.. 123*
Grassroots Gardening. *3* Highway
Heaven. MB All CfustfUg.

RADIO

BBC RADIO 2
ft* am Roger Royfm. 03S Matodfee Fbr Voo.
T13B Desmond Carrington. 230 pm Bonny
Green. 330 Alan Dell. 430 Hotiywood Sound
Stage. 490 Sing Something sunpto. [*M FM
Joins Radio 1). 739 Chorda Chestor. *90
Sunday Haft-Hour. MO Your Hundred Belt
Tunes. 1038 Songs from toe Shows. 1*45
Yonty Solomon at the piano. 113* Peter
Clayton. 130 am Colin Berry. 33*430 A
Little Mght Muale.
MW a* above, sweptJbQ0-73Q pm Sunday
Sport

RADIO 2
730 am TUdor Church Muale. 790 New*.

;

Bmatana Quartan Heydn (Quartet In B Del
103), Smetana (Quartet no 2), jwwcek (Ot
tat No 2. Intimate LattenO- *90 Newt. I

Yaw Cancan Choice. 1095 Music Wee
list* SBC Scottish Symphony Orchestra c

5t
ue**d L«»l»ld Hager: Mozart (Poe*

Serenade). Beethoven (Symphony No
1230 pm Ttoo Seng Cveles: KUpmer/s 8f
manntlletfer and Schumann's CKefclertM
130 Third Ear Writer Noil Sheehan. 1

lUtii* Symphony No 7. 229 Ftofcn and S
tane; Redial by Die Hartley Plano Trio.
*15 Bournemouth Symphony Orchea

D-busay arr N Shews (Symphony tr

^minor). Straims (Fow Lest Sengs). Btrevin
bony In three movements], Ri
ito at Chios; SuHe No 2). 435 A HaFMMU. (bis Tufas lor Louis. 70S Coupe

730 ’Eugene Onegin-: Dramatisation
PutWdn'a wru novel with muale by Pr
flev, toss The BaetiMven String Quartets:

2? HI? 3:
•'tend Evensong records

warn Cathedral. «30 Historic Modem

RADIO 4
MO mn News. MO Sunday Papers. M!
Living World. 7540 Sunday, kso -me w
Good Cause. *31 Weather. *00 News.
Sunday Papers. 9rt* Letter from AimMO Morning Sendee. 1*19 The Aral
1135 Behind uie Heedlbtea. 1130 Piefc <
Week (a). I2rt2 pm Desert island
Rachel Kempna Lady Redgrave (a).
Weather. 130 The Wood Thto Weekend.
Shipping forecast 2fl0 Gardener*' One
Time.

230 Comedy Ctoesice: ’Present Laughter

3
Noel Coward, with Paul ScbctiakL Fonaita
swing and Patricia RouUedge (a). U0

Wlfito’s Weekly, mar The Education ot Hyman
Kaplan, by Leo Hosren. 4s47 Treasure
islands. Panaiope Lively explores the world
of children's books. 835 News; Down Your
Wsy: Oxford. *40 Smith and Son. 590 Ship-
ping Forecast *3* Weather. B30 News.
*15 Feedback, with Chris DunUey. *30

Cafe WtMiOT.MII News; The Root of the
Matter. 79B Food and Farming Year 530
Bookshelf. 030 Soundings. 830 Byron in
ExHe (S). *1* The Natural History Pro-
memmo. *50 Weather IMS Newv KM5
The Rtma at the Bounty (sL 1135 In Commh-
toe. 1130 Seeds of Forth. 1230-1230 eat

WORLD SERVICE
BBC World ferricsJBBCS48 cm bo received
to Weotem Europe 00 Madkne Wmrm 840kHz
(4SSm) at the feOarring florae GMT:
*00 am Nemdeek. *30 Jazz tor the Ash-

ing. 7:00 World News. 730 Twenty-Four
Hours, fallowed by News Summary 730
From Our Own Correspandera. 735 Book
Choice. 730 Waveguide. *M World News.
830 Words Ot Fatih. *18 The Pleasure'*
You re. 930 WOrid News. 93S Review Of the
British Press. 035 Nature New. 930 Financed
Review. WO Book Choice. MS Short Story.
1030 News Summary. 1931 Science In
Action. 1030 Londres Ml* French Nam end
Magazine. 1130 World Nm.
1130 News About Britain. 11,-10 From Our

Own Correspondem. lisa Play of me Week:
A Midsummer Night's Dream. 130 pm News.
130 Twenty-Four Horn. (Mowed by News
Summery. 130 Sports Roundup. 135 World-
brief. 230 Nows Summary. 231 Leader* and
Leadership. 2S0 Anything Goes- >30 News-
reel. 33* BBC English. 230 Naehfiehtofl,
AkhMttes Feature. Brief bus Berlin. 430
World News. 43* Neva About Britain. 4rt*
BBC Engl toil. 430 Ltindree Sdr. 5:15 BBC
Q4fl l .ftttlliflJJL

830 Nachrichten. Bllokpunia Religion:
Apropos. SchalipJatie der Wocfte. 644
Nachrichtorn News. *00 Tips fur Taurtstsn.
Feature 130 Cemrepobit London. Sonntag*
Kommentar. 534 Nachrtdttan; New*. 730
Play of the Week: A Midsummer Night's
Dream (from *20). 030 Work) News. 839
Woridbrlef. *25 Words of Faint e-Jo My
Music. >30 News Summary- 031 Soon*
Roundup. *15 The Pleasure's Your*. 1030
Newshour. 1130 World News. 1139 Book
Choice.

Ilria Letter from America. 1130 Leaden
and Leadership. 1230 Newsdeak. 1220 am in
Protoe of Cod. 1:00 Nows Summary. 131
Opera of the Week. 135 A Chopin Collection.
200 World News. 230 Review of tna British
Press. 215 Newsreel. 230 Science in Action.
230 World News. 230 News About Britain.
SfclS Food and Drink. 330 Letter bom Amer-
ica. 235 NoairkMen uM Pressexhw; Prase
Review. *t» Mmgenmegazln: German New*
Magazine. 4882 Tips fur Tourtenm. 437
NtoftrtcMen; News.


